IOREIT AFR—THoTHoYlo / Uedo
Seclo / UrioUlo—91 /2014—16
A T URE (T A T

TRFRT TAe, TFTT A3

SR U9 &R 2 US|

STATYT
fEmh aRfre

HA[-2, GV (B)
(STR YUY 31eTQ)

HH-HEI—193 (B-1)

ES, HITAdR, 4 Jdcdr, 2022
IMRET 12, 1944 o1& WHq

S} U9 I
faemd sgHrT—1
=T 511 / 79-fd-1—2022-2-%-8-2022
YD, 4 IAIER, 2022

qRT BT AGAEM & 0T 213 S WUS (1) §RT Uaw AR P TN P oguTel eIl
g1 frforRad SR uewr e dargd der {7l dargd (FeeE) SrATQy, 2022 (SR Ul ATy
AR 8 A 2022) FEH TARIRIST IMIT—2 WIS w4 ¥ 9Rfbd © g=nfud f&ar @1 & S
S99 SIRRIET §RT FAARIRT &I el YH1RId f&Har Sr ¢ |
SR <Y & garad qen il darad (FeieE) S’Aresl, 2022
(SR UST ALY TRAT 8 T 2022)
[*TRT TR & fAEwRd 9¥ # IrUTe gRT Y]
IR IR &F UAId 9 T vad AfATE, 1961 BT SIAR AR

P B forg
TSI

%gﬁ?ﬂ—aﬁsﬂ?wwﬁﬂé‘réaﬁ?ﬂwaﬂwwwﬁw%
& o= uRRufoEl e 2 9 R % qRd SRR &A1 Aaedd 8l
T R,

3T, 39, IR HT WAEH & IS 213 & @US (1) §RT Uacd wfdaal
BT YART BB, IoTUTS [FfeTRad AT IR Bl & —

1—J8 AACY IR TS &4 Uard Ul fa garaa (Geiee) sraresr, e
2022 HET SR |




2 IR YT SRARYT TOIC, 4 AR, 2022

S T 2R U &F ugd den forer dEred iftifad, 1961 (R oW o
ST W 33 iy et T 2) @ ART 15 FH—

Edl
Tﬂ}flm (@) SuERl (1) # W& A A RS B RWH W TR IR
(@) SUERT (13) ¥ %@ TP qU’ & IF W e Il qY° W Y
SR |
€IRT 28 BT 39 M @ gt 28 H—
GNICES

(@) STgRT (1) # = M A AWF' & WM W TR IR
- @ A SR,

(@) SUURT (13) # ¥eg "UF a9 & WM W < ‘I 9§ G A
SIRIT |

LT e,
RTSgUTed,
IR YT |
37T 9,
el Hard,
TR A4 |

No. 511/LXXIX-V-1-2022-2-ka-8-2022
Dated Lucknow, October 4, 2022

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh
Kshettra Panchayats tatha Zila Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022 (Uttar Pradesh Adhyadesh
Sankhya 8 of 2022) promulgated by the Governor. The Panchayati Raj Anubhag-2 is administratively
concerned with the said Ordinance.

THE UTTAR PRADESH KSHETTRA PANCHAYATS AND ZILA PANCHAYATS
(SANSHODHAN) ADHYADESH, 2022
(U.P. ORDINANCE NO. 8 OF 2022)
[Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy third Year of the Republic of India
AN
ORDINANCE
further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats
Adhiniyam 1961.
WHEREAS the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor is satisfied that

circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action;

575 RPH vidhaika- 2021 folder adhyadesh (panchayat) 7-10-2022 data 4e



IR YT SRARYT TOIC, 4 AR, 2022

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of
Article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to promulgate the

following Ordinance:-

1. This Ordinance may be called the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Short title
Zila Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022.

2. In section 15 of the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats ~Amendment of
section 15 of

U.P. Actno. 33
(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words of1961

Adhiniyam, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),-

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words

"two years" shall be substituted.

3. In section 28 of the principal Act,- Amendment of

tion 28
(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words seeton

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words

"two years" shall be substituted.

ANANDIBEN PATEL,
Governor,
Uttar Pradesh.

By order,
ATUL SRIVASTAVA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

RoTH0IOI0—T0I0 575 TSTIF—2022—(934)—599 UfTi—(Hrex / Elo / JATHe) |
GIoUH0ZT0—T0Ul0 69 0 faemii—2022—(935)—300 UfA—(@+Iex / Elo / ATHAT) |

575 RPH vidhaika- 2021 folder adhyadesh (panchayat) 7-10-2022 data 4e



