Registered No. HSE/49 [Price : T. 0.30 Paise.

$I000H Uoaa|@all
THE TELANGANA GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
NO. 1] HYDERAB.AD, SATURDAY, AUGUST 16, 2014

TELANGANA ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Ete.

The following is the authoritative text in English
Language of the Ordinance promulgated by the Governor
onthe 14th August, 2014 is being published under article
348 (3) of the Constitution of India for general information:-

TELANGANA ORDINANCE No. 1 OF 2014.

Promulgated by the Governor in the Sixty-fifth Year
of the Republic of india.

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE TELANGANA
(AGRICULTURAL PRODUCE AND LIVESTOCK)
MARKETS ACT, 1966.

Whereas, consequent’ upoh the adaptation of the
Andhra Pradesh (Agricultural Produce and Livestock)
Markets Act, 1966 in the State of Telangana it has been

[1]
0.91




2 TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-B

Short
title and

considered necessary to change the composition of the
Market Committees and to constitute the said Market
Committees afresh so as to suit to the requirements of
fhe State;

And whereas, the Legislature of the State is not in
session and the Governor of Telangana is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to
take immediate action;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred
by clause (1) of article 213 of the Constitution of India, the
Governor hereby promulgates the following Ordinance:-

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Telangana
{(Agricultural Produce and Livestock) Markets (Amendment)

commence-Ordinance, 2014.

ment.

Amend-
mentof
section 5.
{ActNo.
16 of
1966).

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. |n the Telangana (Agricultural Produce and
Livestock) Markets Act, 1966 (hereinafter referred to as
the principal Act} in sections 5,

(1) in sub-section (1),

(a) in the opening paragraph, for the words
“eighteen members”, the word “fourteen members” shall
be subsituted,

{(b) in clause (i),- for the words “eleven
members”, the words “eight members” shall be substituted;

(c) in the second proviso, for the words “five
members”, the words “three members” shall be
substituted;

(d) in clause (ii) for the words “three
members”, the words “two members” shall be substituted;

(2) in sub-section (3) for the words “three years”,
the words “two years” shall be substituted.




August 16,2014]  TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

3. Existing Members, Vice-Chairman and
Chairman of the Market Committee to cease hold
Office:- (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the
principal Act, all the members, Vice-Chairman and
Chairman of every Market Committee holding office at the
commencement of the Telangana (Agricultural Produce and
Livestock) Markets (Amendment) Ordinance, 2014 shall
cease to hold office as such and thereupon it shall be
competent for the Government to appoint a person or
persons to exercise the powers and perform the functions
of the Market Committee until the Market Committee is re-
constituted in accordance with the provisions of section 5
of the principal Act as amended by this Ordinance.

(2) The person or persons so appointed shall
subject to the control of the Government and to such
instructions and directions as may be issued, from time to
time, exercise the powers, discharge the duties and perform
the functions of the Market Committee and take all such
actions as may be required in the interests of the Market
Committee. '

(3) The Government may fix the remuneration
payable to the person or persons so appointed. The amount
of such remuneration and other costs, if any, incurred in
the management of the Committee shall be payable out of
the Market Committee Fund”.

E.S.L. NARASIMHAN,
Governor of Telangana.

- A. SANTOSH REDDY,

Secretary to Government,
Legal Affairs, Legislative Affairs &
Justice, Law Department.

Ci
H
P
P
il
b

T

® - R n——




Registered No. HSE/49 [Price : X, 0.36 Paise.

B0I0008 D@5
THE TELANGANA GAZETTE
PART IV-B EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
NO.1] HYDERABAD, SATURDAY, AUGUST 16, 2014

TELANGANA ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Ete.
Boorrer  Hydoe, eprg@dEses So8aka
AVASIF0BVLY BEOXDD.

2014, ey 145 3G K4S a8 3D &4 1808
PR EDNI W0E8 IEoY DB IN ROLSIBIOB
. ERDBODBERHS.

2014 % 1% eaz;o5a:éx;m

PO (a3 Tug) ) D DoNEBHNS® K55S
e BDADBEIS.

®)




6  TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part 1V-B

Do
oo
Sofa¥os
oS,

535 B8
SAL-EAEE A
PSd.
1086e7D
165

5 gs.}a.

Boorrer (Sg5Frd)8 508050 23ES)
B0B)0 B350, 196650 D:380BFS eprgdEsL.
SOISHAE (SgHarGBrdd Ho8050 BHe5H) S8,
59500, 1966 Boomer TPH0HE eRuHBoNBALIOND
SEFIDRONT SPHNT 0L IBDYHEY BBEB 5I76)6
ga0e3ei) bog)m: DAf08:E HOBK BesBd 558,65 Enoede
Erosy)R0 B0mEYH0R eSSR0RED GO0 DB0LIRKYY;

DR FIOR0GE BYPE efDENS® Blodr,
maoﬁnbc:’uﬁédéémgmm SO HFETHD Boorrer
T HEE0 DROS BRI -

&5 DONGPR0 GR0Y),; 2139 ey Poiam (1) mger
LRGN P5EI00[80 VBRI, KSGE agpcd
Qottoreon &s |50 eswééémm e BHa0BmS:-

1. (1) e erprysiuonio Boorrer (Smairnd mBat
RAED) 0) 8 (Fen) egrglian), 2014 e 67, B5Iy.

(2) 28, Dowsd eisoes D Sdyd.

2. (m08 B0 DR (ST Begod BEYBE)
Boorres (H5ORr@Brd)® 08050 @HED) 2G)e) e,
1966 @), 55 :aazsacsm&‘,

(1) &5-5039y550 (1)&°,-

() @085 oS, “SROMEA 008 Hibgen”
00 ISH0eL wieor “Oonentd B0o8 Hio5en” e
580008 SoWHS;




August 16,2014]  TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 7

(@) ot (D)6, - “SesE ot D08 Hghgen” B
$A O 2T - IDE S0ob ‘éz,ﬁéea” £935) DESRNOX
EODHBH; -

(2) B0t DrranoHE,- “aEHE deogen” e
BesH0e%r e B8 D850ge0” @90 DEHNOD
EO0NDBN; l

(&) Pogoo (1)~ “BaRsd Befogen” @b
Besdnesy e © agsy K}?;So?sen” 89350 HEBNODY
&0NHBW;

(2) &5-563ysan (3)S" e BSOS &R0
So5E1eE) HEET “Botk HoHEEHNE” @0 HEDVOW
GOWHDD.

3. (1) 550 Begd0d’ D5208)3)380, Boorre
(HR~G35~Ey D 08050 2B5059) 293,80 (59889) IEI,
2014 G0, R0 BED HADNE B30, £00635080,
56500 EORAV PHS, PR-DE B0B0k DEHFRoBE” SE
008 DEDOTHBR). HoBAK €6 HHYL, B e EHE TSR
$5BoBBEDENT PER Do By, 53 988D
DrolstentnBon, Brdyen  Sodey  8BR  omen
B onctonos HEE, DIV FNLO BPSEHNOB
2D RoHH $BAD Kbgineds dow §T8H 5 S
55090 DAHD0DIED [SEHEFIN O EORAI00.

(2) 8 DAHMWOVRED 558 B Hgeo (HE08S
Doh0BERS” S0BA% E0IITHRCNBNO0E) 238D aHEDE

SIT a0
gnoelo
[DLet]
‘a‘:r.’ioaeo,
A0- Y0
SoBayso
q_o’am
&
Sood

Do baoSak.




TELANGANA GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY _[Part IV-B

S 5500 MBoY eBESNONH S0, 5380 E20ede
SESEINO[ DRATROBIBL , EISFIVOR DEEF0BHB
805 Eysanets BEBGOBHBR BB 557860 e
TBINOD SHIEHE e DR SRS THE.

(3) P30BEFD, oy 200D JE Bor et
DYoD R HBE LA OFBoBBRN. e 365 DgD
B0 S0 e Py SandH HBD 9 Dntaven
2070)5020 E2085 08 303 BYoBIB0.

B.0R.0S, H8D0GS,
B0 K;‘)tglti).

. D08 Bg,

EIAMLN 58558,
ET";SOi);')géL’JBéM@J, T ;’)?326‘?.356?3)3@)3
Jo8asw
_aﬁéoi)avezi), aavéom%mgp.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE COMMISSIONER OF PRINTING
AT LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY PRESS, HYDERABAD.
2014




