ad g, 3 32 | : THEAR. AR 5. J0%0/HIF ¥, I QIR [ 75 <. e 3w 0%.00

AYWUT HHTR | Y

WITrFa TS

"Ry fagrwise Afafran 9 ToamerEr weEniaa FEe ey 3 e fafEaw
Ffor faet a =g TEuarTEgs AT fades Gor FEE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India. the foliowing
translation in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal
Councils (Amendment) Ordinance, 2010 (Mah. Ord. X of 20101, is hereby pubiished
under the authority of the Governor,

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra.

H. B. PATEL.
Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

i(Transiation in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal
Councils (Amendment) Ordinance, 2010 (Mah. Ord. X of 2010), published under
the authoerity of the Governor.

URBAN DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated the 26th August 2010.

MAHARASHTRA ORDINANCE No. X OF 2010.

AN ORDINANCE
further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporaiion Act, the
Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949. the Cily of
Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashira Municipal
Cauncils, Nagar Panchavats and Industricl Townships Act 1965,
WHEREAS, both Houses of the State Legislature are not i session ;
AND WHEREAS, the Governor of Maharashira is satisfied that
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take
<)
e —5 22



Short title
and
comimence-
ment.

Amendment
of section
128 of

Bom. [II of
1888.

Amendment
of \"LB\u
140A of
Bom. Il o
1888

TERTE FA A0 RETIROT W ATS, AL 3%, J0%0/9W ¥, Y& 73R

immediate action further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation
Act, the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City
of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 and the Maharashira Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for
the purposes hereinafter appearing ;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause
(1) of article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Maharashtra is hereby pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance,
namely :—

CHAPTER 1
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Ordinance ﬁiay be called the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and Mumeipal Councils (Amendmenﬁ Ordinance, 2010.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

CHAPTER 1T
AMENDMENTS 10 THE MUMBAl MunNIcral CORPORATION AT

2. In section 128 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act
thereinafier, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Mumbai Corporation
Act”)—

{1) in sub-section (1), in clause (a¢}.—

(a) for the words “official year: and ™ the words * official
year : ” shall be substituted ;

{b) the following proviso shali be added, namely :(—

“Provided that, the Corporation may determine different

rates of property taxes for different categories of users of a

building or land or part thereof; and 7 ;

{2} after sub-gection (2), the followmg sub- sectlon shall be added,
namely —

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (I}
and (2}, the Corporation may at any time, after the commencement
of the Maharashtra Municipal Corperations and Municipal Councils
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, but before the expiry of the
official year 2010-2011 (hereinafter, in this Act, referred to as
“the year 2010-2011"}, determine different rates of property taxes
for different categories of users of a building or land or part
thereof, which may be levied in the year 2010-2011. The rates
of property taxes so determined shall be effective and shall be
deemed to have been effective from the 1st April 2010 and the
tax during the year 2010-2011 shall be leviable and payable at
those rates.”.

3. Section 140A of the Mumbai Corporatir)n Act shall be re-
numberad 25 cph-section (7) thereof : and afier sub-section (1), as so
re-numbered, the following sub-sections shall be inserted, nameiy —

“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section {4) of
section 139A or any other provisions of this Act or Resolution, if

Bom.
It of
1888.
Bom.

LIX
o

1949,
C.P.
and
Berar
ii of
1950,
Mah.
XL of
1965.

Boni.
I of
1888.

Mah.
Ord.
X of
20140,



Mah.
Ord,
X of
2010,

Bom.
LX of
19588.

I I TTA0A ARTEWT 90T 13, AR 39, 0%0/9F ¥, TH ]3I

any, passed by the Corporation adopting the levy of property tax on
building and lands on the basis of capital value, but subject to the
provisions of section 154A, buildings and lands in respect of which
the process of fixing capital value is in progress on the date of
coming into force of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and
Municipal Councils (Amendment) Ordinance. 2010, and pending
fixing the capital value thereof, the tax leviable and payable in
respect of such buildings and lands shall provisionally be equal to
the amount of tax leviable and payable in the preceding vear, that
is to say, for the vear ending on the thirty-first day of March 201,
and on fixation of capital value of such buildings and lands during
the year 2010-2011, a final bill based on the final assessment shall
be issued for the total tax leviable and payable during the year
2010-2011. After such final assessment, if it is found that the
assessee has paid excess amount, such excess amount shall,
notwithstanding anything contained in section 179, be refunded
within three months from the date of issuing the final bill, along
with interest from such date as provided in the first proviso to sub-
section (5) of section 217, or after obtaining the cousent of the
assessee shall be adjusted towards payment of property tax due, if
any, or for the subsequent year; and if the amount of tax on final
assessment is more than the amount of tax already paid by the
assessee the difference shall be recovered from the assessee.

{3) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 163 or 217 or
any other provisions of this Act and having regard to the fact that
the property tax bill has been issued in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (2), not being a final bhill, such bill shall not
be questioned before any forum ; and no complaint or appeal shall
lie against such bill merely on the ground that capital value in
respect of the property which is the subject matter of the bill is not
vet fixed, or that the amount of tax leviable and payable at the rate
of the property tax determined by the Corporation is not yet finally
ascertained, or on any other ground whatever.”

4. To section 144A of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the following

Explanation shall be added, namely :—

“ Explanation. —For the purposes of this section “ecologically
beneficial scheme ” includes rain water harvesting system, vermi
composting, use of solar energy and other non-conventional sources
of energy, recycling and re-use of waste water, or any scheme for
promoting environment friendly and ecologicallv beneficial building
construction or the like as the Corporation or the State Government
may identify. "

5. Insection 154 of the Mumbai Corporation Act.—

(1) insub-section (lA)—

{a} after the words and figures “ the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958 "
the words “ as a base value, ” shall be inserted :

T FH3 —Ey-%

w

Amendment
of section
144A of
Bom. III of
18845,

Amendment
of section
154 of
Bom. III of
1388,



Insertion of
section
154A in

Bom. 111 of

1888,

Provisional
fixation of
capital
value in
certain
cases.

Amendment
of section
156 of

Bom. 1} of
1888,

Amendment
of section
168 of
Bom. I11 of
1888,

Insertion of
section
215A in
Bom. III

of 18RS,

Certain
provisions
to have
overriding
effect.

TERTE WITHT TRAOS SETUHOT 9T 3NS5, RO 2%, 0%0/91 ¥, Wb QIR

(6) for the words “ taking into cohsideration the market value of
such building or land, as a base value ; and also have regard to the
following factors, namely :— " the words “ taking into consideration
the market value of such building or land, as a base value. The
Commissioner, while fixing the capital value as aforesaid, shall
also have regard to the following factors, namely — ” shall he
substituted ;

{2) in sub-section (IB), for the words “ assigned to various such
categories ” the words “ assigned to various such facters and
categories " shall be substituted. '

6. After section 154 of the Mumbai Corperation Act, the following
sectior shall be inserted, namely :—

*154A. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 154, where
in respect of any building or land or part thereof, the process of fixing
capital vatue for the year 2010-2011 is in progress on the date of coming
into force of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and Municipal
Councils (Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, the rateable value of such
building or land or any part thereof during the year preceding the
year 2010-2011 shall be the provisional capital value and shall be
deemed to be the capital value validly and legally fixed under the
provisions of this Act, pending fixing the final capital value thereof:
and it shall be lawful for the Commissioner to treat it as such for the
purposes of assessment book kept under the provisions of this Act,
and the bil! of property tax issued under sub-section (2) of section
140A shall be deemed to have been validly and legally issued under
the provisions of this Act. ™.

7. In section 156 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, for.the words
“preseribe by rules” the word “determine” shall be substituted.

8. Insection 168 of the Mumbai Corpotation Act, in sub-section ().
for the words “four years” the words “five years” shall be substituted.

9. After section 219 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely :—

“219A. The provisions of sections 128, 140A, 154A, 156 and 168,
as amended by the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and
Municipal Councils (Amendment) Ordinance, 2010, shall have effect
notwithstanding anything inconsistent therewith econtained in Chapter
VIII or in any other provisions of this Act, or in any judgment, decree or
order of any court.”.

Mah.
Ord.
X of
2010

Mah,
Ord.
X ot
2010,



i

TERTE THT WATH JFRTUWT U TS, SRS I8, 020/WiE ¥, I R3IR o,

CHAPTER 1
AMENDMENTS TO THE BosmBay ProvinciaL MUNICIPAL
CorroraTioNs Act, 1949

Bom.  10. Insection 129 of the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Amendment
LIS Act, 1949 (hereinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “ the Provincial ¢ section

- . » 129 of
H_Mg Corporations Act”),— ‘ Bomn . LLX
(1} after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, of 1949.
namely :—
“Provided further that, the Corporation may determine different
rates of property tax for different categories of user of a building or
land or a part thereof ™
(2} in the second proviso, for the words “Provided that” the words
“Provided also that” shall be substituted.
11. In Schedule ‘D’ of the Provincial Corporations Actl, in Amendmen:
T py ks f Senedul
Chapter VIII,— -&i)‘ ::—; .ﬁoﬂf
. oA LIX of
(AYin rule 7A, T940
{1V in sub-rale{l), ---
Bom. {a} after the words and figures “the Bombay Stamp Act, 19587
1‘1)55;’ the words “as a base value,” shall be inserted;

(b) for the words “taking into consideration the tnarket value
of such building or land, as a base value; and also have regard to
the following factors, namely: —” the words “taking into
consideration the market value of such building or land, as a
hase value. The Commissioner, while fixing the capital value as
aforesaid, shall also have regard to the following factors,
namely:—-" shall be substituted;

(2 in sub-rule 12), for the words “assigned to various such
categories™ the words “assigned to various such factors and
categories” shall be substituted;

{B} in rule 21, in sub-rule (2), for the words “four years” the words
“five years” shall be substituted. '

CHAPTER 1V
AnE-DMENTS TO THE C1Tv oF NAGPUR CORPORATION ACT, 1948

P 12, In section 115A of the City of Nagpur Corporation Act, 1948 A"*f}mﬂ%mem
B and heveinafter, in this Chapter, referred to as “the Nagpur Corporation o o
Qrar as

il of Act”), to sub-gection (1), the following proviso shall be added. namely:— C.P. and
1950. . - . . o Berar 1I of
“Provided that, the Corporation may determine different rates of 1950

property tax for different categories of users of a building or land or a
part thereof.”.

BT S fy-55]




% NETITE, TR (0T SETERIT 97T 316, APRE JE, 0%0/W¥ ¥, T 2’3

Amendment  13. In section 119 of the Nagpur Corporation Act, in clause (Bj,--
of section

119 of C.P. {1)1in clause {a¢),—
and Berar
i1 of 1950. {a) after the words and figures “the Bombay Stamp Act. 19587

the words “as a base value,” shall be inserted ;

(b} for the words “taking into consideration the market value
of such building or land, as a base value ; and alse have regard to
the following factors, namely :—” the words “taking into
consideration the market value of such building or [and. as a base
value. The Commissioner, while fixing the capital value as
aforesaid, shall also have regard to the following factors, namely .—
shall be substituted ;

{2) in clause (b), for the words “assigned to various such categories”
the words “assigned to various such factors and categories” shall be
substituted.

CHAPTERV

AMENDMENTS 1O THE MazarasqHTRy MUNICIPAL CoOUNCILS, NAGAR PANeitivars
AND InpUsTRIAL TowNsHIPS Act, 1965

Amendment 14. In section 105 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils. Nagar
of T(:f)“::j‘ Parchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, 11 this
Mab. Xi. Chupter, referred to as “the Municipal Councils Act™), to sub-section

of 1965 (1) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,

namely —

“Provided also that, the Council may determine different rutes of
tax for different categories of users of a building or land or a part
thereof.”.

Amendment 15. In section 114 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (3),—
of section

114 of {1 1n clause {a),—
Mah. XL
of 1965, (@) after the words and figures “the Bombay Stamp Act, 1958”

the words “as a base value,” shall be inserted ;

(b) for the words “taking into consideration the market value
of such building or land, as a base value ; and also have regard to
the following facters, namely .—" the words “Laking into
consideration the market value of such building or land, as a base
value. The Chief Officer, while fixing the capital value as aforesaid,
shall also have regard to the following factors, namely -—" shall be
substituted ;

Bom.
LX of
1958,

Mabh.
X of
1965.

Bom.
130 of
1958.



IR WA TRITS FARTGRTT U 3G, AP 2§, I0%0/WE ¥, Tih 232

{21 in sub-clause (bJ, for the words “assigned Lo various such
categories” the words “assigned to various such factors and
categories” shall be substituted.

16. In section 124 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (2),
for the words “four years” the words “five years™ shall be
substituted.

CHAPTER VI

MISCELLANEOUS

- 17. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving cffect to the provisions of
. the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Bombay Provincial

Mumnicipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of Nagpuwr Corporation Act.
1948 or, as the case may be, the Maharashira Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchavats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in respect of the matters
contained in this Ordinance. the State Government may, as the occazion
ariges, by order published in the Official Gazetie, do anvthing not
Inconsistent with the provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation
Act. the Bombay Provineial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the Cits

- of Nagpur Corporation Act. 1948 or, as the case mayv be, the
sh. Muharashira Municipal Councils, Negar Ponchavats and Industrial

Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Ordinance, which appears to

it to be necessary for the purpose oi removing the difficulty.

{2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as
may be, after it is made, beforc each House of the State Legislature.

o

Amendment
of section
124 of
Mah. X1,

of 1965,

Power to
remoye
ditfieults



I I T0F SO 91T 36; HTRE R, 0%0/WIE ¥, Wiah R]3R

STATEMENT

With a view to bring greater transparency and to rationalize the
revenue of the Urban Local Bodies from property taxes, the Municipal
Corporations and Municipal Councils have been empowered to levy
property tax on the basis of capital value of property in lieu of the
system of levy of property tax on the basis of rateable value of
property, by amending the Municipal Laws in the State. Accordingly,
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation has decided to levy the property
tax on the basis of capital value, with effect from the 1st April 2010.
Under the prevailing circumstances certain transitory provisions are
proposed to be incorporated in the Mumbai Municipal Corperation Act
{Bom. III of 1888) frem implementation point of view and certain
provisions have been proposed to maintain uniformity in all Municipal
Laws as under :—

{1) to enable the Mumbai Municipal Corporation to fix different
rates of tax for different user of a building or land or a part thereof,
and accordingly to fix such rates during the year 2010-201].
effective from the 1st April 2010, an amendment to section 128 is
proposed. Similar amendment has also been propesed in the other
Municipal Corporations Acts as well as the Municipal Cauncils Act ;

(2} to enable the Mumnbai Municipal Corporation for provisional
levy of property tax equal to the amount of tax leviable and payable
in the preceding year. an amendment te section 140A is proposed :

{3) to clarify the provision relating to other factors to be taken
inte account while deciding the capital value of the property, on the
basis of stamp duty ready reckoner or market value of the buildings
and lands, suitable amendment to section 154 of the Mumbai
Corporation Act is proposed. Similar amendment has also been
proposed in other Municipal Corporation Acts as well as Municipal
Councils Act ;

{4) to explain the term “ecologically beneficial scheme” used in
scction 144A of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, an
cxplanation is proposed to be added to the said section 144A on the
lines of the provisions obtaining-in other Municipal Corporation
Acts and the Municipal Councils Act ;

{5} to enable the Mumbai Municipal Corporation to treat the
rateable value of the building or iand or any part thereof, pending
fixing the capital value thercof, for the year preceding the year
2010-2011 as a prov‘isional capital value so as to levy tax thereon
under section 140A, a new scction 154A is proposed to be inserted.



TERT VIS TATS JATIROC ¥ 373, APTIZ TR, 2ovo/WE ¥, TF ]3I “

2. As both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session and
the Governor of Maharashtra 1s satisfied that circumstances exist
which render it necessary for him to take immediate action further
to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Bombay
Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, the City of Nagpur
Corperation Act, 1948 and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes
aforesaid, this Ordinance is promulgated.

Mumbai, K SANKARANARAYANAN,
Dated the 26th August 2010. Governor of Maharashtra.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

MANU KUMAR SHRIVASTAV.

Secretary to Government.

ON BEHALF OF COVERNMENT PRINTING. STATIONERY AND PUSLICATION, PRINTED AND PURLISHED  HY SHRI PARSHL'KAM
JAGANNATH GOSAV] PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRA]. PRESS. 21-A, NETAJ] SCBHASH ROAD, CHARNIT ROAL. MUMBAL 204 04
AND PUBLESHIED AF DIRKCTORATE OF GOVERNMENT MRIN'TING. STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A NETAS SUBHAYH ROALD,
CHARNT ROGAN. MUABAL 400 304, EDITOR - SHR! PARSHURAM JAGANNATH (GOSAV]



