TH ATEES www.govipressmp.nic.in
QA ot gEA ore fFa ST wwd T

f

FH® 221] e, 9ER, fediEw o slie 2018—37 19, Y 1940

fafa ofit faurht w1 fawm
e, fei 9 3tiie, 2018

F. 5925-100-SFRIG-3I(.).—Wd % WEUH F ST 213 F I WY & TS
o wefua foren T Frfafad SRy YR B WHHR ¥ Yeva fEar s €.

HEAYEYl % TSI & AH § qT STSIER,
YT I1eE, i gid.

441



442 ey To, feeli 9 i 2018
HEAYIT AT
FHI® & T 08¢

Wmﬁ%%ﬁr(ﬁsﬁm)m{?ou‘

[ ““mregder T (orarawer)” # faiw @ oliel, R0%¢ WY WUHER wefdra fRam @ ]

AR TV & S8 ad B qSourel gR1 gefua femar T,

TeagRet Ao Bom afufiEm, QRuE AT MeAWeyr RuteeT iR, zﬂaza;‘raﬂr
HlfE T ¥ FEATQT.

7, T ¥ Taum-ted B u AR 6l 8 o AeIuey % TS H ¥ WAeE g 0w
el wRfafat foemm €, S HRO 9 e € T E fF 3 7 wleE WG

3, W%Eﬁm%aﬂ%ﬁ?zaiw(z)mmmﬁmﬁwﬁmnﬁm
¥ Touure frefaraa sy yenfad w1 € i—

wfyw . 3. T STERY 1 G TR HEATW TRUTer fafy (FR) FERY, Rov¢ §.
TR sfufrEm 2. 39 IR ¥ Yafda WY W ety % SRE, Heande Rutes fm sfufem, us (A

WAIH R WL 33 T IQUE) TN HEIRY TR iU, {38 (ShHIR 30 W RRE&R) UNT 2 s ¥ # fafafdy
RWHE T i ¥ sreaefe @ g vl €.

afufrem
3 T 2R&L W
et ®Y A
wyifua fwar
ST
HIT-T&h

TEAYRYT TR PR sfufrEm, g]us (FHUih 3 T AjUE ) H HIlEH

TGN ' 3. WeRy TRUfAE Frm sfufm, e (FAE 3 W RRjuR) H, UAT R-F -4

23 W Lj4E

I () Uk D hwE” & WA ®), v A i s fee s

(@) v “TRfas T R 5 ER W € arel Yo F AR 1 STEnT ST
fawrg 9 aREsEell | fFafad w0 8 stgen T aREsEel R % fad
Heift TR T g stgE SuE SR @ forg i el wfaseE 1 | fha
IO ¥ O W, TR T THR W € arell o w1 T H ST TR &
i e T, REwER stere wfEsEiel, 321 Y@ ) affed R g
T qReae O Y o ufEeel & ford feran ST wE. 59 YRR e Ui
I SR Sheafad ufEse % fFrrerm v faw e el % fade % fag
ot foren < wepm.’ wenfya fog smd,



TS TS, i 9 e 2018 ' 442 (1)

q-
HEATSYT TRUTTeRT STIfam, Q&% (iR 39 WY RE&L ) T UyieH

¥, TEAGA TRUIAR SUEE, 2962 (ShHi 30 W 2]&R) H, UIU g& W, SUMRI (R) H,—  WenRw sfufrm
Cxica 39 '{T‘[
LRE L T HYiNer,

(@) W= ‘9 srﬁma" ® WA W, v o glgea’’ wifm fee S,

() W TRt afteg @ TR e N 39 YER WG S aTell Yook ki M H STE
N forshra &t afEsstl &t frafaa s 3 srean T ufesmetl & fvaragm
¥ for Heiftrg rafersnt oftag a1 PR afteg gRT steran Suet ok @ faw o i
1 fade w0 § forn S, ¥ WM W, WS 39 YR W € arel J5% $
T 1 ST TR & H R St fowm, frmad srera afEseeh, ag
& Y witafera i g TR aftEes @ T o ufEsrel & fed foman s s,
mmmmmwmmmﬁﬁmamm
*uil % AfadeE & fau «f fFan s @, wenfue fee S,

TG © 3, 0%¢. _ TSIITe,
TEIIRYI.

arare, fei 9 sl 2018

. 5925-100-FFRE-3I(UL).—9RA & WfuM F 0T 348 & WUE (3) F FTWRV H, ALAYSY FRUNTH
fafy (denes) sreaRy, 2018 (FHIF 6 W 2018) o ST 3FHR TSI & WMFR & Taegrl Ywivm fan
S ®.

TEAYRY F TSIIA &F H H q01 SRR,
T Agd, stfafaa afea.



442 (2)

HeqyRy UeTad, T 9 st 2018

Short title.

Madhya Pradesh
Act No. 23 of
1956 and Act No.
37 of 1961 to be
temporarily
agxended.

Amendment to
the Madhya
Pradesh Act
No. 23 of 1956.

MADHYA PRADESH ORDINANCE
No. 6 orF 2018

'THE MADHYA PRADESH NAGARPALIK VIDHI (SANSHODHAN)
’ ADHYADESH, 2018

[First published in the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”’, dated the 9th April,
2018.]

Promulgated by the Governor in the sixty-ninth year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 and the
Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961.

WHEREAS, the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor of Madhya Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance :—

». This Ordinance may be called the Madhya Pradesh Nagarpalik Vidhi
Adhyadesh, 2018.

(Sanshodhan)

2. During the period of operation of this Ordinance, the Madhya Pradesh Municipal
Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956) and the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No.
37 of 1961) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 and 4.

PART-1

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA PRADESH MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT,

1956 (No. 23 oF 1956)

3. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipal Corporation Act, 1956 (No. 23 of 1956), in section
133-A, in sub-section (1), —

(i) for the words "two per centum”, the words “three per centum” shall be
substituted;
(i1) for the words "The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Corporation

shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects or for
repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on behalf
of the concerned Municipal Corporation.”, the words “The amount of duty so
received may be used for urban infrastructure development, affordable housing
projects, urban transport including metro rail or such other projects in urban
areas: This amount so received may also be used for repayment of loans taken
for implementation of aforementioned projects” shall be substituted.



ey e, fetw 9 s 2018 442 (3)

+ +

PART-II

AMENDMENT TO THE MADHYA ‘PRADESH MUNICIPALITIES ACT, 1961
(NO. 37 or 1961)

4. In the Madhya Pradesh Municipalities Act, 1961 (No. 37 of 1961), in section 161, in Amendment to

sub-section (1),— the Madhya
Pradesh Act No.
37 of 1961.
@) for the words “two per centum”, the words “three per centum” shall be
substituted;
(i) for the words “The amount of duty so received to the Municipal Council or Nagar

Parishad shall be used for implementation of infrastructure developments projects
or for repayment of loans taken for implementation of such projects by or on
behalf of the concerned Municipal Council or Nagar Parishad:”, the words
“The amount of duty so received may be used for urban infrastructure
development, affordable housing projects, urban transport including metro rail or
such other projects in urban areas. This amount so received may also be used
for repayment of loans taken for implementation of aforementioned projects:” shall
be substituted.

ANANDIBEN PATEL
BHOPAL :* ’ *Governor,
DATED THE 7th April, 2018. Madhya Pradesh.

FRisTer, TR ET qe S AT, HEAYE g1 e e RO, v ¥ Afka q=n TEa—2018.



