B aaﬂr{‘a www.govipressmp.nic.in
b off TeA dre fear S g ©

THHE 294 ] AITe, JUAR, fw 22 A 2015—37WE 31, TF 1937

faum gy ofeearer, geayey

qrared, TSk 22 S 2015

%. 16217-Ta 9. -faum-2015. —AsAyey faum @9 & uftsen qun o duem g faa-64 & 3l & e
A mergew g9 fafeei (Sene) iR genf susi fadess, 2015 (@i 11 w1 2015) S faum ww § fewies
22 13 2015 1 GRAAMTG N . STGIHRY I GEAT & Forw wepiidr feman S &

WA ST
vg@ e,
Ty faum T

neaueyt fadee |

HHTE ¢ WA oWy

TeaweyT oW fafuat (Hones ) 4 ysivt Susiy fadee, 209y
fomg =

HIT Teh
EIERED
. Gfera Mg 3R R, :
I &
Taq R e gf=mior sder (Framsm don Jen-vd fafrm)
srfufTas, ]R8 1 G

R HEAYSY TSF &l @F] BU ®9 H Him Afuftad, 9/%& &1 e 1 g
3. 9N o T HIEA,

587



588

HEAYSY S04, fEA 22 S 2015

m

R0.
22

R
LES

R¥.
.

&

2\,

2¢.
2R

g d
o 31k o7 Gf=mior SR weam Sust fufEm, Q]R8 &1 TeieM

LAY T & 0] gU ®9 H FHiy aifufam, 9298 &1 ¢ 1 G
HRT 3 3R 29 R HYHA.

YN TR
sl g9 (faframa @it seaeq) sfufem, _wo &1 Goed

HETRY T I AT gU wY H F fufEm, 2o @ 30 T Huem,
YR 9. 3R 93 1w, .
T 97
SR@E aifufTam, ¢%¢ @ HeiyA

LAY T T AF] U TG H Hr aifufm, wc?ﬂaawwﬁm
¥R &4, &§ R W T TEle,

9T 38
efie faare sfufam, (ve &1 e

AR T H AN gC B H i aifulimy, 9w @1 9% @ Hee.
U %, 9, SR WT H WM,

T F1d
=T yarlt wueR (Fawm o fafme st dar od)
Afafram, Qe =1 Helled

nwﬁwmﬁm@mﬁ%ﬁaﬁm QR9R HT 30 T HIMEA,
URT ¥ 1 HNEA.

AN 2713
AT gfiiaed HaeR afufqam, 9qse &1 geiyA

HETY T H R §U T H wesg aifulrE, 9989 w1 9 o Heive.
URT 3 o1 GG

a7 A
wfdea gm0 fafyl & 219 ool 1 guHe 99T fo=Ror #1 IwEe

TAYes U H wfary g9 il & o1 st &7 w9,

T <
fafis g ot 9l % Huwor qon fafis ghR a6t faerfomi wega
foe M ¥ B2
eAyeyl o H waea gn fafesl & el fafus yer w1 9fSEl % duror qen
fafim yar =t faerfor =@ feu s 9 we.

YN TIRE
fafay susy

7 T9H vt
HicTEal &1 X fepan S,




Hegey e, feiies 22 \gcfus' 2015 588 (1)

eI %s}araa

HHIH 22 U oW
TeAyeyT oW fafiet (deiem) 3R wentot Susy fadees, o9y
YT T I T gU ®9 H —

() W 3R 37 i s (Felir aen Sa-vd Rfr) sffm, 2338 (238 & 1)

() 97 SR 3T G FHepr e Ut SRR, ]R8 (2338 FH 3¢)

() s gm (Faferm oiR samA) sifufem, gqwo (3R6e @ 30)

(=) Al 2%¢ (2¥¢ - &3)

(4) Sief foar sfufmm, 130 (239s 1 9%)

(B%) Srrfreh Yot swenr (Frersm 1 fafrme ofR fm wrd) sifufrm, qe’ (2R F 30)

(T) A 9T FHeR eAfufem, 962 (2’82 & )
=1 SR Heifea T Bg 9 e g e % deu f et suey w0 ¥ R fadee

U TR F foared oY o gy faum-Hued g wanﬁgd@ﬁagaqﬁzﬁaﬁaﬁ‘f —

HIT Weh
EIRED

e (R) 38 fufrad w1 dfyw 9m meguRw o9 fafus (deiem) @R geiol Sudy  d@fera amwosfe
sAfyfTIE, 09y %, WIS,

(R) ¥E "EARY To H THF FERM 1 AR | T B

arT |1
qaq AR 7 gi=uiv wHeR (FRsE a9 Ja-vd fafeme)
aafufaas, ¢]]% o1 HOEA

R. WYY T 1 AN g¢ w9 ¥, a7 AR a4 afmtor wefer (Friem aon Sa-vd fafrmm) TN T Y
AT, 23R8 (2938 1 39) (Fﬁsﬂﬂmﬁmwwsﬁwﬁm%ﬁwﬁﬁﬁgé)aﬁw AR ®T A

9T H, SHh UvEr Ivetea Gfg # duifua e sme N%»;FNW,

EIDER

3 @ stfafrem 1 ar oo H 39Em (3) F wveEn, frefafan soum sty e, el o e w wvinem,

Y (¥) Al SeRA W w F A 9 fafed wemafy F e Sede sfed gr e F
o o weiy # i oot snew Wi R T R A e Toredreneor s fear T wwE

1
SITEL




588 (2) TEYRS! o, feAie 22 SR 2015

g dF
a3 o1 wiemto wHeRr s syt sifufqam, 9q]s &1 HIEA

HEAIeT W? . HEAYRY U9 I AN BT &Y 8, g 2R 31 Tf=mivn ifer e 3uet Afufam, ]R&(13%E
%ﬁ% W R¢) (S 38 WM H g9 w1 SHfufrm % AW 9 FRe ¥) w5 m um H gue gee sveityd Afd
9QR& W 3¢ w1 H GNITHA TRl S,
T 3 3N Qg W . 7o sAfufEm H—

(t) 9/ 3 #, 39am (R) % wvamw, frefafed suam o zenfaa 1 S, steiq —

“(e®) Tum (R) H ofafde feet O % EN gu off e wREm 0 ugw fe S &
I QG SR weA % wd qun afided W S Sra iR U S anTat
I, S for U= AR g SR 6t T ifege g fafAidy o S, feeet e
BN ST wf=ator ®t are 9 sgafsia s fean s '

() ¥ 2R H, ITEN (2) ¥ W W, Frafafas svum wnfia w5t s, sl —

‘(%) 78 sfufram & erftn semg g i A ofafdy fdt s % € g off, v W
sref fopn o forelt fraRor e @ = ur © & enfiR o ww wnfm sifemifa
FH 9 Tt ey @ =afoa w8 fiers, W@ Twa ¥ o, S fafed fea
TN, 99 e wifger) o W wey |, S fw fafeq feen soqen wEh Ofa
¥, St for T gren gr fafafds ) we, erdter o 9

YT =R
I o9 (fafqame o sagres) afufaem, ewoe w1 d9ileA

AT T a:: &, HETURY T H Fﬂ?l‘grq w ¥ 3w g9 (fafreem ot sed) aifafqad, 2Rwe (2R9oe & 39)
D (7 w1 & v T, e T 3 T @ o %) 1 v 2, e e i O ¥
gQ0 W 3 wr  [HAN S, )

HIlTer.

oI 9 3T 93 @ o, 7@ AfufEm §—

Holrer.

(TH) w0 o #H, I9ERT () & 9van, FAfafed 78 ITam of< xenfd 1 5, s —

“(3) 3UER (R) % ATUR Bft TR ¥ qof oreed yega fRU S W, Seed wed g
I & A ¥ 30 feT w5t Fematy & i FeiEal el WS w9y
FE I ITY THR B AT R B T Y F 1IN F HT AR WA
FA T AHEA @ ¢, A1 TH T, fore ey 7 UE sneed fe e T, g,
w9 ¥ Wergiha o fean T gven smom.

() 9r1 22 H, 3UEN (3) & Uvan, Fefafed w8 3uum el e, e1oiq —

Y () IUUR (%) & STER Tl TR F goi STIE KA fRU S W, 39 T % Eed
o, foraer ey § snden fean mn §, At em sfyert s yea feu M
I TE F 30 foq 1 Fam@afy & G 3EFfa <3 @ 399 THR FE 91 3H 15
HT H AT FH A Y TR HH AT WM HH T FIE W & H THEA
A T A ISR F TEEH w1 H oTgafa 3 € T wEel S




AEAYes Uead, f&Tiew 22 AR’ 2015 ' 588 (3)

gr 9™
FHREF AfUfTH, 2R%¢ & GImeH

¢. HEAYRW U F AN U T H, FGE AW, 2284 (2984 F &) (S 3@ WM H gHF  memmer T A
yyHq A sttt ok Am | ffdE ®), w9, ™o 9w °, 3o uven Svdfua Oft 6 deifa 'g_%u@ff o

fepan e, §R%e W &3
R. gt AfuftEm H— ' O g4, &% 3T
9% HT HITre,
(TH) 91 &4 H,—

(%) 399 (R) = @ fowan S
(@) ww(a)%awmm,ﬁm%ﬁgawamwﬁaaﬁm i - —
“(3) (F) TR UL, 4R, u¥ 3R ug H ofafdy frdt ama & €0 g o, freht guws ge
FHHR FI, Frefafad wdf w1 @ fre S & ey wa gu 5 wren
o, a® H, ¥¢ "vel ¥ iy e s w1 erwfa < s weh —
() fordt ot fo7 & & Fa1 =2 9RE 9 afus 7 2,

(1) Tasm siquet =) faeme frdl v T o & o faer @ 9 ¥ st = €,

() stfaerra = faemey, fordt e § <@ & $o ¥ @6 ¥ ifus =& &,

(AR) fordt wHSR w1, T 99 § uE fo 9 aifus @ eifase sm w0 &
sTTa el fman smom oiR fadlt fammel A sifasia M % Fo w0 ww G
T=E 9 e &l e;

(qfe) TEr eAfgerter s frdt s9eR ¥ o sifrard @ age 78] 2.

(@) rfumman, HHa™ % S ok sl AR AlqerTel wM &) s ve Ofa § S
for fafga =t sme, Henf@ s,

TSRO, —30 TUYR | fqAEl’ w1 we) ot B S fF ar &% R SUEW (%)

o fezm mar 8.7
(31) 9 &8 H,—

() UM (%) H, @ve (W) 3R Wqs & o9 fFhan S,

(@) 399N (1) % wvam, frafafes sauw siaxenfya &1 S, i —

(o) TSY TRER, TRV gN, $A ufeensd, # an w1 gifvea w0 F ol v fafiis
FHE, T80 T ¢ o § Gog & 9 F o fordl wram steren fafoior gfswan
T M T FT U KT W € A FHT HCT HT ST G S 2



588 (4) AEAYeY TN, feaie 22 e’ 2015

(TF) arr e W, STUERT (2) 3R Weien & A R, fr=fafaa suam oiv wsteton ey
ferg S, ererfq

(1) YIF FUFR I, fagT o wder o & A el smm § o feT o arfyss
ﬁ%{‘aﬁfammm%,w%d‘S{aﬁ%g(Hﬁiﬁﬁf@mHW@Tﬁmﬁ?
i Torgd wfed g2 o w A & Swi—

() et goer ) oo #, & weel g & M S9F g fey e udsw e
% %M & fau s o

(81) Tt st &t o W T Ferel 9d % S SEF g feu U yds dgw for
% & & g = fa

TP ¢ —FH IR o TNk fau—
(%) IR A1 TR GRT S1ea Tl oMREl & erefi Fen SR Hed % wR

(@) St FHFR # < H, 9Re wuE ¥ omfus ¥ ol ugla gedt & w fam; o

(M) 5@ = gedt w1 3udim fear sman o qEedl A9 H S g,

<{

<o 91 aferer el &t ety &Y SO W TR ¥ o U9 fer wwd s R
HHER & HREE § w1 fmar 2.7

T D7
e faare sifufam, Lwe &1 deieA

HEAYRT T Y Ro. WEAYRT U9 ! @] g ®Y H SPEifren faaw sifufam, e3xe (3269 ® %) (S TW 9

W’LE‘IW‘T‘ o zae qvE o eifufm & am | R ) 9w 9w A, 35 gve sysfia Gft § denfea e

93%\9 T ¥ T S .

WY

UWT I, R4, 2. o At §,—

AN T &7 . . v ‘
olre, (W) 9/ -%F H, 30N (3) B wsg ‘9| =mEmerd O e’ & e W, v e

e 1 At 91 gag Afver’ sy few Si;
() ¥/ Y = H—

(%) @Ug (&) U, I "' TF FEH F GIN'' F WH W R dH wEh w e’ e
fere =T :

~

(@) @ve (@) & ©H R, fafafeg e wenfud fFo S, seoiq —
“(@) HHBR H A & qHF TH Fiae § eI T g7 S R wen < g HYi|
79 F fad a1 o7 9 9§ sfuw % sus fedl am & fou ugg faa & sirea
I F U A1 IHE dF I F 2Argd g @y Ul &, S off ifes g1, s
B, SR

() 9/ 4 T H, S9EW () W, v Cuw G F e W v e | wnfe fee



HEAYY ST, Tt 22 §ems 2015 588 (5)
HAT 91d
| TRt WAt wHwR (FRieE @ fatee e de v ) sifufEm, 9”u%
T T,
RR. WY T HI T g wY H sy gl FHER (Freis w1 fafem o) e wwd)  wemde aw
AfafTEE, 239R (3R] T 30) (ﬁ%ﬁmﬁquﬁﬁwéﬁw@ﬁﬁ%) Ealc gfirm i

9T § 38 UvET Susifua Ofg A weifud fean S,

23. 7o erfufrd |, uw o H, 39um (3) #, pof form & T ® e wenfua fa s iR
A Fefafaa atge Sirer S, siufg

g afe Wedteal SIfueid 5 STERT (2) ¥ o1 oTEeH wega fRy S o aiE @ dig
T % i =8 vfaga eew ol =&t e s €, @ oo v €9 9

YT 3718
Hre? ufiagy wHerR fafEm, ¢]8¢ &7 Wyled

2%, HEIFSR T & AN §Y &9 H " ufigsd wHER Afufray, e (R]82 H W) (S
T M H 3He gvE a fufm % oAm @ filw R) @, gw 9w § gud gve syeta dfa A

4. et eAfufem ¥, 9ra 3 #, 3uam (R) H, ol foum % o W e ey R s ek
SHF wvER FeEfatea T staenfi e s sl —

g afe fafea wiver) gr emeeT wiqa fu 9T ) qiig @ 9 feT @ sty & i
h1s idepel oTew Wia =t foran mn € af TFogiontor g, 9 @ T o e wmen
S, ’

T At
whiaua o9 faferll & atefi= 27uRrelf T WoTHs qer Ta=soT &7 SugTH

6. (2) T=fafea efufsed, stafq .—
() waA gy sifufam, ue (208 &I Y);

(=) =M fafy (fomoft 37 o Forey w @ wfaw w1 92) sfufem, g3 (3¢
1 42);

(A1) =Fan wegd sifuftam, ¢R¥e (LR¥¢ F 92);
(TR) TGl dem arfufaem, 938 (2338 & ¥);

(urm) faa daea =t (Far od) erfuftam, 9w (9Rus &1 22); § idfdw fadi o
% BId gU +ff, T WeR R, afuge gr, su ffam wifuga o afuer, —

RROR T Ro W

T % SR |,

TGS T Rl
] g w9 A
wa etfufem,
RRE&R &I 9 &
HTTer.

I 3 HT HIIEA.

AW WH H
= faug 2T
fafert o7 aefs
ITUATEN HT WITHA



"~ 588 (6) ALYy TSI, & 22 @R 2015
(%) = sfufreml & s1efia v ar i@ forg o stgen 4d o ifia e 9 § qoey
et ey @1, (Afk *1E FY), A a¥ F FEEY F FEHH B S F UvEn,
afrer d@ite frr s % o stan s gvEq gue @ tfuswman wfr 9
sy fr=g sty & fore siferan A o o7 © 3T WO Yok ol UH
ufer aga weh S for 9w 3faa wud, oA R g, et
(@) 371 Al & 17 o 9R i o M, wifa S qen 99 o a% & wReT
q gUSHg Uy F A1 1 SRS wited fRu S % q@ w1 9ve, T A a4
% FNEW § TS Y & AU =EdH UL Qo000 F AN W U
itk S 1 &9 A1 6 SER R, & AT T o HNE™ Y QUSHE ST
% T UG Q0,000 UTT TF HE TF & FREE W oA AR F fog Tug
Q0,000EﬁUﬁTmeWW.
(R) STUqY hi—
(Th)  sfEeH dfted foe s % qd, 39 IR TeEA g1 S st SRS @ el
& g R afk ww afmen § ® @ gaa @ T smom;
(2)  ARESH dited 81 99 % UYE 39 YR YOEE € S W YA 6 9RO ey
SOt IHIE g1 S
CTHET H
fafim wepm =t Uil & duwor qen fafi= ver st faarforat wega feg s
| g
HegRYr T H Qu. Frafafaa sfufrasd, safq . —
& faua TH
fafiel & arfn (W) I g9 (fafraua ot soares) erfufrem, 9o (23Wo &1 3W);
= v =t
R % Hum () wuE il sifufTam, qque (2298 I RY);
e faflir= yer
a  Preaxforat () s erfafrd, eR¥e (3R%¥¢ & &3);
A T 9 |
e (FR) SNt foane sifufem, qowo (2]we &1 R%);
(=) ot gardt wHSR (Frasm 1 fafraea i gen s afafaam, 2wl (2]wR
W 30);
(') o= fafy (foaroft 33 R o Wi 9 wfaug Tl = ge) sifufm, (e
(2R¢¢ AT UR);
(&) o wgfaen sfafem, 2282 (2382 H 43);
(e118)  AaH wergll sifuf A, ¢e’¥e (R¥<e F 22);
(A1) Hrex dftEed wHeER afuftam, 9R8e (2358 & 39)
(z) g dem oafufray, 98y (2R84 T RY);

(TINE) IS e AfufTEE, 929y (2w F 3R);



LAYy USTYH, & 22 A 2015 588 (7)

(IRE) weigl e sifuftem, 9338 (]38 H ¥);

(W) fasy Haew s (Ao wid) sfufemm, 9qus (3Rus 1 RR),
 suddl ¥ sfafde et @ & g9 gu o, U5 WER, SRV gN, Ia Sl
AT Ik e §A MU faet & orala fafead wwdl % aed # feeht Fria sferan
T gR1 G qun tfere S & @R faarfori wega & & fou oee s
&M SAerEn g w @

W T R, FEEIFT e i

ST S WA,
YT TIRE
Tehiul SUser
8¢, (%) T4 W&ER, Y8 THRE ot ¥ & 174 wd gy, 39 ifufem & syad ) frarafa fem st w5
HH & TS 9 I w9 g, ifer.

(R) 38 sifufem & oM oY TU wHw frem A% I S % uvE agwed vy, e
[ F T W W S,

2R (®) 39 sfufm & Suadl o frareem o aft #1 #feaE Sqya didt ® O 79 waR,  wiends @ @@
ST H WY RO st fady orey gr, v srfufEm % Sweel § o oW 0§ Sydy gy foRer W
TRl S HSTE H W FE F AU S mEvas e oA wid a

(R) 3Uum (%) & 1™ foren T Y SRl faum 9a1 ¥ Yed W @ S,

IV 3 HWUN T HIT
Ig fadTs fFa w1 wa o iR ofufadl & swsdl & w1 U au wHen ¥ fga # wqfEd
TREIUT HT IUSY HH F 3T U waud g9 fafiedl § geiem w0 % fou v e s R

() ¥ AR o7 wi=mion wdeRr (Feem qor don v fafree) fufTam, 2]%& (]38 &1 9) & HNT
F TN (3) F A T F e F A sy sffusfaa € ey e e 9 s & fag @
wa-dia fafed 787 € oI soferd UW ofeeq Heifya srfoa § sfafag 999 7% ofad T &1 dveel 9 39K
& fe S weal BT e w @ N F fom el Ao wiEer § uneRfa am wE % el 3uEm
(x ®) & ®1 H ©F Afafem 3udy Ser 9 ywnfad ¥, faed aft eediedl sfuewd gr s e s
uifta et fefen o0 § ot fafeq wwa-im & gvem ofufem % e Toaeieor e fem T awen .

3() WaT oI 39 Gf-mivl sHeR oo SUHT SIUFTIT, 2’98 (29RE& HT ¢) H N 3 F IYERT (2)
H fordlt fee g ST WfEE #7 Gra WSy Seufed w1 SUeY ¥ T 3w Haw § fE wfemion &
IRdfah T H Bl WifE, g aiE gk RRE, SuSH 1 uRv wgd @ el gm fafus
(wart) dfdl § af=mo @ A o gR e W ot £ UH sferEdl @ g ) & fou, W o3 @
T Afafed SUam (%) ywarfad & W1 W § fagd gay ofn 9eid aet 4 %9 w6 W FRiE g SWE aty,
ST |f=mi o T R iR U s erfafte @ R BN v w9 ¥ fafifde #) smoh ik ofemi w)
AT H o T2t g




588 (8) qEYRY TSI, a7 22 e 2015

() 9r 22 1 IuEm (R) H, frufvor syl & sy & favg ordiel =1 Swsiy sifvssfug ® e g,
9o SR o1 wf-min HHER weam suswtor fam, 9k¢ & fam v § % 39 ufww wfea wha @ § w=itE
I 7e ol w9 A faae-Tw g1 A oft frie @ fruion efusi) gro e Sue at dqol ol s e Bl §
3R 3 o Yok ot S FA € 8. oraum, U ufEwns S w1 @ wW ¥ fau, sfufem ) um o
H TN (]) & TEIGd L0 & g Q UF R H oTie F uiwEe § geied fafsd 6 ¥ fau 9w
ERIESIRG RS

¥, 3@ g9 (fafrm oiv soareq) sfufem, g]wo (2]Wo T 39) F URT © H YR (1) IR €1 23
SUYR (3) ¥, gl TR & e R SHeRl % fau orefia & sudy sifusfua ¥ wg sEe W fHRT SR
% fau =iE w9 " fafea 7€t & @i 39 w0 04 smaeq o sififede aF faas 29 & 99Ee o @ S
Ul wimaens woagal B g e H o ok ufemed ¥ uneffa s @ % R am v ol 23 ¥ endA
aAfaftad sy Sirgl ST weaferd foren s @1 € fored for afe emdeq @ofi wor @ ol €1 ok 39 sty % e
FIE AU TR w T F A 30 oA Y wwy-diw H wiea wwen S,

W(2) wREM AfufTm, R¥e (2’%¥¢ HT §3) oY ¥N &4 &I SUNR () H, frd wdwr & sifawer wrf
! wematy # wE 5 1 F fau ufwml wer ok gt § fifeg € o 10 efoee w5 & faw o of
Aferrfer €. T ogAfa W e & AU, Ye BREM W SeN-STen STeed w B 3 ol o sfed ufwman
Y S B B, AfaR @ srafy deeR W@ Fraemel o glaw 23 % fau ok sfea & Rl ww gn A
Hegll 1 T R GAT Fh FUBR I IcAGeH AR el feufy = gumd & fag, w6 & R quw st &
He 9@ R IUR! vl F Y SudY um sy Y 3UEW (3) F onefiw fafzm e wn @ ¥ ok wmw sy @ SUEMW
() ®1 @ fFan S wefaa fan s @ 2.

T ot ywifad fen s w1 € fF fadl o weR w ofaee #E e % fag wser w6l e sosie
ATt B & SuSHl % gEEm B G F o fafed www ¥ owm % R el sifvet w1 Rerd duifm s
BII.

(R) 9RI &8 I SYER (L) F @I (F) T (@) ¥, U0 Ft T4 § Aot & fau «@ & e & gay
d sudy sfysfam €. 3 Swdy gdwe gRigea #, afseel w1 wiftafy ot 9 SmrEEwa ¥ oeR0 QO 8 T E
Hfeasll & fau TR % sraer g ¥ Ay ot T w U e e e afgens # HeAE A @ S &
fag, st qeen ghlem w20 o, U9 ¢ 99 W GOR & IS H ol IR BE B H AN o4 F U Suey
Ul &8 H wwen fFy w1 W ¥ U TR g ft T uil % S I gren & fau swey ghfvea feg

(2) 4R W &t I9ER () H wogd Wi aifte gedl & Sysy fafed few mw ¥ feg sa% sae wo
fedl ®1 qol Qe % wwAr € o Sovel od 9 frdt wEeR W wemd wfed affs ged w1 STEY %S9
FHER % foau atfys giagsmes a9 & fag, o8 ywfad € fF g o) § S w0 SHER @ de F Lo
feAt 1 qoi A & uvEr S Fove ad  wegd wiEgd wedt i ety fire,

& (7)) oienfirr foarg sifafaem, swe (Rwe &1 g¥) &1 ¥ R & §, fich Rl & om ¥ fou =+
Trg-Hr fofeq 8T &1 M ¥ R we-meft faae wd @d ordia €1 WM % uvend se W ¥ faed U@ faaEl ¥
froer & wfeTdal gidt . s3rue, g8 yefad e 7w & % 9/ 3% F onf oW O i e sem %
fad @9 a9 @) gug-gimn ot Sysfud @ S

(R) faemm &m u-= o wHER ® 3T A F g dF g9 w1 Afew A1 Afew F wm w Aifem #)
HAE % ford Aogd fou S @1 yaeE ¥ wdeni % fka § w9 Suey w1 Svifud fem SRR g8 yeaed € fw
YR 4-F & GUE (W) ® dufug fmar s aife Sef w1 Q9 §, FHER F1 N 4G 1 A" 9 F9 9 FH
A HE H AN & SN A8 IUEY AR ol IR B i ewn H, ufedd & wemEfy % SNE, i
FrErgs Tl Geam g8 Hm. ‘ ‘




ey o, S 22 gtcfnsf 2015 588 (9)

(3) 9 Ru-< fuferg % HeaE W= @ 6 A B 1 STEY R T A1 A8 o1eid R STenfie v
1, (S %aa gmfas ypfa & 7 & a1 58 gaa w9 @ & g 98 T s @), s w9 w9 fyed
qeadt A W A e fHd Tow @ fom W Cuw d@ @ erfusm srer frifsa @ €, @ an g @ e
#, frefss R, wmedl, wedt ofR e fau W &% ud wsw wee W qd e eifura feen S et €
YoMy gR1 HHHR A W@ Q00 ¥ 300 T FGH FEfad §. S A w1 T & Ua R fafig sdari o
Al den fifsa w0 § g qn s8 Wanfza don T srafaat w1 w5 ot W 9 S T &
faq sl deiell ol & off @ &,

., FTEE yaE FHeR  (FEem w1 faframa ot dar vd) efufrem, 9qur (]8R &1 30) i W ¥
B IUUW (3) ¥, faemm swdy ww & A # ufEar fafea e ® e twn e SR s F
e wiE gg-din fafeq 46t =t 7€ §, foos diorreesy 18 smden afafvea wamefy & fou afteg 99 ® 94
2. orum, IRefiar S weH dur T ufeaeas o o e % T 3o fe @ wwa-d fafed e ¥ fau
@mwmwm%mmwﬁﬁ%mﬁﬁﬁmﬁamﬂmﬁﬁ%m
it 81 e T § @), Aedientor g w9 Qs fean mn wmen S

¢. AR ufiasd HHaR Afufam, 9382 (2R&2 1 9) I °RT 3 H IUUW () §, fHUdH Iuey e ¥
Usredtentor skt uiskan fafed ar & fhg T oo o & & fod o gra-dim fafeq 7t = 0 8, foas
JRomH ey U9 eTagd eifafiud Femafy % fod dfdq 99 w© wed ¥ owwm, el s @A gen U
SiRaTT ®H A R FA F A, 30 T F gma-diw fafed w0 & g u erfalten uwgew sfasenfua fean s
wefad @ e o afe Wil sfued g afe 18 yfaga ondw wie &1 fepan won @ a1 forediaor gwrm,
w1 9 o e T wwen S,

R. I <@ T ¥ o fafrm gm fafel o fommm Suddl & o, emuuel % wemA % forw i sudy = ¥,
uftoreaEy SfREeT Amell @t Ten afus B W ®, fSes wren W) afusiiEl i wy @ el %
FHIAA THT H A AU el €. Wi o Fee 3 W™ % % herd ol 9uHl % dig Feer # fow sk
ARl F@ B HA G FH FE F Ay Fow W@ afufedl O ad wifl ok Ee 3 A9 9 % HRErE @)
3UEY ¥, 99 faum & erfuemfEl gro ueme & wiem 9 U9 Omel & fatvem ¥ fou suey wwfed e s @

Ro. TEWN IR anforfves wenuei 1 smrorvas TR 4 g=9m & fau &R ome gv fafdl & suddl = e
FH & fed el afess wordlt yonelt giafeed 0 w9 orie g fafvEl % ordi wxefiora il aen foefort ot
gfaw Suesy WA & fau ww e @ T 08 Sudy fou smd R faoes @ ofsel, sifierdl qen faerfordl o
Had B, T THIFA FHe Tuif w1 H e w9 R 5% Fegediiea 9 fefiea vl § dui@ & &
ol STga B

2¢. o7d: I faerew weqa ®

T 31?-1’{@%‘ 3™
TG ¢ SRR, oy, IITHIEE: 5L,



588 (10) ' ey ST, AR 22 A 2015

yearatad fafer fafor deielt o=

wefaa fateres & 57 9l gR T wer o faumr uiwal yomifsa = s @ g s oo Frergar & —

gus 3 —3ded yd oy i 1 wremafy fafga fen e,
GUE 4— 30 YT H og gHa-d e e fafed feg e @t Gfa fafafde feg wm;
@UE R.3(W)—FW F wl 3R Afaswiar wm =l ser) = Gfa fafea fee om;

U 2. (A8 ) —TTIhT oteran TaA gry ufsEl den eifiyerg derfta #e ok faerforl wiga w0 % ol ey
fafga fre sm;

2¢. T 998 Sm;
2R, HiSTRAl & T fopu o;

% gay § T WHER faw o1 gt s Wi W@y % g,

WITEMEd SETHT
g ufes,
Hegyey faum @

Fisrer, orEeRld RO el TR AFRAl, ATy N WM FRg qRuerE, S s qen v — 2015,



T JIERES Www.govipressmp.nic.in
4 +ft SR7 @re faa S wwH

AR 299 ] Ao, TEaR, el 23 Yo 2015—4M@9 1, qF 1937

fafa oiR faurht wrf faam
A, feTis 23 S 2015

. 5076-212-3FhIE-3 (U.).—9RTd & HfOu™ & w8 348 % WU (3) & I B, ALIWRY 4
fafeat (Fenem) iR wanf Sudy fadas, 2015 (RHEF 11 W 2015) &1 SR STEE USIME % WifteR @
TAGgN YehTi¥rd fopanm Sren ©.

Clauses :

TAYSY o TSI & AH G qe SRR,
TAYT I1Ed, TR gia.

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 11 oF 2015

THE MADHYA PRADESH LABOUR LAWS (AMENDMENT) AND
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS BILL, 2015

TABLE OF CONTENTS

PART 1
PRELIMINARY

Short tital and commencement.
PART II
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
(REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1996

Amendment of Central Act No. 27 of 1996 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
Amendment of Section 7.

597



598

Heyy TS, faie 23 e 2015

PART 1II
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
WELFARE CESS ACT, 1996

4. Amendment of Central Act No. 28 of 1996 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
5. Amendment of Sections 3 and 11.

PART IV
AMENDMENT OF THE CONTRACT LABOUR (REGULATION AND ABOLITION) ACT, 1970

6. Amendment of Central Act No. 37 of 1970 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
7. Amendment of Sections 7 and 13.

PART V
AMENDMENT OF THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948

8. Amendment of Central Act No. 63 of 1948 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
9. Amendment of Sections 65, 66 and 79.

PART VI
AMENDMENT OF THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES ACT, 1947

10.  Amendment of Central Act No. 14 of 1947 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
11.  Amendment of Sections 2A, 25F and 25K.

PART VII
AMENDMENT OF THE INTER-STATE MIGRANT WORKMEN (REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT
AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1979

12.  Amendment of Central Act No. 30 of 1979 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
13, Amendment of Section 4. ‘

PART VIII
AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS ACT, 1961

14, Amendment of Central Act No. 27 of 1961 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
15.  Amendment of Section 3.

PART IX
COMPOSITION OF OFFENCES AND ABATEMENT OF TRIALS UNDER CERTAIN LABOUR LAWS

16. Composition of offences under certain Labour laws in the State of Madhya Pradesh.
PART X

EXEMPTION FROM MAINTAINING MULTIPLE REGISTERS AND SUBMISSION OF
MULTIPLE RETURNS

17.  Exemption from maintaining multiple registers and submission of multiple returns under certain Labour
Laws in the State of Madhya Pradesh.

PART XI
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

18. Power to make rules.
19. Removal of difficulties.



HEAYR TSI, fediar 23 S 2015 598 (1)
MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 11 or 2015
THE MADHYA PRADESH LABOUR LAWS (AMENDMENT) AND
MISCELLANEOQOUS PROVISIONS BILL, 2015
A Bill further to amend the—
)] Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of Employment and
Conditions of Service) Act, 1996 (No. 27 of 1996);
(it) Building and Other Construction Workers’ Welfare Cess Act, 1996 (No. 28 of
1996);
(iii) Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970);
@iv) Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948);
W) Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947);
(vi) Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of
Service) Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979);
(vii) Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961).
in their application to the State of Madhya Pradesh and to make miscellaneous provisions
regarding other Labour Laws.
Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-sixth year of the Republic
of India as follows:—
-PART 1
PRELIMINARY
1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Labout Laws (Amendment) and Short tital and
commencement.

Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 2015.
(2) It shall cone into force from the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

PART 1I
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
(REGULATION OF EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1996

2. The Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of Employment and
Conditions of Service) Act, 1996 (No. 27 of 1996) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the
principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided in this Part.

3. In the principal Act, in Section 7, after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall
be inserted, namely:—
“(3A) If no adverse order is passed in regard to registration of establishment by the
Registering Officer within the prescribed period from the date of submission
of application, then the registration shall be deemed to be duly granted.”.

Amendment of
Central Act No. 27
of 1996 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 7.



598 (2) HegYey eTH, faAid 23 el 2015
PART III
AMENDMENT OF THE BUILDING AND OTHER CONSTRUCTION WORKERS
WELFARE CESS ACT, 1996
Amendment  of 4. The Building and Other Construction Workers” Welfare Cess Act, 1996 (No. 28 of

Central Act No. 28
of 1996 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Sections 3 and 11.

Amendment of
Central Act No. 37
of 1970 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Sections 7 and 13.

1996) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the
State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

5. In the principal Act,—

(1) in Section 3, after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:— '
(IA)  Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), costs incurred on

purchase and transportation of plant and machinery meant to be used in a
factory and such other costs as may be specified by notificaion issued by
the State Government shall be excluded from the cost of construction
incurred by an employer.”;
(i1) in Section 11, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:—
“() Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules made under this Act, any
employer aggrieved by an order of assessment made under Section 5 or
by an order imposing penalty under Section 9 may, within such time as
may be prescribed, appeal to such appellate authority in such form as may
be prescribed and in such manner as may be specified by the State
Government.”.

PART IV
AMENDMENT OF THE CONTRACT LABOUR (REGULATION AND ABOLITION)
ACT, 1970

6. The Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970) (hereinafter
in this Part referred to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya
Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

7. In the principal Act,—

@ in Section 7, after sub-section (2), the following new sub-section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“3 Upon submission of an application complete in all respects, in accordance
with sub-section (1), the establishment in respect of which such application
is made shall be deemed to be duly registered if the registering officer fails
to pass an order either granting or refusing or objecting to grant or amend
the registration within a period of 30 days from the date of submission of
application.”;

(i1) in Section 13, after sub-section (3), the following new sub-section shall be
added, namely:—

@

Upon submission of an application complete in all respects in accordance



TS TSI, Al 23 @ 2015

598 (3)

with sub-section (1), the contractor in relation to an establishment in respect
of which such application is made shall be deemed to be duly licensed if
the licensing officer fails to pass an order either granting or refusing or
objecting to grant or renew or amend the license within a period of 30 days
from the date of submission of application.”.

PART V
AMENDMENT OF THE FACTORIES ACT, 1948

8. The Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948) (herecinafter in this Part referred to as the
principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner
hereinafter provided in this Part.

9. In the principal Act,—
6] in Section 65,—
(a) sub-section (2) shall be deleted;
(b) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) (a) Notwithstanding anything contained in sections 51, 52, 54 and 56, an
adult male worker may be allowed to work in a factory for more than
48 hours in a week subject to fulfilment of following conditions:—

i) the total number of hours of work in any day shall not exdeed twelve;

(i)

the spread over, inclusive of intervals for rest, shall not exceed thirteen
hours in any one day;

(ii1) the total number of hours of work in any week, including overtime,
shall not exceed sixty;

(iv) no worker shall be allowed to work overtime, for more than seven
days at a stretch and the total number of hours of overtime work in
any quarter shall not exceed one hundred and twenty five;

(v) such overtime work shall not be made compulsory or obligatory for

any worker.

(b)

The occupier shall maintain information of working hours any overtime
work of workers in such manner as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—In this sub-section “quarter” has the same meaning as in
sub-section (4) of section 64.”;

(i1) in Section 66,—
(a) in sub-section (1), clause (b) and proviso shall be omitted;

(b)
“(1A)

after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

The State Government may, by order, specify conditions for ensuring
safety of women who are required or allowed to work in any factory or
manufacturing process between the hours of 8 PM. and 6 AM.”;

(ii1) in Section 79, for sub-section (1) and Explanation 1, the following sub-section
and Explanation shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) Every worker who has worked for a period of 180 days or more in a factory
during a calender year shall be allowed during the same calendar yeat, leave

Amendment of
Central Act No. 63
of 1948 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Sections 65, 66
and 79.



598 (4) AEYQY W9, fEE 23 e 2015
with wages for a number of days calculated at the rate of—
6 if an adult, one day for every twenty days of work performed by him
during the calender year;
(i) if a child, one day for every fifteen days of work performed by him
during the calendar year.
Explanation 1.—For the purpose of this sub-section—
(a) any days of lay-off, by agreement or contract or as permissible under
the standing orders;
(b) in the case of a female worker, maternity leave for any number of
days not exceeding twelve weeks; and
() the leave earned in the year prior to that in which the leave is
enjoyed,
shall be deemed to be days on which the worker has worked in a factory for
the purpose of computation of the period of 180 days or more.”.
PART VI
AMENDMENT OF THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES ACT, 1947
Amendment of

Central Act No. 14
of 1947 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Sections 24, 25F and
25K.

Amendment of
Central Act No. 30
of 1979 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

10. The Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947) (hereinafter in this Part referred
to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in
the manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

11. In the principal Act,—

(i) in Section 2-A, in sub-section (3), for the words “the Labour Court or
Tribunal”, the words “the Labour Court or Tribunal or Conciliation Officer”
shall be substituted;

(i) in Section 25F,—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “one month's notice”, the words “three month’s
notice” shall be substituted;

(b) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(b) the workman has been paid, at the time of retrenchment, compensation
which shall be equivalent to fifteen days’ average pay for every
completed year of continuous service or any part thereof in excess of
six months, or an amount equivalent to his three months’ average pay,
whichever is more; and”;

(iii) in Section 25K, in sub-section (1), for the words “one hundred”, the words
“three hundred” shall be substituted.

PART VI
AMENDMENT OF THE INTER-STATE MIGRANT WORKMEN (REGULATION OF
EMPLOYMENT AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE) ACT, 1979

12. The Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of
Service) Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979) (hereinafter in this Part referred to as the principal Act)
shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be amended in the manner hereinafter
provided in this Part.



TGRS I, ferien 23 S 2015

598 (5)

13. In the principal Act, in Section 4, in sub-section (3), for full stop, the colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that if no adverse order is passed by the Registering Officer within thirty
days from the date of submission of application under sub-section (1), then
the registration shall be deemed to be duly granted.”.

PART VIII
AMENDMENT OF THE MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS ACT, 1961

14. The Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961) (hereinafter in this Part
referred to as the principal Act) shall in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh be
amended in the manner hereinafter provided in this Part.

15. In the principal Act, in Section 3, in sub-section (2), for full stop, the colon shall be
substituted and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

"Provided that if no adverse order is passed by the prescribed authority within a period
of 30 days from the date of submission of application, then the registration
shall be deemed to be duly granted.".

PART IX

COMPOSITION OF OFFENCES AND ABATEMENT OF TRIALS UNDER CERTAIN
LABOUR LAWS

16.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the following Acts, namely :—

@) Equal Remuneration Act, 1976 (No. 25 of 1976);

(i1) Labour Laws (Exemption from Furnishing Returns and Maintaining Registers
by certain Establishments) Act, 1988 (No. 51 of 1988);

Minimum Wages Act, 1948 (No. 11 of 1948);

Payment of Wages Act, 1936 (No. 4 of 1936);

Sales Promotion Employees (Conditions of Service) Act, 1976 (No. 11 of 1976),

(i)
(iv)
v)

an officer authorised by the State Government in this behalf by notifiicaton
may compound.

any offence punishable with only fine under these Acts committed for the
first time or after expiry of a period of two years of commitment of pervious
offence (if any), either before or after institution of the prosecution, on
realization of such amount of composition fee, as he thinks fit, not exceeding
the maximum amount of fine but not less than half of the maximum amount
of fine for the offence, or

(a)

b any offence pusishable with fine and imprisonment up to three months under
these Acts committed for the first time, either before or after institution of
the prosecution, on realization of composition fee of an amount equivalent
to ten times of the maximum fine subject to a minimum of Rs. 10,000 for
offences punishable with imprisonment up to one month Rs. 20,000 for
offences punishable with imprisonment up to two months or Rs. 30,000 for

offences punishable with imprisonment up to three months.
(2) When the offence is so compounded—

@) before the institution of the prosecution the offender shall not be liable to
prosecution and shall, if in custody, be set at liberty;

Amendment of
Section 4.

Amendment of
Central Act No. 27
of 1961 in its
application to the
State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 3.

Composition of
offences under
certain Labour laws
in the State of
Madhya Pradesh.



598 (6) ALYy ST, Tl 23 R 2015
(ii) after the institution of prosecution, the composition shall amount to acquittal
of the offender.
PART X
EXEMPTION FROM MAINTAINING MULTIPLE REGISTERS AND SUBMISSION
OF MULTIPLE RETURNS
Exemption  from 17. Notwithstanding anything contained in the provisions of the following Acts,
maintaining multiple
registers and namely —
submission of
multiple returns @) Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970);
under certain
Lab L in th
State of Madhya (i)  Equal Remuneration Act, 1976 (No. 25 of 1976);
Pradesh.
(ii1) Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948);
@av) Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947);
) Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and Conditions of
Service) Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979);
(vi) Labour Laws (Exemption from Furnishing Returns and Maintaining Registers
by certain Establishments) Act, 1988 (No. 51 of 1988);
(vii) Maternity Benefit Act, 1961 (No. 53 of 1961);
(vii)  Minimum Wages Act, 1948 (No. 11 of 1948);
(ix) Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961);
(%) Payment of Bonus Act, 1965 (No. 21 of 1965);
(xi) Payment of Gratuity Act, 1972 (No. 39 of 1972);
(xii) Payment of Wages Act, 1936 (No. 4 of 1936);

Power to make rules.

(xiii)

Sales Promotion Employees (Conditions of Service) Act, 1976 (No. 11 of
1976);

the State Government by order may devise or notify forms for maintaining
registers and records and furnishing returns by an employer or establishment
in lieu of the forms prescribed under the said Acts and the rules made
thereunder:

Provided that the State Government may allow the registers and
records to be maintained in computerised or digital formats.

PART XI
MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

18. (1) The State Government, subject to the condition of previous publication, may make
rules for the purpose of giving effect to the provisions of this Act;



TEAYRY ToITH, fEieh 23 e 2015 598 (7)

(2) All rules made under this Act shall, as soon as after they are made, be laid on the
table of the Legislative Assembly.

19. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of this Act, the State Removal of
Government may, by general or special order published in the Gazette, make such provisions difficulties.
not inconsistent with the provisions of this Act as appear to it to be necessary or expendient
for removal of the difficulty.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid on the table of the Legislative
Assembly.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

This Bill is being proposed for making amendments in certain labour laws with the objective of simplifying
the procedure and avoiding the duplicity of the provisions in the Acts and for providing the appropriate safeguards
in the interest of the workmen.

2. Under sub-section (3) of Section 7 of the Building and Other Construction Workers (Regulation of
Employment and Conditions of Service) Act, 1996 (No. 27 of 1996), provisions for registration of establishment is
laid down but no time limit is prescribed for issuing such registration and there fore possibilities to keep such
applications pending for indefinite period in the concerning office cannot be ruled out. In order to remove such
lacuna and maintaining transparency in registration procedure an additional provision is proposed to be added as
sub-section (3A), so that the registration under the Act shall be deemed to be granted after prescribed time limit,
if no adverse order is passed by the registering officer;

3. (1) In sub-section (1) of Section 3 of the Building and Other Construction Workers Welfare Cess Act,
1996 (No. 28 of 1996), there is a provision of levying cess on the cost of construction incurred by an employer
but in absence of any classification regarding what should be the actual cost of construction, assessment of cess is
being done by calculating the cost of construction in various (arbitrary) manners by different officers. To remove
such difficluties an additional sub-section (1A) of Section 3 is being proposed wherein the cost incurred by an
employer on purchase of plant and machinery from outside, not being the part of construction and other such extra
costs shall clearly be specified by the Government and will not be the part of cost of construction.

(2) In sub-section (1) of Section 11, the provisions for appeal against the order of the assessing officer is
laid down and the procedure is laid down in rule 14 of the Building and Other Construction Workers Welfare
Cess Rules, 1998. The procedure therein seems to be complicated as the employer has to deposit the full amount
of cess ordered by the assessing officer, even if it is grossly disputed and he has to deposit the appeal fee too.
Therefore, in order to remove such procedural problem, the State Government is being empowered to prescribe
amendment in procedure of appeal through proposed substitution of sub-section (1) of Section 11 of the Act.

4. In sub-section (2) of Section 7 and sub-section (3) of Section 13 of the Contract labour (Regulation and
Abolition) Act, 1970 (No. 37 of 1970), provisions for registration of principal employer and licence for contractors
are laid down but no time limit is prescribed for issuing of the same and therefore there is always a possibility of
delaying of such application for indefinite period. In order to remove such procedural difficulties and for maintaining
transparency in procedures, additional provisions under Section 7 and 13 are being proposed to be added so that
the applications are deemed to be granted in 30 days time limit if complete in all respect and no objections are
raised during this time period.

5. (1) In sub-sction (2) of Section 65 of the Factories Act, 1948 (No. 63 of 1948), powers are vested with
the Government and the Cheif Inspector for granting any exemption in the periods of overtime work of any worker
and the conditions for such overtime work are also laid down. For seeking such permission, every factory has to
apply individually and has to undergo a lengthy complicated procedure. For facilitating such employers by way
of increasing the overtime period and for enhancing the productivity and the economic conditions of workers, by
way of receiving wages for overtime at double rate, the provision for extended working hours and overtime hours
and the conditions thereof are being prescribed under sub-section (3) of Section 65, and sub-section (2) of Section
65 is being proposed to be deleted. '



598 (8) AEYRY TNU, & 23 SR 2015

This is also being proposed that no worker shall be compelled to do the overtime and the occupier shall have
to maintain the record of working hours and overtime in prescribed formats to avoid the misuse of this provisions.

(2) In clause (a) and (b) of sub-section (1) of Section 66, the provisions are laid down about restrictions of
work for women in night shifts. This provision has become obsolete in light of the scenario at present, status of
women and the awareness among them. For promoting the employment opportunity for women and therefore in
order to remove difficulty in night shift working of women while ensuring their safety, the provision for allowing
them to work from 8 PM to 6 AM is being proposed in Section 66. Provisions for their safety will also be ensured
during night shifts by the State Government.

(3) In sub-section (1) of Section 79, provisions for annual leave with wages are prescribed but that provides
annual leave with wages to a worker only after 240 days of completed service that too from next calendar year.
To make it more convenient to workers, it is proposed that the worker get the benefit of leave with wages after
completing 180 days of service and from the same calendar year by making amendment of Section 79.

6. (1) In Section 2A of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (No. 14 of 1947), no time limit is prescribed for
raising personal disputes and sometimes disputes are raised after a lapse of many years which cause difficuities in
settlement of such disputes. It is, therefore, proposed that a time limit of three years should also be provided for
raising the industrial disputes covered under Section 2A.

(2) Existing Section 25-F provides for one month's notice or wages in lieu of notice for notice period is to
be given to the workers before retrenching them. By amending this provision in the interest of the workmen, it is
proposed to amend clause (b) of Section 25 F that in case of retrenchment, three months notice and also wages
for at least three months be given to the workmen. This amendment would provide much needed financial security
to the workmen during the period of transition in case of their retrenchment.

(3) Section 25K provides for applicability of chapter VB of the Act and this chapter is applicable to such
industrial establishment (not being an establishment of a seasonal character or in which work is performed only
intermittently) in which not less than “one hundred” workmen were employed on an average per working day for
the preceding twelve months. In such establishments, prior permission of the State Government is required to be
obtained by the employer before effecting lay off, retrenchment or closure. By amendment it is proposed to increase
the number of workmen from 100 to 300, which would help and encourage the employers to employ more number
of regular workers on the rolls of establishment and also remove the procedural difficulties for small establishments
seeking such permissions.

7. In sub-section (3) of Section 4 of the Inter-State Migrant Workmen (Regulation of Employment and
Conditions of Service) Act, 1979 (No. 30 of 1979), existing provision prescribes the procedure of registration of
the establishment, but no time limit is prescribed for issuing such registration that may result into pendency of
such applications for indefinite period. Therefore, it is proposed in order to maintain transparency and remove
such procedural lacuna, to insert an additional proviso for prescribing time limit of 30 days beyond which the
registration shall be deemed to be duly granted if an adverse order is not passed by the registering officer.

8. In sub-section (2) of Section 3 of the Motor Transport Workers Act, 1961 (No. 27 of 1961), existing
provision prescribes the procedure of registration of the establishment, but no time limit is prescribed for issuing
such registration that may result into pendency of such applications for indefinite period. Therefore, it is proposed
in order to maintain transparency and remove such procedural lacuna, to insert an additional proviso for prescribing
time limit of 30 days beyond which the registration shall be deemed to be duly granted if an adverse order is not
passed by the registering officer.

9. It is observed that under the existing provisions in various labour laws, there is no provision for
compounding of offences, resulting in higher number of prosecution cases, that leads also to consumption of precious
time of Government officials and the employers as well. For speedy disposal of offences with penalties and
imprisonment up to 3 months only and to minimize the number of litigations, provision is being proposed for
deciding such cases by way of compounding by the labour department officers in only such Acts wherem the penalty
and imprisonment up to only 3 months are provided.



TR TS, TSI 23 % 2015 598 (9)

10. In order to avoid unnecessary harassment to industries and commercial establishments and to provide the
facility of simplified registers and returns under various labour laws while ensuring a more effective system for
compliance with the povisions of labour laws, it is proposed to bring in such provision wherein only smaller and
simpler intefgrated formats of registers, records and returns will be required to be maintained by the employers,
and the same would also be allowed to be maintained in computerized or digital format.

11. Hence this Bill.

Bhopal : ANTAR SINGH ARYA
Dated the 18th July, 2015. Member-In-Charge.

iz, STEERE R0 QU oREd W, TG g WEeE FRE TR, WO | Hfa 9o FeRii—2015.



	BillNo11of2015-MP.pdf
	BillNo11of2015-MPe.pdf

