
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÁgÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À̧ À s̈É 

£Á®Ì£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  
ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2024 

(2024gÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À¨sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-36) 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  

ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ಡฤ ಒಂൿ เඒಯಕ.  

 ಇย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴ ಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  

ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963 

(1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 4)ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ෷ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ;   

 ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ౲ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൤౨ ೖದඡ ವಷბದย౵  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ౲  เඋನ 

෱ಡಲದൽಂದ  ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ൤ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

1. ๸౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ౳ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ 

ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) 

ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2024 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ, ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 2. ಪർವัಗಳ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕಜච.- ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ 

ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ 4)ರย౵  (ಇದರย౵  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว౵ ೕ಍๭ං) 

“ඛඃბಶಕ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಬฆವ ಕഷಗಳว౵ ม౵  “ಆ෷ಕ౨ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ಪ౳ ತ౲ ಯಗูಂൽಡ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 3. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 15ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 15ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

 (i) ಪ౳ ๯౨ ತเฆವ ಘಡವඝ౬  (1)ඡ ಘಡๅಂൿ ๸ಒ౲ ಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 (ii) ๻ಡ ๸ಒ౲ ಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡมದ (1)ඡ ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

๳คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(2) ๬౱ ರಕವඝ౬  ದൡ౨  ൤ಡൿಆำ౶ ವ ෽ೕಜචಯലಯย౵  ౽ಲ౽ಲಃౙ  

ಅඌ๰ಚචಯ ෩ಲಕ ಕකბಟಕ ಸ౽ბರโ ඛಗൽಪല๭ฆವ ෥ಗბ๰೉ಗำ ಅಥ฿ 



2 

 
งඪ๭ฆವ ಷರൡ౨ ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඛීಧචಗಳ ಅඝ๬ರ, ಉಪඛ ಅಥ฿  ಫෳბ ಅಥ฿ 

๭ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ಸಹූಜತ౷  (LLP) ๸๲౩ , ඩฤർคಃ ಫෳბ, ಆಸ౾౨ ෷ಳ౶  ๵๴ഔಗำ 

ಅಥ฿ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗำ, ಟ౳ ๺ౣ ಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಸ౽ბชತರ ๸๲౩ ಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಆಸ౾౨ ෷ಳ౶  

ವ౲ ౾౨ ಗำ,  ಅವರ ๬ಂ๭౩ ಕ ๬෥೧ಕ ຄൕಛคಃ  (CSR) ౽ಯბಕ౳ ಮಗಳ ಅലಯย౵  

ಕකბಟಕർದ౲ ಂತเฆವ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗำ ಮൡ౨  

ಅವ๕ಷಗำ, ඩฏಪคಕ ಕಟౣ ಡಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඩฏಪคಕ ൞ಣಗಳ ರౘൕಡ, ๸ರౘൕಡ, 

೧ೕ൘ೕბർ౫ ರಃౙ , ฿๞ბಕ ඛವბಹൕಡ ๻ಟ ಪ౳ ฿๭ಗคಡ ෩ಲ ಮൡ౨  ಆඎඛಕ 

๷ಲಭ౲ ಗಳඝ౬  ಅ෗ไൽ౫ ಪലಸฤ ಅโಗಳඝ౬  ದൡ౨  ൤ಡൿಆำ౶ โದ౽ౙ ಜ ’๬౱ ರಕ ෦ತ౳ ฆ’ 

ಎಂಬ ಪഔౣ ಯย౵  ๳ರฤ ಅವฆ ಅಹბฃಜฆ൞౨ ฉ.”  

 4. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 26ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 26ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 

ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ನ (iv)ඡ ಘಡದย౵  “෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ 

ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ๻ಟ “ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ 

งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 5. ಪ౳ ಕರಣ 31ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 31ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ 

ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದย౵ ,- 

(i) ಘಡ (i)ರย౵ ನ “෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ 

ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ๻ಟ “ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(ii) ಘಡ (ii)ರย౵ ನ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ 

งඩ෵ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ౳ ൟ෽ೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

  

  

 



3 

 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 

 

 ಈ ෨ಂൽನโಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  

ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 

4)ඝ౬  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ෥ഴโൿ ಅವಶ౲ ಕๅಂൿ ಪคಗ൐๭ං,- 

 (1) ಉಪඛ ಅಥ฿ ಫෳბ ಅಥ฿ ๭ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ಸಹූಜತ౷  (LLP) ๸ಸ౩  

ಅಥ฿ ඩฤർคಃ ಫෳბ, ಆಸ౾౨ ෷ಳ౶  ๵๴ഔಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಸಹ౽ರ ๸ಘಗำ, ಟ౳ ๺ౣ

ಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಸ౽ბชತರ ๸๲౩ ಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಆಸ౾౨ ෷ಳ౶  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ’๬౱ ರಕ ෦ತ౳ ฆ  

ಪഔౣ ಯย౵  ๳ค๯โದಃౙ  ಅಹბฃಜ๯โൿ; ಮൡ౨  

 (2) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘචಛಜ ඈಡච ಮൡ౨  ๏ಃ౹ ಯඝ౬  ಪคಷౙ ค๯โൿ. 

 

ಆದ౪ คಂದ, ಈ เඒಯಕ. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  



4 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ౳  

 

ಪ౳ ๬౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ౱ ಕ ಕ౳ ಮโ ෴โඃ ກ೉౞ ನ ๅಚ౞ ವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆโൽಲ౵ . 

 

 

 

ಎೖ.ಃ.ඩഔೕฯ 

౽ඞඝ, ක౲ ಯ ಮൡ౨  ෥ನವ ಹಀౙ ಗำ, 
๸ಸൽೕಯ ವ౲ ವ๻ರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච 

๻ಟ ಪ౳ ฿๵ೕದ౲ ಮ ෱ൟ౳  

 

 
 

 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

  
 
 



5 

 

ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ ඩ౳ ೉ೕನ ಮൡ౨  ಐൟ๻๭ಕ ๬౱ ರಕಗำ ಮൡ౨  ඬฃತತ౷  ಸ౩ ಳಗಳ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅವ๕ಷಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 4)ರ ಉದ౫ ೃತ 

ූಗ 
 

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 
 

15. ಸ౷ ෵೎౟ ಯ ๋ൟಃಗำ.- ඛඃბಶಕඝ ๸ರ౾౹ ತ ๬౱ ರಕವඝ౬  ๯๭౩ ൟಯย౵ ഖౣ ಆಂഴ 

ಬฆโದ౽ౙ ಜನ ๅಚ౞ ಗัಛಜ ಸ౷ ෵೎౟  ๋ൟಡಗಳඝ౬  ๭౷ ೕಕคಸಬ๾ൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅವඝ ๻ಡ 

๭౷ ೕಕค๭ದ ෴โඃ ඛඌಗಳ ವ౲ ವ๬౩ ಪච ಮൡ౨  เඛ෽ೕಗದ ಬಡ౛  ಆඃಶಗಳඝ౬  ඛೕಡಬ๾ൿ: 

ಪฏൡ, ಈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ๭౷ ೕಕคಸมದ ෴โඃ ๋ൟಡಯඝ౬ , ෴โದ౽ౙ ಜ ๋ൟಡಯඝ౬  

ඛೕಡม෵൧ೕ ಆ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄರൡ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶಃౙ  เඛ෽ೕಜಸತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .    

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

26.  ඈಡಗำ.- 

(1) (i) ๸ರ౾౹ ತ ๬౱ ರಕವඝ౬  කಶಪല๯ವ, ൤ಡൿ๻ಀವ, ๻ඛತั๯ವ, 

ಬದม෵๯ವ, เงಪತั๯ವ, ಧറಂತರ౾ౙ ೕഴ෥ഴವ ಅಥ฿ ൿฆಪ෽ೕಗಪല๯ವ; 

ಅಥ฿  

(ii) ๸ರ౾౹ ತ ๬౱ ರಕದ ಒഷಯ ಅಥ฿ ಅඌෟೕಗർರකಜൿ౪  9ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 

ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅಥ฿ 10ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ෥ലದ ಆඃಶವඝ౬  

ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๯ವ; ಅಥ฿  

(i) ๸ರ౾౹ ತ ๬౱ ರಕൽಂದ ෴โඃ ๏ಲ౭ , ಃತ౨ ච, ಪ౳ ൟ෫, ಅฉ෷ ౯් ೉ತ౳ , ๎ಸನ ಅಥ฿ 

ಇತರ ಅಂತ๾ඃ ವ๯౨ ವඝ౬  ๬౩ ನಪಲ౵ ಟತั๯ವ; ಅಥ฿ 

(ii) 20ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣವඝ౬  ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๭ ෴โඃ ౽ಯბವඝ౬  ෥ഴವ  

-෴ವඡ ಆಗย, ෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ౽ฃ฿ಸൽಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಎರഴ 

๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಅๅರಡคಂದล 

ඈಡඛೕಯකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ .     

(2) 22ඡ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಜನ ಅඌ๰ಚචಯඝ౬  ಉಲ౵ ಂಫ๭ 

෴โඃ ඬฃತನ ವ๯౨ ವඝ౬  ಸ౩ ಳ ಬದม෵๯ವ ෴ವඡ ವ౲ ౾౨ ෷ ෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ 

เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ౽ฃ฿ಸൽಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ 

೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಅๅರಡคಂದล ඈಡඛೕಯකಗತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ෴โඃ ಅಂಥ 

ಉಲ౵ ಂಘචಯ ಬಡ౛  ವ౲ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ಅಪฃඌ෺ಂൿ ඛಣბ෵๯ವ ක౲ ෴ಲಯโ ಆඃಶದ ෩ಲಕ 

ಅಂಥ ඬฃತನ ವ๯౨ ವඝ౬  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ෨ഖౣ ತೕฤ ๻౾ಆಳ౶ ತಕౙ ං౪ ಂൿ ඛඃბ๏ಸಬ๾ൿ.    



6 

 
XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

31. ඛಯಮಗಳ ರಚකඌ౽ರ.- 

XXX                  XXX                    XXX 

(3) ಈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ෴โඃ ඛಯಮโ, ಅದರ ಉಲ౵ ಂಘච෷,- 

(i) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ (ಎ) ಘಡಃౙ  ๸ීඌ๭ ರ೉๭ದ ඛಯಮದ ๸ದಭბದย౵ , 

෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ౽ฃ฿ಸൽಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಎರഴ ๬เರ งඩ෵ಗัಡ 

เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಅๅರಡคಂದล; 

(ii) (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ౳ ಕರಣದ  (෈) ಘಡಃౙ  ๸ීඌ๭ ರ೉๭ದ ඛಯಮದ ๸ದಭბದย౵  ಐൿ 

ඞฆ งඩ෵ಗัಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬ๾ർඈಥ ೩ม౱ ච෵ಂದ-ඈಡඛೕಯ฿ಗತಀౙ ංಂൿ 

ಉಪීඌಸಬ๾ൿ.  

 (4) ಈ ಪ౳ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ರ೉๭ದ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಂൿ ඛಯಮವඝ౬ , ಅದඝ౬  ರ೉๭ ತฆ฿ಯ 

ಆದ๠ౣ  ෎ಗච ฃಜ౲  เඋನ ෱ಡಲದ ಪ౳ ൟ෽ಂൿ ಸದನದ ෨ಂං, ಅൿ ಅඌๆಶನದย౵ ฆ฿ಗ, 

ಒಂൿ ಅඌๆಶನ ಅಥ฿ ಒಂർದ ෬สಂದฏ൤ ಬฆವ ಎರഴ ಅඌๆಶನಗಳย౵  

ಅಡಕ฿ಗ๾ർඈಥ ಒഖౣ  ෩ವൡ౨  ൽವಸಗಳ ಅವඌಯವฉಡ ಇಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  ಅದඝ౬  ๻ಡ 

ಇಟౣ  ಅඌๆಶನ ಅಥ฿ ඛಕജೕತ౨ ರದ ಅඌๆಶನโ ෨౽౨ ಯ฿ಞโದಃౙ  ෨ಂ೎ ಆ ඛಯಮದย౵  

෴โඃ ෥ඩბಟඝ౬  ෥ಡ෎ಃಂൿ ಎರവ ಸದನಗำ ಒඪ౭ ದฉ, ಅಥ฿ ಆ ඛಯಮವඝ౬  

෥ಡಁಡංಂൿ ಎರവ ಸದನಗำ ಒඪ౭ ದฉ, ಆ ತฆ฿ಯ ಆ ඛಯಮโ ๸ದූბඝ๬ರ, ๻ಡ 

෥ඩბഓದ งಪದย౵  ෥ತ౳  ಪค൏ಮ౽ค෴ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಅಥ฿ ಪค൏ಮ౽ค෴ಗತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ ; 

ಆർಟ౲ , ಅಂಥ ෴โඃ ෥ඩბഖ ಅಥ฿ ರൽ౪ ෴ൟ෷ ಆ ඛಯಮದ ෬ฉಡ ๼ಂං ෥ലದ 

෴โඃ ౽ಯბದ ๭ಂඎತ౷ ಃౙ  ෇ಧಕವඝ౬ ಂഖ ෥ಡತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ౵ .      

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

À̧PÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, «PÁ¸À̧ ËzsÀ, ¨ÉAUÀ¼ÀÆgÀÄ, ¦7, PÁ À̧Æ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 23£ÉÃ dÄ¯ÉÊ 2024 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
FOURTH SESSION 

 

THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND 
ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024 

(LA Bill No. 36 of 2024) 
 

A Bill to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and 

Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961. 

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and 

Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka 

Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter  appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth  year of 

the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains 

(Amendment) Act, 2024. 

(2)It shall come into force at once. 

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical 

Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of 

1962)  (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where 

ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.   

3. Amendment of section 15.- In the  Principal Act, in section 15,- 

(i)  the existing clause shall be numbered as  clause (1) ; and  

(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“ (2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern  (LLP) or a 

Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non- 

Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled 

as ‘Smaraka Mitras’ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and 

remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation, 

preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic 



2 
 

 

and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR) programme 

as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by the 

Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of 

Notification under the scheme of Adopt  a Monument”.  

     4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section  26, in sub- 

section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and 

for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be 

substituted.  

     5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section  31, in sub-

section (3),- 

(i) in clause (i)  for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for 

the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted; 

and  

 (ii) in clause (ii)  for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one 

lakh” shall be substituted. 

  

 

 



3 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical 

Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of 

1962) to,- 

(1) make eligible a Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership 

concern (LLP) or a Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative 

Societies, Trusts or Non-Governmental Organisations or interested 

individuals to be empanelled as ‘Smaraka Mitras’.; as 

(2) revise penalty and punishment for the violation of the Act. 

 

Hence the Bill. 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



4 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure. 

 

 
H. K. PATIL 

Minister for Law and Parliamentary 
Affair, Legislation and Tourism 

 
 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 

 

  



5 
 

 

ANNEXURE 
Extract from the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological 

Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 07 of 1962) 
 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 
 

           15.  Voluntary contributions.-The Director may receive voluntary contributions 

towards the cost of maintaining a protected monument and may give orders as to the 

management and application of any funds so received by him: Provided that no 

contribution received under this section shall be applied to any purpose other than the 

purpose for which it was contributed. 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 
 

26. Penalties.- Whoever,-  

(1) (i) destroys, removes, injures, alters, defaces, imperils, or misuses a protected 

monument; or  

(ii) being the owner or occupier of a protected monument, contravenes an order 

made under sub-section (1) of section 9 or under sub-section (1) of section 10; or 

(iii) removes from a protected monument any sculpture, carving, image, bas relief, 

inscription or other like object; 

 (iv) does any act in contravention of sub-section (1) of section 20, -shall be 

punishable with imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may 

extend to two thousand rupees, or with both.  

(2) Any person who moves any antiquity in contravention of a notification under 

subsection (1) of section 22 shall be punishable with imprisonment which may extend to 

three months or fine which may extend to five hundred rupees or with both, and the court 

convicting a person of any such contravention may by order direct that such antiquity shall 

be forfeited to Government. 

 

XXX                              XXX                           XXX 
 

31. Power to make rules.-  
 

(XXX                              XXX                           XXX 
  

(3) Any rule made under this section may provide that a breach thereof shall be 

punishable,-  

(i) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (a) of sub-section (2), with 

imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may extend to two 

thousand rupees, or with both; 



6 
 

 

(ii) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (b) of sub-section (2), with fine 

which may extend to five hundred rupees.  

(4) Every rule made under this section shall be laid as soon as may be after it is 

made, before each House of the State Legislature while it is in session for a total period of 

thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two successive sessions, and if 

before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid or the session immediately following, 

both Houses agree in making any modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the 

rule should not be made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or 

be of no effect, as the case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment 

shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule. 

 

  XXX                              XXX                           XXX 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 23rd July, 2024, P7, W.D., Copies 500 


