TOTOTIC NPT
m@ﬁc ©RHEe3I

BUOFET TR D), 20 3TIT T, BTN 3B, oIS, XYMV D3Iy,
ORBERNY (B BR) I3C0DT, 2024

(20248 rREzgod Qe xoss-36)

TOEET @RS eNB), 803TWeAT A ITING) NI), R)T033, AFNY 03,
B HRNY PO, 196330, 3T eVTEN 2,0T3D ITIODT.

YY), YJEN0T FOWY WA NBLINPTON ToorddT DS DI,
80355028 A IINY e03), YU33, RINY 03y, 93FRNY 9DICHD, 1963
(19643 TU0EEIT 9RDAOND 4), 3T BB 300308 T O3NT.eNBIH)TBOOTS;

JT, T3 NPT%E  D@B,3 B RVRERE), Toe&dT Toxs PO
RDOBOTROT &8 TV0DT03 IR0 eNIZeNS:-

1. F0B R, BRIV DI), WYT0R.- (1) B8 LIRIONNTI, TOEET D3
H3), 03702 OIING D3y, YUo33, AINY DI, MSHRNY (STT)
9N, 2024 DOT FTONIT,T,.

(2) BT, B8 TPBEK DN WIB3T,,;

2. BRORYNY T3P RCLR.- Foor€dT TS DI, 03TAT A BTN
DI, RT3IF,; RPNY NI, WBHAEBAY IPACHD, 1963 (19648 TR EIT
ORI 43T, (BWT), VIN0T DR RDONNROTD 3 ENAR)
"ABETT” D0W JWMYH  0RNE  IBRNYS 9. "e3O30T” 0D  BWNFID,
CRoWETolelala TV EIOWoI L AR

3. 309 150 S3WHI_RBR.- zDR 9NN 153¢ BFTLITE),-

(i) yR,BedTe3 DOTBEI, (1) DOTROT) ROAB;ONTY, ABIT,T,,; eI,

(i) Dot ROB;OPT, BT (1) DOBET 33000 8 ORI,
ADRITLT,, DOTIT:-

"2 AITHI, BI), INDTRME  RBRLBIODRODE). ToOTOOT,
DI RTIOD TNROT TEEIT AT Tod) INDBEATNG 0NERPBNY) 9IT00



CRDATIE ROZNEY &N, QVOFPING 9ISVART, TOBN) IR0 e’ E CIT00
2€e))3 BRHBNODT RXBINI, (LLP) FOA,, [OITODT Padr’c, e3AZ O30, AL REINTD
B0 ABTT AOPNY, AN 900 ATIETIT FOA N 9GP0 SAFONY,
B3NS, 98T A0A T APRIORT BLRHBMOOT  (CSR) ToORNFFTINY e9BODE).
FOOE TR0V YRS ARSING DI, DT3Z, AIN DI,
BB, TTOROT TE BN DI, FTOTOTOT IJoony TFWR, ROTTHN,
CBRCE WO 0F, WONET DWBEDBBIN BONR  &jedANON DR aNI), SBTPIIT
ARPOZNP, 9P D BRAD) BINFIN, B3I, 3NTTRIE)TTO,N ‘Ao ST I3’
DO TE3,0DE). ALTEN 93330 L9TBE TONTIZ3."

4. FTO 260 ISWHJBR.- RO RINDT  26:3¢  JyFTLT  (1)3¢
NVTRTTLIWELS (V)¢ DOBTE). “eDRTY SONINPT" D02 BWRY TN "dTBY
BRENPSON” TN "TEY AT BRTIONTPR" D0 BWNE TN 20T ©OF
BRTIONNPNR" 02 BWNPI, 33 RAIT,T,..

5. ®¥yF0D 3180 S BR.- DR OPRIANDT 3136 JFTT  (3)3C
VTR T, -

() OB ()IBAS "&DRTY JONPINRYR" Q0w TWNY WROR  "dTR
BVRENFEIOR” D020 BWRFI, ToNR "QRTCRY AedT CRTIONNPN" D00 JWNY
TR "2,0T) OF CRTIONTIER” D02 BRNY, &3 RERIITT,,

(i) VOB (i)BOS “80xD SRTY BRTWICINPR" 0 BWNY WHANR 20T OF
BRTIONNPNR" 02 BWNPI, 33 RAIT,T,..



3

VT LINPH H3), ToONnY BCPTF

T DODIPYINPMON TOEET @3S DI, 03TeAT AIOTING) NI,
Q0033 AFNY NI, WBHINY LPICND, 1963 (19648 TIeEIT 9RO
43, BT F e300TBIIHTI) 9e3B5 T30 WONBATS, -

(1) TOBD VTRV P’e LT A BRTWNODT ABLNI, (LLP) ROX,
9G3e00 WOCNWPDT Pk, BRTOAINY, ARALEINY) 9P ABTOT FOPND, EYT,
N 9PN RTEKXIT ROA NP TR0 BRIV, BINPI, A9 0T NI

BE3,0D ). ALDRIP)TT, eIT/ETINRITHTY; 303,

(2) B3 LIPAADTNT N OFIMON OB 203, dF 0N, BOR,DRIH)T0.

333 D0, B8 IFCODNT.



SDFT W RS R,

FWA,e)3 TOAVIT T)addey) 00T 3023, 8323,8330, WwPNRPORTIYNC)..

DT B. T3>

TSR, V9503 20D, E0Te3 BB,NYD,
RORDLOD 235235000NP &N, FOAT VTSI
[ DIAVCRATALENONARAEAVOK:]

N0.3B. QTRE,
TOODNFTEF
BIOF LT PR



WO

Fooréds T930R D3I, 2038TOAT T IFINYH DI, PTo33, 3. ¥ N
D3, RTBCRNY 9PDAODHD, 1963 (19640 FOFETF 9D AOHTD 4)T NG y3
yon

XXX XXX XXX

15. B,00323.03 WO3FND.- ATEITI FOTR I A BTad0y AP0 £30, TR OTY
WARTT,NS  323,NPMN 7,008, BOINNYI, ALIDIVIBIT) DI, 9330 N
2 LTDAT O APNY &5 m,BN a3, dIASRENT W, eSTBNFI, DLTBTIT:
FTB0IB), B8 FWyTTEIT DTN A LTOROT O30T 503NN, ORI TT,N &303RTON,
BN SE €3 QT L3To,N BRTI) Y3V O30e) T3¢ NTWL3F, )O3R ENTIT,TBL)..

XXX XXX XXX
26. TOBWND.-

(1 (i) ROTZ3 AR JOTRN, ~oIdBBAVEE, INENTOTES,  TBOITRPRI,
WBOONAE, LBRITRRAPYARI, NOTWIOIZTBLBITIRIE LW  BIBITARENTERIES,

(STATND)

(ii) RNO0E3 A LITE B R0 9QPRINTCINGE), I [FTeeS (1)
T T T TN e93a00 10:3¢ RyFTRT (1) SVTW-TTTEITT a3 e300 RT 3BT,
VO OBRIES; LT

(i) R0TY 3 T TFTDOTW AI0HTE DO, T3S, &)8ed, LITOINWILT), TR €00
B3T 90IZBITK &R, AO,SBOENRRP RIS, C9ITe00

(ii) 20:3¢ TJyTTEAT (1) VR TYTTEDaT, SV OB ODeHTIE TOODE 2330, @003V

-0350a33¢ €311, EDRTY SONFINPT IR DRWTBITIVTOT FTOTIWORDOT €90 DTTID
T0e)T BRDIONNPR JRDIWBDIOWOT  ODS0N0T 90 9R38BOOTOR
TCOBALODVON T3,

(2) 223 RTyTTW (1) URBITTHET RBEENS  IPIRTIONTY, YOOI
O QT3S BAEN, R WBUANAIE O30S @353,0300 DRTY  30NHRPR
IR, DRVTIDOEOT TOURADOT €900 80530 SRT) CRTICINEN A DRWIBITTOT
ZIDANO0T BT 9RCBOOTWOR  BOWALODDINIT,E), a0I), O 90T
PV OFIOD 27, 35300, LITTIRONOTI) DLDEANIAIE V50D e3THIT NPT
90T B)TOIS 23R),e3)y ATOE TF, 23309E3,TRLE) T BBRF,3T,T3,003) DTIEEDRTIT0.



XXX XXX XXX
31, dodadne’ 8WTeDT0.-
XXX XXX XXX
(B) 3 RTTHT TR 0330e) T3 DODEE), LITT SV 0TI, -

(i) )3 NBTTTRT () DOWF, AOWOPA TBAIW DONINT IOWPFERD,,
TNRTY 3ONPINDR IA DR WTBIDIEOT TOUNIARNOT 9IG0 DT AoedT BRDWIONNRPR
IR, DRWTITOCOT I, S3CANO0T IT00 €9:3BBDOTIOR);

(ii) 2)3 OBTJTTLOT () DOTBT, AOWOPA BWATW DONTNT AOWLIETE), 8053
SPT TCRITIANLR IADIWBIDIRTOT I A0T-TOTWNLONIT, O

VB WORRWIIT.

4) B8 ByTORE D3N 33AT F3ABROT) DONNER,, LTI, T3 33250030
BSTRY,, BN T GO TNOBOT TSR OT) AW V0T, €973 L9RNIBIT).Boever,
WOTD  IRNIIT 9T WOWIT NS ROWT03 T ATBY  IRNISINT).
BT RONTIVTOT W), 3DRTI), DBANE 9RBR0ODRBN VBIT,T),; 303, LTI, TN
Qe RIS 9T DTEIRC3 BT IRNTTaY) 200T,0NWITVTR)TT, 300 €3 DONNTE),
O0eY T 330WREEIRD, VBLETOT) NTBR ABSNY) 2wD,BT, 9T &8 DODNT,
BT RTWEOR) RTVBR ABSINED 2w, B3, €3 330a3003 €3 JONRE) ROTILIE SIAOT, TN
RRDOEEIVT CRBRE), 303 BOTONTOVCAINIT, T, 9T W BOHBONTODOIINIT,TB.L) ;
3TN, €90T OVHTE e300VEE) €900 B O3503030) €3 DONTNT NETN 300 BT
00T ToODET AOGNI,T, WOGBTRNL0E) B3 TE.L..

ATFO WNTFROOD, DTG, LBoRTRD, 27, FRR , JENW 500, 233¢ w0, 2024



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA ANCIENT AND HISTORICAL MONUMENTS AND
ARCHAEOLOGICAL SITES AND REMAINS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2024

(LA Bill No. 36 of 2024)

A Bill to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and

Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ancient and
Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961, (Karnataka

Act 7 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fifth year of

the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains

(Amendment) Act, 2024.
(2)It shall come into force at once.

2. Substitution of expression.- In the Karnataka Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of
1962) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the word “Director”, where

ever it occur the word “Commissioner”, shall be substituted.
3. Amendment of section 15.- In the Principal Act, in section 15,-
(i) the existing clause shall be numbered as clause (1) ; and
(ii) after clause (1) as so numbered the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(2) A Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership concern (LLP) or a
Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative Societies, Trusts or Non-
Governmental Organisations or interested individuals are eligible to be empanelled
as ‘Smaraka Mitras’ to adopt Ancient Monuments and Archaeological sites and
remains, Heritage buildings and Heritage areas across Karnataka for conservation,

preservation, restoration and annual maintenance, development of tourist basic



2

and advance amenities under their corporate social responsibility (CSR) programme
as per the stipulated guidelines or terms and conditions set forth by the
Government of Karnataka and issued thereon from time to time by the way of

Notification under the scheme of Adopt a Monument”.

4. Amendment of section 26.- In the Principal Act, in section 26, in sub-
section (1), in clause (iv), for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and
for the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be

substituted.

5. Amendment of section 31.- In the Principal Act, in section 31, in sub-

section (3),-

(i) in clause (i) for the words “ three months” the words “two years” and for
the words “two thousand rupees” the words “Rupees one lakh” shall be substituted;

and

(ii) in clause (ii) for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “Rupees one
lakh” shall be substituted.



3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ancient and Historical
Monuments and Archeological Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 7 of
1962) to,-

(1) make eligible a Company or Firm or Limited Liability Partnership
concern (LLP) or a Partnership Firm, interested Societies or Cooperative
Societies, Trusts or Non-Governmental Organisations or interested
individuals to be empanelled as ‘Smaraka Mitras’.; as

(2) revise penalty and punishment for the violation of the Act.

Hence the Bill.



4

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.

H. K. PATIL
Minister for Law and Parliamentary
Affair, Legislation and Tourism

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



5

ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Ancient and Historical Monuments and Archeological
Sites and Remains Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 07 of 1962)

XXX XXX XXX

15. Voluntary contributions.-The Director may receive voluntary contributions
towards the cost of maintaining a protected monument and may give orders as to the
management and application of any funds so received by him: Provided that no
contribution received under this section shall be applied to any purpose other than the
purpose for which it was contributed.

XXX XXX XXX

26. Penalties.- Whoever,-

(1) (i) destroys, removes, injures, alters, defaces, imperils, or misuses a protected
monument; or

(ii) being the owner or occupier of a protected monument, contravenes an order
made under sub-section (1) of section 9 or under sub-section (1) of section 10; or

(iiij) removes from a protected monument any sculpture, carving, image, bas relief,
inscription or other like object;

(iv) does any act in contravention of sub-section (1) of section 20, -shall be
punishable with imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may
extend to two thousand rupees, or with both.

(2) Any person who moves any antiquity in contravention of a notification under
subsection (1) of section 22 shall be punishable with imprisonment which may extend to
three months or fine which may extend to five hundred rupees or with both, and the court
convicting a person of any such contravention may by order direct that such antiquity shall

be forfeited to Government.

XXX XXX XXX

31. Power to make rules.-

(XXX XXX XXX

(3) Any rule made under this section may provide that a breach thereof shall be
punishable,-

(i) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (a) of sub-section (2), with
imprisonment which may extend to three months, or with fine which may extend to two

thousand rupees, or with both;



6

(ii) in the case of a rule made with reference to clause (b) of sub-section (2), with fine
which may extend to five hundred rupees.

(4) Every rule made under this section shall be laid as soon as may be after it is
made, before each House of the State Legislature while it is in session for a total period of
thirty days which may be comprised in one session or in two successive sessions, and if
before the expiry of the session in which it is so laid or the session immediately following,
both Houses agree in making any modification in the rule or both Houses agree that the
rule should not be made, the rule shall thereafter have effect only in such modified form or
be of no effect, as the case may be; so however that any such modification or annulment

shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done under that rule.

XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 23 July, 2024, P7, W.D., Copies 500



