
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À¸À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÁgÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À̧ À s̈É 

JgÀqÀ£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2023 
(2023gÀ «zsÁ£À¸À¨sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-22) 

 

 ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ಡฤ ಒಂൿ เඒಯಕ. 
ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957 

(1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 34) ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ;   
ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൞౬ ಲౙ ඡ ವಷბದย  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  เඋನಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 

෨ಂൽඦ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 
1. ౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) 

ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2023 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
 (2) ಇൿ ಈ ಁಡว ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
 2. 30ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957 (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ 34)ರ (ಇದರย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว ೕಸมಜං) 30ඡ 
ಪ ಕರಣದย ನ (ಎ) ಘಡದ ಅඝ ೕದ . [52] () ಮൡ౨  ಅದಃౙ  ීඌದ ನ෩ൿಗಳ 
ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
 “. [52] () (ීಧಪತ , ಅಡನ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ เ ඩยಯ ෩ಲಕ ಭದ ತัದ 
෴โඃ ൞ಸ౾౨ ಯ ವಛბವൕ)  
 . (56) ධಪฑ  ಂಋ ಛ ฏഔ ಮൡ౨  ಇ- ಂಋ ಛ ฏഔಡ ීඌದ౪ ย ].-“ 

3. ಅඝಯ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದย ನ ಅඝಯย ,-   
(i) 3ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  
(ii) 4ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
“ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 (iii)  5ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
 (ಎ) ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಗคಷౣ  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ 
ಒಳಪഖౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ഖౣ ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  
 () ಘಡ (ಇ) ಯย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ii)ನย ನ  (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  න” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐವൡ౨  න”  ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  เರ 
งඩಗಳ ಗคಷౣ  ಆದฉ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಕല෫ ಇಲ ൿದಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆದฉ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಕല෫ ಇಲ ඈ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () ಘಡ (ಐ-ല) ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ 

งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ , ಗคಷ  ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , 
ກೋ ವค෴ಜ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ.”. 

(ല) ಘಡ (ಐ-ಇ) ಯย ,- 



2 

 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ೯ಡ ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ 

ಲౘ งඩ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ.”. 
(ಇ) ಘಡ (೬) ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(iv) 6ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 
(ಎ) ಘಡ (1) ರย ,-  
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕.0.1” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ ಬದยಡ 

“๕.0.5” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಲ ಅಥ฿ ಋಣದ ෮ತ౨ ದ ๕.0.5”; 
() ಘಡ (2) ರย ,-  
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕.0.1” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ ಬದยಡ 

“๕.0.5” ಎಂಬ ಪದ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಲ ಅಥ฿ ಋಣದ ෮ತ౨ ದ ๕.0.5”; 

(v) 8ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ () ಘಡದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(vi) 10ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬   
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಗคಷ  ಒಂൿ ಆೕഔ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ 
ූಗಃౙ  ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ”. 
(vii) 11ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ () ಘಡದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ 
෬ว ๕ಕറ 3/4ฏ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳ ಬದยಡ “෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  
ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಯඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ”; ಮൡ౨  

() ಉಪಘಡ (iii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 1ฏ”. 
(viii) 12ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಕඛಷ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ.”; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಕඛಷ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ.” 
(ix)  14ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 



3 

 
(ಎ) ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
() ಘಡ () ಯย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(x)  17ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xi)  19ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xii) 20ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ (4)ರย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 

“๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “๕ಕಡ ಒಂದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ 
෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๕ಕಡ ಐದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
“๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “๕ಕಡ ಒಂದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ 
෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “๕ಕಡ ಐದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() (6)ඡ ಘಡದย , (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“ಗคಷౣ  ಐൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಎರഴ งඩ”; 

()  (7)ඡ ಘಡದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xiii)  21ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
“ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 
“ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xiv)  22ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xv)  25ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xvi)  31ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ งඩ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 

“ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xvii)  33ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ (ಎ) ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xviii) 34ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ ()ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ 

“ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ ಟ ಪ ൟೕ ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ಒಂൿ 

เರ งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐൿ งඩಗำ” 
() ಘಡ (ല)ಯย ನ,- 



4 

 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (i) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ”; 

ಮൡ౨  
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (ii) ರย  (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗัಡ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ”; 

(xix) 39ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 
 (ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ)ಯย ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (1) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಒಂൿ เರ 

งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಐൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(ii) ಉಪಘಡ (2) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಐൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ෩ฆ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ ඞರ 
ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ ඞರ 
ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xx) 40ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “๕ಕറ ಐದರౣ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

(ല) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(xxi) 40-ಎ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

 (ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ,- 
(i) ಉಪಘಡ (ಎ)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(ii) ಉಪಘಡ ()ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย ನ ನ෩ൿಗಳ ಬದยಡ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
“ಐൿ เರ งඩಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಗคಷ  ಇಪ౭ ౨ ೖൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ   

ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗಳ ීಡ฿ಳ ෮ತ౨ ವඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಪ ൟ ಐൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ”; ಮൡ౨  

 () ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “๕ಕಡ ෩ฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ  
“๕ಕಡ ಐൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(xxii) 41ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  



5 

 
() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  
(ല) ಘಡ (ല) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
 (ಇ) ಘಡ (ಎෆ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 
(ಎෆ) ಘಡ (೧) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 

ಬದยಡ “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  
(೧) ಘಡ (ಎೖ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxiii)  44ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxiv)  45ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩ ಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxv) 47ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (ಎ) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಐವൡ౨  න” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ 
งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxvi)  51ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ () ಘಡದ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxvii) 52ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ () ರย ನ ಉಪಘಡ (ii)ರ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  
ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ () ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xxviii) 54ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದย ನ,- 

(ಎ) ಘಡ (i) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

() ಘಡ (ii) ರย ನ (3)ඡ ౽อನย  “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ 
ಬದยಡ “ಎರഴ เರ งඩಗำ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (xxix) 55ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 
  “56.  ಂಋ ಛ ฏഔಡ ීಧಪഔౣ ದ౪ ย ,- 

(i) ධಪฑ   ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ ීඌฆವย  ෩ฆ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 
(ii) ಇ- ಂಋ  ಛ ฏഔಡ ීඌฆವย  ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 
 

 



6 

 

ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 
 

 ಃಲโ ಪ ಕರಣಗಳย  ౣ ಂඬ ๑ಲౙ ದ ದರವඝ౬  ກ ಸฤ ಮൡ౨   ಂಋ ಛ ฏഔಗಳ ෬ว 

ౣ ಂඬ ๑ಲౙ ವඝ౬  เඌโದಃౙ  ීඌඈ ಪ  ೕಕ ಉಪීಧವඝ౬  ಕย౭ ಸฤ ಕකბಟಕ 

ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957 (1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 34)ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ 

ಅವಶ ಕๅಂൿ ಪคಗං. 

 

ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඒಯಕ. 

  

. 

 

 

  



7 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ  

 

ಪ ౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ ಕ ಕ ಮโ ෴โඃ ກ ನ ๅಚ ವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆโൽಲ .  

 

 

 
ಂಷ౧  ෞชದಡ 
   ಉർಯ ൟ  

 
 

 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

  
 
 
 
 
 
 



8 

 
ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ ౣ ಂඬ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1957ರ 
(1957ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 34)ರ ಉඁತ ූಗ 

xxx      xxx   xxx 
ಅඝ 

xxx      xxx   xxx 

3. ದತ౨ ಕ ಪತ .- ಎಂದฉ ದತ౨ ಕವඝ౬  ർಖฤ 
ഴವ, ಅಥ฿ ದൡ౨  ಡൿಆಳ ฤ ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  
ಪ ർನ ഴವ ಅಥ฿ ಪ ർನ ഴโർಜ 
൞ತ౭ ಯბ฿ಞವ ෴โඃ ยತ (ಮರಣ 
๎ಸನವඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല)  

ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

4. ಅඹಡเഡ.-  

 ಪ ಣ ഴโದಃౙ  ಬದมಜ ඁുೕಕคಸฤ 
ಅಥ฿ ಳೕಸฤ ౽ඞඛನ ෩ಲಕ 
ಅඝಮൟಸมದ ವ ౾౨ ಗಳ ದಭბದย ನ ඁുೕಕರಣ 
ಅಥ฿ ಳೕಷൕ. 

ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  งඩಗำ 

 

5. ಒಪ౭ ಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ർಖวಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
ಒಪ౭ ಂದದ เವರಣ ಪತ ,- 

(ಎ) XXX 

()ಸ౽ბค ಭದ ಯ ಖคೕൽ ಅಥ฿ ฃಟಃౙ  
ීඌฆವย  

 

 

 

 
 

ಗคಷ  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  
ಅಂಥ ಭದ ಯ ಖคೕൽ ಅಥ฿ ದූბඝರ 
ฃಟದ ಸಮಯದย  ಅದರ ಲ ದ ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  
เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ 
งඩ. 

(ಇ) ౩ ರ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฃಟಃౙ  ීඌฆವย  
ಕฃರඝ౬  ූಗಶ:฿ಜ ඛವბฆವย ,-   

 

(i) XXX 

 (ii) ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ  ౷ ඌೕನಯඝ౬   ඛೕಡඃ ಇದ౪ ย ,  

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

ಪ ൟಫಲದ ෮ತ౨ ಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ 
෬ว ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  เರ งඩಗಳ ಗคಷ  ಆದฉ 
ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಕല෫ ಇಲ ൿದಃౙ  
ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಹൡ౨  න: 

 

xxx      xxx   xxx 



9 

 

14 ยತಗಳ ರൽ౪ ෴ൟ.-(ಎ) ಅඝಯ 
ಮൡ౨  ಅඝ ಂದ เ๕ಷ฿ಜ 
ಉಪීඌರದ ຄರൡ ෴โඃ ಅඝ ೕಧದ 
ಪ ౽ರ ർಯ ಡมದ ౣ ಂභ ಂಕದ 
෬ว ෨ಂತ฿ಜ ౽ಯბงಪಃౙ  ීದ 
෴โඃ ยತದ ರൽ౫ ෴ൟ. 

       

 

 
 

() ಄ಂದ  ಸ౽ბರ ಅಥ฿ ತ൞ౙ ಲ ದย  
೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛನ ෩ಲಕ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರലಯย  ರಸมದ ಸ౩ ัೕಯ 
ඩ ඌ౽ರ ಅಥ฿ ಇತฉ ඩ ඌ౽ರ ಅಥ฿ ಄ಂದ  
ಸ౽ბರ ಅಥ฿ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ තಣბ฿ಜ 
ຄಂൽฆವ ಅಥ฿ ඛತ ಣ 
ದย ഖౣ ಆಂലฆವ ඛಗ෦ತ ඛ౽ಯದ ෩ಲಕ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ಪರ฿ಜ ౽ಯბงಪಃౙ  ൪ದ 
෴โඃ ยತದ ರൽ౪ ෴ൟ. 

() ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย ,-  

ಕฃฆ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ർಖวಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಒಂൿ 
ಕฃฆ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ  ಒ  (5) (ಇ)  

(i), ഴಗഷ (ಒ  45) ವ ವ౩ ಪක ಪತ ದ 
ರൽ౫ ෴ൟ (ಒ .48-) ಢಯඝ౬  
ഖౣ ಆഴโൿ (ಒ .51) ಇโಗಳඝ౬  ඣೕല 

 

เವರൕ.- ෩ಲ ยತโ, ಅඌඛಯಮದ 45-ಎ 
ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ 
ඛಧბರൕಡ ಒಳಪഔౣ ൿ౪ , ಅಂಥ ยತದ 
ರൽ౫ ෴ൟಯ ෬ยನ ౣ ಂභ ಂಕโ 
ಅඌඛಯಮದ 45-ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದലಯย  
ඛಧბคದౣ ೕ ಆಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

ಅಂಥ ರൿ౪ ಪലเಃ, ಈಛಗศ ෩ಲ ยತ 
ಪತ ದ ෩ಲಕ ಹ౨ ಂತರತಂಡ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ಮฆ 
ಹ౨ ಂತರದ ෬ว ಪค൏ಮ ലದ౪ ฉ, ෩ಲ 
ಹ౨ ಂತರದ ෬ยನౣ ೕ ๑ಲౙ : 

ಪฏൡ, ෩ಲ ยತ ಪತ โ ฃಟದ ෬ยನ 
ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ฿ಜದ౪ ย , ಆಗ ಅಂಥ ರൿ౪ ಪലเಃ 
ยತ ಪತ ದ ෬ว ർಯ ಡ౽ದ ౣ ಂඬ 
๑ಲౙ โ, ಅඝ ೕದ 20(1)ರ ಅನ౷ ಯ, ಅಂಥ 
ರൿ౪ ಪലเಃಯඝ౬  ಬฉൿಆഴವ ൽකಂಕඈൿ 
ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว. 
 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

17 ඣೕಂದ ಪ ಣಪತ .-ක ಯ฿ൽಗಳ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ರ (1961ರ ಄ಂർ ඌඛಯಮ 
25) ෬ฉಡ ฃಜ  ฑ ಈඛ౺ ยನವฆ 
ತ෴คದ ಮൡ౨  ಇഖౣ ಆಂഴ ීದ 
ක ಯ฿ൽಗಳ ಪഔౣ ಯย  คเಃಯ 
ಪ ಣ ಪತ . 
 

ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

19. ಒഽಬലಃ ಪತ  ಎಂದฉ ಋ 
ಬฉൿಆಟౣ  ෴ವ ยತದ ෩ಲಕ ಅವඝ 
ತನ౬  ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  ಲಆಟౣ ವರ ಪ ೕಜನ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಹ౨ ಂತคವඣೕ ಅಥ฿ ಲ ಆಟౣ ವคಡ 
ಅವರ ಋಣಗಳ ෬ว ಒഽಬലಃ ಅಥ฿ 
ലเഷಂലನ ർಯವඝ౬  
ಭದ ತัಸมಜංೕ ಅಥ฿ ಅವನ ಲ 

ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 



10 

 
ಆಟౣ ವರ ಪ ೕಜನ౽ౙ ಜ ಪค๏ೕಲಕರ ෬ย౷  
ೈರൕಯย  ಅಥ฿ ษಸඨ౺  ಪತ ಗಳ ෬ฉಡ 
ಋಯ ವ ವರವඝ౬  ෨ಂൿವคโದ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಏඩბഴ ಡมಜංೕ, ಆ ෴โඃ ยತ 

20. ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ ಪತ .-  

(4) ಉಪඛಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ರ ಪ ಕರಣ 394ರ 
ಅലಯย  ಕ౨  ක ෴ඌ౽ರಣಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
ඩ ඌ౽ರಗಳ ಅലಯย  ಅಥ฿ 
ಉಚ ක ෴ಲಯโ ലದ ಒಂൿ ಅඃಶಃౙ  
ීಧಪഔౣ ದ౪ ฉ. 
 

(i) ൣ ಉಪඛಂൽಡ තರಕ เยೕನವඞ౬  
ಒಳತಂഽ ಉಪඛಗಳ  เยೕನದ 
ීಧದย , 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ದย ฆವ ಮൡ౨  ವಛბವൕ ಪഷದ 
ಉಪඛಡ ವಛბಸมದ ವಛბವൕ ഴವ 
ಉಪඛಯ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ๕ಕറ 
෩ರರౣ  ಅಥ฿ 

เඛಮಯದย  ಅಥ฿ ಅನ ൭ ඛೕലದ ಅಥ฿ ງಃ 
ലದ ฆಗಳ ಒഓౣ ฉ ಲ ದ ๕ಕಡ ಒಂದಃౙ  
ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ ಮൡ౨  තರಕ ಉಪඛಯ 
ದಭბದย  ฆಗำ ൣ ಉಪඛಂൽಡ 
เยೕನತಂലದ౪ ฉ (ಅಥ฿ ರർ౪ ಜದ౪ ฉ) ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ 
೯ಡ ಇಂಥ เยೕನಃౙ  ಪคಗಣචಯย ฆವ ෮ಬಲಞ 
ಇๅರಡರย  ෴โൿ ກ ೕ ಅದඝ౬  ർಯ 
ഴโൿ. 

(ii)ಉಪඛಯ ඬನฑ ඛბಣ ಅಥ฿ 
ലಮಜბฑನ ීಧದย ,- 

 

 

 

 

 

ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ದย ฆವ ಮൡ౨  ವಛბವൕ ಪഷದ, 
ಉಪඛಡ ವಛბಸมದ ವಛბವൕ ഴವ 
ಉಪඛ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว๕ಕറ 
෩ರರౣ  ಅಥ฿ คಸยౣ ಂ ಉಪඛಡ เತคದ 
ಅಥ฿ ງಃ ലದ ฆಗಳ ಒഖౣ  ಲ ದ 
๕ಕಡ ಒಂದಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಞ ಮൡ౨  ಇದರ 
೯ಡ, ಅಂಥ ലಮಜბฑ ಅಥ฿ ඬನฑ ඛბಣಃౙ  
ർಯ ലದ౪ ย  ಪคಗಣචಯย ฆವ ෮ಬಲಞ, 
ಇๅರಡರย  ෴โൿ ກ ೕ ಅൿ. 

(6) ౭ ಷฯ ಪಪბ ๅಕฯ ಡ (ಎ.ඪ.เ) 
ಅಥ฿ ಅโಗಳඝ౬  ෴โඃ ກಸค ඛಂದ 
ಕฉಯย, ಭದ  ಒದಜವ ಪ ౾ ಯ ීಧ 
ದย  ಭದ ൟೕಕರಣ ಞ ඬನඛბಣ ಮൡ౨  
ಭದ ಯ ಬല ಯ ಅಮฤ ೦ค ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
2002 ರലಯย  ෩ಲಕತბඛಂದ 
౷ ೕಕคಸಬർದโಗಳ ವಆഴเಃಡ 
ීඌದ౪ ฉ. 
 

(7) ವಛბವೕಯ ಅไൽ౫  ಹಀౙ ಗัಡ 
ීඌದ ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ ಪತ  

ಗคಷౣ  ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ 
เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ 
งඩ. 

 

 

 
 

ಹ౨ ಂತರಣದ ವ౨  เಷಯ฿ಜฆವ ಅಂಥ 
ವಛბವೕಯ ಅไൽ౫  ಹಀౙ ಗัಡ ಅವ౽ಶ ඛೕഴವ 
฿ൽ ූಗದ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ಃౙ  ಸಮකದ 
ವಛბವೕಯ ಅไൽ౫  ಹಀౙ ಗಳ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ  
ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ಹ౨ ಂತರಣದ ಪ ൟಫಲ, ಇದರย  
෴โൿ ກ ೕ, ಅದರ ෬ว ๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ . 



11 

 

21.  ಪ ൟ ಅಥ฿ ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ.- ෴ವඡ 
ಸ౽ბค ಅඌ౽คಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಅವನ ಆඃಶದ 
෩ಲಕ ඛಜ฿ದ ಪ ൟ ಅಥ฿ ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ 
ಎಂ්ർಜ ಪ ೕಕคಸมದ ಮൡ౨  
ක ෴ಲಯ ඪೕ೩ಗัಡ ීಧಪಟౣ ಂ 
ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ౽ඞඛನ ෬ฉಡ 
เඌಸಬർಜಲ ඈಥ ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗದ ಪ ൟ. 
 

(i) ෩ಲದ ෬ว ಂಕವඝ౬  
เඌಸಬർಜಲ ൽದ౪ ฉ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ෬ว 
เඌಸಬർಜದ౪  ಂಕโ ಐൿ 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕರൽದ౪ ฉ. 
 

(ii) ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 

 

 

 

 
 

ಐൿ งඩಗำ 

 

 
 

ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ 

 

22. ಂಕ เඌಸಬർದ ಮൡ౨  ಸค෴ದ 
ಂಕವඝ౬  ർಯ ലඈಥ ෴โඃ 
ยತಗಳ ಪ ൟ งಪ ಅಥ฿ ൽ౷ ಪ ൟ. 

(ಎ) ෩ಲ ยತಃౙ  เඌಸಬർದ ಂಕโ 
ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ෦ೕರൽದ౪ ฉ 

() ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 

 
 

෩ಲದ ෬ว ർಯ ಡತಕౙ ಂಥඃ ಂಕ. 
 

ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

25. เ฿ಹ เ ೕಧನ-ยತ.- ෴ವ ยತದ 
෩ಲಕ ෴่ಬ౯  ವ ౾౨  ತನ౬  เ฿ಹವඝ౬  
เಘഔ ಆำ ൞౨ ඣೕ ಆ ෴โඃ ยತ. 

ವರದ౾౹ ൕ ยತ-ವ ವ౩  (ಒ  48)ඝ౬  ඣೕല. 

ൽ౷ ಪ ൟ-ಪ ൟงಪ (.22) ඣೕല 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 
 

31. ෴โඃ ಉಪඛ ಅಥ฿ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ತ 
ಉಪඛಯย ನ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಉಪඛ ಅಥ฿ 
ಉං౪ ೕ๏ತ ಉಪඛ ಎತ౨ ౽ದ ෴โඃ 
ಲಃౙ  ීඌඈ ฆಗಳ ງಃ ಪತ . 

ಪ ಣ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ದ౨ ๆಜඝ౬  (ಒ  
16) ಸಹ ඣೕല.  ಌತค ಪತ -ಒಪ౭ ಂದವඝ౬  
(ಒ  5) ඣೕല. 

ಒಂൿ งඩ 

 

33. ಉಪඛಯ ಘದ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ .- 

(ಎ) ಉಪඛಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1956ರ (1956ರ 
಄ಂದ  ಅඌඛಯಮ 1)26ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ಘದ ඛಯವัಗಳ ೯ಡ ಇದ౪ ฉ, 

 

() ಡ ೯ಡ ಇಲ ൽದ౪ ฉ, 

 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 

 

 

ಉಪඛಯ ฆ ීಡ฿ಳಕౙ ඝರ฿ಜ 
ಅඝ ೕದದല (.10) ಘದ ඛಯವัಗಳ ෬ว 
เඌಸಬർದౣ ೕ ಂಕ 



12 

 

34. ಹಀౙ ಪತ ಗಳඛ౬ ഴโൿ.-  

() ෩ಲ ಅಥ฿ ඩ ಥ෦ಕ ಭದ ൞ ಪತ ಃౙ  
ಯ൶ೕತ฿ಜ ౣ ಂඬ ಕมಜದ౪ ย , ಸಹ 
ಭದ  ಅಥ฿ තರಕ ಭದ  ಅಥ฿ ກೋ ವค 
ಭದ  ಅಥ฿ ಪ ൟ ಭದ  ಅಥ฿ ෬ಲౙ ಂಡ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ກ ನ ಭರವ ඛೕലർಗ,-  

(i) ಭದ ಛಜ ඛೕലದ 1,000 งඩಗัಡ 
෦ೕರದ ಪ ൟಂൿ ෮ತ౨ ಃౙ  

(ii)1000 งඩಗัಡ ກೋ ವค ෴ಜ 
ಭದ ෴ಜ ඛೕലದ ಪ ൟ 1000 งඩಗัಡ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  

(ല) ಚರಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ಆඋರ౽ౙ ಜ ಲ ಅಥ฿ ಋಣโ 
ലಃಯ ෬ว ർಯ฿ದฉ, 

(i) ಲದ ෮ತ౨ โ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗำ 
෦ೕರൽฆವย ; 

 

(ii) ಲದ ෮ತ౨ โ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗಳඝ౬  
෦ೕฆವย ; 

 

 

 

 
 

ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ 
 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ ກೋ ವค෴ಜ භರൟ 
ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  
ಹൡ౨  งඩಗಳ ೯ಡ ಒಂൿ งඩ 

 
 

ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  
ಹൡ౨  งඩಗำ. 

 

ಗคಷ  ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัತಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಹൡ౨  
เರ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  
งඩಗำ. 

39. เಭಜච ยತ ಪತ โ,-2 (1) (ಃ) ಪ ಕರಣದ 
෩ಲಕ ಉว ೕಸมඈ, 

 

       (ಎ) เಭಜචಯย  ಒಳತಂಡ ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  
ಂತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಪคವൟბದย  ಅಥ฿ 
ಂತರ ಬಳಃಯ ಸฤ฿ಜ ಇದ౪ ย  

 

(1)  ಆ ಸ౷ ൡ౨ , පರ ඛಗಮ ಅಥ฿ 
ನಗฃไൽ౫  ඩ ඌ౽ರಗำ ಅಥ฿ 
පರ ಪคಷൡ౨  ಅಥ฿ ಪಟౣ ಣ 
ඵೈಯൟಗಳ ಅඌ౽ರ ฿ ඪ౨ ಳಡ 
ಇದ౪ ย  

 

(2) ಆ ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ෬ಲౙ ಂಡ (1)ඡ ಉಪ ಘಡದย  
ನ෩ൽಸมದโಗಳඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല 
ಉัದ ಪ ඃಶಗಳย  ಇದ౪ ย  

 

() เಭಜචಯย  ಒಳತಂಡ ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ಂ 
ಜ෦ೕකಜದ౪ ย  

 

() เಭಜචಯย  ಒಳತಂಡ ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ಚฃ౨  
ಅಥ฿ ಹಣದ งಪದย ದ౪ ย  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 

 

 
 

ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಐൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ. 
 

 

ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ ඞರ ಐವൡ౨  
งඩಗำ 

 

ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ಎರഴ ඞರ ಐವൡ౨  
งඩಗำ 

 

ಅಂಥ ಪ ൟಂൿ ඩยಡ ෬ಲౙ ಂಡ (ಎ), () ಅಥ฿ 
() ಉಪ-ಘಡಗಳย  เವคಸมದ ಂಕಗಳ ಒഖౣ  
෮ತ౨ : 



13 

 
(ല) เಭಜචಯย  ಒಳತಂಡ ಸ౷ ൡ౨ , ෬ಲౙ ಂಡ 
(ಎ), () ಮൡ౨  () ಉಪ ಘಡಗಳย  
ನ෩ൽಸมದ ಎರവ ಪ ವಗბಗัಡ 
ීඌർ౪ ದย  

40. ඩฤർคಃ.-  

.ඬකರಚච:- 

        (ಎ) ඩฤർರ ಅಥ฿ ඩฤർರฆ ฆ 
งಪದย  ಸย ದ ౩ ರ ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ಅವฆ 
ඛಗბ෦ವ ಸಮಯದย  ಫ෦ბನย  
ಉัದย , ಅಂಥ ඩฤർರ ಅಥ฿ 
ඩฤർರฆ ෴โඃ คೕൟಯย  ಅಂಥ 
ඩฤಛคಃ ಫಮბඝ౬  ඬನರბಚච ലದย . 

        ()෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย    

.เಘಟච:- 

        (ಎ) ඩฤർคಃ ಆฏಭ฿ർಗ ಒಬ౯  
ඩฤർರඛಡ ಅಥ฿ ඩฤർರคಡ 
คದಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  ಮ൧౨ ಬ౯  ඩฤർರ ಅಥ฿ 
ඩฤർರคಡ เತರൕ ಅಥ฿ ງಃ 
ലದ౪ ย  

 
 

       () ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 

 

ಫ෦ბನย  ಉัൽฆವ ౩ ರ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  วಯ 
෬ว ๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ  

 

 
 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 

 

ಡ เಘಟච෴ർಗ ಅಂಥ ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  เತರൕ ಅಥ฿ 
ງಃ ലರൽದ౪ ย  ಅಥ฿ ඛೕലರൽದ౪ ย  ർಯ 
ಡ౽ಞൟ౨ ದ౪  ಂಕದ ೯ಡ, ඩฤർರ ಅಥ฿ 
ඩฤർರคಡ เಘಟක ಪತ ದ ಅലಯย  เತರൕ 
ಅಥ฿ ງಃ ಡมಜದ౪ ง ಅಥ฿ ඛೕಡมಜದ౪  
ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  วಯ ෬ว ๕ಕറ ෩ರರౣ  
 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 

40ಎ. ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ඩฤർคಃ,- 

 

ಎ. ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ඩฤർคಃಯ ౩ ಪච 
ಅಥ฿ ಫෳბ/ಌಸಜ ಉಪඛ/ಪഔౣ ಯย ಲ ದ 
ವბಜඛಕ ೕ෦ತ ಉಪඛಯඝ౬  ೕ෦ತ 
ຄൕಛคಃ ඩฤർคಃಯක౬ ಜ 
ಪბലเಃ. 
 

       (ಎ) ීಡ฿ಳโ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕರൽฆವย  

        () ීಡ฿ಳโ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದย ; ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคದ ಪ ൟ ಐൿ ಲౘ 
งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  
 

 

. ೕ෦ತ ຄൕಛคಃ ඩฤർคಃಯ 
ඬකರಚච ಅಥ฿ ೕಜච 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 
 

 ಒಂൿ เರದ งඩಗำ ೯ಡ ීಡ฿ಳ 
෮ತ౨ โ ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಟ ෦ೕคದย  ಗคಷ  
ಹൡ౨  ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಪ ൟ ಐൿ ಲౘ 
งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಐൿ ඞฆ 
งඩಗำ 
 

ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ದย ฆವ ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ ೕ෦ತ 
ຄൕಛคಃ ඩฤർคಃಯ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ಪ ൟಫಲ ಅಥ฿ 
ฆಕങౣ  ಲ  ಇโಗಳย  ෴โൿ ກ ೕ ಅದರ 
෬ยನ ๕ಕಡ ෩ฆ. 



14 

 

41. ෮ಌ౨  ರක෫ಗำ,- ಪ ൟඛඌ ಪತ ವಲ ದ 
(2(1) (ඪ) ಪ ಕರಣದ ෩ಲಕ ಪคූඈ) 
 

           (ಎ) ಒಂඃ ವ ವರಃౙ  ීಧಪಟౣ ಂ 
ಅಥ฿ ಒಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ກೋ  ಅಂಥ 
ർ౨ ๆ೩ಗಳඝ౬  ಬฉൿ ಆഔౣ ฆโದඝ౬  
ಅಂಜೕಕคโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಒಂൿ  ಅಥ฿ ກೋ  
ದ౨ ๆ೩ಗಳ ඣೕಂದಯඝ౬  
අರ౾ಆำ ವ ಏಅಕ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬฉൿ 
ಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ; 

          () (ಎ) ಘಡದย  ನ෩ൽದ 
ದಭბವඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല ಒಂඃ 
ವ ವರದย  ౽ಯბ ඛವბಸฤ ಒಬ౯  ಅಥ฿ 
ກೋ  ವ ౾౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ಅඌಂತತัฆ฿ಗ; 
 

          () ಒಂದ౾ౙ ಂತ ກೋ  ವ ವರದย  
ೲഔ෴ಜ ಮൡ౨  ಪ  ೕಕ฿ಜ ಅಥ฿ 
ನ ฿ಜ ౽ಯბඛವბಸฤ ಐದ౾ౙ ಂತ 
ກೋ  ವ ౾౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ಅඌಂತತัฆ฿ಗ; 
 

           (ല) ಒಂದ౾ౙ ಂತ ກೋ  ವ ವರದย  
ೲഔ෴ಜ ಮൡ౨  ಪ  ೕಕ฿ಜ ಅಥ฿ 
ನ ฿ಜ ౽ಯბඛವბಸฤ ಐದ౾ౙ ಂತ 
ກೋ  ಆದฉ ಹತ౨ ౾ౙ ಂತ ກ ಲ ದ ವ ౾౨ ಗಳඝ౬  
ಅඌಂತತัฆ฿ಗ; 
 

                 (ಇ) ಪ ൟಫಲಧನಃౙ  ಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ 
ಮൡ౨ /ಅಥ฿ ೯ಡ ൞ಸ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  
෴โඃ ౩ ರ ಆ౨ ಯඝ౬  ฃಟ ഴವ 
ಅವ౽ಶವඝ౬  ಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 
 

 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 
 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 
 

ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 
 

 

ಪ ൟಫಲಧನ ಅಥ฿ ෨ಌ౨  ฆක෫ಯ ವ౨  
เಷಯ฿ದ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ  ಇโಗಳย  
෴โൿ ກ ೕ ಅದರ ෬ว [20(1)ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ] 
ಅലಯย  ಹ౨ ಂತರ ಪತ ಃౙ  เඌವౣ ೕ ๑ಲౙ : 
 

ಪฏൡ, ಅඝ ೕದ 5(ಇ)ರ ಅലಯย  ฃಟ ಕฃคನ 
෬ว ಅಥ฿ ฃಟ ಅಥ฿ ದූბඝರ฿ಜ 
ವಛბವൕಯ ยತದ ෬ว ඩವൟಸมದ ෨ർ ಂಕ 
ಂಕವඝ౬  ಅඃ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ಡ ීඌඈ, ಅඃ 
ಪౘ౽ರರ ನഴๅ ಅඝ ೕದ 41(ಇ)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛೕഴವ 
෨ಌ౨  ರකಮದ ෬ว ඩವൟಸ౽ದ ෨ർ ಂಕ 
๑ಲౙ ದย  ຄಂർಃ ലಆಳ ౽ಞತ౨ ං.  

Xx                 xx                        xx  

 

(ಇ) ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ದย ฆವ ౩ ರ ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  
ฆโದಃౙ  ීඌඈ ඩ ඌಂತකದ 
ವ ౾౨ , ಬฉൿ ಆഴವವನ ൪ං, ൞, ಪൟ౬ , 
ಅಥ฿ ಪൟ, ಧഴ ಮಕౙ ำ, ກ౧  ಮಕౙ ำ, 
ಸຄೕದರฆ, ಸຄೕದค ಯರඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല 
ಇತರ ವ ౾౨ ಡ ඛೕലർಗ, 

 

 ෨ಌ౨  ฆක෫ಯ ವ౨  เಷಯ฿ದ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ 
ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว 20 (1)ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ 
ಅലಯย  ಹ౨ ಂತರ ಪತ ಃౙ  เඌವౣ ೕ ๑ಲౙ : 

ಪฏൡ, ಅඝ ೕದ 5(ಇ)ರ ಅലಯย  ฃಟ 
ಕฃคನ ෬ว ಅಥ฿ ฃಟ ಅಥ฿ 
ದූბඝರ฿ಜ ವಛბವൕಯ ยತದ ෬ว 



15 

 

 

 

 

 
 

(ಇ) ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ದย ฆವ ವಛბಸಬർದ 
ಅไൽ౫  ಹಀౙ ಗัಡ ීದಪಟౣ  ౩ ರ ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  
ฆโದಃౙ  ීඌඈ ඩ ඌಂತකದ 
ವ ౾౨ , ಬฉൿ ಆഴವವನ ൪ං, ൞, ಪൟ౬ , 
ಅಥ฿ ಪൟ, ಧഴ ಮಕౙ ำ, ກ౧  ಮಕౙ ำ, 
ಸຄೕದರฆ, ಸຄೕದค ಯರඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല 
ಇತರ ವ ౾౨ ಡ ඛೕലർಗ  

 

(ಎෆ) ಯಜನඝ ಅಥ฿ ಕ౾౹ ർರඝ, ฃಟ 
ಡಬ ർದ ಭದ ൞ ಪತ ಗಳ ฃಟ/ ಖคೕൽ, 
ౣ ಀಗಳ เඛಮಯಃౙ  ීඌඈ ಭದ ൞ 
ಪತ ಗಳ ವಛბವൕ, ಯಜನඛಂದ ಅಥ฿ 
ಕ౾౹ ർರඛಂದ/ಅವನ ಪರ฿ಜ ಇತರ ಪౘ౽ರคಡ 
ඛඌಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಭದ ൞ ಪತ ಗಳඝ౬  
౷ ೕಕคโൿ/ഴಗഷ ഴโ คඈ 
ಅವನ/ಅವಳ ฿ ඩರ ౽෴ბಚರൕಗัಡ 
ීಧಪಟౣ  ಎಲ  ౽ඞඝ ಬದ౫  ౽ಯბ ಮൡ౨  
ಂತ ಗಳඝ౬  ඛವბโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಏ೬ಂಟನඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ 
ದะ ัಯඝ౬  ಅඌಂತ ತัವ ಏಕತ  
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬฉൿಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ 

 
 

(೧) ಯಜನඝ/ำ ಅಥ฿ ಕ౾౹ ർರඝ/ำ, ತನ౬  
ല ഡ วಕౙ  ಌಡ ීಧಪಟౣ  ಎಲ  ౽ඞඝ 
ಬದ౫  ౽ಯბಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಂತ ಗಳඝ౬  
ඛವბโದ౽ౙ ಜ, ಅಂಥ ౽෴ბ ಚರൕಗಳඝ౬  
ඛൟ ವ ഩವ ౩ ನಗಳ 
ಉಪเඌಗಳ/เඛಯಮಗಳ ಪ ౽ರ ഩವ ౩ ನದ 
ූಜೕർರ ನඝ౬  ಅඌಂತತัವ ಏಕ ತ  
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬฉൿಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ” 

 

(ກೖ) ಇತช ෴โඃ ದಭბದย , 

 

ಎඨ.. ඣೕಂದ ಎಂಬ ಪർವั ඣೕಂದ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1908 (಄ಂದ  ಅඌඛಯಮ 1908ರ) 
ಅലಯย  ඣೕಂದಡ ಆඝಜಕ฿ದ 
ಪ ൟಂൿ ౽෴ბಚರൕಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ ತ౨ ං. 

 

เವರൕ.- ಈ ಅඝ ೕದದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ, ಸದค 
౩ ౨ ಡ คದ ಒಬ౯ ඛಜಂತ ກ ನ ವ ౾౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ಒಬ౯  
ವ ౾౨ ಂඃ ූเಸತಕൿ౪ . 

ඩವൟಸมದ ෨ർ ಂಕ ಂಕವඝ౬  ಅඃ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ಡ 
ීඌඈ, ಅඃ ಪౘ౽ರರ ನഴๅ ಅඝ ೕದ 
41(ಇ)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛೕഴವ ෨ಌ౨  ರකಮದ 
෬ว ඩವൟಸ౽ದ ෨ർ ಂಕ ๑ಲౙ ದย  
ຄಂർಃ ലಆಳ ౽ಞತ౨ ං. 

෨ಌ౨  ฆක෫ಯ ವ౨  เಷಯ฿ದ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ 
ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว 20 (7)ඡ ಅඝ ೕದದ 
ಅലಯย  ಹ౨ ಂತರ ಪತ ಃౙ  เඌವౣ ೕ ๑ಲౙ . 

 

 

 

 

ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ಐವൡ౨  งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



16 

 

44. ಅಡನ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ಮฆ ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ,- 
 

       (ಎ) ෴ವ ಪ ൟಫಲ౽ౙ ಜ ಸ౷ ತ౨ ඝ౬  ಅಡನ 
ಡมಜංೕ ಆ ಪ ൟಫಲโ 1,000 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕರൽದ౪ ฉ- 

 
        () ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 
 

ಹ౨ ಂತರಣದย  ຂัฆ๋ಥ ಪ ൟಫಲದ 
෮ಬಲಜಡ ಸಮකದ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ౽ౙ ಜನ 
ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ (.20) ಎಂී ಅඃ ಂಕ. 

 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

45. ഴಗഷ, ಎಂದฉ, ෴ವ ยತದ ෩ಲಕ 
(24ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෩ಲಕ ಉಪීඌඈಥ 
ഴಗഷಯಲ ൿ౪ ) ಒಬ౯  ವ ౾౨  ಇඣ౬ ಬ౯  
ವ ౾౨ ಯ ෬ยನ ಅಥ฿ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ෴โඃ 
ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ เฆದ౫  ಃ ೕಮඝ౬  ഖౣ ಆഴโൿ 

 

(ಎ) ಞൟ౨ ಡ ಀഖಂಬ ಸದಸ ರ ನഴๅ 
ಆಜರൽದ౪ ย  

 

 

 

 
() ಹಀౙ  ഴಗഷ ಪತ โ ಀഖಂಬದ ಸದಸ ರ 
ನഴๅ ಆಜದ౪ ฉ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

เವರൕ.- () ಘಡದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಒಬ౯  ವ ౾౨ ಡ 
ීඌඈ ಀഖಂಬ ಎಂದฉ ಪൟ, ಪൟ౬ , ಮಗ, 
ಮಗำ, ൪ං, ൞, ಸຄೕದರ,  ಈ ಂං 
෪ತකದ ಸຄೕದರನ ಪൟ౬ , ಮಕౙ ำ, ಸຄೕದค, 
ಈ ಂං    ෪ತะದ ಸຄೕದคಯ ಪൟ, ಮಕౙ ำ, ಈ 
ಂං ൟೕคಆಂಡ ಮಗನ ກಂಡൟ ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಂං 
ൟೕคಆಂಡ ಮಗ ಅಥ฿ ෮ದศ ൟೕคಆಂಡ 
ಮಗಳ ಮಕౙ ำ. 

 

 

 

 
 

ಆ౨ ಯ ฆಕങౣ  ಲ ದ ෬ว ಮൡ౨ /ಅಥ฿ 
ಃ ೕ෦ನ ෮ತ౨ ದ ಅಥ฿ ಲ ದ ෬ว 
ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ ಅಥ฿ ಃ ೕ෦ನ ූಗ ಅಥ฿ 
ದූბඝರ (ഴಗഷಯ ವ౨  เಷಯ฿ದ) 
ഖౣ ಡมದ ಃ ೕ෦ನ ූಗ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ 
ഴಗഷ ಪ෴ბสೕಚච ಇโಗಳย  ෴โൿ 
ກ ೕ ಅದฏ ಂಕ 

 

(i) ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ಂಗิฆ ಮನಗರ ಪ ඃ๎ไൽ౫  
ඩ ඌ౽ರದ ಅಥ฿ ಹ൬ ಂಗิฆ ಮನಗರ 
ඩยಃಯ ಅಥ฿ ಮನಗರඩยಃಯ 
෦ൟಳಡ ಇದ౪ ฉ -----  ಐൿ เರ 
งඩಗำ; 

(ii) ಸ౷ ൡ౨  ನಗರ ಅಥ฿ ඬರಸො ಅಥ฿ ಪಟౣ ಣ 
ඵೈಯ൬ ಪ ඃಶದ ෦ൟಗಳย  ಇದ౪ ฉ                                   
-----  ෩ฆ เರ งඩಗำ; 

(iii) ಸ౷ ൡ౨  (i)ඡ ಮൡ౨  (ii)ඡ ්ಗಳย  
ඛൽბಷౣ ಪല ෦ൟಗಳ ຄರ൞ಜ ಇತರ ෦ൟಗಳย  
ಇದ౪ ฉ   -----  ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ; 

ಪฏൡ, ෬ว ನ෩ൽದ (i), (ii) ಮൡ౨  (iii)ඡ 
්ಗಳ ෴โඃ ಒഖౣ ಟലದ ෦ൟಗಳย  ಸ౷ ൡ౨  
ಇದ౪ ฉ, ർಯ ಡಬർದ ಂಕโ ෬ยನ 
(i), (ii) ಮൡ౨  (iii)ඡ ්ಗಳย  ನ෩ൽದ 
ಂಕಗಳ ಗคಷ ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 



17 

 
() ಅಡನದ ಹಀౙ  ಅಥ฿ උರ൏ඌ౽ರದ 
ഴಗഷ. 

ಗคಷ  ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  
ීಧಪತ  (ಒ .12) ಎಂී ಅౣ ೕ ಂಕ. 

47.  ಭದ ൞ ීಧಪತ  ಅಥ฿ ಅಡನ ಪತ ,- 

ಪದದ ಕ౨  ඛವბಹൕಛಜ ಭದ ಂൿ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದคಂർಜ ౷ ೕಕคದ ಹಣ ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ಡ 
วಕౙ ಆಡฤ ಬฉൿಆಟౣ  ಅಥ฿ ಕฃคನ ಕ౨  
චರๆคಃಯඝ౬  ඛ๏ ತತัಸฤ 
೦෦ೕඝർರඝ ಬฉൿ ಆഴವ ಭದ ൞ 
ීಧಪತ  ಅಥ฿ ಅಡನ ಪತ . 
 
 

(ಎ) ಭದ ൞ ෮ತ౨ โ ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕರൽฆ฿ಗ  
 

() ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  
 

เකൟ.- ීಧಪತ  ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ยತ,- 

     (ಎ) ಧბಥბ ಔಷඋಲಯ, ಅಸ౭   ಅಥ฿ 
෴โඃ ಇತರ ವბಜඛಕ ಉಪೕಗದ ಇತರ 
෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶಃౙ  ಌಸಜ ർಗัಂದ ಒದಜ 
ಬฆವ ಸ౩ ัೕಯ ಆർಯโ ൟಂಗูಂದಃౙ  
ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ෮ತ౨ ౾ౙ ಂತ ಕല෫ ಇರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ  
ಎಂ්ದඝ౬  ಌತคಪലವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
෴่ಬ౯  ವ ౾౨   

      () ෨ಂා ඛೕฃವค ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1879ರ 70ඡ 
ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ರದ ඛಯಮಗಳ ಒ .3ಎ 
෬ฉಡ 

       () ಕකბಟಕ ේ ෬ม౭ ഖ ಲಗಳ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963 (1963ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 
16) ರ ಅಥ฿ ಕකბಟಕ ಂಕರ ಲಗಳ 
ಅඌඛಯಮ,1963 (1963ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 
17)ರ ෬ฉಡ ෨ಂಗಡ ಗಳඝ౬  ಪഷವ ವ ౾౨ ಗำ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ ෨ಂಗಡಗಳ ಮฆ ඩವൟಛಜನ 
ಭದ ಛಜ ಅವರ ೦෦ೕඝർರฆ 

       (ല) ಸ౽ბค ಅඌ౽คಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಪದದ ಕ౨  
ඛವბಹൕಯ ಭದ ಛಜ ಅವರ ೦෦ೕඝർರฆ 
ಅಥ฿ ಅದคಂർಜ ౷ ೕಕคದ ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ಡ 
ಕ౨ ฿ಜ วಕౙ  ಆಡฤ-ಅದඝ౬  ಬฉൿ ಆഔౣ ฆ 
฿ಗ  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

ಪ ൟ ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ 
ූಗಃౙ  ಐವൡ౨  න  
 

ಎರഴ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

 

51. ಢಯඝ౬  ഖౣ ಆഴโൿ,- 

(ಎ) ಢಡ เඌಸಬർඈಥ ಂಕโ ಇಪ౭ ౨ ರഴ 
งඩ ಐವൡ౨  නಗಳඝ౬  ෦ೕคർ౪ ಗ  

() ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 

ಅಂತಹ ಢಯ ෬ว เඌಸಬർඈಥ ಂಕ 
 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 



18 

 

 

 

xxx       xxx   xxx 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, À̧ÄªÀtð «zsÁ£À¸ËzsÀ, ¨É¼ÀUÁ«, ¦7, PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 600, 06£ÉÃ r Ȩ́A§gï 2023 

52. ಇโಗಳ ವಛბವൕ.-(ಪ ൟಫಲ ಸತ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅൽಲ ං) 

(ಎ) ರಬർದ ಭದ ಗะಜฆವ 
ലಂಚฆಗำ-ಆ ലಂಚฆ ಂಕಃౙ  ಞค෴ಜರย 
ಅಥ฿ ಇಲ ൽರย 

 
 

() ීಧಪತ  ಅಡನ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ เ 
ඩยಯ ෩ಲಕ ಭದ ತัಸದ ෴โඃ 
൞ಸ౾౨  
 

     (i) ಅಂತಹ ීಧಪತ , ಅಡನ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ 
ඩยಯ ෬ยನ ಂಕโ ಇಪ౭ ౨ ರഴ งඩ 
ಐವൡ౨  නಯඝ౬  ෦ೕರൽದ౪ ฉ 
 

     (ii)  ෴โඃ ಇತರ ದಭბದย  

 

      () ಅല ඛౣ იೕಟฑ ಜನರฤ ಗಳ (ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1963ರ 25ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಜನ ಸ౷ ൡ౨        

 
 

ലಂಚคನ ෨ಖ ෮ಬಲಜಡ ಸಮකದ 
ಪ ൟಫಲ౽ౙ ಜನ ಹ౨ ಂತರಣ ಪ ൟ ඞฆ 
งඩಗัಡ ಅದರ ූಗಃౙ  ಒಂൿ เರ 
ಗคಷ ಆౙ ಳಪഖౣ  ඩವൟಸ౽ದ ಂಕ ಐವൡ౨  
න  

 

 

 

ಅಂತಹ ීಧಪತ , ಅಡನ ಪತ  ಅಥ฿ 
เඩยಯ ෬ว เඌಸಬർඈಥ ಂಕ 
 

 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

 

ಒಂൿ ඞฆ งඩಗำ 

54. ක ಸ,- ಳೕಷൕ ಅಥ฿ ಉฤ ಪತ ವಲ ದ 
෴โඃ ยತದย  ಡมದ ෴โඃ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ 
ීಧದย .- 

(i) ವბಜඛಕ උ෦ბಕ ಮൡ౨  ಧბർಯ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಪ  ೕಕ฿ಜ ක ಸವඝ౬  ലർಗ. 

(ii) ಸ౷ ൡ౨ ಗಳ ඛವბಹൕ ಅಥ฿ ಅರಃ౹ ಛಜ, 
ಫมඝಭเಗัಡ, ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ಪ ೕಜನಗำ/มಭಗಳ 
ງಃಯ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಮൡ౨  ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ෴โඃ 
เಧದย  ವಛბವൕ/เว฿ค ಇಲ ൽದ౪ ย , 
ක ಸವඝ౬  ലർಗ. 

(iii) ಯโඃ เಧದย  ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ವಛბವൕ/เว฿ค 
ಒಳತಂലฆವ ක ಸವඝ౬  ലർಗ. 
 

 

 
 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 
 

ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗำ 

 

 

 

ಅಂಥ ವಛბವൕ/เศ฿คಯ ವ౨  
เಷಯ฿ಜฆವ ಸ౷ ൟ౨ ನ ෮ತ౨  ಮൡ౨  ฆಕങౣ  
ಲ ದ ෬ว ಅඝ ೕಧ ಒ  20 (1) 
ಹ౨ ಂತರಣඈತඃ ๑ಲౙ  



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
SECOND SESSION 

 

THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023 
(LA Bill No. 22 of 2023) 

 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957. 

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957 
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) for the purposes herein after appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fourth 
year of the Republic India as follows:- 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka  Stamp (Amendment) Act, 2023. 

(2) It shall come into force at once.   

 2. Amendment of section 30.- In the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957, 
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section 
30, in clause (a), for Article No. [52] (b) and the entries relating thereto, the following 
shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “No. [52] (b) (Transfer of any interest secured by a bond, mortgage deed or 
policy of insurance),  

 No. (56) if relating to paper bank guarantee and e-bank guarantee].-”  

  3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the Principal Act, in the Schedule,- 

 (i) in Article 3, in column (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words 
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (ii) in Article 4, in column (3), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “One 
hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (iii) in Article 5,- 

(a) in clause (b), in column (3), the words “subject to a maximum of 
rupees one thousand” shall be omitted; 

(b) in clause (e), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten 
paise”, the words, “fifty paise” shall be substituted, and for the 
words “subject to a maximum of rupees twenty thousand but 
not less than rupees Five hundred”, the words “but not less than 
rupees Five hundred” shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (i-d),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i),  in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 
hundred”, the words “Rupees Five hundred” shall be 
substituted; and  
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)  for the entries in column (3), the the 
following  shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Rupees Five hundred and in addition Rupees Five hundred for 
every Rupees ten lakhs or part thereof in excess of Rupees ten 
lakhs, subject to a maximum of Rupees Ten lakhs.”; 



2 
 

 

(d) in  clause (i-e),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 
hundred”, the words, “Rupees Five hundred” shall be 
substituted; and  
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the  following    
shall be substituted, namely:-  
“Rupees Five hundred plus rupees hundred for every rupees 
one lakh or part thereof, in excess of rupees one lakh.” 

(e) in clause (j), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees” 
the words, “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

 (iv) in Article 6,-  

(a) in  clause (1),- 

(i)  in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the figures and  words, “0.1 
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the  following    
shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “0.5 percent of the loan or debt amount”; 

(b) in clause (2),- 

(i) in sub-clause (i) in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1 
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted; 
and  

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the  following    
shall be substituted, namely:- 

“0.5 percent on the loan or debt amount”.  

 (v) in Article 8, in clause (b), in column (3) of, for the words “one hundred 
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 

(vi) In Article 10, for the entries in column (3), the  following    shall be 
substituted, namely:-  

“Rupees Five thousand for every rupees ten lakhs or part thereof subject to a 
maximum of rupees One Crore.” 

 (vii) In Article 11, in clause (b),-  

(a) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words and figures 
“3/4 % of the amount or market value”, the words and 
figures “1 % of the amount or market value.”, shall be 
substituted; 

           (b) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the 
following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“1 % of the amount or market value.”; and  

          (c) in sub-clause (iii), for the entries in column (3), the     

               following shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “1 % of the amount or market value.” 

 



3 
 

 

(viii) in Article 12,- 
 
           (a) in clause (a), for the entries in column (3), the                  

following shall be substituted, namely:-  
 “Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof 
subject to   minimum of rupees one hundred.”; and  
 
(b) in clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the                  

following shall be substituted, namely:-  
“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof   
subject to minimum of rupees one hundred.” 

 
 (ix) in Article 14,- 

(a) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred 
rupees.”, the words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred 
rupees.”, the words, “Five hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted. 

 (x) in Article 17, in column (3), for the words “Five hundred rupees.”, the 
words, “Two thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xi) in Article 19, in column (3), for the words “Two hundred rupees.”, the 
words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 
 (xii) in Article 20,- 

(a) in clause (4),- 
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the 

words, “five percent” shall be substituted and for the words “An 
amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal to 
five per cent”, shall be substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, 
the words “five percent” shall be substituted, and for the words, 
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal 
to five per cent”, shall be substituted; 

 
(b) in clause (6), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be 

substituted, namely:-  
    “Two rupee for every one thousand rupees or part thereof 

subject to a maximum of rupees five lakhs.”;  
(c) in clause (7), in column (3), for the words “three percent”, the 

words “five percent”, shall be substituted. 
 (xiii) in Article 21,- 

(a) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “five rupees”, the 
words, “twenty rupees” shall be substituted; and  

(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten rupees”, the 
words, “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted. 

 
 (xiv) in Article 22, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “five hundred 
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xv) in Article 25, in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the 
words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted. 



4 
 

 

 (xvi) in Article 31, in column (3), for the words “one rupee”, the words “ten 
rupees” shall be substituted. 
 (xvii) in Article 33, in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand 
rupees”, the words, “Five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xviii) in Article 34,- 

             (a) in clause (c),- 
(i) in sub-clause (i),  in column (3), for the words “ten rupees”,  the 

words “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted; 
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall 

be substituted, namely:-   
 “Fifty rupees plus five rupees for every rupees one thousand or 
part thereof in excess of rupees one thousand.”; 

            (b) in clause (d),- 
 (i) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the following shall 

be substituted, namely:-    
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”; and  
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall 

be substituted, namely:-   
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.” 

 (xix) in Article 39,- 
               (a) in clause (a),-  
             (i) in sub-clause (1),  in column (3), for the words “Rupees one 
thousand for each share”, the words “Rupees Five thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted; 
             (ii)  in sub-clause (2), in column (3), for the words “Rupees five 
hundred for each share.”, the words, “Rupees Three Thousand for each share.” 
shall be substituted; 
             (b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “Rupees two hundred 
and fifty for each share”, the words “Rupees One thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted; and  
             (c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees two hundred 
and fifty for each share”, the words, “Rupees One thousand for each share.”, 
shall be substituted. 
 (xx) in Article 40.- 

(a) in clause (B), in sub-clause (a),  in column (3), for the words 
“three percent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (B), in sub-clause (b),  in column (3), for the 
words “One thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand 
rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (C), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words 
“three percent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted; 
and  

(d) in clause (C), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the words 
“One thousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees”, shall 
be substituted. 

 (xxi) in Article 40-A,- 
(a) in clause (A),- 
(i) in sub-clause (a),  in column (3), for the words “One thousand 

rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted; 



5 
 

 

(ii) in sub-clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the following 
shall be substituted, namely:- 

“Rupees Five thousand plus rupees one thousand for every 
rupees five lakhs or part thereof, exceeding rupees ten lakhs 
capital amount, subject to a maximum of rupees Twenty five 
lakhs.”; and  

              (b) in clause (B), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the 
words, “five percent”, shall be substituted. 
 (xxii) in Article 41,- 

(a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, 
the words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred 
rupees”, the  words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred 
rupees”, the  words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(d) in clause (d), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred 
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(e) in clause (f), in column (3), for the words “rupees fifty”, the words 
“one  hundred  rupees”, shall be substituted; 

(f) in clause (g), in column (3), for the words, “rupees fifty”, the 
words “one hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; and  

(g) in clause (h), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred 
rupees”, the words, “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 

 (xxiii) in Article 44, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “one hundred      
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 
 (xxiv) in Article 45, in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “ rupees one      
hundred”, the words “rupees two hundred”, shall be substituted. 

(xxv) in Article 47,- 
(a) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words "Fifty paise”, the words 

“two      rupees”,  shall be substituted; and  
(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “rupees two hundred”, 

the words, “rupees five hundred”, shall be substituted. 
(xxvi) in Article 51, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred 

rupees”, the words  “two hundred”,  shall be substituted. 
(xxvii) in Article 52,- 

(a) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words “one 
hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, 
the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. 

(xxviii) in Article 54,- 
(a) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 

Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be 
substituted; and  

(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One 
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be 
substituted. 

(xxix) after Article 55 the following shall be inserted, namely ; -  
 “56.  if relating to bank guarantee,-  

  (i) if relating to paper bank guarantee  Rupees three hundred  
 (ii) if relating to e-bank guarantee Rupees two hundred 



6 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

It is considered necessary further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957 

(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) to enhance the rate of Stamp Duty in certain cases and 

to make a separate provision regarding levy of Stamp Duty on Bank Guarantee. 

Hence the Bill. 

 

 

 

 



7 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure. 

   
           

 
KRISHNA BYREGOWDA 

Minister for Revenue 
 
 
 
 

M.K. VISHALAKSHI 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



8 
 

 

ANNEXURE 
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA STAMP ACT, 1957 

 (Karnataka Act 34 of 1957)  
 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
SCHEDULE 

 
XXX   XXX   XXX 

 
3. Adoption deed, that is to say, any 
instrument (other than a will), recording an 
adoption, or conferring or purporting to 
confer an authority to adopt.  

Five hundred rupees 

4. Affidavit,- including an affirmation or 
declaration in the case of persons by law 
allowed to affirm or declare instead of 
swearing. 

Twenty rupees 

 5. Agreement or its records or 
Memorandum of an Agreement,— 
 
(a) xxx  
(b) if relating to the purchase or sale of a 
Government security  
 
 

 
 
 
 
One rupee for every rupees ten 
thousand or part thereof of the value of the 
security at the time of its purchase or sale, 
as the case may be, subject to a maximum 
of rupees one thousand. 

(e) If relating to sale. of immovable 
property wherein part performance of the 
contract,- 
(i) xxx 
(ii) possession of the property is not 
delivered 
 
 
 

  
 
 
 
Ten paise for every one hundred rupees or 
part thereof on the market value equal to 
the amount of consideration subject to a 
maximum of rupees twenty thousand but 
not less than rupees five hundred 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
14. Cancellation of instruments.- (a) 
Cancellation of any instrument previously 
executed on which stamp duty has been 
paid as per any article of the Schedule and 
not otherwise specifically provided for by the 
Schedule. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
(b) Cancellation of any instrument executed 
by or on behalf of the Central Government or 
a Local Authority or other Authority 
constituted by or under any law for the time 
being in force or a body corporate wholly 
owned or controlled by the Central 
Government or the State Government. 

 
same duty as on the original instrument if 
such cancellation has the effect of 
reconveyance of property already conveyed 
by the original instrument: 
 
Provided that, if the original instrument is a 
conveyance on sale, then the stamp duty 
payable on such cancellation instrument is, 
as per article 20(1), on the market value of 
the property as on the date of execution of 
such cancellation. 
 
one hundred rupees 
 
 
 
 
 
 



9 
 

 

 
 
(c) in any other case 
See also agreement or its records or 
Memorandum of an Agreement No.(5)(e)  
(i) Release (No.45) Revocation of Settlement 
(No.48-B), Surrender of Lease (No.51)  
Explanation.- If the original instrument has 
been subjected to determination of the 
market value under section 45-A of the Act, 
stamp duty on the cancellation of such 
instrument shall be the same as determined 
under section 45-A of the Act 
 

 
 
one hundred rupees 

17.Certificate of enrolment,- in the roll of 
Advocates prepared and maintained by the 
State Bar Council under the Advocates Act, 
1961 (Central Act 25 of 1961) 

Five hundred rupees 

19. Composition-deed,- that is to say, any 
instrument executed by a debtor, where by 
he conveys his property, for the benefit of 
his creditors, or whereby payment of a 
composition or dividend on their debts is 
secured to the creditors or whereby 
provision is made for the continuance of the 
debtors‘ business, under the supervision of 
inspectors or under letters of licence, for the 
benefit of his creditors 

two hundred rupees 

20.For Conveyance.- 
 
(4) If relating to an order made by the High 
Court or appropriate Tribunals or 
appropriate Authorities under the 
Companies Act, 2013, in respect of,- 
 
(i) Amalgamation of Companies, including a 
subsidiary amalgamating with parent 
company 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
(ii) Reconstruction or Demerger of a 
company 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Three percent on the market value of the 
property of the transferor company, located 
within the State of Karnataka and 
transferred to the transferee company; or 
An amount equal to one percent of the 
aggregate value of shares issued or allotted 
in exchange, or otherwise and in case of a 
subsidiary company, shares merged (or 
cancelled) with parent company and in 
addition, the amount of consideration if 
any, paid for such amalgamation; - 
whichever is higher subject to a maximum 
of rupees twenty five crores. 
 
Three percent on the market value of the 
property of the transferor company, located 
within the State of Karnataka, and 
transferred to the resulting company; or An 
amount equal to one percent of the 
aggregate value of shares issued or allotted 
to the resulting company and in addition, 



10 
 

 

 
 
 
 

the amount of consideration if any, paid for 
such demerger or reconstruction; -
whichever is higher subject to a maximum 
of rupees twenty five crores. 

(6) If relating to assignment of receivab les 
by the originator to the special purpose 
Vehicle (SPV), or by whatever name they are 
called in the process of securitisation under 
securitisation and reconstruction of 
Financial Assets and Enforcement of 
Security Interest Act, 2002 

One rupee for every one thousand rupees 
or part thereof subject to a maximum of 
rupees one lakh. 

(7)conveyance relating to Transferable 
Development Rights 
 
 

Three percent on the market value of the 
Transferable Development Rights equal to 
the market value of the corresponding 
portion of the property leading to such 
Transferable Development Rights, which is 
the subject matter of conveyance; or 
consideration for such conveyance; 
whichever is higher. 

21. Copy or extract,- certified to be true 
copy or extract by or by order of any public 
officer and not chargeable under the law for 
the time being in force relating to the Court 
fees:  
(i) if the original was not chargeable with 
duty, or if the duty with which it was 
chargeable does not exceed five rupees. 
 (ii) in any other case 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Five rupees 
 
 
 
Ten rupees 

22. Counterpart or duplicate.—of any 
instruments, chargeable with duty and in 
respect of which the proper duty has been 
paid  
(a) if the duty with which the original 
instruments is chargeable does not exceed 
five hundred rupees.  
 
(b) in any other case 

 
 
 
 
The same duty as payable on the 
Original 
 
 
five hundred rupees 
 

25. Divorce,-instrument of that is to say, 
any instrument by which any person effects 
the dissolution of his marriage.  
Dower,—Instrument of — See settle-ment 
(No. 48)  
Duplicate,—See Counterpart (No. 22) 

One hundred rupees 

31. Letter of allotment of shares,- in any 
company or proposed company or in respect 
of any loan to be raised by any company or 
proposed company.  
See also certificate or other Document (No. 
16) Letter of Guarantee 
See Agreement (No. 5) 

 
One rupee 

33 Memorandum of Association of a 
company,—  
(a) if accompanied by Articles of Association 
under section 26 of the Companies Act, 

 
 
One thousand rupees 



11 
 

 

1956 (Central Act 1 of 1956) 
(b) if not so accompanied  
according to the share capital of the 
company. 

 
 
 
The same duty as under Article (No. 10) 

34. Mortgage deed,-  
(c) When a collateral or auxiliary or 
additional or substituted security, or by way 
of further assurance for the above 
mentioned purpose, where the principal or 
primary security is duly stamped.  
(i) for every sum secured not exceeding Rs. 
1,000. 
(ii) for every Rs. 1,000 or part there of, 
secured in excess of Rs.1000. 
 
(d) for hypothecation of movable property,- 
If the loan or debt is repayable on demand 
(i) where the loan amount does not exceeds 
rupees ten lakhs  
 
(ii) where the loan amount exceeds rupees 
ten lakhs 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Ten rupees 
 
Ten rupees plus one rupee for every rupees 
one thousand or part thereof in excess of 
rupees one thousand. 
 
 
 
rupees ten for every rupees ten thousands 
or part  thereof 
 
rupees twenty for every rupees ten 
thousands or part thereof, subject to a 
maximum of rupees ten lakhs". 

39. Partition.- -Instrument,- of, as defined 
by clause (K) of sub-section (1) of section 2. 
(a) where the property involved in the 
partition is converted for non-agricultural 
purpose or is meant for non agricultural 
use. 
 
(1) if the property is situated in the Rupees 
jurisdiction of Municipal Corporation or 
Urban Development Authorities or Municipal 
Councils or Town Panchayats.  
 
(2) If the property is situated in the areas 
other than those mentioned in sub- clause 
(1) above. 
 
(b) where the property involved in the 
partition is agricultural land  
 
 (c) where the property involved in the 
partition is moveable or money 
 
(d) where the property involved in the 
partition belongs to any of the combinations 
of categories mentioned in sub-clause (a), (b) 
and  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
one thousand for each share 
 
 
 
 
Rupees five hundred for each share 
 
 
 
Rupees two hundred fifty for each share 
 
 
Rupees two hundred and fifty for each 
share  
 
Maximum of the duties described in sub-
clause (a), (b) or (c) above for each share  
  

40 Partnership.- 
B. Reconstitution:— 
(a) Where immovable property contributed 

 
 
Three percent 



12 
 

 

as share by a partner  or partners remains 
with the firm at the time of outgoing in 
whatever  manner by such partner or 
partners on reconstitution of such 
partnership firm. 
(b) In any other case 
 
C. Dissolution of:—  
(a) Where the property which belonged to 
one partner or partners when the 
partnership commenced is distributed or 
alloted or given to another partner or 
partners.  
  
 
 
 
(b) In any other case  

on the market value of the immovable 
property remaining with the firm. 
 
 
 
one thousand rupees 
 
 
Three percent on  a market value equal to 
the market value of the property distributed 
or alloted or given to partner under the 
instrument of dissolution, in addition to the 
duty which would have been chargeable on 
such dissolution if such property had not 
been distributed or alloted or given.  
 
 
one thousand rupees  

40A Limited Liability Partnership,- A. 
constitution of Limited Liability Partnership, 
or conversion of firm/private 
company/unlisted public limited company 
into limited liability partnership, 
(a) where the capital does not exceed rupees 
ten lakhs 
(b) where the capital exceeds rupees ten 
lakhs; for every rupees five lakh of part 
thereof exceeding rupees ten lakhs 
 
 
B. Reconstruction or amalgamation of 
Limited Liability Partnership 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Rupees one thousand 
 
Rupees one thousand plus rupees five 
hundred for every rupees five lakhs or part 
thereof, exceeding rupee ten lakhs capital 
amount, subject to a maximum of rupees 
ten lakhs 
 
Three percent on the consideration or 
market value of the property whichever is 
higher of the transferor limited liability 
partnership located within the State of 
Karnataka 

41. Powers of attorney,—(as defined by 
section 2(1)(P) not being a proxy,— 
 (a) when executed for the sole purpose of 
procuring the registration of one or more 
documents in relation to a single transaction 
or for admitting execution of one or more 
such documents  
 
(b) when authorising one person or more to 
act in a single transaction other than the 
case mentioned in Clause (a)  
 
(c) when authorising not more than five 
persons to act jointly and severally in more 
than one transaction or generally  
 
(d) when authorising more than five but not 
more than ten persons to act Jointly and 

 
 
One hundred rupees 
 
 
 
 
 
One hundred rupees  
 
 
 
One hundred rupees  
 
 
 
Two hundred rupees 
 



13 
 

 

severally in more than one transaction or 
generally; 
 
(e) when given for consideration or when 
coupled with interest and authorizing the 
attorney to sell any immovable property; 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 XXX                 XXX 
   

(eb) When given to a person other than the 
father, mother, wife or husb and, sons, 
daughters, brothers, sisters in relation to 
the executant authorising such person to 
sell immoveable property situated in 
Karnataka State 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
(ec) When given to person other than the 
father, mother, wife or husband, sons, 
daughters, brothers, sisters in relation to 
the executant authorising such person to 
sell Transferable Development Rights 
relating to immovable property situated in 
Karnataka State. 

 
 
 
The same duty as a Conveyance under 
Article 20(1) on consideration or on market 
value of the property which is the subject 
matter of such power of attorney), 
whichever is higher. 
Provided that, the duty paid on agreement 
for sale under Article 5(e) or instrument of 
sale or transfer as the case may be, is 
adjustable towards the duty payable on 
such power of attorney under Article 41 (e), 
executed between the same parties and in 
respect of the same property 
 

XXX 
 
The same duty as a conveyance under 
Article 20(1) on the market value of the 
property which is the subject matter of the 
power of attorney  
 
          Provided that the duty paid on 
agreement for sale under Article 5(e) or 
instrument of sale or transfer as the case 
may be is adjustable towards the duty 
payable on such power of attorney under 
Article 41 (eb), executed between the same 
parties and in respect of the same property 
 
The same duty as a conveyance under 
Article 20(7) on the market value of the 
property which is the subject matter of 
Power of Attorney 

(f) When executed by a principal or client for 
the sole purpose of authorizing the agent or 
broker to carry out all lawful acts and deeds 
relating to his / her trading operations 
including sale / purchase of marketable 
securities, transfer of securities towards -
stock exchange, receiving / releasing funds 
and securities from / to other parties on 
behalf of the principal or client.  
  (g) When executed by a principal or client 
for the sole purpose of authorizing the 
depository participant to carry out all lawful 
acts and deeds relating to his/her demat 
account as per the bye-laws of the 
depositories / regulations governing such 
operations. 
 
 

Rupees fifty 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
rupees fifty  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



14 
 

 

(h)in any other case 
N.B. The term ―Registration includes every 
operation incidental to registration under 
the Registration Act, 1908. (Central Act 16 
of 1908). 
 
 Explanation—‗For the purposes of this 
article more persons than one when 
belonging to the same firm shall be deemed 
to be one person 
 

 
two hundred rupees 
 
 
 
 

44. Reconveyance of mortgaged 
property,—  
 
(a) the consideration for which the property 
was mortgaged does not to the exceed Rs. 
l,000.  
 
 
(b) in any other case  

 
 
 
The same duty as a conveyance (No. 20) for 
a market value equal amount of such 
consideration as set forth in the re-
conveyance.  
 
One-hundred rupees 
 

45. Release, that is to say, any ins-trument 
(not being such a release as is provided for 
by section 24,) whereby a person renounces 
a claim upon another person or against any 
specified property: 
 
(a) where the release is not between the 
family members  
 
 
 
 
 
 
(b) Where the release is between the family 
members 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
The same duty as a Conveyance under 
Article No.20 on the market value of the 
property or on the amount or value of claim 
or part of claim renounced, as the case may 
be which is the subject matter of release or 
consideration for such release, whichever is 
higher. 
 
(i) If the property is situated within the 
limits of Bangalore Metropolitan Regional 
Development Authority or Bruhat 
Bangalore Mahanagara Palike or City 
Corporation ……Rupees five thousand;  
(ii) If the property is situated within the 
limits of City or Town Municipal Council or 
Town Panchayat area …………. Rupees 
three thousand;  
(iii) If the property is situated within the 
limits other than the limits specified in 
items (i) and (ii) …………………. Rupees one 
thousand;  
 
          Provided that, if the property is 
situated in any of the combinations of 
limits, mentioned in items (i), (ii) and (iii) 
above the duty payable shall be the 
maximum of the duties specified in items 
(i), (ii) and (iii) above. 
 



15 
 

 

Explanation.- family in relation to a person 
for the purpose of clause (b) means 
husband, wife, son, daughter, father, 
mother, brother, wife / children of 
predeceased brother sister, husband/ 
children of predeceased sister wife of a 
predeceased son and children of a 
predeceased son or predeceased daughter.  
 
 
(c)Release of mortgage rights  or lien 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Same duty as bond (No. 12) subject a 
maximum of rupees one hundred 
 

47. Security bond or mortgage-deed,- 
executed by way of security for the due 
execution of an office, or to account for 
money or other property received by virtue 
thereof, or execution by a surety to secure 
the due performance of a contract. 
 
(a) when the amount secured does not 
exceed rupees one thousand  
(b) in any other case  
 
EXEMPTION  
Bond or other instrument, when executed,-  
 
(a) by any person for the purpose of 
guaranteeing that the local income derived 
from private subscriptions to a charitable 
dispensary or hospital or any other object of 
public utility shall not be less than a 
specified sum per mensem,  
(b) under No. 3A of the rules made under 
section 70 of the Bombay Irrigation Act, 
1879,  
(c) by persons taking advances under the 
Karnataka Land Improvement Loan Act, 
1963 (Karnataka Act 16 of 1963), the 
Karnataka Agriculturists Loans Act, 1963 
(Karnataka Act 17 of 1963) or by their 
sureties as security for the repayment of 
such advances.  
(d) by officers of Government or their 
sureties to secure the due execution of an 
office or the due accounting for money or 
other property received by virtue thereof. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Fifty paise for every rupees one hundred or 
part thereof  
Rupees two hundred". 

51. Surrender of lease  
(a) when the duty with which the lease is 
chargeable does not exceed ed twenty-two 
rupees and fifty paise 
 
(b) In any other case  

 
The duty with which such lease is 
chargeable. 
 
 
One hundred rupees 

52. Transfer.— (Whether with or without 
consideration),  

 
 



16 
 

 

(a) of debentures, being marketable 
securities, whether the debenture is, liable 
to duty or not  
 
 
 
(b) of any interest secured by a bond, 
mortgage-deed or policy of insurance, 
(i) if the duty on such bond, mortgage-deed 
or policy does not exceed twenty-two rupees 
and fifty paise  
(ii) in any other case  
 
(c) of any property under section 25 of the 
Administrator Generals Act, 1963  
 
 

Fifty paise for every rupees one hundred or 
part thereof subject to a maximum of one 
thousand rupees  for a. consideration equal 
to the face value of the debenture 
 
  
The duty with which such bond, mortgage 
deed; or policy of insurance is chargeable.     
 
 
 
One hundred rupees 
 
One hundred rupees 
 

54 Trust,-  
Declaration of or concerning, any property 
when made by any writing not being a Will.- 
 (i) When the Trust is made exclusively for 
public religious and charitable purposes.  
(ii) When the Trust is made for the 
management & custody of properties, for the 
purpose of distributing the benefits/profits 
of the property to the beneficiaries and 
where there is no transfer/ disposition of 
property, in any way.  
(iii)When the trust made involves the 
transfer/ disposition of property in any way; 

 
 
 
Rupees One Thousand  
 
Rupees One Thousand  
 
 
 
 
 
The same duty as conveyance under Article 
No. 20(1) on the amount and the market 
value of the property, which is the subject 
matter of such transfer / disposition. 

   
 

  XXX   XXX   XXX 
 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Govt. Press, Suvarna Vidhana Soudha, Belgavi, 05TH Dec, 2023, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


