TOTOTIC NPT
NTTBRE WRFCST

FooFédT T0,05) (STWHIRIB) AFCoDF, 2023
(202338 QFOTHLECH PR xosﬁﬁ—n)

FTOREET F,L0W) LD, 195730, 2RI R, STV BE VB WwOT LITFEONT.

Q) YR,EN0TW  FOTWIWTRE NTL3RLMON FIEET TO,0R) 9RO, 1957
(19573 FUEET 9RO 34) 0, eI R, STV TE 300TBIY)T ONT 0 NTV)TOOT;

YT I0T3 NETLST DF,T0,0,¢ WRE B, TREET Do c)POSOTBODOT &3
EODTO3 9NN 3TN ;-

1. 30 R, VI DI, WT0.- (1) T3 LRIONNTI), TIEET F,0R) (ST )
9RO, 2023 DO TN 3T,

(2) BT B8 TPTWE3 0N T3,

2. 30:3¢ ®yTOOTW 3T RBR.- ToorEdT F,0®) LIRDVOND, 1957 (19578 FToOEEdT
ORIV 34)3 (VWTL), BIV,ZN0T aDRE  eIPICNNTOTY  ve3 LDREINT) 30:3€
DTOOTAS () DOBT IIFLT RO. [52] (D) DI, 9IWF, AOWORNAT SDRTING
BN 83 EDI0RTTIN, T3S RAIT,T3), DOTT:-

"R0. [52] () (WOFRI), 90T B3I) €T30 )30 DA NPT 23TYINRRP AT
0350 T3¢ S0IJR B0 NOE IT)

FO. (56) VETT®* 2050T° MOsB0E3 3DIY, B-2050T° MBI BOWORRIT ) ].-"

3. ©3)3R280D 3T BR.- TR 9PIONDTAS 90RRWB D) -

(i) 33¢ ONBLBT 3)I TOOOIA), 80T SRTY TRTIAWNYY” D0W BBINY

BN "2 0 FOedT CRTWICNNF" D0 BWNPR, 83 CERIT,T),.

(i) 4 OBLEE 3K FToOOIA), BRI, CRTIANNF" D02 IJBNY WTONR

"200T3) SRTY BRTWIONNEF” 020 BWNP, )33 RIT,T,.

(i) 53¢ 90T LBRS,, -

(@) VOB (W) ADAS (3)3¢ ToOIS), "MOR,, WO AT TRWIONNPN
2wFTED," D02 BTN, DENDBIT,,;

() VOB ([) ONAS NBDOT (ISAS  (3)SC FToOOIE), "BI), TyA" D0

BENY VTOR "80e33), TyA” D0W BBINF, 3303RCBRIT,EY, :NI), "@&,3), AIT
CRHTIAINY NOR, T3 80830 ST CRTIONNPT TR YATNGWT, wF@BED," D0
B[BNY WTUN "e333 80830 ST BRTIANPNR TN VYOEO0I" D00 BBNEF,
33 RCBRIT,T,;

() DO (80-8) ODNE) -

(i) VTR0 (i) BAS (3)3C TOOOIE), "2,0T3) SRTY BTN D0 BTN
WRAR "2083) SRTY BRTOAINH" D02 BWNPR, 3303RCERIT,TI,,; *03IY,

(i) eVBOTR (i) B, (3)3C TOOOTAR SeNRTWING TN &3 ZDIODIT,
3B RCBRIT,E),, DOTT:-

80030 SRT BRTIONNY) eI, 38 B3I, OF CRTAINPT 950 BI), OF
CRTIAINT), XOT BT JonT, N0\, BI), OF BR[IAINPNR  2wFEBED,,
3B23),,a3003N 80T SRTI BRTWIANINED.".

(&) DOT (80-1) O,



(i) VTR0 (i) TS (3) TOOOIL), “20TD SPRTY TRTWICNNY)” D0 BWNY
WTOAR "80T3) SRTD dfa—aoi')m% D0 BENFIY, 3B RERAIT,R,,; eI,

(i) VTDOBR (i) TL. (3) FOOOI) S SENRTINPNR WTBEIIN B8 ZDIODIT,
33 PLBRIT,TD,, DOTT:-

"80T3) ST B AINE) B3N 200830 OF BRETIONNFT, DT 318 00T
OF SR ITY €ITWT 230NT, 2,03 SRTD CRECNNE).".

() DOT (23) DA (3)3¢ TOOOIE), "TT SRTY BRTICNNL)” 0 BTN
TR “80T3) ST CRTWIONNE” D0 BWNFY, T)303eCBRIT,T),,;

(iv) 6:3¢ e90WLTTS, -

() DOTI (1 d@

(i) E’ID@J&)OG% d@s ()3 FoOOI), “S.0.1" DOW BT DI, WOINY WHONR
"30.0.5" 202 B3 méo O0BINT, F3A3CRRIT,L,; eNI3Y,

(i) VTDOBR (i) TR, (3)€ FOOOIE) S SNRTINLT TN B8 TNIODITR,,
3B RCBRIT,T,, DOTT:-

"R €930 MDEITS RIS 3€.0.5";

(2J) OB (2) B,

(i) ﬂowa)océ (i) BAS (3)3¢ ToOTE). “£.0.1" 0 VW aNI), HOBINY WHRON
"30.0.5" 02 WL &N3I, @O%ﬁ«?’m& 3O3R RIT,,; T3,

(i) VTDOBR (i) TL. (3) FOOOI) S SENRTINPNR WTBEIVN B8 ZDIODIT,
)33 PLBRIT,TD,, DOTT:-

"o LI DT WRI TS 3.0.5";
(v) 83€ €903 LT (D) DOBTAS (3)3¢ anow@ 20003 SRTY BRI 0
BENY TR TR SRTD d@_@d'bﬁ@b D0 BRNFI,, &3S RCBRIT,T,,.
Vi) 1038 ONWLBTT 3) FTOOOIDS SeRNRTINET WHEPN &8 T0DITI,
3B PCRRITLE,, DOTT:-
"MOR, WwOT TRLES TRTOANNER WwPIED, T8 B3I, OF TRTIOTYTR €950 9T
239NT, 80T AT CRTICNSD".
(vii) 113¢ @930 LTT (?D) VOB, -

() B0 (i) TAS 3) FoOOI), "WBRIT I 0TTES,, 33°5T3
R0t BT 3/4003" @Dou wcjmfo DB, ORTY TN "RBRI T 9T 300030 E3,
SPOST &3¢3 FFT3 1503" 02 WBNYD &0 I, L9I0ZFONRN, &3 REBRIT,T),;

() VB0 (i) T, (3) FoOIE) S FeNRTWINDT TN T3 ZDI0ODIT,
3B PCRRITE,, DOTT:-
"RPRIT LT 0TNTES, BPDST 303 T3 1303"; DI,

(%) OBOBR (jii) 3L, (3)3¢ TOOOIA.S TNRTINYT TN T3 TNIODIT,
&3 ABRCBRIT,TN,, DOTT:-
"SRRI LT 3TITES, 2P 5T e FedTee 1303
(viii) 1283¢ 93023 3RS, -

() DOB (D) 3D, B) TOOOIAS JDRTINYT WHETON S8 TNI0DITI,
@3B RIT, CSJQ @ocjé -

"TOR, WwORD ST CRTIOINDN WwFTBEY), T8 WwOTD SPTY BRTIONE)
93200 €9TIT LIINT, T CRTION.”; aI),

() OB () 3. (3)3 m@ow@w SRDRTINDT TN 8 ZDI0DITI,
303 RIT,T,, @owd

"FAR, WO SRTY CRTIOINPR 2WwF@BED, &8 w0 SPTY BTN
G 9T IINT, NTTI CRTIAN."
(ix)  143¢ 9WBLTTD,,-



() DOT () DA (3)¢ TODOIE), 20T SRTY BRTICNNY)” D0 BINY
WTAR "853 SRTI BRTWIONNE” D0 BWNFY, 3303 RIT,T),,; 203D,

() DOT (2) DA (3)3€ ToOOIE), “2,0T) BRTY TRTWIOTIF” D02 BINY
WTAR "853 ST CRTWIONNE” 0L BWNFY, T)303eCRRIT,T),.

x) 17:3¢ 9NWLBTAS (3)3€ TOOOIE), “80T3) SRTY BRTICNNF” 0L BWNY
WRAR " DT AT TRTIANTE)" 02 BWNP, 3303 CRIITET,.

xi) 193¢ ONBLBTTAS (3)3 TOOOIEL), "DTTWI SRTI TRTIOTE” 02 BENY
TR "853 ST CRTWIONNE” D0 BWNFY, T)303eCRRIT,T),.

(xii) 203¢ €9V LTTAS, -

() DO (43 -

(i) GUTDOTI (i d@s ()3 ToOOIE), "FETTBO NRTTRY," D0W BHRNY WIRON
"HTE DTWTRY,,” @ou BBNPI, 3B RERAIT,T, a0, "HIB 2,0T3T, AePVITS
VRVOM" D0 BRNEY VBN "HTEB 0T, ReDVOT WO 02 BBNP,
3B RCBRIT,,; T3,

(ii) VBV OT (i) B (3)3¢ TOOOIE), "BETTED TNRTTRY,," D0 BWRNY TR
"FTTI0 OTWTRY,," D0 WERNFRN, F3BRERRIT,T, a0, "HTIB 20T, AePVIT
BRWON” 0 awmf WBON "HTIB 80387T, ReDVT 230N D02 BBNP),
3B BRITT,

() (6)3¢ 9306565@, 3)R3¢ FOOOTE) S SENRTING TN B8 3DI0DIT,
)33 PLBRIT,TD,, DOTT:-

"MOR,; 803 OF CRTIONNPT 2FaBEd), 518 20T AT BRTWICNY) 95300
93T PONT, DT BRWION";

) (NI VOBRBAS (33 FToOOID), "FTWo 2NRTTRY," D0 IBINY
BN "FeTWo 0TBTRY,," 02 BBNY DY, BSOSRCRBIITT,,.

(i) 213 9BL3T3S, -

() OB (i) TAS 3) ToOOIE), "80T3) TRWIONNY)" D0 BWNY TN
"9 3, BRTIANNYY" 0L WBNPN, &3 RELRITLE),; 03,

(2J) OB (i) BAS (3)3 ToOOIE), "®I), TRWIONNY)" D0 JVINY TN
808330, CLREIONNE” D020 BWNF, &)3A3RCBRIT,,.

(xiv) 2233¢ 9NBLTTAS () VOBT (3)3¢ TOOOIL), 80730 SRTY TRTOCINYD”

NOW BN ABOAR “2,03) AdT  TRDIOWNYY N0 BBRNAYSY,

FJEIOWOI ISICE A AN

(xv)  2583¢ ONBLTTAS (3) ToOOIL), “20T0 SRTY TRTIAWNE)” D02 BWNY
BN 8003 SRTD BRTICANF)” D0 BWNPRN, B33 CERIT,3),.

xvi)  313¢ 9B LBBAS (3 FToOOITE), “%O0TY TRTIAN" D0 JWNY TN
"B3), CRTIANNE)” 02 BWNF, &)3A3CBRIT,T3,,.

(xvi)) 333 9NBLTTAS () DOBT (3) FOOOIL), 2007 AT TRTIONTS"

R0 BBNY TN “80T3) T eIT TRTWICNTF)” D0 BWNRPR, B33 CERIT,T),.

(xviii) 343¢ 93023 LBBOS, -

() VOB ()OS, -

(i) VTR0 (i) B (3)¢ TOOOIE), "I, BRTWICNNY)” D0 JWNE TN
80833, dfa—ad')m@b R0 BBNFI, ) 3ABRERAIT,T,,

(i) VTDOBR (i) TL. (3) TOOOI) S SENRTINPNR WTBEIIN B8 ZDI0DIT,
3O3R LBRIT,TD,, DOTT:-

"80833), CRTIONNE) TaNe )3C 20T ARedT BRTIANPNR 9530 2,003
A0edC BRTIAINF, DT eITT 250NT, 80530 CREONED”

() DOT (BN, -



(i) VTDOR (i) T, (3)C FLOIT) S TeNRWINDT WTEIN T3 ZDIODIT,
)33 PLBRIT,RD,, DOTT:-

"TS B3I, AT BRTIOINS) IFH0 W3 JNT, 805330, BRTWIOINS)”,;
AVICN)

(i) VB0 (i) B, (3) FOVOIAS STNRTINPT WTEIPN B8 TNIODIT,
3O3R LBRIT,TD,, DOTT:-

"8 B3I, AedT BRTWIOINE) 95330 EITWT LINT, 80e33), BTN,

(xix) 393¢ €930 LTRSS,

() DOTI ()N, -

(i) SOTROT (1) BAS (3)3¢ FTOOOID), “€90T F)3OROT TN 20T AT
SRTANY)" DN0W BVPNY WHROR  "907F &SR0T DR ) F0edD
BRTIAINY)" 0 BBNFN, &30 EBRITT),,;

(i) VBRORB (2) TS (3)I FoOOIE). "0 T33P0 TN 80T ST
SRTONNY)" D0 RBENY WROR "907 F8A3ROT) TR 3DRTY  Aee)T
BRTOCNNY" 02 BTBNL, 30308 ITT,:

() VOB () BAS 3) FToOIEL), "eI0T TySBROTD TN DTWBY ST
80e33), BRTIONNY" D0 JWNY WERAN "90T FO3P0T) WD 2,083 FoedT
ONOEARICINAL>Y @ow BENF,, B3RV RRRITE,,; eI,

() DOTW () TAS (3)F FToOIE), "e905 T3P0 DD TWY SRT
8033, d@_@d')bﬁ@b N0 BBNY BN "90T F3A3P0T) WD 2,083 FoedT
BTN 02 BBNPI, TSR RCRAIT,T),.

(xx) 40:3¢ 90 LTT) S,

(®) VOB (W) B NBDOT ()T (3) ToOIR), “BTTID 30 RTTeRY," DOW
BINY TR "BTT S0TTRY,,” D02 BRNF Y, BB RCRIITTY,;

) VOB () TAS OBROBW ()T (B) FOOID), “2,0T) AeIT
BRTANNE)" D02 BWNY WRONR "TRBY AT SRTICNTF)" 02 JWNRPS,
30300 R IELTI,;

(R) DOTW (&) TAS NTDOT (D)3 (3) ToOOIE), "FETBO 2NPTTRY," D0
TG WBOR “Fe 380 BETRY,” 02 BBNE, TSRS RIITE,; 032,

(&) DOT (A) TAS NTDOT ()3 (3)€ TOOOIE), “200T) AeIT RTINS
NOW BINY TR QTR AT BRTICWNY" D00  BBRNYSY,
FJREIOWOI IS ICE A AN
(xxi) 40-ed €92 LTTE) -

() DOT () T ,-

(i) VTDOT ()T (3)IE TOOOIE), “2OTD AT BRTIONTH" D0 BWNY
BN "80T3) F0eIT BRTIONINE" 02 BWRNRPIN, 3303 CRAIT,T),;

(i) QUBDORB ()T (3) TOOIAS SENRTING WHBAR &8 BODIT,,
3B RCBRIT,EN,, DOTT:-

"80T3) AedT SN s3I, NOE, BEW,3,4030 OF CRTIOINDNR 20P&BEN,
23), OF CRTIOINE 200TW0F RIS, DT &8 03 OF CREaOINYNR
G0 9T IINT, 20T ARe)T BRTWIONNE"; a0,

() VOB () BAS (33 ToOOIA), "FTB 3NRTY" D0W J/WINY VTN
"HTB 0T D0 BBNYI), TSR RCRAITTD,;

(xxii) 4138 930 LTTOS, -

() VOB (@) BAS (3)3¢ ToOOIE), “2,0TD SR dfa—@oi')m% DOW JTINY
TR "800 mm CRETIONINP” 02 BWNFI, &SRB RCRAITT,

() OB () TAS (3) TOOIA), 20T ST dfawoi')omfo N0 BWNY
TR 803 ST dJa—e)oSm% QD02 BBNFIN, T 3BRERAIT, T,



(R) DOTW () BAS (3)3 ToOOIE), 20T SRTY BRFTICNNYD” D0 JWNY
WTOAR "80T3 sfada dfa—aoi')m% D0 BBNFI), 3B RERAIT,T),,;

(&) VOB (&) TARS (3)3 TOOOIL), "OTRY SRTY BRTICNNY" DOW JTNY
BN "200T3) ToedT dfawoi’)m@b DO BWNF, &30S RIT,T),,;

(8) OB (DF°) BAS (3)J€ ToOOI), “80e33), BRWIANNS" D0 JWNY
WRAR "2,0T3) SRTI BRTWIONNE)" D0 BWNF, &)303eCBRIT,T),,;

(RF°) VOB (¥) TAS 3)3C FToOOIE), “80533), BLRTIONNY" D0 BINY
WBAR “2,0TD sfada dfawoi’)m% D02 BWNFI, 3B RERAIT,I,,; eI,

() VOB (2F°) TAS 3) ToOOIL), "DNTRBY SPRTY TRTWICINY” 0
BIBAY TR "80T3 3@63 dfawoi’)m@b N0W BWNFI), &3 RERAIT,),.
(xxiii)  443¢ 9NTLBTOS () VOB (3):3¢ FToOOIE), “20T) SRTY TRTWIONYD”
NOW  JBINY  ATOR "DTBY SRTY TRDIONTYY" N0 BBNYS,
FJEIOWOI ISICE A AN
(xxiv) 4533¢ 9NBLBTBAS () DORBT (3)3€ FoOOIE), “2,0T3) SRTY BRTOATLT”
NOW  BRNY ABOR ‘TR SRTY)  TeDO NN D0  BWENPIY,
33 RCBRIT,,.
(xxv) 4738 O[BLBTOS, -

() VOB (D) BAS (3) TOOOIE), "80e33), WyA" DOW BWNY WTON “DTTIY
B INS)” @ow BBNF,, B3RV RRRITE,,; eI,

() DOT (W) TAS (3)3€ TOOOIE), “DTTBY SRTI BRTWIONTIF" D0 BWNY
BN "80T3) SRTD TRTWICANTH)” D0 BWRPR, B33 CERIT,T),.
i) 5138 9B LTS () DOBT (3) ToOOID), “2,0T3) SRTY CRTIOTS"
NOoW  JBINY  DTOR "ATBY SRTY  TRDIONTYY N0 BBNYS,
FJEIOWOI INICE A AN
Oxvii) 52:3¢ 93023, BT, -

() DOT () B LVBDOT (ii)T (3) TOOTE), “2,0T) SRTY TRTWIONNYD”
NOW  JBINY  DTOR "DTWY SRTY TRDIONTYY N0  BBNYS,
3B RCBRIT,,; &I,

() VOB () TAS (3)3 TOOOID, “"2,0T) JRTY TRTICNNYD" D0 BRNY
BN "RV SLRTI TRTWICAWTIF)” 0 BWRPR, B8A3RCBRITLT,.
Oexviii) 54:3¢ 93023 LBRD S, -

() DOR (i) BAS (3 TOOOIE), “2,0T) AOIT TRTIOTY)” D0 BTN
WRBAR "DV AT TRTIOTIF)” D02 BWNP N, 3303 CERIT,TI,,; s3I,

() OR (i) BAS (3)3€ TOLOIL), “2,0T3) AT BRTICNNY" 0 BINY
WRAR " DT AT TRTIANTE)" 02 BWNP, 3O3R CRIITT,.
(xxix) 553€ €9J0LLTT 3TV20003 B8 2NI0DTT, ALDRIT,T),, DOTT:-

“56. W39;,0%° No;800831 FowoFHE B & .-

(i) BCBT® 23050F° NMOB0EINR FOWORATVRE). | 3DRTI SLRTD CRTICNNRY)

(i) 9-23950F° MEsBOE3Tt FOWORPATITE). NTRBY SPTY TR




T LBNPH H3), FoONY BCPTF

FO) WyFTLNYE). A,05) N, W3aTD), 3B23,AN aNIY, L50T° NOsBOEINY aheed
F0,08) NV, DRRIPTT, FOWORAITWOI Ty3LT NBVWOTRY, TR TooeEdT
A,0T) LORDAODNED, 1957 (19578 FREEIT LIPIOND 34)), aNI R, STRBR e00BIeHTI
£923F5Te30C3) SONRBAT.

303, D00 B8 IFLONT.



SDFT W RS R,

FWA,e)3 TOAVIT T)addey) 00T 3023, 8323,8330, WwPNRPORTIYNC)..

3R, 23,8¢rPR
TOWIO N0,

20.3. QTR
TOONFTEE
BIOF 3T NPONIY



o wog
Foor&F T9,0%) RPIODD, 19573
(19570 B0oF 3% 9DAODTD 34)0 T3y 3 yont

XXX XXX XXX
933P
XXX XXX XXX

3. B33 RBI.- 0BT TITS, TODEN
2RI, 930 B3I, IRCNTRY,D) LIPTTaI3,
Do WIRRI LW BONT  00TIe) TN
303,00FPmES  BRPDE ONDI (DT
TR, BRTIDTEA)

80330 BRTI BRI

4. 9T IESS.-

FTeoed BRI TWT, WRRN  ZRETOA
93200 FRCARD) EORWOINEY NPT
NIRRT VB NY FOTPEBAS TyRETT 0
G0 FRCRTB.

¥R,3), TR IR

5. WwR 0B OFH0 BP0 Doa3ned ergzme
2R 0B ARTD B3, -

(ed) XXX

(RQ)RTED PZ3ODH DOD 9T 330000833,
20WORATT),

NO®, WOTD AT TRWIONNPT wPIE,
0E P3O DOD T AOTWLRE VAT
FR0ET BNONTE), 9T TP 33)8 B3I,
F0edT CRTICANNY) 9300 9T IoNF, 20T
CRTAN.

(8) 30 R3S WevueddF, ZowoDAITLIRS,
F0o0R), WonZ:weN da3roAB1r:3E) ,-

(i) XXX
(i) B8R TORDEIZ0NT, VBT VWL,

TIPOT VBRI T, ADVOT a0 TES, 233253
S BRXB), AT CRHTIANY NOR, eST33
00D IPTY CRDIANYR TR VORNTT,
WPTE,, T8 WOT) SRTI TRTIONE) 900
T INT, B3I, Wy

XXX XXX

XXX




14 9D3INY T O0H03.-(x) TR ELFOD
D3I, (SINENOYR N0 3TN
TWORAITT BRTI) O30T IIWLTFTH
BTV AOTWION VBT A,0° AT
2303 @000233e39NA3K FTOORETBRTT, WOT3
03R)TE DNIT B O350.8.

() BCOW RTFT ©FPde 3I,® T,
ZDOND) TS OVTHTE  TOSRIS  sDROT
B0 OWBBONS), TBIRT X LOD
DYPTT 90 V3T DYPTOT T d0 TCOT)
RTOET 9300 Ty ATOE Tog) AOTREIE 200N
BRODTT (SIATAD) NJeweke]lxo)
BN, BROBTIE N3 DTONT sDROT
TR0 BT BTN ToONETCRIF, IO
B35t DNIE TR,0303.

(%) 03059 T3¢ ¥3T ROWLIETE),,-

TOOT) B0 eIWT DN 9P 20D
TOOD o, B B3) A0 (5) (W)

(i), DWNB (FoBs 45) FTseadmo@Be IFT
3003508 (R035.48-2)) reed 0330,
20830, FRTBIYT (F0835.51) YRINF 0, 08

AWORB.- DR NI, IDIORNTNT 45-6d
TTORT  OBRONE),  TTE, P

APETHBR w¥RET),, ©O0E  OD3IT
SR.03080D DT 0T AOT)
DIHEE 45  RBORERODE),

AFEDATR,L SNBIT,530,.

903 ST BRAITAN, ssmonel Do ONI
BVIYIYT  DDPROT  BAYOICRROB A S D
BAQOITT K3 B[O  RRBT, DR
BAQOITVT REDITR,L B,

BC03), DR ONI3 [Ijey) 0IET D
BAQ0ITVLIINTEL), 31 90T T BBRIIT AN
ONI BIT 303 FOTIAD VL TIT  Ae,0)

DOE),  ODELT 20T ][00, 90T
B BRRIITONS),  WIBTITRTWIE DI0TTOTD
R3S TTES,, 352573 30¢e3.

20073 BRTY TRTO AN

20073 BRTY TRTO AN

17 JRC0TB &)e0eoBB).-0050000DNY
90D, 19613 (19613 FLOTTYR DO
25) 3R Towsy WU FTOD,DJTZTD
303DAT DI, BENTROW VOT
VsODTDNY B/E,0DAD, ALDRIITOD
Tyasr0c0 B3,

80T3) SRTY BRTIVONTIE)

19. wROWRT B3I 0BT DA
WBBBRE), 030 ONITW 3DROT  €9z3
33, AE8, AOTRET  FO3etewST,N
BR0ZVATIRL 90 AL TRE@IONR
930 2NN DS WwBOWRT T
BABORS ROTONT),,
BPRRPIRNERBeE  9F00 988 mo©

RTT DRTY BT ONINED




10

FREEIT TJYABRCBTTI,N BOICOTT a6,
FOBAHS), ©FEwe AT, BINTG 0e3H
20O 235e3OTIRY, TIOTIITORIEYH 3T, N
DDVIER e300BIPNTBO3BE, €3 03303 DD I

20. ®8%0,0309 R3).-

(4) TOBINY 9PIOND, 19563 &yTTeo 3943
RO, ART 5OV RNTOTLINY)  ITTad0
DPTOCNY B0, SIATAD)
Q23,0050 TWRRT WO eITH3F,
ROWORHBETI.

(i) 2903, FOBDBLODT FRTF DT3B N0,
WPRPOTIO3I FOBANY I
2OWOFTA,,

FOOERT Toz AT DD, W[MOFRHm BB
FORBIN  SDMIEFONRCVE  D[MOERW 3008303
FOBID F 8N 0030TES, PO ate3 JeTTs0
eNRTTRY,; C9ITIeI0

e)TNONTE), T LT3 DT I BOWSF
ToRT RTINY 2,839,8 PeE FFW 20T,
RADVOT  RWRWON)  aDI), HETT  TOB/IOD
AOBPFRD), RN 3y TFTOBIBRODNR
LOIRPOBRTT (9T TW,NBT) NI, 9T
BR3IN YOF dIIF, TONLDIONDTIET wRVOND
YSTBT), BT BER,L OB, SO0
200 TIYT.

(IBOBAH  R[T*  dahores
BRRDHETR BOWOFHE),,-

93200

FooF&dT Do) TR a0I), RMOFRH® BB,
FORBIN  SDMIEFONRCIE  D[MOERW 008303
TOBAO A3 20TTE, w203 aNC3HTT30
EDPTTRY, 9P DID,0MF FOBINR  IIDAT
T BOWT 0RET AWM 2,83, O
TR WORF, ANDVIE RVRWON) aNI), |3
ZR3N, WOF BENWET® B0 RDNT® eI 0T,
RO RTL). BONLIIAN) BT &LV,
QRTBTE). O30T TBLFR,L IT.

(6) R RV JIEA* WTE® N (DR".D.eD)
OFY  WPYNF, 0z HX J/ID DO
FB0DSD, PT3 wBNRIT TyOHOD FOWOT
B, P3CTTD TN )RBDETIIV0D 03I,
PBPY3oDH WD D) XD 9D,

2002 3RO, DROTIEDOT
2 LTDROTBDOWING BDRABTRWIIFTN
ROWORATT.

(7)  SMFSdod 9D, BI|NALH

ROWORAT BR0ITeo T3,

NO&R,, 2WwOTD OF CRTICDNPN wFTE, T3 20T
TG CRTIAINYY 9T W3 N3, 20T
Bz 0.

B/A,0ITLIT AN ROD N30T (Sleln]
SO 92)e3,B), BH,NST 9:3F0Z ACTBI3
XOOD NG  eTTES, POT,  AePVO
SBMOFEIBEOD 923D, BI,NY 00B0FES, 352
PP ©OT BALOITHW I8B®, [BTE),
O30T BLER,L, TWT 03 HTTE 2DRTTRY,,.




11

2. &8 PI T _y3 Womn.- 00a33¢
RTED RDNTIDANOT IFH0 W3S 33T
RDPOT DT TS I QT ,3 N
DOWITIN Tyt TOR IO &3,
V950300 MNP FOWOPIE,03
330,00 DN T TOSRIT N3N
)RR WIBITIND O VT3, 43 LN ) 3.

(i) DROT a0¢e3 AIOTEII),
DRAVTBITONODBT 9T 9W3  aee3
PR WBDITONT, ROT) 80T
BT ANF D, ETDTT.

(i) O30T V3T BOTWRETE),

80730 BTN

3, CRTONNY)

22. ROT IDNIVTITORT aNI), ADOIT
AOTRD), RO VPRTOF  O0HTC
O3NS )3 CRRE 9P D, R)3.

(@) NP DNIT, IPIWBITOT [AIOTaY)
80730 BRT BRTICWTPNR T3

(29) O3s0eyEe 93T ROBLBEEE),

FDPOT L3 OO TIBITOFEWE AO0T.

80030 BRTY CRTIONTIE)

25. dWOB AWLFT-ODNI.- Bos DNIT
DPROT O30T, 353,030 I3, e)eIdBWas3d,
)TE3R BRY,TIE €3 O30T DDI.

NOB B ANI-3;:38, (0B 48)30, SeCk.
0, R 3-T3TRB (F0.22) S8

20073 BRTY TRTO AN

31. Ooxx)Ee  TORBD  OI9Pwe LI
FOBION) S €9T300 O30 YTE FOT) EITIa00
N LIZ TFOBIN DILHTW  O0eHTC
TOOTF, ROWORATO3 RCCINY BOWT I3

)z300e B3I ¥ V30 WAL, (R0
16) A® SR, D30 BI-2u33, 0T,
(05 5) SeCe.

200730 BRTIAN

33. FoBIOD ROFT 220, RS RI).-

() TOBINY IPIODD, 19568 (19563
TOTY POV 126 &yFTT 03N
FOPT DONTRPNY 231 9.3,

() ort B3N 9LNTB3,

20073 AReIT BRI

FOBOD R WOBDOY T, AT 0N
ONWLBRR (0.10) FOPTW AR LNY €3
LDRDAWTBITOTRA,L RIOT




12

34. DB IRV, B Td.-

() DR T DYPeNT PYI0 BI|T,
NP3 3N F,0F) TETINTL), AD
B3 9P BRTT P33 W He,a30
B3 9T I8 PR3 9T 30,08
N L3T,N B2, 3T A LTI,

() PZY3meN ORI 1,000 TR@DOINPNR
T &Wy3ARBROT) VR3IT,

(i)1000 CRPBIONNAPR TVLWD,SO 03N
BPY30N NRT T3 1000 BeT[2ANPR
9300 e9TT JINT,

(B3) 230X 8 3300 To,N Ao 9B D)
RBFTOD €3 FOTRORNTIT,

() ROTW PR3P B3I, OF TCRTIOINS)
BN(elnloA NI

(i) APOT BRI B3I, OF BRTIANFI),
TV, ;

T3), SRR

20T AOeIT TBRDIONNPNR T23,e3000N T3
20T AP)T TCRDIOINEY) 9T BT N,
B3), SRTOINY ZRI3N 2,0T3) TLRTION

BTyS B3I, AT BRTIONNEY) 9T 9WT N3,
T3), SRTONIND.

no&E, ™3, OF SRTANPRRTHIED,, &8 B3I,
70T CRTIOVNY) 9T 9W3 PNT, ¥I,3),
BUez0 OINED.

39. APHS DI I3)3),-2 (1) (I) JyTTT
DROT NS DRIDTIOS,

(@) IPRIOND,  wFRPOB A IS,
FHAONIT N LST,N BOTWICATE), 9T
FHAONEIT WFFOD FTN YT,

Me 3, T N 9T
SMoeYe3,d, TYRTTNY) 950
TPT JORI), 9T WEJE
BOWIODINY IPTOT 20030, 3RFN
3D,

(2)e3 B,3), 306,08 (1) eVE DOTBT).
SEDPDRVTRINP D, BRTIDIEA

NPT FTHINTE). VB,
() APBIND, wIRPROB FB), FA
25N,

() APHIANS), wPRPOB &I, W0,
93200 BEDT BRTBTWD.BL).

90T B)3A3ROTI TWOT 2,03 AIT BUzTdANTIH)

903 R3ABROT) TR 603 BT BRTOONE.

90 IBARBROTWY TONR DT ST 80333,
(e¥OTARISINAL>

90 T3 ROTY TONR DT ST 80333,
BTN

903 T3OROT TN aNC,0T (), (2)) I3
() NTB-DOBNFS).  deIDRCVE AIOTNY 2.,
DRI




13

(B) PRI, wFRPOTB B I, NC,0T

(@), @) DI, R) X DOWNRY).

SeDRDRT NVBSR JySnenen

ROWORATTD,

40. TOITVOF .-

0. PP B W:-

() TOENTVT LTI TWONTVTF REDD | FeNERD), VPRTE A0 R3S :0030FE3, 2330

SRPBRBA), [ARAB AT &AD), 983 | Deed 3Tt e0RTTRY,

AMENRIT  RDODFE),  BeNESD.ORE

NPT, 9033 TN €T30

TOENTVTT) Oz OEIANE). 903

TOOIMODT FaNE R, R)TTEWS :300BTE)..
(29) 035053 T3¢ 93T ROBBETE),

2. dFEI:-

() VOTIDTCARN) e3TOLITIN 2,20,
PARISMAnIe NI P00 FTOENTITON
AROTRB, D3R, TOOIWIC  9IGFR0
TONTOTON  D3TH®  9Pwe = BOWBT
BB,

(29) Odseey T 93T ROBLPERE),

200T3) AReIT BRTICNNED

TR dPEIIOVTN 90T A3, DITH I
FBOWT TRTRT,L), L9300 ACRBTRT,L), OO
200 2TIMIS T, RIOTE BRIN, TOITOT €I
TOCNWITOR PV BIW RADE). IITH
B0 BOWTF PBINT TR 90 BN,
7.3 00ITE,, L3S #6e3 BeTTED sPDPTTRY,,

200T3) AReIT BRTICNNED

40. 303 BPBNOOT TOOITIOOTF,-

. A3 BPBMDT TOOIWDTAD AT
9B P e /DRARN  FOBD/BEZ0DND T

AOWEBDT AN FOBAONITD, A3
BPBMNDT OV TORNT,N
FTWELRIIT.

(D) WOBF ) >3, OF
BRTOONNF T, AETDTED),

() 20BRY ) 3, oF
CRDIANNFI, OB, ®I), OF
SRTOAMFI), 0T I8 0D ©F

BTN YD) 95300 9T LIoNT,

Q. 2DI BRBMEIT  D[OOITDTOD
R)VOTWS €930 RO

200T3) AReIT BRTICNND

200D AITRT TRTOOWNE) BR3INR 0W¥
RRIR) BI), OF CRTIANDNR DT, NOR,
33), OF CRHDOINPR wPBED, T8 0T OF
SRTOANNY) T ©BT  PNT, &) ST
oNoTARIeINALA)

FoorddT OB BAQOITED  ACI
BRBNODT WIWIDTON A 88 BdPO 9Tedo
TR TE, P05 YINFD), ORHT) BeFR,L 933
DT FEFT T0DRT.




14

41. DRV, BTN, FjIY IBI[OR
(2(1) (D) WyTTLRT SDROT BOLIIAIT03I)

(®) 20T T3e3000F, ROWOFIBEL03
PR WO P BW), O
AR TINT, W3R FRE3BNTI,
ONTORIRTWT,N WO T B,
AR e A a SBeCOTIEIONT,
BPRTBRATRWNE DFT R L3T,N 3T
FpE3,Boeen;

) () DOBTE). SR
ROTPERTI), BRTIDWRA 2,0C3¢
W533T/OVTE), FOONE DEIEREN 22, T
TP, BsINPN, L9QTFIRRPATIN;

Q) 20WB,03 TV, 353000030,
208303N DI,  Jy3LToN T
AOT5200N  TOODEDWERRID)  80838,03
TP, WBsINFP I, 9RTF,IRRPATITN;

(B) 2wOTWB,03 TV, 35e:30OBTE),
208303N DI,  Jy3LTeN T
AON500N  TOODEDSEGRIL)  80T33,03
TP, BSBT 3,03 BVB,AT WBsFNP,
9RTYINPRPLATIN;

() TSBOFIT, FRE3 BN
DI /9F0 BRI 0IRFTONTY, DI,
O30T A0 €33,007, 335009 3300C8IE
933TT I, TeE3 Boeven

20073 BRTY TRTO AN

20003 SRT BRTWO AN

200T3) SRT RTINS

DNTVRBI SRTY BRI AN

BUETASIA N BN S TAIAL B A W DI S AN OIA VO VIR N
DBRONTOT AT TRRTEI, W05 YRINYE),
AR B23,L BT 2306e3 [20(1)e 932223
9RO, BAYOIT BI T, IPRITR,L O,

B30, 9L 5(B)T LHRONE), 3350003 TTIOS
203 90 0 9T AOTILVE VAT eiN
WMOEFRBOD DDIT L3 B3R EIVT BNWYOT
ROTRR, W F 3R ROWORPATOIZ, 9Tk
BVTTOTT SWeS ITWELT 41()T BODS), LTI
DR, BV0NT 33N e33R LWNTOT  BNWYOT
30,3, BROTWIRT e300 FRY,LICTIMIE.

Xx

XX XX

(BD) TooFET TotsBATE AT AE8SY | 30BN WA), IRODIOT A S
R TF, T0OWORATO3I DYRTYIVT | 30B0TES, TP &3k 20 (1)K e93F LB
B30, W3 FRWITHS 308, 30, B, | RONE). BAY,03T BIJT, dRASBR.L e,

BP0 B3, NOW DT, D), DT,
ABPLDPCT), ABRTO 0PV, BRTIITRA

B33 3531 TN,

TT03), OINWLT 5(W)T RO, 0T
TOOOS RS 9T 0008 9T
ROTILIVE AT eI0N 3N IHBOR VNI 303




15

(YR) TOOEET TosTBE).B0eS a3MoE ORIV
DR, BI,NAPR TOWOWRE, AT A3,
B TT, ROWORAT03 DY T3V
WsBO3, WIR) TRWIRIS IO, I, J,,
PP XY, NOW NTY, D/, DT,
RBPBTTD, ABAETO ONTI, BRTIDIRA
Q3T 3531 DTN

(55°) ONHEVT 9T FF 00D, 23000083
WPBWDB OB PRT0 BINY 00EY/ DD,
TN d)DODNT, [NOWORAWOI  PI)30
BINY S[Meead™, OPLEPSII0T 900
FTZDO0A0T/93S BTN W30 JFTeTONR
QNS 23, (AlaTED) SACIAL AN
2 LTOAMPITV/ABINB  R[RBIPTL  ACDTO3
a3 /9 IADITADI®) TR WTBRYN
ROWOFBWE, D), TSR WT, ToONE DI,
B3NP, D3 0AI)TT,N B0, 9T
BPLODT, ©ORTFHI NRAPAIE NI
N3 £3F0,N WTTITRES Toeven

() ODWNOTTN/F) 9D T WTIN/P, 33,
Be30563¢ 3T, 3N ROVOPREY, D), TSI
AR FTOONENT I, NI, EACNAC NN
AW TT,N, 907 ToOoe WIBNES,
NIV ETAN Bea3ed A SNY
NTIPNF/AAONING &0 Be3d Ao, ST
9oNC8 I, IPTLIRAPRIE DT eJ)
N £3T,N WITBITRETBoeson”

(B25°) 933¢ 0T FOWIETE,,

DA%, JSPCOTB D0 BLORIPORN) SLLOTIS
e9DAOHTD, 1908 (0T PO  19083)
90N, S0 S3IDRONTIT
3030 FoOIREWTHBOANR, WPRAP,IT.

dWOB.- B ODNELTT B L3T,N, ITD
RO&, N AOT 202, N038 BW,S BB NF, W,
353,000 290IRITEI),.

POTITOVT DNTYOT AIOTaI), 9T &, 31
ROWORNATO3, 9T RVFTTT SIS LIRWLT
41(8W)T RPN, DRI TR, 5TV
S ToWIRWIETOT  BNWY0T  2He,B,
BROTWIRT 390D FRY,LICTOMIT3.

TN, TV WA, VDT A,
TN TES,, e3P &S 20 ()X e9TeF LT3
RO, BAY,OIT BIT, LIPAITR,L DN,

£0233), BT AN

£0233), BT AN

NTRBI ST BR AN




16

44. BRI 3,38 V) BF,0309,-

(®) O JdPOT,N A B, IIBI
BN A3 es BAETAISIN) 1,000
BT ANY D, ETDTT-

(2) O350 T3 93T ROWLIETIE),

BAQ0ITEITIE). BXLTITOT TSFOT
RBPWONT ANV 0BT ES,,  35°0F,NS
BAROITED (A0.20) DOWO3I &ITX AVOT.

20T BDRTY TR ONINE)

45. ABAB, DO0W3, Boed ONIT NPT
(2438 TTCLTW NPT YUTVORATOT
DRBINBODOL,) 2, B0 AR,
B30 BT 9P DDERLBBAIT O0) T
R3S AT, LR, WE,TRTBITHTI

(®) ™IRO  BEHOW N[N

esNCDTE).

RESR0

() BB, DRBINB BIjad IENOWT ATASC
SRS SNT 3

dWORB.- () DOBVT T L3To,N 2,2, 3537
ROWORATWOZ BEN0W DOWT &S, @I, N,
Drgd, 30W, I, ABRTT, B 00T
2300 ABALBTIS By, DT, IBRLTO,
83 008 3[),3YT ABRLTOOD B3, aNTLY, B3
007 3COTROB NS BORBS DI, &8 00T
3DFTROB N 9Two VPWEE  ICDBTROT
NG DT,D.

32,03 30TTE, P N3 NI, /9T
TS  BPITW  OFe WP aeed
BAQOITD BT FLeddS PN 9ITedo
ROWYLOENAOT (WWBINTBOD 31, IRCDI0E)
D8N BRT Tl N 9T OT
DBINB BOPVESLIIS YeINFE), 00T
BVER,L TWT030NE AOT

(i) R,3), WONLRT) =NTOSNT TTHT0L e, D

(~]

DYPTOVE 9200 29,B3° WONFRT) DTSN3

DT SIATAD) D TOSNT DD T O
3B BRI ----- 800 AT
BRTOANYY;

(i) R3), SNC 9T RTAL 9GP0 3,69
TOFIODI® Bflnleln] 3NFS) /B3
----- ENRTI )T BRTDWIANIND;

(i) A3, (3¢ DI, () wWonYe),

ADERBRA DN BRTIToN YIT NINF).
/33 2,033 AIT BRTICNNYY;

TVB03), S SeDRDAT (i), (i) =03, (ji)3e
23020NY 03505 T3 2.ELNPRT DNINFD). &30,
[B.3, RO e3VTWOTWITIVE RI0FeY) e
@), (i) DI, (i) 200NFD), IDRDAT
AOTNY NOR 20NTIT,3),.




17

Q) OBTIIE BR), WP HOUHRTTT
DBIN3E.

nNoO®, WO SPT) TCRTIONPNR wPTE,
20033B3) (F0835.12) D0WO0Z IR L RIOT.

47. $E30 WOPRI) 9P BN R3I),-

BT BT, DseBBMIN P30D0TD 9T
BDOIN A LTDAW o WP V3T X SN
ST, TPTBD) DTTITRE, 9GP0 FTDS O30T,

VDT O, EMNETCIAVOLTSN
Z0edNWOTI W3E) TRWIE  PII9
WORRIT) 9200 9B 3.
() B30 VORIV 2,03 T0edT
BRHIANF ), BTN

(29) O3s0ey T 93T ROBLBEEE),

AN 3.- WOPRI) 9GP 930 ONI, -

(®) FEFE BDRPOOAD, ©A 3 9T
O30T V3T AOBEBDT QVBO3RENT B3T
O3 NBVLIT, DOAN WOWINPOW 2N

W3R AIMAD STy 30onEe0TT,
ARFR BRAT RR3B,03 TR BIIT,TL,
INOIAM ATV V3DBRRI N L3T,N

035032, 353,030

(2d) &0023; AETTD LR, 18793 703¢
TTOT NOR TG233T AODTINY F0835.30d
e33R

(R) TOIERT P D98N meoOnY
IRDNOND, 1963 (19638 Toee&dT 9D
16) T 900 FIOE&T FATT [AIONE
IRDNOND, 1963 (19638 Fooe&T 9D
17)3 S0¢3R BVONTB NP, BB BN
BP0 OF V|VONBNRY DT He3NMNNS
B3NN 9233 23033

(&) ATED LPTONS) 953230 T3 O3NT,
ABEBBOD P3N 9233 230eACITTT)
G0 9ITDOTN A LIDAT 9T Y33 X 31
O3NT N 3T, TRTBEN-LIWI), WY BTeéd,3d
2N

TS WORD JPTY) TRTANNY) 9P T3
290NF, 80833), W™

RTTY SRTD BT ONINED

51. rieed o), WL BRBIFHT),-

() TREBR LIDRWTBICVEBOT RI0TeY) VR,,3.0C8)
BRI 80E33), ByARNF R, DTN

(29) O3s0elEe 93T ROBWLBEEE),

90333 13O 236e3 LIPRWFTITIVCIOT RIOT

20T BDRTY TR ONINE)




18

52. 9PYNY [MRFIB.-(T3PO o3 9T
OROXR)

() VLIS YAT A ALIN] 23BN PaNTIS
823023 TOTEH -3 B23023TY RYOFF, MDOIPNTS
9500 BT

() WOFPRF) ©BIS R[VF) P edaddo
DDA  DDROFT  PRIRAPIT 00 a3C
03033,

(i) ©903m® WOPRT), LW I3 9IFTz00
FDROD &S F0TY) BVR,3TBY BRTION
80233), FWyAON, BT IJ

(i) O3PYTE V3T BOWLIeTS,

() 9B NR, T BITOINY (9RO,
19630 25:3¢ &BTE0TS eNCTNS &,30,

23030 D RBRVONR
TBBFOT,NS BRY03TD )3 ST
CPTOAMPR BT oNT, w0RY AeIT
NOR, TR,FBED,, P0FINTT AIOT 8033,
Ry A

ESTANINDIN

O38m™ WOPRI), MBS RF) I
)30z DA aNCE3 IPRWIBITIVTBOT RAIOF

20T SRTY BR AN

20T BDRTY TR ONINED

54. TR, PRCRB 90 GVAND) BIBD.E
BT DNDITE), BT BRI &8,
ROWOFPB), .-

() ROBEBIT TPReNET NI, Feoe oo
B L3NDMON &3)35LTe0N DogA a3, a0l IaN.

(i) RBINY JPe®DW ©OFve  ©9YTT e,
BN INPR, 73S TOSRCHINS /03N
TOBTOAD NBLIT,N NI, X O O3HIC
AP BNOE 358/) 3300 RIS IO
VsA I3, e8I,

(i) DT AFBD), R, 8 BN BB/De35000
WPNRPOTTIE VORI, 0T TIaN.

200T3) AReIT BRI

200T3) AReIT BRI

9033 WM BB/ 32D O 3R,
RBODWNRNE B BE8S RR3I, &I, 0CTES,

PO 3 OFLE  m0Bs 20 (1)
BA,0I3TLITIOITITE B,
XXX XXX XXX

TTFO WRTHOOON, ATEE QOIAG, WD, &7, TR

. BEMKL 600, 063¢ @FowT® 2023




3

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SECOND SESSION

THE KARNATAKA STAMP (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023
(LA Bill No. 22 of 2023)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) for the purposes herein after appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy fourth
yearof the Republic India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
KarnatakaStamp (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 30.- In the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957,
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) in section
30, in clause (a), for Article No. [52] (b) and the entries relating thereto, the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“No. [52] (b) (Transfer of any interest secured by a bond, mortgage deed or
policy of insurance),

No. (56) if relating to paper bank guarantee and e-bank guarantee].-”
3. Amendment of the Schedule.- In the Principal Act, in the Schedule,-

(i) in Article 3, in column (3), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words
“one thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in Article 4, in column (3), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “One
hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(iii) in Article 5,-
(@) in clause (b), in column (3), the words “subject to a maximum of
rupees one thousand” shall be omitted;

(b) in clause (e), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten
paise”, the words, “fifty paise” shall be substituted, and for the
words “subject to a maximum of rupees twenty thousand but
not less than rupees Five hundred”, the words “but not less than
rupees Five hundred” shall be substituted;

(c) in clause (i-d),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “RupeesOne
hundred”, the words “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) for the entries in column (3), the the
followingshall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five hundred and in addition Rupees Five hundred for
every Rupees ten lakhs or part thereof in excess of Rupees ten
lakhs, subject to amaximum of Rupees Ten lakhs.”;



(d) in clause (i-e),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
hundred”, the words, “Rupees Five hundred” shall be
substituted; and
(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees Five hundred plus rupees hundred for every rupees
one lakh orpart thereof, in excess of rupees one lakh.”
(e) in clause (j), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred rupees”
the words, “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.
(iv) in Article 6,-
(@) in clause (1),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“0.5 percent of the loan or debt amount”;
(b) in clause (2),-

(i) in sub-clause (i) in column (3), for the figures and words, “0.1
percent”, the figures and words “0.5 percent”, shall be substituted,;
and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii)), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“0.5 percent on the loan or debt amount”.

(v) in Article 8, in clause (b), in column (3) of, for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

(vi) In Article 10, for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand for every rupees ten lakhs or part thereof subject toa
maximum of rupees One Crore.”

(vii) In Article 11, in clause (b),-

(@) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words and figures
“3/4 % of the amount or market value”, the words and
figures “1 % of the amount or market value.”, shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“1 % of the amount or market value.”; and
(c) in sub-clause (iii), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-
“1 % of the amount or market value.”



(viii) in Article 12,-

(@) in clause (a), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof

subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”; and

(b) in clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Two Rupee for every one hundred rupees or part thereof

subject tominimum of rupees one hundred.”

(ix) in Article 14,-

(@) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “One hundred
rupees.”, the words, “Five hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted.

(x) in Article 17, in column (3), for the words “Five hundred rupees.”, the
words, “Two thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xi) in Article 19, in column (3), for the words “Two hundred rupees.”,the
words “Five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xii) in Article 20,-
(a) in clause (4),-

(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the
words, “five percent” shall be substituted and for the words “An
amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal to
five per cent”, shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-clause (ii) in column (3), for the words, “three percent”,
the words “five percent” shall be substituted, and for the words,
“An amount equal to one per cent”, the words, “An amount equal
to five per cent”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (6), for the entries in column (3), the following shall be
substituted, namely:-
“Two rupee for every one thousand rupees or part thereof
subject to a maximum of rupees five lakhs.”;
(c) in clause (7), in column (3), for the words “three percent”, the
words “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xiii) in Article 21,-
(@ in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “five rupees”, the
words, “twenty rupees” shall be substituted; and
(b) in clause (ii), in column (3), for the words, “ten rupees”, the
words, “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xiv) in Article 22, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “five hundred
rupees”, the words, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xv) in Article 25, in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the
words “five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.



4

(xvi) in Article 31, in column (3), for the words “one rupee”, the words “ten
rupees” shall be substituted.
(xvii) in Article 33, in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words, “Five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xviii) in Article 34,-
(a) in clause (c),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), in column (3), for the words “ten rupees”, the
words “fifty rupees”, shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-
“Fifty rupees plus five rupees for every rupees one thousand or
part thereof in excess of rupees one thousand.”;
(b) in clause (d),-
(i) in sub-clause (i), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”; and
(ii) in sub-clause (ii), for the entries in column (3), the following shall
be substituted, namely:-
“Rupees fifty for every rupees ten thousand or part thereof.”
(xix) in Article 39,-
(a) in clause (a),-

(i) in sub-clause (1), in column (3), for the words “Rupees one
thousand for each share”, the words “Rupees Five thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (2), in column (3), for the words “Rupees five
hundred for each share.”, the words, “Rupees Three Thousand for each share.”
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “Rupees two hundred
and fifty for each share”, the words “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted; and

(c) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees two hundred
and fifty for each share”, the words, “Rupees One thousand for each share.”,
shall be substituted.

(xx) in Article 40.-

(a) in clause (B), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“threepercent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted,;

(b) in clause (B), in sub-clause (b), in column (3), for the
words “One thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand
rupees”, shall be substituted,;

(c) in clause (C), in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words
“three percent”, the words “five percent”, shall be substituted,
and

(d) in clause (C), in sub-clause (b),in column (3), for the words
“Onethousand rupees”, the words “two thousand rupees”, shall
be substituted.

(xxi) in Article 40-A,-

(a) in clause (A),-

(i) in sub-clause (a), in column (3), for the words “One thousand
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”, shall be substituted,;



5

(ii) in sub-clause (b), for the entries in column (3), the following
shall be substituted, namely:-

“Rupees Five thousand plus rupees one thousand for every
rupees five lakhsor part thereof, exceeding rupees ten lakhs
capital amount, subject to a maximum of rupees Twenty five
lakhs.”; and

(b) in clause (B), in column (3), for the words, “three percent”, the

words, “five percent”, shall be substituted.
(xxii) in Article 41,-

(@) in clause (a), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred
rupees”, the words “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

() in clause (¢), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred
rupees”, thewords “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted,;

(d) in clause (d), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred
rupees”, thewords, “one thousand rupees”, shall be substituted;

(e) in clause (f), in column (3), for the words “rupees fifty”, the words
“onehundred rupees”, shall be substituted;

(f) in clause (g), in column (3), for the words, “rupees fifty”, the
words “one hundred rupees”, shall be substituted; and

(g) in clause (h), in column (3), for the words, “two hundred
rupees”, thewords, “five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxiii) in Article 44, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.
(xxiv) in Article 45, in clause (c), in column (3), for the words
hundred”, the words “rupees two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxv) in Article 47,-
(@)in clause (a), in column (3), for the words "Fifty paise”, the words
“two rupees”, shall be substituted; and
(b) in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “rupees two hundred”,
thewords, “rupees five hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxvi) in Article 51, in clause (b), in column (3), for the words, “one hundred
rupees”, the words “two hundred”, shall be substituted.
(xxvii) in Article 52,-

(@) in clause (b), in sub-clause (ii), in column (3), for the words “one
hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (c), in column (3), for the words “one hundred rupees”,
thewords “two hundred rupees”, shall be substituted.

(xxviii) in Article 54,-

(@) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted; and

(b) in clause (i), in column (3), for the words, “Rupees One
Thousand.”, the words, “Rupees Two Thousand.”, shall be
substituted.

(xxix) after Article 55 the following shall be inserted, namely ; -

“56. if relating to bank guarantee,-
(i) if relating to paper bank guarantee | Rupees three hundred
(i) if relating to e-bank guarantee Rupees two hundred

3

rupees one




6

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary further to amend the Karnataka Stamp Act, 1957
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957) to enhance the rate of Stamp Duty in certain cases and

to make a separate provision regarding levy of Stamp Duty on Bank Guarantee.

Hence the Bill.



7

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.

KRISHNA BYREGOWDA
Minister for Revenue

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



8

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA STAMP ACT, 1957
(Karnataka Act 34 of 1957)

XXX XXX XXX
SCHEDULE
XXX XXX XXX

3. Adoption deed, that is to say, any
instrument (other than a will), recording an
adoption, or conferring or purporting to
confer an authority to adopt.

Five hundred rupees

4. Affidavit,- including an affirmation or
declaration in the case of persons by law
allowed to affirm or declare instead of
swearing.

Twenty rupees

5. Agreement or its records
Memorandum of an Agreement,—

or

(a) xxx
(b) if relating to the purchase or sale of a
Government security

One rupee for every rupees ten

thousand or part thereof of the value of the
security at the time of its purchase or sale,
as the case may be, subject to a maximum
of rupees one thousand.

(e) If relating to sale. of immovable
property wherein part performance of the

contract,-

(i) xxx

(ii) possession of the property is not | Ten paise for every one hundred rupees or

delivered part thereof on the market value equal to
the amount of consideration subject to a
maximum of rupees twenty thousand but
not less than rupees five hundred

XXX XXX XXX
14. Cancellation of instruments.- (a)

Cancellation of any instrument previously
executed on which stamp duty has been
paid as per any article of the Schedule and
not otherwise specifically provided for by the
Schedule.

(b) Cancellation of any instrument executed
by or on behalf of the Central Government or
a Local Authority or other Authority
constituted by or under any law for the time
being in force or a body corporate wholly
owned or controlled by the Central
Government or the State Government.

same duty as on the original instrument if
such cancellation has the effect of
reconveyance of property already conveyed
by the original instrument:

Provided that, if the original instrument is a
conveyance on sale, then the stamp duty
payable on such cancellation instrument is,
as per article 20(1), on the market value of
the property as on the date of execution of
such cancellation.

one hundred rupees




(c) in any other case

See also agreement or its records or
Memorandum of an Agreement No.(5)(e)

(i) Release (No.45) Revocation of Settlement
(No.48-B), Surrender of Lease (No.51)
Explanation.- If the original instrument has
been subjected to determination of the
market value under section 45-A of the Act,
stamp duty on the cancellation of such
instrument shall be the same as determined
under section 45-A of the Act

one hundred rupees

17.Certificate of enrolment,- in the roll of
Advocates prepared and maintained by the
State Bar Council under the Advocates Act,
1961 (Central Act 25 of 1961)

Five hundred rupees

19. Composition-deed,- that is to say, any
instrument executed by a debtor, where by
he conveys his property, for the benefit of
his creditors, or whereby payment of a
composition or dividend on their debts is
secured to the creditors or whereby
provision is made for the continuance of the
debtors‘ business, under the supervision of
inspectors or under letters of licence, for the
benefit of his creditors

two hundred rupees

20.For Conveyance.-

(4) If relating to an order made by the High
Court or appropriate Tribunals or
appropriate Authorities under the
Companies Act, 2013, in respect of,-

(i) Amalgamation of Companies, including a

subsidiary amalgamating with parent
company
(i) Reconstruction or Demerger of a
company

Three percent on the market value of the
property of the transferor company, located
within the State of Karnataka and
transferred to the transferee company; or
An amount equal to one percent of the
aggregate value of shares issued or allotted
in exchange, or otherwise and in case of a
subsidiary company, shares merged (or
cancelled) with parent company and in
addition, the amount of consideration if
any, paid for such amalgamation; -
whichever is higher subject to a maximum
of rupees twenty five crores.

Three percent on the market value of the
property of the transferor company, located
within the State of Karnataka, and
transferred to the resulting company; or An
amount equal to one percent of the
aggregate value of shares issued or allotted
to the resulting company and in addition,




10

the amount of consideration if any, paid for
such demerger or reconstruction;
whichever is higher subject to a maximum
of rupees twenty five crores.

(6) If relating to assignment of receivab les
by the originator to the special purpose
Vehicle (SPV), or by whatever name they are
called in the process of securitisation under

One rupee for every one thousand rupees
or part thereof subject to a maximum of
rupees one lakh.

securitisation and  reconstruction  of

Financial Assets and Enforcement of

Security Interest Act, 2002

(7)conveyance relating to Transferable | Three percent on the market value of the

Development Rights

Transferable Development Rights equal to
the market value of the corresponding
portion of the property leading to such
Transferable Development Rights, which is
the subject matter of conveyance; or
consideration for such conveyance;
whichever is higher.

21. Copy or extract,- certified to be true
copy or extract by or by order of any public
officer and not chargeable under the law for
the time being in force relating to the Court
fees:

(i) if the original was not chargeable with
duty, or if the duty with which it was
chargeable does not exceed five rupees.

(ii) in any other case

Five rupees

Ten rupees

22. Counterpart or duplicate.—of any
instruments, chargeable with duty and in
respect of which the proper duty has been
paid

(@) if the duty with which the original
instruments is chargeable does not exceed
five hundred rupees.

(b) in any other case

The same duty as payable on the
Original

five hundred rupees

25. Divorce,-instrument of that is to say,
any instrument by which any person effects
the dissolution of his marriage.
Dower,—Instrument of — See settle-ment
(No. 48)

Duplicate,—See Counterpart (No. 22)

One hundred rupees

31. Letter of allotment of shares,- in any
company or proposed company or in respect
of any loan to be raised by any company or
proposed company.

See also certificate or other Document (No.
16) Letter of Guarantee

See Agreement (No. 5)

One rupee

33 Memorandum of Association of a
company,—

(a) if accompanied by Articles of Association
under section 26 of the Companies Act,

One thousand rupees




11

1956 (Central Act 1 of 1956)

(b) if not so accompanied

according to the share capital
company.

of the

The same duty as under Article (No. 10)

34. Mortgage deed,-

() When a collateral or auxiliary or
additional or substituted security, or by way
of further assurance for the above
mentioned purpose, where the principal or
primary security is duly stamped.

(i) for every sum secured not exceeding Rs.
1,000.

(ii) for every Rs. 1,000 or part there of,
secured in excess of Rs.1000.

(d) for hypothecation of movable property,-

If the loan or debt is repayable on demand

(i) where the loan amount does not exceeds
rupees ten lakhs

(ii) where the loan amount exceeds rupees
ten lakhs

Ten rupees

Ten rupees plus one rupee for every rupees
one thousand or part thereof in excess of
rupees one thousand.

rupees ten for every rupees ten thousands
or part thereof

rupees twenty for every rupees ten
thousands or part thereof, subject to a
maximum of rupees ten lakhs".

39. Partition.- -Instrument,- of, as defined
by clause (K) of sub-section (1) of section 2.
(a) where the property involved in the
partition is converted for non-agricultural
purpose or is meant for non agricultural
use.

(1) if the property is situated in the Rupees
jurisdiction of Municipal Corporation or
Urban Development Authorities or Municipal
Councils or Town Panchayats.

(2) If the property is situated in the areas
other than those mentioned in sub- clause
(1) above.

(b) where the property involved in the
partition is agricultural land

(c) where the property involved in the
partition is moveable or money

(d) where the property involved in the
partition belongs to any of the combinations
of categories mentioned in sub-clause (a), (b)
and

one thousand for each share

Rupees five hundred for each share

Rupees two hundred fifty for each share
Rupees two hundred and fifty for each
share

Maximum of the duties described in sub-
clause (a), (b) or (c) above for each share

40 Partnership.-
B. Reconstitution:—
(a) Where immovable property contributed

Three percent




12

as share by a partner or partners remains
with the firm at the time of outgoing in
whatever = manner by such partner or
partners on reconstitution of such
partnership firm.

(b) In any other case

C. Dissolution of:—

(a) Where the property which belonged to
one partner or partners when the
partnership commenced is distributed or
alloted or given to another partner or
partners.

(b) In any other case

on the market value of the immovable

property remaining with the firm.

one thousand rupees

Three percent on a market value equal to
the market value of the property distributed
or alloted or given to partner under the
instrument of dissolution, in addition to the
duty which would have been chargeable on
such dissolution if such property had not
been distributed or alloted or given.

one thousand rupees

40A Limited Liability Partnership,- A.
constitution of Limited Liability Partnership,
or conversion of firm /private
company/unlisted public limited company
into limited liability partnership,

(a) where the capital does not exceed rupees
ten lakhs

(b) where the capital exceeds rupees ten
lakhs; for every rupees five lakh of part
thereof exceeding rupees ten lakhs

B. Reconstruction or amalgamation of

Limited Liability Partnership

Rupees one thousand

Rupees one thousand plus rupees five
hundred for every rupees five lakhs or part
thereof, exceeding rupee ten lakhs capital
amount, subject to a maximum of rupees
ten lakhs

Three percent on the consideration or
market value of the property whichever is
higher of the transferor limited liability
partnership located within the State of
Karnataka

41. Powers of attorney,—(as defined by
section 2(1)(P) not being a proxy,—

(a) when executed for the sole purpose of
procuring the registration of one or more
documents in relation to a single transaction
or for admitting execution of one or more
such documents

(b) when authorising one person or more to
act in a single transaction other than the
case mentioned in Clause (a)

() when authorising not more than five
persons to act jointly and severally in more
than one transaction or generally

(d) when authorising more than five but not
more than ten persons to act Jointly and

One hundred rupees

One hundred rupees

One hundred rupees

Two hundred rupees




13

severally in more than one transaction or
generally;

() when given for consideration or when
coupled with interest and authorizing the
attorney to sell any immovable property;

The same duty as a Conveyance under
Article 20(1) on consideration or on market
value of the property which is the subject
matter of such power of attorney),
whichever is higher.

Provided that, the duty paid on agreement
for sale under Article 5(e) or instrument of
sale or transfer as the case may be, is
adjustable towards the duty payable on
such power of attorney under Article 41 (e),
executed between the same parties and in
respect of the same property

XXX XXX

(eb) When given to a person other than the
father, mother, wife or husb and, sons,
daughters, brothers, sisters in relation to
the executant authorising such person to
sell immoveable property situated in
Karnataka State

(ec) When given to person other than the
father, mother, wife or husband, sons,
daughters, brothers, sisters in relation to
the executant authorising such person to
sell Transferable Development Rights
relating to immovable property situated in
Karnataka State.

XXX

The same duty as a conveyance under
Article 20(1) on the market value of the
property which is the subject matter of the
power of attorney

Provided that the duty paid on
agreement for sale under Article 5(e) or
instrument of sale or transfer as the case
may be is adjustable towards the duty
payable on such power of attorney under
Article 41 (eb), executed between the same
parties and in respect of the same property

The same duty as a conveyance under
Article 20(7) on the market value of the
property which is the subject matter of
Power of Attorney

(f) When executed by a principal or client for
the sole purpose of authorizing the agent or
broker to carry out all lawful acts and deeds
relating to his / her trading operations
including sale / purchase of marketable
securities, transfer of securities towards -
stock exchange, receiving / releasing funds
and securities from / to other parties on
behalf of the principal or client.

(g) When executed by a principal or client
for the sole purpose of authorizing the
depository participant to carry out all lawful
acts and deeds relating to his/her demat
account as per the bye-laws of the
depositories / regulations governing such
operations.

Rupees fifty

rupees fifty




14

(h)in any other case

N.B. The term —Registration includes every
operation incidental to registration under
the Registration Act, 1908. (Central Act 16
of 1908).

Explanation—_For the purposes of this
article more persons than one when
belonging to the same firm shall be deemed
to be one person

two hundred rupees

44. Reconveyance of

property,—

mortgaged

(a) the consideration for which the property
was mortgaged does not to the exceed Rs.
1,000.

(b) in any other case

The same duty as a conveyance (No. 20) for
a market value equal amount of such
consideration as set forth in the re-
conveyance.

One-hundred rupees

45. Release, that is to say, any ins-trument
(not being such a release as is provided for
by section 24,) whereby a person renounces
a claim upon another person or against any
specified property:

(a) where the release is not between the
family members

(b) Where the release is between the family
members

The same duty as a Conveyance under
Article No.20 on the market value of the
property or on the amount or value of claim
or part of claim renounced, as the case may
be which is the subject matter of release or
consideration for such release, whichever is
higher.

(i) If the property is situated within the
limits of Bangalore Metropolitan Regional
Development Authority or Bruhat
Bangalore Mahanagara Palike or City
Corporation Rupees five thousand,;

(ii) If the property is situated within the
limits of City or Town Municipal Council or
Town Panchayat area Rupees
three thousand;

(iii) If the property is situated within the
limits other than the limits specified in
items (i) and (ii) Rupees one
thousand;

Provided that, if the property is
situated in any of the combinations of
limits, mentioned in items (i), (ii) and (iii)
above the duty payable shall be the
maximum of the duties specified in items
(i), (ii) and (iii) above.




15

Explanation.- family in relation to a person
for the purpose of clause (b) means
husband, wife, son, daughter, father,
mother, brother, wife / children of
predeceased brother sister, husband/
children of predeceased sister wife of a
predeceased son and children of a
predeceased son or predeceased daughter.

(c)Release of mortgage rights or lien Same duty as bond (No. 12) subject a
maximum of rupees one hundred

47. Security bond or mortgage-deed,-
executed by way of security for the due
execution of an office, or to account for
money or other property received by virtue
thereof, or execution by a surety to secure
the due performance of a contract.

(@) when the amount secured does not | Fifty paise for every rupees one hundred or

exceed rupees one thousand part thereof
(b) in any other case Rupees two hundred".
EXEMPTION

Bond or other instrument, when executed,-

(a) by any person for the purpose of
guaranteeing that the local income derived
from private subscriptions to a charitable
dispensary or hospital or any other object of
public utility shall not be less than a
specified sum per mensem,

(b) under No. 3A of the rules made under
section 70 of the Bombay Irrigation Act,
1879,

() by persons taking advances under the
Karnataka Land Improvement Loan Act,
1963 (Karnataka Act 16 of 1963), the
Karnataka Agriculturists Loans Act, 1963
(Karnataka Act 17 of 1963) or by their
sureties as security for the repayment of
such advances.

(d) by officers of Government or their
sureties to secure the due execution of an
office or the due accounting for money or
other property received by virtue thereof.

51. Surrender of lease
(a) when the duty with which the lease is | The duty with which such lease is
chargeable does not exceed ed twenty-two | chargeable.

rupees and fifty paise

(b) In any other case One hundred rupees

52. Transfer.— (Whether with or without
consideration),




16

(@) of debentures, being marketable
securities, whether the debenture is, liable
to duty or not

(b) of any interest secured by a bond,
mortgage-deed or policy of insurance,

(i) if the duty on such bond, mortgage-deed
or policy does not exceed twenty-two rupees
and fifty paise

(ii) in any other case

(c) of any property under section 25 of the
Administrator Generals Act, 1963

Fifty paise for every rupees one hundred or
part thereof subject to a maximum of one
thousand rupees for a. consideration equal
to the face value of the debenture

The duty with which such bond, mortgage
deed; or policy of insurance is chargeable.

One hundred rupees

One hundred rupees

54 Trust,-

Declaration of or concerning, any property
when made by any writing not being a Will.-

(i) When the Trust is made exclusively for
public religious and charitable purposes.

(i) When the Trust is made for the
management & custody of properties, for the
purpose of distributing the benefits/profits
of the property to the beneficiaries and
where there is no transfer/ disposition of
property, in any way.

(iiijWhen the trust made involves the
transfer/ disposition of property in any way;

Rupees One Thousand

Rupees One Thousand

The same duty as conveyance under Article
No. 20(1) on the amount and the market
value of the property, which is the subject
matter of such transfer / disposition.

XXX

XXX

Govt. Press, Suvarna Vidhana Soudha, Belgavi, 05™ Dec, 2023, P7, W.D. , Copies 500




