
 
PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£ÉÊzÀ£ÉÃ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

ºÀ¢£Á®Ì£ÉÃ C¢üªÉÃ±À£À 

ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ (ಎರಡඡ ൟൿ౪ ಪല) เඒಯಕ, 2022 

(2022gÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉAiÀÄ «zsÉÃAiÀÄPÀ ¸ÀASÉå-30) 
 

 ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ಡฤ ಒಂൿ 

เඒಯಕ. 

 ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 
1964ඝ౬  (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 12) ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ; 

 ಇൿ ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ ದ ಎಪ౭ ൢ ರඡ ವಷბದย  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  เඋನಡಲൽಂದ ಈ 
෨ಂൽඦ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย:- 

 1. ౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ 
(ಎರಡඡ ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2022 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (2) ಇൿ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ ಅඌಚචಯ ෩ಲಕ ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ൽකಂಕඈൿ  

೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 2. ಪ ಕರಣ 95ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964ರ (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ 12) (ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ ಉว ೕಸมಜං) 95ඡ 
ಪ ಕರಣದย ,-  

 (1) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “ (2)  ಉർಯದ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ ේ෦ಯ  

ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ෴โඃ ූಗವඝ౬  ෴โඃ ಇತರ 

ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬದยಸฤ ಇ ದฉ, ಆತඝ ඡ෦ಸಬർඈಥ คೕൟಯย  ಒಂൿ ಅඹറเഡ 
೯ಡ ೧ม ඌ౽คಡ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಸย ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨ ,- 

 (i) ಕකბಟಕ ಪಟౣ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಛ ಂತರ ೕಜච ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1963ರ ಕකბಟಕ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ 11)ರ ಉಪීಧಗಳ ෬ฉಡ ීಧಪಟౣ  ේ෦ಯ ීಧದย  ಕ౨ ฿ಜ 
ಪ ಕഔಸมದ ಸౣ ฑ ඩ ඨನย  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ಬಳಃಡ ಅඝರ฿ಜ ಬದมವൕಯඝ౬  

ಆೕคದฉ ಆಗ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ๑ಲౙ ದ ඩವൟಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅದඝ౬  
ಬದมಸมಜං ಎಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅ೧ბಯ ౷ ೕಂൟಯ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಏำ 
ൽನಗูಳಛಜ ಅದಕౙ ඝರ฿ಜ ಅඝ෮ೕದච ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ຄರലಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಪฏൡ, ೧ม ඌ౽ค ಅ೧ბಯ ౷ ೕಂൟಯ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಏำ ൽನಗูಳಛಜ ತನ౬  
ඛಣბಯವඝ౬  ඛೕಡฤ ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ಡฤ เಫಲකದ 

ದಭბದย  ೧ม ඌ౽ค ේ ಬಳಃ ಬದมವൕಛಜ ಅඝ෮ೕದචಯඝ౬  ඛೕലർ౪ ฉಂൿ 
ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ๑ಲౙ ದ ർಯದ ತฆ฿ಯ 
ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ คೕൟಯย  ಅದඝ౬  ಪ ೕಕคಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ຄರലಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



2 

 
 (ii) ಸౣ ฑ ඩ ನඝ౬  ಪ ಕഔಸൽฆವ ದಭბದย  ಅಥ฿ ේ෦ ಸ౩ ัೕಯ ೕಜක 
ಪ ඃಶದ ຄರಡ ಬฆವย  ීಧಪಟౣ  ඩ ඌ౽ರಗำ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ౷ ೕಕคದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ 

ಹൽජൿ ൽನಗูಳಛಜ ತಮ  ಅඩ ಯವඝ౬  ಸย ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ೧ม ඌ౽ค ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7) ರ 
ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ๑ಲౙ ದ ർಯಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ , ීಧಪಟౣ  ඩ ඌ౽ರಗำ ಸย ದ 
ಅඩ ಯಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅ೧ბಯ ಅඝರ ේ ಬಳಃ ಬದมವൕಛಜ ಅඝ෮ೕದචಯඝ౬  

ඛೕಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಪฏൡ, ඩ ඌ౽ರಗำ ಸದค ಹൽජൿ ൽನಗูಳಡ ෴โඃ ಅඩ ಯ ಸย ಸൽฆವ 

ದಭბದย , ಅ೧ბಗඝರ ಸದค ේ ಬಳಃ ಬದมವൕಡ ීಧಪಟౣ  ඩ ඌ౽ರಗัಂದ 
෴โඃ ಆಃ౹ ೕಪൕ ಇฆโൽಲ ๅಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

 ಮൡ౨  ಪฏൡ, ೧ม ඌ౽ค, ಅ೧ბಯ ౷ ೕಂൟಯ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ෩ವൡ౨  ൽನಗูಳಡ 

ಈ ಬಡ  ತನ౬  ൟೕბನವඝ౬  ඛೕಡฤ ಮൡ౨  ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ຄರലಸฤ เಫಲකದ ದಭბದย  
೧ม ඌ౽ค ේ ಬಳಃ ಬದมವൕಛಜ ಅඝ෮ೕದචಯඝ౬  ඛೕലർ౪ ฉಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  

ಮൡ౨  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ๑ಲౙ ದ ർಯಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ  
ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ คೕൟಯย  ಅದඝ౬  ಪ ೕಕคಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ຄರലಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

  (iii) ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ำ  ಅಥ฿ ತඬ౭  ಳೕಷൕ ഴವ ෩ಲಕ ಅಥ฿ 

ಅඹറเഡ ಸย ವ ෩ಲಕ ෴โඃ ේ ಬದมವൕ ലಆಂലದ౪ ฉ ೧ม ඌ౽ค 
౾ ෦ನฯ ຄൕಛคಃಯ ೯ಡ ಈ ಬಡಜನ ಸದค ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ರൿ౪ ಪല ಆඃ๏ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

ಪคವತბච ๑ಲౙ  ಏකದง ർಯ ലದ౪ ฉ ಅದඝ౬  ಸ౽ბರ ಁಡศ ෨ഖౣ ತೕฤ 
౾ಆಳ ತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ำ  ಅඹറเഡ ಸย ವ ෩ಲಕ ෴ವ ේ෦ಯ ීಧದย  

ಂತರ ಬಳಃಛಜ ಬದมವൕ ಪഷಯมಜංೕ ೧ม ඌ౽คಯವฆ ಆ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  

ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ෨ഖౣ ತೕฤ ౾ಆำ โದ౽ౙ ಜ ಆඃಶ ಡಬൿ. 

 (iv) ಸๆბ ඦಬฑನ ಒಂൿ ූಗವඝ౬  ಂತರ ಬಳಃಛಜ ಬದมವൕ ലಆഴ๋ 

ಆೕคದ ದಭბದย  ಬದมವൕ ಆೕคದ ූಗದ ಗല ಞฆൡಗಳඝ౬  ಞฆൟ ේ ಪನ, 

ಉർಯ ವ ವ౩  ಮൡ౨  ේ ർಖวಗಳ ಇมಒ ಅඝ෮ೕൽದ  ಪคವತბක තವბ ನಃ౹  (Pre 

Conversion Sketch) ಅඝ౬  ಬದมವൕ ಅ೧ბಂൽಡ ಸย โൿ ಕറ ಯ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ :  

 ಪฏൡ, ේ ಪನ, ಉർಯ ವ ವ౩  ಮൡ౨  ේ ർಖวಗಳ ಇมಒ ಅ೧ბർರඝ 
ನಃ౹ ಛಜ ಅ೧ბ ಸย ದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಹൽජൿ ൽನಗูಳಛಜ ಪคವತბක තವბ ನಃ౹ ಯඝ౬  

ಅඝ෮ೕൽಸฤ เಫಲ฿ದ ಅಥ฿ ൟರಸౙ คದ ದಭბದย  ಅ೧ბർರඝ ದ౪ ಪലඈ 
ಅದඝ౬  ಅඝ෮ೕൽಸมಜංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ คೕൟಯย  

ಅඝ෮ೕದචಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (v) ಅ೧ბർರඝ ತನ౬  ಳೕಷൕ ಅಥ฿ ಅඹറเഡನย  ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಂತರ 

ಬಳಃಛಜ ಬದมಸฤ ಆೕคฆವ ේ෦ ೪ฆ ലฆವ ේ෦ (Granted Land) 

ಆಜංಂൿ ඛงඪฆವย , ಬದมವൕ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඝತ ೦ൟಗಳ ಮൡ౨  ಅඝತ 
්ಡಕഖౣ ಗಳ (ಃಲโ ේ෦ಗಳ ವಛბವൕಯ ඛಧ) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1978 ಅಥ฿ ಕකბಟಕ ේ 

೪ฃൟಯ ඛಯಮಗำ, 1969 ಅಥ฿ ಸ౽ბರโ ౽ಲ౽ಲಃౙ  ຄರലವ ේ 
೪ฃൟಗಳ ෴โඃ ඛීಧචಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ಉಲ ಂಫൟ౨ ದ౪ ฉ ม ඌ౽ค 
ಅಂಥ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ൟರಸౙ คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



3 

 
 (vi) ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย ನ ಬದมವൕಯ ಆඃಶโ, ಕකბಟಕ ಪಟౣ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಛ ಂತರ 
ೕಜච ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1963ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 11)ರ ಉಪීಧಗಳย ฆ๋ 
ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ฿ಸ౨ เಕ ಂತರ ಬಳಃಛಜದ౪  ຄರൡ, ෨ർ ಂಕ ಮൡ౨  ඣೕಂದ ಇมಒ 
ಅඌඈ ಬದมವൕ෴ದ ේ෦ಯ ಗბ วಯย  ಸ౷  ກಚ ಳಃౙ  
౽ರಣ฿ಗತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ . 

 ಪฏൡ, ದ౾౹ ಣ ಕನ౬ ಡ ೧ว ಯย , ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳ ඛბಣ ಅಥ฿ ූเ ಅಥ฿ ಃฉಗಳ 
ඛბಣಃౙ  ීඌඈ ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ ,- 

 (ಎ) ಕකბಟಕ ේ ർರൕಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 10) ರ 
48ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ಏౙ , ค ಅಥ฿ ූಛ౨  ේ෦ಯ ಅඌෟೕಗർರකಜ 
ඣಂർತ฿ದ ಅಥ฿ ඣಂർโದಃౙ  ຄൕಛರකದ ವ ౾౨ ; ಅಥ฿ 

 () ಕකბಟಕ ේ ർರൕಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 10)ರ 
77ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ೪ฃൟ ಪഷದ ವ ౾౨ , 

 - ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ಅಗತ ฿ದ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯං ಮൡ౨  ಅದರย  
ಅಡಕ฿ದൿ౪  ಏඡ ಇൿ౪ ർ౪ ಜ, ತಹ๏ೕม౪ ರคಡ ඡ෦ಸಬർඈಥ ನ෩චಯย  තವბ 
ඣೕഔೕ ಕำದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ๑ಲౙ ದ 
ർಯಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅಂಥ ේ෦ ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗವඝ౬  ෴โඃ ಇತฉ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಬದมಸಬൿ.” 

 (2) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (3), (4), (5) ಮൡ౨  (6)ඝ౬  ഖౣ ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (3) ಉಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ಬದมಜ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(7) ಉർಯ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ ෴โඃ 

ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳಸฤ ಅඝಮൟ ಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ ಅಥ฿ ಈ 
ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅඝಮൟ ඛೕಡมಜංಂൿ ූเฆ฿ಗ ೧ม ඌ౽ค ಈ ಬಡ  ฃಜ  
ಸ౽ბರโ ರಸಬർඈಥ ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ౽ಲ౽ಲಃౙ  ಅඌඈಥ ๑ಲౙ ವඝ౬  
ർಯ ಡฤ ಅಗತ ಪലಸಬൿ. ಆ ತฆ฿ಯ 83ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ຄರൡ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯ ෬ว ෴โඃ ಉർಯವඝ౬  เඌಸತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ .” 

 3. ಪ ಕರಣ 96ರ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದย ನ 96ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (i) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (1)ರย ,- 

 (ಎ) “ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನರ ಅඝಮൟ ಇಲ ං” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ 
(2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ෴โๆ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಉಲ ಂಫ ಅಥ฿ ำ  ಅಥ฿ ತඬ౭  ಅඹಡเഡ 
ಳೕಷൕಯක౬ ಧค” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗำ, ಅಂ౾ಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಆವರಣಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 () “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ 
ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರย ,- 

 (ಎ) “ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗัಡ” 
ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

 () “ಇಪ౭ ౨ ೖൿ งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಎರഴ เರದ ಐൿඞฆ 
งඩಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 

  



4 

 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗำ ಮൡ౨  ౽ರಣಗಳ ຂัಃ 

 

 2021-2022ರ ವಷბದ ಆಯವ ಯ ූಷಣದย  ലದ ಪ ౨ ವචಗಳඝ౬  ೦คಡ ತರฤ ಮൡ౨  

ಂತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ  ේ ಪคವತბචಯඝ౬  ಸರಳತัโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964 (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 12)ರ 95ඡ ಮൡ౨  96ඡ ಪ ಕರಣವඝ౬   ಮತ౨ ౣ  

ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ ಅವಶ ಕๅಂൿ ಪคಗಸมಜං. 

ಆದ౪ คಂದ ಈ เඑಯಕ. 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 



5 

 
ಆ൮ბಕ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ  

 

ಪ ౨ เತ ๎ಸකತ ಕ ಕ ಮโ ෴โඃ ກ ನ ๅಚ ವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆโൽಲ . 

 

 



6 

 
ಪ ൞ ೕ೧ತ ๎ಸನ ರಚකඌ౽ರದ ಀคൡ ೦ౢ ಪನ ಪತ  

ಘಡ 2 ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ฆವ 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ಈ 
ಘಡದ ಅലಯย ,- 

(i)      2ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣโ,-  

(ಎ) ಂತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ೕಷನฑಡ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಸย ವ 
เඋನದ ಀคൡ ඛಯ෦ಸฤ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ඛೕഴತ౨ ං.  

()  (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (i)ඡ ಘಡದ ಪฏൡಕ ಮൡ౨  (ii)ඡ ಘಡದ 
ಎರಡඡ ಪฏൡಕโ ේ ಬಳಃ ಬದมವൕಛಜ ಅඝർನವඝ౬  
ඛೕലർ౪ ฉಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅದඝ౬  ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ೕಷನฑඝ 
ඁുೕಕคವ ಮൡ౨  ຄರലವ เඋನದ ಀคൡ ඛಯ෦ಸฤ ฃಜ  
ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ඛೕഴತ౨ ං.   

() (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (iv)ඡ ಘಡದ ಪฏൡಕโ ಅ೧ბർರನ ನಃ౹ ಯඝ౬  
ಅඝ෮ೕൽฆโർಜ ූเโൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅದඝ౬  ේ ಪನ, 
ಉർಯ ವ ವ౩  ಮൡ౨  ේർಖวಗಳ ಇมಒ ຄರലಸತಕౙ  
เඋನದ ಀคൡ ඛಯ෦ಸฤ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ඛೕഴತ౨ ං.   

(ല)  2ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ (iv)ඡ ಘಡದ ಪฏൡಕದ () ්โ ಅಂಥ 
ನ෩චಯย  ತಹ๏ೕม౪ ರคಡ තವბ ඣೕഔೕಸඝ౬  ಕำโದ౽ౙ ಜ 
ඛಯಮಗಳඝ౬  ರಸฤ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  ඛೕഴತ౨ ං.   

 (ii)  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ฆವ 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (7)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣโ 
(2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಅඝಮൟโದಃౙ  ඛಯಮಗಳඝ౬  ರಸฤ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅඌ౽ರವඝ౬  
ඛೕഴತ౨ ං.    

 

ಪ ౨ เತ ๎ಸನ ರಚකඌ౽ರದ ಪ ൞ ೕಜච ฿ലಃಯ ಸ౷ งಪർ౪ ಜං.  

  

 

Dgï. C±ÉÆÃPÀ 

PÀAzÁAiÀÄ ªÀÄAwæ 

 
 

JA.PÉ. «±Á¯ÁQë 

PÁAiÀÄðzÀ²ð 

PÀ£ÁðlPÀ «zsÁ£À̧ À̈ sÉ 

 

 



7 

 
ಅඝීಧ 

ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964ರ  
(1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ  12)ಉದ౫ ೃತ ූಗ 

X X           XX           XX 

83. ಉർಯ ඛಣბಯದ คೕൟ, ತರ ಉർಯದ ಪคವತბච ಮൡ౨  ಃಲโ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ේ෦ಯ ಬಳಃಯඝ౬  ඛඌโൿ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ෩ಲಕ ಅಥ฿ 
ಅದರ ෬ฉಡ ಅನ ൭ ಉಪීඌฆโದඝ౬ ัൿ, ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ෬ฉಡ ෴โඃ ේ෦ಯ 
ಬಡ  เඌಸมಞವ ේಉർಯವඝ౬ , ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಆ ේ෦ ಬಳಃ෴ಞโದඝ౬  
ಗಮඛ ඛಧბคಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಅಥ฿ ඛಧბคಸมಜංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಯವಲ ದ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳฆವ 
෴โඃ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬದยಆಂಡฉ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳದฉ, ಅದಃౙ  
ಉർಯವඝ౬  ಮක౬  ലದ౪ ง ಅಥ฿ ಯವಲ ದ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಉർಯವඝ౬  ඛಧბคದง, ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳඈಥ ේ෦ಯ ಬಡ  
ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ ದರಗಳ ෬ฉಡ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ಆ ේ෦ಯ ಬಡ  
ේಉർಯವඝ౬  ർಯ ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

(3) ෴โඃ ේ෦ಯඝ౬ , - 

 (ಎ) ฿ಸದ ಮචಗಳ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ; 

 () ಅಛคಃ ಅಥ฿ ฿ಜ ದ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ; ಅಥ฿ 

 () ಇತರ ෴โඃ ತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 

- ಬಳโದಃౙ  ීඌ, ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮโ ඩ ฏಭ฿ಞโದಃౙ  ෮ದฤ ೦คಯย ದ౪  
෴โඃ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅಥ฿ ౽ඞඛನ ෬ฉಡ ಆ ේ෦ಯ ෬ว เඌಸมಞವ ಮൡ౨  
ඛಧბคದ ಅಥ฿ ඛಧბคಸมಜංಂൿ ූเದ ේಉർಯವඝ౬ , ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย  ಏඡ 
ಇದ౪ ง, (4)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪීಧಗัಗඝರ฿ಜ ಅಂಥ ಉർಯโ ಪคವൟბತ฿ಜದ౪  
ຄರൡ, ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮโ ඩ ฏಭ฿ಞವ ౽ಲದย  ෴ವ ದರದ ಪ ౽ರ เඌಸมಜ൧౨ ೕ ಅಥ฿ 
เඌಸಬർಜ൧౨ ೕ ಅದರ ಪ ౽ರ เඌโൿ ෨ಂൿವคಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(4) ಯವಲ ದ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳದ ෴โඃ ේ෦ಡ ීඌ, 
ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮโ ඩ ฏಭ฿ಞโದಃౙ  ෮ದฤ ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ಅಥ฿ 
౽ඞඛನ ෩ಲಕ ಅಥ฿ ಅโಗಳ ෬ฉಡ ฿ბಕ฿ಜ ർಯ ಡ౽ಜฆವ 
ේಉർಯವඝ౬  เඌಸಬർಜ൧౨ ೕ ಅಥ฿ เඌಸมಜංೕ ಅಂಥ ේಉർಯವඝ౬ , 
ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ ඛಯಮಗัಗඝರ฿ಜ ಅಂಥ ฿ბಕ ಉർಯದ ෮ಬಲಜನ 
ಐದರಷౣ ಃౙ  ಸಮකದ ෮ಬಲಗඝ౬  ฃಜ  ಸರ౽ರಃౙ  ർಯ ഴโದರ ෩ಲಕ 
ಪคವൟბಸಬൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಪคವತბච෴ದ ෬ว ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಡ ಅಂಥ ฿ბಕ 
ේಉർಯൽಂದ เකൟ ಇರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(5) ತಹ๏ೕม౪ ರඝ ಅಥ฿ ෮ೕಜ ಅඌ౽ค, ಈ ಬಡ  ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ 
ඛಯಮಗัತಳಪഖౣ , ේಉർಯಃౙ  ຄൕ෴ಜฆವ ෴โඃ ේ෦ಯ ಬಳಃಯඝ౬  ಃಲโ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಪ ൟීඌಸಬൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ෴โඃ ಪ ൟීඌತ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಅದඝ౬  
ಬಳವ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳಸฤ ಯൟ౬ ವ ෴ช ഴವัർರನඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ವ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ౾౹ ಪ౨  
ಕ ಮದ ෩ಲಕ ຄರಡಬൿ. 

X X           XX           XX 

95. ಯದ ේ෦ಯ ಬಳಃಗำ ಮൡ౨  ಯದ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಇತರ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳವ ಬಡಜನ เඋನ.- (1) ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳඝ౬  ಕഖౣ ವ ಅಥ฿ เಗಳඝ౬  
ಅಥ฿ ಃฉಗಳඝ౬  ඛ෦ბವ ಬಡ  ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , 
ಉർಯದ ඛಧბರൕ෴ದ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ ේ෦ಯ 
ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ, ಆ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಉತ౨ ಮ฿ಜಞವั ಡฤ ಅಥ฿ ෬ว ຂัದ 



8 

 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಆ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ກೋ  ಅඝಁಲಕರ฿ಜ ಬಳಃ ഴโದ౽ౙ ಜ, ൞ඡ ಏർ౪ ಜ 
මฏ ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳඝ౬  ಕಟౣ ฤ, เ ಅಥ฿ ಃฉಗಳඝ౬  ඛ෦ბಸฤ, ฉ ෴โඃ 
උರൕಗಳඝ౬  ಡฤ ಅಥ฿ ತನ౬  ඥಕರคಂದ, ಢർರคಂದ, ಏ೬ಂಟคಂದ ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ 
౽ඞඝಸಮ ತ ಪ ൟඛඌಗัಂದ මฏ ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳඝ౬  ಕഔౣ ಸฤ, เ ಅಥ฿ ಃฉಗಳඝ౬  
ඛ෦ბಆಳ ฤ ಅಥ฿ ฉ ෴โඃ උರൕಗಳඝ౬  ലಸฤ ಹಀౙ ಳ ವකಜฆ൞౨ ච. 

ಪฏൡ, ේ෦ಡ ඛಯ෦ಸಬർඈಥ ಗคಷ  เ౨ ೕಣბಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ , ಡ ಕഔౣ ದ 
මฏ ಕಟౣ ಡโ ಅಥ฿ මฏ ຆ ಆತನ ഴವัಯ ๕ಕಡ ಹತ౨ ౾ౙ ಂತ ກೈ ಜರತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ . 

เವರൕ.- ಈ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ "මฏ ಕಟౣ ಡ" ಅಥ฿ "මฏ ຆ" ಎಂದฉ, 
ซತನ ವಸൟಛಜ ಬಳದ ಅಥ฿ ಂ ಪคಕರಗಳඝ౬  ಇഴವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳದ ಮൡ౨  
೦ඝ฿ฆಗಳඝ౬  ಕഔౣ ಕฤ ಬಳದ ಜ෦ೕඛಡ ຄಂൽಆಂലฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಂ ේ෦ಯ 
ಒಂൿ ූಗದย  ඛ෦ბದ ಮච ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಮචಯඝ౬  ซತඝ ತನ౬  ಸ౷ ಂತ ಉಪೕಗ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಬಳಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಟ ಅದඝ౬  ෴โඃ ವ ౾౨ ಯ ಅಥ฿ ಏ೬ඛ౺ ಯ ฿ಜ  ಚഖವഔಃಗัಡ 
ඛೕಡತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ . 

(2) ಉർಯದ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ 
ේ෦ಯ ෴ช ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ෴โඃ ූಗವඝ౬  
෴โඃ ಇತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬದยಸฤ ಇ ದฉ, ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ 
౽ඞඛನย  ಏඡ ಒಳತಂലದ౪ ง ಅವඝ ಅඝಮൟಛಜ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನคಡಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  
ಸย ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉಪීಧಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದ ෬ฉಡ 
ലದ ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ඛฃಕคಸಬൿ ಅಥ฿ ಕ౨ ๅಂൿ ൞ඝ 
ಆสೕ๋ಥ ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅದඝ౬  ಆಡಬൿ. 

ಪฏൡ, ಂ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಲ ಪನ ലದ ಅಥ฿ ຄಂൽದ ෴โඃ ಂ 
ේ෦ ಕකბಟಕ ಪಟౣ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಛ ಂತರ ೕಜච ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ರ (1963ರ 
ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 11) ಅലಯย  ಸౣ ฑ ඩ ඨ ಅඝ౬  ಕ౨ ฿ಜ ಪ ಕഔಸมಜฆವ 
ಸ౩ ัೕಯ ೕಜක ಪ ඃಶඅಳಡ ಇൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ේ෦ ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಪคವತბච ಅಂಥ 
ಸౣ ฑ ඩ ඨನย  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ේ ಬಳಃಯ ಉං౪ ೕಶಃౙ  ಅඝರ฿ಜದ౪  ಪ ಕರಣದย , 
ಅದಃౙ  (7)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย  ඛಯ෦ಸมದ ೩ม චಯඝ౬  ඩವൟโದಃౙ  
ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡมಜංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

ಮ ౨ൢ  ಪฏൡ, ದ౾౹ ಣ ಕನ౬ ಡ ೧ว ಯย  ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳ ඛბಣಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ เಗಳඝ౬  
ಅಥ฿ ಃฉಗಳඝ౬  ඛ෦ბโದಃౙ  ීඌඈ ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ 
౽ඞඛಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ಏౙ  (ඬಂ೦) ේ෦, ತคේ෦ ಅಥ฿ ಛಯ൬ ේ෦ 
ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ,- 

 (ಎ)  ಕකბಟಕ ේ උರ൏ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 10) ರ 
48ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯ ಅඌෟೕಗർರචಂൿ ඣೕಂದ෴ದ ಅಥ฿ 
ඣೕಂದ෴ಗ౽ದ ವ ౾౨  ಅಲ ൽದ౪ ฉ; ಅಥ฿ 

 ()  ಸದค ಅඌඛಯಮದ 77ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಪഷದ ವ ౾౨  
ಅಲ ൽದ౪ ฉ, 

ಈ ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅಗತ ಪലದ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷಯං ಮൡ౨  ಅದರย  ಏඡ 
ಒಳತಂലದ౪ ง, ತಹ๏ೕม౪ ರඛಡ ඛಗൽತ ಅ೧ბ ನ෩චಯย  ಆ ಬಡ  ෨ಂತ฿ಜ 
ඣೕഔඝ౬  ಕำದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಮൡ౨  ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣ (7)ರ ෬ฉಡ ඛಗൽಪലದ ඈಡವඝ౬  
ඛಗൽತ คೕൟಯย  ർಯ ലದ ෬ว ෴โඃ ಇತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  
ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗವඝ౬  ಪคವತბච ಡಬൿ. 

(2ಎ) ಉർಯದ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ 
ේ෦ಯ ෴ช ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ, 2008ರ ലಂಬฑ, 31 ౙಁ  ෨ಂ, (2)ඡ ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದ 
෬ฉಡ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑನ ಅඝಮൟ ಪഷಯං ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗವඝ౬  
฿ಸದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬದยฆವย  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಬದมವൕಯඝ౬  ಸಕ ಮತัโದಃౙ  
ಇ ದย , ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 ೦คಡ ීದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ 
ಒಂൿ ವಷბದ ಅವඌಳಛಜ ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ಅ೧ბ ನ෩චಯย , ๑ಲౙ  ಟ 
ඈಡචಂൽಡ ഷත ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑඛಡ ಅ೧ბ ಸย ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಅಂಥ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ౷ ೕಕคದ 



9 

 
෬ว ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑඝ, ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย  ಏඡ ಒಳತಂലದ౪ ง, ಆದฉ ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  
೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ಇತರ ౽ඞඛನ ಉಪීಧಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಮൡ౨  
ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪಟౣ  ಟ ಅಂಥ คೕൟಯย , ಅವಶ ಕๅಂൿ ൞ඝ 
ಅಗತ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ౘ ವඝ౬  ಜฆಪലದ ෬ว ಟ เೈರൕಯ ತฆ฿ಯ 
ಅಂಥ ේ෦,- 

 (i)   ජಸಜბಕ ಒಳಚฏല ಅಥ฿ ౽ฤๅ ಹคเನ ಗბದย  ಇದ౪ ฉ; 
 (ii) ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ ಅಥ฿ ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರದ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಸ౩ ัೕಯ 

ඩ ඌ౽ರದ  ಒഷತನಃౙ ಅಥ฿ ඛತ ಣದย ฆವ ඩ ඌ౽ರಃౙ  คದ;  
(iii)ಪ ౨ ತ ಅಥ฿ ಪ ౨ ඪತ ರ౨ ಗัಡ, ಒಳಜನ ಅಥ฿ ຄರಜನ ವൡბಲ ರ౨ ಗัಡ, 

ฃౣ იೕಯ ກർ౪ คಗัಡ, ಅಗยೕಕರಣ౽ౙ ಜ ಪ ౨ ඪದโಗิ คඈ ಪ ౨ ඪತ ವൡბಲ 
ರ౨ ಗಳ ාඩಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  ซว౷  ษඝಗัಡ, ഓ ಂๆಗัಡ, ಸ෩ಹ คಡ ౾౹ ಪ  ಪದ౫ ൟ 
ೕಜචಗัಡ, ಪಕბಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  ಇತರ කಗคಕ ಲಭ ಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ವბಜඛಕ 
ಕಯბಗัಡ ಅല  ಅಡಚൕ ಉಂഖ ഴൟ౨ ದ౪ ฉ; 

 (iv)  ಅರಣ  ේ෦෴ಜದ౪ ฉ; 
 (v)  ฌಬ౯  ವ ౾౨ ಡ คൿ౪  ಅ೧ბർರඛಡ ಅದರ ෬ว ಹಀౙ  ಇರൽದ౪ ฉ; 

 (vi)  ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಉർ ನವನಗำ, ಆಟದ ෭ർನಗำ, ෨ಕ౨  ಪ ඃಶಗำ 
ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ಕಯბಗಳඝ౬  ಒದಜಸฤ ෦ೕಸยഔౣ ದ౪ ฉ; 

(vii)  ಅಥ฿ ಕಟౣ ಡโ ಅಕౙ ಪಕౙ ದವರಸ౷ ൟ౨ ಡ ฆಮึಯ ඛೕฆ ಹคൿຄೕಞವ 
ಚฏലಗัಡ, ಃฉ ಏค ಪ ඃಶಗัಡ, ನൽ ඩತ ಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ ನൽ ඈഷಡ ಮൡ౨  ౽ฤๅಗัಡ 
ຄಂൽಆಂലದ౪ ฉ ಅಥ฿ -ങನ౺ ඨ เൿ ൬ ಗბದ ಃಳಡ ಇದ౪ ฉ; 

(viii) ඩฏಪคಕ  ರಕಗัಡ, เನ ඛม౪ ಣಗัಡ ಟ ක ඛීಧචಗัಡ 
ීඌඈ ವಲಯ ඛීಧචಗಳย  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ඛීಧචಗಳย  ಎತ౨ ರ ಇಂൟౣ ೕ  
ಇರಃಂൿ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ඛಬბಂಧಗัಡ เฆದ౫ ฿ಜ ಬಳಃ ഴൟ౨ ದ౪ ฉ; 

(ix) -ങನ౹ ඨ เൿ ൬ ษඨಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ಅಜ౬  ๎ಮಕ ಕ ಮಗัಡಆഔౣ ฆವ 
෴โඃ ಅඝಮൟಡ ಅඝಞಣ฿ಜ ಇರൽದ౪ ฉ; 

(x) ූರತ ಸ౽ბರದ ಪคಸರ ಮൡ౨  ಅರಣ  ൞ ಲಯದ ಕฃವั ವಲಯ 
ඛීಧචಡಒಳಪഔౣ ฆವ ಪ ඃಶದย ದ౪ ฉ; - เೈರൕ ലದ ತฆ฿ಯ 
ಸಕ ಮತัಸಬൿ ಅಥ฿ ಸಕ ಮತัಸฤ ඛฃಕคಸಬൿ; 

(xi) ේ ಬಳಃಯย  ಬದมವൕಡ ීඌඈ ಆಜฆವ ಉಲ ಂಘචಯඝ౬  
ಧ ฿ದౣ  ಮഔౣ ಡ ಕකბಟಕ ಪಟౣ ಣ ಮൡ౨  ಛ ಂತರ ೕಜච ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961ರ 
14ಎ ಪ ಕರಣಃౙ  ಅඝರ฿ಜ; ಅಥ฿ 

(xii) ಎರഴ ಮಹലಗัಜಂತ ກೋ  ಮಹലಗಳඝ౬  ຄಂൽฆವ ෴โඃ ಕಟౣ ಡಃౙ  
ීඌඈ ಅไൽ౫  ౽ಯბವඝ౬  ಅತಂലದ౪ ฉ,- 

(ಎ) ಅಂಥ ಕಟౣ ಡದ ರಚචಯ ౩ ರ ಬಡ  ಕಟౣ ಡ ಇಂ೧ඛೕಯฑඛಂದ ಪ ಣ 
ಪತ ವඝ౬  ೩ฆಪലർಗ;    

 
() ಅಜ౬ ๎ಮಕ ಇมಒಂದ ಆಃ౹ ೕಪൕ ಇಲ  ಪ ಣಪತ  ಪഷൿಆಂലದ౪ ฉ       

- ಸಕ ಮತัಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
(xiii) ಅಥ฿ ಕකბಟಕ ේ ಉർಯ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1964ರ ෬ฉಡ ಳೕದ 

ಅඝ෮ೕൽತ ಸౣ ฑ ඩ ö◌ಯ್ඨನ ಅಥ฿ ಹฆ ಪഔౣ  ವಲಯದย  ಅನඌಂತ 
ಅไൽ౫ ಅಥ฿ ඛბಣ ലದ౪ ฉ; ಮൡ౨  

(xiv) ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ෴โඃ ಇತರ ඛಧಃౙ  ಒಳಪഔౣ ದ౪ ฉ,                                  
- เೈರൕ ലದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಸಕ ಮತัಸಬൿ ಅಥ฿ ಸಕ ಮತัಸฤ 
ඛฃಕคಸಬൿ. 

(2ಎಎ) 2008ರ ലಂಬฑ 31 ౙಁ  ෨ಂ ฿ಸದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಪคವತბච ಅಥ฿ 
ේಬಳಃಯย  ಬದมವൕ ಡมಜ౨ ಂൿ ฆ೩฿ൡಪലವ ຄൕ, ಅಂಥ ಅನඌಂತ 
ಪคವತბචಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ේಬಳಃಯย  ലದ ಬದมವൕಯඝ౬  ಸಕ ಮತัโದ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಆೕคದ ಅ೧ბർರನ ෬ว ಇರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



10 

 
(2ಎಎಎ) ಎม  ಅಂಥ ಪคವತචಗಳඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ේಬಳಃಯ ಬದมವൕಯඝ౬  

ಸಕ ಮತัಸൽฆ฿ಗ ಅಥ฿ ಅ೧ბർರඝ (2ಎ) ಉಪ-ಪ ಕರಣದย  ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ 
ಅವඌಳಡ ಅ೧ბ ಸย ರൽದ౪ ฉ, කಶಪലโದಃౙ  ಅಥ฿ ಅโ ෨ಂ ಬಳಃಯย ದ౪ ಂಥ 
౩ ൟಡ ತฆโದಃౙ  ಞค෴ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  ಅದ౽ౙ ಜ ലದ ๅಚ ಗಳඝ౬  ේಉർಯ 
౾ಗึಂൿ ಅಂಥ ವ ౾౨ ಂದ ಗ ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ : 

(3) ಪคವತბච ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  ೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  
เಫಲತัತ౨ ං ಅಥ฿ ಅൿ ವბಜඛಕ ಉಪದ ವವඝ౬ ಂഖ ഴ๋ಥർ౪ ಜං ಅಥ฿ 
ಅൿ ವბಜඛಕคಡ ತ౽ค෴ಜಲ  ಅಥ฿ (4)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ เඌಸಬർඈಥ 
ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ඩยಸฤ ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಅಸಮಥბකಜർ౪ ච ಅಥ฿ ಇಷౣ ಪഴൟ౨ ಲ ๅಂಬ 
౽ರಣದ෬ว ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನರඝ ಪคವತචಡ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ඛฃಕคಸಬൿ. 

(3ಎ) xxx  
(3) xxx  
(4) ಆฌೕಗ , ರಃ౹  ಮൡ౨  ಕಯბಗಳඝ౬  ౽ඩഴโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಮൡ౨  ಕಟౣ ಡದ 

ඛๆಶನಗึಂൿ ಬಳವ ේ෦ಡ ීඌඈ ಅౣ ೕ ಅಲ , ඛๆಶನಗಳ ಅಳ, ವ ವ౩  
ಮൡ౨  ඛๆಶನಗัಡ ಪ ๆಶ ಇโ ಅඌෟೕಗർರರ ಆฌೕಗ ಃౙ  ಮൡ౨  ಕಯბಃౙ  
ಸคຄಂൽಆำ ತ౨ ๅ/ ಸคຄಂൽಃ෴ಜๅ ಅಥ฿ ಆ ಸ౩ ಳಃౙ  ಕ౨ ฿ಜๅ ಮൡ౨  ಪಟౣ ಣ ಮൡ౨  
ಛ ಂತರದ ೕಜචಡ ಅಥ฿ ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳ ಕഖౣ เಃಡ ීಧಪಟౣ  ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛನ 
ಉಪීಧಗಳඝ౬  ಉಲ ಂಫൟ౨ ಲ ๅಂ්ದඝ౬  ಖತಪലಆำ ವ ಸฤ฿ಜ ಪคವತბච ಬಡಡ 
ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳඝ౬  เඌಸಬൿ. 

(5) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ(2)ರ ෬ฉಡ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಸย ർಗ, ಅ೧ბ ತฤඪದ ൽකಂಕൽಂದ 
කฤౙ  ൟಂಗಳ ಅವඌಳಛಜ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ತನ౬  ൟೕბನವඝ౬  ಅ೧ბർರඛಡ 
ൟัಸฤ ತඪ౭ ದย , ಄ัಆಂಡ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ೪ฆ ಡมಜංಂൿ 
ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(6) ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ෴โඃ เ๏ಷౣ  ದಭბದย  ಅನ ൭ ඛඃბ๏ದ ຄರൡ, 
(2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ෴โඃ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಅದඝ౬  ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಸย ದ ຄರൡ 
ನ  ಡತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ . 

(6ಎ) ದ౾౹ ಣ ಕನ౬ ಡ ೧วಯย , ಆಡಞ ೧ว ಯย  ಟ ෭ฆ ೧ว ಯ ಆ ึ ೕಛಲ 
൞ล౾ನย  ಉർಯದ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽದ 
෴โඃ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ේಉർಯ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1981 ೦คಡ ීದ 
ൽකಂಕಃౙ  ෨ಂ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಪคವൟბದ౪ ฉ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳದ౪ ฉ, ಅದರย ನ 
෴โඃ ಕಟౣ ಡಃౙ  (මฏ ຆ ಅಲ ದ) ຄಂൽಆಂലฆವ ේ෦ಯ ೯ಡ ಬಳದ ಆ 
ේ෦ಯย  ಅಂಥ ಕಟౣ ಡದ ඛბಣದ ಪ ඃಶโ ෩ฆಪഖౣ  ෦ೕರൽದ౪ ฉ, ಅಂಥ 
ൽකಂಕൽಂದ ಪค൏ಮ౽ค෴ಞ๋, ಂತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಬಳโದಃౙ  
ಅඝಮൟಸมಜංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(7) ಉർಯ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽฆವ ෴โඃ 
ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಯಃౙ  ීඌದ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ (2)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 
ಅඝಮൟ ಆഔౣ ฆ฿ಗ ಅಥ฿ ಸದค ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪฏൡಕಗಳ ෬ฉಡ ಪคವൟბದ౪ ฉ 
ಅಥ฿ (5)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅಥ฿ (6ಎ) ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ಅඝಮൟ ඛೕಡมಜංಂൿ 
ූเฆ฿ಗ, ഷත ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑඝ, ಈ ಬಡ  ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ ರಸಬർඈಥ 
ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ೩ม චಯඝ౬  ർಯ ಡฤ ಅಗತ ಪലಸಬൿ. ಆ ತฆ฿ಯ 
83ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (2)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ຄರൡ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯ ෬ว ෴โඃ 
ಉർಯವඝ౬  เඌಸತಕౙ ದ౪ ಲ . 

(8) ಅಛคಃ ಅไൽ౫ ಡ, ๖ౘಕ ౩ ಗัಡ, ත೦ ಸ౩ ಳಗัಡ, ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ 
ಅඝ෮ೕൽದ ಠಹ ඛბಣ ೕಜචಛಜ ಅಥ฿ ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ൧ೕಟಛคಃಯ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಂ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಪคವൟბโದ౽ౙ ಜ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬ ,ಅಛค౽ ಅไൽ౫ ಡ, 
๖ౘಕ  ಗัಡ, ත೦ ಸ౩ ಳಗัಡ, ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ ಅඝ෮ೕൽದ ಠಹ ඛბಣ 
ೕಜචಗัಛಜ ಅಥ฿ ದූბඝರ ൧ೕಟಛคಃಯ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಕකბಟಕ ේ 
උರൕಗಳ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1961 (1962ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 10) ರ 109ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ 



11 

 
ಂ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಖคೕൽโದ౽ౙ ಜ ඛೕലದ ಅඝಮൟ ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ 
ඈಡವඝ౬  ർಯ ഴโದಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ  ೪ฆ ಡมಜං ಎಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

เವರൕ.- ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ, “ಅඌෟೕಗർರ” ಎಂ්ൿ ෩ಲಢർರ 
ಅಥ฿ ಌ ಢർರ ಎಂ්ದඝ౬  ಒಳತำ ತ౨ ං. 

(9)  ಉർಯ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಂ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽದ ේ෦ಯ ෴ช 
ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಕකბಟಕ ಕฤ ඬല ഴเಃ ඛತ ಣ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2011 (2012ರ 
ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 8)ರ ෬ฉಡ ಉಪ ಖඛಜಗಳ ಗಛคಃಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಕฤ ඬല 
ഴเಃ ಚഖವഔಃಗಳඝ౬  ඛൟ ವ ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಅඝರ฿ಜ ಉಪಖඛಜಗಳ 
ಗಛคಃಯඝ౬   ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലರย ಅಥ฿ ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലಸൽರย, ಅಂಥ ಗಛคಃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ෴โඃ ූಗವඝ౬  ಪคವൟბಸฤ ಇ ದย , ಅಂಥ 
ේ෦ಯ ಪคವತბචಛಜ ಅನ౷ ಯ฿ಞವ ඈಡඅಂൽಡ ഷත ഔ ಕ෦ೕಷನರඛಡ ಅ೧ბ 
ಸย ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಅಂಥ ಅ೧ბಯඝ౬  ಸย ದ ෬ว ಸದค ಅඌඛಯಮಗಳ ෬ฉಡ ಞൟ౨ ಡ, ษಸඨ౺  
ಃಲಸಗัಛಜ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ಪഷโದಃౙ  ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯ ಪคವತბචಛಜ 
ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ඛೕಡมಜංಂൿ ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(10) ಉർಯ ඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ෴โඃ ಂ ේ෦ಯ ಅಥ฿ ಂ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ຄಂൽದ ෴โඃ ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಅಂಥ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ಅದರ ූಗವඝ౬ , 
ಸ౽ბರದ ಆඃಶ ಒ : ಇಎඨ 21 เಎ 2014 ൽකಂಕ:22.05.2014ರย  2014-21ರ ಕකბಟಕ 
ರಶ౾౨  ඛೕൟ ಅඝರ฿ಜ ฃಜ โ ಮൡ౨  ಄ಂದ  ಸ౽ბರโ ಅඝ෮ೕൽฆವ ಮൡ౨  ಸౘಮ 
ඩ ඌ౽ರโ ಅඝ෮ೕൽದ ರಶ౾౨  ಉ൞౭ ದಕ ತ ವඝ౬  ౩ ඪವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ, 
ಬದย෴ಜ ಬಳಃ ಡฤ ಬಯದย , ಇದ౽ౙ ಜ ർಯ ಡ౽ದ ಪคವತბච ඈಡ 
ಮൡ౨  ෴โർದง ඹೕ೩ಗಳඝ౬  ඩವൟ ಡ౾ದ౪ ฉ, ಅಂಥ ಎม  ಇತರ ඹೕ೩ಗಳ 
ඩವൟಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ෴ವ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಅඝಮൟಯඝ౬  ೪ฆ ಡมಜංೕ ಆ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಅದඝ౬  ಬಳವವฉಟ, ಅඝಮൟ ೪ฃಜං ಎಂൿ 
ූเಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

X X           XX           XX 

96. ಯದ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅඝಮൟ ಇಲ ං ಇತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳโದಃౙ  
ඈಡ.- (1) ಉർಯದඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽದ ෴โඃ 
ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನರ ಅඝಮൟ ಇಲ ං ಅಥ฿ 85ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (5)ඡ 
ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย  ඛಯ෦ದ ಅವඌ ಆචತำ โದಃౙ  ෨ಂ, ಇತರ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ 
ಪคವൟბದฉ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳದฉ, ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ಅඌෟೕಗർರನඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಡ 
ಪคವತბච ലฆโದಃౙ  ಜ฿౪ ರකಜฆವ ವ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ಁಡว ಡ ಪคವൟბದ 
ේ෦ಂದ ຄರಡಬൿ ಮൡ౨  ಅದರ ෬ว ඛ෦ბದ ෴โඃ ಕಟౣ ಡವඝ౬  
ಅಥ฿ ಇತರ ඛბಣವඝ౬ , ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ಕ౨ ๅಂൿ ൞ඝ ූเ๋ಥ ยತ 
ඣೕഔೕ ಆಟౣ  ತฆ฿ಯใ ಡൿಕൽದ౪ ฉ, ಅൿ ෨ഖౣ ತೕยಡ ಅಥ฿ ಁಡว 
ಡൿಀเಃಡ ಞค෴ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . ಅඌෟೕಗർರඝ ಮൡ౨  ಪคವತბචಡ ಜ฿౪ ರකಜฆವ 
ವ ౾౨ , ಈ ಬಡ  ฃಜ  ಸ౽ბರโ ಡಬർದ ඛಯಮಗัತಳಪഖౣ  ಒಂൿ เರ 
งඩಡ ෦ೕರඈಥ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ඛඃბ๏ಸಬർඈಥ ඈಡ ౙಁ  
ಞค෴ಗತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(2) ಉർಯದඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽದ ෴โඃ 
ේ෦ಯඝ౬ , 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ലದ ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ เඌದ ಷರತ౨ ඝ౬  
ಉಲ ಂಫ ฉ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಪคವൟბದฉ, ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ಅಂಥ ಉಲ ಂಘචಡ 
ಜ฿౪ ರකಜฆವ ವ ౾౨ ಡ, ඣೕഔೕನย  เವคದ ಸಜಸ ಅವඌಳಛಜ ಆ 
ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅದರ ෩ಲ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಬಳಸಃಂൿ ಅಥ฿ ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ඩยಸಃಂൿ 
ඛඃბ๏ವ ඣೕഔೕ ಆಡಬൿ; ಮൡ౨  ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ಅದರ ෩ಲ ಉං౪ ೕಶಃౙ  ಬಳಸฤ 
ಧ ฿ಞ๋ ಅಥ฿ ಷರൡ౨ ಗಳඝ౬  ඩยಸฤ ಧ ฿ಞ๋ ෴โඃ ಕಟౣ ಡವඝ౬  
ಡൿಕฤ, ෴โඃ ಅಡತವඝ౬  ෨ಚ ฤ, ಅಥ฿ ಅಗತ ๅඛಸಬർದ ಇತರ 
ಕ ಮಗಳඝ౬  ಅಆಳ ฤ ಅಂಥ ඣೕഔೕನย  ಅಂಥ ವ ౾౨ ಯඝ౬  ಅಗತ ಪലಸಬൿ. ฃಜ  
ಸ౽ბರದ ಆඃಶಗัತಳഖౣ  ಅಂಥ ಉಲ ಂಘචಛಜ ಒಂൿ เರ งඩಗัಡ ෦ೕರඈಥ 



12 

 
ඈಡವඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂಥ ಉಲ ಂಘච ෨ಂൿವคವ ಪ ൟಂൿ ൽನಃౙ  ಇಪ౭ ౨ ೖൿ 
งඩಗัಡ ෦ೕರඈಥ ಮತ౨ ౣ  ඈಡವඝ౬  ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ เඌಸಬൿ. 

(3) ಉಪಪ ಕರಣ (2)ರ ෬ฉಡ ෴ವ ವ ౾౨ ಡ ඣೕഔೕ ೦ค ಆಜංೕಆ ෴ชವ ౾౨  
ඣೕഔೕನย  ຂัฆವ ಅವඌಳಛಜ ಆ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ 
ಆඃ๏ದ ಕ ಮಗಳඝ౬  ಡൿಆಳ ฤ ತඪ౭ ದฉ ഷඬ ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฆ ಏർ౪ ಜ ಅಂಥ ಕ ಮಗಳඝ౬  
ಡൿಆಳ  ಬൿ ಅಥ฿ ಕ ಮ ಡൿಆำ ๋ ಡಬൿ ಮൡ౨  ಡ ഴ฿ಗ 
ತಞยದ ෴โඃ ಖೋბ ේಉർಯದ ౾ಯඝ౬  ವฤ ഴವ คೕൟಯย  ಅಂಥ 
ವ ౾౨ ಂದ ಅൿ ವยೕಯ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(4)  ಈ ಪ ಕರಣದย  ಏඡ ಒಳತಂലದ౪ ง, ಉർಯದඛಧბರൕ ಆಜฆವ ಅಥ฿ 
ಯದ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ຄಂൽದ ෴โඃ ේ෦ಯඝ౬  ഷත ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑನ ಅඝಮൟ 
ಇಲ ං ಅಥ฿ 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (5)ඡ ಉಪ ಪ ಕರಣದย  ತൡ౨ ಪലದ ಅವඌ 
ಆචತำ โದಃౙ  ෨ಂ ಅಥ฿ 95ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ෬ฉಡ ຄರലದ ಆඃಶವඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ 
เඌದ ಷರತ౨ ඝ౬  ಉಲ ಂಫ ಇತರ ෴โඃ ಉං౪ ೕಶ౽ౙ ಜ ಪคವൟბದฉ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳದ౪ ฉ, 
ഷත ഔ ಕ෦ಷನฑඝ, ತൡ౨ ಪലಸಬർඈಥ ඛಯಮಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ  ಮൡ౨  ಕಟౣ ಡಗಳ 
ඛბಣ ಅಥ฿ เಗำ ಟ ಃฉಗಳඝ౬  ඛ෦ბโದಃౙ  ීඌඈ ತ൞ౙ ಲದย  
೦คಯย ฆವ ෴โඃ ౽ඞඛಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ಮൡ౨  ತൡ౨ ಪലದ ඛීಧචಗัಡ ಮൡ౨  
ಷರൡ౨ ಗัಡ ಒಳಪഖౣ , ฉฉ ಪ ඃಶಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ฉฉ ಉಲ ಂಘචಗัಡ ಅಥ฿ ෴ವ 
ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಡ,ಪคವತბචಡ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳಃಯඝ౬  ಡมಜංೕ ಆ เเಧ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಡ 
ฉฉ෴ಜರಬർඈಥ ತൡ౨ ಪലದ ෮ತ౨ ವඝ౬  ർಯ ലದ ෬ว ಅಂಥ 
ಪൟವತბචಡ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳಃಡ เකൟ ಆಡಬൿ. 

X X           XX           XX 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

¸ÀPÁðj ªÀÄÄzÀæuÁ®AiÀÄ, ¸ÀÄªÀtð «PÁ À̧¸ËzsÀ, ¨É¼ÀUÁ«, ¦7, PÁ¸ÀÆ , ¥ÀæwUÀ¼ÀÄ 500, 19£ÉÃ r¸ÉA§gï, 2022 



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY  
FOURTEENTH SESSION 

THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE (SECOND AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022 
(LA Bill No. 30 of 2022) 

 

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964. 

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 
1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964), for the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy third year of 
the Republic of India, as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Land Revenue (Second Amendment) Act, 2022. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notification, appoint.  

2. Amendment of section 95.- In the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964, 
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in  
section 95,- 

(1) For sub section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(2) If any occupant of a land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture 
wishes to divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall 
submit an affidavit along with an application to the Deputy Commissioner in the 
manner as may be prescribed and if the diversion is sought,- 

(i)  In accordance with the use specified in the Master Plan duly published for 
the concerned land under the provisions of the Karnataka Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963), then the same 
shall be deemed to have been diverted subject to payment of prescribed fee 
under sub-section (7) and the Deputy Commissioner shall issue the order 
of approval accordingly within seven days from the date of receipt of the 
application: 

 Provided that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his decision and 
issue the order under this sub-section within fifteen days from the date of receipt of 
the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to have been 
granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall be certified and issued, 
after payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7), in the manner as may be 
prescribed. 

(ii) In case the Master Plan has not been published or the land is falling outside 
the local planning area, then the concerned authorities shall furnish their 
opinion within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the application. The 
Deputy Commissioner shall issue the approval for diversion for use as per 
the application, subject to the opinion furnished by the concerned 
authorities and subject to payment of the fee prescribed under sub-section 
(7): 



2 
 

 

Provided that, in case no opinion is furnished within the said period of fifteen 
days, it shall be deemed that the concerned authorities have no objection to the 
said diversion of land for use as per the application. 

Provided further that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his 
decision and issue the order under this sub-section within thirty days from the date 
of receipt of the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to 
have been granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall certified and 
issued in the manner as may be prescribed subject to payment of fee prescribed 
under sub-section (7). 

(iii)If any diversion is obtained with a false or wrong declaration or affidavit 
under this section, in addition to the criminal liabilities, the same shall be 
null and void upon order in this regard by the Deputy Commissioner. The 
conversion fee, if remitted, shall stand forfeited to the Government. The 
land whose diversion for non-agriculture use was obtained by a false 
affidavit, the Deputy Commissioner may also issue an order for forfeiture 
of the said land to the Government. 

(iv) In case a part of the survey number is sought to be diverted for non-
agriculture use then prior pre-conversion sketch, approved by the Survey 
Settlement and Land Records Department, identifying the metes and 
bounds for the part sought to be converted, shall be mandatorily filed 
along with application for diversion: 

Provided that, in case the Survey Settlement and Land Records department 
fails to approve or reject the pre-conversion sketch within fifteen days from the date 
of receipt of application for the sketch of the applicant, it shall be deemed to be 
approved as prepared by the applicant and the approval shall be issued in the 
manner as may be prescribed. 

(v) In case the applicant in his declaration or affidavit stated that the land 
sought to be diverted to non-agriculture use is a granted land then the 
Deputy Commissioner shall reject the application if the diversion 
contravenes any provisions of the Karnataka Scheduled Castes and 
Scheduled Tribes (Prohibition of Transfer of Certain Lands) Act, 1978 or 
the Karnataka Land Grants Rules, 1969 or any other terms and conditions 
of the grants issued by the Government from time to time. 

(vi) No order of diversion under this section shall by itself lead to increase in the 
guidance value of the diverted land as notified by the Department of 
Stamp and Registration unless the land is put to actual non-agricultural 
use as under provisions of the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act, 
1961  (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963): 

Provided that, in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time 
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks, 
an occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,- 

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of  
such land under section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 
(Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or 



3 
 

 

(b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 
1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962), may without obtaining the permission 
required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained 
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a 
prior notice to the Tahasildar in such form as may be prescribed and subject 
to payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7).” 

(2) sub-sections (3), (4), (5) and (6) shall be omitted. 

(3) For sub-section (7), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

“(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is 
permitted or is deemed to have been permitted under this section, to be used for 
any purpose other than agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such 
rules as may be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment 
of a fee as notified from time to time. No assessment shall be leviable on such land 
thereafter except under sub-section (2) of section 83.” 

3. Amendment of section 96.- In the Principal Act, in section 96,- 

(i) in sub-section (1),- 

(a) after the words “or used for any other purpose without the permission of 
the Deputy Commissioner” the words, figures and brackets“or in violation of any 
provisions of sub-section (2) of section 95 or based on false or wrong affidavit or 
declaration,” shall be inserted; and 

(b) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2),- 

(a) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted; and 

(b) for the words “twenty-five rupees” the words “two thousand five hundred 
rupees” shall be substituted. 

 



4 
 

 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

To give effect to the proposals made in the Budget Speech for the year 2021-

2022 and to simplify the land conversion process for the non-agricultural purpose, 

it is considered necessary further to amend the section 95 and 96 of the Karnataka 

Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964). 

Hence the Bill. 

 

 

 

 

 

 



5 
 

 

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

 
 

 There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.  

 

 
 

 



6 
 

 

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION 

Clause 2: 
Sub-section (2) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this 

clause,-  

(i) sub-section 2,- 

(a) empowers the State Government, to prescribe the manner 

regarding submission of application to the Deputy Commissioner 

for the non-agricultural purposes; 

(b) the proviso to clause (i) and second proviso to clause (ii) of sub-

section (2) empowers the State Government to prescribe the 

manner regarding deemed grant for diversion and same shall be 

certified and issued by the Deputy Commissioner; 

(c) the proviso to clause (iv) of sub-section (2) empowers the State 

Government to prescribe the manner regarding deemed approval 

for the sketch of the applicant and same shall be issued by the 

Survey Settlement and Land Records Department; 

(d) item (b) of the proviso to clause (vi) sub-section (2) empowers the 

State Government to make rules for sending a prior notice to the 

Tahsildar in such form; and 

(ii) sub-section (7) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this 

clause, empowers the State Government to make rules to 

prescribe the payment of fee for permission of non –agricultural 

purpose under sub-section (2). 

 

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character. 

 

R. ASHOKA 
Minister for Reveue 

 
 

 
M.K. VISHALAKSHI 

Secretary 
Karnataka Legislative Assembly 

 
 
 



7 
 

 

ANNEXURE 
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE ACT, 1964 

(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) 
 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
 

83. Manner of assessment, commutation of non-agricultural assessment and 
prohibition of use of land for certain purposes.—(1) Save as otherwise provided by or 
under this Act, the land revenue leviable on any land under this Act, shall be assessed or 
shall be deemed to have been assessed, with reference to the use of the land for the 
purpose of agriculture.  

(2) If any land held or used for any purpose other than agriculture be diverted or 
used for the purpose of agriculture, such land shall, notwithstanding that it was exempt 
from assessment or was assessed with reference to any purpose other than agriculture, be 
liable to the payment of land revenue at such rates and subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed in this behalf, as for land used for the purpose of agriculture.  

(3) Land revenue leviable on any land and assessed or deemed to be assessed under 
any enactment or law in force before the commencement of this Act, with reference to the 
use of that land,—  

(a) for purpose of dwelling houses;  

(b) for industrial or commercial purposes; or  

(c) for any other non-agricultural purpose, shall, notwithstanding anything 
contained in this Act, continue to be levied at such rate at which it was levied or was 
leviable as at the commencement of this Act, unless such assessment is commuted in 
accordance with the provisions of sub-section (4).  

(4) Where in respect of any land used for any purpose other than agriculture, 
assessment payable annually was leviable or has been levied by or under any enactment or 
law in force before the commencement of this Act, such assessment may, in accordance 
with such rules as may be prescribed, be commuted by payment to the State Government 
of an amount equal to five times the amount of such annual assessment, and on such 
commutation such land shall be exempt from such annual assessment.  

(5) The Tahsildar or a Survey Officer may, subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed in this behalf, prohibit the use for certain purposes of any land liable to the 
payment of land revenue and may summarily evict any holder or other person who uses or 
attempts to use the same for any such prohibited purpose. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 
95. Uses of agricultural land and the procedure for use of agricultural land for 

other purpose.—(1) Subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of 
buildings or construction of wells or tanks, an occupant of land assessed or held for the 
purpose of agriculture is entitled by himself, his servants, tenants, agents, or other legal 
representatives, to erect farm buildings, construct wells or tanks, or make any other 
improvements thereon for the better cultivation of the land or its more convenient use for 
the purpose aforesaid.  

Provided that the farm Building or farm House so erected shall not be more than ten 
percent of his holding subject to maximum of such extent of land as may be prescribed.  



8 
 

 

Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-section “Farm Buildings” or "Farm house" 
means a house attached to a farm and constructed in a portion of an agricultural land, 
used for the residence of the agriculturist or used for the purpose of keeping agricultural 
equipments and tethering cattle. The house shall be used by farmer for his own use and it 
shall not be let out for commercial activities to any individual or agency. 

 (2) If any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture wishes to 
divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall  notwithstanding 
anything contained in any law for the time being in force apply for permission to the 
Deputy Commissioner who may, subject to the provisions of this section and the rules 
made under this Act, refuse permission or grant it on such conditions as he may think fit.  

Provided that in case of any agricultural land assessed or held for the purpose of 
agriculture, falling within the Local Planning Area for which the Master Plan has been duly 
published under the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 
1963) and such land and such diversion is in accordance with the purpose of land use 
specified in such Master plan. The permission therefore shall be deemed to have been 
granted subject to payment of fine prescribed under sub-section (7). 

Provided further that in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time 
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks, an 
occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,— 

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of such land under 
section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or 

 (b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the said Act, may, without obtaining 
the permission required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained 
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a prior notice in 
that behalf, in the prescribed form to the Tahsildar and paying in the prescribed manner, 
the fine prescribed under sub-section (7). 

(2A) Where any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has 
diverted such land or part thereof to residential purpose without obtaining the permission 
of Deputy Commissioner under sub-section (2), prior to 31st day of December 2008 and 
desirous to get such diversion be regularised, shall, apply 8 [within the period of one year 
from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land Revenue (Amendment) Act, 2011  
in such form, alongwith such fee and penalty, as may be prescribed, to the Deputy 
Commissioner. On receipt of such application, the Deputy Commissioner may, 
notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, but subject to the provisions of any other 
law for the time being in force and subject to such conditions and in such manner as may 
be prescribed, on production of such evidence as he may require it to be necessary and 
after an enquiry, regularise or refuse to regularize except where such land,- 

(i) lies in the line of natural drains or course of valley;  
(ii) belongs to the State Government or an authority owned or controlled by the 

State Government or any local Authority;  
(iii) coming in the way of existing or proposed roads, inner or outer ring roads, 

national high ways, by pass over ring roads including those proposed for 
widening and railway lines, tram ways, mass rapid transit system projects, 
communications and other civic facilities or public utilities;  



9 
 

 

(iv) is a forest land;  
(v) belonging to another person over which the applicant has no title;  
(vi) (vi) is reserved for parks, play grounds, open places or for providing any civic 

amenities;  
(vii) or building is abutting to neighbouring property, storm water drains, tank bed 

areas, river course or beds and canals or below the high tension electric line;  
(viii) use is against height restrictions specified in zoning regulations for heritage 

monuments, aerodrums and Defense Regulations; 
(ix) not conforms to any clearance from high-tension lines or fire protection 

measures;  
(x) is in the area covered by the Coastal Zone Regulations of the Ministry 

Environment and Forest, Government of India;  
(xi) regularisation of violation in respect of change of land use shall be made as 

far as may be in accordance with section 14A of the Karnataka Town and 
Country Planning Act, 1961;  

(xii) or development in respect of any building having more than two floors shall be 
regularized unless,- 
(a) a certificate from a Structural Engineer is produced regarding the 
structural stability of such building;  
(b) a No Objection Certificate is obtained from the Fire Force Department.  
 

(xiii) or unauthorised development or construction made in agricultural zone of 
approved Master Plan or green belt area declared under Karnataka Land 
Revenue Act, 1964; and  

(xiv) is covered under any other prohibition as may be prescribed:  
 

(2AA) Burden of proving that the diversion or change of land use was made for 
residential purpose prior to 31st day of December 2008 shall lie on the applicant who seeks 
regularisation of such unauthorised diversion or change of land use.  

(2AAA) All such diversions or change of land use which are not regularised or where 
applicant does not apply within the time specified in sub-section (2A) shall be liable to be 
demolished or brought back to their earlier use and expenses incurred thereon shall be 
collected from such person as arrears of land revenue.  

(3) Permission to divert may be refused by the Deputy Commissioner on the ground 
that the diversion is likely to defeat the provisions of any law for the time being in force or 
that it is likely to cause a public nuisance or that it is not in the interests of the general 
public or that the occupant is unable or unwilling to comply with the conditions that may 
be imposed under subsection (4). 

(3A) xxx 

(3B) xxx 

 (4) Conditions may be imposed on diversion in order to secure the health, safety and 
convenience, and in the case of land which is to be used as building sites, in order to 
secure in addition that the dimensions, arrangement and accessibility of the sites are 
adequate for the health and convenience of occupiers or are suitable to the locality and do 
not contravene the provisions of any law relating to town and country planning or the 
erection of buildings.  



10 
 

 

(5) Where the Deputy Commissioner fails to inform the applicant of his decision on 
the application made under sub-section (2) within a period of four months, from the date of 
receipt of the application, the permission applied for shall be deemed to have been granted.  

(6) Unless the Deputy Commissioner shall, in any particular instance otherwise 
direct, no application under sub-section (2) shall be recognised unless it is made by the 
occupant.  

(6a) In Dakshina Kannada District, Kodagu District, and Kollegal Taluk of Mysore 
District where any land assessed or held for purposes of agriculture has been diverted or 
used for any other purposes, before the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land 
Revenue (Amendment) Act, 1981, the land so used together with the land appurtenant to 
any building (other than a farm house) therein, not exceeding three times the built area of 
such building, shall with effect from such date be deemed to have been permitted to be 
used for purposes other than agriculture.  

(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is permitted under 
sub-section (2) or is diverted under the provisos to the said sub-section or is deemed to 
have been permitted under sub-section (5) or sub-section (6a), to be used for any purpose 
unconnected with agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may 
be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment of a fine. No 
assessment shall be leviable on such land thereafter except under subsection (2) of section 
83. 

 (8) The permission for diversion of agricultural land for industrial development, 
educational institutions, Places of worship a Housing Project approved by the State 
Government, or for purpose of Horticulture under this section shall be deemed to have 
been granted when permission for purchase of agricultural land is accorded under section 
109 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962) for industrial 
development, educational institutions, Places of worship, a Housing Project approved by 
the State Government, or for purpose of Horticulture as the case may be subject to the 
payment of fine as may be prescribed. 

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, “occupant” includes a mulgeni tenant 
or a permanent tenant.  

(9) whenever any occupant of land assessed or held for purpose of agriculture wishes 
to divert such land or any part thereof for the purpose of quarrying of minor minerals, 
whether specified or non specified in accordance with the rules governing quarrying of 
minor minerals or stone crushing activity under the Karnataka regulation of stone crushers 
Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 8 of 2012), shall make an application along with the fine 
applicable to the Deputy Commissioner for diversion of such land. On such application, the 
permission for diversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted subject to 
obtaining lease or licence or working permission under the said enactments.  

(10) If any occupant of any agriculture land assessed or held for the purpose of 
agriculture wishes to divert such land or part thereof for the purpose of setting up of solar 
power generation in accordance with Karnataka Solar Policy 2014-21 issued in G.O EN 21 
VSC 2014 dated 22.05.2014 which has been approved by State and Central Government 
and which has been approved by the Competent Authority, the permission applied for 
conversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted for that purpose so long as 



11 
 

 

they use for purpose for which permission is granted subject to payment of the conversion 
fine and all such other fees payable if any, in this regard. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 

96. Penalty for using agricultural land for other purpose without permission.— 
(1) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture be diverted or used for any 
other purpose without the permission of the Deputy Commissioner, or before the expiry of 
the period prescribed in sub-section (5) of section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may 
summarily evict the occupant and the person responsible for the diversion from the land so 
diverted and any building or other construction erected thereon shall also, if not removed 
after such written notice as the Deputy Commissioner may deem reasonable, be liable to 
forfeiture or to summary removal. The occupant and the person responsible for the 
diversion shall also be liable to pay, such penalty not exceeding one thousand rupees as 
the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to the rules made by the State Government in this 
behalf, direct.  

(2) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted for 
any other purpose in contravention of an order passed or of a condition imposed under 
section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may serve a notice on the person responsible for 
such contravention directing him, within a reasonable period to be stated in the notice, to 
use the land for its original purpose or to observe the condition; and such notice may 
require such person to remove any structure, to fill up any excavation or to take such other 
steps as may be required in order that the land may be used for its original purpose, or 
that the condition may be satisfied. Subject to the orders of the State Government, the 
Deputy Commissioner may also impose on such person a penalty not exceeding one 
thousand rupees for such contravention and a further penalty not exceeding twenty-five 
rupees for each day during which such contravention continues.  

(3) If any person served with a notice under sub-section (2) fails within the period 
stated in the notice to take steps ordered by the Deputy Commissioner under that 
subsection, the Deputy Commissioner may himself take such steps or cause them to be 
taken; and any cost incurred in so doing shall be recoverable from such person in the same 
manner as an arrear of land revenue.  

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, when any land assessed or 
held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted or used for any other purpose without 
the permission of the Deputy Commissioner or before the expiry of the period prescribed in 
sub-section (5) of section 95 or in contravention of an order passed or of a condition 
imposed under section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may be 
prescribed and subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of buildings 
or construction of wells and tanks, and subject to prescribed terms and conditions, 
compound such diversion or use, on payment of the prescribed amount, which may be 
different for different areas or for different contraventions or for different purposes for 
which the diversion or use is made. 

XXX   XXX   XXX 

 
 

 
 

Govt. Press, Suvarna Vikasa Soudha, Belgavi, 19th Dec, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500 


