saa"aécsﬁe ANTY
wamqﬁe ©PC3T

FooFEdT 230 FOWOOD (ATRBRC 3T RB) AG3CoDF, 2022
(20223 QOTRLECR FPeCHT 50935—30)

TOOFET PR TOWIOD RN, 196430, NI R, STNWE 0B 20T
QATRODT.

Q). YI,EN0T FORBIWRE B LINLTON FooeddT 230 FOWIOD IR0,
196430, (196408 TREEIT 9PN 12) eDJ R, STZE 2300T82e)T3) ONT 200 NTBI)TWOOTT;

QR T3 NPTILT R,B0,TC WRE W), FOOEET Dot cIGPOSNOBODOT &3
FORT03 9D ONN 3TN~

1. F0FH, BRIV DIB), TYTVO0YW.- (1) B PIODRNEI, FOEET 3o TOWIOD
(NVBIE 3T BB) 9RO, 2022 0T FBONIT,T,.

(2) BT Dosg ATOE Tz LIDARWIO eDRDT NI EWERLTITIVTOT DT0TLIOT)
220N B3T3,

2. B389 950 3T BR.- TRor€dT 2300 TOTWIOD IR0, 19643 (19643 T édT
ORIV 12) (YD), BYJ0,N0T DR e9PICDTOTY  ue3LDREIN)  95:3€
RT3, -

(1) GUBITTD (2)3 VTN B8 ZDODITN, I)33RCBRIT,T),, DOTT:-

" (2) FOWIONT DGFE T e3NTNET L9009 LA ODNT ST LTT,N BRODTIES 23400

9P PENTIOT] WOT PROD, P BT OPYTE  LIaned), ONeHe ¥3T
NBL3TO,N WTBDFE) Y3 AWT, 33T BCeRWIBIDITOT DCIONE), 2,003 IDTOIE®
PR3N 2259 PNTOONR 920NV, B RIT,T), eI, -

(i) TOVEET WEXED NI, MYRIPOIT ABRHS LIPAODD, 1961 (19638 TREEIT
9PN 11)T  NBWORFPNY B3R BOWOTHEY, 230NN FOWOFHE).  ONTad0N
TTEIRRT DR, DY), ADFRBBAT WFIN 9NAT00N  0T0BORNTY,
FROWT 31 NVTETyTT (7)8 BONE). DONNREIRNT HNO,T D3N WwPBED,, I,
WBOONADINE DO PIARITLLD, a0I), WVEOD A LFHIOD DIJOTDOT O
ASJNERPNN 9TT,S0ATIN L9NRRIT 3T T30, BRTRAIT,I),;:

WC03I), VY PNTOAN ©BEOD A LT3N DI0TROW N DINLRFMN IJ,
QAREONTD, B D), 8 GURVETTRE 3T STHTDD,  30BEN PO
ROWPERE). 2379 DTV PR WFT WHEIRITHBMON  eIWALTBIONT, LRI, TOT
LIVIRITLT, NI, NVTETTED (7)T RBODNE). DONNREIRVT BT FOWIONT 3Tz
AONNRWTBITICIOT DESCNE). eI, TyeII0eBLTORITL), 203D, BRTRRIIZEI),,.



(i) TVRLO® B, ByTEIRDTE BOTLEER), 90 230003 B PO O3Ua¢2s 0
BRCST BRI WRWD), FOWOFREY, DYRTOTNY) 9BE0DNT), A LTOAIT DTO0TDOT
BOIE) DINLRFMON Fad, 9D TYONT, A IIFLR,. 23 PHTOOON NVBRT3e (7) T
9RO, AONNILRT ANE,T AOWIONT, 2WwFRBED,, FOWOFRE, TYRTITNYY I AT
DFTYONT, WwFBED,, IVEOD VAT PR WPT WHBU0RHBMON LI IONT),
INNaICEAANE

RT03), DYRTITNY) ATD BOIJE) DINLRFT A0e)TE 9ITYOD A ATV
ROBPERS), OVENDAIT ATO 280 WPT WBORHBR AOWOFPRE, DYRITOTNLOT
O30T €37 LB YTIYDDEIOT 290eIRIT,TI),:

203, BTOI, LY PTOVAN, LHBEOD A LTHI30N DIJVOTDOT 2RI, DINERFN
S R, 33, 3ePOFNTRTT, ALBEN DI, BTTETID, BRTBID) AFOVE FOTLFETS),
2 PTOAN PR WFT WHBURHBMNON 9T RLEIONT), DCBRTB0RD 4I0edRIT,T3),
D), OBTTTL  (7)T OROND).,  AONNRERT DO, ROWONTF,  WwFTED,
AODNRWTBITITIOT DESCNE). eI, TyeII0eBLTORITL, 203D, BRTRRIIZRI),,.

(i) 88 TJTTPW LROD), Y, B0 IF), PALRHB =PRI NPT €90
eINTBOIET B RIS NPT O 30 WHEEORH w0RTRORTT 2339 DTOD O
BT TVRBMOFTCD BRIN S8 WRNS ABO 3T, CWRLBRA 3TEDRIT,),.
BRI DO, NHVIWCR ROWIOD [RREBT BT, ATET TPWSC a3ED )
TOBBRLIT,E),. AP, IDTNEF A AW DROT O30S BRI FOWOTFTE).
FHAONIT VFTMN DTRRHW  BBODOINEBO3LE 29 DTODONET) €3 2300,
RTOETT, 3NEN L) T B TR, TT,N ST 370T3WT/ITI).

(iv) ReE SOWT’S 20T WNeS), FHRONIT WFTMON WEBREIH 00T TEBITOI
FROTW ROWEFRE), WBERHW TROW PN N MTIIINTI, M3 PR RS,
TOTROD 23523R, 203, B3R WODSNEF YLRBO) LINTBIDAT @O IEN0 wPRE JT, (Pre
Conversion Sketch) €930, 2350383 €923 03R0NT ) AITHT) FT,00NTIT,T3,.:

VB0, PR RN, TOWIOD &533A, NI, 3R WoDSNE YIRBON) €92ETWITI
SE N 928 ) AT DIV0TDOT BRIEY DINLRPMN BDRIF 0 IJRTE 3700,
OV REDID) JPOWOET BT STF,0AT FOWPERS), 9REFWOTI AT BRATO3I
9T, SINWPLRDRIINTONOT) VAT TEY, a0I), DONNRWIBIWVTOT D3N
2930 RLTICNR, B3T3,

(V) ©9BFC 33, POCRD T2 LINTEIIEFTD).  BRAIODTY, T AONE3T
WPTMNON DTEIIONAD) TRDTEE 230000 eD0%RTY &30S ¢3eedd (Granted Land)
e3NBODOT ATRDAIRTS),, WTBEIVTBOIN TR EIT IR I 3NY eI, NALL 3
WIWBTENNY (T PRINY &MIEWBOD IERCES) L9RODED, 1978 €930 ToEET 3o
DOBRTIIOD  AODEDNE), 1969 9FPde RIETe) TJoDTOOT, BRTBAIGT 3P
DOWPTIING OVHTE DWOEING &NI), ROINP, MVOIFIZTE o PTDON
90 IR EON, 3TR,DAIT),.



(Vi) B8 FTTEOT e9IBORNAS WTWBEIRTHBOR 3T, FooEEIT BEJLL0 aDIY, NI 033
ABRwS  ORACHD, 1961 (19638 Fee&dT ORI 11)3  OBVOFNP D 30303
230NN, WOR,eIT TAONEIT WFIMONG, BATIY, eTIYOT 203, SECOTIED YISO
ORNBRBAITWOZ  WBEIVTHBOAIE BRI eneReY  B3ohe), I 0D0 BB LT,
TN I T, LD...

BB0D), B T,B BBSONA), FEBAY Q0D 00 4Ie) 9GP0 FONY
DOEERT, FOWORATOI3 3T, DONE) B3 O30T FOSRIN 20 FTEI, -

() TOEET B0 AIWITCBNY 9IDNOD, 1961 (19628 T 3T 9D 10) T
480 TVYTTLITW BONE). A, IO T  ZIONMOO), 23RO 9P RENTIOT TN
SROTIVOANZIOTI €TI0 ROV TT, BRBNOTNOE a353,; 9T

() TOEET 3R RIWITCBNY 9RO, 1961 (19628 T 3T 9RDOND 10)3
773¢ ByTTEOT BN, TDO0WRTOS TTWTI a353,030,

- B3 PORIYTOOT ORODNE). INZ 00T IRNTNIONTY, BBODTW aNI), ITWTE).
IBTIOTT), D QT NONN, 3BT TOT SCeNRWTBITIVEOT SeNRION). TS
SRR TATW 330D NI), NRIyFTTD (7)3 9RONE). DONNRCTVT HDO,T
ROWRODT, WFIE), 0T BRed) BT BT JNedsdy, O V3T B L3T,N
WTDONRWIIT."

(2) VBT TTED (3), (4), (5) 3DIY, (6), WENDBITR,.

(3) QVTTTED (7)3 TN 8 20T TRN, B33 CRRIT,),, DOTT:-

"(7) TOWOOD AGFETTH 3NV 95300 WRAIONT NTWLBT,N BRODTIES O30T
BRI, WEAO3T 00T T L3T,N WFAL) 9NN T3, Bdevent 9300 &3
FTyTTRTW BN VNS ALBINWONOTD ZI0e)ATION BT PTIDON) &8 N, T
RTETed) BWRVIBIWOTOT AORNINPNR 2 PeTEd),, TOOTOOT, LIPRPWATOT H©,a3:30,
RO BN LINI;TERWTIT. €3 3Bz 833 TTTT (2)€ NWTYTTEITT 20T
BRTIB) EIOT 23000 a3 O0HY T TOTWRONR, LDPRAIT,TB.L,."

3. ®300 968 3T BR.- 3300 LIRNIOINRDTAS 963 TTTLTS),, -

(i) QVBFFTd (1)3C), -

() "BR)5€3 TeAIRIST 9020 AN R" D02 BWNY 33023003 “e95Te0 53¢ T3
(2)3€ VBT TTEITI O0)e3C YVFWWOGNF T, PV 0N EITEID AP, LITe00 IR),, LINT3eIEF®
RRCRFBORNV,FOA" D02 VWML, LI0BTIF) a0 I, L33TLINTP N, ACDAIT,T),; 203,

(2)) "20T3) AT TN 02 BVWNYF WBEON “2.0T) OF CoTICNNLR" 2020
BBNP,, 3B REBRIT,E,.

(i) GVTVTTTeD (2)3¢C) -

() "200TD AT BTN 02 BWNF BN 2,003 OF TRTIONNPT"
R0 BBNFI, T)3ASRCRAIT,,,; a3,

() "YR,3,4030 CRWIONNPR" D00 JWNY WHBN "R AReITT 0T3S T
BRTANNPR" 02 JIENPR, 33A3RERIIT,),.



VT LINPH H3), ToONnY BCPTF

2021-20223 SRET 300350 I0REITE), 30RET TR, SINP R, 22001 ITe D3I,
FHAONIT B L3To, PR BWOBIEION, ACPRAPRIPTT,N TOEET 230 TOWIOD
DA, 1964 (196438 TOoEEIT e9DIOND 12)3 953¢ 03D, 96:3¢ FTT0a33), D3R,
3T BER T0TIIHT €9e3T5TS0T) RWONEBAIINGS.

33 D0T B8 APONT.



SDFT 2, IS R,

F0e)3 ToRTOI,T Taead) OIeIT B3, 3323,5370, 2 FRPORTITIDE)..



R)30;03,0C2 3 TOAN BTN T0E D) 0, IS X3

VOB 2

3B RCBID) B LAATIE 953 ITTW VBRT3D (2)T S8
DOTTI L9BONE) -

() 283 VR BTE) -

() TyAO33 T L3T,N BD)s€3 TIXRIST N 9RECDRD, B RIS
LRIV TV DONNRE) Vo ATOE T, LIPTOTe33), LRI,

() (23 NTRTTIT ()X DOWEW W30IDT I, (i) OB
NVBIC  TCOITey) PR WFT  WBURBHBNMNN  9SDWTe),
QLR TOR) DRI TLE), aNI), TR, BR)std TeIICRST
THRETOANT aNI), BRTERAIE PIITW DOVI) DODNAD) T
AT CT, DTV, DCWIZTI.

(R) (2)3€ VTTTTEIT (iv)SE DOTWT BWT0ZITed) LIRE RV 37 O,
9V PEDAITI)TON  I0IRIYT) 2D, BT, B 0B,
TOWOOR  &W5a3A, NI, PRWIDSBNY Y30 BRTBAIT,
LRIV TV DONNRE) Vo ATOE BT, LIPTOTe3), ITBI3T.

(Bd) 2% NTJIRTTEIT (V) DOWE JTOINTEH () 2W020ey) 90T
SNRIONE). 3BACIRTON TPIE SRCEFERTY, FPHERIHTT,N
QONDINP ), CBARD) Tosy ATOE BB, 9PTOTa3x), LIS T.

(i) TySA3PERI) T LAATIE 95:3¢ FFTLT (7). VRRTT0e))
(2)3¢ NDTTJYFTTRT 9RBOND). 23R eAONT, WCAONE3T T L3T0,N
IR 3N TT, DODEINF I, TR Toss AT BT, LIDTOTaI30,
ABI3 .

TARe)3 TOAS BWRPTOTE 53)F0503/0¢2I0) 2008T O X BT NG.

30f. w3RCE
OO0 N0E,

N0.3. QTR
BOONFTEF
BIOF 3T WO




WO
FooF&F 230 FOOD 9DAODHD, 19643
(19640 300 ¢33 eaDA0DD o835 12)endd 43 23on

XX XX XX

83. TOTOD AAFODT D3, 23A0HE3T FOWIOIHTW BORIFN D3, FOF)
B LBNOMON 2300 WFFODRI, AREDTITHTI).- (1) T3 ORI sDRDT 9530
93T BN 9350 SVBVWORATIR) WINPT, &3 9IRAODENT &3 O30eH T 23000030
278, LRAIMIE BRTOTWION,, WERIONT NTWLBT,N €3 2300030 WFFTOIMIE) T30,
NeNAA APEDRITE, 9IT00 DFEDRIDNTONOT LI0e)RITED,.

) WAODTOE B3IT o) B L3To,N BRODTVE ©Fde  DFPATI
O350zYTE  BRACDT), WCAIONT NT 3TN WBORIFTRORT TP WPART, OTF,
FOWOONT, DVY,; DRRB IR OGN WAIODTDE V3T PR VT L3T,N
FOWONT, IFEDATTR, AT NNBL3T,N WPATOT PeeDOD WA,
QO NRWIBITOTOT WONE 383N aNIY, 90T DODEINPLTR 2w F@BED,, €8 23000 07,
ZBRTOTVONIIY,; AOTWIO 20T IT,T3),..

(3) O350e) T 230D, -
(X)) VAT DING YT L3, N;
()  TDT 0 00T AV LINPMON; L9300
Q) 930 Oz IAONEIT B LIT,N

- WPRIYHTT, IOWORPA, 88 IRIONN) BYT0LeOMIITF, :3RTE 20D0N) T3,
03505 )TE IRDONENT 9P TSRS 031 €3 8RO a3 LRI 203,
ABEDRAIT 95350 AFEDRIDNTONOT) 40T PRTOTWIORNITY,, T8 LIRDONTNTE). S
BB 0P, (4)3 QUBETTEIE QVBWWOBNPNNTOT N IOT TOWION) BRI 3N,
BRTID, T3 L9IPIONNE) BYT0IeINIE FoOTWE). 03503 WITW &yTOT PRAINIRL €90
LRAWBTONZLRL T FTyToT LIPRITHT) 20RO ONIT,TI),,.

4) W3AOONTD.E YI3T O30T NTWLIT,N WFAT 00T 23001 F0WORA,
B RIODTN) DYTOLINMITYTT, HRTE DN TS O350)TE IR IONTNT €930
TOSRIN  TNRDOT PR IYNY  SNXT WORAE TN FOWIOD 200833 TONTE
BRTOTONERD, IPRWVIBITON3RL 95300 IPRINTABRE 0T PRTOTIONEII,,
AODNRWBIDOTOT  DODTDINPLNRNAITdN  90F  WOAFT  FOWIONE  RBRWONS
OWOR,T, AT  RRVONI), OToxy ARCTITF, AROWION RWWBWIRTT  aDRDOT
BVORWIEAWBIE) NI, WOF BOBIEIONOT S 0T PRI 90T ONET
BRTOWIONDOT )TICNS YBIT,T),.

(5) 3BICV T IO [PCBED IPTIVOR), T WNH, DCNeNRWIBICIVTOT
QAODTINYLRRFEBED,, BRTOWIONT, BRTBOIIINTIE O30T 2300 WFTONT), TO)
NBLINPMON  &)300PNAWIBIT) aNI), WOT OPHT &3O B LITo,N LTI,
WP 90 PR ON3,A)e3 003K oI PTIN, 95300 V3T &358,003), RO,
TN SDROT BRTTWRTILIIT.

XX XX XX
95. 23¢TOODNTW PRNOD WFFAY) TDHI), WeRoHT Pedodhsd, |¥3d
B LFT,N VYT WNANS dPod.- (1) TEBAYI, TEIE OO0 2RINTI,

e9T3200 TONPR, DedERIET 07T, 339,0T¢C) DONE) BIad O3I0)TE FTOSRIN 2.PTTEN,,
TOWOONT  APETWOIE 900  CAODT VT L3To,N  BRODTIE 230000
e923RCNTTR, €3 BRAICNRY, VI eNWINTONMIEY W 9T anfed TBELT



N LITO,N €3 BRIIONT), B, LINTAOTTN WPT 300328 T,N, To3E DITIN
HOTO TEBAPID, TELE), W) 0 IJONPID, QeddERD, X3 0ot
RPOVBRTT), e300T3EN 9T I3, FPFTD0TI, NPT, DB 0LDOT 9530 93T
FTOSBPNANE BJSIPNPOTW HTB0 TEBAPID, TR, 2W0ed ©FPoe FONFI,
QeNEATRL,) 95300 23T 00T AIPOTBNRP ), a0 RE) BB, NTITS.

VB03), LBRNIN DONNRWTIWOEOT NOR, DALLRET, wPBED,, T TET
HOT0 TE,RBe) 9IG0 HPOTO TOA* €333 oTWIRYOD FTW 333,08 3¢50, N3IT,.L)..

)TV B.- S8 BRI TTRT QB LSBTo,N "HoT0 FEIB" 9500 "$T0 TPA*" DOT3,
3388 SRIMN WFAT 9T Tyd BVOTONTI, VWIW VB LIT,N WPAIT DI,
2203020 BINFR), TEI,TOTO) WFAT 26N BRODTRORTIZ €I T 230000
2,033 INTBE). DedIFRAIT DI aDI), BB DIOD, G333, 8,03 NTOSRENT,N
WFRITZE), TN WD), O30e)TE 2358303 €900 DBD,0D w0eds L3E3a3e3BNPR
ABIT, L.

(2) TOWIRDNTW AFETW 3N BT AONT NP LITo,N  BRODTT
2800 O303¢ 9RPPENTIVT) 0T 23U0edI0NT), 9T 9T OVHTE N33,
03¢ BIT B L3T,N WRDFL YR ATT, 3T,0R), DDA TS O30T
FORBRITE), DI WwFRPRODBTW VR 93 ITNIMN BR)sE3 TeDRSOREIREONT,
2D R3T,R,. BR)5E3 TeDRSTB) 8 FTTRT SVTWOFNPNR aNI), B8 e9PIONTDT ¢T3
FRRT AONTINPT 2P0, L9IFIN3ON, DTITORIICI) EIG OINTEI0T) T3
e33/0€23 R0 WOI,NPNR 2w FBED,, LT, TRTIWIBITI).

BVT0IB), TR NTLIT,N DTS e0RT IFWe BRODT OPRITK FHhed
B8RO FOFET BEJLLD aNI), NYSw03T OB IPAODD, 19613 (19633
FooFEdT PRI 11) RODE). WRAD® T €93, OMNTweN &yTEIRNTI
220D ABUatZe TWTBBRFT AT, eI, LOT 2300 aNIY, 90T WORBIE IO 9HOT
BRALT® DY), DDEFRBRAT PR WFTAD N LSBT, e90A0T0oNE, &yTTETE),
9T, (7)€ ORBIJTTRT  OBONE), DODNFCRT IO, D0 IR T T,
2 FBE,, 9N IONTY, ACBEIRNTONOT) 230dRIT,TI),.

D3R, BT0I), B0 T, B3 0D, FELRBNY Daoreod, e9GFW 2W0INP,
9P TONYIY, DedERPTRT, AOWORATOI 339,0TC). 200N a3 O30e) T3
TOSPIN  WwPTEL), MR, (@OWD) PR, 3DPR)) WD WNMIONT®  23/0edd
DLW RENTTI, -

(®) FOEET 300 RIPOTTO LIDNODD, 1961 (19628 T T L9RDCN 10) T
4800 TYTTW TR 90T 300D  9IDLIRINTIOTIOW) [BEOTBEIOIINTT €900
RBREOTIBOTIN2ITOT 2358, €90 DT.T; eITFe00

() ATO RIRNDT 773 TJTTRT a0 OT 300D, BBE 353,
SlaTnlnle}

BB VB-TYTTEIT a0 INZ;BRAT 9B 30N, BWONT aDIY, eITWTE), LIC
WERPORT TP, IBVACCRIINT ANDI 9BF JFePRIONS), €3 207, e30023300NONE
SEET, TPIAT IB0a0003 a0I), NIT-TyTTD (7)3 3R ANDBBAIT TOWIS),,
ANRI3 DEICHE), FOTIOD PR 303 O30T V3T N £3T,N 0T 3ROV,
9530 CITT LIINeS), BOWIE S 20T LTITI.

(2d) TOWIONTW DPETHW 3N €900 LAIONT  NTWLBT,N BRODTI
2300 O 9RDWRENTTI, 20083 BAOWT®, 3180, a0, (2)€ YUT-TyTTEITS
3R BR)5€3 TAIRITS 9302308 BBONT 90T 23000, €T30 EITT 20N ad3d,
DOAT NBL3T,N WBDRIREE). NI, HOF WHREIRBHBONT), AFEINRPRIY)TT,
923, AT, FOEET 23,0 FOWIOD (8T FBE) €D, 2011 25007 20T DTOOTDOT
2,030 WRETW 9BDRABRPMON RRI)DBRIWIITOTEOT 9IBE FeNRION), ), TN
BOBIABRODN BFR5E3 TARST AN 9RE A IIFTWY,. IOT 930N, A LTOAITI



03 BR)s€3 TeDRST'R, BB 9PINDTEA), NI W FNRPROBTTP, SBT3 339,0T),
ZDODA) D WP 93T TOSRIT  ORBWOFPNPNR  wFRBED, 03I,
RRIBRIWTBIOEOT RPN wFTE, ToNe 90T DCIONE) , 93T FTI0T) IO
eIMB;BRRWTIWOTOT AT 53030, POBTITRAT &3XS Tane J2FTHBOD 332300
STOIARAVCINMOWNE

(i) FANET WwPWBTOR L9TeI0 TN BDIN a3INE B, BT T;

(i) Doy RTOETT, LGN LW U0 ATOETEW 95800 Ot X PLOD
DYRPTOTT WwBITF,LIT00 DONO0I R3S ) PTTT, ACOTI;

(ii)FYR,3 9T TR BANPNR, wPFNS 90 BRVNS [IE® TANPH,
ToQ,,L0 B ONPR, eNOETTeoT,N FRODATINKRR ADTOIZ TJAINI HWIED
ORANY Bmoa NER DI, GS, SSNnPR, €39,0a3NnPR, R A0 3T @33
RBRHINDT, ROJTENPR D), V3T MoNOT APOZNPNR B0 A LIT
RPTODENDT €98, LI PVOEY 203 3.3;

(iv) €98€05 BReIIONT T,

(v) 2B, BB ALDT, L9VETITIN 9T ate3 BB, BCRTT;

(Vi) 90T BReAODRD, SVTDV;REINED, e3E3TT 3 TWOSNYY, eNT, &SN
9300 O30T APTORNE NP, 2wBNAE) CADES,T T,

(Vi) T FIE B €97,8T,B307,81 DTNFOD A3 BOTITBLRLMIES
WOOBNPNR, T3 HD JXINPR, SO @eIT, 9T SO BOBR DI, ToIRNYNR
BRODTROLT B 953500 By-E3:3,0° eIT3053° eNET TFT VT S;

(viii) PCOT/OT A ITINPTN, eSS D LNPT TONR ALY DWOPINYNH
F0WORNATO3 WO DWOFINTS), ADERBRAIT DWOFPINYS), 33 YOIRL
BTBLFT O DDERLBBAT QWEOFNPN LTI e00N WFF e3900303.3.3;

(ix) By-BI D AT FONMPR 9Taoe &N, TaDT  FNPRTRE,TI
O350 T eIV L9IIMIEIN YT T,

(X) 2003 ATEOEW VOAT DI, VD5 aNOTYOONT TORY  SDOOD
QOFIN P TE3,Boe3 flaeinlSlnle - QWFOVW kTS 3305003
RTRIRRPAWIBIT) BT ATEINRRPI) DTTOR LI,

Xi) PR WFTONC), DW[HBIT AOWORDAITWOIZ  e3NTT BV OFIIODTI,
AO5OTRY,, a3} Tooe€dT wE3,e0 3D, MYe03T B LRI, 19613
140 WyTTEF, L9INAT 0N, &30

(xii) DT DBJ/RNPNOI B, BRNPI, BRODTIW O TE,BT,
ROWORNATOI €92)53,8, ToONE &, Ty WROLT 3,-

() 07 FTE,RBE BBIODH RT3 21, TEE BOLILODT AOT o300
3330, BOTITIVEBATIN;

()  ©ON,TINT YURBANOT STLHHB YO, [eednss BBRTRORET
- AR RPRIT,I,,.

(xii) €900 TOREFET PR TOWIOD SR, 19648 3R FCRAAT
ONVREDI  WARD® D9, 050DV 9P BAT) RBE3, WODTA), IPTYI
9283y, €9T3299 eIREED s BRI T; 03I,

xiv) TRRIBRBIWBITITOF 30T BIT IRFT, wPRE,TBI,
- QFO0m  WRREW 3TN ATINRPIWIIE) OFW0  ATRINRRAP A
QUTORWIICI.

(2e) 20088 L3R0WT® 31T, N0 DORW NP LITo,N RVRIES €930
BRWFTONE), WIEIVWT e300REIDNZ 0 TIIOIDBWRAIE BRTBOI, €905 9IRT,3
VOWIEIONT, 9T BRWFTONE). 0BT WBELIRBON, ATINRRPRIHTT,N
TR BETITI 33 TITED,.



10

RARD) NV, WOF BVORIINFID, OFW0 LWRWVFTOD WBTBO),
AFRDNRPLADTION T IBEFWIT  (2d)  NB-IYFTTHRD), ODER BRI
9RBABRPN e A ATDT T, VoSBBRRDTT, LT 939 :0W WPFTOND 0T
2317 3RPYTT, MIDOINSTR), anI), 9TT,N RETW RWBNAPI, BRTOIOD
WINPT0 90T 353.AN0T FONRIT,TIY,:

(B) BOB3FIRN IT,ORE). WD OHRE SOBVOPNEYIY,
LBONRRPRIZE €9ITTe00 T ARREBIT GV TI)e3e3:39,0630 2003 OFW NG 95300
€93 ARWEWTON S03TDOINE), e9ITe0 (4)3€ VT TTTEAT 3TN PR LTBITOTOT
RTINAPT, DR e9DNBRENTIOTRD IRNFEVONTORN €90 YR FTIY, ) g302)
FTOTLATNCS BeR)5€3 TeAIRITR BDRIIN 9302030V, DTIFTORWTBIT.

(3e) xxx

(32)) xxx

(4) e38CMs, AITF, NI, APTONENP), TOPDWIWIRTWT,N NI, TEBT
QXISNFORD WFRIE BRI ROWORAIWOZ R L 9O, JXIING ©9P3, [se3A,
D), AIINPR  ToXT e PPN CT  e3CelNRT, aDI), APTONET,
ROBRODTRF), 323/ ROBRODTOIONS CITI0 €3 A FT, RTINS a0, 333,60 03I,
NYeiR03TT ARBRtHIN 9580 FELBNY TI,eITNR BOWOFHIE, O30T TSRS
NBWORPNFI), GV ODRISETOWIT, NWBIBVRATRP,E ADWN BDRIEI AN
RVOINF S, LDDRWTIT.

(5) VBTTTED(2)T NETR 9BEODN, I AN, 92BEORN) 3LNAT DIV0OTROT
Do, 0N 9[RABRPMN BR)sE3 TeRST) I, BCeRETRTTY, €923 O3 IN
VTN  ID,RFD, FTLTROB OJNDIODT,  DOBRTY 00BN OHOT
IADINENIC TR AN

(6) BR)sE3 BFRTTY O0IHTE DR, AFOWRERE), IT5T0 DTLEDAT BRTIY,
(2)3€ VTWTYTTEITI NN O3Y T L9REONTY,, LI, IR REMTIITT) BE) AT BRTID
O BB I T,

(6d) TB,£0 T3, B R30DNE),, FRTWNY 30N, TN a393RRTY 23303 FRLLMOO
FORIID), TOWIONTW FETHW SN 9Fwo  FOODT B LST,N  BRODT
O30e) T ZBRIONRD, FUIEET LBRTOWIOD (ST EBE) 9O, 1981 DN 00T
DVV0TT, a002F Y33 O30T VB LINPMN BWORIFATBT 9T WPRIRT, BT
R TELBT, (POCO0 TP 9N E) BRODTRORTE BRNOD BRI WFAT 3
BRIV, OF TFELRBE QS RTT) DRIBE, ABDT3, ©OT
DV0TDOW  BOWDTDOIMR0Z, FHAONIT B L3NPMN WFRIYTT,
930N IRIVNTON 0T IR IT,T),..

(7) OO APET e3NT0ET 95300 2AONT N LTT,N BRODTIE O350 T3C
LBReNONTD, 2AODT, ROWORPATW ORI T L3To,N (2)3¢ VT FTyTTEITS 20BN
930D BTRES TN 9B AWD T TJyFTVLIE RTOINFING N3N B0 IEATWT3
953209 (5)3C T TTTEITS €T30 (6ed) YV RyTTIT aCTTT €9:302308 ILTBEIDNTZOOT
200edAB00N, BRP5E3 TAIRSTR, B8 DN, Toty ATETey) UTWRWWIBITOTOT
QAORTINRDT 2w PBE,, IR0, OO eVVTBEN LINBTWEIAWIITI). €3 332300
8330 TJTTRTW ()X VR FByTTET BN BRTI) 90T 30D 303 O T3¢
FOTIONTR, APRIT,TL)..

8) FMOOF RN, FFRT RORNPR, TPKo ASNER, OTos <TOFTay
9NWRERAT My®D De0eed A3RCEBINON I S8 TTEIT 0B 3¢ MDTAD
NBLITO,N FHA LBReIOND, TR IERIR)TT,N 930NN, TyMeDTo 923N,
3,3RT ROA NPN, TPEo IFNPN, Tots ATETY) IRECDAT TydD De3I0eed
ARBRCBINPMIN 9 AOWLIEINART  3RCEMDTOD NP L3T,N Tooreds B
RIPOTWNY 9RO, 1961 (19628 TIEEIT 9RO 10) T 1093 T3 03N



11

FHAA LPReODRD, DDDRIYTT,N AR 90N I0N03ANE RI),BWERAR WO
BOBI, FOTWIOR &VTBIEYTF, 2o F &), e00TR T e3IVTBLIINGS DOT LIVIRITLTI),.

DRVW.- T IYTOOE NELSTo,N, "eIDBRENRTT” 0WIT)  DROTICEITTOT
973539 V0RO NEEITIOT DOLITIR), WP, T3.

(9) TOTPOD DGFETW SNBSS 9ITe00 Ty ST LTT,N BRODT 2300003 O3
9P PNTOCI TOFERT TR 3083edT  DONO0Fjed L9IPACDD, 2011 (20123
TOOEEIT DA, 8)3 BB B DABNY NRBMEDFTONTY, 9FI0 TR
BRRBINT  WENWEITAPD, DON0YRIE ANDALT  9NATeooN  SVBDIXNY
NBMEDTONTY, DDE R FBRATS) 9200 DDE BLIRANTES), 90T NEMDT VT L3T0,N
907 BRODT), 90 W3 A30HTE oM, RORIERD) B3 AR, €903
B8RO BDVRIEIMON 9T 0DMIE BOBRBRODT BT 583 TeIXRITIN 9236
B AZTD,, 90T LREONTY; A AT CE3 AW LIPIODTINE NCTR ™18, 3aS
FORNLTON 9NN, BVEBRANR)TT, WFBED, WOT PRI DRI INaN
29308030, BN OADOTI) PV RIT,T30,,.

(10) TOTWIOH APETW BSNTISOVHTE Ty 23000 T30 Tyd VT L3T,N
BRODTW ORI HRPRPRNTOTID OT  BRODD, WFX BT PaNeddy,
ATOETT 3T B0Bs: BAD® 21 AR 2014 DT00F:22.05.20143), 2014-213 FOoe&T
APTTY, A3 9DATN Tasad) a0, TCOL) ATOE Ty LIVRLDATIE eI, AT
DYRDTOTY) ONVRDAT  APTIY, NIT,BT ODOZSD, AR QT L3T,N,
WRAOIN WFT 0B WONAIRE), YTTY,N OO 300BLETOE BORIES [OTW
NI, OO WOTCR  DCINPI), TS BRI BT, WOT 9, V3T WING
D0IN WFPTEY,;, Ol B LITO,N I[N I3ONI, eNOWRT) BN O3LE €3
NBL3TO,N ODWRINTITI LT, WFRIBVNR, 93NN eNORTING DOTI
230edRIT,T),..

X X XX XX

96. 23¢TOONT PR AODX), 9D 3 YO 93T B LITo,N WYRJFHTF,
BOR.- (1) FTOTIRWAIFETW e3NT 9T e LEFIONT NTWL3To,N BRODT O30 Te
BRANODI),; BR)sES TeDRST 9N VYO 9T 8583 RTTLW  (5)3C
NBVTTTRRE).  DONNAIT  I9BPHON)  FRAINRR)TT, =00, Y33 N L3T,N
BVOVIFATT 9T WPART, BR)sES TR R ANTITIN, =0I), TN
RVORIES  DRVRTWT, 20020 C0oNE  3s30NT), TPBS Tl BORIEAT
LBReDANOT BRTBRTWOTIR) a0I), BT &BNRS DeEFAT O0HT  TE3, TS,
€900 Y30 ADIVERTY,, BR)sE3 TeBRTT) ARTISOTW) IO 90edAR0T OD3I
SeEXRY BT, 3TIWO0NTR IRTITITIWT, 9T a0E,NRRODR 90 TRTE3
3REYTOBITR THDOIINITE,. LODWRINTIITI 03I, WOBIEIN 26200239, C00N30eS
WsBO), BB WNR, Tty ATETeY) VBWIILNE DODEINPRRFITED, WOTD AT
BRTIONT  DCWOT BE)s€3  TedIRTT)  AWCFIRWTIDOTOT  BOBTR,
DN 3T,30,.

(2) FOTIRITIFETH SNTIES 900 WRAIONT AT £FTo,N BRODT 00e)TE
BRODRD,, 953¢ TJTTRT BN BRET  e3TTRT, 90 LIRNAT RO,
UOONA I3 BL3To,N BVOVIFATT, BR)st3 TR  IOT SO OFIIN
200V BVINTE BN, SeCEEAT).  dWORATW  ANOHBA  9RBPASRPMON o3
BRI, OTWT 2R T L3T,N WFRILTOR) 90 RTINS, DD R LIETOT
ATEEDRIT SURCEICRY BRTIVTITY; 303), B3ROV, LIWT NP W LSBT, IR
AOP500MIB03 9T RTIINPT, WO AG5e00Me03 O30T TE,TTS,
3RTNT/ITO), ORI ONRZDI),  30W,E), 9T INI5SIAWIIWE V3T
FIONPT, FBRBLD 0T SCEFATE), 90T [BsZ0N), CINIsBRAWIBIT). Toss
RNTOE VT STINPLRAFED,, OT G OFIMON 20T AOedT CREIOINPT IICTWOT



12

TOBE, aNI), LOT GUOFION) VOTNOAINEG &8P ROTD DIT, BT,3, 4030
BRTONNPR AETTOT NI R, BOBR, BeD)sES TeARST) LIPRWTBIT.

(3) QVBTyTTD (2)3 ETN O3 23581 SREEICED 220D SNTBO3Ces O3HaTBe3s3,030
SeEATD). BEPTE  9TDABRYMIN €3 RBIJYFTTRT 3R BR)se3 TARST
e3T3DAT FeRNF Y, INTTRET,E) 3,3 BR)s3 TeRTTY WM 90T FadNF 3,
BRTNTRY, VBV 9P Tjadd INTNTR P03 TNBWIBIT 203), TN e0EIN
3T C0YTE WINE PRTOWIONT 2OFONTY, AR a330TWI3 DEIORNS O3E €903
B3 ANOT 9T WRRDCODWONTIT,T),..

4) B8 JyFTHRC). DI WPNRPRORT T, FTOWIONWIPETH 3NTVS 9ITTa00
WeAONT B LIT,N BRODT O30T 2300, BewPsEd TeRST’S IS
QOR OFWo 953 JyFTLW  (5)X OB RyTOLRE), NRIVBRAT 93O
BRAIRRPLE)TT, 00T 95300 95 &TTEES BN BPTRAT STTTI), 9G00
LRAT RVIZ), PQONA B3T OP0RYT NP LST,N FDRBIFAWT 95300 WFATT,
BRPsE TRISTRD, NPIBRAWTIORTOT DODRINLR 2wFRE), NI, TEBNY
QEOEED €TI0 WoeINY) TONR FONPRY, DedEATHTRT, FOWORAIT03 339,0TC).
220DONA BT ABIVHTE FTOSRIN 2w PIE, 3DI), NRIVLBRAT DWOFPINLT NI,
ROBNNRDR 2 PBED,, 233233 BWIBNPR 95300 233233 QL OFINYT 9T O30
NBLINDR,BORIEIN 9T WPTONI), 00BN A3E €3 dedF SR L3NPR
233233 0NTOTINWOT NRIBBPAT BRI, AOWIAD RE ted 05
BVIBIEIN €900 WPTT D000 TRTIWIBIT.

XX XX XX

TFFO BOTFHOOO, MW LFTVIROG, B9, L7, TAR , BAN 500, 193¢ BFowT®, 2022



3

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE (SECOND AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022
(LA Bill No. 30 of 2022)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Land Revenue Act,
1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964), for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy third year of
the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Land Revenue (Second Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 95.- In the Karnataka Land Revenue Act, 1964,
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in
section 95,-

(1) For sub section (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) If any occupant of a land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture
wishes to divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall
submit an affidavit along with an application to the Deputy Commissioner in the
manner as may be prescribed and if the diversion is sought,-

(i) In accordance with the use specified in the Master Plan duly published for
the concerned land under the provisions of the Karnataka Town and
Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963), then the same
shall be deemed to have been diverted subject to payment of prescribed fee
under sub-section (7) and the Deputy Commissioner shall issue the order
of approval accordingly within seven days from the date of receipt of the
application:

Provided that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his decision and
issue the order under this sub-section within fifteen days from the date of receipt of
the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to have been
granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall be certified and issued,
after payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7), in the manner as may be
prescribed.

(ii) In case the Master Plan has not been published or the land is falling outside
the local planning area, then the concerned authorities shall furnish their
opinion within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the application. The
Deputy Commissioner shall issue the approval for diversion for use as per
the application, subject to the opinion furnished by the concerned

authorities and subject to payment of the fee prescribed under sub-section
(7):



2

Provided that, in case no opinion is furnished within the said period of fifteen
days, it shall be deemed that the concerned authorities have no objection to the
said diversion of land for use as per the application.

Provided further that, in case the Deputy Commissioner fails to give his
decision and issue the order under this sub-section within thirty days from the date
of receipt of the application, the approval for diversion for use shall be deemed to
have been granted by the Deputy Commissioner and the same shall certified and
issued in the manner as may be prescribed subject to payment of fee prescribed
under sub-section (7).

(iii)Iif any diversion is obtained with a false or wrong declaration or affidavit
under this section, in addition to the criminal liabilities, the same shall be
null and void upon order in this regard by the Deputy Commissioner. The
conversion fee, if remitted, shall stand forfeited to the Government. The
land whose diversion for non-agriculture use was obtained by a false
affidavit, the Deputy Commissioner may also issue an order for forfeiture
of the said land to the Government.

(iv)iIn case a part of the survey number is sought to be diverted for non-
agriculture use then prior pre-conversion sketch, approved by the Survey
Settlement and Land Records Department, identifying the metes and
bounds for the part sought to be converted, shall be mandatorily filed
along with application for diversion:

Provided that, in case the Survey Settlement and Land Records department
fails to approve or reject the pre-conversion sketch within fifteen days from the date
of receipt of application for the sketch of the applicant, it shall be deemed to be
approved as prepared by the applicant and the approval shall be issued in the
manner as may be prescribed.

(v) In case the applicant in his declaration or affidavit stated that the land
sought to be diverted to non-agriculture use is a granted land then the
Deputy Commissioner shall reject the application if the diversion
contravenes any provisions of the Karnataka Scheduled Castes and
Scheduled Tribes (Prohibition of Transfer of Certain Lands) Act, 1978 or
the Karnataka Land Grants Rules, 1969 or any other terms and conditions
of the grants issued by the Government from time to time.

(vi)No order of diversion under this section shall by itself lead to increase in the
guidance value of the diverted land as notified by the Department of
Stamp and Registration unless the land is put to actual non-agricultural
use as under provisions of the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act,
1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of 1963):

Provided that, in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks,
an occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,-

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of
such land under section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961
(Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or



3

(b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act,
1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962), may without obtaining the permission
required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a
prior notice to the Tahasildar in such form as may be prescribed and subject
to payment of fee prescribed under sub-section (7).”

(2) sub-sections (3), (4), (5) and (6) shall be omitted.
(3) For sub-section (7), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is
permitted or is deemed to have been permitted under this section, to be used for
any purpose other than agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such
rules as may be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment
of a fee as notified from time to time. No assessment shall be leviable on such land
thereafter except under sub-section (2) of section 83.”

3. Amendment of section 96.- In the Principal Act, in section 96,-
(i) in sub-section (1),-

(a) after the words “or used for any other purpose without the permission of
the Deputy Commissioner” the words, figures and brackets“or in violation of any
provisions of sub-section (2) of section 95 or based on false or wrong affidavit or
declaration,” shall be inserted; and

(b) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2),-

(a) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted; and

(b) for the words “twenty-five rupees” the words “two thousand five hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.



4
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

To give effect to the proposals made in the Budget Speech for the year 2021-
2022 and to simplify the land conversion process for the non-agricultural purpose,
it is considered necessary further to amend the section 95 and 96 of the Karnataka

Land Revenue Act, 1964 (Karnataka Act 12 of 1964).

Hence the Bill.



5
FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.



6

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 2:

(i)
()

(b)

(d)

(i)

Sub-section (2) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this

clause,-

sub-section 2,-

empowers the State Government, to prescribe the manner
regarding submission of application to the Deputy Commissioner

for the non-agricultural purposes;

the proviso to clause (i) and second proviso to clause (ii) of sub-
section (2) empowers the State Government to prescribe the
manner regarding deemed grant for diversion and same shall be

certified and issued by the Deputy Commissioner;

the proviso to clause (iv) of sub-section (2) empowers the State
Government to prescribe the manner regarding deemed approval
for the sketch of the applicant and same shall be issued by the

Survey Settlement and Land Records Department;

item (b) of the proviso to clause (vi) sub-section (2) empowers the
State Government to make rules for sending a prior notice to the

Tahsildar in such form; and

sub-section (7) of section 95 sought to be substituted under this
clause, empowers the State Government to make rules to
prescribe the payment of fee for permission of non —agricultural

purpose under sub-section (2).

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character.

R. ASHOKA
Minister for Reveue

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




7

ANNEXURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA LAND REVENUE ACT, 1964
(Karnataka Act 12 of 1964)

XXX XXX XXX

83. Manner of assessment, commutation of non-agricultural assessment and
prohibition of use of land for certain purposes.—(1) Save as otherwise provided by or
under this Act, the land revenue leviable on any land under this Act, shall be assessed or
shall be deemed to have been assessed, with reference to the use of the land for the
purpose of agriculture.

(2) If any land held or used for any purpose other than agriculture be diverted or
used for the purpose of agriculture, such land shall, notwithstanding that it was exempt
from assessment or was assessed with reference to any purpose other than agriculture, be
liable to the payment of land revenue at such rates and subject to such rules as may be
prescribed in this behalf, as for land used for the purpose of agriculture.

(3) Land revenue leviable on any land and assessed or deemed to be assessed under
any enactment or law in force before the commencement of this Act, with reference to the
use of that land,—

(a) for purpose of dwelling houses;
(b) for industrial or commercial purposes; or

() for any other non-agricultural purpose, shall, notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, continue to be levied at such rate at which it was levied or was
leviable as at the commencement of this Act, unless such assessment is commuted in
accordance with the provisions of sub-section (4).

(4) Where in respect of any land used for any purpose other than agriculture,
assessment payable annually was leviable or has been levied by or under any enactment or
law in force before the commencement of this Act, such assessment may, in accordance
with such rules as may be prescribed, be commuted by payment to the State Government
of an amount equal to five times the amount of such annual assessment, and on such
commutation such land shall be exempt from such annual assessment.

(5) The Tahsildar or a Survey Officer may, subject to such rules as may be
prescribed in this behalf, prohibit the use for certain purposes of any land liable to the
payment of land revenue and may summarily evict any holder or other person who uses or
attempts to use the same for any such prohibited purpose.

XXX XXX XXX

95. Uses of agricultural land and the procedure for use of agricultural land for
other purpose.—(1) Subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of
buildings or construction of wells or tanks, an occupant of land assessed or held for the
purpose of agriculture is entitled by himself, his servants, tenants, agents, or other legal
representatives, to erect farm buildings, construct wells or tanks, or make any other
improvements thereon for the better cultivation of the land or its more convenient use for
the purpose aforesaid.

Provided that the farm Building or farm House so erected shall not be more than ten
percent of his holding subject to maximum of such extent of land as may be prescribed.



8

Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-section “Farm Buildings” or "Farm house"
means a house attached to a farm and constructed in a portion of an agricultural land,
used for the residence of the agriculturist or used for the purpose of keeping agricultural
equipments and tethering cattle. The house shall be used by farmer for his own use and it
shall not be let out for commercial activities to any individual or agency.

(2) If any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture wishes to
divert such land or any part thereof to any other purpose, he shall notwithstanding
anything contained in any law for the time being in force apply for permission to the
Deputy Commissioner who may, subject to the provisions of this section and the rules
made under this Act, refuse permission or grant it on such conditions as he may think fit.

Provided that in case of any agricultural land assessed or held for the purpose of
agriculture, falling within the Local Planning Area for which the Master Plan has been duly
published under the Karnataka Town and Country Planning Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 11 of
1963) and such land and such diversion is in accordance with the purpose of land use
specified in such Master plan. The permission therefore shall be deemed to have been
granted subject to payment of fine prescribed under sub-section (7).

Provided further that in Dakshina Kannada District, subject to any law for the time
being in force regarding erection of buildings or the construction of wells or tanks, an
occupant of dry (punja) land, wet land or garden land who is not,—

(a) a person registered or liable to be registered as an occupant of such land under
section 48A of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962); or

(b) a grantee of such land under section 77 of the said Act, may, without obtaining
the permission required under this sub-section and notwithstanding anything contained
therein, divert such land or part thereof to any other purpose after sending a prior notice in
that behalf, in the prescribed form to the Tahsildar and paying in the prescribed manner,
the fine prescribed under sub-section (7).

(2A) Where any occupant of land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has
diverted such land or part thereof to residential purpose without obtaining the permission
of Deputy Commissioner under sub-section (2), prior to 31st day of December 2008 and
desirous to get such diversion be regularised, shall, apply 8 [within the period of one year
from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land Revenue (Amendment) Act, 2011
in such form, alongwith such fee and penalty, as may be prescribed, to the Deputy
Commissioner. On receipt of such application, the Deputy Commissioner may,
notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, but subject to the provisions of any other
law for the time being in force and subject to such conditions and in such manner as may
be prescribed, on production of such evidence as he may require it to be necessary and
after an enquiry, regularise or refuse to regularize except where such land,-

(i) lies in the line of natural drains or course of valley;

(ii) belongs to the State Government or an authority owned or controlled by the
State Government or any local Authority;

(iiij coming in the way of existing or proposed roads, inner or outer ring roads,
national high ways, by pass over ring roads including those proposed for
widening and railway lines, tram ways, mass rapid transit system projects,
communications and other civic facilities or public utilities;



(iv) is a forest land;

(v) belonging to another person over which the applicant has no title;

(vi) (vi) is reserved for parks, play grounds, open places or for providing any civic
amenities;

(vii) or building is abutting to neighbouring property, storm water drains, tank bed
areas, river course or beds and canals or below the high tension electric line;

(viijjuse is against height restrictions specified in zoning regulations for heritage
monuments, aerodrums and Defense Regulations;

(ix) not conforms to any clearance from high-tension lines or fire protection
measures;

(x) is in the area covered by the Coastal Zone Regulations of the Ministry
Environment and Forest, Government of India;

(xi) regularisation of violation in respect of change of land use shall be made as
far as may be in accordance with section 14A of the Karnataka Town and
Country Planning Act, 1961;

(xii) or development in respect of any building having more than two floors shall be
regularized unless,-

(a) a certificate from a Structural Engineer is produced regarding the
structural stability of such building;
(b) a No Objection Certificate is obtained from the Fire Force Department.

(xiii) or unauthorised development or construction made in agricultural zone of
approved Master Plan or green belt area declared under Karnataka Land
Revenue Act, 1964; and

(xiv) is covered under any other prohibition as may be prescribed:

(2AA) Burden of proving that the diversion or change of land use was made for
residential purpose prior to 31st day of December 2008 shall lie on the applicant who seeks
regularisation of such unauthorised diversion or change of land use.

(2AAA) All such diversions or change of land use which are not regularised or where
applicant does not apply within the time specified in sub-section (2A) shall be liable to be
demolished or brought back to their earlier use and expenses incurred thereon shall be
collected from such person as arrears of land revenue.

(3) Permission to divert may be refused by the Deputy Commissioner on the ground
that the diversion is likely to defeat the provisions of any law for the time being in force or
that it is likely to cause a public nuisance or that it is not in the interests of the general
public or that the occupant is unable or unwilling to comply with the conditions that may
be imposed under subsection (4).

(3A) xxx
(3B) xxx

(4) Conditions may be imposed on diversion in order to secure the health, safety and
convenience, and in the case of land which is to be used as building sites, in order to
secure in addition that the dimensions, arrangement and accessibility of the sites are
adequate for the health and convenience of occupiers or are suitable to the locality and do
not contravene the provisions of any law relating to town and country planning or the
erection of buildings.



10

(5) Where the Deputy Commissioner fails to inform the applicant of his decision on
the application made under sub-section (2) within a period of four months, from the date of
receipt of the application, the permission applied for shall be deemed to have been granted.

(6) Unless the Deputy Commissioner shall, in any particular instance otherwise
direct, no application under sub-section (2) shall be recognised unless it is made by the
occupant.

(6a) In Dakshina Kannada District, Kodagu District, and Kollegal Taluk of Mysore
District where any land assessed or held for purposes of agriculture has been diverted or
used for any other purposes, before the date of commencement of the Karnataka Land
Revenue (Amendment) Act, 1981, the land so used together with the land appurtenant to
any building (other than a farm house) therein, not exceeding three times the built area of
such building, shall with effect from such date be deemed to have been permitted to be
used for purposes other than agriculture.

(7) When any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture is permitted under
sub-section (2) or is diverted under the provisos to the said sub-section or is deemed to
have been permitted under sub-section (5) or sub-section (6a), to be used for any purpose
unconnected with agriculture, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may
be made by the State Government in this behalf, require the payment of a fine. No
assessment shall be leviable on such land thereafter except under subsection (2) of section
83.

(8) The permission for diversion of agricultural land for industrial development,
educational institutions, Places of worship a Housing Project approved by the State
Government, or for purpose of Horticulture under this section shall be deemed to have
been granted when permission for purchase of agricultural land is accorded under section
109 of the Karnataka Land Reforms Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 10 of 1962) for industrial
development, educational institutions, Places of worship, a Housing Project approved by
the State Government, or for purpose of Horticulture as the case may be subject to the
payment of fine as may be prescribed.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, “occupant” includes a mulgeni tenant
or a permanent tenant.

(9) whenever any occupant of land assessed or held for purpose of agriculture wishes
to divert such land or any part thereof for the purpose of quarrying of minor minerals,
whether specified or non specified in accordance with the rules governing quarrying of
minor minerals or stone crushing activity under the Karnataka regulation of stone crushers
Act, 2011 (Karnataka Act 8 of 2012), shall make an application along with the fine
applicable to the Deputy Commissioner for diversion of such land. On such application, the
permission for diversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted subject to
obtaining lease or licence or working permission under the said enactments.

(10) If any occupant of any agriculture land assessed or held for the purpose of
agriculture wishes to divert such land or part thereof for the purpose of setting up of solar
power generation in accordance with Karnataka Solar Policy 2014-21 issued in G.O EN 21
VSC 2014 dated 22.05.2014 which has been approved by State and Central Government
and which has been approved by the Competent Authority, the permission applied for
conversion of such land shall be deemed to have been granted for that purpose so long as



11

they use for purpose for which permission is granted subject to payment of the conversion
fine and all such other fees payable if any, in this regard.

XXX XXX XXX

96. Penalty for using agricultural land for other purpose without permission.—
(1) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture be diverted or used for any
other purpose without the permission of the Deputy Commissioner, or before the expiry of
the period prescribed in sub-section (S) of section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may
summarily evict the occupant and the person responsible for the diversion from the land so
diverted and any building or other construction erected thereon shall also, if not removed
after such written notice as the Deputy Commissioner may deem reasonable, be liable to
forfeiture or to summary removal. The occupant and the person responsible for the
diversion shall also be liable to pay, such penalty not exceeding one thousand rupees as
the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to the rules made by the State Government in this
behalf, direct.

(2) If any land assessed or held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted for
any other purpose in contravention of an order passed or of a condition imposed under
section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may serve a notice on the person responsible for
such contravention directing him, within a reasonable period to be stated in the notice, to
use the land for its original purpose or to observe the condition; and such notice may
require such person to remove any structure, to fill up any excavation or to take such other
steps as may be required in order that the land may be used for its original purpose, or
that the condition may be satisfied. Subject to the orders of the State Government, the
Deputy Commissioner may also impose on such person a penalty not exceeding one
thousand rupees for such contravention and a further penalty not exceeding twenty-five
rupees for each day during which such contravention continues.

(3) If any person served with a notice under sub-section (2) fails within the period
stated in the notice to take steps ordered by the Deputy Commissioner under that
subsection, the Deputy Commissioner may himself take such steps or cause them to be
taken; and any cost incurred in so doing shall be recoverable from such person in the same
manner as an arrear of land revenue.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, when any land assessed or
held for the purpose of agriculture has been diverted or used for any other purpose without
the permission of the Deputy Commissioner or before the expiry of the period prescribed in
sub-section (5) of section 95 or in contravention of an order passed or of a condition
imposed under section 95, the Deputy Commissioner may, subject to such rules as may be
prescribed and subject to any law for the time being in force regarding erection of buildings
or construction of wells and tanks, and subject to prescribed terms and conditions,
compound such diversion or use, on payment of the prescribed amount, which may be
different for different areas or for different contraventions or for different purposes for
which the diversion or use is made.

XXX XXX XXX

Govt. Press, Suvarna Vikasa Soudha, Belgavi, 19t Dec, 2022, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



