7 "/ AT\

IRt QR X
samqﬁc AN T
308C WS

(T[T VTR e3R)

BTROFWT NPONDOROTWRT BOWLNLD, a%% IS DIy w%mf
(ETHT/R) Dgeods, 2015

(20158 Q08 BP0 QGeonT 505823 - 03)

FTOFUT DTITWOBOTRT BOWINRW, RS [eBINH ) a;éémﬁ VN,
1956 éé TR, STHRIR [TPBEO 2.0T QDTIONT.

2 9, JIOT  TOW WWB  WHEINOTON  FIFWE  QTOITOBOTHT
BOWENED, JFE WeTIND WD) PINY  ©PIOP, 19563, (19570 3ToF T
DRICNT 2) DT, SN IR TRWRT 0INFNTPHTOOT;

QW, T3 mm%w @dw:a"_opdée TRETY BToF s oo NPOIDOTBOROT B3
BNOOTOZ BRICNNTTONSZT):~

1 BogT FRD Iy TW/IoF.— (1) 38 VHICNTIZ, TIDFLT LTITIORBOTRT
ROWIN, DB [eSIND B 2,,332571%3 (SHTR) WO, 2015 DO ITODIT,

(2) o 3 ZRTSe O WITFR.

2. 3%¢ TFOHT SWPWTJR.~ TTVFUT QTITWOTBOTET FOWINL, AT H[eSTND
DR PN WHRICNT, 19568 (19570 3ToF 38 WRICNID 2) (VY ART]N0T 3RO
PRAORTHOD NFeDITRNT) 33¢ BFTLTY,—

(1) (HFe WTTTTRTY  “DRTI), TONT TRTRCRNAY” D00 IJITRER 0TI
TOWT TRTTDOWNS” Q0w wzsmfsaol ng “QTE ng TRTOONVNS” Q0
JINYR TR @3 BRITTOONVNY” 02 mmsmol @éo&@mxé@d%

(i) (2)Be WTTJFTRTY “TRTB TRT TRTVONNY” Q00 TITRER 0T
TOWT TRITVOWNS” Q0N mmﬂm& még “Q0 vg TRTOONVNE” Q02
JINYR TR eg BRTTOONVNY” 02 mmﬂm& @éo&@mxéﬁﬁd%

3. 43¢ JFOHTW SWHIR.~ FRY VHAONIT 43¢ JFTRTY,~

) DHBe WITFSRTY  “TOTL FIT THTOWNY” D0 IR
'DOWZ) AINT CHTVONNRF” D0 TJHINETW), TSO3REBITTTY; T
(ii) (2)3e YOTHFTCE, B3 TWNODTTR, TSCIRERIIF), HOTT:—

"(2) DS weln &S%ﬁ TRY[OOT  ALPTE  OTI  RRB I,
QTR ARF D TONR @wm& SZTTN f&%ﬁ@%@ B @ =IN



FeOTW BRCLIT TRIVTCR TONR JIRFIDHBMON  SONOR QITBY TONT
TRTOONNS ?,Sééﬁ 9TV 53%%5@?\535&5%"

4. 53¢ ISR SWJIR.—~ DRY LHRICNIT 53¢ TJFTT (2)Je LWBTTTRTY
"R IRT DBRT Q0L JTRYR w0 FPNT” D0 TJHNET, TS03ReBITTT;

5. 63¢ TFTW STIR.~ RO VHIOTT 63¢ TFTT (1)I¢ WTTJFTRT ()
RNTQY, "N IRT DJHT 20D TBASR oW DWIT”T 20 TTAEI,
BEO3ReBRIZT).

6. 83 TFONT IWIR- RO LRICNIDT 83 Tyorem  (2)Je
PNTTITERTY,—

L () RVIQ "9T TRTIOW" D0 JTRAPNR  “w0RHB), SRTION" 0
BINGD, BE3RCBITTIR

ii. (B) 2NIQ "0 TRT TRITVONNE" 00 TTNYR  "ATE FRT
SRTVONNF" D0 JINYI), BSC3RCRITITY.

iii. Reoote TTODITY W cIR)Te x@%ﬂcﬁ@ WITNEANT  JEOTY,
RTE  TONT  THRTVOWVNN" Q00 JIBNER  "'W0R  TORT DTN T
SRTCWND B WEPNTR,  LTBNWRYTE 09T, WDRRWE TONGY
BIS DB BRBFONMUT), WBNAT BRCIST TP AT POV
ROFATY LLOTHIRYLY TSOTE 0T AT TRIRCVAN" 20w THRII,
BEO3RBIIZ.

7. 1083¢ JFTHW STHT[R.~ FRY WHAONIT 103¢ JFTeTY, -

D) DI WIJETBRY 9B, TWDNT TRTONNAY” 20 IJTAYR
BB, LT CRTOONNY” D0 JTNID, TSERCBITITN.

(i) (2)3¢ WTJZFTRTY VW [T 2B/ DewT" R0 JHNYR 20
ARNT DT DOV JHINET), BSC3RCBITITY,

8. 10 TFTT STHNIR.— RO VHIONIT 100 TTTRTY,~

D) DI WIJETBRY 9B, AT TRTONNAY” 20 IJTAYR
'BOTZ) AT BRTVORNE” Q0L TWNYDZ), BSSRCRITIT.

(i) (2)Je WBTJFTRBY 9T, AT THTORNRY” POV IJHIAVR
'BOTZ) AT BRTWORNE” Q0L TWNYD), BSSLCRITIT.

9. 100 IFSHRT ITHIR- PRV LHINTT 109 IFSRTY, 9B TOIT
JRTOOVNY” D02  JBINDN 'JOTZ AT TRTPONNE”  DOW wdﬁ@ém%
TSC3ReBRBIT,

10. 1028 IBTeoW STHJ/R.— RO WHIORTT 1022 TFTeT (2)3e NBZFTRTY
"N JIRT 0B/ DedT™" D0  JWINPR "0 ToNT  DedTT Q0w mmfm&
@éo&meﬁxégd%



11. 1028 Z[3Seem SWMJIR.— DR BRINXT 108 TsoesQ, “9TL TowT
SRTORNAE” D0V JBNYR  "DRTZ D AT SRIPOWNATT Q00 TTIRED,
BEOSRCRIBZT),

12. 103 TFOHT SWDWIR.—- DRY  WRIORIT 108 TFOTY, “AT) TOWT
SRTOVAE” 0w TTMYR W[ LT TRTOWVNT Q0w TTREZY,
BEOSRCRIBZT,

13. 1000 J[FSHT SIR-  DRO  KRANIDT 100 TS (2)Se
NTJFTRTY  "VW THT 0B, DT D0 TTNYR "20T WRT DewTTT Q0w
TINI, BSO3RCBITTT,

14. 1000 TFOHE IR~ DHRY  VHAONTT 1000 IO (2)3e
NTJFTRTY, "NV TRT DT Jew3T™ 202 IJTINER "0 TNT DT 0w
TINI, BSO3RCBITTT,

15. 1138c TESHm IR~ RO VHACHTT  11Se IFos (DS 9
BBOTY, VBB TOIT CRTVORNT” 200 TTNER "QTF ;00 FONT TRTOORNT” 208
BINT), BS3RCBITTT.

16. 110 IFSeem IR~ RO BHIONIT 1l TBTLT (1)Fe NWTTFTRTY,~

() "OBZ D DWIT TRTLORNE" 200 JITNRER "TOTF TORIT  BRTOWLNS"
D0 wdrﬁ%ﬂm& @éo&mﬁ%é@d&;

(W) BRTOBe TTOBFRI, WLDVBBI;

(R) SRTIe TTONITY ") FBA" D0V TTAYR VAT "VRTOF 3001
WRTPCNITOT" DOW TJHINET), FeOTIZR;

(B) 0¥Se TTOBIT  ITOD  WIY  I[OWR FRTEO, B INOLITR,
ﬁe@ﬁé@d&, QOTIT:—

'OYe TI0DL, 03P FJHOIN VT TIFAPNOT TS FeIONIZY), IQATOI
ROTPFTY BIIN STI0ITT FSOIROW TREOFTIROR IRFF TS SoNnen 20T AT
SRZDONNE BOTY BWO V8 H5eITVY, BOTIOD [RTWIFR."

17. 113 JFTT STHH/R.— DR VHIONTT 118 JFTTY,~

1) (HS3e ewTTBTRTY  “2.0T OB TRTVONNY” Q0w JITNER  "DT@
©8 SRTVONNE” 0w IJTNATI, TSoIRBIITT),

(i) (2)3e w@TBTRTY “2.0T0 ©F SRITONNAY” 200 JITNER DT
©8 SRTVONNE” D0 TJTNYI, TBo3RBITIT.

18. 128¢ JFTHTW STHNTR.—~ TR BHACPTT 128¢ BFTRTY,~

@D (®) 00RE, B3 WROOITI, TIERCWATIT, DOTW3:~

() oRSIE  DP, eI BORTT ;’odsé@ﬁ TORNSN
FOLORATOZ  JONWARTOF  FOBNPNR  LITLD), VPO FLREEWT
BH0T  wees eﬁsé ToBT  TO3T0ED a;ééoja VT JBA3ROTD PR 2.0



AONTT W AT CRHITVONNRE JIND TOITed B30T, AdTosYade Lriod
TN OB TS 30N 9TZ ;T TRITODNY BT
BoswEd FTE) BOWOORTONTIT),"

(ii) (2) DoBTY.-

(@) (DFe T DOBTY "WwOTN FONT TRIVCRNRW" D0 TTINR
'RTW  FOWNT CRITVONMN" D0 TTRTTY, W "20W APLTT 0T
SRT TRTIONNE" 202 JTNER "ATE TONT DT IRTD BRTIOVNR
DB VRN, WBNWPTY, 89T, WDARBT TTILORY B[S D)
BReRFOT BT, LTNDT BT ©FD ITT JRCOTIONT FOZNRYY
WPTDIRYLY TEOTE DD FNT TRTRCVADL T F9eod FORMN
20T TORNTT I IRTY TRTICWNY" 0w TBRTD, TBSCIRBIITI).

(®) (i) B¢ 9T DORT SHOD, 35 BPOOITI, HeOITTR,
DOTT:—

"(iii) QBeBTY WFONT TpeANY FoWOFTY FTHT ToSwed B,
ZeRONIR, DOTYY SHIRRPTBOZ ATFO wTe3 Fod: 2FFR 03

PFETD 2011, OF0F: 15.11.20118 ©Fod g ReeRssmy.”

(iii) (2) DoBTY,~

() (ii) Se vz DorTY, "TOL),  TODNT  TRTIOWNT"  DOW
TINER "0T FODT CRTWOWVNE" D0 JINTI, TSC3RBIITI.

() (iv) Se 9T DOWE, B3 TINOOTTI), TSERERTTIT), POTT:~

"(iv) 1120 TBoeT ©ROPY BEDOW JFE BeTITD, BBV
B3Ry [EOIW, TE SONYR HTD ANTT NI SR TRTWOWNRE
IO BTsech FIR LTFTNTTIR,"

(iv) (22) DoETY, "RTF T ADNT TRTDCWNE" D0 TWRER "IOT)
ARNT CRTVONNRE" Q0L TTNYDY, BSSIRCBITIT,

(V) () <Domz (iii) Se wwm DoBRY, "(2) DOBIY DOFFTRIT
TORYY" Q00 TTNY ITDOOD még mzssdra%fﬁ mag ADletcIald) Uozsécﬁ
BRTA DWRIT POT  TOIPEOTYN  TOFADNT DWRT  TOJZY,  FOTWOD
mcgssp%" QOW mwm& i@@ﬁé@zﬁ%

(V) (225) D0BTY,—

(@) () S TZTFTRTY "BOJTD AT TRTWOR” D0
ITNYR m;@g TONT TRTVOW” D02 mmfsa& @éo&r@ezﬁﬁé@cﬂ%

() (i) Se evzTITRTY “5@5@@3 TONT TRTVN” Q02 IBNYR
"BOT) AONT CRTOON” D0W TWRTR, TSERERTIZ.



emdacs 533_30 FTLNS IewF

BeDI HFPRY  Neodeod  BPFWONIT. ST OOT TIDNFWT QI WWORYTBIT
ROWNY, I8 JeIINY DB z,jéémﬁ DRIODT, 19563, (19570 3TFWT QIR 2)
SHTR TRWH  WROT FOFNEOD TIONFATFHFT I TATC  TOWINTR, W)
PINIH, TR 3O VBT TOIRCHRINTZ, TLRPYD VB/IFIBOW TOMESTSING.

BTOOT B4 QDTFONT



BRET @wa T3,

TTONE ToITT0ZF FPOOT  OAFTIIN AT 44 dRcd CRTIONNE

~ o &

TTO B|SFT 523, YVOLPMOTT.

3 3

£3.00.25082803,
FOTNRI), IORDEON e'ssﬁmdmfo,
TRORRCTS BB TOLTW TRV

&. WOTF3
TOORETAF
BI0F 3T WTON R



HROWOP

BROFWT NPON s0OROTW TOWSNLD, a:@g ISR DI a:%m% HRICHNT, 19568
(19573 3Sorids RICHTH xO@S23 2) em%s won

Xx XX XX
3. BRTE /W, zz;az%gd Howensh =T e.-sézgs qs%ﬂeéo.— (1) mgoIen 20w
gonont  RRTB), TONT TRTPOVNY oW B WO aﬁa-ir%& QT Ug
TRTOWNY S8, a;ééofna’no1 BOTIROD SRBIZT,

(2) BPBIOR o SONYR AT TOLT TRTVONNRY oW =T
20T 55&?3& ROE OF TRTVONNY S8 a;éasoinmol ROTROD BPTWIZ).

4. BERTIOHTH, BRFIT S00TTRT TIT DINAW.~ (1) TTOTSODTI,
BERBIW,  WOTHLRTIONBVL, YVTILRFIT, DTREFTITT  [NDOBD, ATOFTT
B0, BEETTD DT VTREFTTH 02, BeTTD, TEOIRYT T, WHTTT
ORI TRSF W) YTT QT STVIONT  WTBB OB[ING  WTOOD  O
B3ONERDT INT WP LBONURD INTT TONSRLOT FRRTB) 3ARENUT 891
2,00 AR a’néo:bzbcl OBRN WOTROD TITBT WFPILD TRFWOINTITI), WF0
QOF AWALE WHIN WIBLRN oNeR SOV AT SRTPOWNY TTBY NI kN
PIE BRYDOONTITRZ, B3 QUT-TFOOT SN WBNIT AT DBORI),
QODWRHRTOF  JeBNYY  WIWINRIIIZT, DT ©TT  HOTF  QAFY)
QONNFTVTOT NENTR, WETIFT Q.

(2) BRPZT 2IT DIN WA DI RN PTF, TRYVOT  ALRTS
UPTO  BRFITD  WIYAD WA IONY,  ATFO emtf&es%é VTOSLENTL
QODWFVTOTOTOF  FeedoNY  Tox, ATETH) TR 3RBRNYIY,
mx%3M@53§w%. QAT AVETE TONL BT, YVZ0TON ‘&%@Jb%@ B &
BBR ReOT BT CRITER TN  ATFIHMN  SOMYR TP TONT
SRITOVNY PIE B[ THYBWOINTIZ,

5. TERTE I ﬁmzﬁ@d TI ﬂaozss.— (H) Xx xx Xxx

(2) ALPBS D) THFION FTWFTP) TS 0MD IR D IRT 0B/R
DT’ TR TONY BPE FNTT DTS HI0DT), TBo3eYONRR FOTWOD
BRBIZT);

Xx XX XX

6. DRI I, TPRFIL DTy TFFTY TOTICH [RBUHT W~
(1) BPBE DI BLRPIL WITNE m@oﬁweﬁ@ﬁ 43¢ Boed (1)3e HTTFT

-

DB ST JFOT VRONY WTNRYR TOWECIRT ITANSR DT [,

2L



TN TOWORRTOZ WRVNL T8 RIBNODI WORVFTIPRY,  FOTIWOD BRI
wc;pmﬁdé@cﬂa@, QOTIT:—

(P) FTETP FOTWOD TPWB DWINRT 0B JewNT Dedgeed P[yF
BR[O Fedpeen [ :FY

XX XX XX
8. Texw HedhTen TPTS, NWI-TRTL, ~z®z§§ mw—~m§3§ ATRCP
aﬁgd TOOBHBL, TTED dsoéDs eI DIy TR "’gd w:oéD Te3e3BS -

QWToNE T3re @336 Iy ¥T 2,33671%.— () Xx xx XxXx

(2) 20T WP TwoR TIOR@ON, ALRTE, SVT-TLOTSE, I sg DB
emw—,qmc%g, TR TFT TOONTTD TFEO [0 RBeZE DB VBREG T[T
Te8e88T0— ‘awcb—

() Xx XX XX

() TROD TROT TOIWE JPRRR TG $SREWCLONR BTB) THTOON
0% S0 TTE, TRYHTINTSIT),

Xx xx Xxx

(B) To3oT OINMN DI 03R)TIe "%%363@2 WITIRNRE  TSOTI,
2,00 TORT TRTIOWNY DIFINRR THYBONTTTT):

TOOW, TOWT BROH HRDT TWANY TOTHFNYE BOIRERT OFRIA
DI oIwPTBe FIBY  NWIHEART TS OIF 20 AT CRTWOWAD
ORI CIPNTIZRY;

Xx XX XX
10. OT-ZTPIJS DY wﬁ—ﬁmz%gd owensd.— (1) QUT-FBS DB
WT-FGPFT 33 TICIRWONH 30NPN BT FLT  TRIWOWVNY  FOWFB/I),
BOTIRON SPBSZT,

(2) WT-TPTE DT WTB-TRFF B3 BIXRYONR, BE S0nen, DD

0

SRT 0B Do’ [edRee® BER FDTOT BT PIWW, FOTOOD BIPTITT),

10, OT-TRTS, maﬁ—zmz%a WP POV PR x'z;az;sg o] 33?52371%*5:01
ATFLHBT [IR Bomeod IpWIewRE Bowd, PIT DI IS P (1) B
@@230535353@ DV ATTR,  BEOTJSOD *?5@ ol famﬁ DB cha “?553
TIEJNYZY, YT "X)mwé 9T Noamsw 18433¢ @Kb&%edw (D :Doc%cs a’bedﬁ
5@@% m@w DT BORET ATZURND ATF &ATY, erow—NaTowé Elafvpliclele
RBFOR  ©TD TN 53?5 awr&af%cﬁ OIEMN TS SoNeR AT TORT
d@mommf ROW T, xomoin DRBSIT W) AT D[P W
LTNATIT, T 5 3B 63¢ TFTLNY QOTWOFNY ONTT 0BT FIIZ),
BOTWOD BRBIF;




Xx XX XX

(2) 3 VOACDIDTY DFe APTH, BRTFII mIP 2D Qmn WF ©
oonlJ) “@@553 TS BATI), WH-FLRPE WP FOLTOITI 1803¢ @ab?é)ewcj (D3¢
DOBT  =NBR SCVINROTBOT  WPOIRLIOD xcj?ss&aa%do QATF&ATT @O
TIEBATI, VBH JITFLAT ©OF WB/OMN ©B[OR TS 0NeR VTH) AT
TRTOWNY oY FOWOOH [PWISTLH, DT BeF [P TR, LBNITITIH)
TORR 5 W) 63¢ TBOORT YWTWOFPNG WNIT 0B &33555301 Eylelaplew!
BRBSZT):

Xx xx XxXx

10, QBeey wgw JOPNTR  BOWT.— ATRET wgw @éo&m&g) JOONIIN
BOMYnt VTR AONT TRTPCNNY ROV, BOTWOD S[RBWIZR,

XX XX XX
1023, QTRLE JFW TeobIOR TS PoR.- (1) Oox, ATOFTY TS0IRL)
QBRET TIW TOODTIN WIALD ART BT o0, LIBNITZT,

(2) Weodey) DTREG TIW IpONIIN TFETHY TE 0N D BT
0B Dewo” FEipee® SN AT HTI PZONT, FOTWOD TPTITTY;

Xx xx XX

102, BwFO oo ZedeIFOR Towd.- TEARL, IFFO FWeITON Sonen
QT AT TRITWOWNET FOWTFIT), FOTICD TRTISTTR:

103, JPeey IFW mos), Bde3ET Dowd.- TIARY, DBRET TIW  B0D

D) p)

Te3e330R onen faagégo TONT TRTOONNY mwwm@l KOTIOOR mwsécs%

10007, BFF0 [wad, Dde3TOR IS POy~ (1) Xx XX Xxx

(2) =ecdey) ATFO W0, AWeITIN TFFSOY TE 0N D IRT
DBV Tl WSR FNIVT TOTI LIS, FOWOOD BRTBITI.

1000, dBReE TP =), Kde3zonR WOR 5653%.— 1) XX XX Xx

(2) BBodwy QNTwer TTB WO, AeBeIFOrt Sonen DY IRT 0T
DT NY DBedRee” TBIF TTOT AON PZONZ, ACBITIH,

Xx xx XX

11. QTRTY DT Qpes TVOHST sz:ssc Towe.— (1) ATOIRY T WS
TORES T3o3RY, FTAIN SONYN VW) AT TRTCNNT TOWFB/IY, FOTWOD
TREIIT, © IOWYF) BICH, TWTTN  NTVCWIGONT Q0T THLEAAT

QTVOTOOT VWO TRTHONTTT) WP QTOIFY P20 VO3 TORITY 0
mcp?ma’nol B0V TOWIWOOOT TIATEF 3T [RRT ATAT FOWHFTY ©B[IZY,



10

TON  DOTNITETT NIRRT HT0TOOT B0 m@m@ﬁ&“@ PVOERTT T SE
©WOF FRITE WFT IVWATCFIT [PRITT & m@m@&@ YUOERT DIV0FTOOT
©WOF FOWHR) TTWONSFI:

Xx XX XX
1o, 33FOR dFe Res™ amd.- (1) TOOFT DPOD  WOBOTWRT
BESINWD, VT [BeIINWD DB a;éémﬂ (STNIB) LRICHI, 20098 TWTOLT
QT203ROT 0ONR WWOE,

(i) D5ex BORIT i) BBION; VT
(i)  DposzLZoD 2.2), RBRBOON; B0

(i) pon3: LSRR RBRoON ) GRNS: WPOSTORIT BBRION

- VW JIREASIOR Aexd FQAT BEARY), [N, O[T NPT WeDTITHONY TS
Sonent BTE T [T TRTONNT BITY V8 H5eSTBI, FOTWOD [PBIZT:

T30, O3 VIR VW BRENAYNOT T, Aed FQATY, wIIN
BTBTJOTT  WROW[TT  TSOIROW BJRFE TS 30NN 2O AT TRTIOWNY
TOTY THWO @ BeIIVI, TSI, STONR, B TFTOT VRONY eWT
Q@ BeIIT Y, BRI SoNnen FRTE T ANT SHTVONNRTRY, NeTIZH Y.

Py IJjo, & éoﬁe;ai:ﬁl OB IRFT WOTH PNE WIROPRIR @oR
:)‘csxécmn 22T ﬁcﬁo&:?»d éza%da awdg ﬁesswmd e%é TODT emcgwﬁ&n 2.0TH
TR RRFI0WTIN waméssgzs%:

©YWe JTO, 2.2, ATFD, QI F0D NARRFION ToTLOOTON 0T
BRENG AeF AQWPYTE SBOANOLRTY, DWW B[RENAT  TRFHOFIOR Hesd
BOATOBIOLOTIN LPRIFIZT;

XX XX XX

112. e.-sézgs 4335.— (1) QBRey wgw TOONIAN 55"&?%& 20T @;uj SRTRONNY
BT, a;és BOTRODTONTIT);

(2) YwT-FgTe, ww—ﬁmq%g, [BoFO a’m@% RS W) NTReT TIT
CONEWS Tede8s— YWoOn m;-o; 2,000 ©F SRITWOWNTY BT, 3, FOTONTNSZT),

12. QeITR B[P DI, P8 IOIFE TS - A[OR Josweed 3,
HZy, ORPIAD DT Jy[Ieok D, 9IS PORZRL.- T8 WRICHIDT  0edn
SRR AONTONY TNRVT ATFOFRTOF ROBNAOT L.9Ted),~

(R) VTPIFY W, LT TORTI ATION  TwANOT  BOWOHATOZ
QOPNILRTOP R[IBNONR LITeD, WP 3RENWTY BTRTT e @§ T3



11

BOIwEd PIOD VT TSCIROW FPR LOT AITT DT INTD TRTWOWNE
N ToImes ORI, 0IPYT[E WROD ToIPEPNTY WTF TS seeL3ON
YWY CHTDONNE BOTY TE3ED P3P FOTWONTONTIIZ, DT DY ATWBOMP
OTC ToRTE YIZANT FINTY AR YT TeermeN AWIFINROT THS
TFHOND, A® wTNIIIT, DB ©0F TIS FFFON, TREOIT FOTHFTY

p)

RTHIN FIoDH ©BHOD BE OTF, R B T0mNR BHTIT HTE DI

B, B BOFODAROT I0ITT HTH OINY WJQR QT ;T SRTWOWNY

L

() ©[H PR ToRTDTFTN DB FPOH  IEF T ;B0TRO0D
QODWAT  WWPOIT  TWOJNYTON  TIBRT  LINE, TG OIF 20T AT
SRTDONNH ) TSIY BIT BHT ToRNYY, TG OTF oW FINTT 0T
SRT BRTPOWNY DTGF, FOTOODTONSZTY.

(i) e RBFOR B3 TRTOFHRHE  HTD  OJNY BT NI, 7Y
mﬁgojamd [O3TT AT AINEN 535?,,335@ Somojamﬁéic’%

(R) BERRY, ATH, ©OPH [ AT, WD) OB/IROON TIWT WP
PROONITOT TT WLDOWT ATAT,—

Xx XX XX
(i) 1o D3T0T LRODY AV [eITBI, RETOWITHT TBo3wY), B[we-
ATHD, ATO S0NYS VIQONY FTHOD WDITOB/IOD FeBN  DTTIR AGY
¥B0Y ATO BRIBI), IRSAHVRIY [OOSR wETEY, TS ONW LY AT
SRTONNY INDT FT3eod FINR BRYBTONTTTT.”

(iv) 1) TIOT SRODY HDOW IVY FeITHIY, ALFOWINT BEOIRL)
B0 ITO SONYR W[EODY FTBeodh BHHTOBIOH Femn DWTER AGY
©T0Q BE0 BRI, IRIRAUITY, TOIK LIYT, TS JonP VB WIT
SATORNY ANOT FTFFoH HIK BNISWNTIIR),”

(%) QTPT FPOD B AT TORIT BIOINY, ATZI, TIAT ATE ;T
TONT TRTCNNY WDTRFY §eg TOIwEd FIODT, JONTWITIT  0edoDY
RETOFLD THRYVTONTITIN,

Xx XX XX
(R) AW FRROT TEITENT BOWOPTY WSO AWM.~

Xx xx XxXx

(i) BNE0W NPT OTOT ITING Scﬁﬁéd ﬁm%oﬁmﬂ@gﬁ, ESEAREE)
B FLPPIT ONBRCTIo3R0OT;



12

~¢PTTY OB WENBOSPNRY 9T Spleday ee¥ple]ateclonsplald) 6665 IROT
VRBRT  BJOIPNYR B TF DROF [RRT  JOSRRER, () DOBTY
QOFFIRJT TONYY I BT TBRTNFE (RTUZTY DBHIT DRVT SPESRT
TOSVEONPN, ©OF TEIWRNPR TOTWOD [IPRT DTWIDICIVIT TOT 20T DTIE
200D PNTEY, TOIWED  FHIII, W DW[RIT  WROT TOIRE  [PBWIRN
VOO WTPOBNY FOWOFTY NXNMON  QONNTWTVTOTOF  QDTWIDIOD DB
OB IR SRTE ;3@%363@2 Bomhm OINYR T OBIE, TOZTD  CRTICWNED
B TORT BRONE 03T 5@%@2 omT TS QOBAY, 9T W TRTWOWNY
DIPZFR) BOTWODTONBZT):

Xx xx Xxx
(Te°) TBodey) FTIHINL 83 TVODT PN FOTWODTONSZ,~

() BRTmed BB A Heex® VRN VB PO B[ERYMN [T
TOZT WONT TRTOW;

(i) @o=me 368 PEnvon TOJT AT TLTOX.

Xx xx XX

RTEFO BNTHOOOR, WFA G, BONHRD, &7, AR 1204, 750-38nsH 163e [eFe, 2015



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTH SESSION
(ADJOURNED MEETINGS)

THE KARNATAKA LEGISLATURE SALARIES, PENSIONS
AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
(L.A. Bill No. 03 of 2015)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions
and Allowances Act, 1956.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Legislature
Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) for
the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty-sixth
year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances
(Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Legislature Salaries,
Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957), (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act), in section 3,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "thirty thousand rupees", the
words "fifty thousand rupees" and for the words "two lakhs
rupees", the words "three lakhs rupees" shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub section (2), for the words "thirty thousand rupees", the
words "fifty thousand rupees" and for the words "two lakhs
rupees", the words "three lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4. - In section 4 of the principal Act,-
(1) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees",
the words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be
substituted; and
(ii) for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

"(2) The Chairman or the Speaker who is entitled to a house rent
allowance, shall be entitled for an allowance of twenty thousand
rupees per mensem for maintenance and upkeep of the



residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included
in such residence."

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty", the words "one
thousand" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty", the
words "one thousand " shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the principal Act, in sub
section (2),-

(i) in item (b), for the words " twenty rupees ", the words "thirty
rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in item (d), for the words "rupees one thousand", the words
"rupees two thousand" shall be substituted.

(iii) in first proviso, for the words "two thousand rupees per day for
the days of journey and for the days of halt at any place", the
words "two thousand five hundred rupees and five thousand
rupees per diem for stay in hotel or other registered
establishment providing lodging and boarding at scheduled
rates subject to production of bills" shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the principal Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres",
the words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 10A.- In section 10A of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 10E.- In section 10E of the principal Act,
for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the words "forty thousand rupees"
shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 10G.- In section 10G of the principal Act,
in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres ", the words
"one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of section 10J.- In section 10J of the principal Act,
for the words "twenty thousand rupees"”, the words "thirty five thousand
rupees" shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 10K.- In section 10K of the principal Act,
for the words "twenty thousand rupees"”, the words "thirty five thousand
rupees" shall be substituted.



13. Amendment of section 10L.- In section 10L of the principal Act,
in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the words
"one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

14. Amendment of section 10M.- In section 10M of the principal
Act, in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the
words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

15. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), for the words ""twenty thousand rupees", the words "twenty
five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

16. Amendment of section 11A.- In section 11A of the Principal Act,
in sub-section (1),-

(@) in clause (iii), for the words " twenty five thousand rupees", the
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(b) the first proviso shall be omitted;

(c) in third proviso, after the word "member", the words "elected for the
first time" shall be inserted;

(d) after seventh proviso and before Explanation, the following shall be
inserted, namely:-

"Provided also that where any person has served for more
than five years there shall be paid to him an additional pension at
the rate of rupees one thousand per mensem for every subsequent
completed year".

17. Amendment of section 11C.- In section 11C of the principal
Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "one lakh rupees ", the
words "two lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "one lakh rupees", the
words "two lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the principal Act,-
(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(@) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative
Assembly and of the Legislative Council traveling allowance for
journeys at the rate of twenty five rupees per kilometre irrespective
of mode of journey subject to such conditions as may be prescribed
or fixed traveling allowance rupees one thousand five hundred for
each meeting in lieu of traveling allowance calculated on the basis
of distance traveled in kilometers."

(ii) in clause (b),-

(@) in sub-clause (i), for the words "one thousand rupees", the
words "two thousand rupees" and for the words "one thousand
five hundred rupees", the words "two thousand five hundred
rupees and five thousand rupees per diem for stay in hotel or



other registered establishment providing boarding and lodging at
scheduled tariffs subject to production of bills and also one
thousand five hundred rupees towards local transport " shall be
substituted;

(b) after sub-clause (ii), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iii) In respect of study tours abroad the T.A. claims of the
members shall be regulated as per G.O.No. FD 3 SRA
2011, dated: 15.11.2011 as amended from time to time."

(iii) in clause (c),-

(@) in sub-clause (iii), for the words "rupees four thousand", the
words "rupees five thousand" shall be substituted.

(b) for sub-clause (iv), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(iv) Every person who is drawing family pension under
section 11B shall be entitled to rupees two thousand five
hundred per month as fixed medical allowance."

(iv) in clause (cc), for the words "rupees twenty five thousand" the
words "rupees forty thousand" shall be substituted.

(v) in clause (e), in sub-clause (iii), after the words "at the rates
specified in clause (a)", the words "and for journeys by air within
the state and outside the state in India actual air fare shall be
paid" shall be inserted.

(v) in clause (h),

(@) in sub-clause (i), for the words "fifteen thousand rupees", the
words "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-clause (ii), for the words "fifteen thousand rupees", the
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. Therefore, it is
considered necessary to enhance the salaries and allowances of the
parliamentary functionaries and the legislators and certain other benefits by
amending the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act,

1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957).

Hence, the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rs.44

crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure.

T.B.JAYACHANDRA
Minister for Law, Parliamentary Affairs
Animal Husbandry and Muzarai

P. OMPRAKASHA
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and
Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957)

XX XX XX

3. Salaries and sumptuary allowances of Chairman and Speaker.-
(1) There shall be paid to the Chairman a salary of thirty thousand rupees
per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of two lakhs rupees per annum.

(2) There shall be paid to the Speaker a salary of Thirty thousand
rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of two lakhs rupees per
annum.

4. Residences of Chairman, Speaker etc.,.- (1) The Chairman,.
Speaker, Deputy Chairman, Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition,
Government Chief Whip and Opposition Chief Whip each shall be entitled to
the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore within thirty
kilometers from the limits of the City of Bangalore throughout his term of
office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or, in lieu of
such furnished residence, to a house rent allowance at the rate of forty
thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-
section shall be furnished on such scales and the plinth area thereof shall
not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by the Chairman or the Speaker, who is
entitled to a house rent allowance in lieu of furnished residence, three rooms
shall be furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be
prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an
allowance of ten thousand rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep of
the residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such
residence.

5. Conveyances of the Chairman and the Speaker.- (1) xx
XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Speaker each a
conveyance allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of
petrol per mensem.

XX XX XX

6. Charges payable by the Chairman and the Speaker and the
Government.- (1) The Chairman and the Speaker shall, in respect of their
respective residences and the motor cars allotted for their use under sub-
section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable to pay the following charges,
namely:—

(@) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government;
and



XX XX XX

8. Travelling and other allowances of the Chairman, the Deputy
Chairman, the Speaker and the 1[Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the
Opposition ,the Government Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief
Whips on tours.-(1) xx XX XX

(2) While touring inside India]lthe Chairman, the Deputy Chairman,
the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition,the
Government Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips shall be
entitled,—

XX XX XX

(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at twenty rupees per
kilometre;

XX XX XX

(d) to daily allowance at rupees one thousand per day for the days of
journey and for the days of halt at any place:

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily
allowance shall be at two thousand rupees per day for the days of journey
and for the days of halt at any place:

XX XX XX

10. Salaries of Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker.- (1) There
shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and to the Deputy Speaker each a
salary of twenty thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) There shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy
Speaker a conveyance allowance of equal to the cost of seven hundred and
fifty litres of petrol per mensem.

10A. Salary, conveyance and conveyance allowance payable to
the Deputy Chairman, Deputy Speaker or the person performing the
duties of the Chairman or Speaker.- (1) Notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, while the office of the Chairman is vacant and the
duties of the said office are performed by the Deputy Chairman or a member
of the Legislative Council appointed under clause (1) of Article 184 of the
Constitution, the Deputy Chairman or such member, shall, during the
period he so performs such duties, be paid a salary of twenty thousand
rupees|] per mensem and provided with a suitable motor car and paid
conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions of sections 5 and 6:

XX XX XX

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of
the Speaker is vacant and the duties of the office are performed by the
Deputy Speaker or member of the Legislative Assembly appointed under
clause (1) of Article 180 of the Constitution, the Deputy Speaker or such
member shall, during the period he so performs such duties, be paid salary
of 2[1[twenty thousand rupees]1]2 per mensem and provided with a suitable



motor car and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions
of sections 5 and 6:

XX XX XX

10E. Salary to the Leader of the Opposition.- There shall be paid
to each Leader of the Opposition a salary of twenty thousand rupees per
mensem.

XX XX XX

10G. Conveyance for the Leader of the Opposition.- (1) The State
Government may provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Leader of
the Opposition.

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a conveyance
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per
mensem.

10J. Salary to the Government Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to
each Government Chief Whip a salary of twenty thousand rupees per
mensem.

10K. Salary to the Opposition Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to
each Opposition Chief Whip a salary of twenty thousand rupees per
mensem.

10L. Conveyance for the Government Chief Whip.- (1)
XX XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Government Chief Whip a conveyance
allowance 1l[equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per
mensem

10M. Conveyance for the Opposition Chief Whip.- (1)
XX P .4 XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Opposition Chief Whip a conveyance
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres]3 of petrol per
mensem.

XX XX XX

11. Salary of members of the Legislative Assembly and the
Legislative Council.- (1) There shall be paid to every member of the
Legislative Assembly or of the Legislative Council a salary of twenty
thousand rupees per mensem which shall accrue to him from the day on
which he is declared duly elected, or, in the case of a member nominated by
the Governor to fill a seat in the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative
Council, from the date on which he is so nominated, or, if such declaration
or nomination is made before the vacancy occurs, from the date of
occurrence of the vacancy:

XX XX XX



10

11A. Pension to the members etc.- (1) With effect from the date of
commencement of the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and
Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 there shall be paid to every person who
has served for a period of five years as,-

(i) a member of the Legislative Council; or
(ii) a member of the Legislative Assembly; or

(iii) partly as a member of the Legislative Assembly and partly as a
member of the Legislative Council, a pension at the rate of
4[3[twenty-five thousand]4 rupees]3 per mensem for the
remainder of his life:

Provided that where any person has served for more than five years
there shall be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees one
thousand per mensem for every subsequent completed year so however that
the total amount of pension payable under this section does not exceed
thirty five thousand rupees per mensem.

Provided further that service as such member for a part of the year
exceeding six months shall be treated as a full year for the purpose of
calculating additional pension:

Provided also that where a member has been prevented from serving
as such for five years on account of dissolution of the Legislative Assembly,
he shall be deemed to have served as member for five years:

XX XX XX

11C. Sumptuary allowance.- (1) The Leaders of the Opposition shall
be paid a sumptuary allowance of one lakh rupees per annum.

(2) The Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Government Chief
Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips shall be paid a sumptuary allowance
of one lakh rupees per annum.

XX XX XX

12. Travelling and daily allowances of, and medical and other
facilities to, members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative
Council.- Subject to such conditions as may be determined by rules made
under this Act,—

(@) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative Assembly and
of the Legislative Council traveling allowance for journeys at the rate of
twenty rupees per kilometre irrespective of mode of journey subject to such
conditions as may be prescribed or fixed traveling allowance rupees one
thousand five hundred for each meeting in lieu of traveling allowance
calculated on the basis of distance traveled in kilometers and all the



11

members be provided with fully furnished accommodation, without payment
of rent, at the place at which their attendance is required and where such
accommodation is not provided, the member shall be paid an allowance of
twenty five rupees per diem during the period of the meeting and for two
days before the commencement of meeting and for two days after the day of
conclusion of meetings.

(b) there shall be paid,—

(i) to all members daily allowance for attending the meetings and for
the prescribed number of days of holidays, intervals or absence between
meetings at the rate of one thousand rupees per-diem within the State and
one thousand five hundred rupees per-diem outside the State in India;

(i) to all members daily allowance for two days before the
commencement of meetings and for two days after the day of conclusion of
the meetings.

(c) Every member or on ex-member and the members of his family who
are residing with and are dependent on him shall be entitled,—

XX XX XX

(iii) every ex-member who is in receipt of the pension under section
11A shall be entitled to fixed medical allowance of rupees four thousand per
month, subject to the condition that the said amount shall be deducted in
the medical reimbursement claim if any during the said month.

(iv) Every person who is drawing family pension under section 11B
shall be entitled to rupees two thousand per month as fixed medical
allowance, subject to the condition that the amount already reimbursed
through the medical reimbursement claim if any during the said month,
shall be deducted from the fixed medical allowance.

(cc) Every member of the Legislative Assembly and of the Legislative
Council shall be entitled to receive in the prescribed manner, a sum of
rupees twenty five thousand per month as constituency Traveling Allowance

XX XX XX

(e) there shall be paid to the members of a committee, in respect of
journeys undertaken by the committee,—

XX XX XX

(iii) with the approval of the Chairman and the Speaker, where the
committee is a committee of members of both Houses, of the Legislature,
travelling allowance for journeys by train and for journeys by road whether
within the State or outside the State in India, at the rates specified in clause
(@) and for journeys by air outside the State in India at the rate of one and



12

one-fifth times the single air fare paid for such journeys and such insurance
premium as may be prescribed for insurance against accidents during such
journeys by air and daily allowance of rupees fifteen per diem for the days of
halt at any place within the State and at rupees twenty-five per diem for the
days of halt at any place outside the State:

XX XX XX

(h) every member shall be paid an allowance of,—

(i) fifteen thousand rupees per month towards meeting the
expenditure incurred by him on telephone and cell phone calls

(ii) fifteen thousand rupees per month as constituency allowances;

XX XX XX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bangalore, P7, W.D.1204 Copies 750, 16™ March, 2015



