
�
������ ����	
�������

�
� �������
���	
�������

�

� ���
������
������
������	�����
	��� ���
�������

����������	
����������	��������� !�"�!��#�$��%&'��
�(���"�!������(��'��
�(
)"�!��
�&	��*��+ ���	

��,����#�-./0�

�-./0����	
�������

�,����	

��,��������1 
)�2�.3��
� � �

� ������ ��� �	
���� ��
� ��	 �� ���� ��
� ��������� �� ����� � ������������ � ������� � 
��������� �  !�
"��� ����
#$%&���'�� �����( ��)��	 ��*+ �, �� �"�� ����-
	 ����	
��
"����.�

� /0 1� / ���2� � ���
	 �� ��
� ��� � ���� �� 3 	 �*�4���5��6� ������ ��� �	
���� ��
� �� 	 �� ����
��
� ��������� �� ����� � ������������ � ������� � 
��������� �  !�
"��� ���� #$%&���2� 7#$%8��� ����������
�  !�
"��� ���9:�� �����( ��)��	 ��*+ �, �� �"�� ��� �;	 ���
"������� �6���� �;	 �<
	 �=�

� /	 ����� 
��������> ��? �	 ��� ��� ����������� �( ��	 �0 1������� �����? ���	
���� ��
� �� 
	 ��@ �
� ���
 ��
����  !�
"��������������'	 ��*AB��

� /4����56��'�� 
���������(��'���7����
�42�7#:�@ ��  !�
"��� ��� ����2������� ����	
���� ��
� ��	 ������
��
� ����������� ������ ������������� �������� 
����������7�	 ��*+ �, :��  !�
"��� ����9C#%�D 
	 �������
"������'	 ��*.�

79:�/ 	 ���@ ���E � �F���G �<���� ������'	 ��*.�

-4�3�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42������� ����	
���� ��
� ��	 �� ������
� ������������ ������ ������������
� �������� 
����������  !�
"��� ���� #$%&��� 7#$%8��������� ����  !�
"��� ���9:� 7/0 1�/ ���2� ���
	 ��� ��E � �
�  !�
"��� ��� �
	 ���3 F�1�H ��F�6	 �:�I����+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B���

7i:� 7#:���� 3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1� K� ��E � ������ ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� NNO � ������
������ ��E + �L �����MM� D
� � + �	 ��������2� � ������� NND ��� ��� ���P���E + �L �����MM� D 
� �
+ �	 ���5���NN� ��E �������P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.�

7ii:� 79:���� 3 + �+�J����> 	 �0 1� K���E � ������ ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� NNO � ������
������ ��E + �L �����MM� D
� � + �	 ��������2� � ������� NND ��� ��� ���P���E + �L �����MM� D 
� �
+ �	 ���5���NN� ��E �������P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.�

34�9�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��R����+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B�

(i) � 7#:���� 3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1� � NN���� ������ ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5���
SD 
� �������������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*=�� ��������

(ii) 79:����3 + �+ �J����> ��'��@ �� ���
 ��	 ����2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*��D 
	 ���AB��

� S79:� � ����� � �, ��� � 
������� T ����'��U� ���	 �� ���
�+ ��� � V�� �� ��� 
�	 
����P�����
�� ���	�� �� ��T �W �� T ���E � � 	 ����2� 3 ���� ��� �6� / � �)��E ��U��� � ������� X � � �������



��

�

���<	�� ��E �� 	 �� ��E + �����( �� T ���E � �� ��T �W ���6� �
��5��� / + �Y����� ������
��E + �L ������� 
�������� � �����T ����'��U� ���6������'	 ��*.S���

94� 0�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42����E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��%����+ �J����> 	 �� 79:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �01��
NNZ ������E ���O� �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ���5���NN-
	 ��������MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

04�:�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��&����+ �J����> 	 ��7#:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 ��7D :�
� �[��01�� NNZ ���� ��E ��� O� �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� NN-
	 ��� �����MM� D 
� � +�	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

�:4� ;�
�� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� \���� + �J����> 	 �� 79:����
3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B�

i. 7[:� � �[��01� S/ + �Y����� ��E + �L �S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� NN���E � ������ ��E + �L �S� D 
� �
+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

ii. 7, :� � �[��01� S-
	 ��� ������ ��E + �L �����S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� SD ��� ��� ������
��E + �L �����S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

iii. � �E 	 ������ + ���
�����	 �0 1� � S� ������� 
"�"�� �;	 ��� ��]��	 �0 1� 3 5	 ����E ���U� �� + �J� ����'�
D ��� ��� ������ ��E + �L ������S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� SD ��� ��� ������ O	 ��� ��E ����
��E + �L ������� � ������� [��1�������2� -	 �6���� �;	 ���'� -��+ �� �)�� � �����E ^ ��� 	 �������0 1�
� ����� � ������� � �E �, �
�_� ���2� -	 �6������ T �E �̀ �F_� � V �� �� / ����� ��E �
	 �L ����
��
��]����0 1�3 5	 ����E ��U���+ �J� ����'�O	 �����������E + �L ������S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

<4�/.�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��#C����+ �J����> 	�0 1�B�

(i) � 7#:���� 3 + �+ �J����> 	 �01� � NN/ + �Y����� ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5���
S���� ��������������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

(ii) 79:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1� SZ ������E ���O � ������0 �� �_S�D 
� �+ �	 ���5��� S-
	 ���
������0 �� �_MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.�

;4�/.= ���7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��#CD �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B�

(i) � 7#:���� 3 + �+ �J����> 	 �01� � NN/ + �Y����� ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5���
S���� ��������������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

(ii) 79:���� 3 + �+�J����> 	�0 1� NN/ + �Y����� ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � +�	 ���5���
S���� ��������������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.�

>4� /.? � ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� #C/ � + �J����> 	 �0 1�� NN/ + �Y����� ������
��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S��� � ������ ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � +�	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

/.4�/.@ ���7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��#CQ �+ �J����> 	 ��79:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�
SZ ���� ��E ��� O� ������ 0 �� �_S� D 
� � +�	 ���5��� S-
	 ��� ������ 0 �� �_MM� D 
� � + �	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.�



��

�

//4� /.A
� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� #CG �� + �J����> 	 �0 1�� NN/+ �Y����� ������
��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S� ��E � ����ab	 ��� ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � +�	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

/-4� /.�
� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� #C��� + �J����> 	 �0 1�� NN/ +�Y����� ������
��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S� ��E � ����ab	��� ������ ��E + �L �����MM� D 
� � +�	 ��������2�
+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

/34� /.=BC� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� #CDF_� + �J����> 	�� 79:����
3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1� SZ ���� ��E ��� O � ������ 0 �� �_S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S-
	 ��� ������ 0 �� �_MM� D 
� �
+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.�

/94� /.=�� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� #CD 
� + �J����> 	 �� 79:����
3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�� SZ ���� ��E ��� O� ������ 0 �� �_S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S-
	 ��� ������ 0 �� �_MM� D 
� �
+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.�

/04� //�
�� ��7����8 	�� &	��*��+ 42� � ��E �� �  !�
"��� ��	 �� ##���� +�J����> 	 �� 7#:���� 3 + ��
+ �J����> 	 �0 1��NN/ + �Y�������������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ���5���S/ + �Y���ab	 �����������E + �L �����MM�D 
� �
+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

/:4�//= ���7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��##D �+ �J����> 	 ��7#:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B�

7D :� S/ + �Y���ab	��� ������ ��E + �L �����S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� S��� � ������ ������ ��E + �L �����S�
D 
� �+�	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*=�

� 7[:�� �E 	 ������+ ���
������ ����2�[��)[������'	 ��*=���

� 7c:� � ��E ������ + ���
�����	 �0 1� S-� d���	�������S� D 
� � + �	 ���5��� � �E 	 ���� S� �E 	 ����� � �<���
e ����L �����	 �S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2����<������'	 ��*=�

7, :� Z ������ + ���
�����	 �� ������ �
"��� � ������� �����W ���� � �E 	 ����� @ � ����
 ��	 ����2�
���<������'	 ��*��D 
	 ���AB�

S� �1	 ��� + ���
����� 
"�"�� �f� d� � ��g�
"���� O	��� � �( ����56
��� T �̂ h��� ���� �
"�����2� ��01c���� ��
��
	 �� 
��	 �0 1�X ��������	 ���
����	 ��+ �J�
"�E 
	 ���+ �E > ���E 
� ��� �( ����'�+ �J���
��5���-
	 ���������
��E + �L ������	 ���	 �0 1�T �e ��h� �<��� ������ ������� ����2���
	�
"���� �"�� �����'	 ��*.S�

� �/<4�//D���7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��##c�+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B��

(i) �7#:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1��NN-
	 ������P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ���5�����SD ��� ���
���P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	��*.��

(ii) 79:����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�NN-
	 ������P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ���5�����SD ��� ���
���P���E + �L �����MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q������'	��*.��

/;4�/-�
����7����8 	��&	��*��+ 42�� ��E ���  !�
"��� ��	 ��#9����+ �J����> 	 �0 1�B�

(i) �7D :�i 
� ���'��@ �� ���
 ��	 ����2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*��D 
	 ���AB���

S7D :� �	
������
�� � ������� �	
���� +�<( ��_��� ��	 ����<��� + �J� �����5���
��
� 
 !c	 �
��� �
"������F�	 �
V �� ( ���������5��� -��+ �� �)� � V �� �� gF�E ���������
X 	 
���	 �� � ���F�� F���'� T �g	 �� + �J
"�"�> � � 
����
"��� � 	 ���� + �J�
"�E 
	 ������
���� -
	 ���



��

�

�����	��O	 �����E ������E + �L ��������� �+ �J
"�"�> �� 
����
"�����2��
"�"�� �;	���� ��
"���
+ �J
"�"�> � �6��0 � � 	 ���'� + �J�� gF�E �����<��� / + �Y���ab	��� ��E + �L ������ 	 ���	 �0 1�
+ �J
"�"�> �� 
����� �;���
	 �
"��� �������'	 ��*.S�

(ii) 7[:�i 
� �	 �0 1�B�

� 7D :�7i:����3 + ��i 
� �	 �0 1�S-
	 �����������E + �L ������S�D 
� �+�	 ���5���
SD ��� ��� ������ ��E + �L ������S� D 
� � + �	 ��������2� � ������� S-
	 ��� �����	�� O	 ���
��E ������E + �L �����S� D 
� � + �	���5��� SD ��� ���������O	 �����E ���� ��E + �L �������
� �������[��1�������2� -	�6�����;	 ���'� -��+ �� �)�� � �����E ^��� 	 ���+ �j)
"��0 1� � ����� � �������
� �E �,�
�_� � ���2� -	 �6������ T �E �̀ �F_� � V �� �� / ����� ��E �
	 �L ���� ��
��]����0 1�
3 5	 ����E ��U��� + �J� ����'� � O	 ��� ������ ��E + �L ������� � ���������]5�
"�����<����6�
-
	 ��������	��O	 �����E ������E + �L �����S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

7[:� 7ii) ���� 3 + �� i 
� �	 �� ������ �
"���� @ � � ���
 ��	 ����2� ���<������'	 ��*��
D 
	 ���AB�

S7iii) �	��4�	�0 1�� 	 
��
"�����+�J� ����������
� 
	 
�	 �0 1���	 �������+ �J
"�"�> �� 
�����
��1�� ����������2�� ��������'� �	 ��*+ �, 
"�"�	 �
��� �����<� X 	 ��4�� ��
k ��A� D + 
_, � CI�
D�_X �_D �9C##�� ��
��A�#%.##.9C##���� ��l
"�����J� ��� 	 �m��E 5������'	 ��*.S�

(iii) 7c:�i 
� �	 �0 1�B�

� 7D :� (iii) ���� 3 +�� i 
� �	 �01�� S����'� ������ ��E + �L �����S� D 
� �
+ �	 ���5���SO 	 �����������E + �L �����S��D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

� 7[:�(iv) ����3 + ��i 
� ���'�@ �� ���
 ��	 ����2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*��D 
	 ���AB�

� S(iv) ##[�+ �J����> 	 ��� , 
"��0 1����� �
� ��� ������ ������� ����2�+ �� �
"��������� ��
+ �J�
"�E � d� � ��g�
"����� + �J�� �
��5��� D ������ �����	�� O 	 ��� ��E ���� ��E + �L ������
��� ���� �b	 ��g�
"����
�������� T ����6������'	 ��*.S�

(iv) 7cc:�i 
� �	 �0 1�� S/ + �Y���ab	 �����������E + �L �����S�D 
� �+ �	 ���5��� S��� � ������
��������E + �L �����S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.��

(v) 7/ :� i 
� �	 �� (iii) ���� 3 + �� i 
��	 �0 1�� S7D :� i 
��	 �0 1� � �( �)+ �, c	 ��
	 �������0 1S�D 
� �+ �	 ������������ �
"���S� ���������? �	 �E ������ �������� 
�����	 �0 1���? �	 ��
T �E ����� ���"���	 �� � ��E � ��� +�J
"�"�> ��'6� � �������� ���"���� 	 ��������2� ��
	�
"���
� �"�������'	 ��*S�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2����<������'	 ��*.��

(v) 7D e _:�i 
� �	 �0 1�B�

� 7D :� (i) ���� 3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1� � NNT � ��b	 ��� ������ ��E + �L �MM� D 
� �
+ �	 ���5���S/ + �Y�������������E + �L �MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+�J�
"�E �Q������'	 ��*.��

� 7[:�(ii) ����3 + �+ �J����> 	 �0 1�NNT � ��b	 �����������E + �L �MM�D 
� �+�	 ���5���
S���� ��������������E + �L �MM�D 
� �+ �	 ��������2�+ �J�
"�E �Q ������'	 ��*.�

� �



��

�

� 	
*�������(��'�����8 "�!��� 
�E�
�

� �

Q�� ���� � �e �h	 �0 1� ��> ��
"��� T �e �h��� �6������	�.� X 	 �*<
	 �� ������ ��� �	
���� � ��
� ���	�� ����

��
� �������� ������ ������������ �������� 
����������  !�
"��� ����#$%&���2�7#$%8��������� ����  !�
"��� ���9:�

�	 ��*+ �, � ��"�� ��� �� � ��E ���� ��
�� �
"��� ��
"����� ��T ������ � ������� 4�������� ��
� ���������2� � �������

� 
�����������2�T ���E ������;�/ �����+ �J
"�E �? ���������2�T �̂ h���� �;	 ���� � �4����� �
	 ���+ �<��> n��F�6	 �.��

X	 �*<
	 ��@ ��	
��
"�����

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

�

� �



��

�

� F����AG��������(�7�

�

+�J������� 4�������o��� ��J��� 
	 �� � �p���� �6� ���� �"����� RR� ��E �j � ��E +�L ������

T �e ��h��<�X� �������� �e�h�3 
`�������	 �.�

�
H 4I 4J �,��K��	�74�

����E�������
�� �
"��������T ����������
+ �4����
��E �+����� �������� ���?��L ����̂ � ����.�

�

�
� L 4�M���7�����
� ��
"���	 �q��
� ����������	
������� 
��
�
�
�

� �



��

�

���� �	
��

�

������ ����	
�����������	����� !�"�!��#�$��%&'��
�(���"�!������(��'��
�(
)"�!�����$�,�����#�/>0:���

�/>0<��������� ������$�,���������1 
)�-��� 	�NO(���
�"��

Xx   xx  xx 
34����
���&����(��'����
�	
�)��6������ !�"�!������(��'��&P�)��
�(
)"�!��42�7#:���� 
�+�����-
	 ���

�
��5��� � ���E ������� ������ ��E +�L ������ ��
� ��� � ������� -
	 ��� � �(����'� D��� ��� ���P�
��E +�L ������X �V����
����
"�����2���
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*.�

� 79:� ��� 
�	 
����P<��� -
	��� �
��5��� � � ��E� ������ ������ ��E + �L ������ ��
� ��� � �������
-
	 �����(����'�D��� ������P���E+ �L ������X �V���� 
����
"�����2���
	 �
"���� �"�������'	��*.�

94����
���&�,�������#����
�	
�)��6��������(�	����������	������
"�!��42� 7#:���� 
�+ ��
"���������
��� 
�	
����P����� 3 + ���� 
�+��
"��� ������ 3 +���� 
�	
����P����� ���E �	
�+ ���P	�� � ���i 
� ������ �������	��
� ���i �� ��e ���������� � ������� ���E �	 
�+ ���P	 �� � ���i �� ��e ����������� + �J�
"�E � d���� ��� ��o� � !����	��
� �� !� + �E��� � ������� � 	���� ���� � �������
"��	�� � � ��� ������  ��������� �� � !
"��� ����
� �
����E������������V �� ����
����E ����������	��+ �<�����5
	��� ��E� ������gF�E ������_�-�����
-
	 ��������Qr��������
"�����2���,�����
	�
"���� �"���	��� �������T ����'��U����6������'	 ��*.��V �� ��
� 
V�������Qr������������ 	�F�6��
��5����������������������E +�L ������	���	�01�������� �, ���
� 
������'� T ����'��U� ���6������'	��*.� @ � 3 + �B+�J����> 	 �� � �������� -	�6c	�� � ���	 �� � ����
"�����2�
�
"������F�	�
V �� 4�J�> n����01� �����Qr����E5������'	��*� � ������� �	 ���� s1
�_� �c��> �� �;�
�
"������F�	�
V ������������2����������'	�*�1.�

� 79:� �����Qr��� ����	�� �������� � 	�F���� � ����� � �,��� � 
������'� T ����'��U� ���	�� ��� 
�+���
� V�� �� ���
�	
����P���� � ������ �� � ���	 �� � ����
"��01�� �����<� 3 	 �*�4���'� 3 +�
"�E�6�����
�
"������� T ��	�	�
V�� 4�J�> n
"��01� ��?�� �������� �;� � ��E ���� ��E t�,�������2�
�����Qr����E5������'	��*.��� ���	 ������T �W ��T ���E �� 	����2�3 ���� ��� �6�/��)��E ��U�����������X �
� ������� ���<	 �� ��E �� 	�� ��E+ �����(�� T ���E � ����T �W ���6� �
��5��� T ������ ������
��E +�L �������
������'��������T ����'��U� ���6������'	��*.�

04����
���&����(��'����
�	
�)��6������ �����Q��
�)42�7#:�Xx   xx  xx 

79:���� 
�+�������������� 
�	
����P<������������;�+�J���
���������E����Z������E ���O� ������
0���_� + �̀ �E J�F_� 	�������� ��e �h��'� ��� ����	�� � �T ���� � 
����
"�����2� + �J�
"�E � d<��E � ��
	�
"���
� �"�������'	 ��*.�

Xx   xx  xx 
:4����
���&����(��'����
�	
�)��6�������(��'����������R����	��,�����,����
���	��K�J��"�!��42�

7#:���� 
�+�������������� 
�	 
����P����� ����������3 +�
"�E�����'6�R����+�J����> 	 ��7#:����3 +�+ �J����> �
� ������� %���� + �J����> 	 �� � ,
"��01� � �������5��� T �
^��
"�"�	�� �������5��� �������� � �E �̀ �����



��

�

�������5��� ��
� 
 !c	�
��� �� ���������� @ � ����
 ��� e�? ���������2� ��
	�
"��� � �"������
� 	 �m��6������'	��*��D 
	 ���AB�

� 7D :��������� �;���
	�
"�����"����� ��Z�����E ��� O� ������0����������+ �̀ �E J����� �e�h��'�
T �e ��h��<
"�"�	��+ �̀ �E J������e �h=�� �������

Xx   xx  xx 
;4���7����	���
��S�����"�����
���&#�� ��2���
���&#����
�	
�)��6#�� ��2���
�	
�)��6#���
T �	
��

����6	�� ���,�������#� �����U� ����V )� ��K
�(������� ���(��'� ��
T �	
�� ����6	�� ����V )� ��K
�(������� 2�
?�����"�!����7�,�,�8 ��
�(
)����(��'�?(�����
�(
)"�!��42�7#:�Xx   xx  xx 

� 79:� � 
�����	 �� -����� + �J� ���� ��"����� ����� ��� 
�+ ���� 3 + �B��� 
�+ ���� ���
�	
����P� � �������
3 +�B��� 
�	
����P�� ���E �	 
�� + ���P	�� ��
"�������� �����<� � ���i ����e������� �����������E �	
�� + ���P	 ��
� ���i ����e���������B�/� �����B�

� 7D :�Xx   xx  xx��

� 7[:� �����
"��� ���E ���� +�J
"�"�> � ��"�,	 ���� + �J�� gF�E �����<��� / + �Y����� ��E+ �L ��
���������b���	 �����'�T ����'��U����6������'	��*.�

Xx   xx  xx�
7, :� + �J
"�"�> 	��  ����5��6� �������� 
"�"���;	��� ��]��	 �01� 3 5	 ����E���U� �� +�J� ����'�

-
	 �����������E + �L ������ ���
������5���T ����'��U����6������'	��*A�

� +���
����� ��?�	�� T �E ����� ��"����� �� + �J��������� ��
	�� 
������01� + �J
"�"�> 	 ��  ����5���
� ������� 
"�"���;	 ��� ��]��	 �01� 3 5	 ����E���U��� +�J��  ����'� D������ ������ ��E +�L �������
 ���
����
"�"�6������'	 ��*A�

Xx   xx  xx�
/.4� � ��2���
���&� ���(��'� � ��2���
�	
�)��6��� ��� !�"�!��42� � �#:� 3 + �B���
�+��� � �������

3 +�B��� 
�	
����P� @ � +�J�
"�E� d<��E � �
��5��� /+ �Y����� ������ ��E +�L ������ ��
� ��� ����2�
��
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*.�

� 79:� 3 +�B��� 
�+ ��� �������� 3 +�B��� 
�	
����P� @ � + �J�
"�E� d<��E �� + �J�� �
��5���� Z ����
��E ���O�������0 ���_�+ �̀ �E J�F_���F�����������	����T ����� 
���������2���
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*.�

� /.= 4�� ��2���
���&#�� ��2���
�	
�)��6��P�������
���&��P�������
�	
�)��6�����(����)"�!����W�
$���X ������ ��)5'"
� ���	��,��� ��,����
���	�� ��� !�#� ��� ���� ���(��'� ��� ���� �
�(
)42� 7#:� @ �
�  !�
"�����	 �01� Z ���� /	 �*��E �� ��� 
�+ ��
"��� ��]����;� k �0� / 	 �*��� �������� ��	 �<� ��]��	 ��
������ ���������2�3 +�B��� 
�+ ���� V�� ����
�	
���	��#\R����� ���e�u�	 �	��7#:�i 
��	 ��� ��������
�����������"�,	 ���	 
����+�<(��������	 ������E� d��������v c	�����3 +�B��� 
�+ ����V �����
V��
��	 ����<��� � ������ T ���� ��������� ����v c	�� �� � !��6� +�J�� �
��5��� / +�Y����� ������
��E +�L ������ ��
� �������2� ��
	�
"��� � �"�������'	 ��*� �������� ��E ���� � �E �̀ ����� ������
-	�6������'	��*� � ������� %� �������� &���� + �J����> ����� 3 +�� 
	
������ � �������� � �T ���� � 
���������2�
��
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*A�



	�

�

Xx   xx  xx�
� 79:�@ ��  !�
"�����	 �01�Z����/ 	�*��E ����� 
�	 
����P�����]��� �;�k �0 �/ 	�*���� �������X �
k �0 ���]��	 �������� ���������2�3 +�B���
�	
����P��V ������
�	
���	 ��#\C��������e�u�	�	 ��7#:����
i 
� �	�� � �������� ���� ������E
��
V�� �	
������ 
�
"��� ��	 ������E� d���� �� ��v c	���� � 
V��
������ ���������2� � ������ �� ��v c	�� � 
V�� � �� !��6� � ��<��� + �J�� �
��5��� /+ �Y����� ������
��E +�L ��������
� �����
	�
"���� �"�������'	��*�����������E ����� �E �̀ ������������2�-	�6������'	 ��*�
T ���E � %� �������� &���� + �J����> 	�� 3 +�� 
	
������ ��������� ��T ���� �
���������2� ��
	�
"���
� �"�������'	 ��*A�

Xx   xx  xx�
� /.? 4� ��
T �	
�� ����6	�� ���,������� ��� !�42� ���E�	
�� + ���P	�� + �J�
"�E � d� ��
"��������
�
��5���/+ �Y�������������E+ �L ��������
� �������2���
	�
"���� �"�������'	 ��*.�

Xx   xx  xx�
/.@ 4� ��
T �	
�� ����6	�� ���,����U"
� ��� ���� �Q��
�)42� 7#:� ��? �� ���������;� +�J�
"�E � d�

���E �	 
��+���P	����
"��������� ���������E ����� �E �̀ ������������2�-	�6������'	��*.�

79:� +�J�
"�E� d� ���E�	
�� + ���P	�� ��
"�������� �������� �;� +�J�� �
������ Z ���� ��E ���
O�������0���_�+ �̀ �E J�F_���F�����������	����T ����� 
����
"�����2���
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*.�

Xx   xx  xx�
/.A
4� �����U� ����V )� ��K
�(���U"
� ��� !�42� + �J�
"�E � d� �����<� ��e������<��� �
��5���

/ +�Y�������������E +�L ��������
� ��� ����2���
	�
"���� �"�� �����'	��*.�

/.�
4� ��
T�	
�� ����6	�� ����V )� ��K
�(������ ��� !�42� + �J�
"�E � d� ���E�	
�� + ���P	 �� � ���i �����
��e �������<����
��5���/+ �Y�������������E+ �L ��������
� �������2���
	 �
"���� �"�������'	��*.�

� /.=BC4������U�����V )���K
�(���U"
���� �����Q��
�)42�7#:�����Xx   xx  xx�

� 79:� +�J�
"�E� d� �����<� ����i �� ��e ���������� �������� �;� +�J�� �
������ Z ���� ��E ���
O�������+ �̀ �E J�F_���F�����������	����T ����� 
���������2���
	�
"���� �"�������'	 ��*.�

/.=�4���
T �	
������6	������V )���K
�(���U"
���U"
���)���
Y42��/������Xx   xx  xx�

�79:� + �J�
"�E � d� ���E �	 
�� + ���P	�� ����i �� ��e������<��� �
��5��� Z���� ��E ��� O�������
0���_�����+ �̀ �E J�F_�	 �����'��������	����<����
����
"�����2���� �����'	 ��*.�

Xx   xx  xx 
�

//4��	
������

����(��'��	
������UZ�&'�����	���)������ !�42�7#:��	
������ 
��� V �����	
����
+ �<(������+ �J�
"�E� d���	 ���������
��5���/+ �Y�������������E+ �L ��������
� ��� ����2���
	�
"���
� �"�������'	 ��*.� X � ��
� ��� �;� �� ������2� ��J���� 	�m� �6� e����L ���F�6	�� D
	 ��� w �E �pc	��
 ��
�� 
	 ��� ��<���+�J+��� �������'	 ��*��V �����	
������ 
��� V�� ���	
����+ �<(�����01�k �0 �
��]��� ����2����
� �����? �+��<
	����� ���	���4����� �"�,	����	���������
	�� 
��	�01��� ������2�




��

�

T ���� ������	 ���4���� � �"�, 	��  ��
�� 
	�� �V �� �� k �0��]����;� 3 
`����� �� � �E	 �F���
� 
V��w �E �(�W ��� V�� ��������	 ���4����� �"�,	�*���X �k �0��]��� �;�3 
`�	�� ��
�� 
	��
� 
V����
� ����;�+ �J+ ����������'	 ��*A�

Xx   xx  xx�
//= 4� ��	���)U"
� $��%&'� �
�(���� ? (�)� 42� 7#:� � ��������� �	 
���� � ��
� ��	 �� ����

� ������������� �� ����� ������������� � ������� �
��������� 7�	��*+�, :� �  !�
"������� 9CC$��� + �J��
�
�	 ��
 ��
�� 
	 ��G�<���� ���� �
����

(i) �	
����+�<(������-� d���	������6=�� V�� ��

(ii) �	
������
�
"���-� d���	������6=��V�� ��

(iii) � 
���4�A��	
������ 
�
"�����	 ������6�� ��������
���4�A��	 
���+�<(��������	������6�

�

B�O	�����(������� ��������������01c	��+�J�
"�E � d�� ��g������ �����3 5	 ��Q ������ !
"��01�+ �J��
�
��5���/+ �Y���ab	�����������E +�L ������	 ���	�01���������������� ����2���
	�
"�����"�������'	 ��*A�

� � +���
����� 
"�"���f� d� � ��g�
"���� O	��� � �(����56
��� T �e ��h� ������ ��01c	 �*01�� X ������
��	 ���
����� ����
	 ��� ���	�� +�J�
"�E 
	 ��� ��( ����'� +�J�� �
������ -
	 ��� ������ ��E+ �L ������
	 ���	�01�T �e��h� �<���������������� ����2���������'	 ��*��X 	���E ��@ �+�J����> 	���, 
"��01������� ��
�� ������������	��-��)�� �E�����;��
��5������E �����ab	�����������E +�L ��������2����������'	 �*�1.�

� ���(��'� �����(��#� � ���� &�"�!����W� ���U	�� ��Z��	�� [�	��� �
�"�	�� ������,�����
"
� ��P��
��	���)��\� ��S]D	�� �
��
�,�����W� � 
K��̂��U� $��%&'� �
�(��������W� B
���� � ������� � 	
*������\� [�	���
��T8 ����Z���
� �	�\���U"�8 _��(����	��*̀�

�

� ��1	��� +���
����� -� d� ��	 ��������� �	 
���� ��� 
�
"��� ���? ���
"��� ����>  
	�6� O	 ���
� �(������� ������ ��01�����;	 ���'� ����
"���
`�	�01�� O	��� � �(������� + �EW ���� !��� ���� ��
��01c���� ���
� �	�6��
��������'	��*A�

xx   xx  xx�
� //D4�� &P�)��
�(
)42�7#:����E �	 
��+ ���P	����
"��������� �(����'�-
	������P���E +�L ������
X �V ����
�������
	�
"����������'	 ��*.�

� 79:�3 + �B���
�+����3 +�B��� 
�	
����P�������<�����i ����e ������������������E �	 
��+���P	��
� ���i ����e������B�/� �<���� �(����'�-
	 ������P���E +�L ������X �V����
�������
	�
"����������'	 ��*.�

� /-4� �	
������
�� ��	���)���� ���(��'� �	
���� ��UZ�(C��� ��	���)���� 2� ?��U"
� ��7�,�,�8 � �
�(
)�
���(��'� ����
�(
)"�!��� ���(��'� �
a	�)5��,��� ���(��'� ?(��
� �Q��
�)"�!��42� @ � � !�
"�����	 �� � ��������
��̂ ��F�	���
"��� �������� ��E�����	
��<��F�	 �
V��(���������5���-��+ ���)�B�

� 7D :� �	
������
�� � ������� �	 
���� +�<(��_��� ��	����<��� + �J������5��� ��
� 
 !c	�
���
�
"������F�	�
V ��(���������5���-��+���)��V �� ��gF�E ���������X 	
���	 ��� ���F��F���'�T �g	��





�

�

+ �J
"�"�> � �
����
"��� � 	 ���� + �J�
"�E
	��� ��� 
���� -
	��� �����	 �� O	 ��� ��E ���� ��E +�L ������
��� �+ �J
"�"�> ��
����
"�����2��
"�"���;	 ���� ��
"���+�J
"�"�> ��6��0��	 ���'�+�J��gF�E �����<���
/ +�Y�������E +�L ������	 ���	�01�+ �J
"�"�> ��
������;���
	�
"����������'	 ��*.���������D�1���	����<��E �
� ����� T �?���� � ��4��������� ��]������01� ��,��� / �1	 �� +�E > �� �6� �����Qr����E 
� �� ������
� ������]
"�����2���T ��-	�6������'	��*.���������� 
V ��� ������������]
"�����2���"��� ��������
	�� 
��	�01�
��	 �����������
�
"����� � !
"���+ �J�� ����'�� ���������� 
��+ �J��
� 
������� ��� �E	 �0���D��� ��� ��������
� ������� ���
�� � ������
"����E 
� �� ��
����	 �� D��� ���  ������� � �� !��� / +�Y���ab	��� ��E +�L ������
� 
����� ����2���
	�
"�����"�� �����'	 ��*.�

� 7[:�D�1���	����<���B�

� 7i:� � � ����� ��� 
���� T �? ��	��	���'6� �������� ��� 
�
"��� ��� ����� � ���� �� ��b���T �?<
"���
�
"����c	 �� � ��	
��
����� ��G� ����5��6� ��? �	�� -����� ��� + �J��  ����'� -
	 ��� ������
��E +�L �������� �������� 
�����	�01�/ �����T �E�����? �����01��+ �J�� ����'�-
	��������	��O	 ���
��E ������E +�L ������ ��� 
�������
	�
"����������'	��*.�

� 7ii:� DF�1� ��	 ����<��� ���
�� +�J��
�
�� ����� �� D������  ������� ��E 	���� �������� ��� 
��
� ������
"��� �	����
����	��D��� ��� ����5��� ���
������;���
	 �
"��� �������'	 ��*.��

� 7c:� +�J�
"�E � d� ��	 ����� � V�� �� ��"�Q� ��	 ����� �������� � ����E 
 ��� � �c���� �� �V ����
� ���
[����	��� � ���������
� 	����	��������B�

Xx   xx  xx�
7iii:�##D �+ �J����> 	���, 
"��01���������������� ����2�cl���<��������� ��+�J�
"�E � d�� �"�QB

��	 �����������	 �<��
��5���� � � !
"��01���b	 ��g�
"���������+ �� ��
"�����1�� ����Z ��	���E �/	 �*01�
� 	���01� ��	 �<� � �E��������2� ��, ����E5������'� (�������� -��+ ���)�� + �J�� �
������ ����'� ������
��E +�L ��������� ���� �b	��g�
"����
�������T ����'��U����6������'	 ��*.xx�

7iv:�##[�+�J����> 	���, 
"��01������
� ��� ������ ������� ����2�cl���<�����������+�J�
"�E � d�
� ��g�
"���� ��	�<� �
��5��� �� � !
"��01� ��b	 ��g�
"��� � �����+ ����
"��� ��1������ Z��	���E � /	 �*01�
� 	���01� ��	�<� ��E ���� ����2� ��,����E 5������'� (�������� -��+ ���)�� + �J�� �
������ D������ ������
��E +�L ��������� ���� �b	��g�
"����
�������T ����'��U����6������'	 ��*.xx���

� 7cc:��	
�������
�
"���� ��������	
����+ �<(������+�J�
"�E � d���	���������� �"�c���/+ �Y���ab	���
������ ��E + �L ������ e������W �� ��P���J� + �J
"�"�> � �
����
"�����2� �
"������� T ��	�	�� <��
"��01�
cl���<�����T ����'��U����6������'	��*.�

Xx   xx  xx�
� 7/ :������
"������b��E
���+ �J
"�"�> �������
� 
	
�	 �01������
"�����	����<���B�

Xx   xx  xx� �

� 7iii:� �����
"���� �	 
���� � ��
���	�� ��	 �������� ��	 ������� �����
"�"�6	�*���� ��� 
�+���
� �����������
�	
����P�������� �E�	 ���
"�E
 ��=�




��

�

B�
�����	 �01� ��? �	�� -������
"�"���0 � � V�� �� ��?�	 �� T �E ������
"�"���0 � ��b0��� � ��E����
� �"���F�	 �� +�J
"�"�> ��5��� � ������� ������ ���E ���� ��"�,	 �� +�J
"�"�> ��5���� 7D :� i 
� �	�01�
� �(�)+ �,c	��	�������01�� ���������? �	��T �E��������
�����	�01����"���	�����E ������"���F�	��
+ �J
"�"�> ��5����� 
V��+�J
"�"�> ��5�����
	 �
"�����"�, 	���� �"���
"�"����	 ���	 ��-
	 ���O	�����
-
	 ��� � 
���	 �(��)� + �J
"�"�> � �
���������2� �������� ���"���	�� ���E ���� +�J
"�"�> � ��"���������
3 
`�������� +�w ����������
� 
	
�	 �01��� ����6��
"������� T ��	 �	�
V�����"���
����� �������
��?�	�� -����� 
"�"���;	 ��� ��]��	�01� ��
������  ����5��� + �J��  ������'� T � ��b	��� ��E +�L �������
� ������� ��?�	�� T �E ����� �� 
"�"���;	��� ��]��	�01� ��
������ + �J��  ������'� /+�Y���ab	��� ��E +�L ������
 ���
������;���
	�
"��� �������'	��*A�

Xx   xx  xx 
� 7T �e_:�+�J�
"�E � d���	 �������E �@ �����
 ����
������������
	�
"��� �������'	��*�B�

� 7i:�	�E ��� �> n�� ���������F_�+
�E ��_�������5��6��� ������ 
�<c	 ����e�h��5��6���"�c���
T � ��b	�����������E +�L �=�

� 7ii:�e������W ����P���J�� 
��������6�T � ��b	�����������E+ �L �.�

Xx   xx  xx 

�

�

 
 

�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�
�

�����<�� ���	 �JW �� 
"�����������y	
���� �
����E �����s 8������E �#9CR��8%CB+ �J�������#&����� �"�e_���9C#%�



 
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

SIXTH SESSION 
(ADJOURNED MEETINGS) 

 

THE KARNATAKA LEGISLATURE SALARIES, PENSIONS  
AND ALLOWANCES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015 

(L.A. Bill No. 03 of 2015) 
 

  

 A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions 
and  Allowances Act, 1956. 

 Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Legislature 
Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) for 
the purposes hereinafter appearing; 

 Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty-sixth 
year of the Republic of India, as follows:- 

 1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the 
Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances                        
(Amendment) Act, 2015. 

 (2) It shall come into force at once.  

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, 
Pensions and  Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957), (hereinafter 
referred to as the principal Act),  in section 3,-  

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "thirty thousand rupees", the 
words "fifty thousand rupees" and for the words "two lakhs 
rupees", the words  "three lakhs rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii)  in sub section (2), for the words "thirty thousand rupees", the 
words "fifty thousand rupees" and for the words "two lakhs 
rupees", the words  "three lakhs rupees" shall be substituted. 

3. Amendment of section 4. - In section 4 of the principal Act,- 

(i)   in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees",     

                     the words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be   

                     substituted; and 

 (ii)       for sub-section (2), the following shall be substituted,   

 namely:- 

"(2)   The Chairman or the Speaker who is entitled to a house rent 
allowance, shall be entitled for an allowance of twenty thousand 
rupees per mensem for maintenance and upkeep of the 



 2

residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included 
in such residence."   

4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the principal Act,  in 
sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty", the words "one 
thousand" shall be substituted. 

5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act,  in 
sub-section (1),  in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty", the 
words "one thousand " shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the principal Act, in sub 
section (2),- 

(i)   in item (b), for the words " twenty rupees ", the words "thirty 
rupees" shall be substituted. 

(ii)    in item (d), for the words "rupees one thousand", the words 
"rupees two thousand" shall be substituted. 

(iii) in first proviso, for the words "two thousand rupees per day for 
the days of journey and for the days of halt at any place", the 
words "two thousand five hundred rupees and five thousand 
rupees per diem for stay in hotel or other registered 
establishment providing lodging and boarding at scheduled 
rates subject to production of bills" shall be substituted. 

7. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the principal Act,- 

(i)    in sub-section (1), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the 
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii)   in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", 
the words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

8. Amendment of section 10A.- In section 10A of the principal Act,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the 
words "forty  thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the 
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

9. Amendment of section 10E.- In section 10E of the principal Act, 
for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the words "forty thousand rupees" 
shall be substituted. 

10. Amendment of section 10G.- In section 10G of the principal Act, 
in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres ", the words  
"one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

11. Amendment of section 10J.- In section 10J of the principal Act, 
for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the words "thirty five thousand 
rupees" shall be substituted. 

12. Amendment of section 10K.- In section 10K of the principal Act, 
for the words "twenty thousand rupees", the words "thirty five thousand 
rupees" shall be substituted. 



 3

13. Amendment of section 10L.- In section 10L of the principal Act, 
in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the words 
"one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

14. Amendment of section 10M.- In section 10M of the principal 
Act, in sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the 
words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted. 

15. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the principal Act, in 
sub-section (1), for the words ""twenty thousand rupees", the words "twenty 
five thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

16. Amendment of section 11A.- In section 11A of the Principal Act, 
in sub-section (1),- 

(a) in clause (iii), for the words " twenty five thousand rupees", the 
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b)  the first proviso shall be omitted; 

(c) in third proviso, after the word "member", the words "elected for the 
first time" shall be inserted; 

(d) after seventh proviso and before Explanation, the following shall be 
inserted, namely:- 

"Provided also that where any person has served for more 
than five years there shall be paid to him an additional pension at 
the rate of rupees one thousand per mensem for every subsequent 
completed year".  

 17. Amendment of section 11C.- In section 11C of the principal 
Act,- 

(i)  in sub-section (1), for the words "one lakh rupees ", the 
words "two lakhs rupees" shall be substituted. 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "one lakh rupees", the 
words "two lakhs rupees" shall be substituted. 

18. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the principal Act,- 

(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

  "(a) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative 
Assembly and of the Legislative Council traveling allowance for 
journeys at the rate of twenty five rupees per kilometre irrespective 
of mode of journey subject to such conditions as may be prescribed 
or fixed traveling allowance rupees one thousand five hundred for 
each meeting in lieu of traveling allowance calculated on the basis 
of distance traveled in kilometers." 

(ii) in clause (b),- 

(a)  in sub-clause (i),  for the words "one thousand rupees", the 
words "two thousand rupees" and for the words "one thousand 
five hundred rupees",  the words  "two thousand five hundred 
rupees and five thousand rupees per diem for stay in hotel or 



 4

other registered establishment providing boarding and lodging at 
scheduled tariffs subject to production of bills and also one 
thousand five hundred rupees towards local transport " shall be 
substituted; 

(b) after sub-clause (ii), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(iii) In respect of study tours abroad the T.A. claims of the 
members shall be regulated as per G.O.No. FD 3 SRA 
2011, dated: 15.11.2011 as amended from time to time." 

(iii) in clause (c),- 

(a)  in sub-clause (iii),  for the words "rupees four thousand", the 
words "rupees five thousand" shall be substituted. 

(b) for sub-clause (iv), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(iv) Every person who is drawing family pension under 
section 11B shall be entitled to rupees two thousand five 
hundred per month as fixed medical allowance." 

 (iv) in clause (cc), for the words "rupees twenty five thousand" the 
words "rupees forty thousand"  shall be substituted. 

(v) in clause (e), in sub-clause (iii), after the words "at the rates 
specified in clause (a)", the words  "and for journeys by air within 
the state and outside the state in India actual air fare shall be 
paid" shall be inserted. 

(v) in clause (h),  

(a) in sub-clause (i), for the words "fifteen thousand rupees", the 
words "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

(b) in sub-clause (ii), for the words "fifteen thousand rupees", the 
words "forty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

 

 

  



 5

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

 

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. Therefore, it is 

considered necessary to enhance the salaries and allowances of the 

parliamentary functionaries and the legislators and certain other benefits by 

amending the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and Allowances Act, 

1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957). 

 

Hence, the Bill. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 6

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 
 

 

 There will be a recurring approximate additional expenditure of Rs.44 

crores per annum from the proposed legislative measure. 

 
 
 

T.B.JAYACHANDRA 
Minister for Law, Parliamentary Affairs 

Animal Husbandry and Muzarai 
 
 

P. OMPRAKASHA 
Secretary 

Karnataka Legislative Assembly 
 

 



 7

ANNEXURE 

Extract from the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and 
Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 2 of 1957) 

 

xx   xx   xx 

3. Salaries and sumptuary allowances of Chairman and Speaker.- 
(1) There shall be paid to the Chairman a salary of thirty thousand rupees 
per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of two lakhs rupees per annum.  

(2) There shall be paid to the Speaker a salary of Thirty thousand 
rupees per mensem and a sumptuary allowance of two lakhs rupees per 
annum. 

4. Residences of Chairman, Speaker etc.,.- (1) The Chairman,. 
Speaker, Deputy Chairman, Deputy Speaker, Leader of Opposition, 
Government Chief Whip and Opposition Chief Whip each shall be entitled to 
the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore within thirty 
kilometers from the limits of the City of Bangalore throughout his term of 
office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or, in lieu of 
such furnished residence, to a house rent allowance at the rate of forty 
thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-
section shall be furnished on such scales and the plinth area thereof shall 
not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed. 

(2) In a residence used by the Chairman or the Speaker, who is 
entitled to a house rent allowance in lieu of furnished residence, three rooms 
shall be furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be 
prescribed, to be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an 
allowance of ten thousand rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep of 
the residence and for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such 
residence. 

 

5. Conveyances of the Chairman and the Speaker.- (1) xx  
 xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to the Chairman and the Speaker each a 
conveyance allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of 
petrol per mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 

6. Charges payable by the Chairman and the Speaker and the 
Government.- (1) The Chairman and the Speaker shall, in respect of their 
respective residences and the motor cars allotted for their use under sub-
section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable to pay the following charges, 
namely:—  

(a) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of 
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government; 
and 



 8

xx   xx   xx 

8. Travelling and other allowances of the Chairman, the Deputy 
Chairman, the Speaker and the 1[Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the 
Opposition ,the Government Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief 
Whips on tours.-(1) xx  xx   xx 

(2) While touring inside India]1the Chairman, the Deputy Chairman, 
the Speaker and the Deputy Speaker, the Leaders of the Opposition,the 
Government Chief Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips shall be 
entitled,—  

xx   xx   xx 

 (b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at twenty rupees per 
kilometre; 

xx   xx   xx 

(d) to daily allowance at rupees one thousand per day for the days of 
journey and for the days of halt at any place:  

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily 
allowance shall be at two thousand rupees per day for the days of journey 
and for the days of halt at any place: 

xx   xx   xx 

10. Salaries of Deputy Chairman and Deputy Speaker.- (1) There 
shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and to the Deputy Speaker each a 
salary of twenty thousand rupees per mensem. 

(2) There shall be paid to the Deputy Chairman and the Deputy 
Speaker a conveyance allowance of equal to the cost of seven hundred and 
fifty litres of petrol per mensem. 

10A. Salary, conveyance and conveyance allowance payable to 
the Deputy Chairman, Deputy Speaker or the person performing the 
duties of the Chairman or Speaker.- (1) Notwithstanding anything 
contained in this Act, while the office of the Chairman is vacant and the 
duties of the said office are performed by the Deputy Chairman or a member 
of the Legislative Council appointed under clause (1) of Article 184 of the 
Constitution, the Deputy Chairman or such member, shall, during the 
period he so performs such duties, be paid a salary of twenty thousand 
rupees] per mensem and provided with a suitable motor car and paid 
conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions of sections 5 and 6: 

xx   xx   xx 

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, while the office of 
the Speaker is vacant and the duties of the office are performed by the 
Deputy Speaker or member of the Legislative Assembly appointed under 
clause (1) of Article 180 of the Constitution, the Deputy Speaker or such 
member shall, during the period he so performs such duties, be paid salary 
of 2[1[twenty thousand rupees]1]2 per mensem and provided with a suitable 



 9

motor car and paid conveyance allowance in accordance with the provisions 
of sections 5 and 6: 

xx   xx   xx 

10E. Salary to the Leader of the Opposition.-  There shall be paid 
to each Leader of the Opposition a salary of twenty thousand rupees per 
mensem. 

xx   xx   xx 
 

10G. Conveyance for the Leader of the Opposition.- (1) The State 
Government may provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Leader of 
the Opposition.  

(2) There shall be paid to each Leader of the Opposition a conveyance 
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per 
mensem. 

10J. Salary to the Government Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to 
each Government Chief Whip a salary of twenty thousand rupees per 
mensem.  

10K. Salary to the Opposition Chief Whip.- There shall be paid to 
each Opposition Chief Whip a salary of twenty thousand rupees per 
mensem. 

10L. Conveyance for the Government Chief Whip.- (1) 

 xx   xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to each Government Chief Whip a conveyance 
allowance 1[equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per 
mensem 

10M. Conveyance for the Opposition Chief Whip.- (1) 

       xx   xx   xx 

(2) There shall be paid to each Opposition Chief Whip a conveyance 
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres]3 of petrol per 
mensem. 

       xx   xx   xx 

11. Salary of members of the Legislative Assembly and the 
Legislative Council.- (1) There shall be paid to every member of the 
Legislative Assembly or of the Legislative Council a salary of twenty 
thousand rupees per mensem which shall accrue to him from the day on 
which he is declared duly elected, or, in the case of a member nominated by 
the Governor to fill a seat in the Legislative Assembly or the Legislative 
Council, from the date on which he is so nominated, or, if such declaration 
or nomination is made before the vacancy occurs, from the date of 
occurrence of the vacancy: 

 

       xx   xx   xx 

 



 10

11A. Pension to the members etc.- (1) With effect from the date of 
commencement of the Karnataka Legislature Salaries, Pensions and 
Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2009 there shall be paid to every person who 
has served for a period of five years as,- 

(i) a member of the Legislative Council; or  

(ii)  a member of the Legislative Assembly; or 

(iii)   partly as a member of the Legislative Assembly and partly as a 
member of the Legislative Council, a pension at the rate of 
4[3[twenty-five thousand]4 rupees]3 per mensem for the 
remainder of his life:  

Provided that where any person has served for more than five years 
there shall be paid to him an additional pension at the rate of rupees one 
thousand per mensem for every subsequent completed year so however that 
the total amount of pension payable under this section does not exceed 
thirty five thousand rupees per mensem.  

Provided further that service as such member for a part of the year 
exceeding six months shall be treated as a full year for the purpose of 
calculating additional pension:  

Provided also that where a member has been prevented from serving 
as such for five years on account of dissolution of the Legislative Assembly, 
he shall be deemed to have served as member for five years: 

 

xx   xx   xx 

11C. Sumptuary allowance.- (1) The Leaders of the Opposition shall 
be paid a sumptuary allowance of one lakh rupees per annum.  

(2) The Deputy Chairman, the Deputy Speaker, the Government Chief 
Whips and the Opposition Chief Whips shall be paid a sumptuary allowance 
of one lakh rupees per annum. 

xx   xx   xx 

12. Travelling and daily allowances of, and medical  and other 
facilities to, members of the Legislative Assembly and the Legislative 
Council.- Subject to such conditions as may be determined by rules made 
under this Act,—  

(a) there shall be paid to the members of the Legislative Assembly and 
of the Legislative Council traveling allowance for journeys at the rate of 
twenty rupees per kilometre irrespective of mode of journey subject to such 
conditions as may be prescribed  or fixed traveling allowance rupees one 
thousand five hundred for each meeting in lieu of traveling allowance 
calculated on the basis of distance traveled in kilometers and all the 



 11

members be provided with fully furnished accommodation, without payment 
of rent, at the place at which their attendance is required and where such 
accommodation is not provided, the member shall be paid an allowance of 
twenty five rupees per diem during the period of the meeting and for two 
days before the commencement of meeting and for two days after the day of 
conclusion of meetings. 

(b) there shall be paid,—  

 (i) to all members daily allowance for attending the meetings and for 
the prescribed number of days of holidays, intervals or absence between 
meetings at the rate of one thousand rupees per-diem within the State and 
one thousand five hundred rupees per-diem outside the State in India; 

(ii) to all members daily allowance for two days before the 
commencement of meetings and for two days after the day of conclusion of 
the meetings. 

(c) Every member or on ex-member and the members of his family who 
are residing with and are dependent on him shall be entitled,— 

xx   xx   xx 

(iii) every ex-member who is in receipt of the pension under section 
11A shall be entitled to fixed medical allowance of rupees four thousand per 
month, subject to the condition that the said amount shall be deducted in 
the medical reimbursement claim if any during the said month. 

(iv) Every person who is drawing family pension under section 11B 
shall be entitled to rupees two thousand per month as fixed medical 
allowance, subject to the condition that the amount already reimbursed 
through the medical reimbursement claim if any during the said month, 
shall be deducted from the fixed medical allowance. 

(cc) Every member of the Legislative Assembly and of the Legislative 
Council shall be entitled to receive in the prescribed manner, a sum of 
rupees twenty five thousand per month as constituency Traveling Allowance 

xx   xx   xx 

(e) there shall be paid to the members of a committee, in respect of 
journeys undertaken by the committee,—  

xx   xx   xx 

(iii) with the approval of the Chairman and the Speaker, where the 
committee is a committee of members of both Houses, of the Legislature, 
travelling allowance for journeys by train and for journeys by road whether 
within the State or outside the State in India, at the rates specified in clause 
(a) and for journeys by air outside the State in India at the rate of one and 



 12

one-fifth times the single air fare paid for such journeys and such insurance 
premium as may be prescribed for insurance against accidents during such 
journeys by air and daily allowance of rupees fifteen per diem for the days of 
halt at any place within the State and at rupees twenty-five per diem for the 
days of halt at any place outside the State: 

 

xx   xx   xx 

(h) every member shall be paid an allowance of,—  

(i) fifteen thousand rupees per month towards meeting the 
expenditure incurred by him on telephone and cell phone calls 

 (ii) fifteen thousand rupees per month as constituency allowances;  

 

xx   xx   xx 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bangalore, P7, W.D.1204 Copies 750, 16th March, 2015 


