samqﬁc AN T
30RC WRFNESS
(T[T VTR e3R)
FTOFWE TITTONY Bowened T qs%mi (SBW=R) NPee»s, 2015
(20158 QgRRiod Qgieodhs Bosd - 16)

BIVFWE  DUWITONG  FOWIND DB FENY  WRIODID, 19563, =TT,
SNTR  TREL 20T DFIECNE.

QY VI, W|NVOT TOWWIE YV EINOMON FTOFLT BWHNY FOWINW
B PHINRY LPIONT, 19563, (19570 3IpFET LHRICNT 5) IR, SHIP
VR O3NFFNVRYTOOT;

YW,  yPTT NeTIRE  WOETOIC BRETY  FDOFWT  Ov
DTOIOTONOT B3 BNOOTOZ HAONNIToND:—

1. o3I IAT DY T;PoF.— (1) 33 LHIODTBJIZ), TIDFLT FWITONE
BOWTNED ) PINY (STHRIR) VRIODI, 2015 20T ITONITT),

(2) 3, 7 D 11Je  TFTeonw 201435 WFE  TpQOOT 20N
2ODTYTON PRI W) AIT LOTOTN 33 BRESe OR WTIZR,

2. 33 TPONW SHIR.- TIOFLT DUSONE  BOWINWD W, PINY
©OIODI, 19563 (19570 Borwd ©wOIOHT 5) (VY ANFTVOT TR
DRAODTPWOT YVGeDFSRNT), 33¢ BFTLTY,—

(i) "SHR=E) ToNT SRTONNDL" 02 JTAYR 0T FNT CRTONRL"
DO TTNYD, BESRCBITITY,

(ii) "faa?géwa AORT TRTOONY" D0 TTREN "SOTB) TONT TRTTONNY"
DO TTNYD), BESRCBITITY,

(iii)) "wo®» OIT NVTB) AT TRTWOVNY" 20w TTINYR WD ©F
SRTDONNT" D0 THINTI), TSCIRBIITI.

3. 4%%¢ TJFOHOT SWNIR.—~ FRY WHRIODTT 43¢ JFTTY,—



(D) (DJe WTHJFTRTY, “TOTB TONT TRTOINE” H0W ITNYR
“R0PT) AT TRTDONNT” D02 JINEI, TS03ReBITII;

(2) (2)Be WTTJFTRTY, T AT THTROWNT” D0V TITASR “"QTB
TONT TRTDONNT” 20w TTRFR, TSOIRRTIZR;

4. 53¢ TFOHRT IR~ DDRY  LRINIDT  SIe TpOT  (2)J¢
NTTEIRTY, "NV [RT 0B[B. D" D00 TTINYR "2.0T0 TNT  Deed”
D0 TTNYD, BESRCBITITY;

5. 63¢c T3ORE SWMWIR.- RO WRIOPWT  63¢  TOT  (1)Ie
NTTFIRT (D) PRTY, "W TeT 0B JewdW" D0 IJTNONR "2.0TD TONT
D" D0V TTNYR, BESARCRTBZT,

6. 6 TFTEITW ITHIR.~ TRV VHICDWT 6 BJFTDY,~

(i) ‘TOTOTL AT CRTPOWNAT" D02 TTRYR  "WRBE [T DT
SRTDONNT" D0 THINTI), TSCIRBIITI; [

(ii) "©028) TNT TRTIONNAY" 2O BJHNYR "VTE ©F TRITWOWNAY" D0
wcﬁmfﬁb& @éoﬁmez&ﬁéb@cﬁ%

7. 62 TJTOT acs%m.- RO VRICNRT 62 TFTRTY,—

() (DIe  WTTTORTY  “"TOB/B) TWIT  THTONNY” Q00  JITAOR

“R0WB) FODNT TRTOWNY” D0 TITNYDY, BSSRCRITITY;

(i) (2)3e WTTFORTY "B TWNT SRTPONNT” 0L JTAPR "9,

[ONIT TRTDONNE” 20w TTBRED, TSIRERTIZTR,

8. 62 JFCHD IR~ RO LRICHIT 68  TFoen  (2)3e
NTTJFTRTY, "D [T 0TF Jeadd" D00 TTAYR "0 TRT Dedd”
D0 TTNYDY, BESRCBITITY;

9. 6B TBTRT STHNIR.~ FWRY WHRACHIT 68 TFTT (1)Ie HTHJFTT
(2) RVTY, "VN THPT IR OeTDNRYN0S" D02 TTAVR  "2.0T0  TONT
DeTORAYNOT" 20w TTRTR, TESERCRTIZTY.

10. 7S¢ TFSHT STHIR.— FRO VHACIT 7S¢ BFTTY,—

=0

(i) TOTOLY, AT TRTVONNT" 20w ITNR "WRTH, FRT
SRTONNT" D0 THINTI), TSCIRBIITI; [



(i) "©0=8) LT TeTRCAY" D0 TTAYR "0 O3 DT [T
SRIVCVNE" 0 wcﬁmﬂfn& @éo&@e&%ﬁé%ﬁ%

11. 8¢ T[FTOTW STHNJ[R.~ FWRY WRICHTT 8Z¢ TFTTY,—

(D (DJe ITTFORTRY  "TOTIH, AT TRTPOVNT” Q00 JITRON
“R0WB TORNT TRITVOWNE” D0 TTNYIY, BESRCRITITY; [T

(i)  (2)Be WBTTITY T TOLT TRTVOWNY” Q0L JTRENR 9T,
TONT CHTVONNT” 0w TTRFR), TS0IRBTIFI).

12. 98¢ JFOHT SWWIR.- RO WRIORIT 93¢ JsTm  (2)Je
NTTJFTRTY, "N IRT 0B DeWTR" 202 IJINYR WO TNT Do R"
DO TTNY, BESRCBITITY,

13. 103¢ J3Oe® STIR.— RO HHAONIT  108e TISem  ()e
NTTFTRT (D) PVITY, VW TeT 2R DedW" D02 IJTNYTR "2,0TD TONT
D" DOV TTNER, BESARCRTBZT,

14. 128 JBORE SMIR.—- RO WHANIDT  128¢ JFores  (2)e
PVTTFTRTY,~

-0

() () PRI "B TRTRR” Q00 IJTNIR “TRFB), ST
DROW TTNYDY, BIRRCRITZTY; OB

(i) (®) DPVTY w0 TWWATT VT [RTD TRTPOWNY” 202 TJTAYR
“RT@ AT CRITDOWNT” D02 JHINTT), TSCSRBIITI.

(iii) Becode JCoITY "HCEW TNT TRTOVNRW" 00  TTAER
“RTE AONTT DWW IRT CRIPORADRT D0 DTNYY,
BIARERTBZTR,

(iv) Q0BJe JT0DTT SHTON T3 RVODT momwmol ﬂe@ﬁé%&cﬁ%
N0TT:—

VYT TTOBD, TORTW BHONT TIOIT FOTHPFTY, ST
ODARBE TONYY 0L ) BIASODT), WBNAB BRI VT
SR0TE ROFONY WWIRELORTY, SIH WRNTR, wINWYTY,
LETEY, 2O @5% DT TOAT  TRIROWNY @sw%ﬁ
OTE TPNTTTT,"



engwﬁeé: 2y FTING oI

BT ReBT ITTTTO [IPBY TR, BBIDNST. SNADOINY,
BWBONY, Toz, MISNY I T BUWITOAY WY NI FINeN, WY
PONOT TOFOADVRDY. STOOT, BOWY, WIRN F3, BT, F, DT
PIAD  YTONY  TOFTWMON  TIvFWS AWBRNT  TOWSNH D) HINY
VHOICDT, 19563, SHIR BPEHPYTH WTJII0W TONETREONT.

BTOOT B4 QDTICON3.



BRET @wa T3,

TAINT TROOT BTG JREE WIP 3.50 docwd TRTICWNY SHFT B[BT)

womma;d.

AT TR 03y
BAIOSNED

Q. WOTF3
TOORETEE
TOFWT QTS B



BROWOF
FTOFWE TUISTONY Bowenwd T z;ésrieé HRICHT, 19563
(19573 3Toreds PRI 5) wd%s won

XX XX XX

3. [ooFHoORTT I RUTTAE  Boweneh.— TN IWoZoDTOR TS
SON TRJZ) AINT SHTVORNAWD I TB0dwe) FW[OR BIPTBOIPI TF ;T
TONT SHTVONNE FOWYTD), TR JPIITT), VLT, B8 B[RFF, WO VI
DV TNT TRTONNY BIF, PIODZ, AT TR BIPTITT),

XX XX XX

4. WETT AR~ (1) TEoIey, FWIWL, LONUAD  INCTY IR,
VRTTVIL AWR ITF DT AT IHOONT  WOBD DINY  ©BHODHTN
WALZ AT, WERL P WOF AIPT WO BIR ZOB FRT
SRTPONNY  TTTY I RN PO, TBONW  BRYFOINTITZ. B3
WOTTFTOW TR LTBNILRT  TFF)  JONRIWTVTRT  WOT N30T,
SNETITTQ.

(2) AALE J0E wTORN DI RN PHIF IRY FWITD  WIAD
ATRTY, VHTZ NTeINY LFEMN, VONNIIT ©OF WFBZoDNY OO, BFOFTH)
DR FREBNTI), WALIARPATIT), WIH BE S0NWD, VAT IVFIH 0B
BEBON WD) WOF JIWATY YWT SRCUNT DTYFT W) ITETHMON  TH)
TOIT TRTVONNY HER BRYBONTITI,.

XX XX XX
5. BBIZHAYR IS ﬂavz%mfo.— XX XX XX

(2) |ECIRY BWTONL TS S0NW D IRTE DB[H) Dewdd Jipee”
RO AT T PO, TOWS TPTITTY;

XX XX XX
6. TIJTL T, TFPFTH) TOWRH  TRTRBCTT d’ageﬂeﬁo.— €)) @éoﬁma&
RWIT, 43¢ TFOT (DIJe wOFT  TTORT @D ST TITOT  [deSR,  ©R[T
QYEMON  TOWEOIPT  DWF W) P[RR FTOT  FOWOFTY, Ty B[VODT
m;;ﬁmo\ TOTOOD [PTELD u%@ﬁd@’@d&, QOTT:—

(D) FTWFTP BOTVOH [T DD I B[ Jedd  Bdpeer
BSNog Byrioden B Peewpdd INIR weIT Bedpeds B

XX XX XX
6. Tow, BUITINE Mowsnh.— Todey) OTvw, BWIOR T onen
TOTID AONT CRTVONNAT FOWY T TG THREF QOWIT) TAT TRITICWNY
B3P, BT, FOTOOD [RTWITI.

XX XX XX



6. Tz TITTORY AIWAND.~ (1) Tode), BWIW, Bonvnd INTBY
3R, WHTTIRH QT ITT DT ATE TWZOONT WTHZY DOING WBHODITN
WALZ JTWATI), WIRLY UPI® WOF AWALIZ WO 23R ZORB BWOT
SeReRNY  ITTY DI RN PIONT), JHODW  TRVFWOINTTIT; S
QUTHFTEOT T WBNIAGT Je0FF) JONWBWTVTOT WOF BFB0NTHNTTIT)
B VT ELVTVONT DREEDF Y JCNBWTTOT WEN0ZT TR ATIZT Q.

(2) AALE J0F wTORN DI RN PHIF IRY FWITD WD
ATRTY, VHTZ NTEINY LFEMN, VONNIRT WOF WFBZoDNY Do, BFOFTH)
DR FREBNYI, WALIRAVRIZE, BT TE S0NH, IT IVFIH D)
BEBON W) WO JIWATY YT IRCWNT DTYFT W) ITETHMN  TH)
TONT TRTVONNY HER BRYVTNTBTI,.

XX XX XX
6. TO%, TUIONYR TS Pognw.—~ (1) O, IFOFTFY, TSR, Tox,
Be$TOMR WYEMON BRTTT [RCERT FoTU, LBNITT,
(2) B3Ry, Tvt WSTONL TG 0T D0 3pTY T Jewsdd FEdpee”
BSR ADTT BT PIODI, FOWOOD BRTBIFI.

XX XX XX
6R. To% TUET DT TWET Toweod Hewesn SEnw.~ (1) D3ode)
Do, AWBL, 60 Tpoeew ()Se LOT BJFTHTW WY 63 TIOLH T ©IT
QYEMON  TOWIOIPT  JWOR  WFY  FectPT  FOT  BOWOFTY T BPOOI
SBYNI, 0TS TPTELD wzfgpmﬁdé'u;d%, QOTT,—

(2) O[T BRERT PWNYR LNTTRAT Jpe S0 DD 3L
DB JeWPAYNOT  BHTY, T,  IFETH  FOWOOD
BRBISFI,
XX XX XX
7. oOF BITTRE BOWER.~  TSOIRY, WOT AWBOMR [T TOIOLY,
AOWNT TRITDOVNE FOWY TV OXFT WTNB) TNT TRTVONNY Qﬁ%(;ﬁs aﬁésﬁ@éaiaol
BOTROD [PTBIZT,

XX XX XX

8. T MITTHAE dAND.—~ (1) TSIy VT FWBP, X, VHTTIHY
QIR TIT T JTW IWFONT WTTB OING WTHONHJTR L30NYRT> INTTIY
WALZ AT, WERL P WOF AIPT WO BIR FOB TRT
SRTPONNY TTTY DS AR FIODT, TIONW JRFDTOINTITT. 83 YO
TBOOT TN 2BNALRT DA JONNFLTTOTOT @%ﬁéo&@:)ﬁdéici% BB
WTT BELOTVONT DALEIFY VONVNAWTVTOT WSNOT T BTSZH L.

(2) AL R WILEN DI AN FIF TRY 0ok, AWBTD WA
QTITY, VHTZ YT EINT WHFMN, JODWTLRT WOF BFI0NY Tvts, XFOFTHY)
TR BREBAYI, WAFZBRRVITIT), ©IW T 30NN, IT ITFIEH D)



gzé)émﬁ DB ©oF JWFTY VT RN NSDRSIIOWEN] DV/FTTMON T,
TOT TRTPONNY HER BRYBONTITI..

XX XX XX
9. X TWTOR TS Pognd.- (1) Ok IWETPH TSRY, WO
Be$TOMR WYEMON BT BRI Fo0, LBNTIZ,
(2) TeRhwy, T AFWIOMR TS 0MW QW IR0 T Jewo
BDTT DR BER FNTT WBI FPOY, PIODT), TR SRBIZR,

XX XX XX
10. 0T BT I To% IHESH) Howeoh IprBews Hdnwh.- (1)
BIARY, LOT I, 8Je TFoeew (DJe wOT TTOW WY 9¢ BT
D0e3R O[T WEIMPN TOWIIRT VR B [PRCEPT. TOT BOWORTY, B4
BROOT [YNRTRY, BOTOH B[IBED wc;pmﬁdéi%ci%, QROTTB:—

(R) ©OTTIT BDHCEEDTD TOTNPT TTOF Tag) ROWROD TRRT DL IR
0@ Dersdd Bedpernod IR wean Jdeeds S

XX XX XX
12. TrRITOILIRR T Iy 9IS PR~ XX XX XX
(2) @033 ITTOT eS ToF [PWWON  BESRRY, FWBD, T,
T[S WP YOT BT,

(@) BOF DRwE [RBGET ToIweenemon ¢ FOIY OPITT O
TEFOD 2.0 TOIREd BOTW DTBORE, THYHOONTZTTY;

() TROD TROF TOIw [pRTeR BE R0 BTI) SRTOW
o7 daém dd%é BRFBOINTIZ,.

(R) DBRIT DRVT [PWT JOIWEITN, WOF TOIWENF, FOWOOD [PRT
20T TTT B 20T DTIE 20T PONDR, W) WOF TOITENT Slelntataaly)
OTTIN PVORTY QTN ANOTRAT QDTIDIOB o
BRYTOINTIII;

(B) To3T OINMN DI 03R)TIe ;3@@553@2 m@m&@@%w @%@5%&
WOT TONTT VT IRV CRIVOWNY aswésﬁ@ﬁ TRYD/OINTIZI:

T30, TR XROR BRET THoANY ROTHFNYY TOIWRT  OINIR
BB o3PTe 5@@553@2 w@mﬁme};ﬁ ol @5%& NTE  TORNT TRV
aswééoswﬂdéﬁd%:

IR TTOD, ALPTE, FI, epi REW OTP QT BWB[OI, cmszscj
WIHNYOTD TONLBIT ROTHFNRYY, WHTW, TOBT WIH DO TONBRRTOT
wOMN @5253235 FOLUGRNTE) mwm& TDT, THOPL 56%%5@?\63%63%

XX XX XX

TFFO BNTFHOOD, WHA A0F, BONYRD, &7, TAL , 750-T3nsh 283e &owesrs, 2015



KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
SIXTH SESSION
(ADJOURNED MEETINGS)

THE KARNATAKA MINISTERS SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
(L.A. Bill No. 16 of 2015)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1956.

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Ministers
Salaries and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957) for the

purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the
sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) Sections 3, 7 and 11 shall be deemed to have come into force on 4th

day of March 2014 and other provisions shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3.- In the Karnataka Ministers Salaries
and Allowances Act, 1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957), (hereinafter referred to

as the principal Act), in section 3,-

(1) for the words "thirty thousand rupees" the words, "fifty

thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words "twenty five thousand rupees" the words, " forty

thousand rupees" ; and

(iii) for the words "one lakh fifty thousand rupees" the words, "three

lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4.- In section 4 of the principal Act,-



(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “fourty thousand rupees”,
the words “eighty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;
(2) in sub-section (2), for the words, “ten thousand rupees”, the
words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
4. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres " the words,

"one thousand litres" shall be substituted.
5. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act,

in sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres",

the words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted.
6. Amendment of section 6A.- In section 6A of the principal Act,-

(i) for the words "sixteen thousand rupees", the words "thirty five

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and

(ii) for the words "eighty thousand rupees", the words "two lakhs
rupees" shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of section 6B.- In section 6B of the principal Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “forty thousand rupees”, the

words “eighty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words, “ten thousand rupees”, the

words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 6C.- In section 6C of the principal Act, in

sub section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres ", the words

one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 6D.- In section 6D of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the

words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted.
10. Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the principal Act,-

(i) for the words "fourteen thousand rupees", the words "thirty

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and



(ii) for the words "sixty thousand rupees", the words "one lakh fifty

thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of section 8.- In section 8 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "forty thousand rupees", the

words "eighty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words "ten thousand rupees" the

words, "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 9.- In section 9 of the principal Act, in

sub-section (2), for the words "seven hundred and fifty litres", the words

"one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

13. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the principal Act, in

sub-section (1), in item (a), for the words "seven hundred fifty litres", the

words "one thousand litres" shall be substituted.

14. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the principal Act, in

sub-section (2),-

(i)

(ii)

(iii)

(iv)

in item (b), for the words "twenty rupees", the words "thirty

rupees" shall be substituted;

in item (d), for the words "one thousand five hundred rupees",

the words "two thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

in first proviso, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words

"two thousand five hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

after second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,

namely:-

"Provided also that in case of tour outside the state where
he has stayed in a hotel or registered establishment providing
boarding and loadging at scheduled rates, he shall be entitled
for daily allowance of rupees five thousand per day subject to

production of bills."



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASON

There is a considerable increase in the cost of living. The salary and
allowances to the Chief Minister, Ministers, Ministers of State and Deputy
Ministers have not been revised since a long time. Therefore, it is
considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and
Allowances Act, 1956 for revision of salary, house rent allowance,

sumptuary allowance, conveyance allowances etc.,

Hence, the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There will be an approximate annual expenditure of Rs. 3.50 Crores

by the proposed measure.

SIDDARAMAIAH
Chief Minister

P. OMPRAKASHA
Secretary
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE
Extract from the Karnataka Ministers Salaries and Allowances, Act,
1956 (Karnataka Act 5 of 1957)

XX XX XX

3. Salaries of Chief Minister and Ministers.- There shall be paid to
the Chief Minister a salary of thirty thousand rupees per mensem and to
each Minister a salary of twenty five thousand rupees per mensem. They
shall also be paid a sumptuary allowance of one lakh fifty thousand rupees
per annum.

XX XX XX

4. Residences of Ministers.- (1) Each Minister shall be entitled, to
the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore throughout his
term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately thereafter, or in lieu
of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance at the rate of fourty
thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under this sub-
section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth area thereof shall
not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by a Minister who is entitled to a house rent
allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be furnished by
the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to be used for
official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten thousand
rupees per month for maintenance and upkeep of residence and for layout
and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XX XX XX
5. Conveyances for Ministers.- xx XX XX

(2) There shall be paid to each Minister a conveyance allowance equal
to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per mensem.

XX XX XX

6. Charges payable by the Minister and the Government.- (1) Each
Minister shall in respect of the residence and motor car allotted for his use
under sub-section (1) of section 4 and section 5, be liable to pay the
following charges, namely:—

(@) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government

XX XX XX

6A. Salaries of Ministers of State.- There shall be paid to each
Minister of State a salary of sixteen thousand rupees per mensem and a
sumptuary allowance of eighty thousand rupees per annum

XX XX XX



6B. Residences of Ministers of State.- (1) Each Minister of State shall
be entitled, to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore
throughout his term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately
thereafter, or in lieu of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance
at the rate of forty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided
under this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales, and the plinth
area thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by a Minister of State who is entitled to a house
rent allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be
furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to
be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten
thousand rupees per month for maintenance and up keep of residence and
for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XX XX XX

6C. Conveyance for Ministers of State.- (1) The State Government
may provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Minister of State.

(2) There shall be paid to each Minister of State a conveyance
allowance equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per
mensem.

XX XX XX

6D. Charges payable by the Minister of State and the
Government.- (1) Each Minister of State shall in respect of the residence
and motor car allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of section 6B and
section 6C, be liable to pay the following charges, namely:—

(@) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of
the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government

XX XX XX

7. Salaries of Deputy Ministers.- There shall be paid to each Deputy
Minister a salary of fourteen thousand rupees per mensem and a sumptuary
allowance of sixty thousand rupees per annum.

XX XX XX

8. Residences of Deputy Ministers.- (1) Each Deputy Minister shall
be entitled to the use of a furnished residence in the City of Bangalore
throughout his term of office and for a period of sixty days immediately
thereafter or in lieu of such furnished residence to a house rent allowance at
the rate of forty thousand rupees per mensem. The residence provided under
this sub-section shall be furnished on such scales and the plinth area
thereof shall not exceed such limits, as may be prescribed.

(2) In a residence used by a Deputy Minister who is entitled to a house
rent allowance in lieu of a furnished residence, three rooms shall be
furnished by the State Government on such scales as may be prescribed, to
be used for official purposes. He shall be entitled for an allowance of ten



thousand rupees per month for maintenance and up keep of residence and
for layout and maintenance of gardens included in such residence.

XX XX XX

9. Conveyance for Deputy Ministers.- (1) The State Government may
provide a suitable motor car for the use of each Deputy Minister.

(2) There shall be paid to each Deputy Minister a conveyance allowance
equal to the cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol per mensem.

XX XX XX

10. Charges payable by the Deputy Minister and the Government.-(1)
Each Deputy Minister shall in respect of the residence and motor car
allotted for his use under sub-section (1) of section 8 and section 9, be liable
to pay the following charges, namely:—

(@) cost of petrol required for their respective motor cars in excess of the
cost of seven hundred and fifty litres of petrol paid by the Government.

XX XX XX

12. Travelling and other allowances on tours.-
XX XX xx

(2) While touring on official business every Minister, Minister of State and
Deputy Minister shall be entitled,—

(@) for journeys by train to two times the single fare of the highest class
available in the train:

(b) for journeys by road, to road mileage at twenty rupees per kilometre;

(c) for journeys by air, to one and one-fifth times the single fare paid for
such journeys l[and to the prescribed insurance premium for insurance
against accidents during such journeys;

(d) to daily allowance at one thousand five hundred rupees per day for
the days of journey and for the days of halt at any place:

Provided that in the case of tours outside the State, the daily allowance
shall be at two thousand rupees per day for the days of journey and for the
days of halt at any place:

Provided further that if a Minister, a Minister of State or a Deputy
Minister is treated as a State Guest, he shall be entitled only to one-fourth of
the daily allowance for the period for which he is treated as a State Guest.

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, P7, W.D. , Copies 750, 28" March, 2015



