%ﬂmamﬂ—uwmw@ﬁ

IIMOR, 23 RITHR, 2023 /01 3Nf3aH, 1945

fRHraeT UeY WRAR

fearae e faum= aw aRare

e 21 RIdwR, 2023

e faoHo—femE—fada® / 1—-52 / 2023 —fRAmad gewr e w91 @7 ufshar vd &R

aTed Hae!, 1973 & MIH—140 @ Sfia IRAA e  (fRAmEe ucer deie) e,

131—=ToT94 / 2023—23—09—2023 (7723)



7724 IoT9F, feareret U, 23 RyawR 2023 /01 2139+, 1945

2023 (2023 BT faed H@id 17) S oMot faAid 21 RIawR, 2023 &I f2Arae weer e s #
RIPUT 8 AT 8, I—ARIRET BT Fgared Ioua 7 gfad o o INa far Sar ¢ |

FXARIRT / —

afea,
2o 9o faum= 4T |

2023 &1 AT H=ATH 17

ARG e (fRemea weer Senes) fagas, 2023
QU BT HH

2023 &1 fads d&=TP 17

ARG e (fRerad weer wenes) fagas, 2023

(fem |wT 3 Reeenfia w5y #)

fRATIe UQE 5T BT AAT AR AR T IMMAFRA, 1899 (1899 T MfAIfm Awdia 2)
BT AR G P B v fadas |

YR TIRSY & digdRd 9y ¥ fRamd uew faum wwr grr fa=foRed wu & U
sfafgad gr—

1. dff@ IH—s9 M &1 e I aRd e (fREmEe ey |eie)
arferferam, 2023 21

2. STE 1-F B WUH——RAES TR I DI AT AN IRA T SR,
1899 I AT 1—h H,—

(@) o Iees 3 H, “Uh Wl JUY’ V@[ & WM W ‘TH BolR SV g I G,
(@) IgET 4 H, T U Y&l B I R G BUY” I I SIMG;

() 3BT 5 H, "UAN JUY” V@I B W W ‘TH Al $UY” ] G Sl
(&) oreeE 23 H—

(i) FHRT & 9OR Jod A $I G BT IHH BT Aclrel & ol 4.00 TRrerd dqen
I Afdadl & oy 6.00 Ufer@” e, el iR g @ WM W 19N dg




o9, fRHTeet uawn, 23 RIawR 2023 /01 mfa, 1945 7725

(i)

qd & AR & IR Hed a7 Ufahe IBA, ST W 1fdd 81, &1 Afeans @
T 4.00 Ufrera T o9 @fddal & U 6.00 URIRIT iR waM 9 o ¥ 31
ISR eI AT UlAhel XPH Bl TRy, S AT 31fed 81, & ol 8.00 Ufcera” wre,
3 AR e I e,

TH JUY & fhead d@ Yuiifehd vkl & ueEr (| e e | R R
T ST AR I g Frefeiiad wRege F=iRefud fohar e, srerid—

R, e e fiere & RT3 TR F t6 a9 & fiaw a8
sl 3R fashar, Ay fIoia, 9@ IR Jed A1 ufdhd IbH Jaar faer
(faerl) @ Ypd afed, Tad o’ BUU | Jif¥d B, & IR b forw
e B & YR Al Aied WE AWl H 8 Ukied e Yo
TR BT SR |

(®) o eee 31 & WM WR, FfelRad v@r Sirgem, sefia—

TR BT faf T ( —geH™) faerg |

(@) Yad Heeh afeqal (U@ 8 qao o Jraeia) iR Ufd iR Uil & 7e |

=AqH 9l BT IR SHTH (& oIk ¥UY & oemedq fafa @ 18 w=Rkn @&
R g @1 0.05 Uferd;

(@) T Ffeqal, S Iad-dee T8 & B " |

][ATH Al TUY SR IMUHTH TP BOR IUY & e, A & 18 wwRy @
TR e @1 0.05 UfRIG; 3R e8] 23 & AR §HR & Swaak o H |
FHRT & R e T gcias T Jed |

(a) L’ﬂﬂrﬁa 33 ﬁ,—

@

TR & GOIR oI & “Afgersi & o7y 4.00 URerd e o= fadai & forg
6.00 MR 6], 3 3R g @ WM R "IN o ddb & FHRT & doR
qed T Ufhel b4, Sl |l SeacR 81, BT Aleellsll & ol 4.00 UG TAT 31
FfFqal & oy 6.00 U IR g=md g ¥ RS IR oI AT Ufahel
IHH B TR FHRT § o 8.00 URIRTA” ¥res, 3w iR frg 3@ ome; oiR

3TTT 33 B I A FIEARIT IR Y& SR, 3efie—

WH&:WWE%?WWH%Wﬁwﬁa%WﬁW@Q
e &F faeE [S¥aT R 9o a1 Uiihe (69 qdar [de ([erai) &
P AfRd, I Rg BV F IfSF B, g8 YTl 3R STV deT B ©

dl gdoR AEell dfed Hd AWell H 8.00 YR WrY Yo YHIRG [
STTRIT:

th_g'?Ts'Sﬁ'\’ﬁswéijw & g & foly, Yad e faaqal (T & gaol
A IaSIa) IR Ui 3R Ul @& AeT =IAqH Ui B9k JUY AR AHTH 3
BOIR YU & JeFYI AART HURT & IR Hed DI 0.05 Flaerd yRa o
ST |7




7726 IoT9F, feareret U, 23 RyawR 2023 /01 2139+, 1945
©) 3rgeva 35 ¥ "5.00 UfRIA” el iR forel & M W, 6.00 Yl b AR fore
ST,
(W) e 40 H—

() v (®) 4 —"FURT & IR JoI AT Ufdhe IBA BT 4.00 UG Afzamsit
o o ok o= afaqal & oy 6.00 UfR afdl, el ok vl & F W
T A dF & FHRT & IR Jed A1 Ufdhel I6H, S W STaaR 81, &
Afgetall & oy 4.00 Ui @ o=y Afddl & U 6.00 wfrerd iR g=md
ARG ¥ 3AMH qOR oI FHERT IT URTHA IHH B FaRT, S 9 I=aaR 8 &
o 8.00 UfR” wres 3w SR o X e,

(@) ‘T Y & Mdcad d@ Quiifehd’ el & 99ar g " & ©IF W) 7 R
RGN ST 3R IFS UL FlelRad URd STT-A1Ud fhar SITgam, sefia—

"R IE TP 99 & |IR, I8! dghdhdl AR FYHIR d96 [T e aeiR
Hod IT Ufhd YeH Ydor fdera (f[oral) &1 Yen afkd uam org & ifds g,
& ISP & oY af7ded &R &, dl Yo} AMel dfed, FA AWl d
8.00 U wIU geh TAIRT fhar SIgam; 3iR

(i) Ts (@) #H "<FIH Th Al JUY IR AMPHTH Th FOR BT & 3feged= qelm
e <9 IUY & Mdead dd Yulifda’ el & A fhar S,

T 48 B WS (F), (@) IR () # g A JUY, ‘TH Al g9 FUY” AR "<l
dl TUY TGl B R W HAE Udh BOR BUYY, ‘TP BOR Ui Al BUY” iR QT
TR $UY" 9§ G S0 3R

T 58 & WUS & H RAGH UdH Al IUY IR IMAHIH TH FTIR TUY B
JIAF” W@l b WM W YATH &I BOIR BUY AR IfAHTH U BAR BUY b
3TN TTeg X SIIG |

Il 3R BRON BT HUF

fRAMIT UQel XIS BT JoNl AN WRA ¥ R H & 3efiE fafi= foradl @1 9reaa

W Ied o X fUed <9 auf ¥ Foad =€ @ 1§ 2| yaled R wm | Hed
IR 1—% ¥ fAf=T Srgeesl & Yob—ai I NG FRAT FHI DI IMaIHAT & |

9 UBR f2AEd U9 M BT AR Yaiad ARTRH A e JJgA—1 & Bl AT

PG S<Id TBYI, BEICRYT UH, AT & [0, M, ycel, 99, JEUdRAHM AR daaw ol

qIad W Yo DI e R AEeIS U BRI BT IR [HAT AT | ST Yaidd
SRR # RN FRAT IRF B AT B

g fadae Sudad Sgewal @l gt & fow 7

(e Rig ==M)
TqRT FH3 |



o9, fRHTeet uawn, 23 RIawR 2023 /01 mfa, 1945 7727

Rree:
[SLEIEC 2023
IERIEESICE]
YR
TR fae = S
YR

IRA & Gfus & gess 207 & I oauTa o el @R der— )

fRATE UQel & IIJUTd, MR A (fRATarel Ueel |eiee) fa8ae®, 2023 &1 fawa 9w
% IR H gua oy 99 @ UvEq, YR & AU & ITgeeE 207 @ A IR @ faum
AT H qRIMNT B IR 9 W IR e o RieiRer &wd € |

ARG e (fRerea oS senes) fagas, 2023

T USwr IS B AT AN IRAI W AFRE, 1899 (1899 T IrfAifrA
AT 2) BT 3R FIEH B B v fadae |

(orma Rig =f)
gaRT H3T |




7728 IoT9F, feareret U, 23 RyawR 2023 /01 2139+, 1945
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

BILL NO. 17 OF 2023

THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Clauses :

1. Short title.
2.  Amendment of Schedule 1-A.

BILL NO. 17 OF 2023

THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT) BILL, 2023
(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)

A
BILL

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (Act No. 2 of 1899), in its application to the
State of Himachal Pradesh.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-fourth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short titlee—This Act may be called the Indian Stamp (Himachal Pradesh
Amendment) Act, 2023.

2. Amendment of Schedule 1-A.—In the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, as applicable in the
State of Himachal Pradesh, in Schedule 1-A,—

(a) 1in article 3, for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “One thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) in article 4, for the words “Ten rupees”, the words “Twenty rupees” shall be
substituted;

(c) in article 5, for the words “Fifty rupees”, the words “One hundred rupees” shall be
substituted;

(d) in article 23,—

(i) for figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other persons, of
the market value of the property or of the amount of purchase money, whichever



o9, fRHTeet uawn, 23 RIawR 2023 /01 mfa, 1945 7729

(i)

is higher”, the figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other
persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the property or of the
consideration amount whichever is higher; and 8% for all above Rupees fifty lakh
of the market value of the property or of the consideration amount whichever is
higher” shall be substituted;

after the words “rupees Ten” for the sign “,”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and
thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that if within one year from the date of registration of the sale
deed, the same purchaser and seller apply for the registration of sale deed, having
market value or consideration amount more than Rupees fifty lakh including the
amount of the earlier deed(s), 8% stamp duty in all cases including earlier cases,
shall be charged.”;

(e) for article 31, the following shall be substituted, namely:—

0]

“Exchange of Property, Instrument of.

(a) between persons of blood 0.05% of the lower value of the
relation (common ancestors) exchanged property, subject to the
and between wife and husband;  minimum of Rupees one hundred and

maximum Rupees one thousand;

(b) between persons not related by 0.05% of the lower value of the
blood relations. exchanged property, subject to the
minimum of Rupees one hundred
and maximum Rupees one thousand;
and as per article 23 on the value
arrived at after deducting the lower
value of property from the higher
value of the property.”.

in article 33,—

(1)

(i)

for the figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other persons,
of the market value of the property”, the figures, signs and words “4.00% for
women and 6.00% for other persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of
the property or of the consideration amount whichever is higher and 8% for all
above Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the property or of the amount of
consideration amount whichever is higher” shall be substituted; and

at the end of article 33, the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that if within one year, the same donor and donee apply for the
registration of gift deed, having market value or consideration amount more than
Rupees fifty lakh including the amount of earlier deed(s), 8% stamp duty in all
cases including earlier cases shall be charged:

Provided further that for the purpose of this article, 0.05% of the market value of
the transferred property in between persons of blood relation (common ancestors)
and between husband and wife, subject to minimum Rupees five thousand and
maximum Rupees ten thousand shall be charged.”;



7730 IoT9F, feareret U, 23 RyawR 2023 /01 2139+, 1945

(g) in article 35, for the figures and sign “5.00%”, the figures and sign “6.00%” shall be
substituted;

(h) in article 40,—
(i) inclause (a),—

(a) after the figures, signs and words “4.00% for women and 6.00% for other
persons, of the market value of the property”, the figures, signs and words
“4.00% for women and 6.00% for other persons, upto Rupees fifty lakh of
the market value of the property or of the consideration amount whichever is
higher and 8% for all above Rupees fifty lakh of the market value of the
property ” shall be substituted;

(b) after the words rupees Ten for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted
and thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that if within one year, the same Mortgagor and Mortgagee
apply for the registration of mortgage deed, having market value or secured
amount more than Rupees fifty lakh including the amount of earlier deed(s),
8% stamp duty in all cases including earlier cases shall be charged; and

(i1) in clause (b), the words “subject to the minimum of rupees one hundred and
maximum rupees one thousand and duty rounded off to the nearest rupees Ten”
shall be deleted;

(1) in the article 48, in clauses (a), (b) and (c), for the words “One hundred rupees”, “One
hundred and fifty rupees” and “Two hundred rupees” the words “One thousand
rupees”’, “One thousand and five hundred rupees” and “Two thousand rupees” shall be
substituted respectively; and

(j) 1inarticle 58, in clause A, for the words “subject to the minimum of rupees one hundred
and maximum rupees one thousand”, the words “subject to minimum of rupees two
thousand and maximum rupees five thousand” shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The rates of Stamp Duty in respect of various instruments under the Indian Stamp Act as
applicable in the State of Himachal Pradesh have not been revised for the last 10 years. It is the
need of the hour to revise the rates of duties of different articles in the Schedule 1-A appended to
the Act ibid.

As such, it has been proposed to make necessary changes in the existing rates of stamp duty
in respect of adoption, conveyance, exchange of property, gift, lease, mortgage, power of attorney
and settlement by amending Schedule-1A appended to the Act ibid, in its application to the State of
Himachal Pradesh. This has necessitated amendments in the Act ibid.



o9, fRHTeet uawn, 23 RIawR 2023 /01 mfa, 1945 7731

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(JAGAT SINGH NEGI)
Minister-in-Charge.
SHIMLA :

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

—Nil—

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

—Nil—

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE
207 OF THE CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

(File No. Rev. Stamp(F)1-1/2005-V)

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh having been informed of the subject matter of the
Indian Stamp (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Bill, 2023, recommends, under article 207 of the
Constitution of India, the introduction and consideration of the Bill in the Legislative
Assembly.

THE INDIAN STAMP (HIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2023

A

BILL



7732 IoT9F, feareret U, 23 RyawR 2023 /01 2139+, 1945

further to amend the Indian Stamp Act, 1899 (Act No.2 of 1899), in its application to the
State of Himachal Pradesh.

(JAGAT SINGH NEGI)
Minister-in-Charge.

(SHARAD KUMAR LAGWAL)
Secretary (Law).

SHIMLA :

ferd 21 RydwR, 2023

e faoao—faema=—fada® / 1—50 / 2023 —RA@e Uew faum | @ ufhar vd &
Fared fraArael, 1973 @ fIW—140 @ 3TFia fedrad UQw TRUTfedT |ar (Femer) faeries,
2023 (2023 BT faer®w H@d 15) ST 3ot fdid 21 RIawR, 2023 &I BArae ueer e s #
QRN 81 bl 8, FI—ARIRY DI Gl o107 H Jfad d+ g UNd fHar S ¢ |

FXARIRT / —

afea,
20 9o faum= T |

2023 &I fISI® H¥=id 15
feHTae uew TRUIferdT |ar (Fmer) faeri®, 2023
HUel BT A
Tl A\ 3R YIRTT |
¢RT 3 BT G |

¢RT 4 T G |
¢RT 5 T G |

Howbdh =





