
Recd. No. CHD/0093/2012-2014

Itarganzt Gotternment (6tt3eat
EXTRAORDINARY

Pub l i shed  by Au thor i t y
0 Govt. of Haryana

CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 29, 2012
(PHALGUNA 10, 1933 SARA)

H A R Y A N A V I D H A N SA BH A SECRETARIAT

Notification

The 29th February, 2012

No. Haryana Private Universities (Amendment) Bill,
2012, IS hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of
the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Ilaryana Legislative

Bill No. 12-HLA of 2012

THE HARYANA PR IVATE UNIVERSITIES
(AMENDMENT) BILL,  2012

A

BILL

further to amend the Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the
Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Private Universities (Amendment)
Act. 2012.

2. In section 2 of the Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006 (hereinafter

Price : Its . 5.00 (663)

Short title

Amendment of
section 2 of
Haryana Act 32 of
2006.



664 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(FEIGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(i ) after clause (a), the
"(aa) 'Bar Council of India' means the Bar Counci l  of India

constituted under the Advocates Act. 1961 (Central
Act 25 of 1961).

(ah) 'campus' means that area of the university in which it is
established;";

(i i ) clauses (d) and (e) shall be omitted;
(i i i ) for clause (f), the following clauses shall be substituted.

namely :--
'(f) 'employee' means a person appointed by the university and

includes a teacher. officer and any other staff of the
university;

(fa) 'existing private university' means a university which has
been established under the Haryana Private Universities
Act. 2006 (32 of 2006) before the noti fication of the
Haryana Private Universities (Amendment) Act. 2012:

(fb) 'faculty means a group of academic departments of similar
disciplines;";

(iv) for clause (j), the following clause shall be substituted,

"0 ) 'hostel' means a place of residence of the students of the
university;";

after clause (k). the following clause shall be inserted.
namely

"(ka) 'Indian Nursing Council' means an autonomous body
constituted under section 3 of the Indian Nursing
Council Act. 1947 (48 of 1947);":

(vi ) for clauses (m) and (n), the following clauses shall be

"(m) 'National Assessment and Accreditation Council' means
National Assessment and Accreditation Council,
Bangalore, an autonomous institution of the University
Grants Commission;

(ma) 'National Board of Accreditation' means National Board
of Accreditation, New Delhi. an autonomous body of All
India Council for Technical Education;

(n) 'National Council for Teacher Education' means the
National Council for Teacher Education, Delhi:- ;

(vi i ) clauses (o) and (p) shall be omitted;
(vi i i ) for clause (q), the following clause shall be substituted,

"(q) 'Pharmacy Council of India' means Pharmacy Council
of India. Delhi;";

( v)



HARYANA GOVT.  GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 665
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SARA)

(ix) for clause (s). the following clause shall be substituted.

'regulating body' means a body established by the
Government of India for laying down norms and
conditions for ensuring academic standards of higher
education, such as University Grants Commission, All
India Council for Technical Education, National Council
for Teacher Education, Medical Counci l  of India, Bar
Counci l of India, Pharmacy Council of India, National
Assessment and Accreditation Council, Indian Council of
Agriculture Research, National Board of Accreditation,
Indian Nursing Council, Council o f Scientific and
Industrial Research etc. and includes the Government or
any such body constituted by Government of India or the
Government";

(x) for clause (t), the following clause shall be substituted,

"(t) 'Rules' means the rules made by the Government under
this Act;";

clause (y) shall be omitted; and

for clause (z), the following clause shall be substituted,

"(z) 'teacher' means a Professor, Associate Professor, Assistant
Professor or any other person required to impart
education or guide research or render guidance in any
other form to the students for pursuing a course or
programme of study of the university;".

3.

(i ) for clause (6), the following clause shall be substituted.
namely: --

"(6) to establish a campus:";

clause (7) shall be omitted;

(i i i ) for clause (9), the following clause shall be substituted.

"(9) to maintain the academic standard of degrees,
diplomas, certificates and other academic distinctions
as per bye-laws and to ensure that the same are not
lower than those laid down by the regulating body;";
and

(i v) clauses (10), (II) and (12) shall be omitted.

4.

(i ) in sub -section (1), for sign (.) existing at the end, the sign (:)
shall be substituted;

(xi)

(xi i )

"(s)

Amendment of
section 3 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 4 of the
Haryana Act 32 of
2006.



Amendment of

section 5 of

Haryana Act

32of 2006.

666 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA. ), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(i i ) after sub -section W. the following proviso shall be added.
namely :

"Provided that the university excluding existing
private university shall offer minimum three faculties at its
commencement and shall provide instructions upto the level
of Ph.D. in a period of three years in any of the three faculties
in which it is imparting degree i.e. Humanities, Languages,
Medicines, Commerce, Science, Engineering, Information
Technology, Law, Agriculture and All ied Sciences,
Management (Business, Hotel, Hospitality, Tourism etc.),
Bio-Tech, Media and Mass Communication etc. with due
permission from the relevant regulating bodies:

Provided further that if a sponsoring body intends to set
up Health and Medical Sciences University, it shall not be
mandatory to offer minimum three faculties.";

(i i i ) in sub -section (2), clause (r) shall be omitted:

(i v) in clause (a) of sub -section (4), the following sign and words
shall be added at the end, namely: --

manner of generation of funds to be raised by the
proposed university before its operations. The sponsoring
body shall give the detailed information in this regard as per
the format given in the bye-laws framed under this Act at the
time of application;"and

(v) in sub -section (6), for the words "one month" occurring twice,
the words "six months" shall be substituted.

5. In sub -section (1) of section 5 of the principal Act,. -

for clause (vi), the following clauses shall be substituted.

"(vi) give undertaking to appoint at least one Professor, two
Associate Professors and adequate number of
Assistant Professors alongwith necessary supporting
staff in each department or discipline to be started by
the university;

(vi -a) maintain objectivity, fairness and transparency in the
recruitment of teachers of the proposed university
with qualification not less than those prescribed by
the University Grants Commission or other
regulating bodies;";

(i i ) in clause (ix), for the sign "." existing at the end, the sign
shall be substituted; and



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 667
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(iii) after clause (ix), the following clause shall be added,

"(x) provide its commitment to prevent all types of
ragging in the campus in accordance with the
regulations prescribed by the University Grants
Commission, Government norms and statutory
provisions in this regard, if any.".

6. For section 10 o f t h e p r in c i p a l Ac t , t h e f o l l o w i n g s e c t io n s h a l l b e

s u b s t i t u t e d .  n a m e l y : -

1 1 0 ) Bar to affiliation and opening off shore campus
(1) T h e  u n i v e r s i t y  s h a l l  n o t  a d m i t  a n y  c o l l e g e  o r  i n s t i t u t i o n  t o

t h e  p r iv i le g e  o f  a f f i l ia t io n .

( 2 ) i t  s h a l l  n o t  o p e n any off campus, off shore campus, study
centre and examination centre in  or out of the State of Haryana and
shall not offer any programme through distance education mode.".

7. For s u b  - s e c t io n s ( I ) a n d ( 2 ) o f s e c t i o n 11 o f t h e p r i n c i p a l Ac t . t h e Amend ment o f

f o l lo win g  s u b  - s e c t io n s  s h a ll  b e  s u b s t i t u t e d , namely section 11 of

Haryana Ac t
1 1 ) T h e s p o n s o r i n g b o d y shall establish an 32 of 2006.

endowment fund for the university  with a minimum amount
of five crores rupees which shall be pledged in  the form of
Fixed Deposit Receipt in  original in favou r of the Higher
Education Commissioner, Haryana, Panchkula.

Note : The provisions of sub -section (1) shall not be
applicable to  the existing private university.

(2) The endowment fund shall be used  as a s ecurity
deposit to ensure that the university complies with the
provisions of t h is Ac t , S t a t u t e s ,  O r d i n a n c e s ,  R u l e s  a n d B y e -

la w s . T h e G o v e r n m e n t s h a ll h a v e t h e p o w e r t o f o r f e it t h e

wh o l e  o r  p a r t  o f  f u n d  i n  c a s e  t h e  u n i v e r s i t y  o r  t h e  s p o n s o r i n g

b o d y  c o n t r a v e n e s  a n y  o f  t h e  p r o v i s i o n s  o f  t h i s  A c t , S t a t u t e s ,

O r d i n a n c e s , B y e - l a w s o r R u l e s o r u s e it f o r m e e t i n g t h e

expenditure for academic and administrative p u r p o s e s  i n  c a s e

o f  d i s s o l u t i o n  i n  a c c o r d a n c e  w i t h  b y e - la w s  . " .

8 . In s e c t io n 1 4  o f  t h e  p r i n c i p a l Ac t ,  a f t e r  c l a u s e  ( 4 ) .  t h e  f o l l o w i n g c l a u s e

s h a l l  b e  i n s e r t e d ,  n a m e l y : -

1 4 A ) t h e  C o n t r o l le r  o f  E x a m in a t i o n s ; " .

Amendment o f

section 10 of

Haryana Ac t

32 of 2006.

Amend ment o f

sec tio n 14 of

Haryana Ac t

32 of 2006.

Amend ment o f
9. For s u b  - s e c t io n  I  I )  o f  s e c t io n 1 7  o f  t h e  p r i n c i p a l  A c t .  t h e  f o l l o w i n g  s u b - sec tio n 1.7 or

Haryana Ac t

32 of 2006.



Amendment of
section 18 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Insertion of
section I8A in
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 30 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

668 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(P1 -ION. 10, 1933 SAKA)

1 1 ) The Vice -Chancellor shall be appointed by the
Chancellor as per the qualifications prescribed by the University
Grants Commission, subject to the provisions contained in sub -section
(7) and shall hold office for a term of three years:

Provided that after expiry of the term of three years, the Vice-
Chancellor shall be eligible for re -appointment for another term of
three years:

Provided further that a Vice -Chancellor shall continue to  hold
the office even after the expiry of his term till new Vice -Chancellor
joins. However, in any case the period shall not exceed one year.".

10. For sub -section ( I) of section 18 of the principal Act, the following sub-

"(I) The appointment of the Registrar shall be made by the
Chairperson of the sponsoring body in such manner, as may be
specified by the Statutes. The Registrar shall possess the qualifications
prescribed by the University Grants Commission.".

11. After section 18 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

"I8A. Appointment and functions of the Controller of
(1) The Cont roller of Ex amination sh all be whole

time salaried officer of the university  and shall be appointed by the
Chancellor in accordance with the Statutes.

(2) It shall be the duty of the Controller of

(i) to conduct examinations in a disciplined and
efficient manner;

(ii) to arrange for the setting of papers with strict regard
to secrecy;

(iii) to arrange for the evaluation of answer -sheets in
accordance with the planned time schedule for
results;

(iv) to  constantly  review the system of examinations in
order to enhance the level of impartiality and
objectivity  with a view to make it  better instrument
for assessing the attainments of students;

(v) to deal with any other matter connected with
examinations which may, from time to time, be
assigned to him by the Vice -Chancellor.".

12.

(i) for clause (b) of sub -section (1), the following clause shall



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 669
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

"(b) the terms and conditions of appointment of the
Chancellor and the Vice -Chancellor and their powers
and functions;";

(i i ) for sub -sections (2) and (3), the following sub -sections shall

"(2) The Governing Body shall prepare First Statute
of the university and submit the same to the Government
for its approval within a period of one month after
incorporation of the university in the Schedule of the Act.

(3) The Government shall consider the First Statute
submitted by the university and if any modifications are
deemed necessary, the same shall be conveyed to the
university for sending the amended draft and if the amended
draft is found in order, it shall give approval within a period
of three months from the date of its receipt.".

13. In sub -section (3) of section 31 of the principal Act, for the words "two
months", the words "three months" shall be substituted.

14. In sub -section (3) of section 32 of the principal Act, for the words "two
months", the words "three months" shall be substituted.

15. In sub -section (2) of section 33 of the principal Act, for the words "two
months", the words "three months" shall be substituted.

16. After section 34 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be

"34A. Authorisation to commence the (1) The
university intending to start a new course or programme of study, shall
intimate such intention to the Government, along with an assessment
report as prescribed under the bye-laws.

(2) The Government shall specify the manner in which the
university shall commence enrolment of students for such course or
programme of study and shall give authorization to the university to

Amendment of

section 31 of

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.

Amendment of

section 32 of

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.

Amendment of

section 33 of

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.

Insertion of

sections 34k

348 and 34C in

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.



670 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

start the course or programme of study and also approve the procedure
thereof.

(3) The university shall not commence first enrolment of
students without specific authorization of the Government. In no case.
the application for authorization be kept pending beyond 120 days,
whereafter it shall be deemed to have the concurrence of the
Government to start the course or programme of study.

34B. Power The Government may if it
is satisfied that the university is not in a position to efficiently
discharge the duties and obligations imposed, it  may, after making
such inquiry, as may be specified by bye-laws, cancel the permission
to continue the course or programme of study,

34C. Compulsory disclosure of  information .- - ) Every
university established under this Act shall publish before expiry of
sixty days prior to the date of the commencement of admission to any
of its  co urses or programme of study, a prospectus containing the

(a) each component of the fee, deposits and other charges
payable by the students for pursuing a course or programme
of study. and the other terms and conditions of such
payment;

(b) the percentage of tuition fee and other charges refundable to
a student in case such student withdraws from university
before or after completion of course or programme of study
and the time within, and the manner, in which such refund
shall be made;

(c) the number of seats approved by the statutory authority in
respect of each course or programme of study for the
academic year for which admission is proposed to be made;

(d) the conditions of eligibility for admission in a particular
course or programme of study;

(e) the educational qualifications specified by the university
where no such qualifying standards have been specified by
any regulating body;

(t) the process of admission and selection of candidates,
including all relevant information with regard to the details
of test or examination for selecting such candidates for
admission to  each course or programme of study and the
amount of fee to  be paid for the admission test;

(g) details of the teaching faculty, including therein the
educational qualifications, teaching experience and
indicating therein whether such member is a regular facility
member or is a visiting member;

(h) information with regard to physical and academic
infrastructure and other facilities including hostel



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA. ), FEB. 29, 2012 671
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

accommodation, library and hospital or industry wherein
the practical training to be imparted to the students and in
particular the facilities accessible by students on being
admitted to the university:

(i ) broad outlines of the syllabus specified by the appropriate
statutory authority or by the university, as the case may be,
for every course or programme of study. including the
teaching hours, practical sessions and other assignments;

(j ) all relevant instructions with regard to maintenance of
discipline by students within or outside the campus,
prohibition of ragging and consequences thereof for
violating the provisions of any regulations in this regard
made under the University Grants Commission Act. 1956
(Central Act 3 of 1956) or any other law for the time being
in force.

(k) any such other information which may be prescribed:

Provided that the university shall publish information
referred to under this section on its website. and the
attention of prospective students and the general public
shall be drawn to such publication on the website through
advertisements displayed prominently in the different
newspapers and through other media.

(2) Every university shall fix the price of each printed copy
of the prospectus. not more than the reasonable cost of its publication.
distribution or sale and its copy shall be sent to the Government for
information. ".

17. For existing section 36 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

"36. Fee may, from time to time,
prepare fee structure and shall send it for information to the Government, at least
thirty days before the commencement of the academic session.

(2) The fee structure for the twenty-five per cent of the students
who are domicile of Haryana shall be based on merit -cum -means and be as

(i ) one -fifth of the twenty-five per cent shall be granted
full fee concession;

(i i ) two -fifth of the twenty-five per cent shall be granted
fifty per cent fee concession;

(i i i ) the balance two -fifth of the twenty-five per cent shall
be granted twenty-five per cent fee concession.

(3) The university shall not charge any fee, by what ever name
called, other than that prescribed as per sub -sections (1) and (2) above :

Amendment of
section 36 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006



672 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

Provided that in case of the university having collaboration with reputed
foreign or international universities or other institutions of other similar nature,
the Government, may, approve different percentage of students eligible for
hundred per cent, fifty percent or twenty-five per cent fee concession.".

Amendment of 18. For section 40 of  t he principal Act, the following section shall be

section 40 of

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.
40. The university shall obtain accreditation from the

. . . . .
National Assessment and Accreditation Council, Bangalore or National
Board of Accreditation within five years of its establishment and
inform the Government and such other regulatory bodies which are
connected with the courses taken up by the university  about the grade
provided by the said accrediting bodies to the university. The
university shall get renewed such accreditation at an interval of every
five years thereafter or as per norms of thc concerned accrediting

bodies.".

19. For section 44 of the principal Act. the following section shall be

"44. Powers of Government to inspect universi ty and
academic and administrative (1) The Government may
cause an assessment to be made, in such manner, as may be prescribed,
for the purpose of ascertaining the standards of teaching, examination
and research or any other matter relating to  the university.

(2) The Government for ascertaining and ensuring quality at
different levels of higher education in  a university and for its continued
sustenance shall conduct annual academic and administrative audit
through Higher Education Department, Haryana or any other body or
persons authorized by it , which shall scrutinize whether the university
is complying with and functioning in accordance with the provisions of
this Act, Statutes. Ordinances, Rules, bye-laws, instructions and the
conditions of the Letter of Intent.

(3) Such persons or body shall give their report within three
months to the Government with specific recommendations and
deficiencies, if found. The Government shall consider the report and
issue a show cause notice of thirty days to  the Chancellor as to why
action should not be initiated against the university for the deficiencies

noticed.

Amendment of

section 44 of

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.

Insertion of

section 44A in

Haryana Act

32 of 2006.

(4) After considering the reply to the show cause notice, the
Government shall have the power to impose penalty under the Act.".

20. After section 44 of  t he principal Act, the following section shall be



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 673
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

The following penalties may be imposed
upon the university  for maladministration, misinformation and for not

stopping of admissions in one or more faculties;

(ii) financial penalty of  a minimum of ten lakhs and
maximum of one crore;

(iii) dissolution of the university  in a phased manner:

Provided that no such penalty shall be imposed unless the
university has been given a show cause notice.".

21.
Amend ment o f

sec tion 46 of

(i) after sub -section (7) the following sub -section shall be Flaryana Act

32 o f 2006.

"(7A) The administrator shall meet day to day
expenses from the income/assets of the university. If the
same are not sufficient, then the administrator with the
prior approval of the Government shall have the powers
to dispose of the properties and assets of the university.";

(ii) for sub -section (9), the following sub -section shall be

"(9) On receipt of the report under sub -section (8),
the Government shall make an amendment in the
Schedule under section 6 by omitting concerned
university therefrom and from the date of such
amendment, all the assets and liabilities of the university
shall vest in the sponsoring body:

Provided that the degrees, diplomas or awards
granted under sub -section (8) shall not be invalid  merely
on the ground that the university has been dissolved.".

22. After section 47 of the principal Act, the following section shall be Insertio n of

sectio n 47A in

Haryana Ac t
47A. Power to make bye -laws -The Government may,

32 o f 2006.
by notification in the Official Gazette, make bye-laws for carrying out

the purposes of this Act.".

23. In  the Schedule to  the principal Act, after serial number 6 and entries
thercagainst, the following serial numbers and entries thereagainst shall be

"7. Baba Mast Nath University District Rohtak

8. M.V.N. University
_

District Palwal

9. Ansal University District Gurgaon".

Amend ment o f

Sc hed ule in

Haryana Ac t

32 o f 2006.



674 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(P1 -ION. 10, 1933 SAICA)

STATEMENT OF  OBJ EC TS AND R EASONS
There is a need for creation and expansion of educational institutions for improving

opportunities of higher education for the youth of the State. In order to accommodate the
unprecedented growth of students in higher education, we need to double the number of
institutions at all levels by 2020. The Government intervention and initiatives alone would not be
adequate to meet the growing demands of higher education. Private Sector is an important player
in providing higher education. For encouraging the persons/sponsoring bodies with rich experience
of running educational institutions "The Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006" has been enacted
by the Government under which Private Universities are created.

Even though the Private Universities established till date have shown promise to be
emerged as Centres of Excellence in academic spheres, it has been felt that there is a requirement
to introduce some new provisions for quality improvement and amend some existing one to match
the contemporary needs of higher learning.

Taking cognizance of the Judgement of flon'ble Supreme Court in Prof. Yashpal versus
State of Chattisgarh, the provisions such as Study Centres. Off Campus and Off Shore Campus
have been omitted. Further it has been decided not to allow distance mode of education in Private
Universities.

Although the Private Universities set up so far have been providing education in multi
disciplines, it has been made mandatory for a Private University to offer minimum three faculties
providing instructions upto the level of Ph. D. However this condition will not be applicable on a
Private Health University.

Further provisions like prevention of ragging, objectivity and transparency in the
recruitment of teachers with prescribed qualifications, increasing endowment fund to Rs. Five
Crores and its usage by the Government in case a University is dissolved, authorization to
commence a course and withdrawal of such a permission, compulsory disclosure of information by
a university and powers of Government to assess a University for ascertaining the standards of
teaching, examination and research or any other matter relating to the University and imposition of
penalties upon the University for misinformation, maladministration and for not maintaining
standards, power of the Government to make bye-laws for private uni'versities are some of the
major additions to the Act.

Further existing provision of fee concession to the students of Haryana domicile has been
made more explicit so that no room is left to ambiguity and all students under Haryana domicile
category get fee concession as per prescribed procedure. And provisions where some abbreviations
were wrongly used have been corrected.

Further for achieving the objectives enshrined in the Act, proposals have been formulated
for setting up Baba Mast Nath University in District Rohtak, MVN University in District Palwal
and Ansal University in District Gurgaon.

Hence, this bill.
GEETA BHUKKAL,

Education Minister, Haryana.

Chandigarh: SUMIT KLTMAR,
The 29th February, 2012 Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 675
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SARA)

[ffige-t f f r I
2012 WI. Cd4414) 4.1.911 olcraoko

61.'41Hull fAul l fdqc1rdelcia ( IIV IER) Thth14), 2012

6P4ruir Thufl fdx4 fathei4

3ri teizizi , 2006 Mt

a r k i i s i M d

Thk1/14)

tioa act -4 Ruuic 'dui( fa1r4rroz-F

wa 4 -at arl i )-f ta f t t i  : -

1. TIE 3TRAWi f4-41 faY4140c i t f  ( f t s t ra f f )  S i .  2012  061 qtr$qt 971

7T +IOW  t

2. 6R11ull1:441RycIfatileig alti rktiri, 2006 (17 -14 i14,

3i ftrik tfiT * -1:1 4 Throz i ttrr Trar

( i )  u . 4 04 .<8 vuq4,

I n ) f4trg tri tErc aff4srm t 3114-a4ffr 3l-f4f4-zr4,

1961 (1961 mg **Pa 3TI1fit14 25) t NEI@ Tred-

f a g  = P IN ;

(M--3T) ,̀ 4 -Litf' R4 &Rum t, faMastier4 'at 4)-- zi t

w r f t ru  t  ; - ;

(i i) ups (Er) M.IT (3.) MT 619 M7 Rzif

( i i i )  U173  ( )  * W I f f  W , P 4-11ZiRgcr tiv4 vitiLefi1tR1 14,a

"(u) '44=01' zrf4-g rzr  t fdxardevozr gir f t -4u c N

. MIT

cbli 3TWT arcrm vrritr-&  t ;

lacairr ff i lt  factiderieni aftrzr t 4)14 fascaelic io

71. 614q iu i r  Pw U f4W 4c r i ew MOIR) et  2012  mQ1

3TRHT-i i td6RiCu lIf l u l i zciRcilev4 31tft011, 2006

(2006 MT 32) *3 eTifirdfM4-11 TRIT t;

3SITLI I t e n t MITir ft

2006 Z.ftZfrrif
3Tt1re421N 32 el
EMI 2 TT TWIT -19 t



6 7 6 HA RY A N A  G O V T .  G A Z.  ( E XT RA . ) ,  F EB . 2 9 ,  2 0 1 2

(P H G N . 10, 1 9 3 3  S A KA )

(iv) w i d  ( 5 ) * T a r m tw, (gu ea -Rem fwar

"N) i34-Rftrwt t  1-44fasireiet 1,)1,4 wr
RQIN;";

(v )  t v u (Z) *  A T 4 , f*if iZEr gus awrfq:-

-(z- w) 1-Tw-dtzr if4tir Rtig' aftrcrwr t -Twau trI39
31ftfffitiff, 1947(1947 Th-T 48) Thct ETRT 3 31v-ftff Tfitd.
tclIqccr FW4 ;'';

(vi) Rgird (3) Mil (U)* 7c -1N DR, Thi--If racf Uu ArdWIRM 1Wq
viiqk 3rar17:-

- M re f IIFTE-6 f f aft trmwrff trf3trq' arltwr
fk v o rd a m4  3 7 1-41-ff 317tFT S \1/411ticcf WRIT, 41121viircFff

a l t i q '-f ;

w) wit&cizr trotrrzi- 3arsirtr t,
'tut trftcrq wcr f4w-wr, Iu {414, 9-4
trdt ;

(a) t .410arawzrw
ftrwr trRiirq. t t A ; -;

(vii) t5u4 (ITO MIT (d) ir cilL1 M 1 r 1/4114 40;

(viii) c l u s (at)* iv -117 q, f**iii Rgcr u,g Si WEIT

"(ai) 311tert1 Ert3trc Sitrwr t Tau attErtiwr
tiffirc, kt4t;";

(ix) uut (u) wr-ff tw Thki1 125cr ziou ted-fe1rferd1W4r

"(q) ftwizr. S r p-rzr t xavcick ftrerr struw
TiFT 31fsa 5'{4 W imiqus at17 vra 3TRIThard
crix4t fw iwt -kg.01,ZgH1 Writid clq f4WRI f$
fZxcifacJiciio arlaq arwifirr, ST iredta

3TEZI1ITW Rita MRticj, iiirdfizr anzifftrii
tr137N, liw-teRr faldv tiffirs at)tiltzr trf3iq
fffft- 9.31°R 14c1414 -1-c WRITS I -Nazi cprd 3FritI9 t q ç

vritti iwzrwm 4)-4. Rwewr wRi-tr tiRtic plwuRct) att7



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 677
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

att-Q111M 3rgit r if f  t f f ir -q c iR-tti \Lig aTtar

ITIVa tH47H gI fl ildcr o l j

l l i # F  t " ;

(x) tgu.1 (9)* 3V-Tr9 tN, Thi-ir Rgcr Nud  eitliff id  ft tIT u iNli E.

374fq:-

Ik z ( l i t  A z i f t r t r t  t T 3affttfrf t  31tft9 xt<4,1,f -g r t

1T7 Thtit

(xi) (au,g (3) R t r JIILJ1I[; U.11

(xii) clud (zO*W.T19 97, f ) , if ftqci cgv4 ra-Parrfem %ZTT r,

apif -q : -

" ( t ) 131611145' a r r t t  faxc i faer i d t  * I i i t ubq l i i

a r g i n 34Z2Tt9 strix4 f e q i M fter r t 4 Trr

3TOUT6 4111141-1 Oa ZIT W ill4 3TRI Wzi Hilf <Y11

ci,x4 rgq. arerfkff cold 3ff-40, ti$Ret,
34mR1 zrr ctM

3. TO e P T  T hAr URI 3 4, -

(0 tql-14  ( 6 )  t :e.1T9113, Th4-11-ORgcf 31faaTTferdr4nir u1IkVIT,

1 6 ) ARM. W a r d

(ii) (V.1 (7) 5T eil MN"

(iii) tslud (9) t  3V-IN tH, Pi ARgct  W1q 3 111tat ird  feAlf vu tmi,

a p t : -

1 9 ) 3q -ra f t z f t 111Dzii, fakr1).11, AMITI tr-1

31"- 1 1411 iTriRit t f a W 111-9

xxgrir tur t i t 3 1 f a t t  t u ft i t  f4R tf lr r  f f im-Rr i c

a r t t s-rw t t m m--1 ; - ;  u t r

(iv) ' i . 1 (m), (i  1) MT (12) tT ALI RUI

4. I .& 3alffiZITf sTRT 4 4,-

z t - t r u  ( 1 )  t , faV4119 " I"  ft c i "

314-tIRT (1) t WC, ql-IFORAci

2006 laq1411
allilf4219 32
um 3 51

-igl IT6

2006 6n6R41
3aff*Pi 32 met
11131 4 MT W1tT9 I



678 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAICA)

"Er91-4wrti f t --4 1 -a34fte rkrit -014547a313c11 criew

-&-q t -Err3144#3 4R t 4TT cfkr 34wrztm-r Terra  c0 4i1

t a f f  R f l i r f f r r  f f i t r t i  t  t 11-444 34 1 t f t - 34 f t--4 f  j i g

tif0#4 f -P4 w:ra r 44 t 3TeTfq

ifififsft, 3r re4- 1rff, clifoNt f t w f f 31t193

ftRr, TS TWIT.<16614 n--

144-C9. -4T4it ) , Titittif ffaTT

utikm#44) 33-tr3 wrr l'4- (1).4 at i6tsifaRr 4 Eflov-t o t i o

3t-r3 erw ftrarr 3VT&T4r1c4V11 :

Er9 ZW  31i7 ziR crq Errifr-A-t P i t i t a t T2IT

f t r +- tffr fa cAvricizr 321-r1ra 7:1,&4- z w r * i n t  t  f f -1

-04 34 tff t" -T #41141 -0 cwrm arreTrrs
Oqi I";

(iii) 37-t ifil  (2)  ti .Z.493  ( ' ) 5T c11T tfR Reif uiNut;

(iv) 3 17- t IR T (4) t vju (W) 31-- 1 4--iraR.qcf 164

va ,g f q iit.ji1, 3mfq:-

- r -fr*I4Rineirr t q4 WvdI1c11d3cdatrm4 -g N I  Ta f f

t r --A f#R ot4f% f f i j  l a v i c o  f t -cwr

3tr4-4-ff 41HEL -*-33 & f e a r artirff

9-#--ferifT f4-q 117 /1t0-1 M 3ITTR *ti TFERT f t 3 7

309T tiTT;"; Thai

(v) ff--rif3r (6) 4 44 ff-R s t r# ' M N "ET

W E" VR 4 ITIf r \ f l  fa ,

2006 (t 5. v i  3 0 1-ftaff %TNT 5 Th3̀1 311-4TTRT (1) 4,-
a m -4-am 32
5TRT 5 ?ifcr3 (vi) 7e .1N ER ,  f ra f t ird. Wcr3. Eret-o-ifftrff f 1/47 k 41 .

ifiAtEM I 3 1 2 k -

"(vi) n Ycae lid e l ErRrir f4,q trr EIT-tt  f t rifEr  ZU

ttE-Tuf 3IT4ZT i-witict) 31TM -iif t d. 5TI 4511 ;ct)

1%-.34M-r4ffyr -TEEM suffrzif

Pi c8i cr) .4- 4fl flirieligtir -11;

s tfo r ftPazciR Evora 3r1-4-1ff 311ErP1 artar faf timrr 1'404t

giv Th eo-al-gift m-#  # t  a w n ( '  f a x c A s a m z x
* 3 Th lin i4 Thcif fdafff b ir ,  n ir i fu f f r  f il lt l kac lf

61,11q Vilr11;";



HA R Y A N A  G O VT .  G A Z.  (EX T R A . ) ,  F E B. 2 9 ,  2 0 1 2 6 7 9

(P HG N . 10, 1933 SA1CA)

tgus (ix) A, 4 f avA t-r f 4 t A 3,P-TrA - ; "

v I t R u f A u  G m unq i i r; U2Tt

(iii) u u d  ( i x ) *  W C ,  1 ,-- , 4 4  R u r A N 411, 3T Tfr -

" (x) T fav rc i-A 3 9 -4-T9 34Tzt4 gp<1 W g --d Rk Li A l t, * x-r

t i fitT qty<u,s i t n Th-q t  3 1 4 -T341,

arg-f rr i  c t i -qtr Tri f t  gwrq xlco T rA  tg

a r c i t -wiNcgctr t 9 T I" I

6. 1 31T?Tr4ZPi SqRT 10 Tar@ ER, i I 1s lcf tTRT Aftfeliftrd

wkrift , 3rs-Tfq:-

- 10 er tu if 43/444.e1 w a f t 1-6h5 di TTT -P_TrzrAT

(1) f d x t l i g i g fm- At 1161RCIf CRT Utir 3 t-feA S t r l i c4 t r i

f a l t i i R e r k -* p  9 - 411

(2) 7.11--d7 312c41 t h 311tff a t M *TN- ( 1441-1,

31Elfai nT r l a T T R'erTfern rgi c 0 411 I1T W 9i a1r

r r a * MIM444 r$+11 41140.1 I5T crim4 i"

7. T O $ 31 ETTRT 11 S 3 1T-4.191 (1) M T (2) TH,

-N-rq 9 -rd-R u f 4 a  S  7 R A f t , 31P-Tf

"(1) LIILI)ulch ff iTh-R 1  f aY a nV Ic l a * f a q m- A t r  m- A t4TT t a 9  x , y 4

f ar i li xt f a . -o-n-Ria- cI) 411 5iY \ixticH f t e r r 3T1gTac1.

t i e 4  T o --e -q  4 A r a  T h -ektr xxh< 7.)-A

f i r a t  v d t wrq-#11

R w u r . f a w n , '  f f i l r  f a c a v i d o t R

0 4 I

(2) 14-- rr-ii  f f i f er f a g v e a l n T A  A  z i t -ge A f t-d u M

TIRA-4- S w c u l t f dzqR v i o er H 3TRATPT, t i R f l i p i i

aTurra-Tri, if4A41 -t m -Q- ar-vr a -9 cnxo r t

S f * r t iufa-: ArTrff : uitcr <N4 4 -T-f r * f t  z u f t

faY41 E.11ell1 in I iii4\714) f icptT ff  arfOrIAA,

v c r a r t r i i n ' W a i t ? S t  . 3 4 q ,c4I m- cb xd i  S zu r

\it-ARRA arg-A-R f o r e A A i A c k 4  t f u m -a-trr

f i t 4  q y  < p x ,) *MR mt i i 4 c f r mr  t i"

8. 10 3 T t i f t t r i  S  U H T 14 tauNg (4) 4T-C. f4 4-i 1M-Zgo- f. s . 4 Tan

"(4M) TiefaTT ftziTq W;" I

20013 t .gRITT"

afftrfizT9 32  t i

EITT 10 tT

2006 t Fi tf ruf

3Tibr409. 32 e
1.11.6 11 kfiT

ar t kP

2006 1 6Ri.muif

3 n  3 2  t i
WV 14

-#Thiq I



2006 M 6R441(71.

aiRtkuR 32 #

CPT 17 4,1

ATItt ii I

2006 ffi 6140uff

ad tka r r  32  #

M T  l a  W

frviltm t

2006 t 6fP171711

arfOrkzr9 32 -4

ETRT 18

ffl 'ii

6 8 0 HA R Y A N A  G O V T .  G A Z.  (E XT RA . ) ,  F E B. 29 ,  20 1 2

(P H G N . 10 ,  1 9 3 3  S A KA )

9. T O  3 411iWZPT Ter U R I  1 7 5  31T-UNT (1) T TeT17 tR ,  P J4W etc i

Tri t-a u f t f f 7rcrrf t, are e ti : -

"(1) cgmLita .014 ETTRT (7) 4 7 .-- rz \14, f t vg facr id4

3 9 4 -r4 a n t i T i w f t t u a r t * 3 1 7 1 R < V A L I D  g N I  f 4 9 w r

f4Hrr cr t i r  ci k Tsf Ther31-4 -* f k t T t r r 0 4 * -'0rr :

cf let wf r a t 4 0 T r f i r * t r z v r -q,  ( tr i g '?  c i l r r -4 4  * I

7 ) 4  a i-g R T i f 4 a C t i  w r 4 [ 7 :

c u r t  t r g 71 4 f t  c r r i t i f i t  7 4 4 1  a n t  W I 4 0 0-R 4 *  t r z -w q

f nw 4-4 443-o- <mor 7 4 0 4 )  4-4-r< t cv i c' t q A501 9 -e ( n o r

t u g r f 4  f t -f 4  41  40r  4 7 4 -R1 w , 4 4  0  S  4 g f  t t i f t I" I

i o . 17  a 1t 1 ff iWr S U R I  1 8  S -ART TPA@ TR, Thi-if*Zgct 3-cf-

u m ~ l i f t )  7 R a i 1 ,  a w _ T f c r :

"(1) cr!,(4 S W r R 5f l t i , mier1.14) 34UTE-T ' Q 4

t r a Wr 7rcrri r, 14R(kuitt f a ( N r: cr3c1 * A 4

f axgrdc ri d4 7 -1-41-4 3171)1T aNT W 6ff artt i f iai t t f 8140 I" I

11. t o t 3 T f t f 4 1 H t t  t r r 0  l a  * 4 -14,1 WZgct zi f i r  T 4 1 7 1-crif t. 7 2 -

- i s T .  4 0 4 4 f 4 0 * a M i p t r  a u r

(1) u r t u r  ' N -A t f f t r a f t r - zr wr 4--d A *  a r t w r t  6 1 44

4 1 n i 4 *  7 -1 0 R q3c .Ai rR r ghr r T hro f r  fwar  \ o wn

(2) zrfteu f ) 4 , 1 4 ,  *

3r71f0u UP -7T  44T trd w0e3rq  0-44 gr<I r :

(i i ) 4 4 4 1 S * I R or<4 rn f c 411441tror TE4F-1

51-47ti  c t r t if  ;

(fir) 4 f 3umt W f i t ql,ndro tg \994 3 1 7 0 1 T 3 1 7 1 R

- v r i c p r i  * f . k; ;

(iv) 1.01- 1 S 3 c F g r E I T T  f 4E r f vur  *  f 4 -6-0 4 Tr i t t l t

W114 i f t r i t i f tE re rm iiWJ q t le r - - f t k rd i t a i

4144 f q 4:04 4a4 mar IrtgRr m f4-c g9 f 4-olcbcr

T T i T  ;

(v) c i a 14-AT ? S t 31- 4 914-R4 t H

1 kriikt, 4sf Pt r t i - r  i zmr t i i "



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 681
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

12. t e f  3 W I 1 F T S U R I  3 0  k -

W B-0 6TZt (1) T W13 (-50 T TaTR tR, PI-1reifbcf WIZ ced-fizuftd

f t-zit 1/4itN4u, azelf-q : -

- (u ) tettf4q14 uErr metf 4 i f i f z * f t 4 -42- eu 7r4

u9-er srfactql ctril;";

3 .0.--101-6 (2) BVIT (3)T WT6 TR PI-ifi=ifisci. .urf-umq wedeirrita
mbr uiiqi1 av4t4:-

" ( 2 ) YIN-1 4 4 f * --T-u zifavut-izt TT WIT lifenrf frETTi ch

uzir t  a i -M t k a q  i t t & T i t fdvcrfaiumzz

su4 -ITNT a r a r * 111-f f rf f*  31171-4 f g

11.<41K *ATV ct) , It

qY45.1IeBT NF u-fz r mem TIftka li f t 6 R

U211 LIfl 4. 10-(101 3110T44 WT v1) tlY1)%1

c m-tr i t \ i r g  f a z 4 we iz i 53-111- u'arr

u f a  t i x A c c m q  Pu .m teu ,r  c m t tro- n r a
w i t ffigr cykr 91\4 zzufer litcH 3 i f i t c 4 a,n !

13. Pga 31f4M611  S  U R I  3 1  S  3 0.-4iRT (3) k 91i1" i t  T t.TT9

"cit-f  +11\9 Yle4 cred--feu Rru ft-q  . 1 1 0

(3)

14. Tia 1-113T 32 .4 BTRINT (3) " T t h e '  v r - 1-* 3=21T9 tfq.

"Arr Hi f i 4 1 4 4  A l t f e r i f t f .4 )q A w l- I

15. 1:19 3TR Ifka li S  W C  33 S EITRT (2) mizz V i-C 1 ' P a
Me.4 Lif0w2TTR10 f+-7  k 4 1 0 I

16. a r i t m i l l i  5 E M T  3 4 $ 61-q, 'f l"-Ir tf1TRTg i t w t f t ,

"34T. 40:1,406 CITT4T ztrz4 TT ciffiTTR in zpizIs**r

azurzrff trRnz zirzwk*f c  3 f f e t ru  f a x z av id z i  zu - f d t r e

T 31TIT6 ZIZTE Witu f=491-Tur f3u)-8 Tzre-u tNcoN & f r u

(11 111 I

( 2 ) \I-N r 4 7 H '? I rc l fa W a te  T-@ftf iTei faYlraf..0cdil ti1 1-11c),L66+4

TR 4)14014 3R-ZRM f g  g r e SITRT1T zOzir uzu

faxo rkuc iz t m-). T T : W I  i n 0145614 36,1:149. S1WPH o n 4

; A z t , t,z ,1:1 sf i 41 39-61-1t t i  w-741

2006 M

32 c ti

UM 3 0 chl n t i t H  !

2006 6% 0 141

31Itrf tar1 32

EMI  31 451#11)T1,.1 I

2006

37PUM7.114 32  if !

EMT 32 ThT f t Z t r a

2006 TA MErtric

S E P T  3 2

tITIT 33 451 irerEP. I

2006 S & W m '

311E.114617 32

ure 34Th. 347.1 citit



682 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(3) f a z a f a v t o a t w o H t - faf .4 .4t e ITTRIVR fa i r 1.91,nt t  c rE E

ThtIT I f291t  gt 4-1141c4 lA ch h i 1-k

31.1444 120 faa &Fitt af fira- vIN4(1, TA* 4R

tlIqz10.1 ZIT 14)140H 31,1144 Yr cM.) et f k ,i-NchN $1.Ti

tr zr T r i a  a c t

34 131-. 1410,40H 'tcC 4r<4 That 7 I f t i f a  E-gfiE er %suet t
f j fdifacAlcia 3ittf4EM-44 MT Th2T-J131.1 * rcntjuf trra
EM.) S ri  R e z t  4 rig t zrg 4E1 iifti aro4

Ect--raRR4 giE f a f l Z ,d  S vflq, u r r 4 z r a r Z I T  S 31E21IFI
E f r a t m-7 E t E l  g

34 111 3141lTh-T3TNR ilAc h a t,M.- (1) L e 31itriktFE*310177P-Tifeta"

Act-tW faYcliacliciel P T * i t -4i tITTTWIT /If 4fidsbq 3TEIR19

* wEE 4 I M E  l id  f a  - 1 1 S  * p e a t  TO  Th iEf t e f E r d

3t a i t z  c o l a - ftaTur  zre'a s ucta13ia wErr, 301E:-

o t i lm i 317117 31T2RE4 toi.4 gIE
liziER EffrE, kililuET3T- s r a r E * s S t Ect
t f l y r -a f f  * 3 r 4 r f44-taff uP-Tr

1,171ThtORA 44)447ffrff =Pre E2E PERI

flr Efra zuro,acocr r  t r 4 t-4 310E9- zicif V t t r zrr

4K 4 14414C41c14 th eir ffY.1T it-1114 ftii*lifffq war (Ma

ItzEl 1 t a iL A

(4) t i t r t f t -f r * Iltt4TRzif WaTitci rtifTR1Tt,

c r it lo a NUR@ T1-4t.T

it r r ad  a t t  V rf i t R TTJ g a S t  S  t i t v i  ;

(Er) fak  z r raciu n a  E r r  s a-E NW :R A' S E t r a m S
icl ;

1.4 , i1514ik azt-

t h a t e t t fdfaiiirr ifi4wrzr g NT 1 ,,d 14,q
g ;

(E) zr- r t a rq z ra r 11 itailioa 316749" 4 34axi f t 7  4 z I

&-d  z r r  Ora fa-awl*  . 4 .4 .4

n \LH-14TFT Trita .34-111441.<1 Etzr -riga a

ea r  av - ir  c ro r att*f7 r um -met uwk4r4t S

EfOr ;



HA R Y A N A  G O V T .  G A Z.  ( EX T RA . ) ,  F E B. 2 9 ,  2 0 1 2 6 8 3

(P HG N . 10, 1 9 3 3  S A KA )

(0 ) 3TUTz19 I-14)14 M t4R uf f 7 i T # Ittri irrTh. 3r f r i c ,

31Eff179 39714 t suf tra t war \3 \44 zrg e i t u i t z i r  T ra t

g f s r i l4ter  R Af Ac r j f M t i q ,24.1 t i 34-r a f t

t i g t t r  t ;

(7 ) to-rrAre, T ticPreiEl u2zr 31TEMT7 lif Err4  w'r

R i f f am! zemigiRcp arrur cw_rr cdPitctiar fazAREada

S t a  R A  u t f r1/2 g lz r  c r r t u T aman ' i t a  I t r a

`?-71 tarPT 3T-aRt(-4 - ?mu 31- 1 41t113# #41/ 14 TE497 ;

(51) 3110411 -6 f t T U211 ar- r t iAT Trecd cr3)-w

tr ra : zrwr i m w r z f t n 31ZZEC9 f c z r a r r  W O- 31/2; f i t u

wr i t  su1rw3o r  ur31  z r r f azaR enew i r fARRtd trra:zr

R a n ;  t t  f t f l d . - tr1/23grr ;

FOUra ti le i g 337T9 & f ern 3TW I1I# 1956 (1956

31WP:Ff 3) ZIT ( l i t  W i t  3 F L I  f a i t -cA 31Eit

a t T T r c  f t 4 i  R A A J A  t  w i r d  t i

rakr * R I  * 1- r uGII6,113sr-i r 3 1 7 T 1 1 TO* ,

t  f1/2-eizz 11211 LT hrm l W  3,1ziEr ticir ci

31ThaTI ;

(Z) c t q 31- F ?ego- W1 -a n :

t w q  f a z a r A t A g i a  a n t  S -4 1114.d '47 Wfl 9 7 1

aS  f1/2f 4 z z r r  m w a r c r  4 5 1/2311/2 tT211 ;Tit 1.0bil-M i r

79 HT -TRW wr arm R-f k - kA'Al

t  ; R i t a  1 4 1 4 - 4 TiTarrr 31/2mu 3 r 3 i  t e g z r r

=Hum A-a r t e  z r z 1 3,1/2mcnixtrr 311/23  R e i N n i

(2) sa3Aw fAxAraermA fAA-nr  t r e r wr Met If e t r r si f t

Wtwo  P i Jc f  w1/21rr f t n r -W  u t i m r , Rif zur

R w z r  t1/2-g f o r r a l t r w uzzr * f l w" ,

Th--1 3 T 91/2W 1° 7 1-1/24 1  q1/2Zr4t I" I

17. 31f iatf # Thai Wa#17 WU 36 *TP-119 tR.1-4 4-i1gbd t IN T ArdM1RM

"36. thaR i RYcl1at4104, LR, t kc f r i l

clkIK Th-R t i Oci f  t 4-t  t e r l t w  3 r W 4r 31 I ñ i H  a t i  f a 4

11.<41K A-4 M I

(2) 11$141q'r 6R241.1(*arfirart t  W  t r t f r  u l t s r d  W  f r c z ISE
t u zr13zrar [7 Tri1. r n tR  & mi ta  g i t  uP - r r

2006 61441191

36it41-+:14 32 et
1117I 36 51

-1i-711-R



2006

4.11 P WT  32 Thar

MT  4 0  MT

itintrff I

2006 6ft6111111

M t n -all 32 Or

EMI  44 4+1

i r " 1 - 3

684 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

trtir credwa /5* iir luf Ire ANTfr ;

(ii) crtii crfayrd* 2/5 SEKIFIIff`ed Stbrre SITE,
t wcali;

(iii) weir 4ea-40**1 2/5 m-1-25 Fri:07Td tHTh̀ tEre:
Wei I

(3) RYcliaViciil kik14)41-1 37-1..TRT (1) "Me (2) 3F-Teri ?aft ti
T.41 f$--ift 41 9Tri sucr 4 fv404 let wsiirr:

iR famReriertr 14igrrufe4711 in 31--t-R1beRf
ZIT3T- r tr4.t)tr taw.; t 33--
*1'<chH ITN IS 4 1:414- ufam-mr* faq 1t Critca, TINTE
graTein tr4re grd7M ticMT EF 5T31-1 *-49. ett  t  I" I

i t TO 3ritffi-ZPI tTRT 40 RIT9" SINT At-fteRM
ari4d;:-

"40. RYclikileitt, ?VWViiichrf 3117 IMITZFff qi4t1c, 41T-A7 TIT
W *4 1-ai cr- frzr4

wiz iii3fri itict)K afti aiR:r RI)imich 1'Am-0r
faxofderienr* \ictcrmi-zuF ThwRil*

facriatirma i1 ricrN TR14'i:144041 Ttif0.0  t
(4)4111 faYcInVicig cic4ZT-411 LN)q) trM 44 M 34-T3T-6-TR ZIT
ii1-44 f ifw01* wcrwt 5 t t werrcrr
w ar cniciNirr r

19. 1:TFaN t  I N T  4 4 tR, Rsct ETRT Sirdeeitid
Wcrrn, 3TP-Tfq:-

"44. MYcInelleiztSNIaTuTMIT "tqf SintiSe1 atsll LiteTT

chi4Si fl 't t Si vrWr.-(1) facrfacriera 3TEZITE(q,
ell  Mir fflW infaxofdsiiwi 0 -4140 War 3T- T ITPTA"

3rl4e4-guit *suit-4 *. f q irqr faro 1\41 trt
4 1'4E00 chiciN4t

(2) TREFR Fir41 Yi4DC11 ORIT fet4 itta tri
Irraur 31littffift4U 024pa cm4 ueir wirer

* fak! .3-orrai gmi 120.1-1PT,6P4-11°11i n W it 374J
174-t - rt i T e gl<A l t i r C4nv141*WRZPT4t arlicb S i M i r

14ZIN-1 4 4 if d t 4 I c l I f5 4fl tift f l t a r  *ft  r e
Le &WAIF, 14P1Loilt, 31Earke, (*it.



HA RY , A N A  G O VT .  G A Z.  (EXT R A . ) ,  F EB. 2 9 ,  2 0 1 2 6 8 5

(14 IG N. 1 0 ,  1 9 3 3  S A KA )

3 1-g k t wrsTzr 9 w -0  mT  3 r -T r r a 9

t  ue r r 9 9 974Y at az  4,14 ,< 6r  t

(3) & A u T f4wrzz ? a z gr l o r R A - M T T a r t 44R- trrzf r 7r-er

t T r O  i -Nct7P1 Th"" Ji rr T i m W  l i t a z  a g r t  i t t 8  t r l I

rzu I t w i w t r f t 921-r -f .t<rfUrraix tgetif trIZr (TNT  Ri

oN ur  41r3119t1 tf l ut i :a * f t 7 th 9  a r r9  i f  and

W f a c r f a t r i e w  W  l ' a w 4  t 1 i S i m i A a  I

(4) 0101 iff3T). e \ict-Pi 1:R MAR c. ,)  M N . i i

3 T WIP:17 3Tc.fr9 71TR?1 3TRIRifiTa S E t r f t  r

20. I T . Sa ffk al l  T h°1 U M  4 4 * 41-4,

"44 i -T a t -  l a Y i 1 a C T I c i 4 tR caSIYIN-K i t r aZI T  i r4T f q  u t u

T r r 9 4 9 w r i N  t o . ). W  i t r-91C if t qc r  xi i Rc r i t  30( t rf i rdS i 7 1

3TM-d i t 311

(i) t 5 TrT J I t z a r w 3,rw R I I #  c r ' o r  t w-9 -r ;

(ii) -R I-T o-9 T er i t l A m d B ; r w m- Rt S  i t Azr  wr1W r

(i i i ) far crfaurew 5I g1tR.TT-4. ,F11. f4-Er-d-9 :

<R11 T r r f e ru4  u-nR r e r -d S w c r e F t w 4

fd aR c r te re tS  t r t o r  wura r i  R t re -i i  9k ?c m T rz r r

21. T T &  3T R at i #  S  M T  46

ZITETRT 7 T 41- 1

"(7 T) WERTT faYcl144104 S 3TTZE R -f

w y t hm t i cr i t 41R trzrf iT t a 9

w i n S t N c h l i i t  I T 4 ar-f r t --9 faxcriaCAleitl Si
Tr.c c r i t t r i u u 10 . 9 ,441 i N G q c i i cr) . k S vre4mrt

0 ,111";

(i i ) zqurRT (3) W wzr9 Thr-ireiRicr vErtrwr wed-i tufErd wrwi t ,

3 1 * : -

19) . TrErrzr (8) W 3TEM ftcf1.8 Crif t tR, tV1cON. tfreitg

faYcnVie14 TT elliT  ct) F t m f  6 * a lt i t f f  34T ze if
.i t tgri trq  w@f i t #  t i xuur r fd aidcriertr

wri t 4RaPcre9aur f l t i t f kwr z r  i f M i ta  t  v i r q4 :

2006 e b l i u r

31Wrilli  32

ER7 44 M fial

7Iffr I

2006 gfttriulT

arltrMli 32 4t

UM 46 -40

44tET9



2006 b14441°11

3 t )f f i l l i i  3 2

E7RI 47 41 Thi '46R

fi-.11I

2006 ttuon
3151f1TP1 32

3 7 1 7 0

477ntiq

686 HAR YANA GOVT. GM. (EXTR A.) , FEB. 29, 2012
(PEON. 10, 1933 S A K A )

T R %  31TETTRT (8) 31}.11# tr 3c f & f ,  f t r A T I T  Z I T  T 4 t4O H

c c i c r r  r e  & MN q v  3 I S E T 6) ,)  f $ . f O c r f t r -d -zr f t i f ec r

TRIT t

22 . Trd. 3 T f t t W T  t t  t I R T  4 7 41-4, .1 1-- 1 RAct I T T i t 31 2 t ht - -

"4745. 4.11.1 114cr. M. 4 113 3 I f t q # 1.

3 W 4 4 9 " M mg l u t r i f cp lo f Pc id ( m . )

o t h t i t &  t 1" 1

23 . ILO 3 a1 1:4 4 #  T hr21 31-g i t i r -it. ET16 ONT t r ,1 4 1,4Riftc4.11 -c t

a r q , f t r ; f 6 i t c a  s n q  f r -c9Err uzir 3 t c f r r r r 4  c r P o i t t r i . 1 1 4  t  w r c t t , a r t -

"7 . 41-4T Tr-f a  9 -raT eart a i t a r d -8

8. crr i f 4 4 1 4 s t i c r i o

9. S  f f i r c i D c a d o

t,11  * k W "

ftr T ErFq-(q

fTIT t_onic r



H A R YA N A  GO V T .  G A Z.  (E X T R A . ) ,  FE B . 29, 2012 687

(REIGN. 10, 1933 S AK A )

4* (4  m-r i c i l u t

fl,7.0 v i a  a W a l 0 1tor 4 *di. awiTR-1141-1 s,(4 tuftw i r-

ti<tiii aft r a i r R Thci anaursattNnst< fOlor 4fdtregft acsic-cvPicr wold41
mficilfct cr,<4 ar-i -mi 4 t4 lpft tc-i0 44 2o2o 0 21131T Thtl *k9c4r 4

4)-6-41 A cm 4 a 30-6-211ThT61 t 1 3 -ccIM Prior 4 Nocil 414 a to cr,44 hi f
ic,cok j ip4p4 T.4 1 8c i tr Intzr 6i)1 ftoT sr-c-r4 cm 4 *fi,; f4ut1a3

Trte9i4 c1)ici4 ti toftrw TERfil- Tacii4 -4 34110  3 1 7 4 clla 1a r r o -i r l a t a s

Picnicii I* 11c611-6c1 4/24 tq tNcrm i r 6P 401111 ThuR 1.)24211e121 3TRIT01-9, 2006

G1-11../1 -1TTIT11 29 t. c16c1 f f i t fdslidweici) -ciffi a iuift ti

n 1 1 ' 31-4 c-10 tftrw 4)31 4 3--1 -tz i 1T#

z4f4 31-4r441 ffurt t met 21-6- & T M fd,c4r Trai t ciar fOrer
arratzzrama a .1,4 ical cm 4 41vr 3t-ar91 tixftvi -Tram wsurT t-q Tto

TIT-421T Th-t <114 Th`l 31TP-T1Wat 1

tft0 1i4ief C114 -rid44 -e11141e161 f4errt

S N s(4 §N .  z i t i gN -fr 4,-0 3th 3rzr-d t r a txcr-fr vW- srrawr
Pao Rc4r Trzt t wet &raft-4U Ffl ThzciRsuciql 4 imitra4 wirr-41 ticii4

at-14ft t4 t f4uta TRrr ti

111-e r  3 1-4 -W7-21-1146 ffia idxoRtnew wg-fdeara 4 ftoT ;Km R-t t  f 4 t
faxardvieRit *fc; qrl-r f4wiict ithz P5 tim Thi3ts-RIN4 ftroT u-cr4 chi -TT

311k4121.MTT Rtir Trzu t uen-14 zit fka ferrfur Rs:11441(.0TR opi -141 61,11i

3Tra1d?1117111Thclt1T2ITTI, alzict trzi-dra Ttp_r Rs:Acacia- alizi-rcra
I r t fdact4to4I<Vtcrfart silk *Qui ra t& vo 5 4,04 cis wor4 aftt

faNfdwou i f4tifecr 6)4 a ftgrfa4 120N glO nW IT Z0 1 cN 4, 1416,1151)PTtM

c4,4 343. tr k r e d *4 MI 3a1tIiR, 142c1Relle14 alV 111-11 MTE ofkar4
vs-elm- -414117-4ft t j 3P4tiT  fdzofhliew

301  %Ti t 41-4O 4 Rgardsimilhi Tgrrs-4 t-f 4 6'<chN ThrT .4S -g4 at)T faxcilluiecca
KRnem RT4r t4, th-q5FAYIN-1-174 trrwa 4 al-Ilk ..1.1 i oion.,1441R-Isaldviciet

fa1/4; Thf4zu-r 4114 itt wiqi' qttovrat, 3114e4611f t ' t 4p4  t i t c /12uf t  1

11a 3611, 614e0113111t4T01141114121T tM Inste vz msiii ittath
,esetp,d fSar Trit t dif4) TrktThT ctI ,m-cir rt  u.au afaid ves-zrr 39BN 6P611111

tuft T d6c-r T41 fdthf.lici) itt aff 4 it-E ftra *la> 'ti t ;Fa-9-F v161

tv41- jT11e1d T12011 fa,zir 'nit



688 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

arraftet a l l i t r i V i  4  a f f m Z-OPZ4 Thct  g r i k i  t -q f CII qiqr
i m-9T2T fdqfdcuo f ff tra-a-F4 c9.410 \mo f4z-a1raw u24 m191 i--4744 atfrs

fttarawd4 Nerd an4 .iqkxu sw ;Rua tredt4-44 FUT TRIT

34H: r4-S  I M F  t

THJ.69 :

29 thCdt , 2012

49655--H VS. H UR , Chd

Tfr-dr
ftair 4 , 5Rziluit

ftri THH,


