Regd. No. CHD/0093/2012-2014

Hargany Gouernment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
© Govt. of Haryana

CHANDIGARH, WEDNESDAY, FEBRUARY 29, 2012
(PHALGUNA 10, 1933 SAKA)
HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 29th February, 2012

No. 12-HLA of 2012/13.—The Haryana Private Universities (Amendment) Bill,
2012, is hereby published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of
the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative
Assembly:—

Bill No. 12-HLA of 2012

THE HARYANA PRIVATE UNIVERSITIES
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2012

A
BILL
further ta amend the Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the
Sixty-third Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Private Universities (Amendment)
Act. 2012.
2, In section 2 of the Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006 (hereinafier

referred to as principal Act),—

Price : Rs. 5.00 {663)

Shon title.

Amendment of
section 2 of
Haryana Act 32 of
2006.



664 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(i} after clause (a). the following clauses shall be insertied. namely:—
“{aa) ‘Bar Council of India’ means the Bar Council of India
constituted under the Advocates Act. 196] (Central

Act 25 of 1961).

{ab) ‘campus’ means that area of the university in which it s

established;™,
(ii)  clauses (d) and (e) shall be omitted;
(iity for clause (f), the following clauses shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(f) ‘employee’ means a person appointed by the university and
includes a teacher. officer and any other staff of the
university;

(fa) ‘existing private university’ means a university which has
been established under the Haryana Private Universities
Act. 2006 (32 of 2006) befare the notification of the
Haryana Private Universities (Amendment) Act. 2012:

(fb) *faculty’ means a group of academic departments of similar
disciplines;™;

{ivi  for clause (j}. the following cluuse shall be substituted.

namely: --
“(jY  ‘hostel” means a place of residence of the students of the
aniversity;”;
{v) after clause (k). the following clause shall be inserted.
namely @ —

“(ka) ‘Indian Nursmg Council’ means an autonomous body
constituted under section 3 of the Indian Nursing
Council Act, 1947 (48 of 1947),™. "
{vi) for clauses (m) and (n), the following clauses shall be
substituted. namely :—
“(m) ‘National Assessment and Accreditation Council” means
National Assessment and  Accreditation Council,
Bangalore, an autopomous institution of the University
Grants Commission;
(ma) ‘National Board of Accreditation’ means National Board
of Accreditation, New Delhi. an autonomous body of All
India Council for Technical Education:
(n) ‘National Council for Teacher Education’ means the
National Council for Teacher Education, Delhi;™;
{vii) clauses {0} and (p) shall be omitted;
{(viii} for clause (q). the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—
“(q) ‘Pharmacy Council of India’ means Pharmacy  Council
of India. Delhi;™,



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 665

(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

3

4,

(ix)

(x)

(x1)

{xii)

for clause (s). the following clause shall be substituted.
namely:—

*(s)

‘regulating body’ means a body established by the
Government of India for laying down norms and
conditions for ensuring academic standards of higher
education, such as University Grants Commission, All
India Council for Technical Education, National Council
for Teacher Education, Medical Council of India, Bar
Council of India, Pharmacy Council of India, National
Assessment and Accreditation Council, Indian Council of
Agriculture Research, National Board of Accreditation,
Indian Nursing Council, Council of Scientific and
Industrial Research etc. and includes the Government or
any such body constituted by Government of India or the
Government;"”;

for clause (t), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely—

“(t)

‘Rules” means the rules made by the Government under
this Act;™;

clause (y) shall be omitted; and

for clause (z), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(z) ‘teacher’ means a Professor, Associate Professor, Assistant

Professor or any other person required to impart
education or guide research or render guidance in any
other form to the students for pursuing a course or
programme of study of the university;".

In section 3 of the principal Act,—

for clause (6). the following clause shall be substituted.
namely:—

(1)

(ii)
(i1}

{iv)

(1)

~(6)

to establish a campus:™;

¢lause (7) shall be omitted;

for clause (9). the following clause shall be substituted.
namely :(—

“9

to maintain the academic standard of degrees,
diplomas, certificates and other academic distinctions
as per bye-laws and to ensure that the same are not
lower than those laid down by the regulating body;™;
and

clauses (10), (11) and (12) shall be omiited.

In section 4 of the principal Act,—

in sub-section (1), for sign (.) existing at the end, the sign (2)
shall be substituted;

Amendment of
section 3 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 4 of the
Haryana Act 32 of
2006,



Amendment of
section 5 of
Haryana Act
32 of 20006.

666 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(M after sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be added.
namely :

“Provided that the university excluding existing
private university shall offer minimum three faculties at its
commencement and shall provide instructions upto the level
of Ph.D. in a period of three years in any of the three facultics
in which it is imparting degree i.e. Humanities. Languages,
Medicines, Commerce, Science, Engineering, Information
Technology, Law, Agriculture and Allied Sciences,
Management (Business, Hotel, Hospitality, Tourism etc.),
Bio-Tech, Media and Mass Communication etc. with due
permission from the relevant regulating bodies:

Provided further that if a sponsoring body intends to set
up Health and Medical Sciences University, it shall not be
mandatory to offer minimum three faculties.”;

(iii) in sub-section (2), clause (r) shall be omitted:

{iv) in clause (a) of sub-section (4), the following sign and words
shall be added at the end, namely:--

*, manner of generation of funds to be raised by the
proposed university before its operations. The sponsoring
body shall give the detailed information in this regard as per
the format given in the bye-laws framed under this Act at the
time of application;”and

{v) in sub-section (6), for the words "one month” occurring twice,
the words “six months™ shall be substituted.
5. In sub-section (1) of section § of the principal Act, -
{i) for clause {vi), the following clauses shall be substituted.
namely:—

“(vi) give undertaking to appoint at least one Professor, two
Associate  Professors and adequate number of
Assistant Professors alongwith necessary supporting
staff in each department or discipline to be started by
the university;

(vi-a) maintain objectivity, fairness and transparency in the
recruitment of teachers of the proposed university
with qualification not less than those prescribed by
the University Grants Commission or other
regulating bodies;"”;

e,

(ii) in clause (ix), for the sign “.” existing at the end, the sign *;
shall be substituted; and



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 667

(PHGN, 10, 1933 SAKA)

6.

7.

8.

9.

(11i)

after clause (ix), the following clause shall be added,
namely:—

“(x) provide its commitment to prevent all types of
ragging in the campus in accordance with the
regulations prescribed by the University Grants
Commission, Government norms and statutory
provisions in this regard, if any.”.

For section 10 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted. namely:-—

“(1¢) Bar to affiliation and opening off shore campus

etc.— (1) The university shall not admit any college or institution to
the privilege of affiliation.

{2} 1t shali not open any off campus, off shore campus, study

centre and examination centre in or out of the State of Haryana and
shall not offer any programme through distance education mode.”.

For sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 11 of the principal Act. the
following sub-sections shall be substituted. namely :-—

*(l)  The sponsoring body shall establish an
endowment fund for the university with a minimum amount
of five crores rupees which shall be pledged in the form of
Fixed Deposit Receipt in original in favour of the Higher
Education Commissioner, Haryana, Panchkula,

Note : The provisions of sub-section (1) shall not be
applicable to the existing private university.

(2) The endowment fund shali be used as a security
deposit to cnsure that the university complics with the
provisions of this Act, Statutes, Ordinances, Rules and Bye-
laws. The Government shall have the power to forfeit the
whole or part of fund in case the university or the sponsoring
body contravenes any of the provisions of this Act, Statutes,
Ordinances, Bye-laws or Rules or use it for meeting the
expenditure for academic and administrative purposes in case
of dissolution in accordance with bye-laws .”.

In section 14 of the principal Act. after clause (4). the following clause
shall be inserted, namely:—

“{4A)

the Controller of Examinations:™.

For sub-section (1) of section 17 of the principal Act. the following sub-
section shall be substituted. namely:—

Amendment of
section (0 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section L1 of
Haryana Act
32 of 20006,

Amendment of
section 14 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 17 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.



Amendment of
section 18 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Insertion of
section 18A in
Haryanz Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 30 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

668

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
{(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

10,

“{1)  The Vice-Chancellor shall be appointed by the
Chancellor as per the gualifications prescribed by the University
Grants Commission, subject to the provisions contained in sub-section
(7) and shall hold office for a term of three years:

Provided that after expiry of the term of three years, the Vice-
Chancellor shall be eligible for re-appointment for another term of
three years:

Provided further that a Vice-Chancellor shall continue to hold
the office even after the expiry of his term till new Vice-Chancellor
joins. However, in any case the period shall not exceed one year.”.

For sub-section (1) of section |8 of the principal Act. the following sub-

section shall be substituted, namely:—

11.

*(1) The appointment of the Registrar shall be made by the
Chairperson of the sponsoring body in such manner, as may be
specified by the Statutes. The Registrar shall possess the qualifications
prescribed by the University Grants Commission.”.

After section 18 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

inserted, namely:—

12.

“18A, Appointment and functions of the Controller of
Examinations.-— (1} The Controller of Examination shall be whole
time salaried officer of the university and shall be appointed by the
Chancellor in accordance with the Statutes.

(2) It shall be the duty of the Controller of
Examinations,—

(i} to conduct examinations in a disciplined and
efficient manner;

(ii)  to arrange for the setting of papers with strict regard
to secrecy;

(iii) to arrange for the evaluation of answer-sheets in
accordance with the planned time schedule for
results;

(iv) to constantly review the system of examinations in
order to enhance the level of impartality and
objectivity with a view to make it better instrument
for assessing the attainments of students;

(v} to deal with any other matter connected with
examinations which may, from time to time, be
assigned to him by the Vice-Chanceilor.”.

In section 30 of the principal Act,—

(i) for clause (b) of sub-section {1), the following clause shall
be substituted, namely :—



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB, 29, 2012 669

(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

the ferms and conditions of appointment of the
Chancellor and the Vice-Chancellor and their powers
and functions;”;

u(b)

for sub-sections (2) and (3), the following sub-sections shall
be substituted, namely:—

(it}

*(2) The Governing Body shall prepare First Statute
of the university and submit the same to the Government
for its approval within a period of one month after
incorporation of the university in the Schedule of the Act.

(3) The Government shall consider the First Statute
submitted by the university and if any modifications are
deemed necessary, the same shall be conveyed to the
university for sending the amended draft and if the amended
draft is found in order, it shall give approval within a period
of three months from the date of its receipt.”.

13.  In sub-section (3) of section 31 of the principal Act, for the words “two
months”, the words “three months™ shall be substituted.

14.  In sub-section (3) of section 32 of the principal Act, for the words “two
months”, the words “three months” shall be substituted.

15. In sub-section (2) of section 33 of the principal Act, for the words “two
months”, the words “three months” shali be substituted.

16.  After section 34 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be
inserted, namely:—

“34A. Authorisation to commence the course.— (1) The
university intending to start a new course or programme of study, shall
intimate such intention to the Government, along with an assessment
report as prescribed under the bye-laws.

(2) The Government shall specify the manner in which the
university shall commence enrolment of students for such course or
programme of study and shall give authorization to the university to

Amendment of
section 31 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amecndment of
section 32 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 33 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

insertion of
sections 34A,
34B and 34 in
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.



670

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

start the course or programme of study and also approve the procedure
thereof.

(3} The university shall not commence first enrolment of
students without specific authorization of the Government. In no case.
the application for authorization be kept pending beyond 120 days,
whereafter it shall be deemed to have the concurrence of the
Government to start the course or programme of study,

34B. Power to cancel a course.— The Government may if it
is satisfied that the university is not in a position to efficiently
discharge the duties and obligations imposed, it may, after making
such inguiry, as may be specified by bye-laws, cancel the permission
to continue the course or programme of study.

34C. Compulsory disclosure of information.-— {1) Every
university established under this Act shall publish before expiry of
sixty days prior to the date of the commencement of admission to any
of its courses or programme of study, a prospectus containing the
following information. namely:—

(a) each component of the fee. deposits and other charges
payable by the students for pursuing a course or programme
of study. and the other terms and conditions of such
payment;

{b) the percentage of tuition fee and other charges refundabte to
a student in case such student withdraws from university
before or after completion of course or programme of study
and the time within, and the manner. in which such refund
shall be made:

{(c) the number of seats approved by the statutory authority in
respect of cach course or programme of study for the
academic year for which admission is proposed to be made;

{d} the conditions of elipibility for admission in a particutar
course or programme of study;

{e)  the educational qualifications specified by the university
where no such qualifying standards have been specitied by
any regulating body:

N the process of admission and selection of candidates.
including all relevant information with regard to the details
of test or examination for selecting such candidates for
admission to each course or programme of study and the
amount of fee to be paid for the admission test;

(g) details of the teaching faculty, including therein the
educational qualifications. teaching experience and
indicating therein whether such member is a regular facility
member or is a visiting member;

(h) information with regard to physical and academic
infrastructure  and other facilities including hostel



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), FEB. 29, 2012 671

(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

information. ",

()

k)

accommodation. library and hospital or industry wherein
the practical training to be imparted to the students and in
particular the facilities accessible by students on being
admitted to the university:

broad outlines ot the sytlabus specified by the appropriate
statutory autharity or by the university, as the case may be,
for every course or programme of study. including the
teaching hours, practical sessions and other assignments;

all relevant instructions with regard to maintenance of
discipline by students within or outside the campus,
prohibition of ragging and consequences thereof for
violating the provisions of any regulations in this regard
made under the University Grants Commission Act. 1956
(Central Act 3 of 1956) or any other law for the time being
in force.

any such other information which may be prescribed:

Pravided that the university shall publish information
referred to under this section on its website. and the
attention of prospective students and the general public
shall be drawn to such publication on the website through
advertisements displayed  prominently in the different
newspapers and through other media.

{2) Every unijversity shall fix the price of each printed copy
of the prospectus. not more than the reascnable cost of its publication.
distribution or sale and its copy shall be sent (o the Government for

]

17.  For existing section 36 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“36. Fee structure.— {1) The university may, from time to time,
prepare fee structure and shall send it for information to the Government, at least
thirty days before the commencement of the academic session.

@

follows:—

(3}

The fee structure for the twenty-five per cent of the students
who are domicile of Haryana shall be based on merit-cuam-means and be as

(1) one-fifth of the twenty-five per cent shaill be granted
full fee concession;

(ii) two-fifth of the twenty-five per cent shall be granted
fifty per cent fee concession;

(iii) the balance two-fifth of the twenty-five per cent shall

be granted twenty-five per cent fee concession.

The university shall not charge any fee, by what ever name
called, other than that prescribed as per sub-sections (1) and (2) above :

Amendment of
section 36 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.



Amendment of
section 40 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 44 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Insertion of
section 44A in
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

672 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

Provided that in case of the university having collaboration with reputed
foreign or international universities or other institutions of other similar nature,
the Government, may, approve different percentage of students eligible for
hundred per cent, fifty percent or twenty-five per cent fee concession.”.

18. For section 40 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“40. The university shall obtain accreditation from the
National Assessment and Accreditation Councit, Bangalore or National
Board of Accreditation within five years of its establishment and
inform the Government and such other regulatory bodies which are
connected with the courses taken up by the university about the grade
provided by the said accrediting bodies to the university. The
university shall get renewed such accreditation at an interval of every
five years thereafter or as per norms of thc concerned accrediting
bodies.”.

19.  For section 44 of the principal Act. the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“44, Powers of Government to inspect university and
academic and administrative audit.— (1) The Government may
cause an assessment to be made, in such manner, as may be prescribed.
for the purpose of ascertaining the standards of teaching, examination
and research or any other matter relating to the university.

(2) The Government for ascertaining and ensuring quality at
different levels of higher education in a university and for its continued
sustenance shall conduct annuvaj academic and administrative audit
through Higher Education Department, Haryana or any other body or
persons authorized by it, which shall scrutinize whether the university
is complying with and functioning in accordance with the provisions of
this Act, Statutes. Ordinances, Rules, bye-laws, instructions and the
conditions of the Letter of Intent.

(3) Such persons or body shall give their report within three
months to the Government with specific recommendations and
deficiencies, if found. The Government shall consider the report and
issue a show cause notice of thirty days to the Chancellor as to why
action should not be initiated against the university for the deficiencies
noticed.

(4) After considering the reply to the show cause notice, the
Government shall have the power to impose penalty under the Act.”.

20.  After section 44 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 673
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

21.

22

“44A. Penalties,.— The following penaltics may be imposed
upon the university for maladministration, misinformation and for not
maintaining standards, namely:— -

(i) stopping of admissions in one or more faculties;

{it) financial penalty of a minimum of ten lakhs and
maximum of one crore;

(iii)  dissolution of the university in a phased manner:

Provided that mo such penalty shall be imposed unless the
university has been given a show cause notice.”.

In section 46 of the principal Act,—

(i)  after sub-section (7) the following sub-section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(7TA} The administrator shall meet day to day
expenses from the income/assets of the university. If the
same are nol sufficient, then the administrator with the
prior approval of the Government shall have the powers
to dispose of the properties and assets of the university.”;

(i)  for sub-section (9), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely —

*(9) On receipt of the report under sub-section (8),
the Government shall make an amendment in the
Schedule under section 6 by omitting concerned
university therefrom and from the date of such
amendment, all the assets and liabilities of the university
shall vest in the sponsoring body:

Provided that the degrees, diplomas or awards
granted under sub-section (8) shall not be invalid merely
on the ground that the university has been dissolved.”,

After section 47 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

inserted, namely :—

“47A. Power to make bye-laws.-The Government may,
by natification in the Official Gazette, make bye-laws for carrying out

the purposes of this Act.”.

23

In the Schedule to the principal Act, after serial number & and entries

thercagainst, the following serial numbers and entries thereagainst shall be
added, namely :(—

“7. | Baba Mast Nath Unijversity District Rohtak
8. M.V .N. University District Palwal

9. | Ansal University District Gurgaon”.

Amendment of
section 46 of
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.

Insertion of
section 47A in
Haryana Act
32 of 2000.

Amendment of
Schedule in
Haryana Act
32 of 2006.



674 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

There 1s a need for creation and expansion of educational institutions for improving
opportunities of higher education for the youth of the State. In order to accommodate the
unprecedented growth of students in higher education, we need to double the number of
institutions at all levels by 2020. The Government intervention and initiatives alone would not be
adequate to meet the growing demands of higher education. Private Sector is an important player
in providing higher education. For encouraging the persons/sponsoring bodies with rich experience
of running educational institutions “The Haryana Private Universities Act, 2006™ has been enacted
by the Government under which Private Universities are created.

Even though the Private Universitics established il date have shown promise to be
emerged as Centres of Excellence in academic spheres, it has been felt that there is a requirement
to introduce some new provisions for quality improvement and amend some existing one 1o match
the contemporary needs of higher learning.

Taking cognizance of the Judgement of Hon'ble Supreme Court in Prof. Yashpal versus
State of Chattisgarh, the provisions such as Study Centres. Off Campus and Off Shore Campus
have been omitted. Further it has been decided not to allow distance mode of education in Private
Universities.

Although the Private Universities set up so far have been providing education in multi
disciplines, it has been made mandatory for a Private University to offer minimum three faculties
providing instructions upto the level of Ph. D. However this condition will not be applicable on a
Private Health University.

Further provisions like prevention of ragging, objectivity and transparency in the
recruitment of teachers with prescribed qualifications, increasing endowment fund to Rs. Five
Crores and its usage by the Government in case a University is dissolved, authorization to
commence a course and withdrawal of such a permission, compulsory disclosure of information by
a university and powers of Government to assess a University for ascertaining the standards of
teaching, examination and research or any other matter relating to the University and imposition of
penalties upon the University for misinformation, maladministration and for not maintaining
standards, power of the Government to make bye-laws for private universities are some of the
major additions to the Act.

Further existing provision of fec concession to the students of Haryana domicile has been
made more explicit so that no room is left to ambiguity and all students under Haryana domicile
calcgory get fee concession as per prescribed procedure. And provisions where some abbreviations
were wrongly used have been corrected.

Further for achieving the objectives cnshrined in the Act, proposals have been formulated
for setting up Baba Mast Nath University in District Rohtak, MVN University in District Palwal
and Ansal University in District Gurgaon.

Hence, this bill.
GEETA BHUKKAL,
Education Minister, Haryana.
Chandigarh : SUMIT KUMAR,

The 29th February, 2012 Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 675
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

{1 3ars |
2012 &7 fagws & 12—TFoydoo

o fh favafderay (doigs) Rdas, 2012
wfRamn et fawafena
sfefay, 2006 &Y
It wenfera
& @ fay
fadas

qd oY @ favwad 9t o eRaron wow fRurmese g frefaiRea
w1 & 78 wfffig 8 —

1. gg #fAfrm gRaren FAoh favafeeray (@erm) sftfas, 2012 o8
I \/Fa B |

2. efeamor foh Reafdenraa afSfam, 2006 (g 389, g9 TQ, 7@
aferfrm & wu 4§ ffdfe fear T &) & awmr 2 W
() @ (&) B are, Feafolea wve W W, arafq: -
“@d) e fafre uReg § a2, s sfdfram,
1961 {1961 & e AR 25) B andfrg nfda TRt
fafers afdvg;
(Fw) s ¥ afva g, Reafaaeg & a8 83 i a8
wrfia &
(i) @os (@) dur (€) &1 iy & Far oo,
(i) @vg (7) & WM W, fAfaRea wvs sfwenfy f5d sme,
GTETT?{:——

2006 & EfEon
Iy a2 &
a2 B HehE |

“(@) wHEa ¥ P & RveRee g fRed B

afd oen g fovafdeney &1 seaus, afrer aen
BT I e o mite

@ ®) fRemm A Rwferar 4 afa & 918 wafaaaa
i BRan Pl fRvdfderner (detersn) sfdfam, 2012 #
aiftrgaT @ o eRarn Fof Rrvaferea sfifaw, 2008
(2006 T 32) B reh werrfie fFoy Tar B,

(@ @) dor ¥ afhurg 2, gy et & dée e o
T TE



676 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(iv) |vg (1) @ wr &), rafafiag e wfoeenfa fear ame,
FAf—~

“() ‘BrEER ¥ A g, fAvafrearen @ el & g
-y
v) @vg (g) @ arg, fAmfaiad @ve w1 sy, arerfg—

“(g %) i AR oy & aforg 2, adg ki ofeg
fRfram, 1947(1947 &7 48) T &191 3 & A 7fda
e e 7,

(vi) Wog (8) aar (8} @ v R, Frafaftea @ve gitrenfio fég
amﬁ,amiq:-—
“(g) AT qeuied R A oRwg @ afvwrg 2
3R yeamg+ aRYg, §7R

(5 &) USHT I 91 Y AU B, s AR asmae!
e afYE & W e, o TQaRE a8, T8
TEA ;

(@) i areamye R wReg & aifvor & o smarges
ﬁr&ﬂtrﬁq?,éa?»ﬂ;“;

(vii) @ug (o) 7 (@) &1 &g &Y far v,

(viii) @ () & v R, F=fefaa gve gfownfia fear amom,
perie—

“@) R Al WReg |/ g 2, ardy v
ufug, IFel;”;
(ix) @ve @) ® o R, Ffafea gos ufarnfg fEan argm,
3121?6[:—

“) fafe e & aftum 2, S Ren @ M
& gAftad s & fg amges o ol st
T B forg TG WHR gRT wifta 18 g 99 &
fawafdere arger anai, Ree Wk aana!
gy, IS s Ren aRwg, wwdia argfie
ufReg, Wy faftre afteg, s iy oReg, i
eaieT AR e afeg, TRA P srgaur afyg,
AT w91, v AR oftg, denfre ok



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA ), FEB. 29, 2012 677
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

3.

4

alenfires arpae afleg swnfa @ SU AR Jferdr
ARG TR AT GVER g 3 Fig WA Fdra @
it &
(x) @S () 3 ™F R, fFrafafeg gue wierenfa fear smem,
Jrgfq—
«) FraEl | aftg 8, 5u o & opflm WeR g
Targ ¢ fae
(xi) @S (@) &1 A & f7r Srgm; qen
(xii) @ve (1) & wrF w A=l gve wfawnfia fFan e,
GTQTT‘E[:—
“(7) ‘onae ¥ wfa E Rvafac & agawd a1 SR
AR e X P faw el @ fem 49w

ST ¥ At F T R0 A s s Aptee
FA & fog onftm @i amard, e, WEe

mmrdmaﬁs‘ma:ﬁﬁ;'w
Ha T Y a3 H - 2006 B ERTY
() TS (6) B eI T, PrfRIRe @S SRR R ST,
et GEicedl

“(6) Y W &7 ;7
(i) wvs (7) &1 A9 & fagr e

(i) @S (0) & wH W, fFafefaa wvs uftrenfa fear s,
arfe—

“{o) Su-fafraf & arfar Iurftl, feeil, W wait afR
=g faen g fdm oufdt & fférs A 1w
I < U giaea o f A fafaa faera gre
ARG Tt § & 7 8 ;7 e
(iv) @Tg (10), (1) T (12) ¥ T FH Faw A |
T affram & gy 4 9 2008 @ Bfam
st 32 #t
(i) Sy—em=r (1) & o d fema e RET B wr o, ¢ REd m,.ma;m,
uferenfad fasar s,

(i) Su—ure (1) B 9, FAefafen wge s Rar s, serfa-



678 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, [933 SAKA)

TS I W FH W B9 A AT B Oa I aen
Hefdd fafrs et @ g <ofa 4 -l dy
Hdor & R gg wmfy & @ # sl A,
ol faf, it o weag fAwH, g (@),
gled, woR, yied gaf), o qwdare!, Aifsar aen
TEe WaR gears 3§ 39 of At arafy § Rogaoio
B &R dF B NeT IuA™ FHETQ
W] T8 3R 5 R B o e wared qen
fafercar fawafaene wrfia &9 & 96 &, o 99
$q Y FH G GHE BT IR S ATQATHD T8
B

(iii) S9—eT (2) # W () & @9 S & @,

(iv) TU-uTT (4) D Woe (&) #, &< A, frafafad fagd qur =

wire fag wred, arerfe-

“gud TR ¥ @ veaifdd Rvafdenera g gaf=m
& T aren fftrat & gwfa @ Gf |y ey
e & WMy g9 sfafwm & ot gd
u--fafEt § ey v vy @ SR 3w 9w F g
Wa”ﬂ;”;ﬁ%ﬁ

(v} SU—aRT (6) A & 4R 3 4Tel “UF AT e} b WA G TE
A wreg fererfae fHe s ;

2006 & wRam 5. Ao Afafram @ arr 5 H Iu-awy (1) A~

Fefrgw 32 A ,
urﬂsairsz () @ve (vi) d v =, Pfafea wvs gitrenfia ey @,
Holere | CRICES

“(vi) favafoere g1 Wow Y ST dlel 94 f@mT ar
o # aavads HEWS IaNd dfed W 8 HF e
amurd, &) wE—amard TR wuih Her W qerne Arng!
! frge $ A e

(vi~a) ardar Wi fazafeney ygar s srrar fafe Feoai
g fafga ardar € &9 7 81 wita wwnfia freafdenay
F amgraet o v A fwafie, fFserar gor aweffar
A7 AL,



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 679
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)}

(i) @vE (ix) ¥, aa & fepm 0 RET & WA R, e REA
gfereenfia fan srgam: e

(iit) E@vE (ix) & g, F=rfofag @ve S fagr wwem, srei-

“(x) Reafraraa wge@ emam gR fafka R, 5w
T ¥ TSR AMgvel aen S Suewl, aft i &),
& AR dww § W geR @ T @ Jee g
o witrager 2 )

6. W@ Yo & w10 @ I W, Prafafied arn afowenfud @ 2o0s @ sRaw
wreft, arerfg- ' afefrem 32 @

€T 10 &
“10 lfp AR PIw IR B ARG AT UAT B T~ gaper,

(1) favafaeray fed waifdenrag qur HwRM Y TEHEA @
e wfgd 4 w3 |

(2) wE Twa @ IR sreraT aTEY @I aifw S, 3w IR SR,
I B T GE B W T HIM g g R
gfr @ A } fF Frdn @ | T@ e e

7. 7o AR B g/ 11 B SN (1) T () F W W, 2008 B ERam
feraforfag Su-aR7 yierenfg @ wmdd, aefg— st 32 @

LRI &
“(1) wawe ey fAvaflere & oY #9349 99 o399 990 g
o Y ¥ e AR wfia s 9 SwEar e arga,
s, dgea & ue A erey 4 weafy ey /i S w0 A
foreelt wdt STt

f2ugor IU-4RT (1) & Iy fer i favafieren w s Ad
& |

(2) R Ry Pdu aRmf @ 3 gz gPfed o @ Rig
I @ el 6 fRrafrerag gv afifva, ol
e, Frat er Su—faftt & Suaw &1 s @ &
PR Bl Ay @ geia: a1 arre: o=t a9 widg 8rf afk
freafare o wraves e 33 A aw, oRfe) seare
Sl o1 framl @ &2 Suawl @1 ST SR & W
Sufafrt & srger fRues & A ¥ AT oo wenwa
WA @ fg wd @ 3 B e 5w wear g4

8. A IR A urr 14 ¥, @y (4) @ Ire, Frfaia @ @ 2008 3 ERamn

manﬂa":_ AT a2 @
gRF 14 ™

“(aw) qdier Pz | Ditiiced]




2006 & gRATM
afafem 32 oY
€] 17 Tl
T |

2006 © ghaToT
aferfrem 32 &
€I 18 DY
e |

2006 & EREon
aefam 3z o

HIT 18 & BT Tl

I T

680 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.}, FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

9. I IRFEH o U 17 B Fu-aW (1) B wIF ), AEfeleg Su-
g uferenfieT @t s, srerfig -
(1) BTl B9 g% (7) A Sl YETEr S g Redfdeney
T AT gy fafda sl & R Fenfufy grr frga
f&ar sem e 9 a€ @ oEf & AT 99 "R &R
O] @11 af &t oy & FRIfa @ vwrd, gedfa &7 of @
0% AR 3 & fo gl &1 o g
R T8 AR & geufer Ao wafey A1 wnfts & gearg

AR Ug eila 7ol W W4 9% T Fedt 98 TEOT T dear
& | et feel oY <9 A aafy oo o @ e Adl el

10. o IRFaT B gRT 18 B I (1) B W W, Frafafiag go—
ot Afeentd @ ey, st

“(1) | |fiT & g, woae e & e gRT o=
A A & wgd, o ok g fafafdse a1 oy e |
freafaened IR AT g Rfga srdaret | g
1. g7 Afram A g1 18 @ q7e, FreafoRad o 1@ e, sifa-
18 . wleT fadme & FAgfda don -
(1) wden frrae fvafyarey w1 g w1fde Jafie sfant s
F1 uRFTR & R genfidfe g1 fryea (&ar s |
(2) o Figme @ efafaa ada 8-
(i) argemfia o <&l WY § g Forferg S0
(i) 9o & dur A @ fag @ Modar @ wey A
TR T
(i) oo @ fay QoS 9HY ATYH B OIER
Fae-gfaatall & qeaidd B fQ wawr R
(iv) BT & Jueferdt & iR & fog 39 da Aeam
IR & g g qur Rvg-fear & 'R @1

o™ B fau wemet o ugfy & PRy gAfdasa
Ol :

(v) Thenat & wafta FE o wme S \HE-ENE ®
FAURT g1 IR W A, &7 e S (7




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA), FEB. 29, 2012 681
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

t2. & ARITH @ gy 30 A

(1) SuaRT (1) @ @vs (@) § w W, fmtaia woe wfoenfia
T g, ek
(@) Fenaafy aur Fealy B MR & Mear qon wd qen
Gﬂ?ﬁmﬂaﬂw;";
(i) Tu-ur ) o (3) 9 A W, Psfeiiea 9u-yRig gfdwenfia
ot e, st

“(2) wraery fy@r Rreafdeneg o1 yem oRfias dar sym
a1 TR e A ST A Reafderera @ Al
@ 9% UF A9 Byl 3 kR g9s e @ fo
IR BT UK BT |

(3) TR favafdemer g1 wegga wer aRfvas o faar svd
ot A B SUIRIRYT Head T8 o 2, O |t
oY Yo+ & forg 9% Rvafdenea o1 gfua s qen
ofe et greu fFremdar amr aer &, oY a8 gaal
ity =t fofy & < A1 1 ) & ofiaw arpres 3

13, 91 AP B aR1 31 B 9991 (3) 7 o< wa et B v
T, A A e gfoeniia fy S |

14. o HfAfgm &t g 32 9 TR (3) # <37 AR Wt @ I O
& A oeg uftrenfie e e

15, Ho 3w & o 33 & 0 ary ) # ot e vt @ A
W, AT A W wlovenfid fby st

16. ¥} IfRfam 9 arT 34 & 718, FrafoRed amig =it @gd, ararfe--

34D, QTIEHH I e BT WRBR §1—~(1) 74 9raaehd W1 Sl
AT B UR™ A B foq s Reafaarean Su-fafay
@ onfia T Rfge fraiv RO afta awer oY tEr snem

Hfad sm |

(2) TR W Ofy fafafde svit R favaftarer W weaw
W FEHA MG B I B S ARIGT AR B AT
favafaemey & wrgasd A HIEHT FAAT TR FA g
e Qi dur IHS wiEar W argEfaa sy

2006 & ERamn
sfeforam a2 &
RT 30 &1 GINRIA

2006 & BfEmon
sffry 32 &
I 31 B HIWA |

2006 3 gRamon
Ffafrm 32 &
HRT 32 T §YNer |
2006 @ &Ramor
afarfm a2 o
T 33 &1 gINH 1

2006 & sRoor
i yaw 32 2

VT 343, 347 o]
347 &1 TG AT §



682 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(3) fvafeerey wer @ Affdc witer @ w1 o1l @ uem
qHiIE e 8 et R f Ame # witer & e
AET 120 A ¥ e afsq 98 @ W, 39S 9
qISUHH AT FTAHH TG Y B & (A7 AR B! WAt
g ¢ |weh S

34 @ UIGEHY 58 F ) AfR -~ WRER B 7S wyfte 8 ol &
f& fvafdeneg sfeRR st do areadrel & el qrd
wH B Refd § 78 & o 7w 0 9w F @ A, o
Iu-fafral gt Rfafde & To, aeasa o1 FRdER aerE
TR IR A wliPfa |9 F w8

34 7. qE & ARt gedeen- (1) 39 JfRfm & s wenfia
T d favafdensy sue e Neadn a1 FTdHA g
T & yRe 3 ffyy & aro R B v @ uger Feafaiea

(@) WTamwey W BRiHH AR T & fag el g
YT AR e, R R N1 TRT & el e qu
T e & g P ot 99

(@) B B O Avg T B T 3G IR @) Hfveren
Tfe YO BT WETHA A FIUHH IE O g W g AT
97 # favafdens orsch & o w9y faas Naw aon AR
o Ot ara=ly &Y et

(m) ¥ of Rras fog wdw Ry o wearfao fsar mar &,
B U ye UgEd Ul FIEA e & Hey
i Sy gRi AEfea Wl B HJe

() ey waawd a1 FTde aRgET A waw @ e ypEe &
g

(®) Rvafrareg grr fRfafde dul sda o & ads
aE el fafrem Fer grr Rffde 78 fey
T ¥,

@) ve qrgEE 41 FrdEH R ¥ yaw @ foy W
I @ T3 B O A7 UV & fEeelt & wey A
o) gHg g WiRd IRNER] & Jae quT T B
withar o AW 2% @ fory YA & S el B B
i ;



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), FEB. 29, 2012 683
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

(®) areagE oy & Raxw Sy suet daftd arar,
e ara i Wi € R owd 48 A 3fita fea
2 & ae O wew frafva gften wew 2 @ Afafy
W T ;

() BT, QEIbTerd T JRYTIA a1 Fei ot wval
frar S areT amaERe ufien g fftreaar fRvafderaa
¥ e o 9 W urEl g ara gl wigd Wifaw
7o Neafres SrawET T o gl @ Ha A g

() AT GG, ATAETRS T T I A wfed odd
qEIHEH U FEHA Ay & fa gur Rerfd g
SR aTftrswe g1 a1 favafare g RAfs aa
favm & f3a W ;

() frafianerd argar amer 3y, 1956 (1956 B FU
R 3) a1 99 TRy o] [ ar R & adi= g9
waer § garg Ty R fferr @ Sues) 9 s @
forg S @ Wiar a1 qEY BIE §IN I I T,
SIﬂ?}‘x’T;

€) B¢ O oy e ot Rfga & e

ww] favafderers o fl 49 wige w3 AW @
i fAfdee | w3 @, <R wTa BT qen
T TR &7 s R e o3 ¥ ugw ey
¥ geidia Rt & Wy 9 e og Sifew @
e § dease o) O W & AR e

(2) e fvafeare v gfyer @ 7@ g afa
& Fma Frag Fom O 399 gHE, owm o
famma & gitmyged wm & e A 8 au sEe

wfel TRHR @) GI B ferg Aot ardef |
17. e A 9 fem ewr 36 & W W, FrefeRea g gfaeenfia

& s, st
“36. B GRaH.~(1) favafaerey, wo—w9g R, ®E 1T
TR TR GoaT & a0l 3 Nelds 99 S W 8 9 O O i
@ WRER B garf Aa |

{2) IR W eRToT & Al ¥ @ g ufava @ fag v
R I Ue A O) ameniRe g e ot et g

2006 @& BfYgmm
A 32 &
HRI 36 B
W |



2006 & gRamon
Ffafrs 32 &
4T 40 &
HMEA |

2006 & efvgTon
atferfom a2
EHTRT a4 &I
YA |

634 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

() o=ira afererd @ 1,/5 @1 Grgel B & g § Srod

(i) u=ia ufterd @ 2/5 7 gar sferd & o @ ge
@ el

(iti) o= ufoers & 99 2,/5 @Y 25 gfdwd o S g @
Q|

(3) favafaeney IR Su—amer (1) o (2) 3 IR fifea |
ey, ave el N A @ s 8 B wrw wwie e #n

W=y o fvaferen favanrd 39 wr emrishy fyzafdenayt
I I HEEY WY G A ey § @ Wt 8, ol
SR qrH Bral 3 e afdeaar @ fog 9t aftrerd, guma
ufererer o1 g=dg witrera W1E BE &t AAEET & "aHdl 2 1

18. & Affmm 3 amy 40 F e W, Fr=faRaa o™ aRenfia @
e, arerfq—
“40. fovafaener, wsha gearsa IR geara uRyg, {TeR @
AT T 4§ S e @ wig gé % ey woaras
W T R TR AR W o Rfre Pl @) o
favafierem @& gog waw el @ g™ Susfa e & IR
# favafdarem g™ Wy Y graumEl @ GEa 8, gfud
F | favafimer davwer 7@ ug 38 & RIS R T
g T el @ ATeTel § AR U W &
HHa HE@T "
19. 3 afafra o ot o4 @ w R, Prefaited arr aideenfia &
GfTQ"ﬁ,&mfﬁ:-—
“44. freafaemera o1 e ten He qon g e oden
B B TER B s —(1) WRopR vafderey & seagE,
T FT I 1 frvafdaren | wERd fee s A
& wrE! @ AfNfrrags © yae @ forg T fafga o=f Afa
# frreivor wxargElY |
(2) W el freafyemey § SR R & R W ®
T ) AfRfafe qen giiRea e B fEg qur saet
= gfte @ fore Seem) R fram, eRaren ar a4t o=
g o g4 g wiRga fdadt & argd @ aifies didre e
WA AT &7 oA weh Wl Gaie e $




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012 685
(PHGN. 10. 1933 SAKA)

20.

21.

Iu-—afer, argaell oI SmIRT UF A IR @ JuAE] B AgurA
H YT & Terr JUal B SFTEAR Hrd aR I8 B |

(3) W afad 1 Frew Rt R T Ffear, of oy s
¢ oftd @veR & O 79 B 9RR A Rud @) e
Raré w Rar wolt aun fvefyemem & Honfiufa & da s
o7 BN TR ] A a0t 9 e # and Ffeal
& forg fvafyenan & fovg odang & @ wrfRy |

() PR FARN AR B TR R AR FH & 9€, WHR
AfSFm & aefia wfa atRifg oo &) oifda &l

ot AR A uRy 44 @ 915, Feafaflad g W& amod, siufa-

“44 ® MRA~ Rvafaray w e firar gg@ & fav @0
Al @ 7 Y v B forg el wikawt siftfta ot o
Tt & g~

() v® 1 vF @ aF H@Era # waw AE
(i) <A™ =6 g a1 AfEaE Ue ds A Rchy mik
(iii) favafaarery &1 wawrmEe A A fAucT
qeeg B¢ M O wiiRa o9 o R 7 @ weh o a@
fazafaerers & R gamt Aifew = 3 e w8 )
1 arferfras & w46 % -
(i) STIRT7 @ g, fFrafafEa Su—ary & smed, arefq—

“(7 %) werie favafienea @ ama /ety A e
wfafes & wd & @ e R 3 uaia 9 2w
UIEE B WReR B qd AgAed § Rvafderea &

gl ur giteRiE o1 Fuer wva & ikt

i,

(i) SHUWT {9) @ wIF U¥, frfeiRaT JUEnRT wfereenfie & S,
Si?ﬂ'q:-

“{9). IuEwT (8) @ 3l RuIE o ity W, WRaR wNE
freafiarer 1 @0 & gu o 6 @ afiT FeE A
Haea sl o= O Jowd @ fafd 9 fvafdeey 9
Y gfamfy aur wflicg wars frer # fAfdd & o

2006 ® gieymom
afafras a2 &
TR 44 & @ WYY
WA |

2006 H &Ramen
#RfTm 32 @
U7 46 @
e |



686 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

UR SU G (8) @ I €Y g 9ul, Ay ar R
DA g N I 7Y 7T 81 o fAvafdenery fufeq

g oy
2006 & BTN 22. 91 AffRm A 47 B a1, Feafefad arr &l s, et
arfafam j
- ;2&,?.@ “47%. - FTF B Al ERER e F SfRgEe
ATy 8N, 39 IRfm & wooEl o anffad s @ fm
Su-—faftat g e & |

2006 % gfRuron 23, 7o ffHgw @ I #7966 U 9ES W ufafeqt &
my:ﬂ are, frferfd A wear qen 9w arm wlafewl Sig & we, s -
aa | “7. 9@ 7 Ty Rvafleren e Aede

8. 9 1 o Rvafderan e yeae

9. I fewdfares frer ema



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA)), FEB. 29, 2012 687
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA}

I v au HRON &Y fEvor
I % gl B Seaaw e deeR SaE) Yer AR ] e wer
&t T AR R @ aragasdar | Seaaw e A fenfidt & swraRe g@ad
B ARG He B et ¥ 79 i '/ w a8 2020 I weens # ww=n A
2R gfy O B aaeem ¥ Iy fen § dedt 7 & @@ s & v daa
TXFER & TAY 4 Ued &) wata 91 gi | Iemaw fen yer e & fag frot &
1 Feeaqol e ¢ delE et gam A AR S g aldgiaaTad
frerdt & Neafed wv &g WHR g1 eftan e Rvafiarem sffigs, 2006
A T forad ged Bt Reefacm) @ = & it T

Tlifen ora e venfig ol freafemerd 3 dfie &= 3§ owpe =1 F U A
IR B AT fewrd € quft 77 orpre fear @ o o= fien A wEeelA
rargharst A I FRA & g HogeT wrawrl § FeeT 7d qoraT gui g FE
T Wl B AN B A EHA ¢

Mo TAUTA T4 BflETE [T HWR # WA Ieaad ey & R wn
fFrorar e & | ga% sfaRaa Foft fivafirenaral § e R yonell &) e 3
FAR 7 & @ A Frofg fomn 7 1

Teft g o% wenfia fref Reafaeray ag-Rene § fan werd & @ € Bl
Rvafyereal % fag g9t= Momg @Y o 1 ¥ &9 @9 g § R vem o
afyart wv fmn wn & qanft o o froh e Rrafenerdl ov amp & et

gu faRa Y 2 e, aita graamst & T Reafarg & semwst
@ et B! famafroae od arRedt T, T Y # %o 5 RIS 9% T o
fareafaenay & faufea & &1 Rufy F wwer gR1 $84E T3 R, Taghd B TH
T R T WP F aww A @ aReR, Pl g7 gE @ At
FHEIHew 7d Riaror AFve! o udn s, 9¥en d e e fqvafdeare | weg
=1 fdfl wrer A freafaerenn & qeies & frg aver ot afeal s Reafeere
T 7Tad a1 o, Red 79rad O qEa! @ 7 a8 7@ b SR, Frof feafieret
& fag fafrm am B wer Y ofew, 39 R & 79 35 @@ B

3E9 oY, gRamn afard) fenfiat &) B § ge F adme weEE B AR
garee fovar mn & @ifs W= @1 PIS e 9 18 7 afda afiha agar gRamn
FRraret gt & qEa i Feanfial & v F ge e aF @@ & e w5l
w4t @1 Ted A R A ot I e fean T @)



688 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), FEB. 29, 2012
(PHGN. 10, 1933 SAKA)

9% Afala afafras § affa gqdvdl o wita g Rren Aeaw A amn
Ty favafremer, foren tead N wredlotwo Rrvafyemar qu e Teia 4 sad
Rrvafaeren @il avd & 9gdvg € (& uwd & wiimes fear )

¥ fod wRga 2
T apd,
foen ==, sRam
FUEG i IR,
29 HAY, 2012 wfed |

49655—H VS, -HGP, Chd



