BILL NO. 08 OF 2015

The Delhi Value Added
Tax (2" Amendment)
Bill, 2015

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National
Capital Territory of Delhi on 30" June, 2015)



BILL NO. 08 OF 2015
THE DELHI VALUE ADDED TAX (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
A
BILL
to further amend the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 (3 of 2005).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi in the Sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

9 Short title, extent and commencement.- (i) This Act may be called the Delhi
Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2015.

(ii) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(iif) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint:

Provided that different dates may be appointed for different provisions of
this Act.

2. Amendment of section 4.- In the principal Act, in section 4, in sub-section
(1),for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) in respect of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, at the rates
specified therein against the description of goods :

Provided that the rate of tax in respect of goods specified in the
Fourth Schedule shall be higher than the rate of tax applicable under

clause (e) of this sub-section but shall not be more than thirty paise in
the rupee;”.

3. Amendment of section 8.- In the principal Act, in section 8,-
(1) in sub-section (1), for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:-
“ (o) the previously agreed consideration for that sale has been altered by
agreement with the recipient for any reason except where a discount or
incentive is offered through a credit note after issuance of tax invoice in
respect of a sale to a registered dealer;”; and

.
Ry




v in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following explanation shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Explanation : Credit notes issued on account of post sale discounts or
incentives will be independent of tax component and no adjustments in
the output tax would be required to be made.”.

4. Amendment of Section 10.-In the principal Act, in section 10,-
. for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8, where any purchaser has
been issued with a credit note or debit note in terms of section 51 of this Act or
if he returns or rejects goods purchased, as a consequence of which the tax
credit claimed by him in any tax period in respect of which the purchase of
goods relates, becomes short or excess, he shall compensate such short or excess
by adjusting the amount of the tax credit allowed to him in respect of the tax
period in which the credit note or debit note has been issued or goods are
returned.

Explanation : While issuance of a credit note of a post sale discount or
incentive by a selling dealer, where no adjustment to output tax, as per the
provisions of sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 has been made, no
adjustment for reduction of input tax credit would be required by the
respective buying registered dealer.”; and

* in sub-section (5), for the starting word “Where”, the words and symbol
“Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 and conditions as may be
prescribed, where” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 22.- In the principal Act, in section 22, sub-section
(7) shall be omitted.
6. Amendment of section 38.- In the principal Act, in section 38, in sub-section

(5), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be substituted.
7. Amendment of section 51.- In the principal Act, in section 51, for the
starting word “Where”, the words and symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2)
of section 8, where” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 86. - In the principal Act, in section 86 -

o in sub-section (5), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;




9,

10.
Sched

'S
|L

for sub-section (6),the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(6) If a registered dealer fails to comply with the provisions of sub.-
section (2) of section 22 of this Act, he shall be liable to pay, by way of
penalty, a sum equal to two hundred rupees for every day of default
subject to a maximum of twenty five thousand rupees.”;

in sub-section (9), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

in sub-section (16), for clause (b), the following  clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(b) having issued a tax invoice or retail invoice, has failed to account jt
correctly in his books of account; or

(c) failed to issue a tax invoice or retail invoice as required under the
provisions of section 50 of this Act;” and

in sub-section (20), the explanation shall be omitted.

Amendment of section 89.- In the principal Act, in section 89, in sub-section
(4), clause (c) shall be omitted.

Amendment of the Fourth Schedule.- In the principal Act, for the Fourth

.No

]

ule appended thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“ The Fourth Schedule
(see section 4)

Commodity | RawofTax |
Petroleum Products other than liquid petroleum | Twanty paise in |

’

| gas, piped natural gas, Compressed Natural Gas the rupee
' and Kerosene such as ‘
. Naptha; ‘
@ Aviation Turbine F uel; /
e Spirit; |
’ . Gasoline;
‘ ® Furnace oil; ‘
————"— o (except petroleum wax used for | |
OV )
\\\\“‘\ V.




manufacture of candles);

. Mixture and combination of above
~products. ) o
' Liquor (Foreign and Indian Made Foreign Liquor). Twenty paise in
the rupee |
Country Liquor. Twenty paise in
o _ - the rupee
Narcotics (Bhaang). Twenty paise in
B the rupee
Molasses. Twenty paise in
the rupee
Rectified Spirit. Twenty paise in
o the rupee
Lottery Tickets. Twenty paise in
the rupee |
| Brake Fluid. Twenty paise in
! the rupee

Tobacco and Gutkha; unmanufacturéd tobacco,
bidis and tobacco used in manufacture of bidis and
hooka tobacco

Twenty paise in
the rupee

Aerated Drinks. Twenty paise in
; 5 » _the rupee
Watches costing above rupees five thousand. Twenty paise in
the rupee

"

This Bill has been passed by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital
Territory of Delhi on the 30t June, 2015.

1
DELHI \ y (Ram Niwas Goel)
Dated: 30* June, 2015 N Speaker,

Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi



BILL NO. 08 OF 2015

The Delhi Value Added
Tax (2" Amendment)
Bill, 2015

(As introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the
National Capital Territory of Delhi on 29"




BILL NO&3. OF 2015
THE DELHI VALUE ADDED TAX (2nd AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015
A
BILL

to further amend the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 (3 of
2005).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi in the Sixty-sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title, extent and commencement.- (i) This Act may be called the
Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Act, 2015.

(ii) It extends to the whole of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.

(iii) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by
notification in the official Gazette, appoint:

Provided that different dates may be appointed for different
provisions of this Act.

2, Amendment of section 4.- In the principal Act, in section 4, in sub-
section (1),for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“(c) in respect of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, at the
rates specified therein against the description of goods:

_ Provided that the rate of tax in respect of goods specified in
the Fourth Schedule shall be higher than the rate of tax applicable
under clause (e) of this sub-section but shall not be more than
thirty paise in the rupee;”.

8. Amendment of section 8.- In the principal Act, in section 8,-
(i) in sub-section (1), for clause (c), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:- '
“ (c) the previously agreed consideration for that sale has been
altered by agreement with the recipient for any reason except where
a discount or incentive is offered through a credit note after issuance
of tax invoice in respect of a sale to a registered dealer;”; and




4,

5.

(ii)  in sub-section (2), after clause (b), the following explanation shall be

inserted, namely:-

“Explanation : Credit notes issued on account of post sale discounts
or incentives will be independent of tax component and no
adjustments in the output tax would be required to be made.”.

Amendment of Section 10.-In the principal Act, in section 10,-

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(1) Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8, where any purchaser
has been issued with a credit note or debit note in terms of section 51 of
this Act or if he returns or rejects goods purchased, as a consequence of
which the tax credit claimed by him in any tax period in respect of which
the purchase of goods relates, becomes short or excess, he shall
compensate such short or excess by adjusting the amount of the tax credit
allowed to him in respect of the tax period in which the credit note or
debit note has been issued or goods are returned.

Explanation : While issuance of a credit note of a post sale discount
or incentive by a selling dealer, where no adjustment to output tax,
as per the provisions of sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 has been
made, no adjustment for reduction of input tax credit would be
required by the respective buying registered dealer.”; and

(ii) in sub-section (5), for the starting word “Where”, the words and
symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 8 and
conditions as may be prescribed, where” shall be substituted.

Amendment of section 22.- In the principal Act, in section 22, sub-

section (7) shall be omitted.

6.

Amendment of section 38.- In the principal Act, in section 38, in sub-

section (5), for the words “fifteen days”, the words “forty five days” shall be
substituted.




7. Amendment of section 51.- In the principal Act, in section 51, for the
starting word “Where”, the words and symbol “Subject to sub-sections (1)
and (2) of section 8, where” shall be substituted.

8.  Amendment of section 86. - In the principal Act, in section 86 -

(1) in sub-section (5), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

(ii)  for sub-section (6)the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(6) If a registered dealer fails to comply with the provisions of sub-
section (2) of section 22 of this Act, he shall be liable to pay, by way
of penalty, a sum equal to two hundred rupees for every day of
default subject to a maximum of twenty five thousand rupees.”;

(iii) in sub-section (9), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two
hundred” shall be substituted;

(iv) in sub-section (16), for clause (b), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely:-

“(b) having issued a tax invoice or retail invoice, has failed to
account it correctly in his books of account; or

(¢) failed to issue a tax invoice or refail invoice as required under
the provisions of section 50 of this Act;” and

(v)  in sub-section (20), the explanation shall be omitted.

9. Amendment of section 89.- In the principal Act, in section 89, in sub-
section (4), clause (c) shall be omitted. e
{

N )



Kerosene such as
(i) Naptha;
(ii) Aviation Turbine Fuel;

10. Amendment of the Fourth Schedule.- In the principal Act, for the
Fourth Schedule appended thereto, the following shall be substituted,
namely:- '
“ The Fourth Schedule
(see section 4)
S.No. Commodity Rate of Tax
1. | Petroleum Products other than liquid petroleum gas, | Twenty paise in
piped natural gas, Compressed Natural Gas and the rupee

(iii)  Spirit;
(iv)  Gasoline;
(v) Furnace oil;
(vi) Wax (except petroleum wax used for
manufacture of candles);
(vii) Mixture and combination of above
products.
2. | Liquor (Foreign and Indian Made Foreign Liquor). Twenty paise in
- the rupee
3. | Country Liquor. Twenty paise in
the rupee
4. | Narcotics (Bhaang). Twenty paise in
the rupee
5. | Molasses. Twenty paise in
the rupee
6. | Rectified Spirit. Twenty paise in
the rupee
7. | Lottery Tickets. Twenty paise in
the rupee
8. | Brake Fluid. Twenty paise in
the rupee
9. | Tobacco and Gutkha, unmanufactured tobacco, bidis | Twenty paise in
and tobacco used in manufacture of bidis and hooka the rupee
tobacco
10. | Aerated Drinks. Twenty paise in
' the rupee
11. | Watches costing above rupees five thousand. Twenty paise in
the rupee




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Amendment in section 4 is aimed to make enabling piovisions in
the Act for levy of VAT in respect of goods described in the Fourth
Schedule at such rates as may be notified by the Government and specified
against the. description of goods enlisted therein instead of a flat rate of
20%. However, this will be subject to the condition that such rates shall be .
higher than the rate of tax applicable under clause (e) of section 4(1) in
respect of goods not specified in any of the Schedules but shall not be more

than 30%

Amendment in section 8 is proposed to disallow the adjustments in
output tax of the selling dealer and the input tax of the purchasing dealers
" on account of issuance of credit notes by the selling dealers for post sale
discounts and incentives as monitoring of such adjustments is not only a
tedious job but also have no impaét on the overall tax receipts of the

Department.

Amendment of section 22 is proposed to do away with filing of
certificate of registration, while applying for cancellation of his registration
or the registration has been cancelled otherwise by the department. It will
smoothen the process of online filing of application. Consequential

amendments are also proposed in section 86 and &9.

Amendment of section 38 is proposed to increase the time limit of 15
days to 45 days for seeking security from the dealers claiming refund if

security is required during processing of refund claims.

"\
b DVS)

..___._--;




Amendment of section 86 is proposed to reduce the amount of
penalties for delay in furnishing of information relating to change in the
nature of business or closure of business, late filing of returns, non-
furnishing of information and non-issuance of invoices. The explanation
appearing after sub-section (20) is also proposed to be omitted to avoid
duplicity.

Amendments in the principal Act are being proposed for removing

deficiencies / legal lacunae in the statute thereby making the tax
administration simpler and convenient for the dealers.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(MANISH SISODIA)
DEPUTY CHIEF MINISTER / FINANCE MINISTER




FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Bill, 2015 does not

involve any additional financial implications since no outgo on new posts is
anticipated from the Consolidated Fund of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi. //’—\

= \

Dvs)

T



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Delhi Value Added Tax (Second Amendment) Bill, 2015 does not

make provision for the delegation of power in favour of any functionaries

=
/f— I.}:

to make subordinate legislation.

[f =
VS
‘\\" l‘::__—-..--'//



fagae T (08) 2015

feeell Houa wafelfa o
(fea derrer)

fag9®e 2015

(Star fe s ot ao faeel @Y faem gur
7 fai® 29 S, 2015 ﬁ@:@ﬁﬁﬁw



2015 &1 faga® Q:I'_-—'%
feeelt qou waftha s= (B waigs) fRdam201s,

foeell qoa wattfa v sfifs, 2004 (2005 &7 3) & it wWeew @ fog
TE
faegas

59 9RAE TRTSY & Barged ad # wsm wogrh 87 Aot @ fumm W gwr
Frerar siftrfrafia fear smear—

1. wfera fds, TErR @ aRT — (1) 3w fafae &t il 9o weftha = (e sonte=)
ferfa9, 2015 HaT ST |

(i) @8 w=grl LI e 89 fReed! d fawaRa sty

(iil) gz s ffr @ g9l 8 O WK, "xEN wdd A e g™ faa e

qurd o zu sifefraa & faftrs yraae=T & oo Ay fafsay faga &) o g9 )

2. 9IRT 4 BT €NEA, — 9 A9 T gRT 4 I STERT (1) H, —

() == (@M & e w® frafalaa ws forenfia fear s, aefq —

“() wtefl A A fafafe wmm @ fivg o sud v faaver @ e sfvafeae o= wo—
gord 5 dleft gyl § fafifde g oo &) <% 39 9T @ @ (8) 3 asfg ang

R P gX @ SA B wRg wuw A i 39 @) )X 9 e T2 =

3. ORI 8 &1 WEIEH. — Hd ifSfvgw @ awr s § —

(i) gt (1) 4 Ws (1) @ w4 W F=faRea s gfteenfya g omaW, sufa

(1) fod gofiga e & & 7E @) 9 Wed § S @1 g o) 3% @ gvE efde
e & ATA9 | 8 A1 giearsd iR 9tM o3 @t Refy w5t sisey, e Y qd wema of¥y
7 grasal & 91 Gasia 9 B sRor @ 9o A omar &0, e

(i) STumT (2) # wvs (@) @ gvEn frfafaa wve afsfas fFa omm, sefq

"WEFRET o~ [§@T SuRa g a1 giared W (A md afve Tt wdd &w gew s ogen
amrseye oY ¥ fodt wwrnes @ smaaear Te e e




4. ORI 10 &1 WeNg. — or Aferfam & awr 10 & —
(i)ma%wmwﬁw%fﬁgawamuﬁrmﬁaaﬁmrﬁ,aeﬁq:—

"(1)waa?r‘\m€rm(1]aeﬂ(2)aﬂ3ﬁwmaﬁﬂﬁ$maﬁwafﬁﬁwaﬁams1a%mgm-\r
w%ﬁm@%ﬁe%wémﬁ@ﬁwwﬁﬂmmmmwg
aﬁ?vﬁwmwwﬁ@ﬁﬁwwﬁeﬁﬁﬂﬁmmﬁr$mmw%qwéwé%t
ﬁWmﬁwmﬁ%a&ﬁmmmﬁrﬁa&zﬁam@ﬁaﬁeum%w%m
WMW?WB@&?WW@&E@W&TﬁWﬂTﬁﬂHWﬁﬁmmMHﬁ

gfagid s
W@m:—mﬁamsﬂ%m(ﬂw(2)$mm$m%®mqamﬁmm
2f¥T AT 99 T T APw Wk g™ Sy WY @1 warte T8 fear war em a
AT a1 UNigd AN §RT $19C 2o sfee ¥ uolad 1 gurder 78 frar s wer

(ii)mam(s)ﬁmfﬁﬁm“mﬁ"a%wrvrm"wsaﬁwsrm(ﬂam(z)a%mﬁ——ram
aen fefRa od, si=f o=t o Preme wt wRreenfa fear smomm )

5. ©TRT 22 BT W¥NEH. — o aFem &) g 22 ¥ SR (7) B geraT ST

6. O 38 &1 WG, — qa IfFraw & arr 38 ¥ ST (5) ¥ TwoE R ~ weal @ i W
“ ot Rt wsst @ afrenfa fear smom

7. ORT 51 BT Wela — qo JRIFET B grr 51 ¥ F anfyw we o wEl ¢ @ v W SR 8
@1 TUERT (1) w1 (2) & aehe, ol weat gen Prem @t wirenRia fea STomT )

8. ©RT 86 &1 WINEH,— JoI AT 3 uRT 86 F—

() Swamr 5 # ' df"g W Wl @ v R 7wt Wt wet o gRwenfa fear s,
(ii)msﬁmﬁﬁmﬁwuﬁ?mﬁﬁaﬁmiﬁ,aaﬁ:~

“(6) A TSiigT AN TE wRfRE @ aw 22 @ STERT (2) © e 1 sque we &

Wﬁﬁ@ﬁﬁ@ﬁ@'@ﬁﬂﬁwﬁﬂmmﬁmqmmﬁq'ﬂ?ﬁﬁ
f7 @ @1 Wl vov B aweR w1 & e s e

(iii) SwemT (9) & ~ wiw Wl “ Wl B v w W @ ¢ oweal @ vheenfia fear s
(iv)at!ammﬁ'm(E)a%wmq?ﬁm%ﬁaamuﬁwm%mmm,am:—
"(@)éﬁﬁwmﬁ‘&ammmﬁmmmgﬁﬁﬁwmﬁ%wﬁm
é‘;m

(M &5 s Y ot 50 & gEu @ siwia sunRh ey g O R R O




(V) SUERT (20) & IR ST gSHAT ST
9. ©IRT 89 BT WG, — 7o AfFras o urxr 89 4, Sysmwr (4) & wvs (M) & gemy wR,

10. @ A w1 Fulew - W@ef ol @ fw gw afPram 4 wwe W we dted
SN B v W) e @t aReafa fear @ -

Ly

atefl e
(emT 4 <)

F. . TG WY DI G¥
1. fafeas delfem o, ugue dgva dw, s Gged A9 o7 | S99 F 20 99

ST @ sramar deifaam sae o -

(1) =Tger ;

(ii) TRYeT exEET vy ;

(i) wfifke ;

(IV) ﬁ'\q}f?ﬂﬁ =

(v) B9 afge ;

(vi) dow (et @& fmio & fay ggea deifem dww &)

BIgHT) ;

(vii) Suxied owrel & s v s
2 Ye (9291 Td 91va # a1 [4e 9l ywiE) wY 7 20 99
3 QI IR wuY H 20 49
4. ARSBICF  (|19) wIY § 20 U]
5. HIRT wIg H 20 49
6. Yediwigs wWiRe w9Y H 20 99
1. dicd Rwe ®/UC H 20 99
8. % Bs wqy H 20 49
9. qqTe, VT ATHI, AT dara, dr9) a1 gEel q4id D LT 7 | B9 § 20 39

9T JIST a9 q9r |
10. YT g wU¢ H 20 49
11. 9" R WYY § SgTQT ONTd @1 "tedr woY 4 20 49

((!q} f;j o I




TR IR ol &7 fAawoy

TR FT AT o 20 gRrera ot wte v @ gomr sl wifva aegel @ faxr @
g seifad o wR agel sy § Seoifea awgel @ waw ¥ dc @ oME @ Riv P
7 graur @ wnef ov @ R awr 4§ wues | 7aft 98 39 oid W B 5 e e
ﬁ?ﬁﬁrﬁ,‘mm%ﬁ‘q‘aﬁw‘:(1)$@E'(§)$afaﬁﬁaﬂgaﬂaﬁﬂﬁﬂgﬂmm
a¥q 30 gfaerd @ warer W€ g

@1 S g qon vtewe @ Ry fABar Rext g wiE AT @ 9 @ ey Redr
%ﬁma%maegammn@ﬂamftaﬁa%sqgemﬁmaﬁﬁ?aﬂﬁ@ﬁmwaﬁ
Wﬁwumﬁaﬁwfﬁiﬁmmmamwﬁmamﬁfﬂwa%ﬁqﬁrﬂtzrﬁ’aq—\r
B3 9ATq 7L SrOTAT 2 |

qﬁﬁaﬂw$mmwa%ﬁwaﬁaﬂmﬁwmﬁﬂmmmﬁﬁﬁm$mméw
qﬁﬁwa%wwa%mgﬁﬁﬁma%mwzzﬁﬁ?ﬁwaﬂmﬁ%l IHY e &
T AT B H B YA A &8l qROT °RT 86 TE 89 ¥ off weew w1 ywg 2

oy Res &1 9fem & e uRefy it 2 @ Res @ @@ o a8 O @
gﬁﬁﬁ‘rmaﬁﬁa%mmﬁmﬁ15%%m4s%aﬂﬁéqwsaﬁﬁﬁa—rrm
gwa # |

2R @ 3T 7 aRedw @ Wy § qawm gy ot ¥ 39 @ @R 3t s e, Red
P! fiere @ wIga HRA1, AN GRT T BT T TG99 o) 9 37 B v Tvs &) iy § wd
B9 O 86 ¥ Wellw & ywarg 2 gelladl (FFd) U9 @ Y 99 aRT (20) @ 99 W
B WA I BT TG 2 |

R & &l /B o B gx B B Riw ger ol § Sutas o1 g @ oy
Rext @ fow o= gomeh &) ot @ gw a9 o w9

S30 SqNHl @ Ehie o3 2y 9% e gega o




e 2

—— et

ﬁﬁmﬁﬁfﬁﬁ@?ﬁwﬁﬁaﬂﬁﬁuﬁzmsﬁmaﬁfﬁaﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁmmﬁ






