Bill No. 19 of 2015

THE MINISTERS OF THE NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI (SALARIES AND
ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015

A
BILL

Further to amend the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi

(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the
Sixty Sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement. — (1) This Act may be called the Ministers

of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by

notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Ministers of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances.) Act, 1994, (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act),

in section 3, -

(a) In sub-section (1), for the words “twenty thousand rupees”, the word “eighty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) Insertion of new sub-section (1) (a), “(a) The salary of Ministers shall be rupees
eighty thousand initially and shall be raised by rupees eight thousand every twelve
months for their term as Ministers:

Provided a Minister who is appointed to the position at a later date shall draw a
salary equal to the salary drawn by the Ministers who were appointed at the time of
constitution of new Government immediately after the general elections to that

Assembly.”

(c) In sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words, “two thousand

rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) In sub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “fifty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(e) In sub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words “three lakh rupees”

shall be substituted and the words “within India” shall be omitted.



3.

(f)

(9)

(h)

(i)

()

(k)

()

Insertion of sub-section (5), “(5) There shall be paid to each Minister rupees twenty
five thousand per month as “MLA’s Constituency Office rental and related utilities

allowance;

provided that the allowance shall not be paid to Ministers operating from office space

provided by public agencies or from their own residences”;

Insertion of sub-section (6), “(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees
one lakh as one time allowance for furnishing their MLA’s Constituency Office for

each term of office as a member of the Legislative Assembly”;

Insertion of sub-section (7), “(7) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees
sixty thousand as one time allowance for buying equipment for his MLA's

Constituency Office for each term of office as a Member of the Legislative Assembly”;

Insertion of sub-section (8), “(8) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees
one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of laptop, personal computer, printer,

mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a member of the Legislative Assembly”;

Insertion of sub-section (9), “(9) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees

ten thousand per month as communication allowance”;

Insertion of sub-section (10), “(10) A Minister shall be reimbursed upto a sum of thirty
thousand rupees each per month towards salary for his personal secretarial staff in
his MLA's Constituency Office, subject to a maximum of four staff personnel, on
production of receipt of payment through cheque or electronic clearance from the

staff so employed.”

Insertion of sub-section (11), “(11) Notwithstanding the provisions of sub-section (9)
of section 3, telephone facilities shall be provided at the office and the residence of
Ministers as may be required subject to a ceiling of thirty thousand rupees per

month.”

Amendment of section 4. — In the principal Act, in section 4 for the words “four

thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4.

Amendment of sub-section (4) of section 6. — In the principal Act in sub-section

(4) of section 6, for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “thirty thousand rupees”

shall be substituted.



5. Substitution of section 9. — In the principal Act, section 9 shall be substituted with
the following, “9. Conveyance advance. — (1) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance
advance up to twelve lakh rupees for the purchase of conveyance which shall be repayable

within his term as a member of the Legislative Assembly.

(2) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (1) and the mode of
recovery and interest thereon shall be such as may be prescribed by the Government, with

the prior approval of the President.”



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS & REASONS

For some time past, there has been persistent demand from the MLAs
for the increase in their salaries and perks/ facilities having regard to the
increase in the price index. It has also been pointed out that
salaries/perks/facilities of Ministers/ Speaker/ Deputy Speaker/ Leader of
Opposition/ Chief Whip are a bit inadequate which should be upgraded and

enhanced to a commensurate extent.

Considering the exigency of demand, the Speaker of Delhi Legislative
Assembly appointed a Committee of Experts on 20.08.2015 to undertake a
comprehensive study of the structure of salaries and allowances of Members
of Legislative Assembly of Delhi and to recommended revision of salary
allowances and other facilities for the Members of Legislative Assembly of
National Capital Territory of Delhi. The Expert Committee after deliberating on
the issues has made its recommendations for increasing the Salaries and
allowances etc. of Members of Legislative Assembly of National Capital

Territory of Delhi.

For the purpose, the Ministers of the Government of National Capital
Territory of Delhi (Salaries & Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 2015, has been
initiated to amend the Ministers of the Government of National Capital
Territory of Delhi (Salaries & Allowances) Act, 1994. The Bill proposes to
increase the salaries, allowances & other facilities of the Ministers of the
Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi, so as to facilitate them to

work effectively.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(MANISH SISODIA)
Deputy Chief/Minister/Minister(Law)
December 2,2015



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

For the implementation of the proposals contained in the Ministers
of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and
Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 2015, there will be an additional annual
recurring expenditure from the Consolidated Fund of the National Capital

Territory of Delhi.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of
Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 2015 does not seek

to confer power of legislation on any subordinate functionaries.



IR IS & faeel @ w3l &1 (da9 vd W) (FeeH) fada®, 2015

T AT aF Aol & G @1 @9 Td W) S, 1904 H deem @ o

e

3 YRAY TR & BIRIed 9§ # UK IO &F fieell @1 fauawr gRr
TR et fear SR —

Jfera e 1 URT — (1) I o o el @ ARl &1 (@aw ud W)
(o) faerIe, 2015 HET STRAT |

TE RGN 19T # IR & SWIRUTA gRT FqfAfRaa fafdr &1 gwrdt grm |

gRT 3 BT FIEM — TS I 87 fAeell @ w1 &1 (@ad vd 9x) srfef=am,
1994 (39 UTAN ol SMAIA & wU H HafHa) &l gRT 3 H —

SUIRT (1) # 99 &R S0’ T & WH W IR BoIR IUY” TGl Pl
gferenTfue fdhar SR,

T gRT (1)(®) BT AFFIIE, (@) AT BT 909 TR | oRR{l 89R S9A 8FTT el
AT & IS AR & IRE TS dRE FelFl § 376 8RB0 Bl el
IKIIE

Iuey © b var w3 O a1e | 9 e R Fga fhar mar & S9 A1 Sl #E @
FAM I AR S [Aue=adT &AM gAal @ R e Ifed Tl AR B
g frgaa /4 @1 Ui grm |

SUIRT (2) § “Th BOIR $UY” Tl & M W "SI §OIR BUA” Il BT yforenfud
far \_YlTaTIT;

SUIRT (3) H "36RE BOIR ¥UY’ V&l & WM W "IN BOR SUI" @] Pl
gforenfud fear S,

SUIRT (4) 9 U9 BoIR ¥9Y ¥@&I & WM W 09 ag 9’ Wkl Pl
gferenfid fhar STRAT @ “WRd & iR W1 $I ST SIRATT,

SYIRT (5) &1 A3, “(65) udd #3l &1 faemas Mafaw a9 srfeaa @ faRe
T ST Gfaer o & v § U= e9R BUY Ye fbd SR

Susy & fb I8 v S9 A &1 T8 far IR S WRerl uET g7 sdfed
PHIITI XHT AT 3 3MART W BRI DY 8 2 |;




SUYRT (6) BT A~ “(6) Y¥d #21 &I fdemad fafaw e drafed § I
FRIEY & ol BRRAT 8 U I3d W & ©U H Uh g Jud I RT <
STRAY;

(@) SUERT (7) &1 ATIeE “(7) IAD F30 B e fFara &5 e § gde
FHRER & o IuBN & ol T 92 9 & ®U H A8 FIR TSI Bl 10 &
Gﬂ—ajﬁ”;

SUYRT (8) BT Af~deE “(8) Udd w2l &I s fafaw eF sraied # I
FHER & ford due, iFe dreger, fiex, A[ga, dedc nft & Wi & ford
T Jed 9 & ©U H U AR BUY DI AT & SRAfT;

SUIRT (9) BT AFFIE “(9) URAH HA Bl TR s & ©T H T IR ST

yferaTs o STRIAT:;

SUERT (10) &1 AFdE “(10) U #=0t &1 foema fafes e erafe # e
IfFTd Ifgared HaRT @& da9 & oy ufaHe O 89IR ¥UY a9 & w9 |
AN §RT b gRT YA bl G o TR AT SAda - Fell N TKd HR W
foar SRR | o B & efdpds fadsrd oHan) IR 9@ 8T |

SUERT (1) BT AT (1) IRT 3 @ SYIRT (9) & Tl & &I ¢ A 731 &
ST TAT AT W FANRAT form Faemd var & SR | gfderns &1 <
I BOIR 9 ufdqAre 9 Bl |

gRT 4 H FeEM — 9 ARE & gRT 4 § IR TR SN ¥Rl & WM W

ORI 6 B SURT (4) H FET — FT AMRFEH B GRT 6 B SUERT (4) H T
E9R B0 K] B WIH IR AN 89X 99 Iea] bl yfarefud fhar SR |

gRT 9 & YRR~ Ho JIRH @& arT 9 & FfeiRad & gfoRenfua fdam
STRATT, “9 a8+ SIRM IRT— (1) IS F3 a8+ & EIg & ol IRE aRg BT
a® qred S ¥ &1 U B RIdT AU 9’ & w9 H hed ©

QINTH g"l'ﬁ‘ldl"l HIHAT BT |

(2) SuERT (1) # Heffa W IR & =9 @ &) T agel UEfd 9T 89 W
TSl ARPR §RT LUl & Yaigaed A AR gRT FeiRa wu # i |




SeT Td BRI BT fdavor

o £ 999 4 4od adid H glg P oud 8¢ [AURIel §RT S99 daq Ud
3T /gfaemett # afg @ =g FReaR AFT &1 o & | 98 W daa fear 1 § &
Hf3T / J1emet / Jureder / <1 Ufiuel / IR Fadd & dd- /e / gaermsit #§ sruafadr @
SR FeTPR U A T T fbar ST =1fey |

AT B AT DI A H & gy Qoell [umar & seger o fuar &
ISR & Id9 TG WAl Bl ARAT BT ATIH eI B q IS e &5 el of
fRemTadT & weil & for) da= Wkl dor I glagell & qured @ ek & for
fais 2082015 &I wah faRme @Affd fgea & off| fdivg wfafa 9 vl v Tes
fraR—faael & uwarg I IotET & fieell @1 faudT et @ 9a9 a9l anfe

G 9y & <
P T

39 WO & ford, T IOE & el WRAR @ AT & (@d9 g W)
JAfAfRE, 1994 ¥ HeNEE = I Ao &3 ool IR & Al & (@99 v <)
(o) faerrd, 2015 URY fhar ar 2 fadms # I o & fieell WReR B
A3 & 9d9, W Ud o gfawmsii # gfg @1 uama 2, s S uwidl € 9 a1 aeA
# gfder 2|

faerge Jafe Seedl &I I &Ral & |

@\ Ryifem)
ST /H3 (FT)
02 fegwR, 2015



P RIRISERECIERSECIISIG)

MR MO &3 ool WRAR @& A3 &1 (@d9 Ud w7) (Fehe) fada®, 2015
fpaY arefiv=er e &1 faumd wifed ved =&Y oxar 2|




EsiRESIE]

MR RIS & feeell IRGR & A3 &1 (@9 vd W ) (Fenes) fagas, 2015
# fafed garal @ fharaas & o’ I ot e feeell @ adfhg A 3 arfaRed
i amradl g B Mazghar 2l |




