
Bill No. 18 of 2015

THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY
OF DELHI (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015

A

BILL

Further to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the Government of National

Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the

Sixty Sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement. – (1) This Act may be called the Members

of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances,

Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by

notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. – In the Members of the Legislative Assembly of

the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994,

(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, -

(a) In sub-section (1) –

(i) for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand

rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “two thousand rupees”

shall be substituted;  and

(iii) the words “subject to maximum up to forty days” shall be omitted;

(b) Insertion of new sub-section (1) (a), “ (a)The salary of members shall

be rupees fifty thousand initially and shall be raised by rupees five thousand

every twelve months during each term of the assembly:

Provided a member elected in a bye – election to the Legislative

Assembly shall draw a salary equal to the salary drawn by the members who

were elected in the general elections to that Assembly.”

(c) In sub-section (2), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the word,

“fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) In sub-section (3), for the words “six thousand rupees”, the word “thirty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted;



(e) In sub-section (4), for the words “secretarial assistance” the words

“communication allowance” shall be substituted;

(f) Insertion of sub-section (5), “(5) There shall be paid to each member

rupees twenty five thousand per month as MLA’s Constituency Office

rental and related utilities allowance;

provided that the allowance shall not be paid to members operating from

office space allotted by public agencies or from their own residences”;

(g) Insertion of sub-section (6) “(6) There shall be paid to each member a

sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for furnishing their MLA’s

Constituency Office for each term of office”;

(h) Insertion of sub-section (7), “(7) There shall be paid to each member a

sum of rupees sixty thousand as one time allowance for buying MLA’s

Constituency Office equipment for each term of office”;

(i) Insertion of sub-section (8), “(8) There shall be paid to each member a

sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of laptop,

personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office”;

3 Substitution of section 6.- – In the principal Act,

(a) Section 6 to be omitted and section 6A to be renumbered as section6;

(b) for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words “three lakh rupees” shall be

substituted;

(c) the words “within India” shall be omitted.

4. Insertion of new section 7. – In the principal Act, after section 6 the

following section shall be inserted, namely :-

“7. Reimbursement of salaries of secretarial staff. – Members of

Legislative Assembly of Delhi shall be reimbursed upto a sum of rupees thirty

thousand per month for one data entry operator and one office assistant;

rupees thirty thousand per month towards salary for one researcher and

rupees ten thousand for one office attendant on production of receipt of

payment through cheque or electronic clearance from the staff so employed.”

5. Amendment in section 8. – In the principal Act, in section 8 for the words “four

lakh rupees” the words “twelve lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

6. Omission of Section 8A. – In the principal Act, section 8A to be omitted.



7. Amendment in section 9. – In the principal Act, in section 9 for the words

“seven thousand five hundred rupees” the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be

substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS & REASONS

For some time past, there has been persistent demand from the MLAs

for the increase in their salaries and perks/ facilities having regard to the

increase in the price index. It has also been pointed out that

salaries/perks/facilities of Ministers/ Speaker/ Deputy Speaker/ Leader of

Opposition/ Chief Whip are a bit inadequate which should be upgraded and

enhanced to a commensurate extent.

Considering the exigency of demand, the Speaker of Delhi Legislative

Assembly appointed a Committee of Experts on 20.08.2015 to undertake a

comprehensive study of the structure of salaries and allowances of Members

of Legislative Assembly of Delhi and to recommended revision of salary

allowances and other facilities for the Members of Legislative Assembly of

National Capital Territory of Delhi. The Expert Committee after deliberating on

the issues has made its recommendations for increasing the Salaries and

allowances etc. of Members of Legislative Assembly of National Capital

Territory of Delhi.

For the purpose, the Members of Legislative Assembly of Delhi of

National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, allowances, Pension etc.)

(Amendment) Bill, 2015, has been initiated to amend the Members of

Legislative Assembly of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries,

Allowances, Pension etc) Act, 1994. The Bill proposes to increase the

salaries, allowances & other facilities of the Members of the Legislative

Assembly of Delhi, so as to facilitate them to work effectively in their fields.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(MANISH SISODIA)
Deputy Chief/Minister/Minister(Law)

December 2,2015



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

For the implementation of the proposals contained in The

Members of Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of

Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension etc.) (Amendment) Bill, 2015, there

will be an additional annual recurring expenditure from the Consolidated

Fund of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Members of Legislative Assembly of  National Capital Territory

of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension etc.) (Amendment) Bill, 2015,

does not seek to confer power of legislation on any subordinate

functionaries.



jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru] HkÙks] isa”ku vkfn½ ¼la”kks/ku½ fo/ks;d]
2015

jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru] HkÙks] isa”ku vkfn½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 esa
la”kks/ku ds fy;s fo/ks;d

bls Hkkjrh; x.kjkT; ds fN;klBosa o"kZ esa jk"Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk }kjk

fuEukuqlkj vf/kfu;fer fd;k tk;sxk %&

1- laf{kIr 'kh"kZd ,oa izkjaHk -& ¼1½ jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru]

HkÙks] isa”ku vkfn½ ¼la”kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2015 dgk tk;sxkA

¼2½ ;g ljdkjh jkti= esa vf/klwpuk ls mijkT;iky }kjk ;Fkkfuf”pr frfFk dks izHkkoh gksxkA

2- /kkjk 3 dk la'kks/ku %& jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru] HkÙks]
isa”ku vkfn½ vf/kfu;e] 1994  ¼blds i”Pkkr~ ewy vf/kfu;e ds :i esa lanfHkZr½ dh /kkjk 3
esa &

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa&

¼i½ ^^ckjg gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k
tk;sxk(

¼ii½ ^^,d gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^nks gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk(
rFkk

¼iii½ ^^vf/kdre pkyhl fnu dh “krZ ij** “kCnksa dks gVk;k tk;sxk(

¼[k½ u;h /kkjk ¼1½¼d½ dk lfUuos”ku] ^^¼d½ lnL;ksa dk osru izkjaHk esa ipkl gtkj #i;s gksxk
rFkk fo/kkulHkk dh izR;sd dk;kZof/k ds nkSjku izR;sd ckjg eghuksa esa ikap gtkj #i;s dh
c<+ksrjh gksxh%



mica/k gS fd fo/kkulHkk ds mi pquko esa fuokZfpr lnL; dks Hkh ml fo/kkulHkk ds lkekU;
pquko esa fuokZfpr lnL; ds }kjk izkIr osru ds leku osru feysxkA**

¼x½ mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa ^^vBkjg gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa dks
izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk(

¼?k½ mi/kkjk ¼3½ esa ^^Ng gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhl gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa dks
izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk(

¼³½ mi/kkjk ¼4½ esa ^^lfpoky; lgk;d** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^lEizs’k.k HkÙkk** “kCnksa dks
izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxk(

¼t½ mi/kkjk ¼5½ dk lfUuos”ku] ^^¼5½ izR;sd lnL; dks fo/kk;d fuokZpu {ks= dk;kZy; ds fdjk;s
rFkk lacaf/kr lqfo/kk HkÙkk ds :i esa iPphl gtkj #i;s iznku fd;s tk;saxs**(

mica/k gS fd ;g HkÙkk mu lnL;ksa dks ugha fn;k tk;sxk tks ljdkjh foHkkxksa }kjk vkoafVr
dk;kZy; LFkkuksa ;k vius vkokl ls dk;Z dj jgs gSaA(

¼N½ mi/kkjk ¼6½ dk lfUuos”ku ^^¼6½ izR;sd lnL; dks fo/kk;d fuokZpu {ks= dk;kZy; esa izR;sd
dk;kZof/k ds fy;s QfuZf”kax gsrq ,d eq”r HkÙks ds :i esa ,d yk[k #i;s dh jkf”k nh
tk;sxh**(

¼p½ mi/kkjk ¼7½ dk lfUuos”ku ^^¼7½ izR;sd lnL; dks fo/kk;d fuokZpu {ks= dk;kZy; esa
izR;sd dk;kZof/k ds fy;s midj.kksa ds fy;s ,d eq”r HkÙks ds :i esa lkB gtkj #i;s dh
jkf”k nh tk;sxh**(

¼>½ mi/kkjk ¼8½ dk lfUuos”ku ^^¼8½ izR;sd lnL; dks fo/kk;d fuokZpu {ks= dk;kZy; esa izR;sd
dk;kZof/k ds fy;s ysiVkWi] ilZuy dEI;wVj] fizUVj] eksckby] gSaMlSV vkfn dh [kjhn ds fy;s
,d eq”r HkÙks ds :i esa ,d yk[k #i;s dh jkf”k nh tk;sxh**(

3- /kkjk 6 dk izfrLFkkiu & ewy vf/kfu;e esa]

¼d½ /kkjk 6 dks gVk;k tk,xk vkSj /kkjk 6d dks] /kkjk 6 ds :i esa dzekfdar fd;k tk,%

¼[k½ ^^ipkl gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij ^^rhu yk[k #i;s** “kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k
tk;sxk(

¼x½ ^^Hkkjr ds Hkhrj** “kCnksa dks gVk;k tk;sxkA

4- u;h /kkjk 7 dk lfUuos”ku -& ewy vf/kfu;e esa /kkjk 6 ds i”pkr~ fuEufyf[kr /kkjk dks
lfUufo’V fd;k tk;sxk] vFkkZr~ %&



^^7 lfpoky; deZpkfj;ksa ds osru dh izfriwfrZ-& fnYyh fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dks ,d MkVk,aVªh
vkWijsVj rFkk ,d dk;kZy; lgk;d ds fy;s rhl gtkj #i;s izfrekg dh jkf”k( ,d
“kks/kdÙkkZ ds osru ds fy;s rhl gtkj #i;s izfrekg rFkk ,d dk;kZy; ifjpj ds fy;s nl
gtkj #i;s fu;qDr deZpkjh }kjk pSd }kjk Hkqxrku dh jlhn nsus ij ;k bySDVªkWfud
Dyh;jsal izLrqr djus ij izfriwfrZ iznku dh tk;sxhA**

5- /kkjk 8 esa la”kks/ku-& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 8 esa ^^pkj yk[k #i;s** “kCnksa ds LFkku ij
^^ckjg yk[k #i;s** “kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxkA

6- /kkjk 8d dks gVkuk-& ewy vf/kfu;e esa /kkjk 8d dks gVk;k tk;sxkA

7- /kkjk 9 esa la”kks/ku -& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 9 esa ^^lkr gtkj ikap lkS #i;s** “kCnksa ds
LFkku ij ^^iUnzg gtkj #i;s** “kCnksa dks izfrLFkkfir fd;k tk;sxkA



mís”; ,oa dkj.kksa dk fooj.k

fiNys dqN le; ls ewY; lwpdkad esa o`f) dks ns[krs gq, fo/kk;dksa }kjk muds osru ,oa
vuqykHk@lqfo/kkvksa esa o`f) djus gsrq fujUrj ekax dh tk jgh gSA ;g Hkh ladsr fd;k x;k gS fd
eaf=;ksa@v/;{k@mik/;{k@usrk izfri{k@eq[; lpsrd ds osru@vuqykHk@lqfo/kkvksa esa vi;kZIrrk gS
ftls c<+kdj ,d leku lhek rd fd;k tkuk pkfg,A

ekax dh vko”;drk dks /;ku esa j[krs gq, fnYyh fo/kkulHkk ds v/;{k us fo/kkulHkk ds
lnL;ksa ds osru ,oa HkÙkksa dh lajpuk dk O;kid v/;;u djus rFkk jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh
fo/kkulHkk ds lnL;ksa ds fy;s osru HkÙkksa rFkk vU; lqfo/kkvksa ds la”kks/ku dh flQkfj”k ds fy;s
fnukad 20-8-2015 dks ,d fo”ks’kK lfefr fu;qDr dh FkhA fo”ks’kK lfefr us fo’k;ksa ij xgu
fopkj&foe”kZ ds i”pkr~ jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa ds osru ,oa HkÙkksa vkfn
esa o`f) dh laLrqfr
dh gSA

bl iz;kstu ds fy;s] jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh fo/kkulHkk ds lnL;ksa ds ¼osru] HkÙks ,oa
isa”ku vkfn½ vf/kfu;e] 1994 esa la”kks/ku gsrq jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh fo/kkulHkk ds lnL;ksa ds
¼osru] HkÙks ,oa isa”ku vkfn½ ¼la”kks/ku½ fo/ks;d] 2015 izkajHk fd;k x;k gSA fo/ks;d esa jk’Vªh;
jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh fo/kkulHkk ds lnL;ksa ds osru] HkÙks ,oa vU; lqfo/kkvksa esa o`f) dk izLrko gS]
ftlls mUgsa izHkkoh <ax ls dk;Z djus esa lqfo/kk gksA

fo/ks;d iwoksZDr mís”;ksa dks izkIr djrk gSA

¼euh’k fllksfn;k½
mi&eq[;ea=h@ea=h ¼U;k;½

02 fnlEcj] 2015



foŸkh; Kkiu

jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru] HkÙks] isa”ku vkfn½ ¼la”kks/ku½

fo/ks;d] 2015 esa fufgr izLrkoksa ds fØ;kUo;u ds fy;s jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh dh lesfdr

fuf/k ls vfrfjDr okf’kZd vkorhZ O;; dh vko';drk gksxhA



izR;k;ksftr fo/kku laca/kh Kkiu

jk’Vªh; jkt/kkuh {ks= fnYyh ds fo/kkulHkk lnL;ksa dk ¼osru] HkÙks] isa”ku vkfn½ ¼la”kks/ku½

fo/ks;d] 2015 fdlh v/khuLFk vf/kdkjh dks fo/kk;h “kfDr iznÙk ugha djrk gSA


