Bill No. 18 of 2015

THE MEMBERS OF LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY
OF DELHI (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES, PENSION, ETC.) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2015

A
BILL

Further to amend the Members of the Legislative Assembly of the Government of National

Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994.

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the

Sixty Sixth year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement. — (1) This Act may be called the Members
of the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances,
Pension, etc.) (Amendment) Act, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by

notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Members of the Legislative Assembly of
the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension, etc.) Act, 1994,

(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 3, -

(@) In sub-section (1) —

@ for the words “twelve thousand rupees”, the words “fifty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “one thousand rupees” the words “two thousand rupees”
shall be substituted; and

(iii) the words “subject to maximum up to forty days” shall be omitted;

(b) Insertion of new sub-section (1) (a), “ (a)The salary of members shall
be rupees fifty thousand initially and shall be raised by rupees five thousand
every twelve months during each term of the assembly:

Provided a member elected in a bye — election to the Legislative
Assembly shall draw a salary equal to the salary drawn by the members who
were elected in the general elections to that Assembly.”

(c) In sub-section (2), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the word,

“fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) In sub-section (3), for the words “six thousand rupees”, the word “thirty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted;



(e) In sub-section (4), for the words “secretarial assistance” the words
“communication allowance” shall be substituted;

(f) Insertion of sub-section (5), “(5) There shall be paid to each member
rupees twenty five thousand per month as MLA’'s Constituency Office
rental and related utilities allowance;
provided that the allowance shall not be paid to members operating from
office space allotted by public agencies or from their own residences”;

(9) Insertion of sub-section (6) “(6) There shall be paid to each member a
sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for furnishing their MLA’s
Constituency Office for each term of office”;

(h) Insertion of sub-section (7), “(7) There shall be paid to each member a
sum of rupees sixty thousand as one time allowance for buying MLA’s
Constituency Office equipment for each term of office”;

(i) Insertion of sub-section (8), “(8) There shall be paid to each member a
sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of laptop,

personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office”;

3 Substitution of section 6.- — In the principal Act,

(@) Section 6 to be omitted and section 6A to be renumbered as section6;

(b) for the words “fifty thousand rupees” the words “three lakh rupees” shall be
substituted;

(© the words “within India” shall be omitted.

4, Insertion of new section 7. — In the principal Act, after section 6 the
following section shall be inserted, namely :-
“7. Reimbursement of salaries of secretarial staff. — Members of
Legislative Assembly of Delhi shall be reimbursed upto a sum of rupees thirty
thousand per month for one data entry operator and one office assistant;
rupees thirty thousand per month  towards salary for one researcher and
rupees ten thousand for one office attendant on production of receipt of
payment through cheque or electronic clearance from the staff so employed.”

5. Amendment in section 8. — In the principal Act, in section 8 for the words “four

lakh rupees” the words “twelve lakh rupees” shall be substituted.

6. Omission of Section 8A. — In the principal Act, section 8A to be omitted.



7. Amendment in section 9. — In the principal Act, in section 9 for the words
“seven thousand five hundred rupees” the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be

substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS & REASONS

For some time past, there has been persistent demand from the MLAs
for the increase in their salaries and perks/ facilities having regard to the
increase in the price index. It has also been pointed out that
salaries/perks/facilities of Ministers/ Speaker/ Deputy Speaker/ Leader of
Opposition/ Chief Whip are a bit inadequate which should be upgraded and

enhanced to a commensurate extent.

Considering the exigency of demand, the Speaker of Delhi Legislative
Assembly appointed a Committee of Experts on 20.08.2015 to undertake a
comprehensive study of the structure of salaries and allowances of Members
of Legislative Assembly of Delhi and to recommended revision of salary
allowances and other facilities for the Members of Legislative Assembly of
National Capital Territory of Delhi. The Expert Committee after deliberating on
the issues has made its recommendations for increasing the Salaries and
allowances etc. of Members of Legislative Assembly of National Capital

Territory of Delhi.

For the purpose, the Members of Legislative Assembly of Delhi of
National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries, allowances, Pension etc.)
(Amendment) Bill, 2015, has been initiated to amend the Members of
Legislative Assembly of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries,
Allowances, Pension etc) Act, 1994. The Bill proposes to increase the
salaries, allowances & other facilities of the Members of the Legislative

Assembly of Delhi, so as to facilitate them to work effectively in their fields.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(MANISH SISODIA)
Deputy Chief/Minister/Minister(Law)
December 2,2015



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

For the implementation of the proposals contained in The
Members of Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension etc.) (Amendment) Bill, 2015, there
will be an additional annual recurring expenditure from the Consolidated

Fund of the National Capital Territory of Delhi.



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Members of Legislative Assembly of National Capital Territory
of Delhi (Salaries, Allowances, Pension etc.) (Amendment) Bill, 2015,
does not seek to confer power of legislation on any subordinate

functionaries.



IR IS & fieel @ faum=ar SeRi &1 (@99, W=, U onfe) (Feer) fagrres,

2015

TR ST &7 oot & fAurrar as@ll &1 (999, W[, U onf) ifafm, 1994 4

FaeE & oy e

3 YRAY TR & BIRIed 9§ # UK IO &F fieell @ faueawr gRy
TR et fear SR —

Jifera e vd aRYM — (1) I o e foeell @ faemea T |ae & (aa,
I, U3 omfe) (i) fadaed, 2015 HT STRIAT |

TE RGN 19T # IR I SWRIRUT gRT AqfAfaad fafr &1 gardt grm |

gRT 3 BT FAEH — I I &85 fAcell & fume=aw del &1 (ad+,
U af) ST, 1994 (S9@ UvANq Aol JARTH & ®U H Hed) P ORT 3
F

SUERT (1) #—

"gRE BOIR BUY’ UK B WM W TN 8oIR SU a] bl gfoRenfugd fhar

T BOR IUY TE] B WM W Il FOR SYY” W&l BT UfaReqiua fHar SRem;
qor

“31fOhad AT o &Y IId W AT Bl BT SR,

T grRT (1)(B) T FHIYE, “(B) A BT IdT URA H YA TOIR BUd BN
T R @) IS HREE & SRM IS IR "ol § U g9R U @l
m B




Iudy & b e & Su garg § i e o 9 39 fagm=a & aHr=
garg H FEifed 9e © §RT U< 909 & S 9 Aol T |

SUIRT (2) H "“36RE BoIR ¥’ V&l & WM W "IN EOIR SUI" @] Pl
gforenfud fear S,

SUIRT (3) # "B8 BOR IR’ @& & WM W G BOIR II’ Gl Pl
gfeRenfod farar SR

SURT (4) # “Afvared WEEE” @ B OWIE WOCGRINU AT de&) Bl
gferenfd farar SR

SUYIRT (5) &7 Af~TdeH, “(5) TA® Fad P fqumae Hared a3 draed @ i
AT AT GIAeT 91 & wU H g=dd g9R U U by SIRAT;

IUeY B b Ig 9T SS9 A Bl T8l AT IR S RGN faWET gRT srafed
PIITTI XTT AT Y 3MART I BRI DY T 2 |;

SYRT (6) BT A~deH “(6) UI® g &I s fated &3 dafay § ud®
HIIEY & o BRRAT 8 U 43d W< & ©U H Uh o B9y oI AR7 o
STRAf;

@) SWIRT (7) &1 Af9RE () TS I B faurs ol &9 srafag #
IS HREY & o)) SUSRT & o) T g3 9 & WU H A6 §9R U B
3T € SrREf;

SUYRT (8) BT AAeH “(8) TP A Bl faumad ated &5 drfed § Idd
A & fo duci, Todd drer, iR, Aegd, gede ofe @ Wik & ford
TP J3d W< D ©U H U ARG U B IR & SIRA

gRT 6 T URIRITIT — H& SIS H,
gRT 6 DI TSR SIYIT 3R GRT 6F BI, IRT 6 S HU H HHANGT fhaT ST
“TT BOTR O9Y Y] & WH R A g vud” el Bl gfarenfua fhar

"R b AR’ ] DT ST STRATT |

T ORT 7 BT A9 — o ARRE H gRT 6 @ uvan FEfeiRad g1 @1
affae fear SR, s —



"7 ARATAT HHARAT & 99 DI gfagfd.— el e Je=ii &1 td Seig!
TR AT TUh BTl Fe-d & ford O 89k Bud YfArg &1 ¥Ifen U
BT & I B oy I BOIR BUd YfTATE Tl U Bl UReR & ford <
BOR ¥U gad HHaRl gRT ddb §RI YA I W& o WR I Soldal-id
FARINE U R W Uiyl uar @l SRt |

gRT 8 § HIEM.— o IMAFTH & gRT 8 § IR g IW’ W&l & WF R
"gRE g B9 Iea] bl gfarenfud fhar SR |

gRT 8% P BCMIL— o ARTIH H GRT 8% BT FSHAT SIRAT |

gRT 9 ¥ Heled — HoT S| & gRT 9 § "9 &9IR Ui Al 9" ¥ai &
WM R U458 TR U &l B yfoRenfid far S|




T U9 HRUN BT fqavor

o ¢5 99 ¥ 0 gaaia ¥ gfg 3 <@d gy el g’ S9& da+ ud
argem / gfaemsit # gfg w1 2g FReaR i @ 97 <@ 71 a8 W Had fear ma § %
A3t / J1emet / Jureder / <11 Ufiuel / qRe FAdd & dde /e / gaermelt # sroafaar @
ST 9¢Th} U | 4T I fohar ST =nfav |

AT B AT DI A H & gy Qoell [umar & seger 9 fuasr &
IR b JId9 TG Al DI GRAAT BT AP NI HR- qAT TS ST &5 faeell &l
foumay & el & foRy 9d9 wal 9 o=y gfdgrell & Weies @ iRy & o
faies 2082015 @I U favme AT Fgad &1 off | fRiveg 9ffa 9 vl w184
froR—famel & uwarq g IS & el @ AT et & 9de ud W enfe
il I Ed ikl
GO

39 YOO & ford, IS Ioe e facel! faum T @ el @ (dad, ¥=T U4
Uer 3Mfe) ST, 1994 ¥ WM Tq IS Sl & fdeel [umad & 9edl &
(@9, W< 9 U omfy) (Wemed) fages, 2015 URY fhar wm B e # s
RIS &y ool e e & dewl & 9a+, Wl Ud o= Jfawmsii § gfg &1 uwa w,
T 92 uMdl &1 | B e § gfaeT B |

fa¥ge gatad Seedl BT U< &l & |

@\ i)
ST—q&IHAT /H43 (|I)
02 fa=mR, 2015



IEIRASICE

IR IO e ool @ faumam el &1 (da9, w1, vord enfe) (Feies)
faerg®, 2015 § fAfed umal & foraraua & fory I o &3 fieel @1 Iafed
fafr 9 srfiRaa a1 amadt @ @ smazadar s8R |




TSI fauE Gl S|

MR IO e ool @ faumadm dael &1 (da9, w1, vod enfe) (Feies)
faerre, 2015 fhefl erefiRer BN &1 fAurh wfed yex &t o=t 21



