BILL NO@2-OF 2012
THE DELHI VALUE ADDED TAX (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2012 .
A |
5 BILL
to further amend the Delhi Valye Added Tax Act, 2004.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Agsembly of the National Capital Territory
of Delhi in the Sixty-second year of the Bepublic of India as follows:-

A. Short title; extent and dommencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Delhi Value Added Tax (Amendment) Act, 2012, ' b

(2) It extends to the whole_of the National Capital Territory of Delhj.

F==———3) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by notification

. Egn

Frime 1

vaen v.‘."\m'.”i]'n'

o ot "u(*xghﬁ“&lﬁivﬁwwl..

in the official Gazette, appoint, except section 7 of thig Act which shall be

deemed to come into force with effect from 1%t April, 2005,

2. Amendment of section 2.- In'the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 (Delhi

3. Amendment of section 3.- In the 'prinéipal Act, in section 3, in syp.
section (4),- . )

(@) . for the words “twenty eight”, the words “twenty one” shal| be substituteq: " -
(®) in'the proviso, for the number ‘28", the number “21” shall be Substituted.

4

4. * Amendment of section 28.- In the principal Act, in Section 28, -

(@) in sub-section ( 1), for the words “four years”, the words “one year” shall be
Substituted; - :

(b) * in sub-section (2), for the words “four years”, the words “one year” shaj| be
Substituted. .

s




-Ic-u-u- .

B OIRHCERD R nem g

’

C WREE W OAe

sy

v Py ,." N

e o

BLE N

5.

““Explanation. 3.- For the purposes of this Act,

[ 40 B dh T1H (PN
>

7.

Amendmehf of section 22.- In the principal Act, in section 29, after the
second Explanation, the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely:--

any return having digital signature

as defined under clause (p) of sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Information
Technology Act, 2000 (No.21 of 2000), shall be treated as if the return has been

~ signed as required under this Act”.

6. Amendment of section 74. — In the principal Act, in section 74, in sub-
section (10), for the word “seven”, the word “eight” shall be substituted.

Am:endment- of section 81.- In the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004
(Delhi Act 3 of 2005), in section 81, in sub-section (2), after the proviso to clause

(a), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely: -

“Provided further that the above proviso shall be deemed to have come

. into force with effect from the First day of April, 2005.”.

" .8. Amendment of section 106.- In the principal Act, in section 106, after

sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be added and shall be deemed to
have been added with effect from the first day of April, 2005, namely:- '

“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, for the purpose of the levy,
assessment, deemed assessment, reassessment, appeal, revision, review,
rectification, reference, registration, collection, refund or input or credit of input
tax, of allowing benefit of exemption or deferment of tax, imposition of any
penalty or of interest or forfeiture of any sum, which relates to any period ending
before Ist day of April, 2005 or for any other purpose whatsoever connected with
or incidental to any of the purposes aforesaid, and whether or not the tax,
penalty, interest or sum forfeited, if any, in relation to such proceedings, is paid
before, on or after Ist day of April, 2005, the repealed Act and all rules,
regulations, orders, notifications, forms and notices issued thereunder and in
force immediately before Ist day of April, 2005 shall continue to have effect as if:

this Act has not been passed.”
" -

o




h

SIS 1€ e . r— ST 4 —

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND'REASONS

To bring uniformity in the definition of purchase and sale turnover in section 2,
the definition of purchase turnover is proposed to be amiended. N

g and make it more efficient, time for payment of Net

To smoothen the tax plannin
28 days to 21 days by amending section 3.

Tax is proposed to be reduced from

C TR YWY apew

To reduce the limitation period for revision of returns and filing of objection for

correction of deficiencies in return from four years to one year, section 28 is proposed to
be amended.

o

-

To provide for treating any return{ having been digitally signed as:per the
sub-section (1) of-section 2 of the Information Technology Act,

E  provisions of clause (p) of f

* 2000 (No.21 of 2000) at par with electronic return to mean returns in the Act 29 is

*  proposed to be amended. ) o

i fo further extend the period of limitation prescribed underléub-seétion (10) of

] section 74 of the DVAT Act by ancther year, which would mean that these appeals

. would-have to-be decided »by.31;03.2013‘instead of 31.03.2012, section 74 is proposed”

:  tobeamended. : '

E For, conferring power on the High Court to condone the delay in filing of éppeals,
he Delhi Act 12 of 2010 which took -

&4 proviso was inserted in the Section 81 through t
offect from 1st February, 2011. While the intended purpose of the amendment was to
make the provision applicable to some appeals which were dismissed by the High Court
for delayed filing, before the amendment, the earlier amendment can achieve its useful
= purposelobjettive only if the amendment is given effect retrospectively, which is being

attempted through the proposed am?ndment in section 81.

clause in respect of the power of revision under
106 of the Delhi Value Added Tax Act, 2004 is -
of the Additional Solicitor General of India.

To provide for a specific saving
the Delhi Sales Tax Act, 1975, section
proposed to be amended on the.suggestion

The Bills seek to achieve the aforesaid objectives.
' . ' (SHEILA DIKSHIT)
' . CHIEF MINISTER / MINISTER OF FINANCE

—NEW DELHI
___ DATED




b

NI S 4 -
g 3 et T ——

»

EINANCIAL MEMORANDLIZ

INANCIAL MEMORANDUM

\

The Delhi Value Added Tax (Amendment) Bill, 2012 does not involve any
Resmonal financial implications since no outgo on new posts is anticipated from the
BEe:clidation Fund of the National Capital Territory of Delhi. '

'd




