R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

Sariae T,

ORTITN TFL3IXTRTH

c‘.’)a’ew oo B33
Poni— IV Bortseh, Don¥mes, 2.0, Vs, 2090 (8,3 OO, BBIBF OFP.9) 0.090
Part- IV Bengaluru, TUESDAY, 31, MARCH, 2020 (Chaithra 11, ShakaVarsha 1942) No. 120
BoDe0d BBHTNH D) ToTS TS Je3zowad
BRI

50936: xodémf‘a 17 2988 2020 Loneed:, d=00s: 31.03.2020

BRFEIB M J,00eF 2B BT T (SWTBB) eﬁmécjezs, 2020 ¥TWB, 20200 Sy
3on¥ 30 Je HI03ToD cm%mod w1 deddd, mdmaﬁé 33BN faci@( 20200 BVFE3B
05 E3ed Joad: 02 POLVWN BJFEIB Ty BT @ BEdTeIeB0r 8TedTeIINS.

2020 3 30rE3d eﬂmzsa"ezi ﬁo&iﬂ: 02
BXFEIB MR J,00e DR B0 TozF (SWBB) esméo"ees, 2020

(5208 rieeteRE  WE,BROTHC ST  FTFHE Do TRO00T B IweNn
20203 313 HIPOBTOWD FIPFWT TonBTIW DR BoWIONY BRTL TFLTONT)

BIIFEIB M R,00F D) BoIIoDS TaF P, 1993, IR, SWPIB B
20T PYTIED.

BRFEIB PRI D) Berdd PN BORB) wRTeBITFY RWODLFTO0T D) VD
@R, B0 SoWIDE GLTIEBNVMN VTYTETDY, @)0YATLY, gy FIBIY SDBERVID
eadz%ﬁra@mdozpﬁ c‘:)csesdmaimb V03N 0o BoFL3S mszs me:gmoén"
I3 NI TO0T;

S5, P08 JoPIRT 2133 DT (1)Fe 0BT Bwws FTIDT WHFITHY,
30 ST LBT TOVETIVT) 8 B0V WTYTWEBTY, &0YDIWT, DOWT:-

1. Bog@ BID DB F9,80%.- (1) 85 VHYTETDY, BRFE3B MY F,00eF DA BoeFaodhe

TeF (3Q=R) S[ap) Be3, 2020 O BBHSB,RD).
(2) 90 B BpdJe 2201t O3B,



S

2. 23¢ BBTHT SWMBB.- BB MY J00e DB BoWahT TzF WD, 1993
(19938 BDoresd R Fosl; 14) (VY A FW0T Fpe VRS0 sVfedTND) 2:3e
@803 (18)e 0oBTY “BWgdeen” dow BBTY, VD ABSZ,T).

3. 53¢ BB0HE SRIB.- Swew WHIDDT 53¢ JBTHT VRBBTE (4)3 BTORBTY) “BR)
SRENYD” Do BTNV D SIREMW” D0 IBNTIY, &3030eBI3B,.

4. 73¢ BBVHBSRBB.-Fwew WHADDT 7358 FBTHT (2)IeeVIB BT “BFE 8503
e aow BTN “BFT BST3 THIToN' Do) BBNTRY, B)308eedIZZ,I).

5. 125¢ &830608 3WIB.- Swew) RIDLRDT 123 BTETO, -

(i) (00) 20BBY “VBLB,3 =HHY” dow BTNY Shezead “WBDe BoFahd® I arode
BBBY, B oDDT Do TBAYRY, JeOISZ .

(i) ST0BBBOI (B)ISBDS Shead 85 BoOITIY, FedISB, W) 20BT :-

(@) (0¢F) 0083 BHOS vIBrSah Fo0drerdTnaly (Operate) 8Te3T DT203DT B
SRR SZ0DHTed BhHcead JoRD@eeN3S, T’

6. 43-0 BBTET SWIB.- WP WRIMIDET 43-0 BBFTT (1)Fe VT BTEITD,-

(i) ‘VBFTFY)” D0 DTB SWTAD “VPDe IZETRY WHBBRIIT T9PTTDY)” D0
BTN, FeOI3Z D).

(ii) (ii)Se 2083 Shmead B SwoDBITIY JedISB,D, 20TT:-

"800, M TowoL VDISMN IBIJRD Mo Boabdrt wde IOIFY D)
w3ead BT03DT OV OINY BTHWRT &8 wdrah JoordTBY B3I SerITY, WLrwsort
39T Md BoePodd IHTO FeedUed DI, M  BoIodSody  HoweD
SeBDFYTN LITSB,R)."; DR

(iii) (v)3e 2083 3heeod Bt SwodITRY, FeOTSZ,W, ©oT3T:-

“(vi) 3D e eﬂcjzsg PO WD emmcjzg QAR IR ﬁdﬁémﬁ DIFBE3, VDo
Ddsodeent D) ST arediie &BTBH 8TReIBTING, BB BT ToeTTT".

7. 443¢ B30T SWBB.-Bwew) RIS 443 BBTT (2)3e VTBBTET (D) WOBTOR
BT0RBT 3Deod Bt SoLITRY, FeOTSZ,W, ©0TT:-

" DF) BB, B NVTDBTLBEDEY WeFODIT BTSHI BweBR) SoriweNTSE,).”

8. 46:¢ BBTHT AWIB.- L BPIDLDT 4633¢ BBTET(1)Se PVBTBTEHTY AT
SRENYW” Q0w BNV “TBBZ) 0N’ dow BBNYRY, &303eedI3B,T.

9. 483 B30T SWBE.- S HIDT 4833 ZBTETO, -

(i) (13e VBBBTBY SweTSe SToBISIY Ve VBIB,T; HA)

(i) (4)Fe TBBITORTY  "TZETY” 0w IBT ST UFTe  ISETY
©0B)Be VT H9BTTY” a0 IBNYIY JeOISZ .

10. 495 B30T SWMBB.-Bew) HIDIT 4933 ZBTETO, -



(i) (1Se eVTBBTTO, -

(@) oTESe ICoBBRY “DweTR)  SoNnWNY Q0w IANYR  BOIWD  Soridnry
QoVBBNIRY, &30eeBI3Z,.

() RweTRe BT0BITY “OTW TN YT dow) BBV B Sorty wIrt vow STBAYR)
B 303,0eRTBT,R); DR

(i) (2)3e BVBH,BTEISSY, DeDVBIZD.

11. 585¢ 33068 SWBB.- Qe RADIT 58:eRBTIT (1) LVTBBTELTO, -

(i) ()Se 20Ba Sheeodh 8 BwoOIBIY FedIBZ,TY, ©oTT:~

V(o) B3 IR dePTe TRV DINW JAofemen 8 AUy DINOT SwgadbezeN
oI BRYRY ADEDIHI;” DB

(ii) (xiii)Se 20BBY @) Sede80VT FoNFR” Do TTAYRY, Ve VBIB,Dworie
‘ToADFT” w0 BBB STweod Wed TodnY DB Bede3dud FodbriY  Foadob
Qodhod ey Joes BT 333, (ABC) STo@DFHTY’ 02 SBNYY, OIS, .

12. 643¢ B30T SWBB.- Swev VRIS 643e BBTT (1) YVBZBTTY “Be3 BB,
QTUATIZZL)” D0 BTNY ST “WPTe oSl aosmsn& QAOTLY” DoY) awma&
XedB3BR).

13. 1113e 30638 SWBB.- S BRIBDDT MIe SBT3 (3)Fe LVBBBTRT (OF°) 2033
Shead Bt BoDITY, FeOTISB, T, ©oB33,-

(@) 8 RIDIDT eVBOFNY BDY My BoeFeahSodw 8éﬁfaod NSRRIV uzg
ARFALAW T JPFTRYRY wedrtedDS DIF) My BoweodhSodh eedndnt J&b Srerds
202330 BeoDHZHD.”

14. 1233¢ BB0HT SWABB.- e BPIDLIDT  1233¢ JBTHT  (3)Fe  LVTB BT
B00BBBY BR) SIRENRY” Do) IBREM O TVENY” D02 BENYRY, B)S0dReBTIZ.

15. 1283¢ B,3063 SRIB.- R BRIDDT 1285¢ BBTET (1)Je LVBHBTLTO -

(i) (B)2008a Sheod (0eF) 0B FedIB3,B0TT:-

(0¢F) Doweohdad JIBJTeN  Boweab3ad eRTe edw, deedS, @yRIBRY
SoodbenBrie TN ayeYae Fo0lrB) WRSIT BT ©9RBTT WHT0LeEN BFTe WFFSAHO
SedweN ooy 833 IBVIIBT WSO WFe Bowedhdah WreRde STIY, Beoddhaer,
S0 3odh ARV gz @33 JANY DAFAdRNBY 2eNalreN, B83D SABJIod S0
Alelnlo}



i) SCORITD -
Q) () SeBIY DD JJENW’ Q00 TRV BT IJENW” Q0w DTV,
JedIBZ D).

() (B) FSOI Sheeod B BoDIBIY FedTIBZ, W) ©0TT:-

(@) (0¢f) 2083 BHOS [BESaD) Fo0dree3dTHody (Operate) ©8T3e3T DT03DOT BT
SR SSe0hTed SHcTeod JoBD@eeN33, Ty’

16. 136 @30T SWBB.- Swew) HADIT 13633 BBTET (1)Se YVBB,BTETO, -

(i) TRBFCR)” A0V IBTW 3D BT B RODITTR) 3TETT IS
©0B)BePIT H9BTTY” a0 IBNYIY JeOTISZ .

(ii) (/e 2083 Sheod B SwoLITRY, FeOTSZ,T), ©oTT:-

@00, 11, ToRTMED DTSN IBTRD Soed B0t wRe JOITO D) lrad
BT008003 oW BINY IRV & wieod FowodnY ST, eESBIY WABEWTOrt 3VJew
FoRd Boe3ohd BATY Beedud DT SewD Boeah3aln Sowed SreBtha)meN
PITI3B,R).”; DIB)

(iii) (v)e 0BT Shzveod B SwoBITY, FeOTSB,T, ©0BT:-

“(vi) OB B VTFZ VFD0 BB YVTIFF VPP FB IBIY PN WIEBI, DTS
Ddzodeert D) RAST areie &BTBEH 8TReIBTNGY, 3L TRes ToeSITT”

17. 1383¢ &, 80000 SRIB.- Swow) QILIDT 138:e BTTO, -

() (23 WSBBTET (@) WoBIOI @ToBT SDhedd B BWoOITD, TeOTISZ W,
Q0TT:-

‘BCOD), B LLBTBTHTBAY DETOOIT TSR SweSTB) SoRWNRYINIBZR.”
)

(i) (3)Fe LVSBBTETY  “OW IRENRW” Do BBV “BweBB) orVNL” dow BBNTI
B 303elT3Z, ).

18. 1403 B30T SWBB.- Swew) BADTT 1403 ZBTETA, -

(i) (3)Ie LVBZBTT, -

(@) Setude SToDBRY “BweaF) Sone¥dr oo ITAVT “BOI,; WD Sone It
QOVBTNYRY, &3030eBI3B,T;

() 2TBIe SToDITY “‘OTW SIENR YT Do VTR BB SonHe T dow BTN
B 30eBT3B,R); DI)

(i) (4)Fe TBBITCHTY "TZrCRY” o JIBT  3DTeah wPTe B DOD
JBeECPYuBB)BieVIT H9BFe0Y” 20 IBNYRY, JedTISZ .

19. 1413e B306 SWIB.- Jwew BPRIDLIT 1413e BBTHT  (6)Je LVTDBTES, B3
BWOOITY, &303eedI3B,T, ©oBT:-



3

“() @dzs§@z;3memmcjé§d c‘.’)dxg AePTe  VITIT TRRT? VT 0T JoLRD
BogeodSodn BOMEIITT, B3ae3 BDERTT FeIod P FBDD, SoTSE, "

20. 1605 B30T SWIB.- Jwew BPIADLRDT 1603e BBTTY BCoRBTOI (i) Je
23T, DeDNBSB, ).

21. 1623¢ JB0HE ARQIB.- Swww RIS 1625 IBTHT  (3)Fe LVBTBTET
BT0DBTY “BR) IR Do ITAVT DO SIENY” Do VBNV, T 303eeBIIZ,T.

22. 1673¢ B30T SAWBB.-Se0 PIDLIDT 1673 FBTET (1)e LVBZBTETA, -

() (3) 20083 Shzead 8 BoDS (2ef) OBSIY JeOTISI, W), ©oTT:-

(Q¢F) Doweohdah JBFDeN  BoweohSod dePde ey, odeeRS, RSB
S0DENBrPPDTIN aye)Tie FoohEBY) WRTIT BTDe &9HBTT WTHTLeEN BFT WEFSAHO
SedmeN uFmy 833 IBIBT BIRWY ©FDe Bosdd3ad wrePte ITI, oL,
@BoFeoh3adh RNV ©FD @30 JANY DIFAIeeNBY 2eNae, B3 S SJSow B0
20T3;”

(i) BCOBBTA, -

(@) () FSBIY S STJENW Do TTRVT BT SJENW Do ITAYRY, FeOISB,.

() (B) FBwOI Shezood B BoDITBIY FedIST, T ©oBT:-

(@) (0¢F) 0083 BHOI vIBrSah Fo0drerdTnaly (Operate) 8Te3T DT3B B
SRR SS0LT3 BHcead doRD@eeN3S, T’

23. 1755¢ BBCHBIRBE.- S0 WHIRET 1755 BBTT (1)e VBB BTEITD -

(i) "TBETY” D0 ITB 3D eFTe By DOD IFrdFy whBBeAT
D9DTITY” D0 BIBNYIY JeOTISZ .

(ii) (ii)Se 2083 Shmead B SWoDBITY TedI3Z,D, 20TT:-

BT, 11T BBV VDTSN ITID By Soseabdrt wde IOIFY D) wBead
BT003003 O% BINY wIDARYT &8 wBeod FowoFBY B3, eVESDIY WABEWTOT 3VJw
By Bowodd SAFO BeedUed DDA By Boeodhdody @oed Sreddhd)men
PIT3B,R).”

(iii) (v)3e 2083 3heod Bt SwodIBIY, FeOTISZ W), ©0TT:-

“(vi) T Ve DoeFeah3od e eﬂzjég PO 9D emmz_jzé PO 9D ﬁdﬁémﬁ
DI, VDTS DDBdeer D) RSV odreile @ BTHTBE B8UReIBIND, SBASohO esiees
prAlTrinefy

24. 1773¢ 33068 SWBB.- e HADDT 177:35e BySTETA, -

(i) (2)SeevaB,B0ET () 2oBBY SToRIT Shceadh B BoVIBIY JedTISZ W), ©0TT:-

‘DR) IC0D), B VTBBTLHBEODY DETVOOIT BWoSHA SweTB) ot wriweNISE,@).”;
R

—o



&

(i) (3)SeevBBBTBY ‘OB JRENW” Qo IBAVT DweTIZ) SonWD” 0w BTN
B 303elT3Z, Q).

25. 1793¢ BB3068 SWBB.- S0 BRI 17953 BBTET (3)Je VBB BTETD, -

() @3B TR “ADDTVIMTT @07 ADRROT w¥Be” dow BBNPY,
JedIB3,3;

(ii) Setue BC0RBBY DeSB) SonHe P’ dow IWALR DO one Tt
Q0w BTNV, &303eeldI3B,TY; DA

(iii) BB e BCoDBBY TR SReNEW ¥ri” 202 STV et oriste I vow IBRII
B 303eRT3B, Q.

26. 1803¢ @30T SWBB.- Iwew WHADDT 1803¢ BT (6)Je  VTB BT, B
BWoOIT, &303eedI3B,T, D0BT:-

“(6) OFZ BT WHIFFI DG YT VAT TRBTY AT 0w BONESITTY, w9 Teds
B0dnBD WPD IBF0Y) WHBBrPIIT arecdee) ¥3T S TS WHTOW Tefad FF3aDIY
LIS AAY

27.  1963¢ 806 SWBB.-Swe0 HHADIT 196:3BBTT(1)Je BVBBSTET BSTORSTO
19880 BRoFe3d @030 OF (SWBB) BIDD  T9ToTeB BT03RT Jwed IJIENY
BRMN' D0V BT, B8BTe) BB, AW D) W0odNHY, Ve ABSZ,I).

28. 1973¢ BB0n SWIB.-Awew RADLIDT  1973e  BBTHT(3)Fe  YVBTBTEITOS
B0oDBBY BOIDOINWe oo ST wdIR)  OIneTow STV
B 303eBT3Z, ).

29. 2373 3306 SWBB.-wew) WRIDDT 2373 BBTEHT (1)Fe LVTB,BTEHT “adyeITse
$80e38 U0 WFT 0w ITNY 3DTead “ B WYPIDDT 64,70,113 DI 269:e BBTETO
ARFFBDBIT T9BFTMR 37108 FoRR T 3edEINY TTBN'd0w SBNYRY, JedISZI.

30. 30820Fe BBTHE SWBB.-DwL WHADLDT 30800 BBTF, B BODIBIY
B 303edT3B,W). 9073,

“308Q00 WIoIBNY a?ewas%,-mz% DNITHe  3AdReNy) DOWIANETFS 93D
FPEEFTRRITY, Spdww WJeTHe B30HobRY, FpefredTIBZD) D) WTsme BDTI0DIY
BPTBDHJYTS, Swodd FuIZW OINEr 3B WTBB TIRINFDEBT3RY, DR W0
Sewozel b 333333’

31.  30800FBCHBIRBA.-SeVBRIDINT 3080DBBTETO -

(o) 2033Y “SedJah OITNTBZD'oow  IJAYR T[S B30I
BIZNTBZ, By w02 STV, &30deedT3B3.; DB

(i) (B) 200B3Y “‘©I¥Ih DI o083 RwodIITAVR OIID OIF, BwoLBITVT Do
BBRYY, B303eeBdISZ .



2

32. 30803 IBTHT SRBAB.-e0 HILRDE 3080 FBTET (1)e LVBTBTETA, -

(i) (D) 20BBY ‘& 303eoT'd0w BTF, “WISTRF, "P0VBTB,B;30d0eBTIB,TY; D)

(ii) () 20BBY,-

(Q)ded TodbBody 200hOHT @le HTHIT o BBRYT wWITSHD DBWRY)
Sz RS SoaBon roedny SpTOF a0 STV, Z30deedT33,T.

Q) =bJeBme ed TodIaky 2wDAODT Do ITPRET  WIeSTHAD  DIWeRY)
BB R,S SoaBoed Notdny SRBOF oo STV, FeOT3BT.

33, 308Y) PBTHT SRBB.-SR0 PAADIT 308D BFTHBY “3080"'D0w Josk; DR
©ZTB, “30808 0 Josd, DA BFTNYRY &30deedTISE,D.

34. 3098 FICHBIRQBB.-e0  HRADDT 3098  IBTHTO(1)IJe VB FBTET
Bew 30Q, -

[x]

() () 2083 Sheeod BrwodI ITI)TOTISZ W, ©0TT:-

2l

(i) | R 0O, ToRd iap]ejerialei APIROBRE emmcjzgd)

SBR,D

2L

(i) @08 (i), (i) S (iv) OO “Be eJeDE’, Boe eJed* TIER® D) ;3 eJe0* TJE™ Do
BRI VT, Dow STSRY, VBN B30deBdI3B,TY

35. 3103 B30T AWBB.- Swew) BADDT 31058 BBTT (2)Fe LVTZBTET (V)
DOTZ, B SoDITRY, B)303eBIBZ W), ©0TT:-

(@) By B0WDHTW, ToRBD B0AENW, B3 B0WANENRW DI BSOS INT
DOBND DF) FTINRDNY FQUDRD 8D, B30T AoDDIT Bedabe) whTed30e3,
BT ADFR, SBBVBMTT 07 F130 IBTT e, Joskod DBIe T, 3,03 BBDAVT),
JBIOD, BSDOI Mycbess FTBeINW DR INC BBeINY wIJosdod IRSed Porome
Br0603, 9DTTN DTNTSE, Y.

36. Ve ehxdewad SWBB.-Swew) RILIDT Ve T30,

(i) Y- Melain) “Be3 BRPe IS0 dedeBodeonidd (i)
S50 RVTBE,Fo0PIBIBW DN OIS BoDITY, ) 30d0eldT35,1), 20TT:-
“D 363 BRYhes3on DoAE3TT
() 033,03 3¢.0.40.
(D) DFB,;Me03 3€.0.50.
(Q) B3, ;11003 Te.0.60"
Q.33 B SPYT e




(i) 2. a0 BAERMY Seed IDDVF O 202 20T DRWTB, FoWOHAT SRRTNY ShTo0d
B ROBITRY, FeOVIZ,T, 0BT~

n‘%

(1) AR Qe T'Se e R,3S P W0 &eS Te.0.10

() AR erges BT B;MedTe Z3edd wod) S0t @y
SAEWIAL) SZeednd) BFIDY
B3eBRL

FTRLOOW TR
TR L3ITTY Uaz%m@d:

BoOF 3T Uoz%m@d efza@agamd
meg 9333 %565@,

(3. RCER® wetk)
TTOFTT ToONF WO
TORLCOD wswmdmﬂo m?%
AT TBES QU03.

SToxdead dédmdm}o DB) TITN SAUN JWTead
OOTRIN

30585: zowémfa 17 2988 2020 Lonseds, d=o0s: 31.03.2020

The Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat Raj (Amendment) Ordinance,
2020 awg 20203 Svow’e Son 303¢ DIP0TTOW TIBIPOT i BRTSW), ABIT,

STLIMON AwDY, 20200 FIFWE ®@553€5 xogjéz 02 ROOTRN  FIFEIT T,
TITY TSRO BTWeHRUONT.

KARNATAKA ORDINANCE NO. 02 OF 2020
THE KARNATAKA GRAM SWARAJ AND PANCHAYAT RAJ

(AMENDMENT) ORIDNANCE, 2020
(Promulgated by the Governor of Karnataka in the Seventy first year of the
Republic of India and First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the
31st day of March, 2020)



¢

An Ordinance further to amend the Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat
Raj Act, 1993 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1993) and for matters connected therewith or
incidental thereto;

Whereas the Karnataka Legislative Assembly and the Karnataka Legislative
Council are not in session and the Governor of Karnataka is satisfied that the
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action to
promulgate the Ordinance for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213
of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Karnataka is pleased to promulgate the
following Ordinance, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Ordinance may be called the

Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat Raj (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.-In section 2of the Karnataka Gram Swaraj and
Panchayat Raj Act, 1993 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1993) (hereinafter referred to as the
Principal Act), in clause (18),the word “leprosy” shall be omitted.

3. Amendment of section 5.-In section 5 of the Principal Act, in sub-section
(4), in the first proviso, for the words “ten years”, the words “five years”, shall be
substituted.

4.Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the Principal Act, in sub-section
(2), for the words “on non party basis”, the words “on non party basis”, shall be
substituted.

5.Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act,- (i) in
clause (1) the following shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

“or while holding any office of panchayat”

(i) in the proviso, after item (d), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(e) the disqualification under clause (1) shall cease to operate after the expiry

of six years from the date of the order.”

6. Amendment of section 43-A.- In section 43-A of the Principal Act in sub
section (1),-

(i) after the words “the Government”, the words “or an Authority authorised by
the Government”, shall be inserted;

(ii) after clause (iii),the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that where an application is made by a member to the Grama
Panchayat for leave to absent himself and Grama panchayat fails to inform the
applicant of its decision on the application within a period of seven days from the
date of the application, the leave applied for shall be deemed to have been granted by

the Grama Panchayat.”; and



00

(iii) after clause (v),the following shall be inserted namely:-

“(vi) if a former Adhyaksha or Upadhyaksha or member of Grama Panchayat
has been accused and proved guilty for misconduct or misappropriation in an
Inquiry”.

7. Amendment of section 44.- In section 44 of the Principal Act, in  sub-
section (2), in clause (c) after the proviso, the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that the duration of the offices reserved under this sub-
section shall be thirty months”.

8. Amendment of section 46.- In section 46 of the Principal Act, in  sub-
section (1), for the words “five years”, the words “thirty months” shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of section 48.- In section 48 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), the third proviso shall be omitted; and

(ii) in sub-section (4), after the word “Government” the words “or an authority
authorised by the Government” shall be inserted.

10. Amendment of section 49.- In section 49 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1),-

(@) in the second proviso, for the words “thirty months” the words “fifteen
months” shall be substituted;

(b) in the third proviso, for the words “within two years” the words “six
months” shall be substituted; and

(ii) sub-section (2) shall be omitted.

11. Amendment of section 58.- In section 58 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1A),-
(i) after clause (i), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(i-a) providing sanitary latrines to all new house constructed every year”; and
(ii) in clause (xiii),forthe words “and owner less dogs” the words “and to conduct

animal birth control measures to control the number of street dogs, ownerless dogs”.
shall be substituted;

12. Amendment of section 64.- In section 64 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1), after the words “any existing building” the words “or erect advertisement
hoarding” shall be inserted.

13. Amendment of section 111.- In section 111 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (3), after the clause (f), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(g) to execute all lawful decision and resolutions taken by the Grama

Panchayath under the Act and sign all the orders of the Grama Panchayath”.



9l9]

14. Amendment of section 123.- In section 123 of the Principal Act, in the
proviso to sub-section (3),for the words “ten years” the words “five years” shall be
substituted.

15. Amendment of section 128.- In section 128 of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (1),

(i) after clause (k), clause (1) shall be inserted, namely:-

“() if he is found guilty, directly involved in any act of misuse or abuse of
power or authority as member of the panchayat in executing any scheme, plan or
project of the panchayat or of misappropriation of funds or other assets of the
panchayat during the term of his membership or while holding any office of
panchayat.”

(ii) in the proviso,-

(@) in item (cc), for the words “after expiry of three years”, the words “after
expiry of six years” shall be substituted. and

(b) after item (d), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(e) the disqualification under clause (1) shall cease to operate after the expiry
of six years from the date of the order.”

16. Amendment of section 136.- In section 136 of the Principal Act, in sub-

section (1),-

(i) after the words “Government” the words “or the authority authorized by the
Government by order in this behalf.” shall be inserted;

(ii) after clause (i), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that where an application is made by a member to the Taluk
Panchayat for leave of absence to himself and Taluk Panchayat fails to inform the
applicant of its decision on the application within a period of seven days from the
date of the application, the leave applied for, shall be deemed to have been granted
by the Taluk Panchayat”.; and

(iii) after clause (v), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(vi) if a former Adhyaksha or Upadhyaksha or member of Taluk Panchayat

has been accused and proved guilty of misconduct or misappropriation in an

Inquiry.”

17. Amendment of section 138.- In section 138 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (2), after clause (a),the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that, the duration of the offices reserved under this sub-section shall
be thirty months”; and

(ii)in sub-section (3), for the words “five years” the words “thirty months” shall
be substituted.

18. Amendment of section 140.- In section 140 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (3),-

(@) in the first proviso, for the words “Thirty months” the words “fifteen
months” shall be substituted;



02

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “two years” the words “six months”
shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (4), after the words “Government” the words “or an authority
authorized by the Government in this behalf ” shall be inserted.

19. Amendment of section 141.- In section 141 of the Principal Act, for sub-
section (6),the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“©) the Deputy Commissioner shall preside over the meeting in which no
confidence motion against Adhyaksha or Upadhyaksha is being considered by the
Taluk Panchayat.”

20. Amendment of section 160.- In section 160 of the Principal Act, in the
proviso, item (ii) shall be omitted.

21. Amendment of section 162.- In section 162 of the Principal Act, in sub
section (3), in the proviso, for the words “ten years” the words “five years” shall be
substituted.

22. Amendment of section 167.- In section 167 of the Principal Act, in sub
section (1),-

(i) after clause (k), the following clause (1) shall be inserted, namely:-

“() if he is found guilty, directly involved in any act of misuse or abuse of
power or authority as member of the panchayat in executing any scheme, plan or
project of the panchayat or of misappropriation of funds or other assets of the
panchayat during the term of his membership or while holding any office of
panchayat.”

(ii) in the proviso,-

(@) in item (cc), for the words “three years” the words “six years” shall be

substituted.

(b) after item (d), the following shall be inserted namely:-

“(e) the disqualification under clause (1) shall cease to operate after the expiry

of six years from the date of the order.”

23. Amendment of section 175.-In section 175 of the principal Act, in sub-

section (1),-

(i) after the word “Government” the words “or an authority authorized by the
Government in this behalf” shall be inserted,;

(ii) after the clause (iii), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that where an application is made by a member to the Zilla
Panchayat for leave of absence to himself and Zilla Panchayat fails to inform the
applicant of its decision on the application within a period of seven days from the
date of the application, the leave applied for shall be deemed to have been granted by
the Zilla Panchayat”.



o0&

(iii) after clause (v), the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(vi) if a former Adhyaksha or Upadhyaksha or member of Zilla Panchayat has
been accused and proved guilty for misconduct or misappropriation in an enquiry.”

24. Amendment of section 177.-In section 177 of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section(2), in clause (c), after the proviso the following shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that the duration of the offices reserved under this sub-
section shall be for thirty months”; and

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “five years” the words “thirty months” shall
be substituted.

25. Amendment of section 179.-In section 179 of the principal Act, in sub-
section (3),-

(i) in the beginning the words “Subject to such rules as may be prescribed”
shall be inserted;

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “thirty months” the words “fifteen months”
shall be substituted; and

(iii) in the second proviso, for the words “two years” the words “six months”
shall be substituted.

26. Amendment of section 180.-In section 180 of the principal Act, for sub-
section (6),the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(6) The Regional Commissioner or any other equivalent officer authorized by
the Government shall preside over the meeting in which no confidence motion
against to Adhyaksha or upadhyaksha is being considered.”

27. Amendment of section 196.-In section 196 of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1),in the proviso, the words, brackets and figures “for a period of three year
from the date of commencement of the Karnataka Panchayat Raj (Amendment) Act,
1998” shall be omitted.

28. Amendment of section 197.-In section 197 of the principal Act, in the
proviso to sub-section (3), for the words “fifteen days” the words “thirty days” shall be
substituted.

29. Amendment of section 237.-In section 237 of the principal Act, in sub-
section (1),after the words “on behalf of Gram panchayat” the following shall be
inserted, namely:-

“other than law full resolutions and decisions taken by the authorities

specified in section 64, 70, 113 and 269 of this Act.”



o

30. Amendment of section 308 AA.-In section 308AA of the principal Act,-

(i) in the heading and in section for the words “the schedule of elections”
occurring in two places, the words “schedule of elections” shall be substituted; and

(ii) for the words “announced” the words “published” shall be substituted.

31. Amendment of section 308 AB.-In section 308AB of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1),-

()in clause (a), for the words, “the third day” the words “the fourth working
day” shall be substituted; and

(ii) in clause (d), for the words “not earlier than” the words “not earlier than”
shall be substituted.

32. Amendment of section 308 AC.-In section 308AC of the principal Act, in
sub section (1),-

(i) in clause (b), for the word “each” the words “hyper sensitive” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) in clause (c),-

(a) for the words “the entire period during which code of conduct of election is
in force” the words “during the period of forty eight hours before closing the polling of
election” shall be substituted; and

(b) for the words “the code of conduct is in force” the words of “forty eight
hours before closing the polling of election” shall be substituted.

33. Amendment of section 308B.- In section 308B of the principal Act, for
the figures and letter “308A” the figures and letters “308 AD” shall be substituted.

34. Amendment of section 309D.- In section 309D of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), in the Table,-

(i) after clause (i), the following entry shall be inserted, namely:-
i-a | the member of the Legislative | Vice chairman
council registered as voter in
that Taluk.

(ii) in clause (ii), (iii) and (iv) for the words “Co chairman, Co-chairperson and
Vice chairperson” the word “Member” shall respectively be substituted.

35. Amendment of section 310.-In section 310 of the principal Act, in sub -
section (2), for clause (e), the following substituted, namely:-

“(e) such number of person not less than four fifth of the total number of
members of committees as may be specified by the Government elected in the
prescribed manner from amongst the members of the Zilla Panchayats, Taluk
Panchayats, Town Panchayats and Councilors of the Municipal corporations and
Municipal councils in the district in proportion to the ratio between population of the
rural areas and urban areas in the District”.

36. Amendment of schedule IV.- In the schedule IV of the Principal Act,-

(i) under the heading ‘A Tax on building’ in item (ii), for the entries in

column (3), the following shall be substituted, namely:-



033

“(a) | Small Scale Industry - | 0.40 percent

(b) | Medium Scale Industry |- | 0.50 percent

(c) | Large Scale Industries - | 0.60 percent
on the capital value of the property

(ii) after the entries relating to “B. Vacant land measuring” the following
shall be inserted, namely:-

(iii)

(1) Run way area of an - 0.10 percent on

Airport the Capital value
of the property

(b) In case of vacant Land in

Airport or Industrial area No tax
where plantations are
grown 7

VAJUBHAI VALA
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Karnataka,

(K. DWARAKANATH BABU)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs and
Legislation.

BBBD Berie BBeBBW:- FoBUTRTIONW, Beeesd UeRwd, J5ord Beod) Bwrmownd, worwedd




		2020-04-02T12:04:01+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




