Registered No. HSE/49 [Price :Rs. 0-90 Paise.

S0 [DBS Do |@ain
THE ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE
PART IV-A EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No.3] HYDERABAD, MONDAY, JUNE 23, 2014.

ANDHRA PRADESH BILLS
ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY

The -following Bill was introduced in the Andhra
Pradesh Legislative Assembly on 23rd June, 2014.

L.A. BILL No. 3 OF 2014.

ABILL FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA PRADESH
PUBLIC EMPLOYMENT (REGULATION OF AGE
OF SUPER-ANNUATION) ACT, 1984.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Andhra
Pradesh in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India, as
follows:-

(1]



2 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY __ [Part IV-A

Short
title and
com-
mence-
ment.

Amend-
ment of
section 3
(Act 23 of
1984).

Insertion
of
section
3A.

Central
Act6of
2014.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Andhra Pradesh
Public Employment (Regulation of Age of Superannuation)
(Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on
the 2nd June, 2014.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment

(Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984,
(hereinafter referred to as principal Act) in section 3,-

(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section
shall be substituted, namely,-

“(1) Every Government employee shall
retire from service on the afternoon of the last day of the
month in which he attains the age of sixty years.”

(2) In sub-section (3), under Explanation I,
in clause (a), for the words “fifty eight or sixty years, as the
case may be”, the words “sixty years” shall be substituted.

(3) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the
words “fifty eight years”, the words “sixty years”, shall be
substituted.

3. In the principal Act, after section 3 so amended,
the following new section shall be inserted, namely,-

113

Savings |3A. subjectto the provisions of section 3,-

(1) A Government employee belonging to the
State Cadre/Multi-zonal Cadre and who by general or
specific order of the Government of India under sub-section



e —

June 23, 2014] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 3

(1) of section 77 of the Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation
Act, 2014, and serving provisionally in connection with the
affairs of the State of Telangana, and if he is finally allotted
to the State of Andhra Pradesh by the Government of India
under sub-section (2) of section 77 of the said Act, 2014
shall be deemed to be continuously serving in the State of
Andhra Pradesh.

(2) A Government employee belonging to the State
Cadre / Multi-zonal Cadre falling in the territories of both
the States of Andhra Pradesh and the State of Telangana,
who by a general or a specific order of the Government of
India under sub-section (1) of section 77 of the said Act,
2014, is serving provisionally and retires on attaining the
age of fifty eight years and on his final allotment,
subsequently to the State of Andhra Pradesh by the
Government of India under sub-section (2) of section 77 of
the said Act but before attaining the age of sixty years, shall
be re-inducted into service / post with effect from the date
of his final allotment to the State of Andhra Pradesh without
break in service:

Provided that an employee who attained the age of
sixty years before the final allotment to the State of
Andhra Pradesh by the Government of India, the
service rendered in the State of Telangana till the date
of his retirement shall be considered notionally as if,
he has rendered service in the State of Andhra
Pradesh for the purpose of calculation of his
pensionary benefits.

(3) The service conditions of the employee of State
Cadre / Multi-zonal Cadre working provisionally in the State



4 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY _ [Part IV-A

of Andhra Pradesh and finally allotted by the Government of India
under sub section (2) of section 77 of the said Act, 2014 to the State
of Telangana shall be governed by the relevant laws / rules of the
State of Telangana on such final allotment”.




June 23, 2014] 'ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 5
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

According to the Andhra Pradesh Public Employment
(Regulation of Age of Superannuation) Act, 1984, every Government
servant in the superior service retires from his / her duties on attaining
the age of fifty eight years now. There is a significant improvement in
the average life expectancy when compared to that of 1984. As per
the World Health Organisation, the global average life expectancy in
the year of 2009 is 68 years and the average Indian life expectancy
is 65 years, The age of retirement of the Central Government
employees was raised from 58 to 60 years in the year 1998 by the
Union Government. The age of superannuation to the Last Grade
employees in the State Government service is sixty years.

In view of the above and consequent on the reorganisation of
the State of Andhra Pradesh in accordance with the provisions of
the Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation Act, 2014, the Government of
Andhra Pradesh felt it necessary to utilise the services of senior
employees in view of their experience and expertise. Accordingly,
Government of Andhra Pradesh have decided to enhance the age of
superannuation of the State Government employees from fifty eight
years up to the attaining the age of sixty years by amending the
Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of Age of
Superannuation) Act, 1984 suitably.

This Bill seeks to give effect to the above decision.

NARA CHANDRABABU NAIDU,
Chief Minister.



Y

6 ANDHRAPRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY  [Part IV-A

MEMORANDUM UNDER RULE 95 OF THE RULES OF
PROCEDURE AND CONDUCT OF BUSINESS IN ANDHRA
PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY.

The Andhra Pradesh Public Employment (Regulation of
Age of Superannuation) (Amendment) Bill, 2014, after itis passed
by both the Houses of the Legislature of the State may be
submitted to the Governor for his assent under Article 200 of the
Constitution of India.

NARA CHANDRABABU NAIDU,
Chief Minister.

K. SATYANARAYANA RAO,
Secretary to State Legislature (l/c).



S0\ 98T Deyen

SO |SAT ToDDSES
5 808 D e30(SBE TIHIGS® 2014 e, 235
BED [THEDRADB.

2014 &°0 35 TISSY vey

wo[$(BB5 P Eme (HEd JuHor HAIB,
(SS0eQ503) 1962, 1984 K> 30507 $00wes3E
Dev.
5 (SETHE) ©5D 0 VoMBINS® eoBS
R TIR06D s (808 DBV T BV9B:-
1. (1) &0 Hegs0> oD [PEOERE YT (56D

DEB0E DAY Lsmwgsdea) (998ea) e, 2014 e
87,500

(2) a8, 2014 &S 25 BED ©20e0S D8 HHHew
IO,

2. (205> Be P (TR DR EY D)
0BT HELSE e (5ed D8N0 HADHRY) Lgmmggesm)
BegH00, 19846°0, 33 HBV)WHS’,~

(71

So(r
L stL)
oo

(rSogismo.

3% ¥0%,
ERH0HE
Sdes.
(19848%
23%
Segieo)



.

8 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-A

(1) &3-383)850 (1)8 adooor s 1208
em-ma:ﬁoamm GOWVIBR, LRSI, -
(1) 38 SEOESE A T exp Sowgioen Haniy
TBID D75:5008" 998 % raboo &7y m 008 59
D09 DODIBR.”.,

(2) 63-36D)i50 (3)S% 25 298es s PoHW
(DS, “oSorg W08 Sor DOBTNIOFE 0T e8P
RoHE)B500” €51 SV BSe0TT e Sodnsses”
2930 SESDVOR GovIB.

(3) &3-38U)EH0 (4)S Pocksn ()S', “osrp
AODE BoHBYEHeN” @By DK ke “e8
DoDEBBN”™ 950 HEINO[> SoB5BH).

3-Deo 3. (35 Dy, &3 DT 55800 35 SBJyes00
g BHETH, &6 (808 578 56850050 ToBHBR, B, -

Teneisoes.
Fassianopen| 3- 9. 39 SBD)ED dwoEHeH ST, -

(1) og8esc/s08) F%en Bestr8D0B B0k esoESDT
rotagh, D0 DPREGE Beydoo, 2014, Boog), TS 96V
6ofoy  BI-IBIEH0 (1) (808 grEe 1980B6S) prses S DB
PR %8s @Uoe Beomer oo I59FPEH00E HowoPod

T, S0 SHBR) (ekodg GBR, HSH Begn, 2014
BooE), 775 3BT &I-58J 50 (2) (8o¢ eres
BB es0(GS0T TP 0980 oA Beronobadd
SBocte, oD TS0S” DEBEOTT SRBZIRENT g0
DS,



June 23, 2014] _ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 9

(2) ©0BSBS B0k BeoTrET &Lah Trgdwe B,
2082000 80655 S mé‘écﬁdg (309 -E" e B8O Dob,
KD g0, 2014 GBoo¥), 7T DS &3-583yeH00 (1)
B0t o8 (SE0Egd) s So ol D8R BBEYR T
are, OER0MT SODRY) ef Hebss GBS, Ay W8
ROSBBRNE HADBY S HOGH D DD DT,
20800 B Do Book), 7T D8BTS &5-383)50
(2) (ot BESHOBEO GEB (HEHBLRVD SBID 0TS
TS0 E> 808 Fero0) IS e, eond, eEd
NOBBIEHNO oKWY TES00B, HB5RS” wodTrAid0
Een/E0¢ BSOS TRV e BF8raN0g) DADED
BB 2008 &5°1900/5505°8 BBR SRS DB

©aNd, FrES (HELBFHVD SOGEDE THANILD BB
Bera00D) DAL B0 B8 JoDHYBBLL HODRAY)
20y &B°R, 0B oY), Hd d8He BO SEH Boore
oegii8006® B2 DBgR0D @B T, Do HATEHINOR
B, 5ey VB0, BB SOBEHRT 0*;:&06‘ 36530 DUV
DR0HDNE’ BIEUIBR.

(3) e0Es Togans” ErEm 8w SHBRT S0bakn
$lnlob) {.’)ééjb:).).), 2014 cﬁngb 77 5383065@ 65—:)83065:0(2)
1808 g8 (Deodssnd Beorrer ooRB0BE BB
Beranodedd o Besth /209~ 8550 8t &8 Gog, v
DROGH weg 08 Beroo) ot deorrer orgs BY);
BE)oOHH FTERDHVL/ DALIBED HBoD BoHdsH.”.

F-3



T

10 ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY [Part IV-A

GG - S

60@,5[9)35 eS8 SE e (565D Dtes SAHiy L%:nao&}géﬁea) D00,
1984 X000 digyth 0™ (58 (3ebiss &6’ A3 digy P
DDWEB HoHBYEI0E éoﬁocoo“) DAY A0ese) B8/ B D00 Hood
BB DEBoer DoHeR di)B. 1984 JoSB)SINE" 2859tk ad9d
0065° Hie 299 esafograo AeadaHormr BRoE. 200965 S50
g e e9% &sodnccs;oi)o 68 So5%)E500ET gradatve B9
waigrabo 65 Bostoenn e ([550: ey S0 D678, Sogs
80BN 1998 SodtBand” 819 e85 0o 5i5d 9858 HODRY
58 S05%)800 00é 60 JodEyEHe% oSG 28RS, O (SaDeg
3B550S% 998 ek ésESG?SKJe) 28D DB0e3 HAHRY 9D foo:)ég)d;ﬁnmm
é08.

2 Dhairre ByRe s 580K eoSEE 5 asémgcfa—a Degao, 2014
G3008); D2I0FHO 08B0 60@@550"@@#)6 :)ézmgda'a 238R% docsen
0855628 6‘5@#59 Ao 985 73):9)995056 @ D900 99 RoM
5700 &0 S0 T8 (S80I grDoN08. BRI, e30(6(SES
808G e (568D 2850 DADTY EBWBESe) HegHao, 19840
BIHDGr SHBOBEO TET LI0EIT (SEDBE0 B (388 B vo Sesd
DEI03 HADHDYH0 AP VNE HoHE SR 006 e roo:)én)dmm
J0HANE DoTD DEaoD0s.

S Dew, P DY) e50en Bawestd éaé%’oéa)&bﬁ.

TP LO(RITE) PTG,
:).na)zsmol_@.



June 23, 2014] ANDHRA PRADESH GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 11

SOSEAT TS % SUSOWN B3 Sodaie Db
QOWHFHOSD 955 oo Bo8 Do,

BOBHBT (8B yre (S8 e DADBY E0RESeD)
(356e) wey, 20140 T°g TORNN0GE W08, &b IEHB0en
SATBODH Dby, BB DoDFTRHNS'D 2005 @RV (8ol
BB DDBAW AIGHLD F08Y0SHSD).

TPO® wo(leren TPaiandsy,
AP0,

2. SBFTTOLEITY),
TR BN 00658 55556

(a5wp).

Printed and Published by the Commissioner of Printng at Legislative Assembly Press, Hyderabad.
2014



