5

5 of 1923.

10

AS TVERODUCED TN THE BAJTA SaBma

Bill No. XXXIX of 1994

I 2 SRR, SR S T

THE INDIAN BOILERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 1994

BILL
Surther to amend ihe Indian Boilers Act, 1923.

BE it enagted by Parliament in the Forty-fifth Year of the Republic of ladia
as follows —

1. () This Act may be called the Indian Boilers {(Amendment) Act, 1994,
(2) 1t shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by

notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, and difforent dates may be appointed
for different provisions of this Act

2. In section 1 of the Indian Boilers Act, 1
principal Act), in sub-section (1), the word “nd

-
o

i (hereinafter referred 1o as the
7 shall be omitted,

n

3. In section 2 of the principal At
() for clanse (), the following clause shall be substituted, namely -
Ya) “accident” means an explosion of a boiler, or boiler component,
or an uncontrolled release of water or steam therefrom, causing death or
injury to any person or damage to any property;’;
(2) for clause (b), the following clauscs shall be substituted, namely—
by “hoiler” means a pressure vessel in which steam is generated for

"wse external to itself by application of heat which is whelly or partly under
pressure when steam is shut off but does not include a pressure vessel,——

(i) with capacity less than 25 litres (such capacity being measured
k valve to the main steamn stop valve);

from the feed check

Shoirt
title

and com.
TCRCE..
ment,

Armend.
ment of
section 1.

Amend.
ment of
section 2.



45 1 ser contime're square desigh
smugfe ey of

(iify inwhichwate below one hundrad degrees centi-

grade;
" Y . Y fa
(bay “b m;,f wmmwm" ,,C,m team piping, feed piping, ecanomiser,
superheate tiing and any other wmml or internal

part of a t
centimetre square wm ey

sasure excesding one kilogram per

¢), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely-—

Ceay
under sub-section {3} of

Authority”  nied
seetion 48]

sn institution regognised 10

{cby “Ce
section (1) of

o’ HeaiS a4 Person fecogni ander sub-

(g after clavse (ceo)

shall be inserted, namely—

an iestitution recognised 13

VNGO E‘

(ceey “manmfactt s manufacture, construction and fabrication
of boiler or botst (*mmmu,m ar both;

cans o person engaged in the manufact ures’s

it <3l

8 “m,i‘s‘lidw% any person”, the words “includes 20

any substituicd;

(6) for clause (f), the following clause shall be substituted, narmely -

V ’ “‘*‘l( il %i'%’?” eans an ‘l% Bl hﬁ (/d”.ﬂ "Ni iC h sfeam passes ﬁfUﬂl
{ Ik
hﬂ*i( ¥ lf

resoure at which stearn passes throu

¢ centimetres above atmg

‘{'?)
3.5 kiloy

1 such pipe exceads 25
pheric pressuge, of

H metre in internal diameter and the
am per sauare contimetres above the

and ineludes in either gase any gonnrofed Hiling of steamn pipes’; 30

{7y for clause {g), the following clanses shall be substituted, vamely

-

() “structural alteration, addition or renewal” means,—
(i) - any change in the design of a boiler or boiler component;

(m mpkuca,mu-m of any part of boeiler or boller component by a
part which does not conform te the same specification; ot

gos
1A

(7)) any addition to any pari of a boiler or boiler component;

(hy  “supert
exposed to flue
beyond the saturat

¢ which is partly or wholly
e the temperature of  steam

fon wessure and includes a re-heater;

(i) ““Technical Adviser” means the 'Technical Adviser appointed 40
under sub-section (1) of section /M’%

D500



(he following section shall be substituted,

4. For section 3 of the principal A
tamely i

«“3  Nothing in this Act shall apply to-—

(¢) locomotive boilers belonging to or under the control of the rail-
Ways;

(]

(b) any boiler or boiler component,—

(i) in any vessel propelied wholly or in part by the agency of
steam
(i) belonging to, or under the conirol of, the Army, Navy or
10 Air Force; or

izer disinfector
not exceed

(i) appertaining tc
nursing homes, if the
’ gapagity.”
& Tn section 4 of the principal Act, for wards “State Goverpment”, the
hall be substituted. ’

3
£

15 words “Central Government” shi

6. After section 4 of the principal Act, the following sections shall be in-
serted, namely -

“4A.(1) The Cenfral Govermment shall sppeint a Technical Adviser froms
amongst the persons having such qualifications and experience &s may be pres-
20 cribed by rufes.

() The terms and conditions of service of the Technical Adviser shall be
such as may be prescribed by the Central Government.

(3) The Technical Adviscs
discharging the functions assigned
25 made thereunder, exercise such of

Ty

Central Government and the Board

[, in addition to exercising the powers and
r this Act or rules or regulations
such functions as the

4B. (1) The Board may recognise an iastitution to be known as Inspecting
Authority to inspect a boiler ot hoiler component, or both  during manufacture

and eroction of sugh boiler or boiler component.
30 (z) Aninstitution fulfilling such conditions, as may be preseribed by regula-
tions may, apply to the Board for recog as Inspecting Authority in such

manner as may be prescribed by regu

(1) The Board may recognise an institution to be known as Competent
Authority to certify Welders engaged durlng manufacture or  uUse of
35 boiler or boiler component, or both.

bed by
1oty 1

b conditions, as may be prescr

(4) An institution fulfilling
' y s Competent Aut

regulations, may apply to the Ba
such manner as may be preseribed by reguk

T man

gring any  boiler

{5} The Board m: c a ot ‘ ,
40 gomponent or any material the nufagure of boiler or boiler

pomponent.

Subati-
tution, of
a new
section
for
section 3.

Liraita.,
tion of

applica-~

ton.

Anerd.
meng of
section 4.

Insertion
of new
sections
44 to 4

Technicsl
Advisor,

Ingpecting

Authority,
Comnpetent
Authority,
recognised
manyfac.
turer and
boiler
repalrer,



Competent
Person.

Welders
certifi-
cate,

Conditions
precedent
for manu-
facture of
bodler and
boiler

component

=,
e

(6y A manufacturer fulfilling such conditions, as may be pmtsc;rihec.‘@ bry
regulations, may apply to the Board for recogumition as recognised mani-
facturer in such manner as ray be prescribed by regulations.

{(7) The Board may recognise an institution to be known as Boiler
Repairer to repair a boiler or boiler component or both during the use of
boiler.

(8) An institution fulfilling such conditions, as may be prescribed by
vegulations, may apply to the Board for recognition as Boiler Repairer in such
manner as may be prescribed by regulations.

"+ {9) 'The Board may, if satisfied that the institution applying for recognition
under sub-sections (2), {g), (6 and (&) has complied with with the conditions
precedent for recognition, recognise such institutions as Inspecting  Authority,
Competent Authority, recognised manufacturer or Boiler Repaiver, as the case
may be, subject to the payment of such foe, and such other conditions as may
be prescribed by regulations;

Provided that the Board shall not refuse recognition to any institution
unless such imstitution is given an opportunity of being heard.

4C. (1) The Technical Advisor may recognise persons 1o be known
as Competent Person for imspection of boiler or boiler component or both
during use of boiler and boiler component.

“(2) A persoun fulfilling such conditions, as may be prescribed by regula-
tions, may apply to the Technical Adviser for recognition as Competent
Person in such manner as may be prescribed by regulations.

(3) The Technical Advisor may, if satised that a person applying for
recognition uader sub-section (2), has complicd with the conditions
precedent for recognition, recognise such person as Competent Person subject
to the payment of such fee and such other conditions as may be prescribed
by regulations:

Provided that the Technical Adviser shall not refuse recognition to a
person unless such person is given an opportonity of being heard.

4D. (7 Any person who proposes t¢ undertake any welding work
connected with or related to a boiler, or a boiler component or both  shall
apply to a Competent Authority for issue of a Welders certificate,

(z) On receipt of an application under sub-section (1), the Competent
Authority shall follow such procedure for examination and grant of Welders
certificate as may be prescribed by regulations.

(3) The Compstent Authority may, if satisfied that the person applying
for Welders certificate under sub-section (2} has complied with the condi-
tions precedent for issue of the Welders certificate, issge such certificats to
such person subject to the payment of such fee and such other conditions as
may be prescribed by regulations:

Provided that the Competent Awvthority shall not refuse Welders certificate
to any person unless such person is given an opportunity of being heard.

4E. (1) No person shall manufacture or cause to be manufactured
any boiler or boiler component, or both unless,—

_{a@) he has provided in the premises or precincts wherein such
boiler or boiler component, or both are manufactured, svch
facilities for design and construction as may be prescribed by regulations

(&) the design and drawi

have been approved by the
section (2} of scction 4F;

soof the boiler and  boiler component
cebing Authority under clause (@) of sub-

16

23

30

kOS]
Lo

46

50

%



(¢} the materials, wmounti and fittings wsed in  the construction
such boiler or boiler comg onent, or both; conforming  to the
specifications prescribed by regulations; and

{(d) the persons  eu saped for Welding boiler or boiler component
fholds Welders certificate issued by o Competent Authority.

urer, before commencing manufacture of a
, shall engage an Inspecting Authority for carrying
os of manufacture as may be prescribed by regula-

4F. (1) Every manufact
boiler or beiler component
out inspection at such stag
tions.

o

10 {2} The Inspecting Authority engaged v sub-section (1) shall follow
: such procedure for inspection and certification of hoiter or boiler component
as may be prescribed by regulations and after inspection it is—
(a) satisfied that the toiler or the boiler component conforms to
the standards prescribed by regulations, it shall issue a certificate of ins-

15 pection and stamp the Boiler, or boiler component, of both; or

(5) of the opianion that ihe boiler, or boiler component, of both
does not conform to the standards prescribed by regulations, it may for
reasons to be recorded in writing refuse to issue  such certificate <

Provided that no certificate shall be refused unless the Inspecting

70 Authority had, directed the manufagturer of the boiler or the boiler com-

porent, or both- in writing to carry out such modifications or rectifica-

tions as it deems hecessary and the Inspecting  Authority is of the opinion

that inspite of such direction the manufacturer of the boiler or boiler
component, or both did not carry out the direction.

25
{3} The Inspecting Authority may for the purposes of inspeciion under this
section charge such fee as may be prescribed by regulations.
4G, (1) The owner Wwho — proposes to register a boiler under
v section 7, shall engage an Inspecting Authority for carrying out inspection
6 at the stage of erection of the boiler.
3
() The Inspecting Anthority shall fellow such procedure for inspection
and certification of a botler boiler component, or both, as may be,
prescribed by regulations and after napection if 34 is—
(@) satisfied that the erection of the boiler is in accordance with the
35 vegulations, it shall issue icate of insection in such form 4s may
be prescribed by regula
(by of the opinion that the holier has not been erected in accordance
with the regulations, It may 101 reasons to be recorded in writing, refuse
to grant the certificate and shall commumcate such refusal to the manu-
40 facturer of the boiler or boiler component forthwithe
Provided that no such certificate ghall be refused unless the Inspecting
Authority  had directed the owner in  writing to carry out
cuch modifications or rectifications as it deems necessary and the Ins-
pecting Authority is of th ion that in spite of such direction the owner
45 did not carry out the diraction.

purposes of inspectron nnder
by regulations.

may for t

(3) The Inspecting Autho
this section charge such fee as me

Inspection

during

AT
facture,

Inspection
during
erection.



G

Conditions 4H- Wo person shall repair or cause to be repaired any hoiler or boiler compo-
precedent neivt or both, unl

for repair-

ing boiler (¢) be has provided in the promises of precincts wherein such boiler
and or boiler component or both, are hoing: 18 used  such facilities for
boiler repairs as may be prescribed by regulations;

component.

(b) the design and drawing of the boiler or boiler component as
the case may be, and the materials, mowilings and fittings uvsed in  the
repair of such boiler or boiler component conform to  the regulations;

{c) persons engaged in Welding, holds a welders certificate issued by
a Competent Authority;

(d) every user who does not have the in-house facilities for repair of
boiler or boiler component shall engage a beiler repairer possessing a
boiler repairer certificate for repaiss of a botler or botler component or
both as the case may be; '

() every user shall engage a Competent Person for approval of
repairs to be carried out in house or by the repairers”™.
Amend- % In section 5 of the principal Act, after sub-section (g} the following

ment of sub-section shall be inserted, narmely o

section 5.

“(4A) No ‘persons shall be appointed as the Chicf Inspector, Deputy
Chief Inspecior or Inspector vnless he possesses sugh gualification and

‘experience as may be proseribed by the Central Government.”
Amend- . In section 6 of the principal Act, in clause (e), for the words “State
ment of Government”, the words “Ceniral Government”, shall be substituted.

section 8.
9, In section 7 of the principal Act—

Armend- {a) in sub-cestion (1), for the words “may aprly o the Inspector to have
ment of the boiler registered.” the words 'may apply to the Inspector along with

section 7. guch other documents as may be prescribed by regulations to have the boiler

registered.” shall bp substit

(b for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

“(3) On the said daie the Inspector shall, inspect the boiler with a
view to satisfying himsell t as not suffered any damage
during its transit rom the place of manufacture to the site of erection and
forward a report of the inspection alongwith the decuments to the Chief

Inspector within seven days.”.
Amend. 10. 1In section & of the principal Act,-
ment of ) _
section 8. (a) in sub-section {(z),—

() in clause (), for the fignres “18.58”, the fignres “20” shall be
substituted;

(i) for dause (&), the foliowing clause shall be substituted, namely v

“(d) save as provided in

section 12, wher
fion, addition or rengwal 18 M 3

N 7
o3 o8

o the boil

(iif) in clause (f), for the words “it or any sieam pipe”, the words
«it or any boiler component” shall be substituted;

16

[
[ &4

2
[

44




10

15

20

25

30

35

40

45

{b) in subesection
Porson” shall be substit

), for the word “Inspector”, the words “Competent
el

(c) for sub-sections {4 and (s}, the following sub-sections shall be
substituted, namely -

petent Porson shall, within fifteen days é:"maﬁn He date of such receip
mspect the boiler in such manner as may he prescribed by 1 ':‘g,mmn 8.

under this section charge such fo

11.

“Ca) On receipt of an application under sub-section (3), the Com-

ot

{5) ¥ the Competent Person i5—

{a) satisfied that the boier and the boiler components attached
(i hafl = o certificate for such

thereto are in good co
period as may be pres

(b} of the opinion that the boiler, or beiler component, or MM“
does not conform ol
may for reasons to be 1
certificate -

")
wded in owrit refuse to issue r;mn

Providad that no cerviificate shall be refused nnless the Inpe
ging Authority h;w divected the ownoer of the boiler or the boiler
component, or be inwriting to carry out such modification or
rectifications  as it decms  mecessary  and the Compelent
Person is of the opinion that inspite of such divection the

owner of the boiler, or boller component, or both did not cacry

out the direction

Provided further that the competent person shall within
jmw eight hours of making the examination inform the owner of
the boiler or boiler component any defect in his opinion and the
reasons  therefor and shall forthwith report the case 1o the
Chisf Inspector. ~

(6) The Competent ]P*s‘frsmw may for the purposes of inspection
> a8 may be prescribed by regulations.”.

In w“ﬁmn 9 of the principal Act, the words, brackets and figures “or

sub-section (§) of section & shall be om mmﬁﬂ

1.

In section 11 of the principal Act,

{a) in clavse (¢), for the words “Btate Government”, the waords “Central
Government” shall ,.n, subatituiod ;

(b) clause {d) and the provisio shall be omitted.

13, In section 12 of ¢ ipal Act, the following proviso shall be in
ted at the end, namely —

“Provided that no such

tion,

sanction is required where the stroctuoral altera-
addition or renewal is made vnder the supervision of a Comvpetent

Person. ™.

14.

substiuted, namely

“13. (ﬁ Befora the owner o a
any structural alterati ion, i
attached to the boiler
writing  of his intention
ation, addifon or rendy

alter

For section 13 of the prinicpal Act,

i ;«a,ny ‘éfm,,oa‘ém mo “gmdé‘/m
jef Mﬂmvm 4 g
p rticutars of g
m vy regulations.

e standards  prescribed hy regulation i

Amend-
ment of
secion 9.
Aomend.
ment of
sectiop 11,

Arnend.
meni of

section 192

Substitu.
tion of
NEW  sec-
tlom for
section 13,

Altgration
op renewal
of boiler

component



&

{(z) Any structural alteration, addition or renewal referred to in sub-
section (1), shall be made by a person possessing e Boiler Repairer certilicate
under the supervision of the Competent Person.”™.

Amend-
ment of
section 14,

15. In section 14 of the principal Acty—

in

{(a) in sub-section (1),—

() in clavse (o), for the word “Inspector”, the words “Competent
Person™ shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (), for the words “prescribed manner”, the words
“manner prescribed by regulations” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (), for the words “be prescribed”, the words “be 1o
preseribed by regulations” shall be substituted ;

(b} in sub-section (2), for the word “Inspector”, the words “Competent
Person” shall be substituted.

Amend., : o .
ment of 16. Jn section 15 of ghe principal Act, for the words and figures “Indian 12 of 1911,
section 15. [Factories Act, 19117, the words and figures ““The Factories Act, 1948 shall be 15 630f 1948,
substituted.
Amend. 17, In section 18 of the principal Act,—
ment of
section 18. (@) in sub-section (z), for the word “steam-pipe”, at both the places where
it occurs, the words “boiler component” shall be substituted;
(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, 20
namely:— ’
“(3) Without prejudice 4o ghe provisions of sub-secpion (1), where
any death has resulted due go any accident, an inquiry may be conducted
by such person and in such manner as may be prescribed by the Central
Government.,”.
- y L L . . . 25
m:‘;@mm 18, After section 18 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
of new inserted, namely -
section
18A.. “18A. (r) Bvery owner shall for the purposes of conserving energy
Energy and for increasing the thermal efficiency ofghe boiler, caunse emergy audit
andit, to be conducted by a person authorised by the Board.
(2) A person aothorised under sub-section (1) shall be a person who 30
fulfils such qualifications as may be prescribed by regulations.
(33 A person authorised under sub-section (1} shall conduct energy
audit in such manner and charge such fee as may be preseribed by regulations.
Amend.. 19, Section 19 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as sub-scction (1)
ment of thercof and after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-sections 35

gection 10, shall be inseried, mamely i

“{2) Every appeal under sub-section (r) shall be made in such manner
as may be preseribed by the State Government.

{(3) The procedure for disposing of an appeal shall be such as may be 4
prescribed by the State Government.”, )

Amend- 20. Section 20 of the principal Act shall be renumbered as sub-section
meni of (r) and,— ‘
seciion 20.
(o) in sub-section (r) as so renumbered, for the words “lodge with tho
Chief Inspector an appeal to an Appellate Authority to be constituted by the 45



9

State Government under this Act”, the words “prrefir an appeal to the Central
Government” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-sections
shall be inserted, namely :—

5 “(2) Any person considering himself aggrieved by the refusal of
an Inspecting Authorify to grant a certificate of inspection of manufacture
or erection, as the case may be, may within thirty days from the date of
communication of such refusal, prefer an appesl to the Central Govern-
ment,

{3) Every appeal under sub-section (1) shall be made in such man-
10 ner as may be prescribed by the Central Government.

(¢) The procedure for disposing of an appeal shall be such as may be
prescribed by the Central Government.”.

21. In section 21 of the principal Act, for the words, figures and letters

“An order of the Central Government under section 20A and save as otherwise

15 provided in sections 19, 20 and 204, an order of an appeliate authority”, the

words, figures and letter “An order of the Central Government under sections 20
and 204, shall be substituted.

22. In section 22 of the principal Act, for the word, “one hundred rapzes”
the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

20 23. In section 23 of the principal Act,—

(@) for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words ““one lakh rupees™
shall be substituted;

(b) for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.

25 24. 1n section 24 of the principal Act, for the words “punishable with
fine which may extend to five hundred rupees”. the words “punish-
able with imprisonment which may extend o two vyears or with fine
which may extend to one lakh rupees, or with both™ shall be substitued.

25 In section 25 of the principal Agt-—
20 (a) in sub-section (1), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words
“one lakh rupecs” shall be substituted;

(b} in sub-section (1), for the words “fine, or withb oth”™, the words “fine
which may extend to one lakh rupees or with both™ shall be substitated.

26. In section 27A of the principal Act, for sub-sections (2) and (3), the
35 following sub-sections shall be substituted, namely

“(2) The Board shall consist of the following memnbers, namely :—

(@) the Secretary to the Government of India incharge of the Depart-
ment of the Central Government having administrative control of the
Board who shall be the Chairperson ex-ofjicio ;

() fifteen Chief Inspector of Boilers to be nominated by the Centraj
Govermment in such manner as may be preseribed by the Central Governe
ment;

Amend.
ment of
section 21.

Amend.
ment of
section 22.

Amend..
ment of
section 28.

Amend..
ment of
section 24

Amend.
ment of
gection 25

Amend.,
ment of
section
27TA .



10
(¢} such number of other persons not exceeding twenty to represent—
0 Ceniral Government,
(i) mc Bureau of Indian Standards,
(iify boiler and hoiler component nanufacturers,
_ (#v) national laboratories,
) (v)\engimenﬂ-g consultancy agencies,
(vi) users of boilers, and

. {vif) such other interests which in the opinion of the Central
Government ought to be represented on the Board,

to be nominated by the Central Government;
t¢/y Fechnical Adviser, Member-Secretary ex afficio.

o () The term of office of the members nominated under clauses (&)
“and (e) of sab-section (2) shall be such as may he prescribed by the Central

Government.”
Amend. 7. In section 28 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I,
ment of
section 28, _ (#) for clause (g}, the follewing clause shall be substituted, namely -

“(ay for laying down the standard conditions in respect of material,
design, construction, erection, operation and maintenance which shall be
required for the purposcs of enabling the registration and certification of
hoilers, boiler components, boiler mountings and fittingsu nder this Act:™;

5 k]
(ity in clause (d), for the word “‘steam-pipes’’.  the words “boiler compo-
pents, boier mountings and fittings” shall be substituted;

(i) afier clause (¢}, the following clav s shall be inserted, namely

“ted) for prescribing the qualifications and experience subject to
which the Inspecting Authonties, C swapetent  Authorities and Competent
Persons shall be regognised wnder thic Act;

(eb) the condit
manufacturer of bo

ions subject to which and the manner in which
iler components of material may be recognised;

(o) Faciiities for design and condiroction which are required to be
provided in the premises in whick the manufacturing of any boiler or
boiler component 1¢ carried out]

(ed) fee for the purposes of inspection or grant of recognition or amny
certificate under this Act;

(¢f) procedure for cxarnination and grant of Welders certificate;

teg powers and fu netions which the Board may delegate to the Techni-
cal Adviser;

(ehy documents 1o Lo enclosed olongwith the application for registran

tion of boilers or renewal of a certificute authorising the use of hoilers;

(¢i) the manmner of inspection of boilers;

{¢j) the period tor which o certificate authorising the use of a boiler
may be renewed;

15

35



20

40

following -~ sub-sections shall be substituted, namely—

Gazette, make vules to carcy out the provisions of this Act.

29, In section 29 of the principal Act, in sub-section {1},

i1

k) conditions subject to which and form in which Competent Per.
son shall renew a certificate authorising the wse of bodlers;

{el) manner and the form in which a Repairer’s certificare shall be
issued;

{em) the manner in which the boiler shall be prepaved for examination;

seifications, documents  and  other  particulars

- {en) drawings s
a boller s required to make available to the

which owner of
Competent Parson;

. feo) the wmanner in which a parson may be authorised o con-
duct energy audit and the manner in which such audit shall be
conducied;

{ep) the mannsr in which disputes between the States with respect

to registration of bailers shall be resolved,

In  section 28B4  of the principal Act, for sub-section (r), the

“(r) The Central Government may, by notification in the} Oficial

(tA) In particular, and  without prejudice to  the generality of

the foregoing power, such rules may provide for all or any of the
following maiters, namely:—

followad  in  making application

wable in respaot of such application;

(@ the prozedure o he
under seption 20A and ths f=

(b) the qualifications and experience of persons to bz appolatad
as Chiel Inspactors, Deputy Chiel Inspactors and Taspectors:

{¢) the manner in which appeals may be preferred to the Board,
the fees payable in  respact of appaals and the procedurs to be followed
or disposing such appeals:

(d) the term of ofizr of the memb s and the manner in which
they of shall bz nominatzd under clauses by and (¢) of sub-section
(2) of section 27A;

(&) the qualifications and exparience Pof the Technical Adviser;

(f) for requiring boilers to be uader the charge of persons holding
ertificate of proficiency or competency and  for preseribing  the
conditions on which such cerificate may be granted;

(g) ths manner in wiich and the porson who shall conduct inguiry
info the accident’.

)

{{) for clause (@) the following cls

se shall be substituted, namely 1 —
section 29,

“(a) the powers and ies of the Chief Inspector, Deputy
Chief Inspectors  and  Inspectors:”:

(ify clause (d} shall be omitted :
(@ii) for clause (f), the following clanse shall be substituted, ALY o
Uy fee payable for registration of boilers’;

(iv) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted,

TAIETY (e

“(y the manner in which appeals shall be preferred to the
Chief Inspector and the procedure to be followed for hearing
such  appeals;’™;

(v clavse (§) shall be omitted.



Amend-
ment of
section 30,

Amend.
ment of
section 33,
Axpend-
ment of
section 34,

12
30. Jm section 30 of the principal Act-—

(@b for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “one thousand
rupess”  shall be substituted;

(by for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh
rupees” shall be substituted.

31, In section 33 of the principal Act, for the word ‘Steam-pipes”
the words ‘boiler components” shall be substituted.

32, In section 34 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

(7). for the words “State Government”, the words “Ceniral Govern-
ment”  shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “steam  pipes”, the words “hoiler components”
shall be substituted;

(i) for the words “any part of the State”, the words “any part
of India” shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBIECTS AND REASONS

The Indian Boilers Act was enacted in W23 to provide for the safety of life
and property of persons from the danger of explosion of boilers during vse. The
Central Boilers Board was constituted in 1937, The administration of the Act is
being carried out by the Inspectorate of Boilers of the States in their respective
territories.

2. Since significant technological developments have taken place worldove
and large capacity (upto 500 MW) boilers are now manufactured within the countrr
according to latest International Standards, many of the provisions of the preseny
Act have become outdated. :

3. Considering all the above aspects, the Government of India had set up a
High Powered Committee in § une, 1972 for a comprehensive review of laws on
boilers and unfired pressure vessels, The committes submitted its report in March,
1974. The committee observed that because of inadequate machinery with the
State Governments both in terms of manpower and technical competence, inter-
pretation of Indian Boiler Regulations and the standards of mspection are ot uni-
form. The discretionary power nsed by Inspectorate of Boilers of the State, to
allow the deviations, raise Inter-State disputes and the boilers manufactured in one
State are not registered in the user State. Diue to this the users suffer.

4. The main rec mmendations of the commitiee are:

() to set up a service oriented Central Government Organisation for ip-
spection of boilers under manufacture and msure instead of State Governments
acting  as mspecting  avthorities;

(i) to recognise independent inspection agencies for inspection of boilers
under manufacture and in use.

3. The report of the commitice was circulated a to all the States and

Union territories to ascertain their views in the years 1974 and 1984, Some of the
State Goveraments opposed the main recommendation regarding the taking over
of the implementation of Indian Boilers Act by Central Government. It was there-
fore decided to leave registration of boilers and the administration of the Act to the
State Governments. urther, considering the recommendations of the High Powered
Committee, the views of the State Governments, the present day technological
requirements, the economic reforms and  liberalisation policy of the Central
Government, it has been decided to amerl the Indiza Boilers Act, 1923 1o, inver alia,
provide for—

(i) the inspection of boilers during manufacture erection and use in line
with the present technological developments throughout the world;

() decentralisation of inspection of boilers during their manufacture ereg-
tion and use, by allowing independent inspection agencies. This will improve
the guality of the boilers and also increase the employment potential of skilled
techuical manpower:



(iii) ephancing the penalties for contravention of the provisions of the Act
on the lines of the provisions contained in the Factories Act, 1948 as amended in
1987;

(ivy change in the procedure for filing appeals aganst the orders made
vnder the Act;

{v) energy audit for achieving higher efficiencies in the use of boilers;

- (vi) for defining the powers of the Central Boilers Boatrd for oversecing
and enforcing the implementation of the provisions of the Act and the regulations
made thereunder.

6. The Bill seeks to achiove the aforesaid objects.

Wew D
The gth May, 1994 RREIBHNA SAMH





