
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2006

Act 31 of 2006

Keyword(s):
Municipal Council, Towhship, Panchayat, Nagar Panchayat, Industrial
Township

Amendments appended: 35 of 2006, 36 of 2006, 48 of 2006, 49 of 2006, 22
of 2007, 33 of 2007, 2 of 2008, 12 of 2008, 13 of 2008, 6 of 2009, 7 of 2009,
21 of 2009, 10 of 2010, 27 of 2010, 1 of 2011, 9 of 2011, 11 of 2011, 20 of 2011,
26 of 2011, 29 of 2011, 42 of 2011, 2 of 2012, 15 of 2012, 17 of 2012, 28 of 2012,
31 of 2012, 19 of 2016, 23 of 2016, 38 of 2016, 9 of 2017, 52 of 2017, 8 of 2018,
21 of 2018, 25 of 2018, 53 of 2018, 65 of 2018, 75 of 2018









































































































































































































































































































































































































¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XIX 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 7th May 2016).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal

Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted in
the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Fourth  Amendment) Act, 2015.

III of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Short title and
commence-
ment.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEò 32] ¶ÉÊxÉ´ÉÉ®ú, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 3, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 53

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).
In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation

in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporation and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. XIX
of 2016), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Secretary to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.
——————————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--53-------1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 19382
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,

by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL

 CORPORATION ACT

2. In section 16 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section
(1), after clause (g), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :—

“(h) has failed to submit to the Corporation a certificate of Assistant
Commissioner, certifying that,—

(i) he resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(ii) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in
such house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but
regularly uses the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this
clause, if he submits such certificate, within a period of  one hundred
eighty days from the date of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Assistant Commissioner fails to
take the decision in respect of such application within a period of
thirty days from the date of receipt of the application; the
application shall be deemed to have been granted and the Assistant
Commissioner shall issue such certificate accordingly.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL

 CORPORATIONS ACT

3. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
sub-section (1), after clause ( j), the following clause shall be added, namely :—

“(k) he has failed to submit to the Corporation a certificate of the
Ward Officer of the concerned corporation, certifying that,—

(i) resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(ii) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in
such house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but
regularly uses the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this
clause, if he submits such certificate, within a period of  one hundred
eighty days from the date of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Ward Officer fails to take the
decision in respect of such application within a period of thirty days

III of
1888.

Mah. XIX
of 2016.

LIX of
1949.

Mah.
XIX of
2016.

Amendment
of section 16

of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 10

of LIX of
1949.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨Éä 7, 2016/´Éè¶ÉÉJÉ 17, ¶ÉEäò 1938 3
from the date of receipt of the application; the application shall be
deemed to have been granted and the Ward Officer shall issue such
certificate accordingly.”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965

4. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), after clause
( l), the following clause shall be added, namely :—

“(m) has failed to submit  to the Council a certificate of the Authorised
Officer of the concerned Council, certifying that,—

(i) he resides in a house owned by him and has a toilet in such house
and he regularly uses such toilet ; or

(ii) he resides in a house not owned by him and has a toilet in such
house and he regularly uses it or he has no such toilet but regularly uses
the community or public toilet :

Provided that, no Councillor on the date of commencement of the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Fourth
Amendment) Act, 2015, shall be disqualified under this clause, if he submits
such certificate, within a period of  one hundred eighty days from the date
of such commencement :

Provided further that, if the Authorised Officer fails to take the
decision in respect of such application within a period of thirty days from
the date of receipt of the application; the application shall be deemed to
have been granted and the Authorised Officer shall issue such certificate
accordingly.”.

Mah. XIX
of 2016.

Amendment
of section 16
of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT
PRINTING, STATIONERYAND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÖ±Éè 29, 2016/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1938 1

Short title.

III of
1888.
Mah.
XL of
1965.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEòú 48] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®úú, VÉÖ±Éè 29, 2016/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 77

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act No. XXIII of 2016),  is
hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,
Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---77-----1

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXIII OF 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 29th July 2016).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act and
the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial

Townships Act, 1965.
WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal

Corporation Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats  and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the
Republic of India, as follows :—

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation and
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2015.



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÖ±Éè 29, 2016/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1938

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT

2. In section 390 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act
(hereinafter referred to as “the Mumbai Corporation Act”), to sub-section
(1), the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, no such permission shall be required in respect of
the factories, workshop or work-place in the area, notified by the
Maharashtra Industrial Development Corporation, within the
jurisdiction of the corporation.”.

3. In section 393 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, to sub-section (1),
the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, no such permission of the Commissioner, under
this sub-section shall be required, if such factory or any other place is
situated in the area, notified by the Maharashtra Industrial
Development Corporation, within the jurisdiction of the corporation.”.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965

4. In section 278 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, to sub-section (1), the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, no such licence under this sub-section shall be
required, if such factory, workshop or place of business is situated in
the area notified by the Maharashtra Industrial Development
Corporation, within the jurisdiction of the Council.”.

III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 390

of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 393

of III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 278
of Mah. XL of

1965.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 21, 2016/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1938 1

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal

Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the

purposes hereinafter appearing; It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh

Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 2, +ÆEòú 78] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 21, 2016/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 135

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ

Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XXXVIII of 2016), is hereby published under the authority
of the Governor.

                                       By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXXVIII OF 2016.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 21st December 2016).

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀------135-----1

Short title.

Mah.
XL of
1965.



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 21, 2016/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 30, ¶ÉEäò 1938

2. In section 9 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as
the “Principal Act”), in sub-section (1), to clause (b), the following proviso
shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, in case of the Municipal Council where the President
is directly elected under section 51A-1A, the President so elected shall
nominate the Councilors under clause (b).”.

3. In section 51A-1A of the Principal Act, in sub-section (9),—

(i) for the words “ The Collector ” the words, “ The President ”
shall be substituted;

(ii) the following shall be added at the end :—

“Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (3) of
section 51A, the President elected under section 51A-1A, shall
have a second or casting vote.”.

Amendment
of section

51A-1A of
Mah. XL of

1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED
AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,
STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.

Amendment
of section 9

of Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
XL of
1965.



1¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats

and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2016, on the 19th May 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
18th July 2016, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Bill, 2016 (L. A. Bill No. XXVI of 2016), for converting the said
Ordinance into an Act of the State Legislature, was passed by the Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly on the 26th July 2016, and was transmitted to the
Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

Mah.
Ord. IX

of
2016.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--14-----1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEò 8(3)] MÉȪ û´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 8 ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò  14

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. IX of 2017),
is  hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,

Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

(1)

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. IX OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 12th January 2017).

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as the session of the Maharashtra Legislative
Council was prorogued on the 5th August 2016, the said Bill could not be
passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2) (a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance shall cease to operate at the expiration of six weeks
from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 28th
August, 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session ; and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances
existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to
continue the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment and
Continuance) Ordinance, 2016 (hereinafter referred to as “ the said
Continuance Ordinance”) on the 30th August 2016 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-seventh Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY

1. (1) This Act  may be called the Maharashtra  Municipal Corporations
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 19th May 2016.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL

CORPORATIONS ACT

2. In section 5 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
sub­ section (3),—

(a) before the first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely :—

“Provided that, after the commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act,
2016, in respect of the general elections to the Corporation, each of
the wards shall elect as far as possible four Councillors but not less
than three and not more than five Councillors, and each voter shall,
notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, be entitled to cast
the same number of votes, as the number of Councillors to be elected
in his ward : ” ;

(b) in the first proviso, for the words “Provided that” the words
“Provided further that” shall be substituted.

LIX of
1949.

Amendment of
section 5 of LIX

of 1949.

Short title and
Commencement.

Mah.
IX of
2017.

Mah.
Ord.
XVI of
2016.



3¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,
NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL

TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965

3. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter, in this Chapter,
referred to as “the Municipal Councils Act”),—

(a) in clause (7),—

(i) after the words “a member of the Council,” the words “the
directly elected President” shall be inserted ;

(ii) in sub-clause (ii), the words “ a President of the Council or”
shall be deleted ;

(b) for clause (12), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(12) “election” means an election to a Council or to the office
of the President, as the case may be, and includes any by-election;”.

4. In section 9 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1), in clause
(a), for the word “Councillors” the words “the President and the Councillors”
shall be substituted.

5. In section 10 of the Municipal Councils Act, to sub-section (2), the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, after the commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, in respect
of the General elections to the Council, each of the wards shall elect as
far as possible two Councillors but not more than three Councillors, and
each voter shall, notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2)
of section 14, be entitled to cast the same number of votes, as the number
of Councillors to be elected in his ward.”.

6.  After section 51 of the Municipal Councils Act, the following section
shall be inserted, namely :—

“51A-1A. (1) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, in respect of
the General elections to the Council, subject to the provisions of section
51-1A, every Council shall have a President who shall be elected by the
persons whose names are included in the municipal voters list prepared under
section 11.

(2) Every person qualified to be elected as a Councillor under section
15 shall be qualified to be elected as a President at an election.

(3) Election of the President shall be held simultaneously with the
general elections of the Council and the procedure regarding holding of
elections  to the Council shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to such election.

(4) If at an election, no President is elected, a fresh election shall
be held to elect a President, and if there is a failure to elect a President
at the fresh election, such vacancy may, notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, be filled by election by the elected Councillors from
amongst themselves.

Mah.
XL of
1965

Direct
Election of
President.

Amendment of
section 2 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Amendment of
section 9 of Mah.
XL of
1965.

Amendment of
section 10 of
Mah. XL of 1965.

Mah.
IX of
2017.

Insertion of
section 51A-1A
in Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
IX of
2017.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--14-----1+



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

(5) Any person elected under sub-section (4) or (7) shall be deemed
to be duly elected at an election under this section.

(6) If, in the election of the President, there is an equality of votes,
the result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn by the State
Election Commissioner or the officer appointed by him for the purpose.

(7) If, during the term of the elected Councillors, there is a vacancy
in the office of the President due to any reason, the same procedure as
provided in sub-sections (1) to (6) shall apply and such President shall
remain in office only for the remainder of the term, for which his
predecessor would have remained in office but for such casual vacancy :

Provided that, if a vacancy occurs, which is within six months
prior to the date on which the term of office of the elected Councillors
expires, the same shall be filled in by election from amongst the
elected Councillors.
(8) In case of a dispute regarding election of the President, the

provisions of section 21 shall, mutatis mutandis, apply.
(9) The Collector shall convene first general meeting of the Council

within twenty-five days from the date on which the name of the President
and the elected Councillors is published in the Official Gazette after the
general election of the Council and the President. The nomination of the
Councillors under clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 9 shall be made
in the prescribed manner in this meeting.”.
7. In section 51A of the Municipal Councils Act, after sub-section (6),

the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—
“(6A) In respect of the Councils to which the President is directly

elected after the commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2016, the
provisions of this section shall apply with the following modifications :—

(i) for sub-section  (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(1) Every Council shall have a Vice- President, who shall
be elected   by the elected Councillors amongst themselves in
the first general meeting convened under sub-section (9) of
section 51A-1A.”;
(ii) for sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be

substituted, namely :—
“(6) Subject to the provisions of section 55A and other

provisions of this Act, the Vice-President shall hold the office
for a term of five years from the date of his election and his term
shall be co-terminus with the term of the Council.”.”.

8. In section 51B of the Municipal Councils Act, after sub-section (3),
the following sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(4) The provisions of this section shall not apply when the President
is elected under section 51A-1A.”.
9. Section 52 of the Municipal Councils Act shall be re-numbered as

sub­section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, the
following sub-sections shall be added, namely :—

“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the term
of office of the President, elected under sub-section (1) of section 51A-
1A, shall be of five years and shall be co-terminus with the term of the
Council.

Amendment of
section 51A of

Mah. XL of 1965.

Amendment of
section 51 B of

Mah. XL of 1965.

Mah.
IX of
2017.

Amendment of
section 52  of

Mah. XL of 1965.



5¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

(3) Nothing in sub-section (2) shall apply to the term of office of the
Presidents who are holding the office in respect of the Council for which
general elections have been held prior to the date of commencement of
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act,
2016 and the provisions of this section, as it existed on the date
immediately preceding such date of commencement, shall continue to
apply in respect of the term of office of such Presidents.”.

10. In section 55 of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (1), for
the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period
of two years from the date of election of the directly elected President
and in case of the President elected by the Councillors from amongst
themselves, within one year from the date of such election.”.

11. After section 341B of the Municipal Councils Act, the following
sections shall be inserted, namely :—

“ 341B-1. (1) Subject to the provisions of section 51-1A, every
Nagar Panchayat shall have a President who shall be elected by the
elected Councillors from amongst themselves.

(2) The Collector shall, within twenty-five days from the date on
which the names of the Councillors elected to Nagar Panchayat are
published or, as the case may be, first published under sub-section (1) of
section 19, in the Official Gazette, convene a special meeting of the
Councillors for election of a President :

Provided that, a meeting under this section shall not be held before
the expiry of the term of office of the outgoing Councillors.

(3) The meeting called under sub-section (2) shall be presided over
by the Collector or such officer as the Collector may by order in writing
appoint in this behalf. The Collector or such officer shall, when presiding
over such meeting, have the same powers as the President of a Nagar
Panchayat when presiding over a meeting of the Nagar Panchayat has,
but shall not have the right to vote :

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act for
regulating the procedure at meetings (including the quorum required
thereat), the Collector or the officer presiding over such meeting may,
for reasons which in his opinion are sufficient, refuse to adjourn such
meeting.

(4) Any Councillor aggrieved by any decision of the Collector or such
officer, accepting or rejecting any nomination paper, may, within forty-
eight hours from intimation of such decision, present an appeal to the
Regional Director of Municipal Administration concerned and
simultaneously give notice of such appeal to the Collector or such officer.
Such appeal shall be disposed of by the Regional Director, as
expeditiously as possible, after giving a reasonable opportunity of being
heard to the parties concerned. The decision of the Regional Director
on such appeal, and subject only to such decision (if any), the decision of
the Collector or such officer, as the case may be, accepting or not, shall
not be called in question in any Court.

Mah.
IX of
2017.

Amendment of
section 55  of
Mah. XL of 1965.

Insertion of
sections 341B-1
to 341 B-6 in
Mah. XL of 1965.

Election of
President of
Nagar
Panchayat.



6 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

(5) If, in the election of the President there is an equality of votes,
the result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn in the
presence of the Collector or the officer presiding in such manner as he
may determine.

(6) Any dispute regarding election of the President shall be referred
to the State Government whose decision in that behalf shall be final.

(7) After election of the President, the Nagar Panchayat shall
continue its meeting for the purpose of electing the Vice-President.

(8) If there is a vacancy in the office of the President due to any
reason whatsoever, then for subsequent election of a President, the same
procedure as laid down in sub-sections (2) to (6) (both inclusive) shall
apply except that the special meeting shall be called by the Collector
within twenty-five days from the date on which the vacancy occurs.

(9) The subsequent election to the post of the President after expiry
of the first term of the two and a half years of the President elected under
the provisions of sub-section (2), shall be held within a period of eight
days prior to the expiry of the said term of the earlier President :

Provided that, the newly elected President shall take charge on
the last day of the term of the outgoing President or next day thereafter.

341B-2. (1) Every Nagar Panchayat shall have a Vice-President, who
shall be elected by the elected Councillors from amongst themselves in the
special meeting convened under sub-section (2) of section 341B-1.

(2) The meeting to elect the Vice-President shall be presided over by the
Collector or such officer as the Collector may nominate specially in this behalf,
but the Collector or such other officer shall have no right to vote:

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
the rules made thereunder, for regulating the procedure at meetings
(including the quorum thereat), the Collector or, as the case may be, the
officer, presiding over such meeting may, for sufficient reasons to be
recorded in writing, refuse to adjourn such meeting.

(3) If, in the election of the Vice-President, there is equality of votes, the
result of the election shall be decided by the officer presiding over such
meeting by drawing lots.

(4) The name of the Vice-President so elected shall be notified by the
Collector, in the Official Gazette, within fifteen days from such election.

(5) Any dispute regarding the election of the Vice-President shall be
referred to the State Government, whose decision thereon shall be final.

(6) Subject to the provisions of section 55A and other provisions of this
Act, the Vice-President, shall hold the office, for a term of two and half years
from the date of his election.

(7) If there is any vacancy in the office of the Vice-President for any reason
whatsoever, the vacancy shall be filled up by following the procedure
prescribed in sub-sections (1) to (3) and the Vice-President so elected shall
remain in office only for the remainder of the term, for which his predecessor
would have remained in office but for such vacancy.

Election of
Vice-

President of
Nagar

Panchayat.



7¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

341B-3. (1) The Collector shall, within seven days from the date of
election of the President, call a special meeting for the purpose of nominating
Councillors.

(2) The nominations of the Councillors under clause (b) of
sub­section (1) of section 9, shall be made in the prescribed manner.

(3) The meeting called under sub-section (1) shall be presided over by
the Collector or such officer as the Collector may by order in writing appoint
in this behalf. The Collector or such officer shall, when presiding over such
meeting, have the same powers as the President of a Nagar Panchayat when
presiding over a meeting of the Nagar Panchayat has, but shall not have the
right to vote :

Provided that, notwithstanding anything contained in this Act for
regulating the procedure at meetings (including the quorum required
thereat), the Collector or the officer presiding over such meeting may,
for reasons which in his opinion are sufficient, refuse to adjourn such
meeting.

341B-4. The term of office of the President, shall be of two and half
years.

341B-5. (1) A President of a Nagar Panchayat shall cease to be
the President if the Councillors by a resolution passed at a special meeting
by majority not less than three-fourths of the total number of Councillors
so decides :

Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period of one
year from the date of the election of the President.

(2) The requisition for such special meeting shall be signed by not less
than one-half of the total number of Councillor’s and shall be sent to the
Collector.

(3) The Collector shall, within ten days of the receipt of a requisition
under sub-section (2), convene a special meeting of the Council :

Provided that, when the Collector convenes a special meeting, he shall
give intimation thereof to the President.

(4) A meeting to consider a resolution under sub-section (1) shall be
presided over by the Collector or any other officer authorised by him in this
behalf, but the Collector or such other officer shall have no right to vote.

(5) The nominated Councillors shall have no right to vote on any
resolution relating to the removal of the President.

(6) If the resolution seeking the removal of the President is not moved
or, as the case may be, rejected, in the special meeting convened for the purpose
under sub-section (3), no fresh resolution seeking the removal of the President
shall be brought before the Nagar Panchayat.

341B-6. (1) A Vice-President shall cease to be the Vice-President, if the
Nagar Panchayat by a resolution passed by a majority of not less than two-
thirds of the total number of the Councillors, at a special meeting, so decides :

Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period of six
months from the date of election of the Vice-President.

Nomination of
Councillors of
Nagar
Panchayat.

Term of office of
President of
Nagar
Panchayat.

Removal of
President of
Nagar
Panchayats by
Councillors.

Removal of
Vice-President
of Nagar
Panchayats
by Councillors.



8 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 12, 2017/{ÉÉè¹É 22, ¶ÉEäò 1938

(2) The requisition for such special meeting shall be signed by not less
than one-half of the total number of Councillors and shall be sent to the
President, and the President shall, within ten days of the receipt of such
requisition, convene a special meeting of the Nagar Panchayat, where the
nominated Councillors shall have no right to vote.

(3) If the resolution seeking removal of the Vice-President is not moved
or as the case may be, rejected, in the special meeting convened for the
purpose under sub-section (2), no fresh resolution for such removal shall be
brought during the tenure of such Vice-President.”.

CHAPTER IV

MISCELLANEOUS

12. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the case may be, the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as
the occasion arises, by an Order published in the Official Gazette, give such
directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Acts as amended
by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the purpose
of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

13. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils,  Nagar Panchayats  and Industrial Townships
(Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2016, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporation Act and the Municipal
Councils Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been
done, taken or, as the case may be, issued under the corresponding provisions
of the said Acts, as amended by this Act.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. XVI

of 2016 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord.
XVI of
2016.

LIX of
1949.

LIX of
1949.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 1, 2017/¦ÉÉpù 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LII OF 2017

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 1st September 2017).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal

Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “ the
said Ordinance”), on the 2nd February 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
6th March 2017, the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Bill, 2017 (L.A. Bill No.
IV of 2017), for converting the said Ordinance into an Act of the State
Legislature was passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 16th
March 2017 and was transmitted to the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

Mah.
Ord. VI
of 2017.

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 3, +ÆEò 67(2)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®ú, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 1, 2017/¦ÉÉpù 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 3, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 133

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. LII of 2017), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

N. J. JAMADAR,
Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`öö---133-1
(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 1, 2017/¦ÉÉpù 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

AND WHEREAS thereafter, as the session of the Maharashtra
Legislative Council was prorogued on the 7th April 2017, the said Bill could
not be passed by the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213 (2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance had ceased to operate at the expiration of six weeks
from the date of re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is, after the 16th
April 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the operation
of the provisions of the said Ordinance ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in
session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action to continue the operation of the provisions of the said Ordinance, for
the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, the Governor of
Maharashtra has promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment and
Continuance) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as “ the said
Continuance Ordinance”), on the 30th May 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the
Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 2nd February 2017.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 16 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section
(1), in clause (h), after the words “ a certificate of Assistant Commissioner ”
the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ” shall be inserted.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

3. In section 10 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
sub-section (1), in clause (k), after the words “ a certificate of the Ward Officer
of the concerned corporation ” the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ”
shall be inserted.

CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,

NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.
4. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), in clause
(m), after the words “ a certificate of the Authorised Officer of the concerned
Council ” the words “ or a self-certificate by such person ” shall be inserted.

Amendment
of section 16

of III of
1888.

III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 10

of LIX of
1949.

LIX of
1949.

Amendment
of section 16

of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah. Ord.
VIII of
2017.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, ºÉ{]åõ¤É®ú 1, 2017/¦ÉÉpù 10, ¶ÉEäò 1939 3

CHAPTER V
MISCELLANEOUS

5. (1) The Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2017,
is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 as amended by the
said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or, as the case may
be, issued under the corresponding provisions of the relevant Acts, as
amended by this Act.

6. For the removal of doubt, it is hereby declared that all the provisions
of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as amended by the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, shall with effect from 2nd February
2017, being the date of commencement of the said Ordinance, continue to be
in force and be deemed to be continuously in force.

Mah.
Ord.

VIII of
2017.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.
VIII of 2017
and saving.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Removal of
doubt.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah.
Ord. VI
of 2017.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 15, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VIII OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 15th January 2018).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats  and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, on the 2nd November 2017;

 Mah.
Ord.

XXV of
2017.

 Mah.
XL of
1965.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 1(8)] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®úú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 15, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 4,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 8

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act. No. VIII of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of
the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--8--1 (1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 15, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 2nd November
2017.

2. After section 341B-1 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as
“the principal Act”), the following section shall be inserted, namely :—

“341B-1A. (1) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2017, in respect of the general elections to the Nagar
Panchayats, subject to the provisions of section 51-1A, every  Nagar
Panchayat shall have a President who shall be elected by the persons
whose names are included in the voters list prepared for elections to
wards under section 341B for Nagar Panchayat.

(2) Every person qualified to be elected as a Councillor to the
Nagar Panchayat shall be qualified to be elected as a President at an
election under sub-section (1).

(3) Election of the President shall be held simultaneously with
the general elections of the Nagar Panchayat and the procedure
regarding holding of elections to the Nagar Panchayats shall, mutatis
mutandis, apply to such election.

(4) If at an election, no President is elected, a fresh election shall
be held to elect a President, and if there is a failure to elect a President
at the fresh election, such vacancy may, notwithstanding anything
contained in this Act, be filled by election by the elected Councillors
from amongst themselves.

(5) Any person elected under sub-section (4) or (7) shall be deemed
to be duly elected at an election under this section.

(6) If, in the election of the President, there is an equality of
votes, the result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn
by the State Election Commissioner or the officer appointed by him
for the purpose.

(7) If, during the term of the elected Councillors, there is a vacancy
in the office of the President due to any reason, the same procedure
as provided in sub-sections (1) to (6) shall apply and such President
shall remain in office only for the remainder of the term, for which his
predecessor would have remained in office but for such casual vacancy :

Provided that, if a vacancy occurs, which is within six months
prior to the date on which the term of office of the elected Councillor
expires, the same shall be filled in by election from amongst the elected
Councillors.

(8) In case of a dispute regarding election of the President, the
provisions of section 21 shall, mutatis mutandis, apply.

(9) The President shall convene first general meeting of the Nagar
Panchayat within twenty-five days from the date on which the name
of the President and the elected Councillors is published in the Official
Gazette after the general elections of the Nagar Panchayat and the
President. The nomination of the Councillors under clause (b) of sub-
section (1) of section 9 shall be made in the prescribed manner in this
meeting by the President elected under this section.”.

Short title and
commence-

ment.

Insertion
of section

341B-1A in
Mah. XL of

1965.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Direct
election of

President of
Nagar

Panchayat.

Mah.
VIII
of 2018.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 15, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939 3

3. In section 341B-2 of the principal Act, after sub-section (6), the
following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(6A) In respect of the Nagar Panchayats to which the President
is directly elected after the commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2017, the provisions of this section shall apply with
the following modifications :—

(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(1) Every Nagar Panchayat shall have a Vice-President,
who shall be elected by the elected Councillors amongst
themselves in the first general meeting convened under sub-
section (9) of section 341B-1A.”;

(ii) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(3) If in the election of Vice-President there is equality
of votes, the President elected under section 341B-1A shall
have a second or casting vote.”;

(iii) for sub-section (6), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(6) Subject to the provisions of section 55A and other
provisions of this Act, the Vice-President shall hold the office
for a term of five years from the date of his election and his
term shall be co-terminus with the term of the Nagar
Panchayat.”.”.

4. In section 341B-3 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the
following sub-section shall be added, namely:—

“(4) The provisions of this section shall not apply when the
President is elected under section 341B-1A.”.

5. Section 341B-4 of the principal Act shall be re-numbered as
sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1), as so re-numbered, the
following sub-sections shall be added, namely :—

“ (2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the
term of office of the President, elected under sub-section (1) of section
341B-1A, shall be of five years and shall be co-terminus with the term
of the Nagar Panchayat.

(3) Nothing in sub-section (2) shall apply to the term of office of
the Presidents who are holding the office in respect of the Nagar
Panchayats for which general elections have been held prior to the
date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2017 and the
provisions of this section, as it existed on the date immediately
preceding such date of commencement, shall continue to apply in
respect of the term of office of such Presidents.”.

6. In section 341B-5 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the
proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, no such resolution shall be moved within a period
of two years from the date of election of the directly elected President
and in case of the President elected by the Councillors from amongst
themselves, within one year from the date of such election.”.

Amendment
of section
341B-2 of
Mah. XL of
1965.Mah.

VIII of
2018.

Amendment
of section
341B-3 of
Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section
341B-4 of
Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
VIII of

2018.

Amendment
of section
341B-5 of
Mah. XL of
1965.



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 15, 2018/{ÉÉè¹É 25, ¶ÉEäò 1939

7. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the principal Act, as
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken
or issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the
principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Repeal of Mah.
Ord. XXV of

2017 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord.
XXV of
2017.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 20, 2018/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 29, ¶ÉEäò 1939 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. XXI OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 20th March 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra

Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter  appearing; it is hereby
enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :––

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018.

III of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Short title.

(1)¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--39-------1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 19] ¨ÉÆMÉ³ý´ÉÉ®úú, ̈ ÉÉSÉÇ 20, 2018/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 29, ¶ÉEäò 1939 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 39

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and
the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. XXI of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————————

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 20, 2018/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 29, ¶ÉEäò 19392

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.
2. In section 5B of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act  (hereinafter

referred to as “the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act”), for the first proviso,
the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,––

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any other proof
of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee :”.

3. In section 37 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in sub-section
(2A), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the office of the Mayor for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing
on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation,
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a person who has applied to
the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his Caste Certificate before
the date of filing the nomination papers but who has not received the
validity certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee:”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

4. In section 5B of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act
(hereinafter referred to as “ the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act”),
for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal

Amendment
of section 37

of III of
1888.

III of
1888.

Amendment
of section 5B

of  III of
1888.

Mah.
XXI
of 2018.

Mah. XXI
of 2018.

Amendment
of section 5B

of LIX of
1949.

LIX of
1949.

Mah.
XXI
of 2018.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 20, 2018/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 29, ¶ÉEäò 1939 3

Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee : ”.

5. In section 19 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
sub-section (1B), for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the office of the Mayor for which
the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing
on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation,
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a person who has applied to
the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his Caste Certificate before
the date of filing the nomination papers but who has not received the
validity certificate on the date of filing of the nomination papers shall
submit, alongwith the nomination papers,-

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee:”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL  COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

INDUSTRIAL  TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.

6. In section 9A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred
to as “ the Municipal Councils Act ”), for the first proviso, the following proviso
shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, for the General or bye-elections for which the last
date of filing of nomination falls during the period commencing on the
date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the

Amendment
of section 19
of LIX of
1949.

Mah.
XXI

of 2018.

Amendment
of section 9A
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Mah.
XXI

of 2018.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 20, 2018/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 29, ¶ÉEäò 19394

Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment)
Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, in accordance with the
election programme declared by the State Election Commission, a person
who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification of his
Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers but
who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of the
nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the
Scrutiny Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any
other proof of having made such application to the Scrutiny
Committee ; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee : ”.

7. In section 51-1B of the Municipal Councils Act, for the first proviso,
the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“Provided that, for the elections for the office of the President for
which the last date of filing of nomination falls during the period
commencing on the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018 and ending on the 30th June 2019, a
person who has applied to the Scrutiny Committee for the verification
of his Caste Certificate before the date of filing the nomination papers
but who has not received the validity certificate on the date of filing of
the nomination papers shall submit, alongwith the nomination papers,—

(i) a true copy of the application preferred by him to the Scrutiny
Committee for issuance of the validity certificate or any other proof
of having made such application to the Scrutiny Committee; and

(ii) an undertaking that he shall submit, within a period of six
months from the date of his election, the validity certificate issued
by the Scrutiny Committee :”.

8. In section 341B of the Municipal Councils Act, in sub-section (4),—

(a) after the word and figure “ section 9 ” the figure and letter
“, 9A ” shall be inserted ;

(b) for the word, figures and letter “ section 51-1A ” the words, figures
and letters “ sections 51-1A and 51-1B ” shall be substituted.

Mah.
XXI
of 2018.

Amendment
of section
51-1B of

Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section

341B of
Mah. XL of

1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 31st March 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take
immediate action further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharahstra
Municipal Council, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, on the 25th January 2018;

AND WHEREAS it is expendient to replace the said Ordinance by an
Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year
of the Republic of India as follows :—

 Mah.
Ord. IV
of 2018.

 Mah.
XL of
1965.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 25] ¶ÉÊxÉ´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018 / SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 7, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 58

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ
Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Council Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. XXV of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of
the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

————————

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------58-1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 25th January 2018.

2. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as
“the principal Act”),—

(a) after clause (9), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(9A) “District Administration Officer (DAO)” means the officer
appointed as a District Administration Officer by the Government,
for the purposes of this Act;” ;

(b) after clause (22), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(22A) “Meeting Superintendent” means the officer or the
person designated as a Meeting Superintendent by the Chief Officer
for the purpose of maintaining proceedings of the Council and
Committees and responsible for receiving the proposals as per
section 83A ;”.

3. In section 55 of the principal Act, for the existing proviso, the
following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, no such resolution under this sub-section shall be
moved within a period of one year from the date of the election of the
President. For the removal of the President directly elected under section
51A-1A, the provisions of section 55-1 shall apply.”.

4. For section 55-1 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“55-1. (1) The requisition for removal of the President directly
elected under section 51A-1A shall be signed by not less than one half of
the total number of Councillors and shall contain the charges of
misconduct against such President and shall be sent to the Collector :

Provided that, no such requisition shall be sent within a period of
two and half years from the date of election of such President.

(2) Upon receipt of the requisition under sub-section (1), the Collector
shall conduct the enquiry of such charges and complete such enquiry
within a period of one month from the date of receipt of the requisition :

Provided that, in no case such period of enquiry shall be extended
beyond three months and for such extended period, prior assent of the
State Government shall be obtained by the Collector, if the enquiry
proceeding is delayed due to unavoidable reasons.

(3) The Collector shall submit the findings of the enquiry to the
Government for taking appropriate action under section 55A.”.

Short title
and

commence-
ment.

Amendment
of section 2 of

Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 55

of Mah. XL of
1965.

Substitution
of section

55-1 of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Removal of
President

directly
elected under
section 51A-

1A.

Mah. XL
of 1965.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

5. In section 55A of the principal Act, after the existing proviso, the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided further that, the Government shall take a decision on
the report submitted by the Collector under section 55-1, within a period
of six months from the date of receipt of the report.”.

6. In section 58 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) clause (b) shall be deleted;

(ii) clause (d) shall be deleted;

(iii) clause (e) shall be deleted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(1A) Subject to the provisions of this Act and of any rules and
bye-laws framed thereunder, the President directly elected under
section 51A-1A shall have power to give the financial sanction to
such proposal of development works as may be prescribed by the
State Government, from time to time and development works out
of grants received from the State Government, when there are no
specific instructions regarding financial approval and the Council
has discretion to select the work.”.

7. In section 74 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (3), for the words “Assistant and Deputy
Collector” the words “District Administration Officer” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words “the Assistant and Deputy
Collectors” the words “the District Administration Officer” shall be
substituted.

8. In section 75 of the principal Act, for sub-section  (1), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(1) There shall be a Chief Officer for every Council who shall be
an officer deputed by the State Government to the Municipal Council
from the cadre of Chief Officers or any other officer holding equivalent
post in the State Government appointed on deputation.”.

9. In section 77 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) in clause (a), the words “subject to the control, direction and
supervision of the President,” shall be deleted ;

(ii) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(aa) act as the Government representative for
implementation of all Government policies, schemes and
programs and shall take all necessary steps and shall be
responsible for implementation of the Central Government and
the State Government schemes, and shall implement the
directions issued by the Government, from time to time;”;

Amendment
of section 55A
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 58
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 74
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 75
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 77
of Mah. XL of
1965.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö------58-1+



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940

(iii) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

u(b) as Government representative, be responsible to give
effect to the decisions or resolutions of the Council :

Provided that, if any decision or resolution is against or in
violation of provisions of this Act or any other law, any
Government policy, rules, bye-laws or directions issued by the
Government, then it shall be his responsibility to submit such
a decision or resolution to the Collector under section 308
within three days;”;

(iv) in clause (f), for the words “report to the President”
the words “report to the Government, Director, President” shall
be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) the words “with the sanction of the President” shall be
deleted;

(ii) for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted,
namely :––

“ Provided that, such delegation shall be subject to the control
and revision by the Chief Officer.”.

10. In section 81 of the principal Act,—
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “an ordinary meeting shall be held once in two
months” the words “an ordinary meeting shall be held once in every
month” shall be substituted ;

(ii) for the words “first such meeting shall be held within two
months” the words “first such meeting shall be held within one
month” shall be substituted ;

(iii) for the words “each succeeding ordinary meeting shall be
held within two months” the words “each succeeding ordinary
meeting shall be held within one month” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4), in clause (a), for the words “and posted up at
the Municipal Office” the words “and posted up at the Municipal Office
and the official website of the Council or Nagar Panchayat” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-section (9), in clause (b),—

(i) after the words “at the Municipal Office” the words “and the
official website of the Council or Nagar Panchayat” shall be inserted;

(ii) the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that, all proposals of the Councillors on the agenda
of meeting should have detailed remarks of the Chief Officer of the
Council or Nagar Panchayat.”;
(d) in sub-section (12),—

(i) for the words “The minutes shall be signed as soon as
practicable” the words “The minutes shall be signed within seven
days” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “by any inhabitant of the municipal area” the
words “by any inhabitant of the municipal area and the resolutions
shall be published on the official website of the Council and the
official website of the Director” shall be substituted.

Amendment
of section 81

of Mah. XL of
1965.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940 5

11. For section 83 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“83. (1) The Chief Officer shall have the same right of being present
at a meeting of the Council and of taking part in the discussions thereat
as a Councillor and, with the permission of the presiding authority, may
at any time make a statement or explanation of facts, but he shall not be
at liberty to vote upon, or to make, any proposition at such meeting.

(2) The Council may require any of its officers to attend any meeting
or meetings of the Council at which any matter dealt with by such officer
in the course of his duties is being discussed; when any officer is thus
required to attend any such meeting, he may be called upon to make a
statement or explanation of facts or supply such information in his
possession relating to any matter dealt with by him as the Council may
require.

(3) The Chief Officer shall have the same right of being present at a
meeting of the Standing Committee or of a Subject Committee and of
taking part in the discussions thereat as a member of the said Committee,
but he shall not be at liberty to vote upon or make any proposition at
such meeting.

(4) The Chief Officer and in his absence any other Officer authorized
by him in this behalf shall have the same right of being present at a
meeting of the Council, Standing Committee or of a Subject Committee
and of taking part in the discussion thereat as a member of the said
Committee, but shall not be at liberty to vote upon or make any
proposition at such meeting.

(5) It shall be the duty of the Chief Officer to bring to the notice of
the Council, the provisions of this Act and of other laws, any Government
policy, rules, bye-laws, or directions issued by the Government and he
is further duty bound to send the resolution to the Collector under
section 308, if Council resolves contrary.”.

12. For section 83A of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“83A. (1) (a) Where, any proposal of the Chief Officer requires
previous sanction or approval of the Council or the Committee, the
Council or the Committee shall consider and dispose of any such proposal
of the Chief Officer, within thirty days reckoned from the date of the
meeting of the Council or the Committee held immediately after the
proposal is received by the Meeting Superintendent, whether the item
pertaining to such proposal is taken on the agenda of the meeting or
not.

(b) The Chief Officer shall send any proposal to the Meeting
Superintendent which requires previous approval of the Council, or the
Committee, as the case may be, and the Meeting Superintendent shall
immediately place the same before the President or the Chairman of
the concerned Committee.

(2) (a) If the Council or the Committee fails to take the decision
within the period specified in sub-section (1), then the President or the
Chairman of the concerned Committee shall decide the proposal within

Substitution
of section 83
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Proceedings of
the Council,
Standing
Committee,
etc.

Substitution
of section 83A
of Mah. XL of
1965.
Deemed
sanction.



6 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940

seven days after the expiry of the said period. The decision given by the
President or the Chairman of the concerned Committee on such proposal
shall be deemed to have been given by the Council or the concerned
Committee :

Provided that, any such deemed sanction or approval shall be
restricted to the extent the proposal conforms to the existing provisions
of this Act or any other law, for the time being in force.

(b) If the President or the Chairman of the Committee fails to take
the decision within the period specified in clause (a) above or, the Council,
the Committee or the President, as the case may be, the Chairman of
the Committee rejects such proposal, which is recommended by the Chief
Officer as per the directions of the Government, then the Chief Officer
shall be empowered to give effect to such proposal and submit a report
about the same to the Government, within three days.”.

13. In section 93 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (2),—

(i) in clause (c), —

(I) for the words “approval or sanction of the Council” the
words “ approval or sanction of the Standing Committee” shall
be substituted;

(II) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that, for such a category of contract as the
Government may prescribe, from time to time, a committee
consisting of the President and Chief Officer shall approve such
contract, within a period of fifteen days from its receipt.”;

(ii) in clause (d), for the words “to the Council” the words “ to
the Standing Committee” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (4),—

(i) for the words “ the Council” the words “ the Standing
Committee” shall be substituted;

(ii) for the words “two members of the Standing Committee”
the words “two members of the Standing Committee or any two
Councillors of the Council authorised by the President” shall be
substituted;

(c) in sub-section (7), for the words “the Council” the words “the
Standing Committee” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section (8), for the words “ the Council” the words “the
Standing Committee” shall be substituted.

14. In section 101 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the words
“under the directions of the President” shall be deleted.

15. In section 308 of the principal Act, for sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“ (1) If the Council or any Committee resolves contrary to provisions
of this Act or any other law, or rules, bye-laws, or the Government
directions, then it shall be the responsibility of the Chief Officer to send

Amendment
of section 93

of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 101
of Mah. XL of

1965.

Amendment
of section 308
of Mah. XL of

1965.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 31, 2018/SÉèjÉ 10, ¶ÉEäò 1940 7

it to the Collector for suspension of execution of such a resolution or
prohibition of doing thereof, within the period of three days from the
receipt of the said resolution. The Collector shall decide on such proposal
within the period of thirty days from the date of receipt of such proposal.
If it remains undecided within the said period, then the Collector shall
submit the report thereof to the Director within ten days and the decision
of the Director thereon shall be final. In such case, appeal against the
order of the Director shall lie to the State Government.”.

16. After section 341B-6 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“ 341B-7. Notwithstanding anything contained in sections
341B-1 to 341B-6, the provisions of sections 55, 55-1, 58, 75, 77, 81, 93
and 101 shall apply mutatis mutandis to the Nagar Panchayats.”.

17. (1) The Maharshtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the principal Act, as
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or
issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the Principal
Act, as amended by this Act.

Insertion of
section 341B-
7 in Mah. XL
of 1965.

Application of
certain
sections to
Nagar
Panchayats.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. IV
of 2018 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord. IV
of 2018.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004  AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI
PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 10, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LIII OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“ Maharashtra Government Gazette ”, on the 10th August 2018).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act,
the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the

Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby
enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

III of
1888.

LIX of
1949.
Mah.
XL of
1965.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 61(2)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®úúú, +ÉìMÉº]õ 10, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [ {ÉÞ¹`ä 3, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 127
|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LIII
of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--127--1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 10, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940

Amendment
of section

152 A of III
of 1888.

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY

1. This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENT TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 152A of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, in
sub-section (1),  after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided further that, the rates decided by the Corporation under
this sub-section shall be deemed to have came into effect from the 1st
April 2010, being the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal
Corporation (Third Amendment) Act, 2006. ”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

3. In section 267A of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, after
the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“ Provided further that, the rates decided by the Corporation under
this sub-section shall be deemed to have came into effect from the
4th January 2008, being the date of commencement of the Bombay
Provincial Municipal Corporations, the City of Nagpur Corporation and
the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Indusrial
Townships (Amendment) Act, 2007. ”.

CHAPTER IV
AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS,

NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.
4. In section 189A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “ shall be liable to pay every year a penalty, which
shall be equal to twice the property tax leviable on such building ” , the
following shall be substituted, namely :—

“ shall be liable to a penalty, at such rate as may be decided, from
time to time, by the Government, by an order, on such building ”;

(b) after the first proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided further that, the rates decided by the Government
under this sub-section, in view of the amendment carried out by clause
(a) of section 4 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2018,
shall be deemed to have came into effect from the 4th January 2008,
being the date of commencement of the Bombay Provincial Municipal
Corporations, the City of Nagpur Corporation and the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Indusrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2007.”.

Amendment
of section

267A of LIX
of 1949.

Mah. XI
of 2009.

Mah. II
of 2008.

Amendment
of section

189A of Mah.
XL of 1965.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah.
LIII of
2018.

Short title.

III of
1888.

LIX of
1949.

Mah. II
of 2008.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, +ÉìMÉº]õ 10, 2018/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 19, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

CHAPTER V
MISCELLANEOUS

5. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations
Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the
State Government may, as occasion arises, by an order published in the Official
Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with the provisions of the
relevant Act, as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to be necessary or
expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order issued under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as
may be, after it is issued, before each House of the State Legislature.

Power to
remove
difficulty.III of

1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LXV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 14th December 2018).

An Act further to amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra
Municipal Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar

Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances
existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action further to
amend the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and,
therefore, promulgated the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships (Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, on the 27th September 2018 ;

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah.
Ord. XX
of 2018.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEò 85(2)] ¶ÉÖGò´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 5, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 166

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ´ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (third Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXV
of 2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

—————————

RNI No. MAHENG / 2009 / 35528

(1)
¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--166----1



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the
State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

CHAPTER I
PRELIMINARY.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 27th September 2018.

CHAPTER II
AMENDMENTS TO THE MUMBAI MUNICIPAL CORPORATION ACT.

2. In section 5B of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act (hereinafter in this
Chapter referred to as “Mumbai Corporation Act”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

3. In section 37 of the Mumbai Corporation Act, in sub-section (2A),—
(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words

“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER III
AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

4. In section 5B of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act (hereinafter
in this Chapter referred to as “Maharashtra Corporations Act”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 7th April 2015 ;

Short title and
commence-

ment.

Amendment of
section 5B of

III of 1888.

III of
1888.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Amendment of
section 37 of

III of 1888.

Mah.
LXVof
2018.

Amendment of
section 5B of
LIX of 1949.

LIX of
1949.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 3

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

5. In section 19 of the Maharashtra Corporations Act, in sub-section (1B),—
(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words

“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER IV

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS

AND INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.

6. In section 9A of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter in this Chapter referred to as
“Municipal Councils Act”),—

(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words
“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—
“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person

under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Amendment of
section 19 of
LIX of 1949.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Amendment of
section 9A of
Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--166----2



4 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940

7. In section 51-1B of the Municipal Councils Act,—
(a) in the first proviso, in clause (ii), for the words “six months” the words

“twelve months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “six months” the words “twelve
months” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from 7th April 2015 ;

(c) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“Provided also that, in respect of the undertaking filed by any person
under clause (ii) of the first proviso, before the date of commencement of
the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, the period of “six
months” specified in such undertaking shall be deemed to have been
substituted as “twelve months”.”.

CHAPTER V

MISCELLANEOUS

8. Nothing in this Act shall affect the elections conducted by the State Election
Commission for conducting the elections or any programme declared by it therefor,
prior to the date of commencement of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation, the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Act, 2018, for filling up
the resultant vacancy in view of the provisions of section 5B or sub-section (2A) of
section 37 of the Mumbai Municipal Corporation Act, section 5B or
sub-section (1B) of section 19 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act,
section 9A or section 51-1B of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act,1965, as it stood prior to such date of
commencement.

9. Any person, who has obtained the Caste Certificate and validity certificate
but has not filed such certificate prior to the date of commencement of this Act, shall
not be deemed to be disqualified under the provisions of the relevant Municipal law,
if he submits such certificate within a period of fifteen days from the date of
commencement of this Act :

Provided that, the provisions of this section shall not apply where the State
Election Commission has already prior to the date of commencement of this Act
held elections to fill the vacancy of such person or declared the programme for
holding of such election.

10. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the
case may be, the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial
Townships Act, 1965, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as the
occasion arises, by an Order published in the Official Gazette, give such directions
not inconsistent with the provisions of the said Acts as amended by this Act, as
may appear to it to be necessary or expedient for the purpose of removing the
difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period of two
years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may be,
after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

Amendment of
section 51-1B
of Mah. XL of

1965.

Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Saving as to
certain

elections. Mah.
LXV of
2018.

Saving as to
certain

disqualification.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.
Mah. XL
of 1965.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.
Mah. XL
of 1965.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 14, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 23, ¶ÉEäò 1940 5

11. (1) The Mumbai Municial Corporation, the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken (including
any notification or order issued) under the corresponding provisions of the Mumbai
Municipal Corporation Act, the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act,
1965, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done,
taken or issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the
said Acts, as amended by this Act.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. XX
of 2018 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord. XX
of 2018.

III of
1888.
LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,  21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 17, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 1940 1

LIX of
1949.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships

Act,1965.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal
Corporations Act and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter appearing; it is
hereby enacted in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of India as follows :–

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY.

1. This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the
Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Amendment) Act, 2018.

Short title.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀------178----1

(1)

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 4, +ÆEòú 87(5)] ºÉÉä̈ É´ÉÉ®ú, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 17, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 1940 [{ÉÞ¹`ä 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEòú 178

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ  Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation in English
of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations and the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships (Amendment) Act, 2018 (Mah. Act No. LXXV of 2018) is hereby published under
the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

Secretary (Legislation) to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

—————

MAHARASHTRA ACT NO. LXXV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the “Maharashtra
Government Gazette”, on the 17th December 2018.)

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, Êb÷ºÉå¤É®ú 17, 2018/+OÉ½þÉªÉhÉ 26, ¶ÉEäò 19402

CHAPTER II

AMENDMENTS TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL CORPORATIONS ACT.

2. In section 79 of the Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act, in
clause (g),–

(a) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
 namely :—

“Provided that, where the Municipal Corporation has granted
approval to the implementation of the Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana of
the Central Government on the land belonging to it, the Commissioner
shall grant lease of such land to the eligible individual beneficiary in the
manner, as may be notified by the State Government : ”;

(b) in the existing proviso, for the words “Provided that,” the words
“ Provided further that,” shall be substituted.

CHAPTER III

AMENDMENT TO THE MAHARASHTRA MUNICIPAL COUNCILS, NAGAR PANCHAYATS AND

INDUSTRIAL TOWNSHIPS ACT, 1965.

3. In section 92 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats
and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely :–

“ Provided that, where the Council has granted approval to the
implementation of the Pradhan Mantri Awas Yojana of the Central Government,
on the land belonging to it, the Chief Officer shall grant lease of such land
to the eligible individual beneficiary in the manner, as may be notified by the
State Government.”.

CHAPTER IV

MISCELLANEOUS

4. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
Maharashtra Municipal Corporations Act or, as the case may be, the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, as
amended by this Act, the State Government may, as the occasion arises, by an
Order published in the Official Gazette, give such directions not inconsistent with
the provisions of the said Acts as amended by this Act, as may appear to it to
be necessary or expedient for the purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after expiry of a period of two
years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.

LIX of
1949.

Amendment of
section

79 of LIX
1949.

Amendment of
section 92 of

Mah. XL 1965.

Mah.
XL of
1965.

Power to
remove

difficulty.
LIX of
1949.
Mah.
XL of
1965.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR
GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT
DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004.
EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 14, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 24, ¶ÉEäò 1941 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XII OF 2020.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 14th March 2020).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature are not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965, for the purposes hereinafter
appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats  and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020, on the 4th February 2020 ;

AND WHEREAS, it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance with
minor modifications by an Act of the State Legislature; it is hereby enacted
in the Seventy-first Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Municipal Councils,
Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Act, 2020.

Short title
and
commencement.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Mah.
Ord. IV
of 1965.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö---35----1
(1)

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 6, +ÆEòú 16(2)] ¶ÉÊxÉ´ÉÉ®ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 14, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 24, ¶ÉEäò 1941 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ 4,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 35

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É

xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Second Amendment) Act, 2020 (Mah. Act No. XII of 2020), is hereby published under the authority
of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.
—————————



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 14, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 24, ¶ÉEäò 19412

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 4th February 2020.

2. In section 2 of the Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar
Panchayats and Industrial Townships Act, 1965 (hereinafter referred to as
“the principal Act”), in clause (7), in sub-clause (ii), after the words “to get
elected as” the words, figures and letters “a President of the Council in
accordance with section 51A-1B under section 51 or” shall be inserted.

3. After section 51A-1A of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“ 51A-1B. After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Second Amendment) Act, 2020, in respect of general elections and by-
elections to the Council, the provisions of section 51A-1A shall cease to
apply and every Council shall have a President who shall be elected
under section 51 and the provisions of the said section 51 shall apply
therefor.”.

4. In section 51A of the principal Act, after sub-section (6A), the
following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(6B) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second
Amendment) Act, 2020, in respect of the general elections and by-
elections to the Councils, the provisions of sub-section (6A) shall cease
to apply and every Council shall have a Vice-President who shall be
elected under section 51A and the provisions of the said section 51A
shall apply therefor.”.

5. In section 52 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(4) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second
Amendment) Act, 2020, the term of office of the President elected in
accordance with section 51A-1B under section 51 shall be such as provided
in sub-section (1) of this section.”.

6. For section 55 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“ 55. (1) The requisition for removal of the President elected under
section 51 shall be signed by not less than one-half of the total number of
Councillors and shall contain the charges of misconduct against such
President and shall be sent to the Collector:

Provided that, no such requisition shall be sent within a period of
one year from the date of election of such President.

(2) Upon receipt of the requisition under sub-section (1), the
Collector shall conduct the enquiry of such charges and complete such
enquiry within a period of one month from the date of receipt of the
requisition:

Provided that, in no case such period of enquiry shall be extended
beyond three months and for such extended period, prior assent of the
State Government shall be obtained by the Collector, if the enquiry
proceeding is delayed due to unavoidable reasons.

Amendment
of section 2 of

Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah. XL
of 1965.

Insertion of
section 51A-1B

in Mah. XL of
1965.

Non-
application of

section 51A-
1A for election
of President of

Council.

Mah. XII
of 2020.

Amendment
of section 51A
of Mah. XL of

1965. Mah.  XII
of 2020.

Amendment
of section 52

of Mah. XL of
1965. Mah.  XII

of 2020.

Substitution
of section 55

of Mah. XL of
1965.

Removal of
President by
Councillors.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 14, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 24, ¶ÉEäò 1941 3

(3) The Collector shall submit the findings of such enquiry to the
Government for taking appropriate action under section 55A.”.

7. In section 58 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1A), for the words,
figures and letters “the President directly elected under section 51A-1A shall
have power to give the financial sanction to such proposal of development
works as may be prescribed by the State Government, from time to time” the
words, figures and letters “ the President elected in accordance with section
51 or, as the case may be, the President directly elected under section 51 A-l A,
shall have power to give the financial sanction to such proposal of
development works as may be specified by the State Government, by order,
from time to time,” shall be substituted.

8. In section 93 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (c), for
the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Provided that, for such a contract as the State Government may,
by order, specify, from time to time, a committee of the President (elected
in accordance with section 51, or as the case may be, directly elected
under section 51A-1A) and the Chief Officer shall approve such contract,
within a period of fifteen days from its receipt.”.

9. After section 341B-1A of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“ 341B-1B. After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra
Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships
(Second Amendment) Act, 2020, in respect of the general elections
and by-elections to the Nagar Panchayats, the provisions of section
341B-1A shall cease to apply and every Nagar Panchayat shall have a
President who shall be elected under section 341B-1 and the provisions
of the said section 341B-1 shall apply therefor.”.

10. In section 341B-2 of the principal Act, after sub-section (6A), the
following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“(6B) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second
Amendment) Act, 2020, in respect of the general elections and by-
elections to the Nagar Panchayats, the provisions of sub-section (6A)
shall cease to apply and every Nagar Panchayat shall have a Vice-
President who shall be elected under section 341B-2 and the provisions
of the said section 341B-2 shall apply therefor.

(6C) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second
Amendment) Act, 2020, the term of office of Vice-President elected in
accordance with sub-section (6B) of section 341B-2 shall be such as
provided in sub-section (6) of section 341B-2.”.

Amendment
of section 58
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Amendment
of section 93
of Mah. XL of
1965.

Insertion of
section 341B-
1B of Mah. XL
of 1965.

Non-appli-
cation of
section 341B-
1A for election
of President of
Nagar
Panchayats.

Mah.
 XII of
2020.

Amendment
of section
341B-2 of
Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah.
 XII of
2020.

Mah.
 XII of
2020.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 14, 2020/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 24, ¶ÉEäò 19414

11. In section 341B-4 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the
following sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(4) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Municipal
Councils, Nagar Panchayats and Industrial Townships (Second
Amendment) Act, 2020, the term of office of the President elected in
accordance with section 341B-1B under section 341B-1 shall be such as
provided in sub-section (1) of this section.”.

12. For section 341B-5 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be substituted, namely :—

“ 341B-5. (1) The requisition for removal of the President elected under
section 341B-1 shall be signed by not less than one-half of the total number of
Councillors and shall contain the charges of misconduct against such President
and shall be sent to the Collector :

Provided that, no such requisition shall be sent within a period of one
year from the date of election of such President.

(2) Upon receipt of the requisition under sub-section (1), the Collector
shall conduct the enquiry of such charges and complete such enquiry within
a period of one month from the date of receipt of the requisition:

Provided that, in no case such period of enquiry shall be extended beyond
three months and for such extended period, prior assent of the State
Government shall be obtained by the Collector, if the enquiry proceeding is
delayed due to unavoidable reasons.

(3) The Collector shall submit the findings of the enquiry to the
Government for taking appropriate action under section 55A as applicable
therefor.”.

13. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
principal Act, as amended by this Act, the State Government may, as the
occasion arises, by order published in the Official Gazette, do anything not
inconsistent with the objects and purposes of the principal Act, which appears
to it to be necessary or expedient for the purposes of removing the
difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period
of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may
be, after it is made, before each House of State Legislature.

14. (1) The Maharashtra Municipal Councils, Nagar Panchayats and
Industrial Townships (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2020, is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anyting done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the principal Act, as
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or
issued, as the case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the principal
Act, as amended by this Act.

Substitution
of section
341B-5 of

Mah. XL of
1965.

Removal of
President of

Nagar
Panchayats by

Councillors.

Amendment
of section
341B-4 of

Mah. XL of
1965.

Mah. XII
of 2020.

Power to
remove

difficulty.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord. IV

of 2020 and
saving.

Mah.
Ord. IV
of 2020.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI
400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : DIRECTOR RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.




