
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016

Act 14 of 2016

Keyword(s):
Civic Amenities, Infrastructure, Deficient Municipal Areas

Amendments appended: 33 of 2017, 15 of 2018, 20 of 2020, 24 of 2021



 

Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015–2017 

 
 

 

 

Haryana Government Gazette 

EXTRAORDINARY 
Published  by  Authority 

© Govt. of  Haryana  

No. 117-2016/Ext.] p.Mhx<+] ohjokj] fnukad 28 tqykbZ] 2016 

 (6 Jko.k] 1938 'kd) 

 

fo/kk;h ifjf'k"V 

 

Øekad fo"k; oLrq i`"B  

Hkkx&I vf/kfu;e 

 1.  gfj;k.kk vfXu’keu lsok ¼la’kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 ¼2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 11½ 81 

 2.  gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dk izcU/ku  82-84 

  ¼fo’ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 ¼2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 14½ 

 3.  iwohZ iatkc tksr ¼pdcUnh rFkk [k.Mdj.k jksdFkke½ gfj;k.kk la’kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2016 85  

  ¼2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 16½ 

  ¼dsoy fgUnh esa½ 

Hkkx& II v/;kns'k 

 dqN ugha 

Hkkx& III izR;k;ksftr fo/kku 

 dqN ugha 

 Hkkx& IV 'kqf) iphZ] iqu% izdk'ku rFkk izfrLFkkiu 

 dqN ugha 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Price : Rs.  5.00                                                       (li) 



 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), JULY  28,  2016 (SRVN.  6, 1938  SAKA) 81 

 
Hkkx-I 

gfj;k.kk ljdkj 

fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkx 

vf/klwpuk 

fnukad 28 tqykbZ] 2016 

la[;k ySt-14@2016.— fn gfj;k.kk Q+kbvWj~ lW%o+~&bl ¼vWes*UMesUV½ ,sDV] 2016] dk 
fuEufyf[kr fgUnh vuqokn gfj;k.kk ds jkT;iky dh fnukad 19 tqykbZ] 2016 dh Lohd`fr ds v/khu 
,rn~}kjk izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS vkSj ;g gfj;k.kk jktHkk"kk vf/kfu;e] 1969 ¼1969 dk 17½] dh /kkjk 
4&d ds v/khu mDr vf/kfu;e dk fgUnh Hkk"kk esa izkekf.kd ikB le>k tk,xk %& 

2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 11 

   gfj;k.kk vfXu'keu lsok ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 
gfj;k.kk vfXu'keu lsok vf/kfu;e] 2009] 

dks vkxs la’kksf/kr djus ds fy, 
vf/kfu;e 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds lM+lBosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %& 

1. ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk vfXu'keu lsok ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2016] dgk tk ldrk gSA laf{kIr ukeA 

2. gfj;k.kk vfXu'keu lsok vf/kfu;e] 2009] dh /kkjk 15 esa]& 

 (i) mi&/kkjk ¼5½ ds LFkku ij] fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk izfrLFkkfir dh tk;sxh] vFkkZr~%& 

^^¼5½ vfr mPp Hkou ds fuekZ.k ds iwjk gksus ij] vukifRr izek.k&i= izkIr fd;k 
tk;sxk] tks ikap o"kZ dh vof/k ds fy, ekU; gksxkA  ,sls izek.k&i= ds u gksus 
ij] Lokeh Hkou dk vf/kHkksx ugha djsxk] dks iV~Vs ij ugha nsxk ;k cspsxk 
ughaA**A 

(ii) mi&/kkjk ¼5½  ds ckn] fuEufyf[kr mi&/kkjk tksM+ nh tk;sxh] vFkkZr~%& 

^^¼6½ Hkou dk Lokeh@vf/kHkksxh bl vk'k; dk izfr o"kZ Lor% ?kks"k.kk izek.k&i= nsxk 
fd mlds Hkou@ifjlj esa laLFkkfir vfXu'kked iz.kkyh vPNh fLFkfr esa dk;Z 
dj jgh gS rFkk Hkou esa dksbZ ifjo/kZu@ifjorZu ugha gSA ;fn Hkou esa dksbZ 
ifjo/kZu@ifjorZu gS] rks vfXu vukifRr izek.k&i= vfLrRoghu gks tk,xk rFkk 
Lokeh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds vuqlkj iqujhf{kr vfXu'kked Ldhe ds vuqeksnu ds fy, 
vkosnu djsxk rFkk l{ke izkf/kdkjh ;nk&dnk ,sls Hkou@ifjljksa dh 
tkap&iM+rky dj ldrk gSA**A  

2009 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 12 dh 
/kkjk 15 dk 
la'kks/kuA 

                                                             
 

 dqynhi tSu] 
 lfpo] gfj;k.kk ljdkj] 
 fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkxA 
 

 
 
 



82  HARYANA GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), JULY  28,   2016 (SRVN.  6, 1938   SAKA) 

 

gfj;k.kk ljdkj 

fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkx 

vf/klwpuk 

fnukad 28 tqykbZ] 2016 

la[;k ySt-17@2016.— fn gfj;k.kk eSu~bt~eWUV vkWo+ flo+~bd vWesfufVt ,sUM bu~ÝWLVªWd~pW 
fMfQ'kWUV E;wfufliWy ,vWfjvWt ¼Lis'kWy izWfo'tWul½ ,sDV] 2016] dk fuEufyf[kr fgUnh vuqokn gfj;k.kk ds 
jkT;iky dh fnukad 19 tqykbZ] 2016 dh Lohd`fr ds v/khu ,rn~}kjk izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS vkSj ;g 
gfj;k.kk jktHkk"kk vf/kfu;e] 1969 ¼1969 dk 17½] dh /kkjk 4&d ds [k.M ¼d½ ds v/khu mDr vf/kfu;e 
dk fgUnh Hkk"kk esa izkekf.kd ikB le>k tk,xk %& 

2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 14 

gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk 
dk izcU/ku ¼fo’ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2016  

gfj;k.kk jkT; esa uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk  
volajpuk esa rFkk mlls lacaf/kr rFkk muls vuq"kafxd  
ekeyksa ds fy, vko';d lsokvksa dh O;oLFkk djus  

gsrq fo'ks"k micU/k djus ds fy, 
vf/kfu;e 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds lM+lBosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %&  

laf{kIr ukeA 1. ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dk 
izcU/ku ¼fo’ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 dgk tk ldrk gSA  

ifjHkk"kk,aA 2. bl vf/kfu;e esa] tc rd lanHkZ ls vU;Fkk visf{kr u gks]& 

¼d½  **l{ke izkf/kdkjh** ls vfHkizk; gS] gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1973 ¼1973 dk 24½] 
gfj;k.kk uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk 16½] gfj;k.kk uxjh; {ks= fodkl rFkk 
fofu;eu vf/kfu;e] 1975 ¼1975 dk 8½] iatkc vuqlwfpr lM+d rFkk fu;af=r {ks= 
vfu;fer fodkl fucZU/ku vf/kfu;e] 1963 ¼1963 dk iatkc vf/kfu;e 41½] iatkc ubZ 
jkt/kkuh ¼ifjf/k½ fu;a=.k vf/kfu;e] 1952 ¼1953 dk iatkc vf/kfu;e 1½ ;k rRle; ykxw 
fdlh vU; fof/k ds mica/kksa ds v/khu mYya?ku ds fy, fof/kd dkjZokbZ djus ds fy, 
l{ke izkf/kdkjh ( 

¼[k½  **?kksf"kr {ks=** ls vfHkizk; gS] /kkjk 3 ds v/khu viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk 
{ks= ds :i esa ?kksf"kr {ks= ( 

¼x½  **vko';d lsokvksa** ls vfHkizk; gS] ty vkiwfrZ] ey fudkl] lM+dsa rFkk xyh izdk'k ( 

¼?k½  **ljdkj** ls vfHkizk; gS] iz'kkldh; foHkkx esa gfj;k.kk jkT; dh ljdkj ( 

¼³½  **uxjikfydk {ks=** ls vfHkizk; gS] gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1973 ¼1973 dk 24½ ;k 
gfj;k.kk uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk 16½] tSlh Hkh fLFkfr gks] esa ;Fkk 
ifjHkkf"kr uxjikfydk {ks= ( 

¼p½  **uxjikfydk** ls vfHkizk; gS] gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1973 ¼1973 dk 24½ rFkk 
gfj;k.kk uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk 16½ esa ;Fkk ifjHkkf"kr uxjikfydk ( 

¼N½  **vizkf/kd`r fuekZ.k** ls vfHkizk; gS] fuekZ.k tks gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1973  
¼1973 dk 24½] gfj;k.kk uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk 16½] gfj;k.kk uxjh; {ks= 
fodkl rFkk fofu;eu vf/kfu;e] 1975 ¼1975 dk 8½] iatkc vuqlwfpr lM+d rFkk 
fu;af=r {ks= vfu;fer fodkl fucZU/ku vf/kfu;e] 1963 ¼1963 dk iatkc vf/kfu;e 41½] 
iatkc ubZ jkt/kkuh ¼ifjf/k½ fu;a=.k vf/kfu;e] 1952 ¼1953 dk iatkc vf/kfu;e 1½ ;k 
rRle; ykxw fdlh vU; fof/k ds mica/kksa ds mYya?ku esa fufeZr fd;k x;k gSA 

 



 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), JULY  28,  2016 (SRVN.  6, 1938  SAKA) 83 

 
3. ljdkj] jkti= esa vf/klwpuk }kjk] uxjikfydk {ks= ds fdlh {ks= dks viw.kZ ukxfjd 
lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk {ks= ds :i esa ?kksf"kr dj ldrh gS ftlesa& 

¼d½ 31 ekpZ] 2015 ls iwoZ ipkl izfr'kr ls vf/kd IykVksa ij lajpuk gks pqdh gS ( rFkk 
¼[k½ bl vk'k; dk ladYi lEc) uxjikfydk }kjk ikfjr fd;k x;k gS rFkk uxj fuxe 

dh n'kk esa lEc) eaMy vk;qDr rFkk uxjikfydk dh n'kk esa mik;qDr }kjk vuq'kalk 
dh xbZ gS % 

ijUrq lEc) uxjikfydk }kjk igys ls gh ikfjr rFkk e.My vk;qDr ;k 
mik;qDr] tSlh Hkh fLFkfr gks] }kjk vuq'kaflr ladYi ljdkj }kjk vf/kdfFkr ekinaM 
dks iwjk djrk gSA 

?kksf"kr {ks=A  

4. ¼1½ gfj;k.kk jkT; esa rRle; ykxw fdlh vU; jkT; fof/k esa nh xbZ fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, 
Hkh] fdlh U;k;ky; ;k fdlh izkf/kdj.k ds fdlh U;k;&fu.kZ;] fMØh ;k vkns'k] blds v/khu cuk, 
x, fdUgha fu;eksa] fofu;eksa ;k mifof/k;ksa ds izfrdwy gS] rks ljdkj bl vf/kfu;e ds izkjEHk ls ,d 
o"kZ dh vof/k ds Hkhrj] ?kksf"kr {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dh leL;k ls 
fuiVus gsrq ekudksa] ikfylh ekxZn'kZdksa rFkk lk/; j.kuhfr;ksa dks vfUre :i nsus ds fy, lHkh laHko 
mik; djsxhA 
 ¼2½ ,sls O;fDr;ksa] ftUgksaus gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk vf/kfu;e] 1973 ¼1973 dk 24½] gfj;k.kk 
uxj fuxe vf/kfu;e] 1994 ¼1994 dk 16½] gfj;k.kk uxjh; {ks= fodkl rFkk fofu;eu vf/kfu;e] 
1975 ¼1975 dk 8½] iatkc vuqlwfpr lM+d rFkk fu;af=r {ks= vfu;fer fodkl fucZU/ku vf/kfu;e] 
1963 ¼1963 dk iatkc vf/kfu;e 41½ ;k rRle; ykxw fdlh vU; fof/k ds mica/kksa dh mYya?kuk esa 
izkf/kdj ds fcuk Hkwfe dk mi foHkktu fd;k gS ;k vizkf/kd`r fuekZ.kksa dk ifjfuekZ.k ;k iqu%ifjfuekZ.k 
fd;k gS] ds fo#) fof/kd dkjZokbZ izkjEHk djus ds fy, ?kksf"kr {ks= esa fdlh l{ke izkf/kdkjh }kjk bl 
vf/kfu;e ds izkjaHk ls iwoZ tkjh lHkh uksfVlksa rFkk ikfjr izR;korZu vkns'k ?kksf"kr {ks= esa fuyfEcr 
fd, x, le>s tk,axs rFkk fdlh U;k;ky; ds le{k izLrqr fd, x, rFkk yfEcr ekeyksa ds flok;] 
,d o"kZ dh iwoksZDr vof/k ds nkSjku vkxs dksbZ Hkh n.MkRed dkjZokbZ ugha dh tk,xhA 

izorZu vkLFkfxr 
j[kukA 

5. rRle; ykxw fdlh vU; jkT; fof/k esa nh xbZ fdlh ckr ds gksrs gq, Hkh] lEc) uxjikfydk 
ftlds v/khu ?kksf"kr {ks= vkrk gS] ,sls {ks= esa vko';d lsokvksa dks miyC/k djokus ds fy, dkjZokbZ 
izkjEHk dj ldrh gS rFkk vkxs ?kksf"kr {ks= esa vofLFkr IykVksa ;k fuekZ.kksa dks] fofufnZ"V le; ds Hkhrj 
Qhl ds Hkqxrku rFkk fuca/ku rFkk 'krsZa] tks fofgr dh tk,a] dks iwjk djus ds v/;/khu fu;fer fd;k 
x;k le>k tk,xkA 

IykVksa@fuekZ.kksa 
dk 
fu;ferhdj.kA 

6. dksbZ Hkh O;fDr rc rd fdlh ykHk ;k jkgr ds nkos dk gdnkj ugha gksxk tc rd ljdkj 
}kjk ;Fkk fofufnZ"V lHkh fuca/ku rFkk 'krsZa iwjh u dh xbZ gksa rFkk visf{kr Qhl] tks ljdkj }kjk 
fofgr dh tk,] tek u djokbZ xbZ gksA 

ykHk ds fy, 
gdnkjhA 

7. ¼1½ fdlh O;fDr ds fo#) fdlh ckr ds laca/k esa] tks bl vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, 
x, fu;eksa ds vuqlj.k esa ln~HkkoiwoZd dh xbZ gS ;k dh tkus ds fy, vk'kf;r gS] dksbZ Hkh okn] 
vfHk;kstu ;k vU; fof/kd dk;Zokfg;ka ugha gks ldsaxhA 
 ¼2½ ljdkj ds fo#) fdlh ckr }kjk dh xbZ ;k dh tkus ds fy, lEHkkfor fdlh {kfr ds 
laca/k esa] tks bl vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds v/khu ln~HkkoiwoZd dh xbZ gS ;k dh 
tkus ds fy, vk'kf;r gS] dksbZ Hkh okn ;k vU; fof/kd dk;Zokfg;ka ugha gks ldsaxhA 

mUeqfDrA 

8. fdlh Hkh flfoy U;k;ky; dks bl vf/kfu;e ;k blds v/khu cuk, x, fu;eksa ds v/khu vkus 
okys ekeyksa ds laca/k esa dksbZ okn xzg.k djus dh vf/kdkfjrk ugha gksxhA 

vf/kdkfjrk dk 
otZuA 

9. bl vf/kfu;e dh dksbZ Hkh ckr ml {ks= dks ykxw ugha gksxh]& 
¼d½ tks Hkwfe vtZu vf/kfu;e] 1894 ¼1894 dk dsUnzh; vf/kfu;e 1½] ou laj{k.k vf/kfu;e] 

1980 ¼1980 dk dsUnzh; vf/kfu;e 69½] i;kZoj.k laj{k.k vf/kfu;e] 1986 ¼1986 dk 
dsUnzh; vf/kfu;e 29½] j{kk ladeZ vf/kfu;e] 1903 ¼1903 dk dsUnzh; vf/kfu;e 7½] 
Hkkjrh; fo|qr vf/kfu;e] 1910 ¼1910 dk dsUnzh; vf/kfu;e 9½ ;k fdlh vU; dsUnzh; 
vf/kfu;e ds v/khu vf/klwfpr fd;k x;k gS@ vkrk gS( 

¼[k½ tks dsUnzh; ;k jkT; ljdkj }kjk LokfeRok/khu gS( 
¼x½ tks dsUnzh; ;k jkT; ljdkj ds cksMZ rFkk fuxeksa }kjk LokfeRok/khu gS( 
¼?k½ tks fdlh fof/k ds v/khu xfBr ifCyd lSDVj miØeksa }kjk LokfeRok/khu gS( 
¼³½ tgka dksbZ vkS|ksfxd bdkbZ vofLFkr gS( 
¼p½ tgka dksbZ okf.kfT;d fuekZ.k] eky] eYVhIysDl] gksVy ;k nkor [kkuk vofLFkr gS( 
¼N½ tgka dksbZ vU; izdkj dk fuekZ.k] tks ljdkj }kjk fofgr fd;k tk,] vofLFkr gSA 

NwVA 



84  HARYANA GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), JULY  28,   2016 (SRVN.  6, 1938   SAKA) 

 
fu;e cukus 

dh 'kfDrA 
10. ljdkj] jkti= esa vf/klwpuk }kjk rFkk iwoZ izdk'ku ds v/;/khu] bl vf/kfu;e ds iz;kstuksa dks 
dk;kZfUor djus ds fy, fu;e cuk ldrh gSA 

fujlu rFkk 

O;ko`fRrA 
11. ¼1½ gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[klqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dk izcU/ku 
¼fo’ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2013 ¼2013 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e 13½] blds }kjk] fujflr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 ¼2½ ,sls fujlu ds gksrs gq, Hkh] bl izdkj fujflr fd, x, vf/kfu;e ds v/khu dh xbZ dksbZ 
ckr ;k dh xbZ dksbZ dkjZokbZ] bl vf/kfu;e ds rRle mica/kksa ds v/khu dh xbZ ckr ;k dh xbZ dkjZokbZ 
le>h tk,xhA 

 
 

 dqynhi tSu] 
 lfpo] gfj;k.kk ljdkj] 
 fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkxA 
 



 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), JULY  28,  2016 (SRVN.  6, 1938  SAKA) 85 

 

gfj;k.kk ljdkj 

fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkx 

vf/klwpuk 

fnukad 28 tqykbZ] 2016 

la[;k ySt-19@2016.— fn bZLV iatkc gksYM~&bUxt ¼dWu~lkWfyMs'kWu ,sUM fizos*u~'kWu vkWo+ 
ÝSx~es*u~Vs'kWu½ gfj;k.kk vWes*UMesUV ,sDV] 2016] dk fuEufyf[kr fgUnh vuqokn gfj;k.kk ds jkT;iky 
dh fnukad 18 tqykbZ] 2016 dh Lohd`fr ds v/khu ,rn~}kjk izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gS vkSj ;g gfj;k.kk 
jktHkk"kk vf/kfu;e] 1969 ¼1969 dk 17½] dh /kkjk 4&d ds [k.M ¼[k½ ds v/khu mDr vf/kfu;e dk 
fgUnh Hkk"kk esa izkekf.kd ikB le>k tk,xk %& 

      2016 dk gfj;k.kk vf/kfu;e la[;k 16 

iwohZ iatkc tksr ¼pdcUnh rFkk [k.Mdj.k jksdFkke½ gfj;k.kk la’kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2016 
iwohZ iatkc tksr ¼pdcUnh rFkk [k.Mdj.k jksdFkke½ vf/kfu;e] 1948] 

gfj;k.kk jkT;kFkZ] dks vkxs la’kksf/kr 
djus ds fy,  
vf/kfu;e 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds lM+lBosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gks %&  

1. ;g vf/kfu;e iwohZ iatkc tksr ¼pdcUnh rFkk [k.Mdj.k jksdFkke½ gfj;k.kk la’kks/ku 
vf/kfu;e] 2016 dgk tk ldrk gS A 

 laf{kIr uke A 

2. iwohZ iatkc tksr ¼pdcUnh rFkk [k.Mdj.k jksdFkke½ vf/kfu;e] 1948 ¼ftls] blesa] blds 
ckn] ewy vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh izLrkouk esa]& 

(i)  ^^d`f"k tksrksa ds [k.Mdj.k dh jksdFkke gsrq^^ 'kCnksa ds  ckn] ^^rFkk jkT; ljdkj ;k 
ljdkjh LokfeRok/khu laLFkkvksa }kjk LokfeRok/khu Hkwfe;ksa ij fdlh vU; fodkl 
iz;kstu ds fy,]^^ 'kCn j[ks tk;saxs( rFkk  

(ii)   ^^xkao^^ 'kCn ds ckn] ^^;k xkaoksa^^ 'kCn j[ks tk,axs A 

1948 ds iwohZ iatkc 
vf/kfu;e 50 dh 
izLrkouk dk 
la’kks/ku A  

3. ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 14 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^pdcUnh ds mn~ns’; ls^^ ‘'kCnksa ds ckn] 
^^;k jkT; ljdkj ;k ljdkjh LokfeRok/khu laLFkkvksa }kjk LokfeRok/khu Hkwfe;ksa ij fdlh vU; fodkl 
iz;kstu ds fy,^^ 'kCn j[ks tk;saxs A 

1948 ds iwohZ iatkc 
vf/kfu;e 50 dh 
/kkjk 14 dk 
la’kks/ku A 

4. ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 19 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa] ^^fofgr jhfr esa^^ 'kCnksa ds ckn] ^^xzke lHkk ds 
ijke’kZ ls rFkk lEc) rglhynkj vkSj [k.M fodkl rFkk iapk;r vf/kdkjh dh mifLFkfr esa^^ 'kCn 
j[ks tk;saxs A  

1948 ds iwohZ iatkc 
vf/kfu;e 50 dh 
/kkjk 19 dk 
la’kks/ku A 

5. ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 36 esa] ^^ifjofrZr ;k^^ 'kCnksa ds ckn] ^^vkaf’kd :i ls izfrlag`r ;k^^ 
'kCn j[ks tk;saxs A  

1948 ds iwohZ iatkc 
vf/kfu;e 50 dh 
/kkjk 36 dk 
la’kks/ku A 

 

 
 dqynhi tSu] 
 lfpo] gfj;k.kk ljdkj] 
 fof/k rFkk fo/kk;h foHkkxA 
 
 

 
54500—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd. 



 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.),  NOV.  23,  2017  (AGHN.  1,  1939  SAKA)   

 

461 

PART–I 

HARYANA GOVERNMENT 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 

Notification 

The 23rd  November, 2017 

No. Leg. 36/2017.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received 

the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 8th November, 2017 and is hereby published for 

general information:– 

HARYANA ACT NO. 33 OF 2017 

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT  

ACT, 2017  

AN 

ACT 

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-eighth Year of the 

Republic of India as follows:– 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and 

  Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment  

  Act, 2017. 

 (2)  It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016. 

Short title and 
commencement. 

2.  In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be 

substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 

section 4 of 

Haryana Act 14 of 
2016. 

 

 

 

 BHUPINDER NATH, 

 Additional Legal Remembrancer &  

 Special Secretary to Government Haryana, 

 Law and Legislative Department.  
 

 

 

 

 
55804—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd.  



 HARYANA   GOVT.   GAZ.   (EXTRA.),   APR.  19,   2018 (CHTR  29,  1940   SAKA) 83 

 

PART - I 

HARYANA GOVERNMENT 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 

Notification 

The 19th April, 2018 

 No. Leg. 18/2018.—  The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received 

the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 3rd April, 2018 and is hereby published for general 

information:- 

HARYANA  ACT NO. 15 OF 2018 

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND  

INFRASTRUCTURE DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS  

(SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2018 

AN 

ACT 

 further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016. 

  Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-ninth Year of the 

Republic of India as follows:- 

1.  (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and 

Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2018. 

 (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016. 

Short title and 
commencement. 

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be 

substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be 

substituted. 

 

Amendment of 

section 4 of 
Haryana Act 14  

of 2016.  

 

KULDIP JAIN, 

Secretary to Government Haryana, 

Law and Legislative Department. 
 
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 

56208—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd. 



 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.), SEPT.  19,  2020 (BHDR.  28, 1942  SAKA) 157 

PART-I 

HARYANA GOVERNMENT 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 

Notification 

The 19th September, 2020 

No. Leg. 30/2020.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received 
the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 16th September, 2020 and is hereby published for 
general information:- 

HARYANA ACT NO. 20 OF 2020 

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2020 

AN 
ACT 

 further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016. 

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the 
Republic of India as follows:- 

1.  (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and 
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2020. 

 (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016. 

Short title and 
commencement. 

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be 
substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be 
substituted. 

Amendment of 
section 4 of 
Haryana Act 14 
of 2016. 

 
 

BIMLESH TANWAR, 
ADMINISTRATIVE SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT, HARYANA,  

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
8908—L.R.—H.G.P., Pkl. 



 
 
 
 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.),  SEPT. 10,  2021  (BHDR. 19,  1943  SAKA) 221 
 

 

HARYANA GOVERNMENT 

LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT 

Notification 

The 10th September, 2021 

 No. Leg.24/2021.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana 
received the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 4th September, 2021 and is hereby 
published for general information:- 

HARYANA ACT NO.24 OF 2021 

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE 
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) 

AMENDMENT ACT, 2021 

AN 

ACT 

       further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure 
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016. 

 BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-second Year of 
the Republic of India as follows:- 

 

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure 
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2021. 

Short title. 

 

2. For section 3 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure 
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016 (hereinafter called the principal Act), 
the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

 “3.  Declared area.— The Government may, by notification in the Official 
Gazette, declare any area falling within any municipal area to be the civic amenities and 
infrastructure deficient area where a resolution to such effect has been passed by the 
concerned municipality and recommended to that effect by the concerned Divisional 
Commissioner in case of a Municipal Corporation or by the concerned District 
Municipal Commissioner in case of a municipality, as per the norms notified by the 
Government from time to time.”. 

Substitution of 
section 3 of Haryana 
Act 14 of 2016. 

3. For section 4 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:- 

“4. Enforcement to be kept in abeyance.— (1) Notwithstanding anything 
contained in any other State law for the time being in force in the State of Haryana 
including any rules, regulations or bye-laws made thereunder, or any judgment, decree 
or order of any court or any authority to the contrary, the Government shall take all 
possible measures to finalise norms, policy guidelines and feasible strategies to deal 
with the problem of civic amenities and infrastructure deficiencies in the declared area. 

(2) All notices and restoration orders passed prior to the commencement of 
this Act or before the declaration is made under section 3 of the Act to this effect, as the 
case may be, by any competent authority in the declared area for initiating legal action 
against persons who have subdivided the land without authority or have erected or  
re-erected unauthorised building in contravention of the provisions of the Haryana 
Municipal Act, 1973 (24 of 1973), the Haryana Municipal Corporation Act, 1994 (16 of 
1994), the Haryana Development and Regulation of Urban Areas Act, 1975 (8 of 1975), 
the Haryana Scheduled Roads and Controlled Areas Restriction of Unregulated 
Development Act, 1963 (Punjab Act 41 of 1963), or any other law for the time being in 
force, shall be deemed to have been suspended in the declared area and no further 
punitive action shall be taken in such cases, except cases which have been forwarded to 
or pending before any court of law.”. 

Substitution of 
section 4 of Haryana 
Act 14 of 2016. 



 
 
 
 HARYANA  GOVT.  GAZ.  (EXTRA.),  SEPT. 10,  2021  (BHDR. 19,  1943  SAKA) 222 
 

 

Insertion of 
section 9A in 
Haryana Act 14 of 
2016. 

4. After section 9 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:- 

  “9A. Power to relax.— If the Government is of the opinion that the operation of 
any of the provisions of the Act or any part of notification(s) issued under the Act causes 
or has caused undue hardship or circumstances exist which render it expedient so to do, it 
may, subject to such terms and conditions as it may impose, by an order, give relaxation to 
any class of persons or area or land from all or any provisions of the Act.”. 

 

_________ 

 

 
BIMLESH TANWAR, 

ADMINISTRATIVE SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT, 
HARYANA, LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT. 

  
 
 
 
 
   

9318—L.R.—H.G.P., Pkl.  

 


