The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016

Act 14 of 2016

Keyword(s):
Civic Amenities, Infrastructure, Deficient Municipal Areas

Amendments appended: 33 of 2017, 15 of 2018, 20 of 2020, 24 of 2021

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015-2017

Harpana Gouernment Guazette

EXTRAORDINARY

Published by Authority
© Govt. of Haryana

No. 117-2016/Ext.] JUENTE, dRAR, feTid 28 JeTe, 2016
(6 #TT9YT, 1938 9Th)

faumrft aRfdre

HHID fawr 9% EIS]
qarr-1 afefem
1. R A Har (Fee) 1fdf e, 2016 (2016 &1 gRamn sfafw ww@r 11) 81

2. RO TRUMHT &3l H YUl ANRE GRIGATAT TAT JTAEAT BT Y=l 82-84
(frery Sugm) fSfH, 2016 (2016 &1 &RAN rfAfEH Hw@ 14)
3. gdi UST9 Sid (Fdhawal a7 WUSEHRUT AGATH) BRATOT Helerd e, 2016 85
(2016 @1 BRATOM IrfAfTTH HEAT 16)
(@aar f2= )
qr— 11 3=y
BT Bl
A 1 yaamafsa fam
BT Bl
Ar- IV gfg udff, q=: yorem qom yfoeemns
Y Tl

Price : Rs. 5.00 (1)



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JULY 28, 2016 (SRVN. 6, 1938 SAKA)

81

HAT-1
RATT PR
fafer o faumrdy favmT

=T
fasTid 28 TS, 2016

W&l W14 /2016 — f& sRamom wEdR Hg-sd @WTHT) Ude, 2016, &l
FrafaRad 2= srgare gRamn & Isgure @1 faid 19 Jefrs, 2016 @ WiHfd & oA
UAGERT USRI far S 8 iR a1 gRATom 1T S1feif—ie, 1969 (1969 &1 17), & &IRT
4~ & JNT I AR BT B 9197 H UG ure AHS ST -

2016 &1 sRATOM IAfSrfay =T 11

gRAmom fiserE dar (Wene) sferfam, 2016
gRImo e dar siferfa, 2009,
P AT GAMEa 1 & fog
arferfors

YR TORTSY & dsdcd ay § gRImon g faurvved grT fF=fafRad vy & I8
sferfafia & —

1. U srfaf e eRamom iftaeme Jar (Fee) ifaif M, 2016, H8T ST AHhar 2 |
2. gRarom iftaeme dar ifaferaH, 2009, @Y ORT 15 H—
() SU-URT (5) & WM R, F=faRaq Su—arr uforenfid & SRrf, seifq—
“(65) SIft S=a wad @ AT & R BW W, I YH-UH U fhar
SIRATT, ST uie 9§ &1 31afy & forg A R | U WHIU-UF & A 8
W, WHT WG BT ARPART & S, BT S W A T AT I
8|
() SU-URT (5) & dT, fFrHfRad SU—aRT S &1 SN, i —
“(6) WA HI @ /IR $9 3merg &1 Ui 9y e SO YHOT-uS <
5 SHd a9 /uRIR § FRenfud 1fi9emHe gumel et Rafd & &rd
PR G T AT WA H I yRaeE /uRadw T8 g1 afe waw § BIs
gRae= /uRad= &, ar o9 sMmufcd YAMOT-—u= JIRTTE 8 ST e
T SU—URT (1) & JIFAR YA RS ThiH & AT & fory
JMIGT BT dAT W& UIhRI  AG-hal U 9a9 /IR™R dl
STAa—gsdlel B Fhdl 21 |

CIELR \_ﬁ'_‘L
(N ~ o
ATdd, IRV AXDIR,

fafer o fAumlr fawmT |

fered A |
2009 P ERATOM
farfrE 12 @t

gYRT 15 hT
e |



82

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JULY 28, 2016 (SRVN. 6, 1938 SAKA)

<feret A |

TRYTETY |

RATT WRHR
fafer e faegmdy fawm
FfergET
fasis 28 JeITs, 2016
e AW7 /2016— & RN Aot offs Rigge Rffew U s
feftheie ARt weiRafT (FRia Ufawsi=d) Vae, 2016, &1 FefaRad 2=l srgars sRamwm &
U B fRAid 19 S8, 2016 B WIGid & T TAGERT USHIRIA fhar iar © 8k I8

FRATOT IS AFTIH, 1969 (1969 BT 17), BT URT 4—F & WU (F) B AN Iad IrfAfraH
1 =) AT9T | UrHIfOIE uIe |WHS ST —

2016 &I BRI AT G 14
Ao TRuIfas &3 4 sqel aRe gagfaemsn don sEuaHTn
&1 g9=uq (faery Sue=e) srferfaa, 2016

R g A TRufaet a3 A qul anRe gugfens qen

JGEIEAT H dAT I9Y WA g 99 N

Al @ fIY oaedd A4drsll B FaRT A

2g faely Sueg a1 @ fay
e

IR TRST & Fedod a¥ # RIm wwa fuaved gt EfoRad wu § us
i 8 —

1. I8 IR eRamn TRUfSdr el # qqel ArTRe gEgfaunsl qor FawRea bl
ya (faQry Sue) STfifram, 2016 HET ST Adhdr 7 |

2. 39 AR #, 59 9o ded & =g ufdd 7 8l —

(@) "Fem UGN | STy ®, gRaon TRuferdt ifSf e, 1973 (1973 BT 24),
gRA TR e IR, 1994 (1994 &1 16), BRATOM TN &F fawry den
fafere s, 1975 (1975 &1 8), U@ ggfaad we& don A a3
afafia faer fdw—e faf e, 1963 (1963 &1 doie srfaf =™ 41), 9@ =8
JrotErl (AR FrRiEeT srfarferRm, 1952 (1953 &1 USTE AfAFR—H 1) AT T AT]
TEH USRI

(@) it &= | A B, gRT 3 & S7Ef QUi ANTRe GEgaensil T sfadRE
&3 & WU A A &

(M) amaTEd WAl ¥ AU 2, ST AR, A e, Aed qAT Tl UHT
@) "R’ H AU B, wmerd R # gRATT T B WRBR

(8) "TRUfeI®T &= | AR 2, sRaTm TRUIferaT Iff==™, 1973 (1973 &7 24) AT
gRamom TR W iffEm, 1994 (1994 @ 16), RN W Rerfy @, H ger
IRYIIT TRUTfrT & ;

@) TRUAST ¥ AU B, SRATOM TRUICIhT ARFRA, 1973 (1973 BT 24) T
RN TR R 1fdfaH, 1994 (1994 &1 16) H T2 uRWING TRuTferaT ;

(®) “owu¥ea fFEr ¥ el B, T S sRaen Ruierdr sreiRE, 1973
(1973 &1 24), BRI TR A AfRTTH, 1994 (1994 BT 16), TRATOM TR &5
famra den fafree sfaffm, 1975 (1975 &1 8), UG SIgfad dsd ol
frifa &= sifvafia e dem aififam, 1963 (1963 @1 UoTa Sifafram 41),
gorg s <ot (TR o siferferm, 1952 (1953 &1 goTe srfSfaH 1) ar
TITT ], felt o1 fafdy & Sudell & Sootem # fffa fovar mar 2




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JULY 28, 2016 (SRVN. 6, 1938 SAKA)

83

3. IRPR, IGUA H ARG gRI, TWRUND! &5 & fBAl & Pl Al ARG = &= |

FEgaemRil qorm rawERe T 85 & wu H 9 o) "adl § RraH—
(@) 31 A/, 2015 ¥ Y4 gAMN GRerd ¥ S(f¥d Wil IR GRAT 8 gdl § ; qof
(@) 39 M BT Ahed AHg TRAMASGT gRT IRT fbar 7 € denm R s
DI T H Ag HSel MY AT TRUINADT DI ST H UG gIRT AT
CARIERE
Re] TG TRUMTDHI §RT Usel 9 & UIRG T AvSd Agad AT
Jurgad, Sl f Rfa 81 gRT rRifd daed WRaR gRT I RE AEs
BT IR HCT 2|
4. (1) =ERIM TS H qEHT AF et o ow fafy # & g feft 919 & 219 g%
fl, fefl <o a1 5l wiitrexer & fdt =ma—foota, feat ar aew, s9@ aefe 99w
W%ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁfmwﬁ@?ﬁzﬁumwﬁFﬁﬁwusvsﬁ%rﬁwzﬁuﬂméw
Y B JAW B WIAR, BN & H YUl ARG GEGATAT TAT JqAET B TR
faest &g AFl, Tiferefl Anfesiel dorm arg IoHifaal & off~dd U < & forw vt |va
JURT BT |
@) v afiadl, R sRan wRufadT srfafm, 1973 (1973 &1 24), Ramom
TR ST, 1994 (1994 H1 16), BRAON TR &5 A den A= ifdfaw,
1975 (1975 &1 8), UoTd AJYfIT Asd den FRIFT &3 aiffafia e fdwem afafas,
1963 (1963 HT UGId IAMAFRA 41) a1 THHT AN fHdl o= R & Sueel &1 Sewamm 4
U & a1 1 &1 I faror fhar @ ar smnfdea fFmion @1 aRfemier ar gaaRfemmor
foar 8, @ f9og faffe dRaE UR™ w1 & forg aifvd e # 6l e Wl gRT 39
JRAFRE & URYM A g IR G AIfCAl Jm wRT giracE e 9iiva &F H Aafad
Py 7T A G qern fhdl AT & Wl yRdd by MY qen dffgd amal & ey,
waﬁaﬁqﬁwmﬁﬁaﬁmaﬁaﬁs‘ﬁmaﬁa@ﬁaﬁa@ﬂl
5. doamy o] fedl o= oy Y § &1 S B0 a1d & B gy W, Re TRaiford
e e aita & oaT &, U &3 # 377avdd Hansi & SUdel dRdM & oy dRdars
UR™ $R Fhdl § TAT IR \Id & # @ReId wiret a1 Ao &, faffde a9g & fiax
BRI ® I d g e e, S fAfed @ S, B R® wRA & srade e faar
AT FHSAT ST |
6. @3 W @ 9 d@ A ™ AT IET B I BT THAR ARl BN OF TP ARDR
grT uen fafafde vt fadem dom ord @@ 9 @1 W€ &
fafg @1 ST, S 7 PRaAs TR Bl
7. (1) &0 afed & fOog kil a9 @ e §, o 39 Iffrm ar sqa @i 991
MY fEl & IGERYl H AHYdd Bl T § AT Bl S P oY MIRd §, P A A,
AT A1 31 fAftres wRiaTE &1 81 Wbl |
2 WoR & fog O 919 gRT & T3 A B IH @ forg wefad fodr afa &
ey ¥, S 59 SIS A1 59 JFefF 9¢ T A & oeflF AeMEgdSd @l g © AT B
S & g omeld €, @IS 1 9% A1 o fafde eriarfeai el 8w |
8. &l f Rifde =marera &1 59 IfSfrm a1 s ofid 991g U Ml & ofelie 3
qrel AHAl S Hae H PIS AG T8I B DI ARBIRGT 8l B |
9. =9 JIfRIEW @ BIE W 919 9 &F BT AN TRl 8FI—
@) 1 g o A, 1894 (1894 BT Hrwrd IARAIH 1), I AREAT AT,
1980 (1980 &1 Hww1d IAFTIA 69), UITaRoT ARefoT AT, 1986 (1986 I
g ARTH 20), e FHH ARTH, 1903 (1903 BT B AfTH 7),
IR faega iff M, 1910 (1910 &1 S ARFRM 9) a7 fhell 39 Sy
s & e sifdrgfad farar ar 8 / o &;

@) S I A7 5T WRGR §RT @A 2

(M) SN = A1 5T WBR & dre a1 Al gR1 warfiar= €;

@) o fexdl ffy & erfie wfowd ufeerd Haer SuFHAl gRT W@fAcaEl+ §;

®) < o AeEnfiie sHE aked €;

@) &l P arfviisgs fAWvn, J1e, Aedieiad, gled AT T1ad W raRerd ®;
(B) el BIE g YHR &I v, S WReR gRT fafka farar sy, saRerd g1

o IR
G|

el / ferrort

o & forw
THANT |

e |

SfErRTRAT BT
oI |

e |

o



84

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JULY 28, 2016 (SRVN. 6, 1938 SAKA)

w5
P wifad |

R e
ATgHA |

10. IRGR, A9UF H IR §RT TAT Y& THRE & Aegedi, 39 AT & gl Pr

BRIfad o) b g FRm 41 Fobell B |

1. (1) BRaon TRUfTST &3 § AUl ANTRG GEGAemsi q AawRaT b1 gaE

(faery Sueee) erfafraH, 2013 (2013 &1 BRI ifaf =™ 13), 3@ gR1, ARRAT fvar i 21
@) W FREF & B 8¢ I, 39 UeR FRRA fey U it & srii| @t 18 B

T AT DI TS PIs HRATS, 39 AT & Taw Sudell & iefie ol T 91 I P TS HRATS

e SITg |

BT I,
fea, eRAT RER,
fafer o faumrhy favm |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), JULY 28, 2016 (SRVN. 6, 1938 SAKA)

85

RATT PR
fafer qomr faumrdy favmr

=T
fasTid 28 TS, 2016

[T AW.19 /2016 — & S UOE Eleg—s=Tol (bdiferes= Vs IR 3ifg
) BRI SWTSAT Yae, 2016, Wﬁﬁ%@ﬁ%ﬁaﬂaﬁmfﬁm
@I el 18 JeTS, 2016 B AT & AT TAGERT USRI fHar SIr & 3R I8 sRamon
ITSTHTST ITfAIfH, 1969 (1969 &I 17), B URT 4-F T @IS @) & i Sad rffaq &1
=Y 99T # urAIfoTeR uTe ARSI ST —

2016 T sRATUT A= AT 16

qdf g9 S (Fda<l a7 AvSHIUT AHAT) sRATT Hereq aff=aw, 2016
gdf 4Se Sid (Fha<l dT WusHRT AHA) AfeIfaH, 1948,
gRIom e, &t Im wenfera
1 o fag
arferfrm
RA TR & Fedsd a9 # sRamom wsg furHvse grr f=felaa w9 & ug
srffeafia & —

1. I8 JRAfFm qdl dome S (@ddl U7 GUSHRU JHAT) ERATOM HeE
AfAfTH, 2016 HET ST Fhal & |

2. YAl U9 S (THaa] AT FUSHRUN ABATH) A, 1948 (4, 594, 6D
9T, ol SMATH el AT 8) DI IR H—
() "N G & GIESHIU B AGAM TG TR b 91, TAT AT ASHR AT
AR WIHEEE Femsll gRT Wit 9l ) & o e
Ao & forg,” wres I SR, el
(i) 9Ta weE & T8, AT MG AR G SIG |
3. T AR @ ORT 14 @ SWRT (1) H UIHel B Sqe¥d WY Rl B 9IS,
AT AT ARBR AT ISR AT FeImell gR1 A= il w &0 o= e
T & folg” e I SR |

4. o AFRFRE @ arT 19 B [wawr (1) H, fafea Gf 7 ki & are, a9 @
R | AT AHg dedldeR iR @re faer dor dard s o SuRerfa # oes
L SR |

5. qd ffFEE @ grT 36 H, uRafia a1 wekl & 915, wifte w9 9 ufodgd a1t
e I SIRAT |

BT I,
fea, eRAT RER,
fafer qorm faumrdy favmT |

54500—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd.

e A |

1948 ® YT U
JAMFH 50 B
TRATIT BT
GNICER

1948 % YT UG
srfrfras 50 @t
GRT 14 BT
e |

1948 & YT TSI
| 50 B
gRT 19 BT
GNICEE
1948 & Yt U
JAMFH 50 B

EINT 36 bl
e |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), NOV. 23, 2017 (AGHN. 1, 1939 SAKA) 461

PART-I
HARYANA GOVERNMENT
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 23rd November, 2017

No. Leg. 36/2017.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received
the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 8th November, 2017 and is hereby published for
general information:—

HARYANA ACT NO. 33 OF 2017

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT
ACT, 2017

AN
ACT

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-eighth Year of the
Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1)  This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment
Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.
2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,-

(1) in sub-section (1), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be
substituted; and

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “one year”, the words “two years” shall be
substituted.

BHUPINDER NATH,
Additional Legal Remembrancer &
Special Secretary to Government Haryana,
Law and Legislative Department.

55804—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 4 of
Haryana Act 14 of
2016.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), APR. 19, 2018 (CHTR 29, 1940 SAKA)

83

PART -1
HARYANA GOVERNMENT
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 19th April, 2018

No. Leg. 18/2018.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received
the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 3rd April, 2018 and is hereby published for general
information:-

HARYANA ACT NO. 15 OF 2018

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND
INFRASTRUCTURE DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS
(SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2018

AN
ACT

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-ninth Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2018.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.
2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,-

1) in sub-section (1), for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be
substituted; and

(i)  in sub-section (2), for the words “two years”, the words “three years” shall be
substituted.

KULDIP JAIN,
Secretary to Government Haryana,
Law and Legislative Department.

56208—L.R.—H.G.P., Chd.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 4 of
Haryana Act 14
of 2016.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), SEPT. 19, 2020 (BHDR. 28, 1942 SAKA) 157

PART-I

HARYANA GOVERNMENT
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 19th September, 2020

No. Leg. 30/2020.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana received
the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 16th September, 2020 and is hereby published for

general information:-
HARYANA ACT NO. 20 OF 2020

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT ACT, 2020
AN
ACT

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Shorttitle and
Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2020. commencement.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016.

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient ~Amendment of

- : O section 4 of
Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- Haryana Act 14

)] in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be of2016.
substituted; and

(il)  in sub-section (2), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be
substituted.

BIMLESH TANWAR,
ADMINISTRATIVE SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT, HARYANA,
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT.

8908—L.R.—H.G.P., Pkl.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), SEPT. 10, 2021 (BHDR. 19, 1943 SAKA) 221

HARYANA GOVERNMENT
LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 10th September, 2021

No. Leg.24/2021.— The following Act of the Legislature of the State of Haryana
received the assent of the Governor of Haryana on the 4th September, 2021 and is hereby
published for general information:-

HARYANA ACT NO.24 OF 2021

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE
DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS)
AMENDMENT ACT, 2021

AN
ACT

further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-second Year of
the Republic of India as follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2021.

2. For section 3 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure
Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016 (hereinafter called the principal Act),
the following section shall be substituted, namely:-

“3. Declared area.— The Government may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, declare any area falling within any municipal area to be the civic amenities and
infrastructure deficient area where a resolution to such effect has been passed by the
concerned municipality and recommended to that effect by the concerned Divisional
Commissioner in case of a Municipal Corporation or by the concerned District
Municipal Commissioner in case of a municipality, as per the norms notified by the
Government from time to time.”.

3. For section 4 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:-

“4. Enforcement to be kept in abeyance.— (1) Notwithstanding anything
contained in any other State law for the time being in force in the State of Haryana
including any rules, regulations or bye-laws made thereunder, or any judgment, decree
or order of any court or any authority to the contrary, the Government shall take all
possible measures to finalise norms, policy guidelines and feasible strategies to deal
with the problem of civic amenities and infrastructure deficiencies in the declared area.

(2)  All notices and restoration orders passed prior to the commencement of
this Act or before the declaration is made under section 3 of the Act to this effect, as the
case may be, by any competent authority in the declared area for initiating legal action
against persons who have subdivided the land without authority or have erected or
re-erected unauthorised building in contravention of the provisions of the Haryana
Municipal Act, 1973 (24 of 1973), the Haryana Municipal Corporation Act, 1994 (16 of
1994), the Haryana Development and Regulation of Urban Areas Act, 1975 (8 of 1975),
the Haryana Scheduled Roads and Controlled Areas Restriction of Unregulated
Development Act, 1963 (Punjab Act 41 of 1963), or any other law for the time being in
force, shall be deemed to have been suspended in the declared area and no further
punitive action shall be taken in such cases, except cases which have been forwarded to
or pending before any court of law.”.

Short title.

Substitution of
section 3 of Haryana
Act 14 0of 2016.

Substitution of
section 4 of Haryana
Act 14 0f 2016.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), SEPT. 10, 2021 (BHDR. 19, 1943 SAKA) 222

Inseftiog Zf 4. After section 9 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:-

section n

Haryana Act 14 of “9A. Power to relax.— If the Government is of the opinion that the operation of
2016. any of the provisions of the Act or any part of notification(s) issued under the Act causes

or has caused undue hardship or circumstances exist which render it expedient so to do, it
may, subject to such terms and conditions as it may impose, by an order, give relaxation to
any class of persons or area or land from all or any provisions of the Act.”.

BIMLESH TANWAR,
ADMINISTRATIVE SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT,
HARYANA, LAW AND LEGISLATIVE DEPARTMENT.

9318—L.R—H.G.P., Pkl.



