
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2018

Act 9 of 2018

Keyword(s):
Adhivakta, Kalyan Nidhi



"ftFrt€ fu + enarla er* ganft
irrq grrilq ( fuqr er*E*-e ) + issr
tg ,rgcf, meiq 6.r-rr-#qrq
qqe 1 rs ft. A. ftaT{, Ri's
3o-05-2ool."

t'''friscis
' 
lufurq/gf 

l oe f 20 | 3 - zo r s."

fu 1tE[rtEr
(srfrrsrnur)

urfufiR I rt,rRrd

s'qifi 136l trugr, xrfudR, fui6 7 e{frd zorr 
- 

+d 17, rri6 1940

fdfu sfr furr* q,dfrtilrT
riil?rq, qETff rr{{, Tqt {-qgt

aqrtrqgr, fr{is z er+a zore

mqia:nss/S. os/zr-sr/urs./o.rr./rs. 
-fufrqrcurTr*rftE{frfude{fuRqcfr€q{kriq 

o:-oa-zors6}
trsqra ff eqqfr urq d g-ff t, \rd-detq s-{Hrtriur ff q1-q{rff + frq u-orftra ftqr unr t.

sderrq ft ttqqta * *n taw ednrgun,
rr+q grm argn, wftfum uftra.

271



272

S*,Eci67er+dzorr

q'fhq =lnr asr
vm"c

qm ls ur sviq?,

qm te ql uhiq_q. 3.

ffim
u'*sqE sTfu{ffr q.srur ft& ftf*rrrt er&frqq, zore

".i fu ffi 
qkdffi iniqrq fte srfufuqc , tsa2(m. r *-l rsrz) ili sft ffifud

tncrqurrrq+*"{f ii+E{f EdwBErrrrqrwarnffiofuasqfr qaeffids:_
l. (r) reerefuqB*qrroaThdfrr qqrorfr&fr+rilqql 

er&fuc, 2or8mEarfur.

O) T€ {t-sq-d fr r€* r+rqr fi dr6q6 y_to &n.

u-fu rB qfudff r oarur fr & s&ftirc, l es 2 (iF. e vt r e 8 2 ) Gfr rsfr w* qu,E{d srefunHffi## #kur;;;, _*"* scq qd

qdwefuq6 qRr rsfr,

((q) w-Em (I) fr' tr€ "q5r1q"*'wrqq{, 
Tq "{=;*q.q*,,ftTqrfraftqlurd; 

ent
t*t sq-qnr (2) i, w "tr*quqt,*err+qt, 

vq .,qa]q.q+,,nfttqrfufrqrvr+.

"qr{.qgr, 
frqim z erfrd zore

.ew"mil:i*J*'J,#ffi"#.,*;ffiffiffi 
ffi ffi !:,*s{-sviurnrsfr 

q,r*vc{ws

. udf,rB*rqqra* crcedursilartgsn,
rft girn.g., .nnG 

"m.



B'ifrqrra{Enqr, frqis z srftd zors z7z (tl

CHIIAITISGARH ACT

(No. 9 of 2018)

TIIE CHHATTISGARH ADHryAIilA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN)

ADHINTYAM, 2018

AnAct furtherto amend the ChhattisgarhAdhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982
(No. 9 of 1982).

Be it enacted by the Ctrhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-ninth Year of the Republic of
lndia, as follows :-

short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhicommencement" (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam,2018.

@ It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

Amendment of 2. In Section 18 of the Chhaftisgarh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyarn, 1982
section 18' (No. 9 of 1982), (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), for the words

" Ten Rupees and Twenty Five Rupees ", the words " Twenty-five Rupees and
Fifty Rupees " shall be substituted

Amendment of 3. In Section 19 ofthe principalAct,-
Section 19.

O in sub-section (l), for the words"TenRupees", the words"Twenty-five
Rupees" shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words " Twenty-frve Rupees ", the words
"Fifty Rupees" shall be substituted.

r{am*, $q den aEq qrern, u-*$rq am rnv$a gaonau, nugr Q gBa aur q-*,rRrd - zo r e.


